

Exhibit 10

BAKER & MCKENZIE
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

EUROPE
MIDDLE EAST

AMSTERDAM
ANTWERP
BAHRAIN
BARCELONA
BERLIN
BOLOGNA
BRUSSELS
BUDAPEST
CAIRO
DUSSELDORF
FRANKFURT
GENEVA
KIEV
LONDON
MADRID
MILAN
MOSCOW
MUNICH
PARIS
PRAGUE
RIYADH
ROME
STOCKHOLM
ST. PETERSBURG
WARSAW
ZURICH

ASIA
PACIFIC

ALMATY
BAKU
BANGKOK
BEIJING
HANOI
HO CHI MINH CITY
HONG KONG
HSINCHU
MANILA
MELBOURNE
SINGAPORE
SYDNEY
TAIPEI
TOKYO

NORTH AND
SOUTH AMERICA

BOGOTA
BRASILIA
BUENOS AIRES
CARACAS
CHICAGO
DALLAS
GUADALAJARA
HOUSTON
JUAREZ
MEXICO CITY
MIAMI
MONTERREY
NEW YORK
PALO ALTO
PORTO ALEGRE
RIO DE JANEIRO
SAN DIEGO
SAN FRANCISCO
SANTIAGO
SAO PAULO
TIJUANA
TORONTO
VALENCIA
WASHINGTON, D.C.

ONE PRUDENTIAL PLAZA
130 EAST RANDOLPH DRIVE
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60601-6384
TELEPHONE (312) 861-8000
FACSIMILE (312) 861-2899

www.bakernet.com

David P. Hackett
(312) 861-6640
DAVID.P.HACKETT@BAKERNET.COM

September 18, 2003
(revised October 31, 2003)

Rian Scheel
Vice President and General Manager
The Lockformer Company, A Division of Met-Coil Corporation
711 Ogden Avenue
Lisle, IL 60532

Re: Statement for Legal Services – Post-Petition

Dear Rian:

Enclosed please find our statement for professional services rendered and expenses incurred for the period August 27, 2003 through August 31, 2003.

Please return the enclosed remittance copy with your payment to ensure proper credit to your account.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,

David P. Hackett

DPH/bdm
Enclosures

BAKER & MCKENZIE

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

ONE PRUDENTIAL PLAZA
130 EAST RANDOLPH DRIVE
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60601-6384
TELEPHONE (312) 861-8000
FACSIMILE (312) 861-2899

IRS# 36-2137456

STATEMENT

September 18, 2003
(revised October 31, 2003)

The Lockformer Company, A Division of Met-Coil Corporation
711 Ogden Avenue
Lisle, IL 60532

- to -

BAKER & MCKENZIE
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054811

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE
PERIOD AUGUST 27, 2003 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2003, AS FOLLOWS:

Post-Petition

TOTAL FEES.....	\$ 55,820.50
TOTAL EXPENSES.....	\$ 2,381.08
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE.....	\$ 58,201.58

For your convenience, you may send a *Wire Transfer* in payment of statements to:

Baker & McKenzie
Bank One
120 South LaSalle Street
Chicago, IL 60603
Account No. 110183
Routing No. 071000013
SWIFT Code: FNBC-US-44

RE: Invoice #: 21054811

BAKER & M^CKENZIE

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

ONE PRUDENTIAL PLAZA
130 EAST RANDOLPH DRIVE
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60601-6384
TELEPHONE (312) 861-8000
FACSIMILE (312) 861-2899

IRS# 36-2137456

REMITTANCE COPY

September 18, 2003
(revised October 31, 2003)

The Lockformer Company, A Division of Met-Coil Corporation
711 Ogden Avenue
Lisle, IL 60532

- to -

BAKER & McKENZIE
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054811

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 27, 2003 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2003, AS FOLLOWS:

Post-Petition

TOTAL FEES.....	\$ 55,820.50
TOTAL EXPENSES.....	\$ <u>2,381.08</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE.....	\$ <u>58,201.58</u>

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR REMITTANCE

BAKER & M^CKENZIE

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

ONE PRUDENTIAL PLAZA
130 EAST RANDOLPH DRIVE
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60601-6384
TELEPHONE (312) 861-8000
FACSIMILE (312) 861-2899

IRS# 36-2137456

September 18, 2003
(revised October 31, 2003)

The Lockformer Company, A Division of Met-Coil Corporation
711 Ogden Avenue
Lisle, IL 60532

- to -

BAKER & McKENZIE
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054811

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE
PERIOD AUGUST 27, 2003 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2003, AS FOLLOWS:

RE: Devane et al vs. Lockformer et al

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/28/03	Herald, Jr.	Conference with plaintiffs' attorney, M. Palermo, re bankruptcy issues; telephone conference with plaintiffs' attorney, E. Scanlan re same; review media article.	.5

Total Fees: \$ 225.00

BAKER & MCKENZIE

The Lockformer Company
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054811

September 18, 2003
Page 2

SUMMARY OF FEES:

Chicago Office

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
J. Patrick Herald, Jr.	.5	450.00	\$ 225.00
	Total:	\$	225.00

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES:

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Photocopies	\$ 2.85
Outside Information Services	199.16
Facsimile	3.25
Binding Charge	45.00
	Total Expenses: \$ 250.26

Total Fees and Expenses for Devane et al vs. Lockformer et al: \$ 475.26

RE: LeClerq

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/28/03	Herald, Jr.	Review appearance of Meckler Bulger & Tilson.	.2
08/29/03	Herald, Jr.	Review appearance of RHI Holding and Fairchild Corp. (fourth party defendants) by Schopf & Weiss.	.2
		Total Fees: \$	180.00

BAKER & MCKENZIE

The Lockformer Company
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054811

September 18, 2003
Page 3

SUMMARY OF FEES:

Chicago Office

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
J. Patrick Herald, Jr.	.4	450.00	\$ 180.00
	Total:	\$	180.00

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES:

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Photocopies	\$ 10.65
	Total Expenses: \$ 10.65

Total Fees and Expenses for LeClerq: \$ 190.65

RE: Mejdrech

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/27/03	Hackett	Review Daubert motions and strategy; revise summary judgment motion surreply and related issues.	.7

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/27/03	Herald, Jr.	Conference with R. Saines re telephone conference with R. Barliant re special counsel status/retainer issue; conference with J. Connor inquiry re status of fees owed; prepare for and conference with Greenburg and Vurdelja re final pretrial order; conference with Goldberg Kohn re bankruptcy status issues and notice of Judge Leinenweber emergency status on 8/28 at 9:00 a.m.; conference with N. Peterman/K. Pamenter re R. Barliant participation in 8/28 status, scheduling issues, notification letters and trial preparation issues/status; conference with Honeywell re experts, graphics and pretrial order; review correspondence from plaintiffs' attorney re Rule 11 issues/threats; conference with R. Saines re sur-reply to summary judgment issue; call to Leinenweber's chambers; review Swanson Martin & Bell's appearance on behalf of Magnetrol.	6.0
08/27/03	McCutcheon	Prepare motion in limine to bar evidence of or reference to punitive damages against Mestek.	.3
08/27/03	McCutcheon	Prepare motion in limine to bar evidence of Met-Coil's termination from the IEPA Site Remediation Program.	.2
08/27/03	McCutcheon	Conference with Greenberg Training and G. Vedelja re Mestek trial strategy.	2.5
08/27/03	McCutcheon	Review motion in limine from Wildman Harrold's attorneys.	1.6
08/27/03	McCutcheon	Review plaintiffs' exhibits from LeClercq trial to prepare objections in Mejdrech trial.	2.0
08/27/03	Nothelfer	Prepare Docket request for R. Hayes.	.2
08/27/03	Nothelfer	Review and file new materials.	.2
08/27/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	.3
08/27/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conference with M. Scavo re case materials.	.1

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/27/03	Nothelfer	Update list of documents sent to J. Connor for D. Sanders.	.8
08/27/03	Nothelfer	Organize materials in Room 30A for attorneys.	.2
08/27/03	Nothelfer	Prepare facsimile of Plaintiff's lists for N. Pakkala.	.2
08/27/03	Nothelfer	Attend conference with attorneys and Greenberg re trial.	2.4
08/27/03	Nothelfer	Messenger Mestek exhibits to G. Vurdelja.	.2
08/27/03	Oleszkiewicz	Prepare for trial; conference with team and Goldberg re trial preparation; conference with Vurdelja re trial preparation; witness prep and outlines; pretrial order issues and prep.	10.5
08/27/03	Saines	Prepare Summary Reply to Plaintiff's reply and review same.	2.6
08/27/03	Saines	Telephone conference with J. Madonia re Connor testimony.	2.5
08/27/03	Saines	Review Connor documents and Ball documents.	3.0
08/27/03	Sanders	Conference with Greenberg Traurig re trial preparation.	3.0
08/27/03	Sanders	Review Connor documents re pre-trial order.	2.9
08/27/03	Sanders	Review Devane documents re pre-trial order.	2.4
08/27/03	Sanders	Revise pre-trial order and document list.	.8
08/27/03	Sanders	Review witnesses and prepare witness list for trial meeting.	1.5
08/27/03	Terrell	Research and prepare memorandum re whether plaintiff's RCRA claims are barred by CERLLA Section 113(h).	3.2
08/27/03	Willis	Prepare email to D. Sanders re preparation for today's meeting.	.1

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/27/03	Willis	Prepare email to A. Nothelfer re preparation for trial.	.1
08/27/03	Willis	Prepare for meeting at 1:00 with regard to necessary materials.	.2
08/27/03	Willis	Pretrial conference with all counsel involved re witnesses, motions and pre-trial order.	2.5
08/27/03	Willis	Research with regard to press releases and all other relative information.	.5
08/28/03	Hackett	Review pleadings and motions; evaluate additional pleadings to be filed; pretrial motion strategy; evaluate expert opinion strategy.	1.2
08/28/03	Herald, Jr.	Attend emergency status called by Judge Leinenweber due to Met-Coil bankruptcy filing; conference with Goldberg Kohn (Met-Coil bankruptcy attorneys) re strategy; conference with N. Barry re Judge Zagel cases status; review draft sur-reply on summary judgment issue; conference with R. Saines re same and need to review with Greenburg; conference with D. Sanders re mandamus denial by 7th Circuit; trial preparation; attend to issues re coordination of final pretrial order due 9/2; conference with D. Sanders and M. McCutcheon re same; conference with V. Oleszkiewicz re Berggreen, Stover and Meagher; review Mestek's Rule 26.1 disclosure statement.	5.5
08/28/03	McCutcheon	Prepare e-mail to G. Verdelja and Goldberg Traurig attorneys re Mestek motions in limine.	.2
08/28/03	McCutcheon	Prepare e-mail to E. McKittrick at Wildman Harrold re Met-Coil trial exhibits.	.2
08/28/03	McCutcheon	Prepare objections to plaintiffs' exhibits; review plaintiffs' exhibits.	5.0
08/28/03	McCutcheon	Prepare pretrial order.	1.0

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/28/03	McCutcheon	Review and analyze case law re testifying attorneys at trial and ability to call current counsel to testify at trial.	2.6
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Contact M. Scavo re videos.	.1
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Gather videos to be copied for Greenberg.	.3
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Review and file new materials.	.3
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Conference with R. Saines and D. Sanders re trial.	.4
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Revise witness binder list.	.2
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Conferences with H. Willis re witness binders.	.9
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Gather L. Meagher and R. Stodola materials for V. Oleszkiewicz.	1.0
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conference with M. Scavo re witness binder list.	.1
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conference and conference with J. Schwind re copying services.	.4
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conference with M. McCutcheon re materials.	.1
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Messenger D. Ozonoff report to M. Scavo.	.3
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Review file to confirm Plaintiff's addresses for K. Pamenter.	.2
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Update and prepare witness binders.	2.5
08/28/03	Nothelfer	Conference with L. Henrikson re Mestek exhibits.	.2
08/28/03	Oleszkiewicz	Prepare for trial - witnesses prep and pretrial order prep with exhibits.	10.6
08/28/03	Pollard	Review e-mail re denial of mandamus petition.	.1
08/28/03	Saines	Hearing before Judge Leinenweber re Met-Coil BK and stay of case.	2.0

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/28/03	Saines	Telephone conference with J. Madonia, J. Connor and graphics company re demonstrative exhibits.	.8
08/28/03	Saines	Telephone conference with W. Sturchio re Daubert and trial issues.	.6
08/28/03	Saines	Review Reply Brief and documents to prepare for trial.	5.7
08/28/03	Saines	Revise Summary Reply.	.4
08/28/03	Sanders	Attend status hearing re third-party actions and bankruptcy.	1.2
08/28/03	Sanders	Review documents re pre-trial order and revise document list.	6.7
08/28/03	Sanders	Review Honeywell witnesses documents and materials.	1.1
08/28/03	Sievers	Conference with R. Saines on assignment/research into selective admission of prior recorded testimony; prepare memo on conclusions.	2.1
08/28/03	Willis	Conference with A. Nothelfer re pre-trial preparation tasks.	1.1
08/28/03	Willis	Prepare witness binders; attend to trial preparation.	6.8
08/29/03	Hackett	Conference and analysis re tasks, strategy and issues related to trial, trial strategy, motions and related issues.	1.4

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/29/03	Herald, Jr.	Telephone conference with R. Bahe-Johnson re Mestek not wanting sur-reply filed and also wants to discourage Honeywell from filing; exchange correspondence with Wildman attorneys re same; conference with M. McCutcheon re motions in limine and pretrial order issues; conference with D. Sanders re same; review bankruptcy filings from Greenburg; joint defense conference call with client and bankruptcy counsel; conference call with D. Sanders, F. Citera and G. Vurdelja re Mestek defense strategy/stay and final pretrial order issues re same; review third party defendants' motion to deem cross claims filed and denied.	6.0
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Prepare objections to plaintiffs' trial exhibits.	.3
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Prepare defendants' trial exhibits.	2.0
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Telephone conference with attorney re piercing corporate veil, jury instructions and motions in limine.	.2
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Prepare jury instructions for Mestek.	1.3
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Prepare e-mail to T. Hopp re motions in limine.	.2
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Conference with J.P. Herald and D. Sanders re trial strategy.	1.5
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Prepare cross examination outline of R. Block.	1.5
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Review R. Block's deposition transcript from 1993 lawsuit.	1.0
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Review R. Block's LeClercq trial testimony.	1.0
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Review 2003 deposition transcript of R. Block.	1.0
08/29/03	McCutcheon	Review trial transcript of D. Cooke's LeClercq trial testimony.	.2
08/29/03	Nothelfer	Organize materials in Room 33A for attorneys.	.7
08/29/03	Nothelfer	Prepare copy of trial subpoenas for D. Sanders.	.2

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/29/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conference with M. Scavo re materials.	.2
08/29/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	.3
08/29/03	Nothelfer	Conference with J. Schwind re copying services.	.1
08/29/03	Nothelfer	Prepare facsimile of J. Reed confidential deposition for M. Scavo.	.2
08/29/03	Nothelfer	Update and prepare witness binders.	3.5
08/29/03	Oleszkiewicz	Prepare for trial; calls re Berggreen and Meagher; outline and document re same; fashion Mestek-type defense and outline of same; call G. Vurdelja.	6.8
08/29/03	Saines	Telephone conference with D. Sanders and M. McCutcheon re case strategy and pretrial order.	1.2
08/29/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with F. Citera, G. Vurdelja and P. Herald re pre-trial order and trial strategy.	.9
08/29/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with bankruptcy and trial attorneys re pre-trial order, expert payment and trial strategy.	1.0
08/29/03	Sanders	Revise Connor document list for pre-trial order.	1.2
08/29/03	Sanders	Review Devane documents re pre-trial order.	3.1
08/29/03	Sanders	Review Scheel materials re trial preparation.	1.5
08/29/03	Willis	Prepare witness binders.	5.2
08/30/03	Herald, Jr.	Trial preparation re class plaintiff representatives, expert Ball issues, pretrial order and motion in limine issues.	4.0
08/30/03	McCutcheon	Prepare cross examination outline for D. Cooke.	2.0
08/30/03	McCutcheon	Prepare cross examination outline of T. Love.	.3

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/30/03	McCutcheon	Prepare cross examination outline for F. Nelson.	2.0
08/30/03	McCutcheon	Review deposition transcript of F. Nelson.	1.0
08/30/03	McCutcheon	Prepare and review defense exhibits for pretrial order document list.	1.0
08/30/03	McCutcheon	Review deposition and trial testimony of S. Incandella for preparation of cross examination outline.	1.0
08/30/03	McCutcheon	Prepare cross examination outline for R. Blakeman.	.2
08/30/03	McCutcheon	Review prior trial testimony and deposition transcript of R. Blakeman.	2.3
08/30/03	Saines	Review documents for pretrial order.	5.7
08/30/03	Saines	Prepare and revise article for ABA Journal.	4.0
08/30/03	Sanders	Review Connor documents re pre-trial order.	3.2
08/30/03	Sanders	Revise pre-trial order.	1.7
08/30/03	Sanders	Review Heitt trial testimony re Mejdrech trial preparation.	.9
08/30/03	Sanders	Review R. St. John documents re pre-trial order and Mejdrech preparation.	1.5
08/31/03	Herald, Jr.	Trial preparation re expert Ball issues, Met-Coil witnesses, pretrial order and motion in limine issues.	4.0
08/31/03	Saines	Review document list from J. Connor for pretrial order.	1.6
08/31/03	Sanders	Review Heitt deposition transcripts re Mejdrech trial preparation.	1.9
08/31/03	Sanders	Review Mestek due diligence documents for pre-trial order and revise pre-trial order.	4.2

Total Fees: \$ 55,415.50

SUMMARY OF FEES:**Chicago Office**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		<u>Amount</u>
David P. Hackett	3.3	425.00	\$	1,402.50
J. Patrick Herald, Jr.	25.5	450.00		11,475.00
Michael C. McCutcheon	35.6	200.00		7,120.00
Amy M. Nothelfer	16.8	150.00		2,520.00
Vincent S. Oleszkiewicz	27.9	375.00		10,462.50
Michael A. Pollard	.1	430.00		43.00
Richard M. Saines	30.1	290.00		8,729.00
Douglas B. Sanders	40.7	260.00		10,582.00
Eric W. Sievers	2.1	215.00		451.50
Michael V. Terrell	3.2	100.00		320.00
Heather A. Willis	16.5	140.00		2,310.00
				<hr/>
	Total:		\$	55,415.50

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES:

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Photocopies	\$ 1,875.45
Transportation - Local	18.00
Outside Information Services	159.33
Facsimile	23.89
Binding Charge	43.50
	<hr/>
	Total Expenses: \$ 2,120.17

Total Fees and Expenses for Mejdrech: \$ 57,535.67

BAKER & M^cKENZIE

The Lockformer Company
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054811

September 18, 2003
Page 13

TOTAL FEES:	\$ 55,820.50
TOTAL EXPENSES:	<u>\$ 2,381.08</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE:	<u>\$ 58,201.58</u>