

Exhibit 1

BAKER & M^CKENZIE

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

ONE PRUDENTIAL PLAZA
130 EAST RANDOLPH DRIVE
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60601-6384
TELEPHONE (312) 861-8000
FACSIMILE (312) 861-2899

www.bakernet.com

EUROPE
MIDDLE EAST

AMSTERDAM
ANTWERP
BAHRAIN
BARCELONA
BERLIN
BOLOGNA
BRUSSELS
BUDAPEST
CAIRO
DUSSELDORF
FRANKFURT
GENEVA
KIEV

LONDON
MADRID
MILAN
MOSCOW
MUNICH
PARIS
PRAGUE
RIYADH
ROME
STOCKHOLM
ST. PETERSBURG
WARSAW
ZURICH

ASIA
PACIFIC

ALMATY
BAKU
BANGKOK
BEIJING
HANOI
HO CHI MINH CITY
HONG KONG
HSINCHU
MANILA
MELBOURNE
SINGAPORE
SYDNEY
TAIPEI
TOKYO

NORTH AND
SOUTH AMERICA

BOGOTA
BRASILIA
BUENOS AIRES
CARACAS
CHICAGO
DALLAS
GUADALAJARA
HOUSTON

JUAREZ
MEXICO CITY
MIAMI
MONTERREY
NEW YORK
PALO ALTO
PORTO ALEGRE
RIO DE JANEIRO

SAN DIEGO
SAN FRANCISCO
SANTIAGO
SAO PAULO
TIJUANA
TORONTO
VALENCIA
WASHINGTON, D.C.

David P. Hackett
(312) 861-6640
DAVID.P.HACKETT@BAKERNET.COM

October 31, 2003

Rian Scheel
Vice President and General Manager
The Lockformer Company, A Division of Met-Coil Corporation
711 Ogden Avenue
Lisle, IL 60532

Re: Statement for Legal Services

Dear Rian:

Enclosed please find our statement for professional services rendered and expenses incurred for the period ending September 30, 2003.

Please return the enclosed remittance copy with your payment to ensure proper credit to your account.

According to our Accounting Department, the following prior statements remain outstanding:

<u>INVOICE #</u>	<u>STATEMENT DATE</u>	<u>AMOUNT DUE</u>
21048875	July 23, 2003	\$ 358,333.23
21049614	August 01, 2003	\$ 314,327.97
21051977 (Pre-Petition)	September 18, 2003	\$ 219,537.84
21054811 (Post-Petition)	September 18, 2003	\$ 44,246.46
Total Amount Outstanding:		\$ 1,529,184.38

BAKER & MCKENZIE

Rian Scheel
The Lockformer Company
October 31, 2003
Page 2

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,

David P. Hackett

DPH/bdm
Enclosures

BAKER & MCKENZIE

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

ONE PRUDENTIAL PLAZA
130 EAST RANDOLPH DRIVE
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60601-6384
TELEPHONE (312) 861-8000
FACSIMILE (312) 861-2899

IRS# 36-2137456

STATEMENT

October 31, 2003

The Lockformer Company, A Division of Met-Coil Corporation
711 Ogden Avenue
Lisle, IL 60532

- to -

BAKER & MCKENZIE
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054814

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD ENDING SEPTEMBER 30, 2003, AS FOLLOWS:

TOTAL FEES	\$ 65,022.50
TOTAL EXPENSES	\$ 1,720.13
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	\$ 66,742.63

For your convenience, you may send a *Wire Transfer* in payment of statements to:

Baker & McKenzie
Bank One
120 South LaSalle Street
Chicago, IL 60603
Account No. 110183
Routing No. 071000013
SWIFT Code: FNBC-US-44

RE: Invoice #: 21054814

BAKER & M^CKENZIE

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

ONE PRUDENTIAL PLAZA
130 EAST RANDOLPH DRIVE
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60601-6384
TELEPHONE (312) 861-8000
FACSIMILE (312) 861-2899

IRS# 36-2137456

REMITTANCE COPY

October 31, 2003

The Lockformer Company, A Division of Met-Coil Corporation
711 Ogden Avenue
Lisle, IL 60532

- to -

BAKER & M^CKENZIE
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054814

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE
PERIOD ENDING SEPTEMBER 30, 2003, AS FOLLOWS:

TOTAL FEES.....	\$ 65,022.50
TOTAL EXPENSES.....	\$ <u>1,720.13</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE.....	\$ <u>66,742.63</u>

PLEASE RETURN THIS COPY WITH YOUR REMITTANCE

BAKER & MCKENZIE

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

ONE PRUDENTIAL PLAZA
130 EAST RANDOLPH DRIVE
CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60601-6384
TELEPHONE (312) 861-8000
FACSIMILE (312) 861-2899

IRS# 36-2137456

October 31, 2003

The Lockformer Company, A Division of Met-Coil Corporation
711 Ogden Avenue
Lisle, IL 60532

- to -

BAKER & MCKENZIE
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054814

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE
PERIOD ENDING SEPTEMBER 30, 2003, AS FOLLOWS:

RE: Devane et al vs. Lockformer et al

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/08/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	2.6
09/09/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	1.9
09/10/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	1.0
09/10/03	Nothelfer	Update pleading index and boards.	.4
09/10/03	Nothelfer	Organize D. Sander's materials from trial.	.7
09/10/03	Nothelfer	Organize P. Herald's materials from trial and conference with J. Costello re materials.	1.6
09/11/03	Herald, Jr.	Telephone conference/voicemail exchange with plaintiff's attorney, E. Scanlan.	.2

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/11/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	1.8
09/11/03	Nothelfer	Update pleading boards and index.	.9
09/12/03	Herald, Jr.	Telephone conference with E. Scanlan, plaintiff's attorney, re: post trial motion and bankruptcy stay; referred to R. Barliant.	.2
09/12/03	Nothelfer	Update correspondence files.	1.4
09/12/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	.3
09/12/03	Nothelfer	Update pleading index and boards.	3.3
09/12/03	Nothelfer	Review file for Order for D. Sanders.	.4
09/12/03	Nothelfer	Send facsimile of Order to C. Clark for D. Sanders.	.2
09/15/03	Nothelfer	Update pleading index and boards.	4.9
09/17/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	1.0
09/17/03	Nothelfer	Organize correspondence files.	.5
09/17/03	Plaza	Organization of file.	.5
09/17/03	Sanders	Address billing issues with Trialgraphix.	.8
09/18/03	Plaza	Organize file.	3.1
09/19/03	Herald, Jr.	Receive and review fax from E. Scanlan re: plaintiff's motion for extension of time to file response to defendant's post trial motion; telephone conference with E. Scanlan.	.3
09/19/03	Nothelfer	Update case file index.	.5
09/19/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials into boxes.	3.7
09/22/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials into boxes.	4.9
09/22/03	Nothelfer	Update case files index.	.9
09/23/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	2.0
09/23/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials into boxes.	.6
09/23/03	Nothelfer	Update case files index.	.8

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/24/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials into boxes.	4.3
09/24/03	Nothelfer	Update case files index.	.5
09/26/03	Nothelfer	Contact H. Willis regarding Plaintiffs' trial exhibits.	.1
09/26/03	Nothelfer	Update case files index.	1.2
09/26/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials into boxes.	3.0
09/26/03	Plaza	Organize file.	.7
09/30/03	Herald, Jr.	Status report to counsel; correspondence with D. Sanders re: same.	.2
09/30/03	Herald, Jr.	Receive and review copy of order re: plaintiff's motion for extension of time to respond to Honeywell's post trial motion.	.2
09/30/03	Nothelfer	Contact M. Scavo re Plaintiffs extension to reply and conference with D. Sanders re reply.	.2
09/30/03	Plaza	Organize file.	1.0
Total Fees:			\$ 8,152.50

SUMMARY OF FEES:**Chicago Office**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
J. Patrick Herald, Jr.	1.1	450.00	\$ 495.00
Amy M. Nothelfer	45.6	150.00	6,840.00
Lisa M. Plaza	5.3	115.00	609.50
Douglas B. Sanders	.8	260.00	208.00
Total:			\$ 8,152.50

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES:

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
Telephone	\$ 2.10	
Photocopies	9.90	
Business Meals	173.66	
Facsimile	5.76	
Outside Copy Service	17.50	
		Total Expenses: \$ <u>208.92</u>
		Total Fees and Expenses for Devane et al vs. Lockformer et al: \$ 8,361.42

RE: General

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/04/03	Hackett	Conferences and analysis related to multiple issues.	.4
09/15/03	Sanders	Review list of litigation and email correspondence with bankruptcy counsel re same.	.2
09/15/03	Sanders	Review and coordinate expert, consultant and litigation support bills for bankruptcy; exchange email correspondence with K. Martin re same.	2.2
09/16/03	Hackett	Further analysis and strategy re bankruptcy and environmental developments and issues; evaluate and pursue same.	1.6
09/17/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with Trialgraphix and review bills.	.4
09/23/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with P. Fain re Trialgraphix bills.	.4

BAKER & M^cKENZIE

The Lockformer Company
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054814

October 31, 2003
Page 5

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/25/03	Hackett	Review issues related to bankruptcy, Baker & McKenzie role and conference with Metcoil bankruptcy counsel related to same.	.8
09/26/03	Hackett	Follow-up re bankruptcy and related tasks.	.6
Total Fees:			\$ 2,277.00

SUMMARY OF FEES:

Chicago Office

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
David P. Hackett	3.4	425.00	\$ 1,445.00
Douglas B. Sanders	3.2	260.00	832.00
Total:			\$ 2,277.00

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES:

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
Telephone	\$ 1.14	
Photocopies	35.10	
Courier/Messenger Service	5.50	
Total Expenses:		\$ 41.74

Total Fees and Expenses for General: \$ 2,318.74

RE: Mejdrech

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/01/03	Hackett	Conferences and analysis related to trial preparation, strategy and tasks.	.8
09/01/03	Herald, Jr.	Conference with D. Sanders and M. McCutcheon re final pretrial orders, motions in limine and witness/trial preparation; class representative plaintiff materials review; exhibits list/structure.	6.0
09/01/03	McCutcheon	Conference with J.P. Herald re motions in limine filing for 9/2/03 with Honeywell jointly.	.3
09/01/03	McCutcheon	Prepare joint motions in limine with P. Freeborn.	.5
09/01/03	McCutcheon	Prepare e-mail to F. Citem re motions in limine filing on 9/2/03.	.3
09/01/03	McCutcheon	Prepare motions in limine with P. Freeborn of Wildman Harrold for joint filing.	.6
09/01/03	Oleszkiewicz	Prepare for trial - witness exams and documents; review draft pretrial order; conference re same with D. Sanders.	5.5
09/01/03	Saines	Prepare pretrial order and telephone conference with J. Connor re same.	7.5
09/01/03	Sanders	Review documents and review and revise motions for pre-trial order and trial preparation.	7.4
09/02/03	Hackett	Conferences and meetings re settlement; review continuing issues and tasks; evaluate ongoing strategy related to Honeywell, Metcoil witnesses, experts and third-party actions.	1.7

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/02/03	Herald, Jr.	Conference with D. Sanders and M. McCutcheon re final pretrial order and motion in limine filing issues; telephone conference with F. Citera re same; conference with V. Oleszkiewicz re L. Meagher issues and exhibits; conference re J. Connor issues with R. Saines and D. Sanders; conference with A. Nothelfer re filing; conference with G. Vurdelja re notice of settlement; telephone conference with N. Barry and T. Hopp re same and motion in limine issues; telephone conference with J. Madonia re settlement/court appearance issue; telephone conference with F. Citera re R. Heard/Honeywell correspondence re settlement and indemnification issues; telephone conference with R. Barliant re same and Met-Coil issues for Honeywell trial; conference with D. Sanders re same and witness preparation/revision issues; review Honeywell's response to plaintiff's motion to bar testimony of Dr. Sturchio; review copies of subpoenas to G. Vlk, R. Scheel and R. Berggreen.	4.0
09/02/03	McCutcheon	Prepare exhibits to motions in limine.	.4
09/02/03	McCutcheon	Review depositions of M. Carroll.	1.0
09/02/03	McCutcheon	Review deposition transcript of A. Link.	1.0
09/02/03	McCutcheon	Review deposition transcripts of K. Maxwell.	2.0
09/02/03	McCutcheon	Conference with J.P. Herald re settlement of case and terms of settlement release.	.2
09/02/03	Nothelfer	Prepare exhibits for filing and messenger to Wildman for M. McCutcheon.	1.5
09/02/03	Nothelfer	Gather Mestek documents for D. Sanders.	.2
09/02/03	Nothelfer	Review files for Honeywell's corporate address for K. Pamerter.	.3
09/02/03	Nothelfer	Prepare witness binder.	1.2

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/02/03	Nothelfer	Prepare copy of Tolling Agreement for D. Sanders.	.2
09/02/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	.3
09/02/03	Nothelfer	Review and file new materials.	.4
09/02/03	Nothelfer	Update pleading index and boards.	1.6
09/02/03	Oleszkiewicz	Prepare for trial; conference re status re strategy with team; review settlement; expert witness review.	3.5
09/02/03	Saines	Review documents for pre-trial order.	2.8
09/02/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with G. Vurdelja re pre-trial order.	.2
09/02/03	Sanders	Review documents for trial preparation and pre-trial order.	2.1
09/02/03	Sanders	Review motions in limine and prepare for trial.	.6
09/02/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with P. Herald and V. Oleszkiewicz re bankruptcy and settlement.	.2
09/03/03	Hackett	Conferences and analysis re tasks and issues in connection with pursuit of third-party complaints; review pleadings, issues and follow-up re bankruptcy, settlement, and ongoing trial matters.	1.3
09/03/03	Herald, Jr.	Telephone conference with R. Barliant re bankruptcy issues; conference with V. Oleszkiewicz re same and witness preparation; conference with R. Saines re third party action issues and AG/IEPA remediation and Judge Leinenweber partial summary judgment ruling factual errors.	3.0
09/03/03	Nothelfer	Conference with L. Henrikson re settlement.	.2
09/03/03	Nothelfer	Update pleading index and boards.	.8
09/03/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	3.7

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/03/03	Nothelfer	Prepare copy of LeClercq Settlement Amendment for D. Sanders.	.3
09/03/03	Nothelfer	Prepare copy of documents and messenger to M. Scavo.	.9
09/03/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conferences with M. Scavo re documents.	.2
09/03/03	Nothelfer	Update correspondence files.	.3
09/03/03	Oleszkiewicz	Prepare emails re outstanding billing; prepare emails re settlement details; press release review; emails and conference re remainder of case vs. Honeywell and potential witness issues.	2.3
09/03/03	Saines	Conference with D. Sanders re Access Agreement and review same.	.5
09/03/03	Saines	Review plaintiff's exhibits to their summary judgment motion and telephone conference with J. Connor re same.	2.3
09/03/03	Sanders	Review research re extinguishing third-party liability in settlement agreement in order to pursue contribution claims and prepare email re same.	.8
09/03/03	Sanders	Review settlement letter.	.4
09/03/03	Sanders	Review Honeywell subpoenas and prepare email re same.	.2
09/03/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with R. Bahe-Jachna and N. Pakkala re Honeywell contribution claims.	.2
09/03/03	Sanders	Review subpoenas and email to Pamentor and Citera re subpoenas of Met-Coil witnesses.	.4
09/03/03	Sanders	Review email correspondence and Honeywell pre-trial order and crossclaims.	.8

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/04/03	Hackett	Conference and analysis re issues; attend to additional tasks and follow-up; review related bankruptcy matters; evaluate third-party claim issues and tasks.	1.2
09/04/03	Herald, Jr.	Receive and review notice of agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on 9/5; motion to shorten re: debtors motion for entry of order authorizing continued use of accounts; receive and review copy of article re: Lockformer.	.5
09/04/03	Herald, Jr.	Review plaintiff's motion in limine for 9/8 trial; conference with V. Oleszkiewicz re witness issues; conference with D. Sanders re same; telephone conference with R. Scheel re testimony preparation and attendance at trial; conference with R. Saines re AG/IEPA/USEPA status issues and plaintiff's final pretrial order issues; joint defense conference call on status of pending issues, bankruptcy hearing on 9/5 and Honeywell trial on 9/8; review F. Citera fax re Mejdrech and Schreiber; review motion for protective order and to quash subpoena; review copy of C. Clark's letter re J. Reed, J. Heitt and R. Stodola availability; review plaintiff's motion to compel production of Mestek documents, copy of S. Collins' letter re Scheel's availability and plaintiff's proposed final pretrial order; review memorandum and opinion re denial of defendants' motion to strike and plaintiff's motion to bar testimony of Dr. Sturchio is granted.	5.0
09/04/03	Nothelfer	Review file for and prepare copies of Access Agreements and send via facsimile to K. Pamenter.	2.1
09/04/03	Nothelfer	Update correspondence files.	3.0
09/04/03	Nothelfer	Prepare facsimile of correspondence to K. Pamenter and F. Citera for R. Saines.	.3

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/04/03	Oleszkiewicz	Conference re Honeywell issues and Honeywell settlement; telephone conferences with potential witnesses re status and outcome; conference re status with P. Herald.	2.3
09/04/03	Roy	Telephone conference from M. Bilut re third party defendants' motion to adopt responsive pleadings.	.1
09/04/03	Saines	Weekly litigation conference call.	.6
09/04/03	Saines	Prepare correspondence to Goldberg Kohn and Greenberg Traurig.	.2
09/05/03	Herald, Jr.	Review issues re 9/8 Honeywell trial involving Met-Coil; telephone conference with N. Barry re Honeywell settlement; telephone conference with T. Hopp re same; telephone conference with G. Dickinson/G. Vlk re trial testimony availability; conference with plaintiff and Honeywell re same; review Honeywell settlement letter and notice of settlement; conference with R. Saines re issues with Judge Leinenweber partial summary judgment opinion; reconsideration or clarification re expert, J. Connor, testimony for third party actions; telephone conference with G. Vurdelja re settlement and third party issues. indemnification and bankruptcy ruling.	4.5
09/05/03	Nothelfer	Review and file new materials.	.4
09/05/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	1.2
09/05/03	Nothelfer	Update LeClercq third-party pleading index and boards.	4.3
09/05/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conference with N. Pakkala re document.	.1
09/05/03	Nothelfer	Send document via facsimile to N. Pakkala.	.2

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/05/03	Oleszkiewicz	Review status and various bankruptcy issues; review Third Party Complaint issue with R. Saines.	.8
09/05/03	Saines	Review Court's opinion and telephone conference with J. Connor re same.	1.0
09/05/03	Saines	Review documents.	2.2
09/05/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with N. Pakkala re Honeywell claims.	.4
09/08/03	Herald, Jr.	Telephone conference with R. Bahe-Johnson at Greenburg re Honeywell indemnification claims; telephone conference with J. Connor (GSI) re unpaid time and path forward; telephone conference with R. Barliant re same; conference with F. Citera re same, retention issues and third party actions; conference with D. Sanders and V. Oleszkiewicz re same.	2.0
09/08/03	Nothelfer	Review and file new materials.	.3
09/08/03	Nothelfer	Organize LeClercq third-party case files.	1.0
09/08/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conference with M. Scavo re document.	.1
09/08/03	Nothelfer	Send Honeywell crossclaims via facsimile to M. Scavo.	.4
09/08/03	Nothelfer	Conference with L. Henrikson re J. Connor retention letter.	.2
09/08/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	.3
09/08/03	Nothelfer	Organize document productions.	.5
09/08/03	Oleszkiewicz	Request for Connor retention letter and Connor status.	.4
09/08/03	Sanders	Review pleadings re Honeywell claims against Mestek.	.5
09/08/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with N. Pakkala re Honeywell claims.	.2

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/08/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with P. Herald re partial summary judgment; review partial summary judgment opinion.	.8
09/09/03	Herald, Jr.	Correspondence with D. Sanders re: recap of conference call re: status issues with Attorney General, IEPA, USEPA; bankruptcy issues; receive and review copy of L. Dombrowski correspondence to Judge Leinenweber re: withdrawal of Honeywell's motion to clarify cross-claim against Mestek.	.5
09/09/03	Nothelfer	Organize document productions.	1.0
09/09/03	Nothelfer	Contact M. Scavo re LeClercq deposition exhibits.	.1
09/09/03	Nothelfer	Messenger LeClercq deposition exhibits to M. Scavo.	1.1
09/09/03	Nothelfer	Review and file new materials.	.3
09/09/03	Nothelfer	Revise pleading index and boards.	.3
09/09/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	.4
09/09/03	Saines	Prepare motion to modify order.	2.0
09/09/03	Saines	Telephone conference with D. Sanders re motion to modify order.	.6
09/09/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with R. Saines re partial summary judgment and contribution.	.6
09/10/03	Herald, Jr.	Correspondence with V. Oleszkiewicz re: gathering Greenburg requested information; joint defense call for 9/11 cancelled; correspondence with D. Sanders re: suggesting reconsideration or request to modify summary judgment order.	.5
09/10/03	Nothelfer	Review and file new materials.	.4
09/10/03	Nothelfer	Review files for closing documents for M. Scavo.	.4

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/10/03	Nothelfer	Conferences with V. Oleszkiewicz re closing documents binder.	.2
09/10/03	Nothelfer	Contact M. Scavo re closing documents binder.	.1
09/10/03	Nothelfer	Contact D. Sanders re access agreements for K. Pamenter.	.1
09/10/03	Oleszkiewicz	Request for closing documents; locate same and emails re location of documents.	.7
09/10/03	Sanders	Review partial summary judgment opinion and draft memo to client re motion to reconsider.	2.1
09/11/03	Herald, Jr.	Correspondence with D. Sanders and R. Saines re: Judge Leinenweber reconsideration issues.	.3
09/11/03	Nothelfer	Review and file new materials.	.3
09/11/03	Nothelfer	Review file for and send facsimile of access agreement to K. Pamenter.	.4
09/11/03	Nothelfer	Review file for escrow documents and messenger to K. Pamenter for D. Sanders.	1.0
09/11/03	Oleszkiewicz	Prepare emails and request for Met-Coil closing binder; conference re same with A. Nothelfer and M. Paul.	.5
09/12/03	Herald, Jr.	Conference with D. Hackett re: status; telephone conference with D. Sanders re: third party action issues and reconsideration of Judge Leinenweber 9/4 partial summary judgment ruling; receive and review notice of change of firm name from Eimer, Stahl Klevojn & Solberg.	.5
09/12/03	Nothelfer	Prepare copy of closing documents binders for V. Oleszkiewicz.	.2
09/12/03	Nothelfer	Prepare cover letter and prepare documents to be sent to M. Scavo.	.3
09/12/03	Oleszkiewicz	Review closing binder; copy for Bankruptcy counsel; prepare emails re same.	.4

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/12/03	Sanders	Review Summary Judgment opinion and revise email correspondence re possible impact on contribution claims and defenses.	3.7
09/15/03	Hackett	Conferences and analysis related to role, tasks, issues and undertaking.	.6
09/15/03	Herald, Jr.	Receive and review e-mail correspondence from K. Pamentor; bankruptcy info/issues re: litigation matters within last year; correspondence with R. Saines re: same and R. St. John issue; telephone conference with J. Connor re: outstanding invoices;	.5
09/15/03	Nothelfer	Send closing documents binder to M. Scavo via messenger.	.3
09/15/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	.4
09/15/03	Oleszkiewicz	Prepare invoices to Met-Coil; calls to various consultants re status of invoices; prepare emails re same.	1.2
09/16/03	Herald, Jr.	Review notice of commencement of Chapter 11 bankruptcy case, meeting of creditors and fixing of certain dates.	.2
09/16/03	Nothelfer	Send closing documents to M. Paul via pouch delivery for V. Oleszkiewicz.	.2
09/16/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	.3
09/16/03	Saines	Telephone conference with M. Latham re contribution action.	.3
09/17/03	Nothelfer	Review files for LeClercq list of Plaintiffs and prepare cover letter to K. Pamentor for D. Sanders.	.6
09/17/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	.5
09/17/03	Nothelfer	Prepare copy of USEPA 106 Order for D. Sanders.	.3
09/17/03	Nothelfer	Prepare list of invoices to send to K. Martin for D. Sanders.	1.5

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/17/03	Oleszkiewicz	Conference re status with R. Saines and D. Sanders.	.3
09/17/03	Sanders	Email correspondence re list of opt-outs with LeClercq and Mejdrech.	.3
09/18/03	Herald, Jr.	Correspondence with R. Saines re geographic boundary for notice issues; conference with D. Hackett re telephone conference with N. Filler; conference with D. Sanders re expert issue in third party actions; review bankruptcy notices.	.5
09/18/03	Nothelfer	Review and file new materials.	.2
09/18/03	Nothelfer	Review contents of disk for D. Sanders.	.2
09/18/03	Nothelfer	Revise list of invoices and send to K. Martin.	1.3
09/18/03	Nothelfer	Conference with V. Oleszkiewicz re invoice list.	.2
09/18/03	Nothelfer	Organize V. Oleszkiewicz case materials.	1.4
09/18/03	Nothelfer	Send invoice via facsimile to K. Martin.	.3
09/18/03	Nothelfer	Update case file index.	.5
09/18/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials.	1.8
09/18/03	Nothelfer	Organize case file materials into boxes.	.5
09/18/03	Oleszkiewicz	Prepare email re status and follow-up.	.4
09/19/03	Herald, Jr.	Telephone conference with R. Barliant re communication issues and role going forward; telephone conference with C. Kuoni's office re same; conference with R. Saines re R. St. John as testifying expert issue/objection.	.3
09/22/03	Herald, Jr.	Telephone conference with C. Kuoni re B&M role moving forward, new engagement letter involving limited role forward and agreed \$100,000 deposit/retainer; conference with D. Hackett and R. Saines re same; review bankruptcy affidavit from K. Pamentier; conference with A. Stamato re same.	.5

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/23/03	Herald, Jr.	Conference with R. Saines re draft new engagement description; review K. Pamerter email correspondence; correspondence with A. Stamato re bankruptcy affidavit; conference with D. Hackett re same.	.5
09/23/03	Nothelfer	Gather and prepare invoices to be copied for K. Martin.	.4
09/23/03	Nothelfer	Send invoices to K. Martin via messenger for D. Sanders.	.2
09/24/03	Herald, Jr.	Correspondence with A. Stamato re bankruptcy affidavit issue; conference with D. Hackett re representation issue; conference call for 9/25 cancelled.	.5
09/24/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conference with M. Keough re reports for Goldberg.	.2
09/24/03	Nothelfer	Telephone conference with L. Rossman at Goldberg re complaint and reports.	.1
09/24/03	Nothelfer	Conference with D. Sanders re reports.	.1
09/25/03	Herald, Jr.	Review email from K. Pamerter re bankruptcy affidavit; conference with D. Hackett A. Stamato re: same; telephone conference with N. Barry re status inquiry.	.5
09/29/03	Nothelfer	Organize other case file materials.	1.9
09/30/03	Herald, Jr.	Review notice of commencement of Chapter 11 bankruptcy case, meeting of creditors and fixing of certain dates.	.2
09/30/03	Nothelfer	Organize LeClercq Third Party case file materials.	3.1
09/30/03	Nothelfer	Organize other case file materials.	2.0

Total Fees: \$ 43,485.00

SUMMARY OF FEES:**Chicago Office**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		<u>Amount</u>
David P. Hackett	5.6	425.00	\$	2,380.00
J. Patrick Herald, Jr.	30.5	450.00		13,725.00
Michael C. McCutcheon	6.3	200.00		1,260.00
Amy M. Nothelfer	51.6	150.00		7,740.00
Vincent S. Oleszkiewicz	18.3	375.00		6,862.50
Shima S. Roy	.1	235.00		23.50
Richard M. Saines	20.0	290.00		5,800.00
Douglas B. Sanders	21.9	260.00		5,694.00
				<hr/>
	Total:		\$	43,485.00

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES:

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Telephone	\$ 9.11
Photocopies	616.35
Transportation - Local	105.00
Staff Overtime	51.45
Courier/Messenger Service	90.96
Outside Information Services	51.05
Facsimile	75.92
Outside Copy Service	337.62
	<hr/>
Total Expenses:	\$ 1,337.46

Total Fees and Expenses for Mejdrech: \$ 44,822.46

RE: USEPA Notice Letter

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/03/03	Saines	Telephone conference with R. Scheel re distribution of meeting minutes.	.2
09/03/03	Saines	Review meeting minutes.	.2
09/03/03	Saines	Telephone conference with A. Bourlard re meeting minutes.	.2
09/03/03	Saines	Telephone conference with R. St. John re technical meeting and S. Faryan Affidavit.	.4
09/03/03	Saines	Telephone conference with K. Mack re settlement status.	.2
09/03/03	Sanders	Revise Access Agreement and prepare email correspondence to bankruptcy counsel.	2.9
09/04/03	Saines	Bi-weekly technical telephone conference re ongoing remediation.	3.3
09/04/03	Sanders	Review Access Agreement file for bankruptcy counsel.	.9
09/05/03	Saines	Telephone conference with S. McKibben re URS invoices and continued access to Ogden Corporate Center.	.8
09/08/03	Saines	Telephone conference with S. Bezark re status.	.6
09/09/03	Saines	Telephone conference with K. Pamenter, R. Barliant, D. Sanders and K. Mack re clean-up status.	1.2
09/09/03	Sanders	Participate in conference call with bankruptcy attorneys re coordination and communication with IEPA/USEPA.	.9
09/11/03	Saines	Telephone conference with K. Pamenter, R. Barliant, D. Sanders and K. Mack re internal communication.	1.0
09/11/03	Saines	Telephone conference with D. Sanders re internal communication.	.4

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/11/03	Sanders	Conference call with R. Barliant, R. Saines, K. Mack and K. Pamentor.	1.0
09/11/03	Sanders	Review escrow agreement material.	.9
09/11/03	Sanders	Conference call with R. Saines re internal communication.	.4
09/12/03	Saines	Telephone conference with R. St. John re new procedures.	.6
09/12/03	Saines	Telephone conference with K. Mack re new procedures.	.3
09/12/03	Sanders	Review email correspondence and telephone conference with R. Saines re access issues.	.3
09/15/03	Sanders	Revise Access Agreement.	.7
09/16/03	Saines	Telephone conference with R. St. John re remediation issues.	1.3
09/16/03	Saines	Telephone conference with A. Bourlard re remediation issues.	.7
09/17/03	Saines	Telephone conference with A. Bourlard and J. Olsen re USEPA meeting.	.8
09/17/03	Saines	Conference with D. Sanders re USEPA research.	.4
09/17/03	Sanders	Research re Met-Coil options to challenge USEPA and IEPA actions.	4.1
09/17/03	Sanders	Review AG agreed order and USEPA 106 order.	.6
09/18/03	Saines	Attend bi-weekly conference with USEPA at Lockformer.	4.7
09/18/03	Saines	Review and revise draft access agreement.	.7
09/18/03	Saines	Telephone conference with K. Mack re Village hook-up issues.	.7
09/18/03	Saines	Telephone conference with R. St. John re witness issues.	.5

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/18/03	Saines	Telephone conference with D. Hackett re geographic scope of notice.	.4
09/18/03	Sanders	Telephone conference with K. Mack re Access Agreement.	.2
09/18/03	Sanders	Revise Access Agreement per K. Mack's comments.	.4
09/19/03	Saines	Conference with D. Hackett and P. Herald re work scope and approvals; telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same; prepare email correspondence to K. Pamentier re access issues; telephone conference with P. Herald re scope of work; review invoices.	1.8
09/19/03	Sanders	Review correspondence re Access Agreements.	.2
09/22/03	Saines	Prepare engagement letter.	.3
09/22/03	Saines	Telephone conference with P. Herald re engagement letter.	.2
09/22/03	Saines	Telephone conference with P. Herald re invoices.	.2
09/22/03	Saines	Exchange email correspondence with C. Kuoni re URS escrow.	.3
09/23/03	Saines	Telephone conference with USEPA, IEPA, R. St. John, K. Mack and A. Bourland re boring installations; telephone conference with R. St. John and K. Mack re Clayton insurance for Access Agreements; review escrow agreement file for Ogden Corporate Center Property; telephone conference with S. McKibben re same; telephone conference with C. Kuoni re same; send Escrow Agreement to C. Kuoni; telephone conference with K. Martin re Clayton documents and insurance issues.	3.1

The Lockformer Company
 Client Number: 22568081
 Invoice Number: 21054814

October 31, 2003
 Page 22

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
09/26/03	Saines	Conference with V. Oleszkiewicz re status of assignment.	.2
09/29/03	Saines	Telephone conference with R. St. John re access issues.	.5

Total Fees: \$ 11,108.00

SUMMARY OF FEES:

Chicago Office

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>		<u>Amount</u>
Richard M. Saines	26.2	290.00	\$	7,598.00
Douglas B. Sanders	13.5	260.00		<u>3,510.00</u>
	Total:		\$	11,108.00

SUMMARY OF EXPENSES:

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Photocopies	\$ 2.10
Outside Information Services	128.99
Facsimile	<u>.92</u>
	Total Expenses: \$ <u>132.01</u>

Total Fees and Expenses for USEPA Notice Letter: \$ 11,240.01

BAKER & M^cKENZIE

The Lockformer Company
Client Number: 22568081
Invoice Number: 21054814

October 31, 2003
Page 23

TOTAL FEES:	\$ 65,022.50
TOTAL EXPENSES:	<u>\$ 1,720.13</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE:	<u>\$ 66,742.63</u>