

# **EXHIBIT A**

\*\*\*\*\* TIME ENTRIES \*\*\*\*\*

ID	LAST NAME	DATE	STAT	TASK	BILLED HOURS	DESCRIPTION
221	SCHWARTZ	04/08/04	B	B110	0.30	Case Administration
221	SCHWARTZ	04/08/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. agenda for 4/12 hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	04/12/04	B	B110	0.30	Conf. w\ R. Barilant re: plan, settlement, etc.
221	SCHWARTZ	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Tele. from Klehr attorney re: 4/12 hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	04/15/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Comm. Discovery Motion
221	SCHWARTZ	04/15/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. response to Comm. discovery motion
221	SCHWARTZ	04/15/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. various orders
221	SCHWARTZ	04/15/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. MORs
221	SCHWARTZ	04/15/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. objection to claim objection
221	SCHWARTZ	04/15/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Motion to Shorten time re: Comm. Discovery papers
221	SCHWARTZ	04/15/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Motion to Prosecute Actions
221	SCHWARTZ	04/15/04	B	B110	0.20	Rev. Motion for Leave
221	SCHWARTZ	04/15/04	B	B110	0.20	Conf. w\ R. Barilant and K. Pamentier re: 4/19 hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	04/19/04	B	B110	0.20	Rev. agenda and binder for 4/19 hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	04/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf. w\ R. Barilant and K. Pamentier re: 4/19 hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	04/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf. w\ D. Butz re: 4/19 hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	04/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf. w\ K. Pamentier and R. Barilant re: 4/19 hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	04/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf. w\ D. Butz re: 4/19 hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	04/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Response re: prosecuting actions
221	SCHWARTZ	04/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Beno response re: prosecuting actions
221	SCHWARTZ	04/19/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. Response re: Comm. Discovery
221	SCHWARTZ	04/19/04	B	B110	0.20	Rev. agenda for 4/19 hearing
221	SCHWARTZ	04/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. discovery
221	SCHWARTZ	04/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf. w\ D. Butz re: orders
221	SCHWARTZ	04/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. various emails by K. Pamentier, D. Butz, et. al. re: orders
221	SCHWARTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. various orders
221	SCHWARTZ	04/22/04	B	B110	0.30	Teleconf. w\ R. Barilant and K. Pamentier re: exclusivity
221	SCHWARTZ	04/22/04	B	B110	0.20	Tele. w\ A. Kelly re: exclusivity issues
221	SCHWARTZ	04/22/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. A. Kelly email re: exclusivity issue
221	SCHWARTZ	04/22/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. R. Barilant and K. Pamentier emails and respond thereto re: exclusivity
221	SCHWARTZ	04/22/04	B	B110	0.30	Rev. draft exclusivity motion
221	SCHWARTZ	04/26/04	B	B110	0.10	Tele. w\ D. Butz re: exclusivity motion
221	SCHWARTZ	04/26/04	B	B110	0.20	Tele. w\ K. Pamentier re: Comm. order
221	SCHWARTZ	04/27/04	B	B110	0.20	Rev. response re: cert.
221	SCHWARTZ	04/27/04	B	B110	0.20	Rev. emails of D. Butz, et. al. re: cert. response
221	SCHWARTZ	04/29/04	B	B110	0.20	Conf. w\ A. Kelly re: exclusivity
221	SCHWARTZ	04/29/04	B	B110	0.10	Rev. exclusivity papers
221	SCHWARTZ	04/29/04	B	B110	0.20	Rev. exclusivity motion
221	SCHWARTZ	04/30/04	B	B110	0.20	Calls with co-counsel re status and meeting with DBB adm AK
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B110	0.70	and EDS about the same
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B110	0.10	Comm to co-counsel re upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.40	Review of materials and communication with co-counsel re: various deadlines
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Comm from co-counsel re response to file today

371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Review of response to file today
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Review of supplemental affidavit of CK
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Communication with co-counsel re response to 2004 motion
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Comm from co-counsel re outstanding matters and committee pleadings
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.30	Review of response to file with the Court re 2004 motion
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Mtg with co-counsel re response to 2004 motion
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Revisions to response to 2004 motion
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re response to 2004 motion
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.20	Review and revision to agenda
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.20	Preparing response to file with the Court
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Review of response to file with the Court
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B110	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re agenda for upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Comm to co-counsel re: Mestek's response to 2004 Motion
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Review of comm motion to prosecute and communication to co-counsel about the same
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B110	0.30	Call with claimant re status of case
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B110	0.10	Comm to co-counsel re Agenda for upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B110	0.30	Meeting with DBB re transition and outstanding matters
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Communication to co-counsel re Comm Motion to Pros Actions vs. Mestek
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Call with co-counsel re: comm motion to pros actions vs mestek
389	BUTZ	04/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from EC re: agenda
389	BUTZ	04/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from K Pamerter re: agenda
389	BUTZ	04/14/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from JWH re:L agenda
389	BUTZ	04/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Emails from Katie re: order
389	BUTZ	04/20/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with EC re: order
389	BUTZ	04/20/04	B	B110	0.50	Familiarize self with order procedures with EC (.1) all re: orders
389	BUTZ	04/20/04	B	B110	0.20	Call with co-counsel (.1); discussions with EC (.1) all re: orders
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from EC re: omnibus dates
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: omnibus dates
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: order for hearing dates
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to co-counsel re: hearing dates
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email to company re: monthly operating reports
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Review MOR
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: cert for omnibus order
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Review MOR cover; conf with EC re: same
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: affidavit for ocp
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Call with co-counsel re: affidavit for ocp
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf with EC re: affidavit requirements for filing
389	BUTZ	04/21/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from EDS re: April 19th hrg (.1); email to EDS re: April 19th hrg transcript (.1)
389	BUTZ	04/27/04	B	B110	0.20	April 19th hrg transcript (.1)
389	BUTZ	04/30/04	B	B110	0.10	Email from EC re: fee hrg dates
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B110	0.60	Conf w/ DBB, J. Harbour, EDS, and co-counsel
394	KELLY	04/26/04	B	B110	0.10	Message w/ EDS re email
394	KELLY	04/27/04	B	B110	0.10	Reviewing docket for 4/19 transcript
394	KELLY	04/27/04	B	B110	0.20	Conf w/ DBB & R. Howard re 4/19 transcript
394	KELLY	04/27/04	B	B110	1.40	Preparing and filing exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/29/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ DBB re exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/29/04	B	B110	0.10	Conf w/ EDS re exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/29/04	B	B110	0.10	PC w/ R. Barliant re exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/29/04	B	B110	0.10	Message w/ K. Pamerter re exclusivity motion

394 KELLY  
 560 TATE  
 597 CAMPBELL

04/29/04 B  
 04/28/04 B  
 04/06/04 B

B110  
 B110  
 B110

0.20  
 0.30  
 3.30

18.90

Total Task:

371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR  
 389 BUTZ  
 389 BUTZ  
 389 BUTZ  
 394 KELLY  
 394 KELLY  
 597 CAMPBELL  
 597 CAMPBELL  
 597 CAMPBELL  
 597 CAMPBELL  
 597 CAMPBELL

04/05/04 B  
 04/13/04 B  
 04/23/04 B  
 04/30/04 B  
 04/30/04 B  
 04/30/04 B  
 04/22/04 B  
 04/23/04 B  
 04/01/04 B  
 04/08/04 B  
 04/15/04 B  
 04/16/04 B  
 04/19/04 B

B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160  
 B160

0.20  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.20  
 0.10  
 0.20  
 0.30  
 0.40  
 0.20  
 1.00

Fee/Employment Applications

Call with client re billing  
 Review of CNO to file with court re fee app  
 Email from X re: filing of fee application  
 Email to GK re: fee application and hearing date  
 Email from Goldberg re: fee app  
 Email to EC re: Goldberg fee app  
 Reviewing and signing MNAT CNO  
 Reviewing fee application  
 Chk status fee app (.2)  
 Chk dock re mthly operating rpt (.2);prep cos re same (.1)  
 Chk dock re mnat fee app (.2);prep cno re same (.2)  
 Chk dock re mnat fee app (.2)  
 Efile cno re chbiz fee (.2);prep cno re same (.2);chk dock re  
 Chk dock re chbiz fee (.2);prep cno re same (.2);chk status mnat  
 goldberg fee app (.2);prep cno re same (.2);chk status mnat  
 fee apps (.2)  
 Prep cos re monthly oper rpt (.1);chk dock re ord course  
 prof (.2);prep cos re same (.1);disc w/ DB and TN (.2)  
 Chk dock re mnat fee app (.2);prep cno re same (.2);edit  
 same (.1);prep same for efilng (.1);efiling same (.2)  
 Prep noa re goldberg fee app (.3);prep cos re same  
 (.1);prep fee app re same for efilng (.4);efiling same (.2)  
 P/c to ct re fee app hrg date (.1);disc same w/GS (.1);prep  
 noa re Goldberg fee app (.3);prep cos re same (.1)

6.10

6.10

Total Task:

597 CAMPBELL

Avoidance Action Analysis  
 04/19/04 B

B180

0.40

Total Task:

B180

371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR

04/01/04 B  
 04/01/04 B  
 04/05/04 B  
 04/05/04 B  
 04/05/04 B  
 04/05/04 B  
 04/05/04 B  
 04/05/04 B  
 04/05/04 B  
 04/06/04 B  
 04/06/04 B

B190  
 B190  
 B190  
 B190  
 B190  
 B190  
 B190  
 B190  
 B190  
 B190  
 B190

0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10  
 0.10

Other Contested Matters

Comm to co-counsel re discovery motion be Comm  
 Comm with co-counsel re comm discovery motion  
 Call with counsel to Mestek re: upcoming hearing  
 Call to co-counsel re upcoming hearing  
 Call with co-counsel re: upcoming hearing  
 Comm from Mestek re upcoming hearing  
 Comm to co-counsel re upcoming hearing  
 Comm with EC re upcoming hearing  
 Comm with co-counsel re upcoming hearing  
 Comm to co-counsel re agenda for upcoming hearing in  
 honeywell adv  
 Call with counsel to the Committee re Honeywell adv  
 proceeding  
 Call with the Court and EC re binder for upcoming hearing

62.00

0.40

Total Task:

B190

371 HARBOUR  
 371 HARBOUR

04/07/04 B  
 04/07/04 B

B190  
 B190

0.10  
 0.10

371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B190	0.10	Comm to co-counsel re upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B190	0.10	Cxomm with co-counsel re Honeywell hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B190	0.10	Call with co-counsel re: upcoming hearing re Honeywell
371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B190	0.10	Call with EC re upcoming honeywell hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B190	0.10	Call to the court re upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B190	0.10	Review of agenda to file with the Court
371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B190	0.10	Comm with EC re : upcoming hearing and amended agenda
371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B190	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re upcoming hearing and comm brief
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B190	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re: upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B190	0.10	Review of agenda for hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B190	0.10	Call to co-counsel re upcoming Honeywell hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B190	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re Honeywell hearing and other
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B190	0.10	outstanding matters
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B190	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re upcoming Honeywell hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B190	0.10	Call with co-counsel re response to file with the Court
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B190	0.10	Call with counsel to Mestek re upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B190	0.10	Review of corr from comm re motion to file under seal re
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B190	0.10	Honeywell adv proc
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B190	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re: upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B190	2.20	Attendance at Honeywell adv hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/12/04	B	B190	0.10	Call with co-counsel re hearing today
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B190	0.10	Comm from counsel to Mestek re: order in Honeywell adv proc
		Total Task:		B190	5.30	1325.00
394	KELLY	04/22/04	B	B300	0.30	PC w/ K. Pamentier re exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/22/04	B	B300	0.60	Email to EDS and DBB re exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/22/04	B	B300	0.10	PC w/ K. Pamentier re exclusivity phone call
394	KELLY	04/22/04	B	B300	0.20	PC w/ EDS re exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/26/04	B	B300	0.20	Conf w/ DBB re exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/26/04	B	B300	0.10	Message w/ K. Pamentier re exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/27/04	B	B300	1.10	Researching standard for exclusivity extension in Delaware bankruptcy courts
394	KELLY	04/27/04	B	B300	0.50	Drafting "cause" section of Metcoil exclusivity motion
394	KELLY	04/28/04	B	B300	0.10	Reviewing changes to the Exclusivity motion
		Total Task:		B300	3.20	704.00
371	HARBOUR	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm to EC and from claims agent re pleading to file with the Court
371	HARBOUR	04/05/04	B	B310	0.10	Review of nof to file with court re submission of proof of claims
371	HARBOUR	04/05/04	B	B310	0.10	Call with counsel to Mestek re upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/05/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm to co-counsel re upcoming hearings
371	HARBOUR	04/05/04	B	B310	0.10	Review of recently received pleadings
371	HARBOUR	04/06/04	B	B310	0.10	Call with the court and meeting with EC re omni obj binders
371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm to claims counsel and with EC re omni obj binders
371	HARBOUR	04/07/04	B	B310	0.10	Call with committee and EC re agenda for upcoming hearing
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm from claims agent re omni obj binders
371	HARBOUR	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm from co-counsel re: orders for omni obj
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re claim objection
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm from co-counsel re withdrawal of omni obj

371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B310	0.20	Comm with c-counsel re upcoming hearing and claims objections
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re orders for omni obj
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re claims obj
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re claims obj
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04	B	B310	0.10	Call with co-counsel re claims obj
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm to co-counsel re response to omni obj
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re response to claim obj
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B310	0.10	Communication to co-counsel re claim obj
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B310	0.10	Comm from co-counsel and to DBB re response to claim obj
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B310	0.20	Communication with co-counsel re Fifth Omni Obj order
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B310	0.10	Reviewing email re 4th and 5th omnibus objections
394	KELLY	04/22/04	B	B310	0.10	Email to claims agent re 4th and 5th Omnibus Objection orders
394	KELLY	04/26/04	B	B310	0.10	orders
597	CAMPBELL	04/05/04	B	B310	2.20	Edit notice submission of pocs (.1);prep same for efilng (.1);efiling same (.2);prep agenda (1.8)
597	CAMPBELL	04/06/04	B	B310	0.30	Disc edits to claims binders w/JH (.1);disc same w/LB (.1);chk same (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	04/19/04	B	B310	1.30	Disc cert of counsel re order re 4th omni obj claims w/DB (.1);prep same (.5);edit same (.1);prep cert of counsel re order re 5th omni obj claims (.5);disc same w/DB (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	04/20/04	B	B310	1.20	Prep cert of counsel and related docs for ct re 4th omni obj claims (.3);review order re 5th omni obj to claims (.3);chk dock re same (.2);disc w/DB (.1);email same to KP (.2);p/c to ct re same (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	04/20/04	B	B310	1.30	Prep notice withdraw re fourth omni obj cert of counsel (.3);edit cert counsel re fifth omni obj (.5);disc same w/DB (.1);chk dock re affid serv re omni obj (.2);prep svc poc re city pump to hanify (.2)
597	CAMPBELL	04/20/04	B	B310	0.90	Efile now re cert of counsel re fourth omni obj (.2);edit revised cert coun re fourth omni obj (.3);prep same for efilng (.2);efiling same (.2)
597	CAMPBELL	04/21/04	B	B310	0.60	Prep cert of counsel re omni obj four and five for ct (.6)
597	CAMPBELL	04/26/04	B	B310	0.50	Chk dock re omni objes ordes (.2);d/1 same (.2);email DB re same (.1)
	Total Task:			B310	10.90	1930.50
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B320	0.60	Drafting exclusivity motion
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B320	0.20	Drafting exclusivity Motion
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B320	0.20	Communication to co-counsel and AK re exclusivity Motion
371	HARBOUR	04/14/04	B	B320	0.10	Comm with co-counsel re upcoming hearing agenda
	Total Task:			B320	1.10	275.00
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from JWH re: transition activities
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from Katie Pamentier re: transition actives
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B410	0.40	Conf call with EDS, ABK, JWH re: introductory call
389	BUTZ	04/12/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from JWH re: 365(d)(4) motion
389	BUTZ	04/13/04	B	B410	0.10	Email from JWH re: Committee motions
389	BUTZ	04/13/04	B	B410	0.10	Emails from K Pamentier re: agenda and motions
389	BUTZ	04/13/04	B	B410	0.10	Emails from JWH re: agenda and motions
	Total Task:			B410	0.10	
	Plan and Disclosure Statement					
	General Bankruptcy					







597	CAMPBELL	04/07/04 B	B410	2.00	Disc agenda binder w/JH (.1);disc same w/JP (.1);review same (.3);edit agenda (.5);prep cos re same (.1);disc same w/JH (.1);prep same for efilling (.1);efilling same (.2);prep same for ct (.2);prep svc (.3)
597	CAMPBELL	04/08/04 B	B410	3.30	Prep amended agenda (2.2);email docs re same to co-counsel (.3);prep agenda for efilling (.2);efilling same (.2);disc binder w/JP (.1);prep svc same (.2);p/c to ct re telephonic appear for KP (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	04/12/04 B	B410	3.60	P/c w/ct re hearing (.1);email to JH re same (.1);p/c to co-counsel re same (.1);prep agenda (2.8);chk dock re same (.3);prep cos re resp disc mtn (.2)
597	CAMPBELL	04/13/04 B	B410	0.70	Edit agenda
597	CAMPBELL	04/13/04 B	B410	0.40	Chk dock re goldberg fee app (.2);prep cno re same (.2)
597	CAMPBELL	04/14/04 B	B410	1.40	Chk dock re agenda matters (.3);edit agenda (.9);email same to KP (.2)
597	CAMPBELL	04/15/04 B	B410	1.30	Disc agenda w/LB (.1);edit same (.4);prep cos re same (.1);prep same for efilling (.1);efilling same (.2);prep svc same (.3);disc serv same w/RH (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	04/16/04 B	B410	1.40	Prep resp re committes mtn to prosecute certain actions for efilling (.4);prep cos re same (.2);efile same (.2);prep amended agenda (.6);
597	CAMPBELL	04/19/04 B	B410	1.00	Edit agenda (.2);prep docs re same for ct (.3);efile same (.2);prep svc same (.3);p/c to ct re hrg dates
597	CAMPBELL	04/21/04 B	B410	1.60	Prep cert of counsel re hearing dates (.2);edit same (.1);prep order re same (.3);email same to KP (.2);prep same for efilling (.1);efilling same (.2);prep svc same (.3);prep same for ct (.2)
597	CAMPBELL	04/27/04 B	B410	0.80	Prep resp to cert counsel re rule 2004 for efilling (.1);efilling same (.2);prep svc same (.2);prep nos re same (.3)
597	CAMPBELL	04/29/04 B	B410	0.40	Prep noa re mtn to file plan (.3);prep cos re same (.1)
597	CAMPBELL	04/30/04 B	B410	0.20	Case admin (.2)
Total Task:				40.80	7105.50
FEE SUBTOTAL:				86.70	17660.00