

**Kegler, Brown, Hill & Ritter Co., LPA
Professional Services**

Nippon Electric Glass Ohio, Inc.

March 2005

Summary of Services

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration	\$ 1,334.00
Claims Administration	295.00
Fee / Employment Applications	280.50
Plan & Disclosure Statement	1,298.00
Subtotal of Professional Services	\$ 3,207.50

Expenses

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Copying	147.40
Telephone	0.00
Postage	76.33
Subtotal of Expenses	\$ 223.73
<u>Total Services This Period</u>	<u>\$ 3,431.23</u>

Case Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
3/09/05	R*H	Attention to submitting Order Establishing Bar Date to the Court.	.20
3/11/05	SPU	Confer regarding objection to duplicate claims (.10). Confer with court regarding uploading of Order (.10).	.20
3/14/05	SPU	Review Techneglas Objection to Claims and PBCG claims. Review PBCG claims and NEG Ohio and compare to see if duplicated (1.0). Prepare memo to Ms. Mar regarding claims in the NEG Ohio case (.50). File, serve and revise with appropriate information the Notice of Bar Date (.70).	2.20
3/14/05	R*H	Attention to filing and serving Notice of Filing Notice of Deadline for filing Proofs of Claims and Proofs of Interest.	.50
3/15/05	SPU	Prepare Notice of Monthly Fee Statements for Morrison & Forrester and attention to sending out the same (.50).	.50
3/16/05	SPU	Review Techneglas' Motion to Terminate Employee Medical Benefits (.30). Review correspondence from Ms. Mar regarding Motion to Extend Exclusivity (.20).	.50
3/18/05	SPU	Prepare Second Motion to Extend Exclusivity. Correspond to Ms. Mar regarding the same. Prepare Emergency Motion to Shorten the Notice Period for the Second Motion to Extend Exclusivity.	2.00
3/18/05	R*H	Attention to filing and serving Second Motion to Extend Exclusive Time to File Chapter 11 Plan and Motion for Expedited Hearing	.50
3/28/05	SPU	Review Notice of Proposed Sale Efforts and formulate strategy regarding the same.	.60
3/31/05	SPU	Review status of Order for Expedited Hearing (.20).	.20

3/31/05	R*H	Prepared Order Granting Motion for Expedited Hearing; conference with Court re same.	.50
---------	-----	--	-----

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Stephanie P. Union	6.20	185.00	1,147.00
Robin Hayes	1.70	110.00	187.00
Case Admin Subtotal	7.90		\$1,334.00

Claims Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
3/09/05	KRC	Technical review of pleadings in companion cases (.30).	.30
3/15/05	KRC	Follow up on bar date mailing of notices (.20); Review pleadings filed in affiliated cases (.50).	.70

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	1.00	295.00	295.00
Claims Administration	1.00		\$ 295.00

Fee / Employment Applications

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
3/10/05	SPU	Attention to uploading Order regarding the bar date (.20). Preparing Notice of Fee Statement for February for Morrison and Forrester and Kegler Brown Hill and Ritter (.20).	.40
3/14/05	KRC	Follow up consultations with Ms. Mar on Bar Date Order (.20); organize monthly billing (.50).	.70

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	.70	295.00	206.50
Stephanie P. Union	.40	185.00	74.00
Fee / Employment Applications	1.10		\$ 280.50

Plan and Disclosure Statement

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
3/16/05	KRC	Analysis of strategy for standby exclusivity. (.40);	.40
3/17/05	KRC	Attention to extension of exclusivity matters (.50);	.50
3/18/05	KRC	Finalize motion to extend exclusivity (1.50); email communications to discuss strategy with Attorney Mar (.30); telephone call to Attorney DeMarko regarding offer (.20); Motion to Shorten Response (1.50).	3.50

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	4.40	295.00	\$ 1,298.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	4.40	295.00	\$ 1,298.00