

**Kegler, Brown, Hill & Ritter Co., LPA
Professional Services**

Nippon Electric Glass Ohio, Inc.

April 2005

Summary of Services

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration	2,221.50
Fee/Employment Applications	1,723.50
Litigation	147.50
Plan & Disclosure Statement	324.50
Subtotal of Professional Services	\$ 4,417.00

Expenses

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Copying	268.80
Telephone	0.00
Postage	150.94
Subtotal of Expenses	\$ 419.74
<u>Total Services This Period</u>	<u>\$ 4,836.74</u>

Case Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
4/06/05	KRC	Preparation of material for omnibus hearing (.30); review filings in Techneglas case (.50).	.80
4/07/05	KRC	Participation in omnibus status conference. (1.30)	1.30
4/12/05	KRC	Review bylaws of the Committee for substitution of new corporate representative (.30).	.30
4/12/05	KRC	Finalize March monthly time notice.	.30
4/18/05	KRC	Review pleadings and orders in companion cases (.40).	.40
4/28/05	KRC	Analysis of pleadings in companion cases (.20).	.20
4/04/05	R*H	Finalized Notice of Order on Expedited Hearing. Attention to filing and serving same. (.50)	.50
4/06/05	R*H	Attention to filing and serving Certification of No Response and submitting Order to the Court. (.50)	.50
4/21/05	R*H	Researched docket for filing of new address for IMEX Transport. Researched other sources for same. (.20)	.20
4/22/05	R*H	Attention to filing and serving Notices of Monthly Statements for Kegler Brown and Morrison & Foerster. (.30)	.30
4/26/05	R*H	Attention to filing and serving Second Interim Fee Application, and filing and serving Notice of Second Fee Application of Kegler Brown and Morrison Foerster. (.50)	.50
4/27/05	R*H	Prepared Order Authorizing Morrison Foerster's Second Fee Application. (.30)	.30
4/28/05	R*H	Prepared Order Authorizing Kegler Brown's second fee Application. (.30)	.30
4/04/05	SPU	Confer with Judge Hoffman's clerk regarding Expedited Order. Confer with Ms. Mar regarding the same. Attention to serving the Order and the Notice.	.70
4/05/05	SPU	Prepare Notice of Certification of No Response for Exclusivity Motion. (.30)	.30
4/06/05	SPU	Revise Certificate of No Response to Exclusivity Motion. Revise Order to Upload. (.30)	.30
4/07/05	SPU	Attend Omnibus Hearing. (.60)	.60

4/12/05	SPU	Prepare Monthly Notice for March Fees.	.30
4/18/05	SPU	Review Order and calculate exclusivity extended dates. (.10)	.10
4/22/05	SPU	Attention to preparing Monthly Fee Statement for MoFo and revise Kegler Brown's statement.	.50
4/25/05	SPU	Review Order establishing reimbursement procedures for compensation. (.20)	.20
4/26/05	SPU	Prepare to serve Kegler Brown's and MoFo's Interim Fee Applications.	1.30
4/28/05	SPU	Review U.S. Trustee's issues with fee applications (.40). Review upcoming auction and formulate strategy regarding the same (.20).	.60
4/29/05	SPU	Attention to Fee Application questions from the U.S. Trustee. (.30)	.30

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	3.30	295.00	973.50
Stephanie P. Union	4.40	185.00	814.00
Robin Hayes	2.60	110.00	286.00
Case Admin Subtotal	11.10		\$2,221.50

Fee / Employment Applications

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
4/08/05	KRC	Initial work on second fee application. (.30)	.30
4/08/05	SPU	Prepare Fee Application. (3.50)	3.50
4/11/05	SPU	Prepare Second Interim Fee Application. Correspond to Ms. Mar regarding the same. (2.80)	2.80
4/12/05	KRC	Finalize second fee (.40)	.40
4/12/05	SPU	Revise Fee Application. Correspond to Ms. Mar regarding the same. (1.80)	1.50
4/26/05	SPU	Revise Fee Application.	.40

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	.7	295.00	206.50
Stephanie P. Union	8.20	185.00	1,517.00
Fee / Employment Applications	8.90		\$ 1,723.50

Litigation

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
4/05/05	KRC	Follow up with Techneglas counsel on hearing status (.20); preparation of materials to use at hearing (.30).	.50

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	.50	295.00	\$ 147.50
Litigation	.50		\$ 147.50

Plan and Disclosure Statement

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
4/04/05	KRC	Attention to open issues at upcoming omnibus hearing (.60); consultations with Court's law clerk on motion to extend exclusivity (.30); follow up email to Attorney Mar (.20).	1.10

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	1.10	295.00	\$ 324.50
Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.10		\$ 324.50

**Kegler, Brown, Hill & Ritter Co., LPA
Professional Services**

Nippon Electric Glass Ohio, Inc.

May 2005

Summary of Services

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration	\$ 975.00
Claims Administration and Objections	88.50
Fee/Employment Applications	99.50
Litigation	0.00
Plan & Disclosure Statement	0.00
Subtotal of Professional Services	\$ 1,163.00

Expenses

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Copying	\$ 6.70
Telephone	0.00
Postage	3.78
Subtotal of Expenses	\$ 10.48
<u>Total Services This Period</u>	<u>\$1,173.48</u>

Case Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
5/02/05	KRC	Analysis of pleadings in companion cases (.30); receive information from counsel to Techneglas on upcoming status conference agenda (.20).	.50
5/09/05	KRC	Review daily pleadings filed in companion cases(.30).	.30
5/11/05	SPU	Review changes to Schedule F (.20). Revise billing memo (.40).	.60
5/13/05	SPU	Prepare Notice of Monthly Fee Statement (.20).	.20
5/16/05	SPU	Prepare Monthly Fee Statement (.40).	.40
5/17/05	KRC	Analysis of pleadings received in companion case (.40).	.40
5/18/05	SPU	Prepare Monthly Fee Statement (.20).	.20
5/19/05	SPU	Prepare Monthly Fee Statement for Kegler Brown(.30).	.30
5/20/05	SPU	Revise Monthly Fee Statement (.30).	.30
5/24/05	SPU	Review Proof of Claim filed by Techneglas (.40)	.40
5/24/05	KRC	Analysis of proofs of claim filed by Techneglas (.300).	.30
5/31/05	KRC	Follow up on status of various pleadings in related cases (.30).	.30

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	1.80	295.00	\$ 531.00
Stephanie P. Union	2.40	185.00	444.00
Case Admin Subtotal	3.10		\$ 975.00

Claims Administration and Objections

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
5/12/05	KRC	Analysis of claims objection filed by Techneglas to claim of PBGC (.30)	.30

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	.30	295.00	\$ 88.50
Case Admin Subtotal	.30		\$ 88.50

Fee / Employment Applications

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
5/20/05	SPU	Revise Fee Application Order (.30).	.30
5/20/05	R*H	Attention to uploading Order allowing Morrison Foerster's Second Fee Application (.20).	.20
5/24/05	R*H	Attention to submitting Order for Second Interim Fee Application of Kegler Brown (.20).	.20

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Stephanie P. Union	.30	185.00	55.50
Robin Hayes	.40	110.00	44.00
Fee / Employment Applications	.70		\$99.50

Litigation

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		N/A	

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson			
Litigation			\$ 0.0

Plan and Disclosure Statement

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		N/A	

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson			
Plan and Disclosure Statement			\$ 0.00

**Kegler, Brown, Hill & Ritter Co., LPA
Professional Services**

Nippon Electric Glass Ohio, Inc.

June, 2005

Summary of Services

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration	\$ 734.00
Claims Administration and Objections	0.00
Fee/Employment Applications	0.00
Litigation	0.00
Plan & Disclosure Statement	1,239.00
Subtotal of Professional Services	\$ 1,973.00

Expenses

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Copying	\$ 34.40
Telephone	0.00
Postage	8.38
Subtotal of Expenses	\$ 42.78
<u>Total Services This Period</u>	<u>\$2,015.78</u>

<u>Case Administration</u>			
<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
6/07/05	SPU	Revise billing memo. (.10)	.10
6/21/05	KRC	Technical review of monthly fee statement. (.30)	.30
6/21/05	SPU	Prepare Notice of Monthly Fee Statement and revise invoices. (.70)	.70
6/29/05	KRC	Analysis of various plan and disclosure statement provisions(.50); consultations with co-counsel. (1.00)	1.50
6/30/05	R*H	Conference call with Kenneth Cookson and counsel for NEG America and Techneglas concerning filing Plan and Disclosure Statements. (.50)	.50

<u>Summary of Professional Services</u>			
<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	1.80	295.00	\$ 531.00
Stephanie P. Union	.80	185.00	148.00
Robin Hayes	.50	110.00	55.00
Case Admin Subtotal	3.10		\$ 734.00

<u>Plan and Disclosure Statement</u>			
<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
6/17/05	KRC	Develop strategy for plan drafting. (.40)	.40
6/27/05	KRC	Analysis of proposed initial draft of plan of reorganization and disclosure statements. (1.30)	1.30
6/30/05	KRC	Attention to issues involving the plan of reorganization and disclosure statements (2.10); participation in telephone conference on filing technical points. (.40).	2.50

<u>Summary of Professional Services</u>			
<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	4.20	295.00	\$ 1,239.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement			\$ 1,239.00

**Kegler, Brown, Hill & Ritter Co., LPA
Professional Services**

Nippon Electric Glass Ohio, Inc.

July, 2005

Summary of Services

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration	\$ 756.50
Claims Administration and Objections	0.00
Fee/Employment Applications	129.50
Litigation	594.00
Plan & Disclosure Statement	1,475.00
Subtotal of Professional Services	\$ 2,955.00

Expenses

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Copying	\$ 819.50
Telephone	0.00
Postage	216.83
Subtotal of Expenses	\$ 1,036.33
<u>Total Services This Period</u>	<u>\$3,991.33</u>

Case Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
7/01/05	R*H	Conference calls with Kenneth Cookson and for NEG America and Techneglas concerning filing Plan and Disclosure Statements (.50).	.50
7/06/05	SPU	Confer with Ms. Bowers regarding the filing the Motion for Solicitation of Acceptance of the Plan and the Certificate of Service. Prepare Certificate of Service (1.70).	1.70
7/07/05	KRC	Follow up on pending hearing in Techneglas (.30).	.30
7/14/05	KRC	Organize notice of hearing date (.70).	.70
7/14/05	R*H	Attention to finalized service list and filing and serving Notice of Hearing (.50).	.50
7/29/05	SPU	Correspond regarding extension of time for PBGC to respond (.20).	.20

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	1.00	295.00	\$ 295.00
Stephanie P. Union	1.90	185.00	351.50
Robin Hayes	1.00	110.00	110.00
Case Admin Subtotal	3.90		\$ 756.50

Fee/Employment Applications

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
7/18/05	SPU	Revise bills and review fee application time (.20).	.20
7/19/05	SPU	Prepare Notice of Monthly Fee Application (.50).	.50

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Stephanie P. Union	.70	185.00	\$ 129.50
Fee/Employment Application			\$ 129.50

Litigation

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
7/06/05	KRC	Preparation of solicitation motion for filing. (1.80)	1.80
7/06/05	S*J	File Motion and Notice with exhibits in the Nippon Glass Case (.70).	.70

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	1.80	295.00	\$ 531.00
Sally Jeffrey	.70	90.00	63.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	2.50		\$ 594.00

Plan and Disclosure Statement

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
7/01/05	KRC	Work on Plan and Disclosure Statements for filing as final document (3.50).	3.50
7/05/05	KRC	Organize the Plan and Disclosure Statement for service on parties in interest; review proposed ballots and solicitation motion (1.50).	1.50

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	5.00	295.00	\$ 1,475.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement			\$ 1,475.00