

**Kegler, Brown, Hill & Ritter Co., LPA
Professional Services**

Nippon Electric Glass Ohio, Inc.

August, 2005

Summary of Services

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration	\$ 1,776.50
Litigation	265.50
Plan & Disclosure Statement	5,954.00
Subtotal of Professional Services	\$ 7,996.00

Expenses

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Copying	\$ 889.20
Facsimile	1.50
Telephone	31.09
Postage	237.96
Subtotal of Expenses	\$ 1,159.75

Total Services This Period **\$9,155.75**



Case Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
8/04/05	SPU	Review and revise monthly time statements (.20).	.20
8/08/05	KRC	Analysis of daily pleadings and filings (.50).	.50
8/08/05	SPU	Review Trustee's Objection to the Plan and formulate strategy regarding the same (.30).	.30
8/11/05	KRC	Analysis of incoming pleadings (.50).	.50
8/15/05	SPU	Supervise Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement filing and coordination (.50).	.50
8/15/05	R*H	Attention to filing Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement (.50)	.50
8/16/05	KRC	Preparation of materials for disclosure statement hearing (.60); Review several revisions to the plan and disclosure statement (2.00).	2.60
8/16/05	SPU	Prepare July Monthly Fee Statement (.20).	.20
8/23/05	R*H	Attention to filing voluminous Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement, and uploading Agreed Order (.80).	.80
8/25/05	R*H	Attention to filing Supplement to First Amended Disclosure Statement (.20).	.20
8/25/05	R*H	Worked with Stephanie Union to assemble Plan documents including ballots for service to creditors (.80).	.80
8/26/05	SPU	Prepare solicitation package (.50).	.50
8/29/05	SPU	Attention to insurance settlement motion (.20).	.20
8/29/05	R*H	Prepared Notice of Motion Approving Insurance Settlement (.30). Attention to filing Notice of Hearing Concerning Approval of Solicitations and Voting Procedures (.20).	.50
8/30/05	R*H	Attention to finalizing and filing and serving Motion and Notice Approving Insurance Settlement (.50).	.50

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	3.60	295.00	\$ 1,062.00
Stephanie P. Union	1.90	185.00	351.50
Robin Hayes	3.30	110.00	363.00
Case Admin Subtotal	8.60		\$ 1,776.50

Litigation

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
8/26/05	KRC	Analysis of draft motion to approve settlement with insurance carrier over claims from manufacturing plant fire (.50).	.50
8/30/05	KRC	Finalize motion on insurance settlement (.40).	.40

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	.90	295.00	\$ 265.50
Plan and Disclosure Statement	.90		\$ 265.50

Plan and Disclosure Statement

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
8/01/05	KRC	Review and analyze objections filed by two creditors to the Plan and Disclosure Statement (.60).	.60
8/02/05	KRC	Follow up on objections to Plan and Disclosure Statement (.30).	.30
8/05/05	KRC	Analysis of objections to Plan and Disclosure Statement (.60).	.60
8/15/05	KRC	Attention to Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement (.70); organize filing (.20); confirm plan terms (.60).	1.50
8/17/05	KRC	Work on proposed changes to the Plan and Disclosure Statement (2.00).	2.00
8/17/05	KRC	Preparation for disclosure statement hearing (2.00).	2.00
8/17/05	KRC	Attend disclosure statement hearing (1.50); attend to post-hearing follow-up (.80).	2.30
8/18/05	KRC	Follow up details to the plan and disclosure statement (.70).	.70
8/19/05	KRC	Analysis of proposed order, ballots (1.20).	1.20
8/22/05	KRC	Review drafts of plan and disclosure statement; preparation for filing (1.60).	1.60
8/23/05	KRC	Further review of amended plan and disclosure statement revisions and updates (1.50); Organize filing of plan and disclosure statement (1.00).	2.50
8/23/05	SPU	Prepare to file Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement. Confer with Ms. Bowers regarding the same (1.80).	1.80

8/24/05	KRC	Attention to amendment to plan and disclosure statement (1.00).	1.00
8/24/05	SPU	Confer with Ms. Bowers regarding changes to the Plan (.20).	.20
8/25/05	KRC	Follow up on plan supplement (.80); finalize package for solicitation (.70).	1.50
8/25/05	SPU	Review proposed language and PDF signature to Ms. Bowers. (.50) Prepare Plan for serving, disclosure statement and related documents (1.30).	1.80

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	17.80	295.00	\$ 5,251.00
Stephanie P. Union	3.80	185.00	\$ 703.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	21.60		\$ 5,954.00

**Kegler, Brown, Hill & Ritter Co., LPA
Professional Services**

Nippon Electric Glass Ohio, Inc.

September, 2005

Summary of Services

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration	\$ 192.00
Claims Administration	88.50
Fee/Employment Applications	414.50
Litigation	295.00
Plan & Disclosure Statement	2,176.00
Subtotal of Professional Services	\$ 3,166.00

Expenses

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Copying	\$ 181.90
Postage	88.60
Subtotal of Expenses	\$ 270.50
<u>Total Services This Period</u>	<u>\$3,436.50</u>

Case Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
9/08/05	SPU	Review and revise billing memos (.20).	.20
9/19/05	SPU	Review information for omnibus hearing (.30).	.30
9/22/05	SPU	Prepare August Monthly Fee Statement (.20).	.20
9/23/05	R*H	Attention to submitted Order Approving Insurance Settlement (.20).	.20
9/27/05	R*H	Conference with Judge's law clerk re status of entering Order approving settlement (.20).	.20
9/29/05	SPU	Forward PBGC Ballot for filing (.10).	.10

Summary of Professional Services

	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Stephanie P. Union		.80	185.00	148.00
Robin Hayes		.40	110.00	44.00
Case Admin Subtotal		1.60		\$ 192.00

Claims Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
9/07/05	KRC	Attention to upcoming hearing on settlement with the PBGC (.20); telephone call to local counsel for Techneglas (.10).	.30

Summary of Professional Services

	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson		.30	295.00	\$ 88.50
Claims Administration		.30		\$ 88.50

Fee/Employment Applications

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
9/09/05	SPU	Work on Third Fee Application (.40).	.40
9/12/05	SPU	Revise Fee Application (.30).	.30
9/13/05	L*K	Finalize Third Fee Application for electronic filing (1.00).	1.00
9/14/05	SPU	Revisions to Final Fee Application (.80).	.80
9/15/05	SPU	Attention to service of the fee application (.20).	.20

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Stephanie P. Union	1.70	185.00	\$ 314.50
Lynette Kelley	1.00	100.00	100.00
Fee/Employment Applications	2.90		\$ 414.50

Litigation

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
9/20/05	KRC	Follow up on status of hearing (.30); develop strategy for confirmation meeting (.70).	1.00

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	1.00	295.00	\$ 295.00
Litigation	1.00		\$ 295.00

Plan and Disclosure Statement

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
9/15/05	KRC	Preparation of background materials for up-coming omnibus hearing (.50); preparation for confirmation hearing (1.00).	1.50
9/19/05	KRC	Consultations with Attorney Bowers on confirmation issues (.50); update of insurance settlement motion (.20); update on confirmation objections in Techneglas (.60).	1.30
9/26/05	KRC	Receipt of ballot of PBGC (.20); telephone conference with PBGC counsel (.30); preparation of materials and strategy for confirmation (.50); review objections filed in Techneglas case (1.0).	2.00
9/27/05	KRC	Attention to organizing witness and strategy for confirmation hearing (1.00).	1.00
9/27/05	SPU	Confer with Ms. Bowers and correspond with Ms. Mar regarding confirmation hearing procedures (.40).	.40
9/28/05	KRC	Attention to confirmation issues (.80).	.80
9/29/05	KRC	Follow up on voting report (.40).	.40
9/30/05	SPU	Prepare for Confirmation Hearing (.20).	.20

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	7.00	295.00	\$ 2,065.00
Stephanie P. Union	.60	185.00	11100
Plan and Disclosure Statement	7.00		\$ 2,176.00

**Kegler, Brown, Hill & Ritter Co., LPA
Professional Services**

Nippon Electric Glass Ohio, Inc.

October, 2005

Summary of Services

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Case Administration	\$ 490.00
Claims Administration	590.00
Fee/Employment Applications	1,238.50
Plan & Disclosure Statement	5,524.00
Subtotal of Professional Services	\$ 7,842.50

Expenses

<u>Category</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Copying	\$ 367.40
Facsimile	2.00
Courier Service	12.00
Postage	51.55
Subtotal of Expenses	\$ 432.95

Total Services This Period **\$8,275.45**

Case Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
10/03/05	SPU	Attention to ballots (.20).	.20
10/03/05	R*H	Attention to filing Notice of Supplemental Exhibit Book for First Amended Joint Plan of Reorganization (.50).	.50
10/04/05	R*H	Attention to filing and serving Notice of Technical Modification to First Amended Joint Plan of Reorganization, and Certification of Ballots and Declaration and Balloting Agent, and uploaded Order Confirming First Amended Plan (.50).	.50
10/06/05	SPU	Review docket for upcoming hearing (.10). Follow up regarding Amended Plan and Order (.10).	.20
10/07/05	R*H	Attention to filing First Amended Joint Plan of Reorganization as Confirmed by Court On October 6 2005, and uploaded Order (.30).	.30
10/10/05	SPU	Revise billing memo (.30).	.30
10/12/05	SPU	Prepare Monthly Fee Notice (.40).	.40
10/12/05	R*H	Finalized Motion to Approval Stipulation and Order Between Nippon Ohio and Techneglas; attention to filing and serving same (.50).	.50
10/25/05	KRC	Consultations on effective date implementation. (.30).	.30

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	.30	295.00	88.50
Stephanie P. Union	1.10	185.00	203.50
Robin Hayes	1.80	110.00	198.00
Case Admin Subtotal	4.10		\$ 490.00

Claims Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
10/12/05	KRC	Follow up on filing stipulation for treatment of claims (1.00).	1.00
10/17/05	KRC	Follow up on confirmation issues; receipt of various emails regarding same (1.00).	1.00

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	2.00	295.00	\$ 590.00
Claims Administration	2.00		\$ 590.00

Fee/Employment Applications

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
10/07/05	SPU	Attention to Fee Order and Final Fee Application deadline (.20).	.20
10/11/05	R*H	Modified Order allowing third interim fee application; attention to uploading same to the Court (.40).	.40
10/18/05	R*H	Prepared Order Allowing Third Application for Morrison and Foerster; attention to submitting same to the Court (.50).	.50
10/31/05	SPU	Anticipated preparation of Final Fee Application (2.50).	2.50
10/31/05	KRC	Attention to Final Fee Application (.50); attendance at hearing on Final Fee Application (2.50).	3.00
10/31/05	R*H	Attention to filing Final Fee Application (.50).	.50

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	3.00	195.00	585.00
Stephanie P. Union	2.70	185.00	499.50
Robin Hayes	1.40	110.00	154.00
Fee/Employment Applications	7.10		\$ 1,238.50

Plan and Disclosure Statement

<u>Date</u>	<u>T/K</u>		<u>Hours</u>
10/03/05	KRC	Review ballots to confirm voting (.60); Receive inquiry from counsel to Techneglas on confirmation exhibits (.20); follow up on Exhibits (.50); Organize filing materials for confirmation (1.50); organize ballot declaration (.40).	3.20
10/03/05	L*K	Review docket for ballots that have been filed (1.00). Several telephone conversations with Case Administrator at Bankruptcy Court regarding docketing of ballot that was delivered last week (.20).	1.20
10/04/05	KRC	Review various stipulations and documents in preparation for confirmation (1.50); prepare 1129(a) testimony (.30); organize materials for confirmation (.70).	2.50
10/05/05	KRC	Preparation of documentation and arrangement for confirmation (2.30).	2.30
10/05/05	L*K	Search PACER docket for Pro Hac Vice filings (.20).	.20
10/06/05	KRC	Preparation for confirmation hearing (5.00); attend confirmation hearing (2.00); Post-hearing follow-up (1.00).	8.00
10/07/05	KRC	Post confirmation work on file (1.50).	1.50
10/18/05	SPU	Review Plan regarding filing the final fee application and the effective date of the Plan (.40).	.40
10/27/05	KRC	Participation in conference call with all counsel on effective date implementation (.50).	.50

Summary of Professional Services

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kenneth R. Cookson	18.00	295.00	\$ 5,310.00
Stephanie P. Union	.40	185.00	74.00
Lynnette Kelley	1.40	100.00	140.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	19.80		\$ 5,524.00