

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
DISTRICT OF MAINE

_____ )	
In re: )	Chapter 11
_____ )	
PEGASUS SATELLITE TELEVISION, INC., et al., )	Case No. 04-20878
_____ )	
Debtors. )	(Jointly Administered)
_____ )	

**STATEMENT OF FEES FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND  
OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES INCURRED BY  
BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON AS CO-COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS  
FOR THE PERIOD BEGINNING JULY 1, 2004 AND ENDING JULY 31, 2004**

Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson (“BSSN”), co-counsel to Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc. and its affiliates, the debtors and debtors-in-possession in the above-captioned cases, submits its monthly statement (the “Monthly Statement”) of fees and out-of-pocket expenses for the period beginning July 1, 2004 and ending July 31, 2004 (the “Compensation Period”). In support of the Monthly Statement, BSSN states as follows:

1. On June 2, 2004 (the “Commencement Date”), Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc. and certain of its affiliates (collectively, the “Debtors”) each filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101 et seq., as amended (the “Bankruptcy Code”) in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Maine (the “Court”).

2. On June 24, 2004, the Court entered an order granting the employment of BSSN as co-counsel to the Debtors (the “BSSN Retention Order”).

3. On June 24 2004, the Court entered an order pursuant to sections 105(a) and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code establishing procedures for monthly compensation and reimbursement

of expenses for professionals (the "Monthly Fee Order"). Pursuant to the Monthly Fee Order, the Court authorized a monthly payment for all professionals, subject to a 10% holdback for fees only.

4. For the Compensation Period, BSSN's fees for providing professional services to the Debtors total \$24,986.50. In connection with services rendered, BSSN has recorded actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the amount of \$2,877.08. Additional out-of-pocket expenses that BSSN has incurred but not yet processed due to timing may exist; such expenses will be submitted at a later date. Attached hereto as Exhibit "A" is a schedule summarizing professional services and expenses recorded during the Compensation Period.

5. A summary of all fees and out-of-pocket expenses applied for in this Monthly Statement is outlined below:

Interim Period	Total Fees	Less Holdback @ 10%	Fees Due	Total Expenses	Amounts Due
July 1 – July 31 '04	\$24,986.70	\$2,498.67	\$22,488.03	\$2,877.08	\$25,365.11

6. Based upon the foregoing, pursuant to the Monthly Fee Order, BSSN requests that, in the absence of timely service on BSSN of a Notice Of Objection To Fee Statement by a recipient of this Monthly Statement, the Debtors, in accordance with the Monthly Fee Order, pay to BSSN \$25,365.11, on or after September 15, 2004.

August 25, 2004

BERNTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON

/s/ Robert J. Keach  
By: Robert J. Keach, Esq.  
Shareholder  
100 Middle Street, P. O. Box 9729  
Portland, ME 04104-5029

Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Counselors at Law  
I.D. #01-0378211

100 Middle Street  
P.O. Box 9729  
Portland, Maine 04104-5029  
(207) 774-1200

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

Fees for Professional Services 07/01/04 Through 07/31/04	\$24,986.50
Expenses 07/01/04 Through 07/31/04	\$2,877.08
	-----
Total This Invoice	\$27,863.58
Previous Outstanding Balance	\$106,997.29
	-----
Total Amount Due This Matter	\$134,860.87

----- S E R V I C E S S U M M A R Y -----

LMG	LEN GULINO	19.80 hours at \$225.00 =	\$4,455.00
RJK	ROBERT J. KEACH	50.60 hours at \$350.00 =	\$17,710.00
SD	SHEILA DILIOS	29.70 hours at \$95.00 =	\$2,821.50

Please return the enclosed REMITTANCE COPY with your  
payment to ensure proper credit to your account.

## Remittance Copy

**Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.**

Counselors at Law

I.D. #01-0378211

P.O. Box 9729  
Portland, Maine 04104-5029  
(207) 774-1200

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004      Invoice#    3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

Total This Invoice - Due on Receipt

\$27,863.58

A late charge of 1 1/2% per month may be imposed  
for payment after 30 days.

To Ensure Proper Credit to Your Account:

**Please return this Remittance Copy with your payment.**

If paying by check, please mark the invoice number on your check.

If paying by Visa or Mastercard, please complete the information below.

Card Number \_\_\_\_\_ Exp. Date \_\_\_\_\_

Signature \_\_\_\_\_ Amount \_\_\_\_\_

### REQUIRED PRIVACY ACT NOTICE

Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson does not disclose any nonpublic information about our clients or former clients, except as permitted by law. We restrict access to nonpublic personal information about you to those who need to know that information in order to provide services to you. We maintain physical, electronic and procedural safeguards that comply with federal regulations to guard your nonpublic personal information.

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Counselors at Law  
I.D. #01-0378211

100 Middle Street  
P.O. Box 9729  
Portland, Maine 04104-5029  
(207) 774-1200

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

## 02 Asset Disposition

Date	ATTY	Hours	
07/06/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call to Jessica Knowles regarding Section 365(d)(4) Motion
07/07/04	RJK	0.10	E-mail to Jessica Knowles regarding 365(d)(4) motion
07/07/04	RJK	0.40	Review 365(d)(4) Motion, Order and Notice; attention to filing same
07/09/04	LMG	0.50	Review orders on extension of time to assume or reject leases, AP scheduling order, and brief conference with co-counsel re. same.
07/22/04	LMG	0.20	Review Order Granting an Extension of Time To Assume or Reject Unexpired Leases of Nonresidential Real Property.
-----			
Total 02		1.40	

## 03 Business Operations

Date	ATTY	Hours	
07/06/04	RJK	2.50	Analysis of availability of Section 105 injunction regarding termination of signal
07/07/04	RJK	0.70	Continued analysis regarding Section 105 relief regarding signal termination
-----			
Total 03		3.20	

## 04 Case Administration

Date	ATTY	Hours	
07/02/04	RJK	0.40	Review revised case management order; e-mails to/from Paul Caruso regarding same; telephone call from Paul Caruso regarding same
07/06/04	RJK	0.30	Telephone call with Ted Lodge & Yancey regarding scheduling of hearing on 7-8-04 regarding scheduling order

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004      Invoice#                      3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/07/04	RJK	1.10	Various e-mails and telephone conferences regarding matters scheduled for 7/8/04 and rescheduling same
07/08/04	RJK	0.40	Review Case Management Order redraft; e-mails to Paul Caruso regarding same
07/09/04	RJK	0.20	Review revised case management order; attention to filing same
07/09/04	RJK	0.50	Attention to Woodcock bio; analysis of decisions
07/09/04	RJK	0.50	Prepare for and attend call with Trumbull regarding noticing
07/10/04	RJK	1.10	Review file; detailed e-mail to Guy Neal regarding third-party releases in 1st Circuit
07/10/04	LMG	0.30	Review and analysis of Verified Statement of Wachovia Bank, National Association as Indenture Trustee Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 2019.
07/10/04	LMG	0.40	Rvw. court order on case management and noticing.
07/12/04	LMG	0.50	Discussions with US trustee's office; follow up with client regarding same.
07/12/04	RJK	0.30	Review motion regarding payment of NRTC payments in the escrow
07/12/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call from Ellen Moring regarding Debevoise appearance; attention to same
07/12/04	RJK	0.20	Exchange e-mails regarding NRTC payments escrow; motion
07/13/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone conference with Ellen Moring on creditor's committee retention applications
07/13/04	LMG	1.00	Meeting and negotiations with Attorney Huffaker regarding possible resolution of GP's minority interest; side discussions with client and co-counsel.

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/14/04	LMG	1.00	Research factual background and draft motion for general continuance; work through same.
07/14/04	RJK	0.40	Review pleadings in case: 1) Creditor's Committee Application to retain Akin Gump and attachments; 2) Creditor's Committee Application to Retain Pierce Atwood and attachments; 3) Two (2) verified statements filed by Wachovia Bank (Rule 2019)
07/15/04	LMG	0.40	Review orders on management retention policies and case management procedures.
07/15/04	SD	0.30	Review of e-mails; E-filing of Agenda of Hearing on 7/22.
07/19/04	LMG	0.20	Review verified statement of HSBC Bank.
07/19/04	LMG	0.20	Review and get updated on notice of hearing on matters scheduled for 7/22
07/21/04	SD	0.80	Service of affidavits regarding ordinary course professionals; draft of certificate of service re affidavits and amended - agenda for hearings.
07/21/04	SD	0.20	Review of order establishing case management procedures and hearing schedule.
07/21/04	LMG	1.30	Review about 15 different filings with the court filed today, including statement of professionals, and motions re. adm.
07/21/04	RJK	0.20	Exchange e-mails with Larry Nyhan regarding scheduling matter
07/21/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call with Ellen Moring regarding 7/22 hearings
07/22/04	RJK	2.00	Prepare for and attend 7/22 hearings per agenda
07/22/04	RJK	0.40	Exchange e-mails with Larry Nyhan regarding Section 1146(c) issues

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004      Invoice#            3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/22/04	RJK	0.10	E-mail to Larry Nyhan regarding 8-31-04 schedule
07/22/04	RJK	0.10	E-mail from Larry Nyhan regarding 8-31-04 schedule
07/22/04	SD	0.20	Attention to e-filing of form of order for support services agreement.
07/22/04	LMG	0.20	Review Final Order Authorizing the Debtors to Continue Performing under the Support Services Agreement with Pegasus Communications Management Company.
07/22/04	LMG	0.10	Review Declaration of Proposed Professional and Disclosure Statement of Posinelli, Shalton, Welte, Suelthaus, PC filed by Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.
07/22/04	LMG	0.10	Review Declaration of Proposed Professional and Disclosure Statement of Murtha, Cullina LLP filed by Pegasus Satellite Television.
07/22/04	LMG	0.10	Review Declaration of Proposed Professional Services and Disclosure Statement of Martinez Odell Calabria filed by Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.
07/22/04	LMG	0.10	Review Declaration or Proposed Professional and Disclosure Statement of Lynn, Tillotson & Pinker, LLP, filed by Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.
07/23/04	LMG	0.40	Reveiw various court orders approving professionals, extending deadline to assume or reject, and continuing hearing on certain matters; follow up with co-counsel
07/23/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call to and telephone call from Larry Nyhan regarding status
07/23/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call from court; e-mail to Larry Nyhan regarding 8/30, 8/31 options



# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
 c/o Ted Lodge  
 President & Chief Operating Officer  
 Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
 225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
 Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
 Matter Number: 034902-00002  
 RE: Bankruptcy

07/26/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call with Ellen Moring regarding NRTC Escrow Motion, KERP
07/27/04	LMG	0.40	Review next day papers; discussions with co-counsel.
07/27/04	LMG	0.30	Review Order Granting Application of Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors to Employ Capital & Technology Advisors, LLC as Financial Advisor Nunc Pro Tunc to 6/14/04.
07/27/04	LMG	0.40	Review Order Granting Application of Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors to Employ Greenhill & Co., LLC as Financial Advisor Nunc Pro Tunc to 6/14/04; review reconilliation report from US Trustee and follow up re. same..
07/27/04	LMG	0.10	Review Amended Notice of Hearing Filed by Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc. (related document(s):[338] Generic Motion, filed by Debtor Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.). Hearing scheduled for 8/19/2004 at 10:30 AM at Bankruptcy Courtroom
07/27/04	LMG	0.20	Review Motion re Entry of Order Authorizing Debtors to Deposit into the Registry of the Court Certain Post-Petition Amounts.
07/29/04	RJK	0.20	Attention to status conference
07/30/04	LMG	0.50	Reveiw various filings; discussions with co-counsel re. status.
07/30/04	LMG	1.70	Review pending matters; discussions re. mgm issues..
Total 04		----- 21.00	

05 Claims Administration and Objections

Date ATTY Hours  
 Page 7

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/30/04	SD	0.20	Letter to Trumbull re claims received in error.
		-----	
Total 05		0.20	

## 06 Employee Benefits/Pensions

Date	ATTY	Hours	
07/07/04	RJK	0.20	Exchange e-mails with US Trustees' regarding KERP Motion
07/07/04	RJK	0.10	Review e-mail from Bank Group regarding KERP
07/07/04	RJK	0.30	Telephone call to US Trustee regarding KERP; e-mail to US Trustee regarding KERP; e-mail to Moring regarding same
07/07/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call from Ellen Moring regarding KERP
07/08/04	RJK	1.30	Attend hearings regarding KERP, scheduling order
07/08/04	RJK	0.20	Review e-mails regarding status of KERP motion
07/08/04	RJK	0.50	Review various e-mails regarding KERP motion; review revised orders (drafts); review objection re KERP
07/28/04	RJK	2.00	Prepare for and attend hearings regarding KERP, Miller Buckfire application, including telephone call with Ellen Moring & Guy Neal and follow up teleconference
		-----	
Total 06		4.80	

## 07 Fee/Employment Applications

Date	ATTY	Hours	
07/02/04	RJK	0.20	Review Notice of Hearing (retention applications)

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/02/04	SD	2.50	Review of various e-mail; attention to filing of applications to employ; draft notice of hearing; draft certificate of service; e-filing of same; service of same.
07/07/04	LMG	0.40	Respond to FTI request for assistance on fee application.
07/07/04	LMG	0.50	Review new applications for fees, etc.
07/08/04	RJK	0.30	Telephone call with Ellen Moring regarding methodology for submission of monthly fee requests
07/12/04	SD	0.20	Review of various e-mails requesting forms of fee applications; e-mail to Jessica Knowles regarding fee application
07/15/04	SD	0.30	E-filing of certificate of service regarding applications to employ filed on July 2, 2004; e-filing of NRTC escrow motion.
07/19/04	LMG	0.20	Review Moore & Van Allen PLLC's invoice for fees and expenses through June 30, 2004.
07/20/04	SD	1.20	Attention to file of ordinary course professional declarations.
07/22/04	SD	1.30	Attention to review of order regarding payment of professionals regarding procedure for filing monthly fee statements; telephone call to District court regarding appeal and deadlines; telephone call to bankruptcy court re 7/31 hearing date.
07/22/04	LMG	0.20	Review Order Granting Application to Employ PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP as Accountant and Auditor.
07/22/04	LMG	0.10	Review Order Authorizing the Debtors and Debtors in Possession to Employ Herbein & Company, Inc. as Corporate Taxation Advisors.

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/22/04	LMG	0.10	Review Order Authorizing the Debtors and Debtors in Possession to Employ and Retain King & Spalding LLP as Special Corporate and Transactional Counsel.
07/22/04	SD	0.20	Attention to e-mails from Lauren Hoeflich regarding monthly fee requests; review of monthly fee request.
07/22/04	RJK	0.30	Exchange e-mails regarding monthly fee statements, form, timing
07/23/04	RJK	0.50	Review MBCY monthly statement; review forms of monthly statement; e-mails regarding same
07/23/04	RJK	0.10	Telephone call to Ellen Moring regarding monthly statement format
07/26/04	RJK	0.20	Review Miller Buckfire's monthly statement
07/26/04	RJK	0.30	Review creditors committee application to retain Greenhill
07/26/04	RJK	0.30	Review creditors committee application to retain CTA
07/27/04	RJK	0.20	Exchange e-mails with Ellen Moring and Guy Neal regarding status of KERP, Miller Buckfire application
07/27/04	SD	0.70	Filing of monthly fee statement from Miller Buckfire Lewis & Young - Financial Advisor/Investment Banker; draft certificate service; review of order regarding service.
07/27/04	SD	0.60	Compile Kekst fee statement; e-mail to mr. Freitag; attention to e-filing of Kekst monthly fee statement; draft certificate of service.
07/27/04	SD	0.30	Begin draft of certificate of service for Kekst fee statement.
07/28/04	SD	0.30	Attention to e-filing of Kekst fee statement; finalize certificate of service.

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
 c/o Ted Lodge  
 President & Chief Operating Officer  
 Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
 225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
 Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
 Matter Number: 034902-00002  
 RE: Bankruptcy

07/28/04	SD	2.30	Coding entries on statement in preparation for filing monthly fee statement; discussions with bookkeeping regarding procedure.
07/29/04	SD	0.20	Attention to monthly fee statement.
07/29/04	SD	1.30	Continue working on monthly fee statement
07/29/04	LMG	0.20	Review Application to Employ Miller Buckfire Lewis Ying & Co., LLC as Financial Advisor & Investment Banker, filed by Debtor Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.; rvw results of hearing.
07/29/04	RJK	0.50	Attention to monthly fee statement (BSSN)
07/30/04	RJK	0.10	Telephone call from Ellen Moring regarding Miller Buckfire order
07/30/04	SD	0.70	Draft certificates of service for Hewitt monthly fee statement and BSSN monthly fee statement; e-filing of both fee statements.
		-----	
Total 07		16.80	

10

## Litigation

Date	ATTY	Hours	
07/01/04	RJK	0.50	Review e-mail regarding appeal; draft Motion for Emergency Hearing on 9006 Motion, Order
07/01/04	RJK	0.10	E-mail from Michael Warden regarding filing motion for emergency hearing
07/01/04	RJK	0.40	Review Motion for Scheduling Order in Adversary vs. NRTC/DirecTV; form of Order
07/02/04	RJK	0.90	Review various drafts of amended complaint in Adversary Proceeding vs. DirecTV, et al.
07/02/04	RJK	0.20	Review revisions to Contingent Motion for Leave to Appeal

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/02/04	RJK	0.40	Review of final Amended Complaint; Telephone call to Tom Yancey regarding same; attention to filing
07/02/04	RJK	0.50	Attention to review of 1st Circuit law regarding Rule 2003
07/06/04	RJK	4.10	Review from Leave to Appeal (several drafts); review motion for expedited appeal (drafts); review orders regarding same; review memo regarding expedited appeal; review Lodge affidavit regarding appeal; analysis of 1st Circuit cases regarding 8003, 158, 1292.
07/08/04	LMG	0.30	Brief meeting with co-counsel to get update; review order re. same
07/08/04	RJK	0.70	Review DirectTV objection to rescheduling order motion; prepare for hearing regarding same; telephone call from Michael Warden regarding same
07/09/04	RJK	0.30	E-mail to Ted Lodge regarding appeal
07/09/04	RJK	1.30	Review response to motion to dismiss appeal; e-mail regarding same (with detailed documents)
07/09/04	RJK	0.30	Telephone call with Michael Warden regarding appeal schedule
07/12/04	RJK	0.10	Review e-mail from Michael Warden regarding appeal
07/12/04	SD	0.30	Docketing from Scheduling order.
07/14/04	RJK	0.40	Review and respond to Jason Cowart e-mail regarding appeals practice issues
07/14/04	RJK	0.10	Exchange e-mail with Michael Warden regarding scheduling order in adversary proceeding
07/14/04	RJK	0.20	Revise Motion to Continue dates in 7/7/04 scheduling order

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/15/04	RJK	2.50	Review draft of brief on Appeal; telephone call with Michael Warden regarding brief, process; e-mails regarding same
07/15/04	RJK	0.40	Revise Motion to Continue Dates in Scheduling Order; exchange e-mails regarding same
07/15/04	RJK	3.10	Review subsequent drafts of brief; review and respond to e-mails regarding same; review appellate motions, orders; e-mails regarding same
07/15/04	SD	0.90	Draft of motion to continue deadlines re 02-064 adversary proceeding; draft certificate of service.
07/15/04	SD	0.30	Draft certificate of service re motion to continue deadlines re scheduling order; e-filing of certificate of service.
07/16/04	SD	1.00	Attention to e-filing of brief in district courts; various e-mails and telephone calls from
07/16/04	RJK	1.50	Review draft of brief; telephone call with Sheila Diliios regarding same
07/22/04	RJK	0.10	Telephone call to Michael Warden regarding appeal
07/22/04	RJK	0.30	Conference with Sheila Diliios regarding motion to dismiss in USDC Appeal; telephone call and e-mail to Warden regarding same
07/22/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone conference with Warden regarding Motion to Dismiss Appeal
07/23/04	RJK	0.70	Exchange of various e-mails regarding appellant and scheduling issues

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/23/04	SD	1.10	E-filing of Errata; telephone call to court; draft of certificate of service; draft certificate of service for brief filed on 7/16/04.
07/27/04	SD	0.90	Finalizing and e-filing of motion to file opposition to motion to dismiss appeal in excess of page limit; opposition to motion to dismiss appeal; draft certificate of service; telephone call to court re direction.
07/27/04	SD	0.60	Review and organization of District court filings from DirectTV.
07/27/04	SD	0.70	E-filing of reply brief in the District Court matter; draft certificate of service; telephone call from Jason Cowart; e-mails to Bob Keach and Jennifer Tatel to confirm filed reply brief.
07/27/04	RJK	0.70	Review Reply Brief; e-mail to Sheila Dilius regarding same; review Opposition to Oral Argument
07/27/04	RJK	6.50	Review DirectTV brief in U.S.D.C. Appeal; review NRTC brief in USDC appeal; review Debtors' Opposition to Motion to Dismiss USDC appeal; Review Motion to File Overlength Brief in USDC appeal; review Debtor's Reply Brief in USDC appeal; review and analyze cases regarding aiding/abetting fiduciary duty and rescission as remedy regarding USDC Appeal-Reply Brief
07/30/04	LMG	0.50	Review motion to withdraw case to Tn. court; discussions with co-counsel; review various statements of fees by professionals.
Total 10		33.10	



# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

## 11 Meeting of Creditors

Date	ATTY	Hours	
07/09/04	LMG	0.70	Review Wachovia statement; review various scheduling orders; plan for 341 hearing.
07/09/04	RJK	0.50	Exchange e-mails with Paul Caruso regarding Section 341 meeting planning
07/12/04	RJK	0.30	Exchange various e-mails regarding preparation for Section 341 meeting
07/12/04	SD	0.60	Attention to preparation and gathering materials for 341 meeting; draft of Rule 1007 letter.
07/12/04	LMG	0.70	Further preparation for 341, including discussions with client and meeting with co-counsel.
07/12/04	LMG	1.00	Prepare for 341 hearing; confrence with co-counsel (.7); field inquiry from appraisal company.
07/13/04	LMG	1.50	Preparation for 341 hearing including meeting with co-counsel.
07/13/04	LMG	2.30	Attendance at 341 hearing and advices provided re. same.
07/13/04	RJK	0.50	Conference with Paul Caruso, Leonard Gulino regarding Section 341 meeting
07/13/04	LMG	0.50	Follow up meeting on 341 hearing and discussions with client regarding same.
-----			
Total 11		8.60	

## 14 Other

Date	ATTY	Hours	
07/12/04	SD	0.50	Travel to court re picking up of transcript.
07/12/04	SD	0.30	Review of e-filings; docket court related deadlines.

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/13/04	SD	0.50	Review of ECF regarding service list information.
07/14/04	SD	1.00	Review of ECF listing; draft certificates of service with respect to applications to employ and NRTC deposit motion; Review of service list information.
07/15/04	SD	0.50	E-filing of schedule of 7/22 hearings.
07/16/04	SD	0.70	Drafting and e-filing of certificates of service for filing of pleadings; e-filing of certificates of service.
07/19/04	SD	0.10	Review of pleadings; docket court related deadlines.
07/19/04	SD	0.60	Review of memo and enter deadlines from Timeline memo.
07/20/04	SD	0.70	Update Service List
07/21/04	SD	0.80	Attention to call in information and preparation of documents for 7/22 hearings.
07/21/04	SD	0.20	Assist with service of amended notice of agenda.
07/22/04	SD	0.20	Attention to distributing call in information; telephone discussion with Mary Ellen Scott regarding procedure.
07/23/04	SD	0.10	Review of e-filings; docket court related deadlines.
07/27/04	SD	0.20	Sort pleadings in preparation for updating index.
07/27/04	SD	1.50	Coding for first monthly billing statement.
07/27/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call from Ellen Moring regarding 7-28 hearings; status
07/28/04	SD	0.70	Update service list.
07/28/04	SD	0.40	Review of pleadings; docket court related deadlines.

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

07/29/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call from Larry Nyhan; telephone call from Court regarding status conference
07/29/04	RJK	0.10	Telephone call from Larry Nyhan regarding status
07/30/04	RJK	0.50	Telephone conference with court (status conference); follow-up conference with Sidley Austin
07/30/04	RJK	0.20	Telephone call from/telephone call to Larry Nyhan regarding hearings/status conference
07/30/04	RJK	0.30	Attend telephonic status conference
07/30/04	SD	0.40	Update service list.
07/30/04	SD	0.10	Various telephone calls to court regarding hearing dates and availability for conference.
Total 14		11.00	

## ATTORNEY / PARALEGAL SUMMARY

### 02 Asset Disposition

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
LEN GULINO	0.70	225.00	157.50
ROBERT J. KEACH	0.70	350.00	245.00
Total 02		1.40	402.50

### 03 Business Operations

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
ROBERT J. KEACH	3.20	350.00	1,120.00
Total 03		3.20	1,120.00

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

## 04 Case Administration

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
LEN GULINO	9.90	225.00	2,227.50
ROBERT J. KEACH	9.60	350.00	3,360.00
SHEILA DILIOS	1.50	95.00	142.50
-----			
Total 04	21.00		5,730.00

## 05 Claims Administration and Objections

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
SHEILA DILIOS	0.20	95.00	19.00
-----			
Total 05	0.20		19.00

## 06 Employee Benefits/Pensions

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
ROBERT J. KEACH	4.80	350.00	1,680.00
-----			
Total 06	4.80		1,680.00

## 07 Fee/Employment Applications

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
LEN GULINO	1.70	225.00	382.50
ROBERT J. KEACH	3.00	350.00	1,050.00
SHEILA DILIOS	12.10	95.00	1,149.50
-----			
Total 07	16.80		2,582.00

## 10 Litigation

Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
LEN GULINO	0.80	225.00	180.00
ROBERT J. KEACH	26.50	350.00	9,275.00
SHEILA DILIOS	5.80	95.00	551.00

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004 Invoice# 3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

Total 10	33.10		10,006.00
<b>11 Meeting of Creditors</b>			
Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
LEN GULINO	6.70	225.00	1,507.50
ROBERT J. KEACH	1.30	350.00	455.00
SHEILA DILIOS	0.60	95.00	57.00
Total 11	8.60		2,019.50
<b>14 Other</b>			
Attorney	Hours	Rate	Amount
ROBERT J. KEACH	1.50	350.00	525.00
SHEILA DILIOS	9.50	95.00	902.50
Total 14	11.00		1,427.50

TOTAL FEES \$24,986.50

PHOTOCOPY	1605.60
PHONE CALL(S)	2.16
POSTAGE	97.30
POSTAGE	36.75
SECRETARY OVERTIME	123.28
STAFF OVERTIME	187.50
POSTAGE	161.25
SECRETARY OVERTIME	41.09
TRANSCRIPT COST - PAID TO: TYPEWRIGHTS	192.50
POSTAGE	43.16

# Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.

Pegasus Satellite Communications, Inc.  
c/o Ted Lodge  
President & Chief Operating Officer  
Pegasus Satellite Television, Inc.  
225 City Line Avenue, Suite 200  
Bala Cynwyd, PA 19004

August 18, 2004      Invoice#                      3156129  
Matter Number: 034902-00002  
RE: Bankruptcy

FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	88.92	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	12.07	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	23.00	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	97.78	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	10.45	
FEDERAL EXPRESS - PAID TO: FEDERAL EXPRESS CORPORATION	10.96	
POSTAGE	19.24	
POSTAGE	95.04	
POSTAGE	17.02	
POSTAGE	12.01	
TOTAL EXPENSES		\$2,877.08
TOTAL FEES PLUS EXPENSES		\$27,863.58

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
DISTRICT OF MAINE

_____ )	
In re: )	Chapter 11
)	
PEGASUS SATELLITE TELEVISION, INC., et al., )	Case No. 04-20878 (Lead Case)
)	
Debtors. )	Jointly Administered
_____ )	

**CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE**

I, Sheila R. Dilios, being over the age of eighteen and an employee of Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, hereby certify that on August 26, 2004, I caused the Statement of Fees for Services Rendered and Out-of-Pocket Expenses Incurred by Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson as Co-Counsel to the Debtors for the Period Beginning July 1, 2004 and Ending July 31, 2004 to be served on the parties listed by verifying that such persons(s) are listed on the Electronic Mail Notice List kept by the Clerk's office and therefore will be served as part of the Electronic Case Filing ("ECF") system pursuant to the Standing Order Regarding Administrative Procedures for Electronically Filed Cases dated August 12, 2002, and entered in the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the District of Maine.

August 26, 2004

/s/ Sheila R. Dilios  
SHEILA R. DILIOS

BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON  
100 Middle Street, P.O. Box 9729

Portland, ME 04104-5029

## SERVICE VIA “ECF FILING”

- **Gayle H. Allen**  
gallen@verrilldana.com bankr@verrilldana.com; ebriggeman@verrilldana.com
- **Fred W. Bopp, III,**  
fbopp@perkinsthompson.com malexander@perkinsthompson.com
- **Robert S. Brady**  
bankruptcy@ycst.com
- **Roger A. Clement, Jr.**  
rclement@verrilldana.com bankr@verrilldana.com
- **Randy J. Creswell**  
rcreswell@perkinsthompson.com cpaine@perkinsthompson.com
- **Daniel R. Felkel**  
dfelkel@thplaw.com hmitchell-moore@thplaw.com
- **David J. Gaier**  
dgaier@mccarter.com
- **Alan Eric Gamza**  
agamza@mosessinger.com cdanielson@mosessinger.com
- **Jay S. Geller**  
jgeller@maine.rr.com
- **Leonard M. Gulino**  
lgulino@bssn.com sdilios@bssn.com
- **Nava Hazan**  
nhazan@akingump.com; [pdublin@akingump.com](mailto:pdublin@akingump.com); [aqureshi@akingump.com](mailto:aqureshi@akingump.com); [djnewman@akingump.com](mailto:djnewman@akingump.com); mtilney@akingump.com
- **Bruce B. Hochman**  
bhochman@lambertcoffin.com cyoung@lambertcoffin.com
- **Kim Y. Jefferson**  
ICBRCAL@state.tn.us
- **Robert J. Keach**  
rkeach@bssn.com sdilios@bssn.com
- **Jacob A. Manheimer**  
jmanheimer@pierceatwood.com mpottle@pierceatwood.com



- **Benjamin E. Marcus**  
bmarcusecf@dwmlaw.com
- **George J. Marcus**  
bankruptcy@mcm-law.com dgerry@mcm-law.com
- **John P. McVeigh**  
jmcveigh@preti.com
- **Ellen Moring**  
emoring@sidley.com  
pcarusosidley.com;jknowles@sidley.com;emcdonnell@sidley.com;jmargulies@sidley.com
- **Guy S. Neal**  
gneal@sidley.com
- **Richard J. O'Brien**  
robrien@lcwlaw.com bmclure@lcwlaw.com
- **Jennifer H. Pincus**  
jpincus@perkinsthompson.com
- **Peter Michael Reed**  
sragdale@mvalaw.com
- **F. Bruce Sleeper**  
bankruptcy@jbg.com
-