EXHIBIT "A"

## IN ACCOUNT WITH

## SCHREEDER, WHEELER & FLINT, LLP

1100 PEACHTREE STREET, N.E. SUITE 800 ATLANTA, GEORGIA 30309-4516 Tax Id #58-1184925 (404) 681-3450

November 17, 2008

Marcus A. Watson, Sr. Chapter 7 Trustee 3091 Governors Lake Drive Suite 450 Norcross, GA 30071

Client:

Marc A. Watson

Matter:

Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery

File #:

7031-1

Invoice #: 117119

	Legal Ser	rvices - Litigation	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/01/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	1.80	297.00
	SUBTO	TAL:	1.80	297.00
	Asset An	alysis and Recovery	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
03/24/08	DAW	Research Roark issues; research 506(c) issues.	4.50	1305.00
03/25/08	ВХН	Bankruptcy research re: 506	5.40	945.00
	DAW	Research regarding 506(c) issue.	1.50	435.00
03/26/08	ВХН	Bankruptcy research re: 506	8.40	1470.00
03/27/08	ВХН	Bankruptcy research regarding fradulent conveyance	11.00	1925.00
	DAW	Legal research regarding fraudulent conveyance; 506(c).	5.00	1450.00
03/28/08	ВХН	Bankruptcy research regarding 506	2.80	490.00

		on stee for Pikes Nursery		
Page 2	DAW	Legal research regarding 506(c).	5.50	1595.00
	JAC	Meeting with Roarke and counsel	4.00	1540.00
03/31/08	DAW	Conference regarding various issues of 506(c) and status of Roark research & claims; Legal research regarding 506(c); Legal research and investigation of fraudulent conveyance claims; Preparation for conference on April 1.	5.00	1450.00
	JAC	Telephone call with R. Mercer regarding Roarke claims	1.20	462.00
04/01/08	DAW	Legal research regarding fraudulent conveyance and undercapitalization.	5.50	1650.00
04/02/08	DAW	Legal research memo.	1.50	450.00
04/03/08	DAW	Prepare legal research summary regarding 506(c).	8.00	2400.00
04/04/08	DAW	Legal research summary regarding 506(c).	6.00	1800.00
	JAC	Review PNC response	0.40	158.00
04/10/08	DAW	Memo regarding 506 (c).	0.50	150.00
04/11/08	JCT	Revise and file settlement motion	0.50	137.50
04/30/08	DAW	Review legal research regarding fraudulent conveyance claims against PNC.	0.30	90.00
05/01/08	DAW	Review correspondence regarding fraudulent conveyance litigation.	0.50	150.00
05/09/08	DAW	Review 506(C) correspondence.	0.50	150.00
05/12/08	AJL	Checking/printing cases relevant to 506(c) oversecured surcharge question	2.30	379.50
05/13/08	AJL	Legal research regarding 506(c) surcharge question.	0.30	49.50

		on tee for Pikes Nursery		
Page 3 05/16/08	DAW	Legal research on PNC issues.	1.00	300.00
05/19/08	DAW	Legal research regarding 506(c).	1.00	300.00
05/22/08	DAW	Legal services regarding 506(c) issues.	0.50	150.00
05/29/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	1.40	231.00
05/30/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	0.70	115.50
06/02/08	ALB	Memo on Staute of Limitations for Trustee's Fraudulent Conveyance claim.	1.80	297.00
06/04/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	0.90	148.50
06/09/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	4.60	759.00
06/10/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	1.90	313.50
06/11/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	3.30	544.50
	BRC	Document review, look through financials for Pike	0.30	49.50
06/12/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	0.50	82.50
06/13/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	2.40	396.00
06/16/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	1.10	181.50
06/18/08	ALB	PACA research.	2.10	346.50
06/19/08	ALB	PACA/Applicability of Oregon's statute research.	1.30	214.50
06/25/08	JCT	E-mail L. Ritchie Craig regarding Regis removal of equipment	0.20	55.00

November 17, 2008

Client	Marc	Α	Watson
CHOIL.	IVICIO	4	II ULDUII

Matter: Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery

U				
06/30/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	1.20	198.00
07/02/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	2.10	346.50
07/03/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	3.20	528.00
07/07/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	2.60	429.00
07/08/08	ALB	Document review regarding potential litigation.	3.30	544.50
07/18/08	JCT	Phone conversation with C. Stanton; email to M. Watson regarding AR claim	0.20	55.00
08/05/08	JCT	Voicemail from M. Watson; e-mail regarding lien rights	0.20	55.00
08/08/08	DAW	Organize legal research regarding 506(c).	0.50	150.00
	SUBTO	ΓAL:	118.90	27422.00
	SUBTO7		118.90 <u>Hours</u>	27422.00 <u>Amount</u>
03/24/08				
03/24/08	Sale of A	Draft motion to assume and assign lease for Store No. 4; review objection to extension of time to assume or reject	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
03/24/08	Sale of A	Draft motion to assume and assign lease for Store No. 4; review objection to extension of time to assume or reject leases  Revise order and notice; upload order and notice on sale; phone conversation with E. Moody regarding entry; coordinate	<u>Hours</u> 1.00	<u>Amount</u> 275.00
03/24/08	Sale of A  JCT  JCT	Draft motion to assume and assign lease for Store No. 4; review objection to extension of time to assume or reject leases  Revise order and notice; upload order and notice on sale; phone conversation with E. Moody regarding entry; coordinate service	Hours 1.00 0.50	Amount 275.00 137.50
03/24/08	Sale of A  JCT  JCT	Draft motion to assume and assign lease for Store No. 4; review objection to extension of time to assume or reject leases  Revise order and notice; upload order and notice on sale; phone conversation with E. Moody regarding entry; coordinate service  Draft motion to allow miscellaneous sales  E-mail from D. Cranshaw regarding SunTrust lease; phone conversation and e-mail from P. Douglas regarding lease	Hours 1.00 0.50 0.60	Amount 275.00 137.50

November 17, 2008

Chon. Maic A. Watson	Client:	Marc A	. Watson
----------------------	---------	--------	----------

Matter: Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery

	JCT	Revise motion to permit miscellaneous sale of personal property	0.50	137.50
03/26/08	JCT	Draft motion to reject contracts	1.00	275.00
	JCT	Revise motion to assume and assign and file; draft order to shorten notice and upload	0.60	165.00
	JCT	Revise motion for miscellaneous sale procedures; handle service issue	0.50	137.50
03/27/08	JAC	Review 365 motions, application to employ, DIP orders	5.00	1925.00
	JCT	Review leases and contracts for possible rejection; phone conversation with A. Ray regarding leases; review sale agreements; e-mails with D. Cranshaw; phone conversation with G. Crocket regarding equipment lease; prepare second motion to reject executory contracts; e-mails and phone conversation with D. Schuman	4.70	1292.50
03/28/08	JCT	Revising rejecting contracts list and exhibit; draft motion to confirm rejection of store lease; revise two other rejection motions; e-mail regarding GE Fleet lease	3.00	825.00
03/30/08	JCT	Draft order on second motion to sell to premier consulting	1.50	412.50
03/31/08	JCT	Revise and file two omnibus motions to reject executory contracts and leases; locate additional service addresses and prepare supplemental certificate of service; phone conversation with A. Ray regarding D. Van Vlake regarding rejection	2.50	687.50
	JCT	Revise order on second motion to sell to Premier and upload; confirm proper service for hearing and service on order on lessees	1.20	330.00

November 17, 2008

Client: Marc A. Watson

Matter: Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery

J				
04/01/08	JCT	Prepare order to reject stores 25 and 36; revise and upload proposed orders	0.70	192.50
	JCT	Rejection of equipment lease analysis; prepare and file amendment to first rejection motion; e-mail from D. Cranshaw regarding lease assignment; e-mail A. Ray regarding lease assignment	1.00	275.00
04/02/08	JCT	Draft motion to reject equipment leases; phone conversation with A. Ray regarding cure payments	1.00	275.00
04/03/08	JCT	Motion to reject equipment and vehicle leases; review leases	1.50	412.50
04/04/08	JAC	Telephone calls with GE counsel regarding leases	0.50	197.50
	JCT	Drafting and revising motion to reject equipment lease; phone conversation with D. Cranshaw regarding SunTrust lease; voicemail from L. Ritchey-Craig	2.30	632.50
	JCT	Prepare proposed order on motion to assign lease; prepare proposed order on miscellaneous sale procedures	1.00	275.00
04/07/08	JAC	Attend hearing on PNC motion and motion to sell; revise R. 1019 order	2.70	1066.50
	JAC	Telephone call with Watson and to GE attorney regarding leased equipment	0.60	237.00
	JCT	Revise motion to reject Ryder lease; draft and edit motion to reject corporate offices and motion to shorten notice; draft and edit motion to reject lease with DPR Holding; draft proposed orders on notice; phone conversation with A. Ray regarding lease rejection	2.10	577.50
	JCT	Revise order on motion to permit miscellaneous sales and upload	0.40	110.00

		son ustee for Pikes Nursery		
Page 7 04/08/08	JCT	Legal research regarding sales issues with lease property	1.50	412.50
	JCT	Re-upload order; serve orders on rejection hearings; draft motion to reject lease with W. Pike; phone conversation with R. Williamson regarding payment of cure amounts; review Skinner closing documents; phone conversation and email with D. Cranshaw regarding SunTrust cure payments	1.50	412.50
	JCT	Prepare memorandum regarding rejection status and agenda for hearings; prepare certificate of service for miscellaneous sale order and serve	1.00	275.00
04/09/08	JCT	Review sale agreements regarding escrow disbursements and payment of cure amounts; review letter regarding cure amount claim	0.80	220.00
	JCT	Revise and upload order as assignment motion; prepare orders for two omnibus rejection motions	1.00	275.00
	JCT	Revise motion to reject Ryder leases; draft motion to approve settlement; phone conversation with B. King	1.00	275.00
04/10/08	JAC	Attend hearing on rejection	0.80	316.00
·	JAC	Review 9019 motion for Specialty Contracting	0.30	118.50
	JCT	Prepare notice of hearing for Ryder motion and file motion	0.30	82.50
	JCT	Revise order for omnibus rejection motions; phone conversation and e-mails regarding Calfirst property recovery	0.60	165.00
04/14/08	JCT	Phone conversation with M. Watson, Jr. regarding rejection order; e-mail regarding same; review order	0.40	110.00

		on stee for Pikes Nursery		
Page 8 04/15/08	JAC	Review reply to Armstrong letter regarding sale	0.30	118.50
	JCT	E-mail regarding assignment of lease signature pages; locate requested documents	0.30	82.50
	JCT	Phone conversation with M. Watson, Jr. regarding lease rejection; e-mails regarding lease rejection; voicemail from P. Douglas	0.50	137.50
04/16/08	JCT	Phone conversations and e-mails regarding lease and contract rejections; review APAs; prepare proposed orders on rejection motions	1.00	275.00
	JCT	E-mails regarding Armstrong assignment signature pages sent to A. Goodin	0.20	55.00
04/17/08	JAC	Attend rejection hearing	1.50	592.50
	JCT	Phone conversations regarding rejection and location of equipment; upload orders on rejection motions heard at hearing; review schedule of leases and issues	1.00	275.00
04/18/08	JCT	Phone conversation and e-mails regarding sale notice; prepare notice and send	1.20	330.00
	JCT	Phone conversation with lessors regarding vehicle and equipment pick-up; phone conversation with M. Watson, Jr. regarding Enterprise vehicles; e-mails with counsel regarding vehicle location	0.70	192.50
04/21/08	JCT	Revise first omnibus rejection exhibit; draft second amendment on omnibus rejection; phone conversation with M. Watson, Jr. regarding rejection	1.00	275.00
	JCT	Phone conversation with Ryder regarding leases; review e-mail attachment; e-mails regarding VIN numbers for vehicles; e-mail regarding DeLage Ladin leases; phone conversation and e-mails with C.	1.30	357.50

		son astee for Pikes Nursery		
Page 9		Burkdale regarding Toyota leases; voicemail for Wilmar Leasing; phone conversation regarding Idealease		
04/22/08	JCT	Phone conversation regarding Toyota forklifts; e-mail to J. Wagner regarding GE equipment and leases; revise amendment to omnibus rejection and exhibits; phone conversation regarding rejection of Hasler and Alabama Security	1.00	275.00
04/23/08	JCT	Phone conversation with P. Douglas regarding CalFirst; e-mails and phone conversation with miscellaneous sale of property	0.80	220.00
04/24/08	JCT	E-mail from J. Wagner regarding GE leases; response e-mail	0.20	55.00
04/25/08	JCT	Prepare order rejecting Ryder lease; phone conversation with Kevin S. regarding Ryder; e-mails regarding cure amounts for Ryder	0.60	165.00
	JCT	E-mail to Kevin S. regarding Tucker location; phone conversation with M. Watson regarding same	0.30	82.50
	JCT	Prepare waiver for sale of items in Alabama	0.70	192.50
04/28/08	JCT	Meet with M. Watson regarding cure payments	0.20	55.00
	JCT	Revise release; phone conversation and e-mail to B. Wilkinson	0.40	110.00
04/29/08	JCT	Prepare memorandum regarding cure amounts; e-mails with Kevin S. regarding Ryder amounts	0.50	137.50
	PEV	Review of pleadings for objection to cure amounts	0.40	74.00
04/30/08	JCT	Phone conversation with Ryder regarding cure amounts	0.30	82.50

November 17, 2008

Client: Marc A. Watson

Matter: Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery

	JCT	Prepare order on motion to settle claim	0.30	82.50
	PEV	Review of pleadings for objecton to cure amounts	0.30	55.50
05/01/08	JCT	Upload separate order; review information regarding cure amounts for Ryder	0.30	82.50
05/02/08	JCT	Phone conversation with P. Douglas regarding CalFirst equipment	0.30	82.50
05/05/08	JCT	Phone conversation regarding CalFirst equipment and accounts receivable records; e-mails regarding phone conference	0.60	165.00
	JCT	E-mails and phone message to Ryder regarding cure amounts	0.30	82.50
05/06/08	JCT	E-mail and voicemail regarding Hasler equipment being returned; phone conversation and e-mail regarding taxes for Charlotte property; update memo on cure and closing payment	0.50	137.50
05/07/08	JCT	Research cure amount payments; voicemail from and for J. Morris regarding Ryder	0.80	220.00
05/08/08	JCT	E-mails regarding Ryder cure claims with J. Morris	0.20	55.00
05/09/08	JCT	Phone conversation with M. Watson regarding CalFirst lease assets; phone conversation with M. Watson regarding sale of vehicle; phone conversation with Quench representative; e-mail M. Watson	0.60	165.00
05/12/08	JCT	Phone conversation with W. Ballard; phone conversation with M. Watson regarding payments with Charlotte sale	0.30	82.50
	JCT	Phone conversation with B. King and Specialty Contracting; phone	0.70	192.50

#### Case 07-79129-mgd Document 647 Filed 11/19/2008 Page 12 of 23

November 17, 2008

Client:	Marc A	4. W	atson
---------	--------	------	-------

Matter: Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery

Page 11

conversation with Attorney Recovery

		conversation with Attorney Recovery Systems; review facsimile; e-mail M. Watson; phone conversation with D. Delgado		
	JCT	Phone conversation with J. Morris regarding Ryder cure claims	0.30	82.50
05/13/08	JCT	Letter to D. Delgado with Attorney Recovery Services regarding claims referral	0.40	110.00
05/14/08	JCT	Phone conversations regarding payment of transfer taxes for Charlotte property	0.30	82.50
05/19/08	JCT	E-mails regarding cure for Suite 33 with landlord's counsel; e-mails regarding return of equipment	0.40	110.00
05/20/08	JCT	E-mails regarding CalFirst equipment with P. Douglas and M. Watson	0.30	82.50
05/22/08	JCT	E-mails regarding miscellaneous sales notice	0.20	55.00
	JCT	E-mails regarding additional cure for Suite 33	0.30	82.50
05/28/08	JCT	Letter from A. Arden; phone conversation with S. Arden regarding cure payment	0.20	55.00
05/29/08	JCT	E-mails regarding payment of cure amount	0.20	55.00
06/01/08	JCT	E-mail to Trustee regarding additional rejection notices	0.20	55.00
06/04/08	JCT	E-mail regarding rejection issues; voicemail for G. Bloom regarding Attorney Recovery Systems	0.20	55.00
06/09/08	JCT	Phone conversation and e-mail regarding cure for Store 46	0.30	82.50
06/11/08	JCT	Phone conversation and e-mails with V.	0.40	110.00

		November 17, 2008
Client: Ma Matter: Cha Page 12		son istee for Pikes Nursery
1 age 12		Kelley regarding cure amounts; e-mail Watson regarding Ryder cure amounts
	JCT	Subpoena for letter of credit to Carter Lindbergh Retail
06/12/08	JCT	Phone conversation with Trustee regarding rejection of agreements; pho conversation with Trustee regarding leassignment
06/13/08	JCT	E-mail J. Morris regarding address; e-

Page 12		Kelley regarding cure amounts; e-mail M. Watson regarding Ryder cure amounts		
	JCT	Subpoena for letter of credit to Carter Lindbergh Retail	0.30	82.50
06/12/08	JCT	Phone conversation with Trustee regarding rejection of agreements; phone conversation with Trustee regarding lease assignment	0.40	110.00
06/13/08	JCT	E-mail J. Morris regarding address; e-mail R. Levine regarding Toyota payment; e-mail V. Kelley regarding Ryder payment	0.30	82.50
06/16/08	JCT	E-mails regarding Regis property	0.20	55.00
06/17/08	JAC	Telephone call with J. Craig, draft release for Skinner lease	0.50	197.50
	JAC	Telephone call to Craig regarding Skinner leases	0.10	39.50
	JCT	E-mail from M. Watson regarding equipment and titles	0.30	82.50
	JCT	Revise motions to reject leases and executory contracts	0.40	110.00
06/24/08	JAC	Draft form demand letter for account debtors	0.40	158.00
	JCT	Draft motion to reject agreements with Bellsouth	0.50	137.50
06/25/08	JCT	Revise motion to reject Bellsouth agreement	0.40	110.00
06/26/08	JCT	E-mails with L. Ritchie; revise Bellsouth rejection motion	0.50	137.50
07/08/08	JCT	Phone conversation with E. Rose; phone conversation with J. Sacca; prepare amended notice of hearing and additional certificates of service and file same;	1.50	412.50

November 17, 2008

		11010111001 17, 2000		
Client: Ma Matter: Ch Page 13		son ustee for Pikes Nursery		
Tage 13		review objection to rejection; draft consent order		
07/09/08	JAC	Telephone call with Trustee; counsel to California First regarding lease rejection	0.40	158.00
	JCT	Amend hearing date; phone conversation with E. Moody; phone conversation with counsel for Technisource; prepare for hearing on rejection motions	0.50	137.50
07/10/08	JAC	Telephone call with Watson, Rountree regarding resolving California First Lease rejection	0.50	197.50
	JCT	E-mails with J. Sacca; upload order; hearing preparation; phone conversation with M. Watson, Jr.	0.80	220.00
07/11/08	JAC	Set up meeting with Cal. First; review DLH release; letter to Watson regarding accounts receivables checks	0.40	158.00
	JCT	Draft and upload orders on rejection motions; phone conversation and e-mail with W. Bollard regarding Charlotte taxes	0.50	137.50
07/14/08	JCT	E-mails regarding abandonment; drafting notice of abandonment	0.30	82.50
07/15/08	JCT	Phone conversation with J. Hammond; review facsimile	0.20	55.00
07/17/08	JCT	Phone conversations with M. Watson, Jr. regarding Ryder and abandonment of furniture	0.50	137.50
07/18/08	JCT	Review furniture to abandon; draft and edit abandonment notices; phone conversation with M. Watson; e-mail M. Watson regarding U.S. Bankruptcy copies	0.70	192.50

Research and draft Formal Notice of

07/21/08

ALB

Claim.

3.10

511.50

		son stee for Pikes Nursery		
Page 14	JCT	E-mail and phone conversation regarding documents to be abandoned; revise exhibit for abandonment	0.30	82.50
07/22/08	JCT	Confirm service for abandonment notice; file and serve notice	0.40	110.00
	JCT	E-mails regarding information for accounts receivable	0.20	55.00
07/24/08	JCT	Prepare for and attend hearing on Bellsouth motion to reject agreements; draft and upload order	1.00	275.00
07/28/08	JAC	Telephone call with M. Watson and W. Rountree regarding Cal. First Lease	0.30	118.50
07/29/08	JCT	Voicemail from and for R. Ridge with DeLage Landen; phone conversation with R. Ridge	0.20	55.00
07/31/08	JAC	Attend hearing on lease rejection	0.90	355.50
08/01/08	JCT	Review assignment/sale documents regarding DeLage Landen; phone conversation and e-mail with M. Watson	0.40	110.00
	JCT	Prepare rejection order for Tomax; Clear Objective and CalFirst leases	0.80	220.00
08/04/08	JCT	Phone conversations regarding DeLage Landen forklifts; review amended APA; e-mail R. Ridge	0.50	137.50
08/07/08	JCT	Prepare notice of miscellaneous sale; e-mail client	0.30	82.50
08/29/08	JCT	E-mails and phone conversation regarding Idealease equipment	0.30	82.50
09/02/08	JCT	Phone conversation with M. Watson, Jr. regarding CalFrist and Idealease; voicemail for W. Rountree; e-mail R. Ridge regarding forklift	0.60	165.00
09/05/08	JCT	E-mails regarding sale of vehicle; prepare	0.30	82.50

Client: Marc A. Watson Matter: Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery Page 15					
1 450 15		notice for sale			
09/08/08	JCT	Phone conversations and letter regarding sale of 2001 Toyota Sequoia	0.40	110.00	
09/25/08	JCT	Emails with J. Jennings; review file and GE leases	0.30	82.50	
10/31/08	JAC	Telephone call with Watson regarding receivables	0.20	79.00	
	SUBTO	ΓAL:	91.00	26419.00	
	Business	s Operations	<u>Hours</u>	Amount	
04/03/08	JAC	Telephone call with Watson regarding leased equipment, bank accounts	1.00	395.00	
04/07/08	JCT	Phone conversations with P. Smith at Beecher Carlson regarding insurance issues; review sale agreements and information regarding cancellation of insurance; e-mail spreadsheet to P. Smith; e-mail worker's compensation claim to P. Smith	2.10	577.50	
04/08/08	JCT	Voicemail from J. Stubles; response voicemail regarding insurance issue	0.20	55.00	
05/08/08	JCT	Receipt and review of tax returns for 2007	0.20	55.00	
05/09/08	JCT	E-mails regarding tax returns	0.20	55.00	
06/18/08	JAC	Telephone call with L. Culton regarding 401k	0.20	79.00	
06/25/08	LCS	Conference with John Christy regarding 401(k)	0.20	60.00	
06/27/08	LCS	Research; conference with John Christy; memorandum	4.50	1350.00	
06/30/08	JAC	File AT&T motion	0.20	79.00	
07/24/08	JCT	Phone conversation with former	0.20	55.00	

November 17, 2008

Client: Marc A. Watson

Matter: Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery

Page 16

employee regarding 401K; e-mail trustee

	SUBTO	TAL:	9.00	2760.50
	General (	Case Administration	<u>Hours</u>	Amount
03/24/08	JCT	Revise and upload conversion order; coordinate service	0.50	137.50
	JCT	Obtain access to electronic data information and review available data	0.40	110.00
	PEV	Service of orders, ensure correct addresses and recipients for service	1.10	203.50
03/25/08	JCT	File certificate of service for conversion order	0.30	82.50
	JCT	Review Rule 1019 requests; conference with J. Christy	0.30	82.50
03/26/08	JAC	Telephone call with Watson	0.20	77.00
	JAC	Telephone call with Cranshaw, Williamson regarding leased property of SunTrust	0.60	231.00
	JAC	Telephone call with Culton	0.20	77.00
	JCT	Draft motion to excuse Rule 1019 compliance	0.70	192.50
03/27/08	JAC	Telephone call with Borders, Mercer; telephone call with GE lease attorney	2.00	770.00
	JAC	Telephone calls with Trustee and Mercer regarding case administration	0.50	192.50
	JCT	File motion to excuse compliance with Rule 1019; phone conversation regarding proper ECF event	0.40	110.00
	PEV	Research regarding various leases and equipment, review of docket and pleadings	3.60	666.00

		on stee for Pikes Nursery		
Page 17 03/28/08	JAC	Numerous telephone calls regarding case administration	1.00	385.00
	JAC	Review DIP final orders	0.50	192.50
03/31/08	JCT	Phone conversation with BMC and e- mail regarding servicing questions; phone conversation and e-mail with Bennington regarding service list; phone conversation with various creditors regarding removal from service list	0.60	165.00
04/01/08	JAC	Conference call with Mercer	1.00	395.00
	JCT	Conference call with BMC Group; e- mails regarding rates to retain and outstanding balance due	0.70	192.50
04/02/08	JCT	Phone conversation with T. Marshal regarding BMC; e-mails regarding removal from service list; phone conversation with Trustee's office regarding 341	0.50	137.50
04/03/08	JCT	Phone conversations with B. Carlson regarding insurance issues; e-mails regarding cancellation and alteration of prices; address insurance issues	0.90	247.50
04/04/08	JAC	Telephone call with Daniel Company regarding Hoover site	0.20	79.00
	JAC	Review D&O policy	0.50	197.50
	JCT	E-mails regarding removal from service list	0.20	55.00
	JCT	Prepare proposed order on motion to excuse trustee from filing final report and account	0.40	110.00
04/06/08	JAC	Telephone call with M. Watson regarding status	0.30	118.50
04/07/08	JAC	Telephone call with M. Watson	0.80	316.00

Client: Mar Matter: Chap Page 18		n tee for Pikes Nursery		
rage 16	JCT	Revise order on Rule 1019 motion	0.30	82.50
04/08/08	AMA	Researched address listings	1.00	140.00
	JCT	Phone conversation with T. Marshall regarding return mail and address issues	0.20	55.00
04/09/08	AMA	Researched address list issues	1.00	140.00
	JAC	Telephone call with Marc Watson regarding Roark	1.00	395.00
	JCT	Phone conversation with law clerk regarding notice issues; phone conversation with former employees regarding service in case	0.50	137.50
	JCT	E-mails with A. Ray regarding files	0.20	55.00
04/10/08	AMA	Researched service addresses	1.00	140.00
	JCT	Prepare motion to approve notice procedures; e-mail regarding claims	0.70	192.50
	PEV	Review of pleadings, schedules, and docket, preparation of new master service list, list of twenty largest unsecured creditors, exhibit for motion	3.60	666.00
04/11/08	AMA	Researched service addresses	0.50	70.00
	JAC	Telephone call with Williamson regarding general matters	0.30	118.50
	JCT	Visit Scroggins & Williamson to retrieve files for Chapter 11	2.50	687.50
	JCT	Review motion regarding notice procedures; review proposed master service list and 20 largest creditors revision	0.50	137.50
	PEV	Review of pleadings, schedules and docket, preparation of new master service list, list of twenty largest unsecured creditors, exhibit for motion; review and	2.60	481.00

November 17, 2008

		110 (0111001 11, 2000		
Client: Ma Matter: Cha Page 19		on stee for Pikes Nursery		
1 age 19		filing of motion regarding notice procedures		
04/13/08	JAC	Telephone call with Bank of America counsel regarding account	0.20	79.00
04/14/08	AMA		0.20	28.00
	JAC	Conference call with Trustee regarding status	2.30	908.50
	JAC	Review confidentiality order	0.10	39.50
	JCT	Review return mail list and status update	0.30	82.50
04/15/08	JAC	Review Roark solvency analysis	0.20	79.00
	JCT	Phone conversation with clerk regarding correcting address; draft notice of change of address	0.30	82.50
04/16/08	AMA	Reviewed BMC COS listing for duplicate entries	2.20	308.00
	JCT	Voicemail from and for creditor; file notice of trustee's change of address; review return mail	0.30	82.50
	JCT	Memorandum regarding doucments from Scroggins & Williamson	0.50	137.50
04/17/08	AMA	General case administration	1.50	210.00
04/18/08	AMA	Confirm service addresses	1.50	210.00
	JAC	Telephone call with Cranshaw, Watson and DuPre	2.00	790.00
	JAC	Review AM agreement	0.50	197.50
	JCT	Phone conversation with A. Ray; phone conversation with creditor regarding claims question	0.20	55.00

Phone conversation with P. Smith regarding insurance; e-mail regarding

04/21/08

JCT

0.30

82.50

November 17, 2008

Matter: Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery

111	SI	11	·21	na	e.

•		insurance		
04/22/08	JAC	Telephone call with Mark Watson and to S. Borders regarding Roark	0.30	118.50
04/23/08	JCT	Prepare order for notice procedures and revise same for hearing	0.80	220.00
04/24/08	JAC	Telephone call with Skinner attorney	0.20	79.00
	JAC	Telephone call with Marc Watson regarding general matters	0.60	237.00
04/25/08	JAC	Telephone call with S. Borders	0.20	79.00
	JCT	Prepare for and attend hearing on notice motion; upload order; e-mail order for service; prepare notice of filing service list; finalize master service list	1.50	412.50
	JCT	Phone conversation and e-mails with BMC Group regarding service list; duplicates on list and service order limiting notice procedures; file master service list and prepare certificate of service of order on Master Service List	1.10	302.50
04/29/08	JCT	File certificate of service for administrative bar order	0.20	55.00
04/30/08	AMA	Researched address on return mail report	1.50	210.00
	JAC	Telephone call with Watson; review PNC memo	0.80	316.00
	JCT	Phone conversation with BMC Group regarding service list and claims	0.30	82.50
05/01/08	JCT	E-mails regarding changes of address with BMC	0.20	55.00
	PEV	Research and telephone calls regarding claims of Walker and review of schedules	0.60	111.00
05/02/08	JAC	Telephone call with Watson, Langdon regarding PNC meeting and claims	0.80	316.00

November 17, 2008

Client: Marc A. Watson

Matter: Chapter 7 Trustee for Pikes Nursery

J				
	JCT	File certificate of service for BMC service; prepare certificate of service and service orders	0.30	82.50
	PEV	Review of schedules	0.20	37.00
05/06/08	JAC	Telephone calls with Watson regarding PNC	0.70	276.50
05/07/08	JAC	Telephone calls with Mercer, Watson	0.80	316.00
	JCT	Phone conversation with T. Webb regarding tax return	0.30	82.50
05/08/08	AMA	Prepared and sent out word format of address listing	1.00	140.00
	JAC	Attend PNC meeting in Charlotte	8.50	3357.50
05/09/08	JAC	Telephone call with creditor regarding claim	0.20	79.00
	JCT	E-mails with M. Smith	0.20	55.00
05/10/08	JAC	Telephone call with Watson regarding PNC	0.40	158.00
05/12/08	JAC	Telephone calls with Watson, Mercer regarding PNC	0.90	355.50
	PEV	Review, filing and coordination of service of pleadings	0.20	37.00
05/13/08	JAC	Telephone call with Suwanee EMC counsel regarding 506c issue	0.50	197.50
	PEV	Review of schedules relating to administrative bar order	0.80	148.00
05/14/08	PEV	Review of schedules relating to administrative bar order	0.60	111.00
05/15/08	JAC	Telephone call with M. Watson regarding PNC; complete PNC stipulations	0.30	118.50

		on stee for Pikes Nursery		
Page 22 05/16/08	JCT	Phone conversation with accountant regarding tax return	0.20	55.00
05/19/08	JCT	Handle change of address request	0.20	55.00
05/20/08	JCT	E-mails regarding tax returns	0.20	55.00
	PEV	Research regarding claim	0.70	129.50
05/22/08	JCT	Voicemail for and from D. Newsome	0.30	82.50
05/23/08	JAC	Telephone calls with Mercer, Watson regarding PNC claim	1.00	395.00
05/27/08	JCT	Phone conversations and e-mails regarding address changes for creditors	0.30	82.50
05/28/08	JAC	Telephone calls with Watson, US Trustee Culton regarding PNC settlement	0.40	158.00
	PEV	Assisted review of pleadings and requirements imposed upon Trustee, reviewed order relating to executory contracts	0.80	148.00
05/29/08	JAC	Telephone call with Williamson, Watson regarding PNC; attend PNC 9019 hearing	3.80	1501.00
	PEV	Assisted review of pleadings and requirements imposed upon Trustee	0.70	129.50
05/30/08	PEV	Drafted and filed updated master service list, began review of administrative claims and objections thereto, emails regarding administrative claims and miscellaneous sales report; revisions, filing and service of motions for compensation for Finley, Schreeder, Wheeler & Flint, LLP	1.80	333.00
06/02/08	PEV	Prepared and filed report of miscellaneous sales at auction	0.80	148.00
06/04/08	JCT	Phone conversation and e-mail regarding Trustee's bond	0.30	82.50