

# EXHIBIT A

**Chanin Capital Partners**  
**Financial Advisor for the Committee**  
**In re RCN Corporation, *et al.***  
**Summary of Time Records**  
**June 14, 2004 through June 30, 2004**

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Russell Belinsky	Senior Managing Director	12.50
Sanjay Jindal	Director	16.00
John Garcia	Vice President	54.10
Bill Pearson	Senior Advisor	3.10
Anurag Kapur	Senior Associate	53.00
Mark Schelbert	Associate	58.50
<b>Total</b>		<u><u>197.20</u></u>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*June 14, 2004 through June 30, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
06/14/04	R. Belinsky	Review plan; T/C with client;T/C with counsel; review KERP.	2.00
06/15/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; review analysis; T/C with operating partner at RCN.	1.00
06/16/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; internal meeting; review KERP; review comps.	2.00
06/17/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; T/C with advisor; review filings; review comp analysis.	1.00
06/18/04	R. Belinsky	review comp study; review plan; T/C with client.	1.00
06/21/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; T/C with counsel; review comp analysis; prepare for meeting.	1.50
06/22/04	R. Belinsky	Call with co; review analysis; review emails; T/C with client.	2.00
06/23/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for UCC call; T/C with UCC; T/C with client; T/C with internal team.	2.00
		<b>Total</b>	<b>12.50</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*June 14, 2004 through June 30, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
06/15/04	S. Jindal	Call with Company advisors; review company schedules and SOFAs;	2.50
06/18/04	S. Jindal	Call with CTA; call with AlixPartners on cash forecast; review variance analysis; call with counsel.	3.50
06/21/04	S. Jindal	Call with counsel; review fee analysis and cash variance analysis; call with CTA.	3.50
06/22/04	S. Jindal	Conference call with company and committee; review fee analysis; review retention letter; call with CTA.	3.00
06/23/04	S. Jindal	Committee call.	1.00
06/29/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; internal discussion.	2.50
		<b>Total</b>	<b>16.00</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*June 14, 2004 through June 30, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
06/14/04	J. Garcia	Review plan; KERP analysis.	3.60
06/15/04	J. Garcia	Review KERP analysis; financial due diligence.	2.50
06/16/04	J. Garcia	Comparable transactions analysis; Market comps analysis.	3.80
06/18/04	J. Garcia	Review plan and plan issues.	3.60
06/21/04	J. Garcia	Review documents; call with counsel & clients; financial analysis.	4.30
06/22/04	J. Garcia	Call with co; review analysis; review emails; T/C with client.	3.70
06/23/04	J. Garcia	UCC Call; financial analysis re: business plan; due diligence re same.	3.40
06/24/04	J. Garcia	Conf call re: projections and financial dd.	2.90
06/25/04	J. Garcia	Review fee analysis.	1.50
06/28/04	J. Garcia	Revise fee analysis; review and finalize declaration.	4.30
06/29/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; internal discussion.	3.00
06/29/04	J. Garcia	Travel; review projections; financial analysis re: same.	8.00
06/30/04	J. Garcia	Meeting with company and committee to discuss status and update on developments; travel.	9.50
		<b>Total</b>	<b>54.10</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*June 14, 2004 through June 30, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
06/15/04	B. Pearson	Review NOL analysis.	0.50
06/21/04	B. Pearson	Advisor conf call re: confidentiality.	0.80
06/22/04	B. Pearson	Conf call with company.	1.00
06/23/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	0.80
		<b>Total</b>	<b>3.10</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*June 14, 2004 through June 30, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
06/14/04	A. Kapur	Took calls with bondholders; call with counsel; initiate operational advisor fee analysis.	4.60
06/15/04	A. Kapur	Participate in and summarize call with Company advisors; review company schedules and SOFAs; refine fee analysis.	5.20
06/16/04	A. Kapur	Review and refine draft retention app; call with counsel; refine fee analysis.	4.90
06/17/04	A. Kapur	Review detail on cash forecast; call with counsel; review analysis.	3.20
06/18/04	A. Kapur	Call with CTA; call with AlixPartners on cash forecast; review variance analysis; call with counsel.	4.70
06/21/04	A. Kapur	Call with counsel; revise fee analysis; review and revise cash variance analysis; call with CTA.	4.80
06/22/04	A. Kapur	Conference call with company and committee; review fee analysis; finalize cash analysis; review retention letter; call with CTA.	5.30
06/23/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; review and revise fee analysis.	2.70
06/24/04	A. Kapur	Revise retention app; liaise with counsel.	3.20
06/25/04	A. Kapur	Review fee analysis.	2.10
06/28/04	A. Kapur	Revise fee analysis; review and finalize declaration.	4.30
06/29/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; internal discussion.	3.40
06/30/04	A. Kapur	Meeting with company and committee to discuss status and update on developments.	4.60
		<b>Total</b>	<b>53.00</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*June 14, 2004 through June 30, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
06/14/04	M. Schelbert	Call with counsel; draft operational advisor fee analysis.	5.00
06/15/04	M. Schelbert	Call with Company advisors; review company schedules and SOFAs; refine fee analysis.	6.00
06/16/04	M. Schelbert	Call with counsel; work on fee analysis.	4.50
06/17/04	M. Schelbert	Review cash forecast; call with counsel; work on fee analysis.	5.50
06/18/04	M. Schelbert	Review variance analysis; call with counsel.	2.50
06/21/04	M. Schelbert	Call with counsel; work on fee analysis; call with CTA.	7.00
06/22/04	M. Schelbert	Call with company and committee; work on fee analysis; work on cash analysis.	6.00
06/23/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call; work on fee analysis.	4.50
06/24/04	M. Schelbert	Work on fee analysis.	5.00
06/25/04	M. Schelbert	Work on fee analysis.	4.00
06/28/04	M. Schelbert	Work on fee analysis.	4.00
06/29/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call; internal discussion.	4.50
		<b>Total</b>	<b>58.50</b>

**Chanin Capital Partners**  
**Financial Advisor for the Committee**  
**In re RCN Corporation, *et al.***  
**Summary of Time Records**  
**July 1, 2004 through July 31, 2004**

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Russell Belinsky	Senior Managing Director	35.50
Sanjay Jindal	Director	27.20
John Garcia	Vice President	55.40
Bill Pearson	Senior Advisor	8.60
Anurag Kapur	Senior Associate	64.20
Mark Schelbert	Associate	59.00
<b>Total</b>		<u><u>249.90</u></u>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*July 1, 2004 through July 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
07/01/04	R. Belinsky	Review UCC review; T/C with client.	2.00
07/05/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for UCC meeting; review SG&A analysis; review eng letter.	1.00
07/06/04	R. Belinsky	UCC call; review eng letter.	1.00
07/07/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with co; review financials; review equity motion.	1.50
07/08/04	R. Belinsky	Review Moody's report; T/C with client; review rating agency book.	2.00
07/09/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with internal team; review Moody's report; review SG&A analysis.	1.50
07/12/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; review valuation.	1.00
07/13/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with UCC; review financials; T/C with client.	2.00
07/14/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with co; internal meeting; review and revise memo.	1.50
07/16/04	R. Belinsky	Review schedule; T/C with client; review analysis.	1.00
07/18/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for and travel to meeting with company.	5.00
07/19/04	R. Belinsky	Meeting with company and advisors.	2.50
07/21/04	R. Belinsky	Meeting with company and advisors.	3.00
07/23/04	R. Belinsky	Review analysis; T/C with client; T/C with counsel.	2.00
07/25/04	R. Belinsky	Review and revise sub con analysis (financial).	1.50
07/26/04	R. Belinsky	Review sub con analysis; T/C with UCC; T/C with client.	2.00
07/27/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with UCC and company.	3.00
07/29/04	R. Belinsky	Review plan and d/s; review timeline; internal meeting.	1.00
07/30/04	R. Belinsky	Review plan; T/C with client.	1.00
		<b>Total</b>	<b>35.50</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*July 1, 2004 through July 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
07/02/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; Review SG&A savings initiatives.	2.00
07/06/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; Review plan documents and timeline.	3.40
07/09/04	S. Jindal	Review review rating agency materials and cash forecast updates.	2.00
07/12/04	S. Jindal	Review cash collateral reporting schedule, counsel report on board discussions.	2.40
07/13/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; call with company on franchise issues; review equity committee response, draft term sheet.	3.00
07/18/04	S. Jindal	Review cash collateral reporting schedule, counsel report on board discussions, and plan alternatives while traveling from LAX to NYC.	4.00
07/19/04	S. Jindal	Meeting with company advisors on plan alternatives.	3.30
07/21/04	S. Jindal	Meeting with company and advisors to discuss plan alternatives, progress. Review plan alternatives and cost savings while traveling from JFK to LAX.	5.00
07/28/04	S. Jindal	Committee call.	2.10
		<b>Total</b>	<b>27.20</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*July 1, 2004 through July 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
07/02/04	J. Garcia	Committee conference call; SG&A analysis, review retention application; financial analysis re: projections.	3.70
07/06/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; review documents.	2.40
07/07/04	J. Garcia	Review retention documents; review Starpower information.	1.50
07/08/04	J. Garcia	Review legal documents; review projections; analysis re: same.	2.40
07/09/04	J. Garcia	Review cash forecast updates.	0.50
07/12/04	J. Garcia	Review cash collateral reporting schedule, counsel report on board discussions.	2.40
07/13/04	J. Garcia	Call on real estate with company; Committee call; call with company on franchise issues; call with counsel; call with Blackstone; review equity committee response, draft term sheet.	5.80
07/14/04	J. Garcia	Review memo on cash forecast; review projections re: same.	1.50
07/15/04	J. Garcia	Review company material on contracts, subsidiary creditors; call with CTA.	4.70
07/16/04	J. Garcia	Review financial projections; financial analysis re: same.	2.10
07/19/04	J. Garcia	Meeting with company advisors on plan alternatives.	3.30
07/20/04	J. Garcia	Conference calls re: Co operations.	1.50
07/21/04	J. Garcia	Meeting with company and advisors to discuss plan alternatives, progress.	3.60
07/22/04	J. Garcia	Conference calls re: plan alternatives and SG&A savings: analysis re: same.	3.40
07/25/04	J. Garcia	Call on initiatives.	1.00
07/26/04	J. Garcia	Calls on cost savings initiatives, franchise / regulatory issues, sub con.; review documents.	4.80
07/27/04	J. Garcia	Committee meeting with company; review documents & financial analyses.	4.40
07/28/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; financial analysis re: SG&A savings & projections.	2.10
07/30/04	J. Garcia	Review update memo re: cash; financial analysis re: projections.	4.30
		<b>Total</b>	<b>55.40</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners*  
*Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*July 1, 2004 through July 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
07/02/04	B. Pearson	Review June 30 creditors presentation and conference call.	1.00
07/06/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	0.50
07/07/04	B. Pearson	Conference call with company.	0.50
07/07/04	B. Pearson	Review debtor fees analysis.	0.50
07/07/04	B. Pearson	Review company presentation to S&P.	0.50
07/13/04	B. Pearson	Conference calls with company and committee.	1.00
07/14/04	B. Pearson	Review letters to US Trustee.	0.30
07/14/04	B. Pearson	Review Committee Update Memo and Cash Flow forecast.	0.30
07/21/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	2.00
07/25/04	B. Pearson	Review company's Plan of Reorganization.	1.00
07/26/04	B. Pearson	Conf call with company re: regulatory status.	1.00
		<b>Total</b>	<b>8.60</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*July 1, 2004 through July 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
07/01/04	A. Kapur	Took call with counsel; took call with unsecured creditor.	2.30
07/02/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; call with company to follow-up on SG&A initiatives; review retention app changes.	3.90
07/06/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; review retention documents; discuss with counsel.	3.40
07/07/04	A. Kapur	Finalize retention documents with counsel; revise fee analysis; call with Claris on Starpower sale; review rating agency materials.	4.50
07/08/04	A. Kapur	Review motion on subsidiaries.	1.40
07/09/04	A. Kapur	Review cash forecast updates.	1.70
07/12/04	A. Kapur	Review cash collateral reporting schedule, counsel report on board discussions.	2.40
07/13/04	A. Kapur	Call on real estate with company; Committee call; call with company on franchise issues; call with counsel; call with Blackstone; review equity committee response, draft term sheet.	5.80
07/14/04	A. Kapur	Revise and finalize Committee memo on cash forecast; liaise with company and committee member.	3.10
07/15/04	A. Kapur	Review company material on contracts, subsidiary creditors; call with CTA.	4.70
07/16/04	A. Kapur	Review and summarize connections data; liaise with Blackstone on meetings.	2.10
07/19/04	A. Kapur	Meeting with company advisors on plan alternatives.	3.30
07/20/04	A. Kapur	Calls with company on operations, committee call, discussion with CTA on progress.	2.30
07/21/04	A. Kapur	Meeting with company and advisors to discuss plan alternatives, progress.	3.60
07/22/04	A. Kapur	Calls with AlixPartners and CTA on initiatives.	2.80
07/23/04	A. Kapur	Follow-up discussion on initiatives.	1.80
07/25/04	A. Kapur	Call on initiatives.	0.80
07/26/04	A. Kapur	Calls on cost savings initiatives, franchise / regulatory issues, sub con.	3.50
07/27/04	A. Kapur	Committee meeting with company.	4.40
07/28/04	A. Kapur	Committee call.	2.10
07/30/04	A. Kapur	Draft update memo on cash, review prior valuation.	4.30
		<b>Total</b>	<b>64.20</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*July 1, 2004 through July 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
07/02/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call; call with company to follow-up on SG&A initiatives.	4.00
07/06/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call.	3.50
07/07/04	M. Schelbert	Revise fee analysis; call with Claris on Starpower sale.	4.50
07/09/04	M. Schelbert	Review cash forecast updates.	2.00
07/12/04	M. Schelbert	Review cash collateral reporting schedule.	2.50
07/13/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call; call with company on franchise issues; call with counsel; call with Blackstone; review equity committee response.	6.00
07/14/04	M. Schelbert	Finalize Committee memo on cash forecast.	3.00
07/15/04	M. Schelbert	Call with CTA.	5.00
07/16/04	M. Schelbert	Liaise with Blackstone on meetings.	2.00
07/20/04	M. Schelbert	Calls with company on operations, committee call, discussion with CTA on progress.	2.50
07/21/04	M. Schelbert	Meeting with company and advisors to discuss plan alternatives, progress.	3.50
07/22/04	M. Schelbert	Calls with AlixPartners and CTA on initiatives.	3.00
07/23/04	M. Schelbert	Follow-up discussion on initiatives.	2.00
07/25/04	M. Schelbert	Call on initiatives.	1.00
07/26/04	M. Schelbert	Calls on cost savings initiatives, franchise / regulatory issues, sub con.	3.50
07/27/04	M. Schelbert	Committee meeting with company.	4.50
07/28/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call.	2.00
07/30/04	M. Schelbert	Draft update memo on cash, review prior valuation.	4.50

**Total**

**59.00**

**Chanin Capital Partners**

**Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors**

**In re RCN Corporation, *et al.***

**Summary of Time Records**

**August 1, 2004 through August 31, 2004**

<b><u>Professional</u></b>	<b><u>Title</u></b>	<b><u>Hours</u></b>
Russell Belinsky	Senior Managing Director	21.00
Sanjay Jindal	Director	14.50
John Garcia	Vice President	74.90
Bill Pearson	Senior Advisor	7.00
Anurag Kapur	Senior Associate	113.20
Mark Schelbert	Associate	48.50
Peter Kim	Analyst	50.70
<b>Total</b>		<b><u><u>329.80</u></u></b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*August 1, 2004 through August 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
08/01/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; internal meeting; T/C with UCC.	1.50
08/02/04	R. Belinsky	Client meeting; T/C with co re: starpower; meeting re: valuation.	1.00
08/03/04	R. Belinsky	Valuation meeting; T/C with co; T/C with client.	2.00
08/04/04	R. Belinsky	Call with advisors; T/C with client.	2.00
08/05/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for UCC meeting; review and revise valuation; internal meeting.	3.00
08/09/04	R. Belinsky	Internal meeting; T/C with client.	4.00
08/10/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for meeting; client meeting; review plan.	2.00
08/11/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for and attend call with counsel; internal meeting.	2.50
08/26/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; prepare for UCC meeting; internal meeting; UCC call.	2.00
08/30/04	R. Belinsky	Call with client; review d/s; review valuation.	1.00
		<b>Total</b>	<b>21.00</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*August 1, 2004 through August 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
08/02/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; call on franchise, operational issues.	4.00
08/03/04	S. Jindal	Committee call.	1.00
08/05/04	S. Jindal	Committee call.	1.50
08/10/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; follow-up call with Blackstone.	1.00
08/13/04	S. Jindal	Committee call with company; review subsidiaries; review analysis on Evergreen.	2.50
08/16/04	S. Jindal	Review 10-Q, 10-Q/A filings;	2.00
08/17/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; review draft plan docs.	2.50
		<b>Total</b>	<b>14.50</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*August 1, 2004 through August 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
08/02/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; call on franchise, operational issues.	6.40
08/03/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; conference calls re: projections, and Starpower; financial analysis re: valuation.	7.60
08/04/04	J. Garcia	Valuation analysis; analysis of comparable transactions; report-write-up.	7.90
08/05/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; call with Blackstone re: valuation and projections.	4.80
08/06/04	J. Garcia	Valuation analysis.	1.60
08/09/04	J. Garcia	Call with Blackstone re: valuation; financial analysis re: same.	2.80
08/10/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; follow-up call with Blackstone; review valuation information.	3.80
08/11/04	J. Garcia	Update call with Committee; review plan information and valuation analysis.	2.60
08/12/04	J. Garcia	Review cash variance analysis.	0.50
08/13/04	J. Garcia	Committee call with company.	1.50
08/17/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; finalize Committee cash update; review draft plan docs; call with Company advisors on draft Evergreen term sheet, incentive plan; call with counsel.	6.50
08/18/04	J. Garcia	Call / meeting with Committee and Co; review POR.	3.50
08/19/04	J. Garcia	Calls with Company advisors on Evergreen, projections, valuation issues; review projections and valuation analysis.	7.40
08/20/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; calls with Company advisors on stock, warrant values.; financial analysis re: same.	8.40
08/24/04	J. Garcia	Committee call.	3.20
08/26/04	J. Garcia	Analysis of comparable convertible bond pricing and second lien term sheets.	4.50
08/27/04	J. Garcia	Review bond pricing analysis.	1.40
08/28/04	J. Garcia	Review bond pricing analysis.	0.50
		<b>Total</b>	<b>74.90</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*August 1, 2004 through August 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
08/02/04	B. Pearson	Committee and company conference calls.	2.00
08/03/04	B. Pearson	Committee and company conference calls.	2.00
08/10/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	0.50
08/17/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	0.50
08/20/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	0.50
08/20/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	1.00
08/24/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	0.50
		<b>Total</b>	<b>7.00</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*August 1, 2004 through August 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
08/02/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; call on franchise, operational issues.	6.40
08/03/04	A. Kapur	Committee call, call with company FA on projections, call with company on Starpower; review projections, analysis.	8.70
08/04/04	A. Kapur	Review and refine valuation analysis; took call with bondholder.	10.50
08/05/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; call with Blackstone; review Chicago filing.	4.80
08/06/04	A. Kapur	Took call with bondholders; review Chicago developments, follow-up with Company FA.	2.70
08/09/04	A. Kapur	Review indenture trustee proofs of claim, draft plan; call with company on franchise, real estate issues; call with Blackstone on valuation; took call with bondholder.	4.80
08/10/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; follow-up call with Blackstone.	3.20
08/11/04	A. Kapur	Update call with Committee; follow-up with Blackstone; review additional plan comments; took call with bondholder.	2.90
08/12/04	A. Kapur	Took call with Committee member; review cash variance analysis.	2.30
08/13/04	A. Kapur	Committee call with company; review subsidiaries.	3.40
08/16/04	A. Kapur	Review 10-Q, 10-Q/A filings and summarize; call with Company on operational, real estate issues; took call with bondholder.	5.90
08/17/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; finalize Committee cash update; review draft plan docs; call with Company advisors on draft Evergreen term sheet, incentive plan; call with counsel; took call with bondholder.	6.70
08/18/04	A. Kapur	Call / meeting with Committee and Company on plan issues update and discussion; review executory contracts, proofs of claim; analysis on Evergreen.	7.40
08/19/04	A. Kapur	Calls with Company advisors on Evergreen, projections, valuation issues; review projections and valuation analysis.	9.60
08/20/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; review plan draft documents; calls with Company advisors on stock, warrant values.	7.30
08/23/04	A. Kapur	Call with Company on operational issues; took calls with bondholders.	4.60
08/24/04	A. Kapur	Committee call.	3.20
08/25/04	A. Kapur	Calls with Company on cost savings initiatives, cash forecast; liaise with counsel.	4.70
08/26/04	A. Kapur	Review convertible analysis.	2.30
08/27/04	A. Kapur	Revise and refine convertible analysis; review contracts file.	4.20
08/28/04	A. Kapur	Refine draft convertible analysis.	2.10
08/30/04	A. Kapur	Call with Company on contracts, operational issues.	2.10
08/31/04	A. Kapur	Took call with bondholder; revise convertible analysis.	3.40
		<b>Total</b>	<b>113.20</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*August 1, 2004 through August 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
08/02/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call; call on franchise/operational issues.	6.00
08/03/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call, call with company FA on projections, call with company on Starpower; review projections, analysis.	8.50
08/04/04	M. Schelbert	Review and refine valuation analysis.	10.00
08/05/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call; call with Blackstone.	5.00
08/06/04	M. Schelbert	Review Chicago developments, follow-up with Company FA.	2.30
08/09/04	M. Schelbert	Call with company on franchise, real estate issues; call with Blackstone on valuation.	4.20
08/10/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call.	3.50
08/11/04	M. Schelbert	Update call with Committee; follow-up with Blackstone; review additional plan comments.	3.00
08/12/04	M. Schelbert	Draft cash variance analysis.	2.50
08/13/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call with company.	3.50
		<b>Total</b>	<b>48.50</b>

*Chanin Capital Partners  
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*In re RCN Corporation, et al.*

*August 1, 2004 through August 31, 2004*

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
08/05/04	P. Kim	Reviewed Valuation Presentation and draft of disclosure statement.	2.00
08/09/04	P. Kim	Put together draft of excess cash and contingency reserve analysis.	2.50
08/13/04	P. Kim	Updated CF Budget and prepared draft of memo to Committee.	3.50
08/17/04	P. Kim	Prepared preliminary draft of Yield Spread Analysis.	6.00
08/18/04	P. Kim	Prepared 3 scenario IRR analysis.	1.00
08/19/04	P. Kim	Updated revised projections and prepared revised valuation analysis. Revised Yield Spread Analysis.	12.00
08/23/04	P. Kim	Committee Call.	3.20
08/26/04	P. Kim	Prepared Draft of Convertible Analysis.	7.00
08/27/04	P. Kim	Revised Convertible Analysis.	5.00
08/28/04	P. Kim	Revised Convertible Analysis.	4.50
08/31/04	P. Kim	Revised Convertible Analysis.	4.00
		<b>Total</b>	<b>50.70</b>