

EXHIBIT A

RCN Corporation

Chanin Capital Partners

Summary of Hours for the Period September 1, 2004 through December 21, 2004

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Sept</u>	<u>Oct</u>	<u>Nov</u>	<u>Dec</u>	<u>Total</u>
Russell Belinsky	Sr. Managing Director	17.50	16.00	10.50	2.00	46.00
Sanjay Jindal	Director	7.00	12.80	11.50	10.50	41.80
John Garcia	Vice President	35.30	20.20	3.00	10.00	68.50
Brian Cullen	Vice President	25.00	13.30	22.70	12.30	73.30
Anurag Kapur	Vice President	55.40	42.70	48.20	17.80	164.10
Bill Pearson	Sr. Advisor	7.00	5.50	3.00	0.00	15.50
Mark Scheibert	Associate	0.00	11.90	31.80	29.10	72.80
Peter Kim	Analyst	6.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	6.00
Michael Sullivan	Analyst	0.00	4.00	0.00	0.00	4.00
		153.20	126.40	130.70	81.70	492.00

Chanin Capital Partners

Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

In re RCN Corporation, *et al.*

Summary of Time Records

September 1, 2004 through September 30, 2004

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Russell Belinsky	Senior Managing Director	17.50
Sanjay Jindal	Director	7.00
John Garcia	Vice President	35.30
Brian Cullen	Vice President	25.00
Bill Pearson	Senior Advisor	7.00
Anurag Kapur	Senior Associate	55.40
Mark Schelbert	Associate	0.00
Peter Kim	Analyst	6.00
Total		<u><u>153.20</u></u>

Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

September 1, 2004 through September 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
09/07/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for and attend UCC call; internal meeting; review term sheet.	2.00
09/14/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for RCN UCC call; UCC call; RCN co call; review financing.	3.00
09/15/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for UCC call; UCC call; T/C with co; internal meeting; review term sheets; revise term sheets.	2.00
09/21/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for meeting; UCC call; call with co; review timeline; internal meeting.	3.00
09/22/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; internal meeting; review disclosure statement.	2.00
09/23/04	R. Belinsky	Call with client; review disclosure statement; T/C with advisor.	1.50
09/27/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for call; review projections.	1.00
09/28/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for UCC call; UCC call.	1.50
09/29/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; internal meeting; review bank book.	1.50
		Total	17.50

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

September 1, 2004 through September 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
09/07/04	S. Jindal	Participated in Committee conference call.	1.50
09/08/04	S. Jindal	Participated in Committee conference call - all hands meeting in NYC.	2.50
09/21/04	S. Jindal	Participated in Committee conference call.	1.50
09/24/04	S. Jindal	Review of Megacable memo and plan.	1.50
		Total	7.00

Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

September 1, 2004 through September 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
09/01/04	J. Garcia	Prepare for and attend UCC call; internal meeting; review term sheet.	3.70
09/02/04	J. Garcia	Review draft franchise settlement.	0.50
09/03/04	J. Garcia	Internal discussion of case developments.	1.20
09/07/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; finalize convert draft; review market comps.	3.40
09/08/04	J. Garcia	Prepare for and attend Company and Committee meeting in NY.	5.30
09/14/04	J. Garcia	Review Starpower information; call with Co re: same.	2.80
09/15/04	J. Garcia	Call with company and committee on Starpower, term sheet.	2.40
09/17/04	J. Garcia	Review Megacable information.	0.50
09/21/04	J. Garcia	Prepare for and attend UCC call; internal meeting.	3.50
09/23/04	J. Garcia	Review Megacable issues, term sheet.	2.30
09/24/04	J. Garcia	Review plan, disclosure statement draft additions; Review convert term sheet; Review court filings.	4.50
09/28/04	J. Garcia	Committee call. Review Starpower and Megacable information.	1.40
09/30/04	J. Garcia	Call with company and committee regarding D&O; review public filing disclosures on Megacable, review cash flow.	3.80
		Total	35.30

Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

September 1, 2004 through September 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
09/01/04	B. Cullen	Prepare for and attend UCC call; internal meeting; review term sheet.	2.00
09/03/04	B. Cullen	Internal discussion of case developments.	2.00
09/07/04	B. Cullen	Committee call; finalize convert draft; review market comps.	2.00
09/08/04	B. Cullen	Prepare for and attend Company and Committee meeting in NY.	4.00
09/14/04	B. Cullen	Review Starpower information; call with Co re: same.	2.00
09/15/04	B. Cullen	Call with company and committee on Starpower, term sheet.	1.50
09/21/04	B. Cullen	Prepare for and attend UCC call; internal meeting.	2.00
09/23/04	B. Cullen	Review Megacable issues, term sheet.	1.00
09/24/04	B. Cullen	Review plan, disclosure statement draft additions; Review convert term sheet; Review court filings.	5.00
09/28/04	B. Cullen	Committee call. Review Starpower and Megacable information.	1.00
09/30/04	B. Cullen	Call with company and committee regarding D&O; review public filing disclosures on Megacable, review cash flow.	2.50
		Total	25.00

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

September 1, 2004 through September 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
09/07/04	B. Pearson	Participated in Committee conference calls. Review of company contracts.	1.50
09/14/04	B. Pearson	Participated in Committee conference call.	1.00
09/21/04	B. Pearson	Participated in Committee conference call. Review of company property analysis. Company conference call.	2.50
09/24/04	B. Pearson	Review of Megacable memo and plan blackline.	1.00
09/28/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	1.00
		Total	7.00

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

September 1, 2004 through September 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
09/01/04	A. Kapur	Call with Company on franchise issues; took calls with bondholders; follow-up discussion with CTA.	3.70
09/02/04	A. Kapur	Review draft franchise settlement.	1.40
09/03/04	A. Kapur	Internal discussion of case developments.	1.20
09/07/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; finalize convert draft; review CTA memo.	4.60
09/08/04	A. Kapur	Prepare for and attend Company and Committee meeting in NY.	5.30
09/09/04	A. Kapur	Review cash performance and forecast.	2.70
09/10/04	A. Kapur	Call with Milbank regarding Starpower; liaise with CTA; call with Blackstone.	3.80
09/13/04	A. Kapur	Review cash forecast back-up, Starpower issues.	2.30
09/14/04	A. Kapur	Committee calls; call with company on Starpower.	3.60
09/15/04	A. Kapur	Call with company and committee on Starpower, term sheet.	2.90
09/16/04	A. Kapur	Review Starpower settlement.	1.30
09/17/04	A. Kapur	Review Megacable information; call with company.	1.70
09/20/04	A. Kapur	Review Megacable data; call with company to discuss.	2.10
09/21/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; call with company and Committee; review real estate data.	4.30
09/23/04	A. Kapur	Review Megacable issues, term sheet.	2.30
09/24/04	A. Kapur	Review plan, disclosure statement draft additions.	2.80
09/27/04	A. Kapur	Review Chicago issues, Skadden letter.	1.90
09/28/04	A. Kapur	Committee call.	1.40
09/29/04	A. Kapur	Review D&O issues, draft DB book.	2.30
09/30/04	A. Kapur	Call with company and committee regarding D&O; review public filing disclosures on Megacable, review cash flow.	3.80
Total			55.40

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

September 1, 2004 through September 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
09/07/04	P. Kim	Participated in Committee Call.	2.00
09/08/04	P. Kim	Participated in All Hands Meeting Call.	4.00
		Total	6.00

Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
In re RCN Corporation, *et al.*
Summary of Time Records
October 1, 2004 through October 31, 2004

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Russell Belinsky	Senior Managing Director	16.00
Sanjay Jindal	Director	12.80
John Garcia	Vice President	20.20
Brian Cullen	Vice President	13.30
Bill Pearson	Senior Advisor	5.50
Anurag Kapur	Senior Associate	42.70
Mark Schelbert	Associate	11.90
Michael Sullivan	Analyst	4.00
Total		<u><u>126.40</u></u>

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

October 1, 2004 through October 31, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
10/01/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; review ppm.	1.00
10/04/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for call; call with client; review materials for ucc call.	2.00
10/05/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for ucc call; ucc call; call with client.	2.00
10/08/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; review docs; T/C with advisors.	2.00
10/12/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with clients; review ds; T/C with advisor.	1.00
10/13/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; review ds.	1.00
10/14/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; review ds; T/C with advisor.	1.00
10/15/04	R. Belinsky	Review bank book; client calls; Megacable calls.	2.00
10/19/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; internal meeting; review plan.	1.00
10/20/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; review ds; review valuation.	1.00
10/26/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for ucc call; ucc call.	2.00
		Total	16.00

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

October 1, 2004 through October 31, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
10/05/04	S. Jindal	Committee call.	1.30
10/07/04	S. Jindal	Review Convertible issues, Chicago, Megacable issues, company performance.	2.50
10/08/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; call with company on Megacable.	1.00
10/12/04	S. Jindal	Review claims, Evergreen term sheet, disclosure statement draft.	2.00
10/15/04	S. Jindal	Review Starpower developments, Moody's presentation.	2.00
10/22/04	S. Jindal	Committee call. Review cash position.	1.50
10/26/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; review and compare 2nd lien term sheets;	2.50
		Total	12.80

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

October 1, 2004 through October 31, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
10/05/04	J. Garcia	Committee call.	1.30
10/06/04	J. Garcia	Review convertible issues, model; financial analysis re: same.	3.50
10/08/04	J. Garcia	Committee call.	2.30
10/11/04	J. Garcia	Review claims, DS draft.	4.20
10/12/04	J. Garcia	Review DS hearing outcome.	0.50
10/22/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; review legal documents.	1.50
10/26/04	J. Garcia	Committee call; review and compare 2nd lien term sheets; call with company FA.	5.30
10/28/04	J. Garcia	Review cash variance.	0.70
10/29/04	J. Garcia	Review operational issues update.	0.90
		Total	20.20

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

October 1, 2004 through October 31, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
10/05/04	B. Cullen	Committee call.	1.30
10/07/04	B. Cullen	Review convertible issues, model; financial analysis.	2.00
10/08/04	B. Cullen	Committee call.	2.30
10/22/04	B. Cullen	Committee call; review legal documents.	1.50
10/26/04	B. Cullen	Committee call; review and compare 2nd lien term sheets; call with company FA.	5.30
10/28/04	B. Cullen	Review operational issues update.	0.90
		Total	13.30

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

October 1, 2004 through October 31, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
10/01/04	B. Pearson	Review of liability insurance.	0.50
10/05/04	B. Pearson	Review of CEO candidates.	0.50
10/08/04	B. Pearson	Review of contract status.	0.50
10/11/04	B. Pearson	Review of Evergreen analysis.	0.50
10/12/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	1.00
10/14/04	B. Pearson	Review of CEO candidate updates.	0.50
10/19/04	B. Pearson	Committee conference call.	0.50
10/26/04	B. Pearson	Review of Merrill complaint and committee conf call.	1.50
		Total	5.50

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

October 1, 2004 through October 31, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
10/01/04	A. Kapur	Review DB book draft; liaise with company FA.	2.50
10/04/04	A. Kapur	Call with Blackstone on comments to DB book.	1.20
10/05/04	A. Kapur	Committee call.	1.30
10/06/04	A. Kapur	Review convertible issues, model.	2.70
10/07/04	A. Kapur	Review Chicago, Megacable issues, company performance; took calls from unsecured creditors.	3.80
10/08/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; call with company on Megacable.	2.40
10/10/04	A. Kapur	Took call with counsel on disclosure statement issues.	1.10
10/11/04	A. Kapur	Review claims, Evergreen term sheet, disclosure statement draft; took calls from holders.	3.40
10/12/04	A. Kapur	Review DS hearing outcome.	0.90
10/13/04	A. Kapur	Took calls from holders; review connections report; review Megacable issues, call with Blackstone.	3.20
10/14/04	A. Kapur	Review final DS and plan, potential director candidates.	1.50
10/15/04	A. Kapur	Review Starpower developments, court hearings, Moody's presentation.	2.40
10/18/04	A. Kapur	Took call from holder; review Starpower development.	1.40
10/19/04	A. Kapur	Took calls from holders, review cable news.	2.20
10/20/04	A. Kapur	Took calls from unsecured creditors, review Chicago issue.	1.30
10/21/04	A. Kapur	Took call from holder, review cash variance.	1.10
10/22/04	A. Kapur	Committee call.	0.80
10/25/04	A. Kapur	Discuss Chicago issues with counsel.	1.20
10/26/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; review and compare 2nd lien term sheets; call with company FA.	5.30
10/27/04	A. Kapur	Took call with bondholder; review recent research; review Moody's release.	1.40
10/28/04	A. Kapur	Review cash variance.	0.70
10/29/04	A. Kapur	Review operational issues update.	0.90
		Total	42.70

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

October 1, 2004 through October 31, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
10/18/04	M. Schelbert	Review Starpower development.	0.80
10/19/04	M. Schelbert	Review cable news.	1.20
10/20/04	M. Schelbert	Review Chicago issue.	1.00
10/21/04	M. Schelbert	Review cash variance.	0.70
10/22/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call.	0.80
10/25/04	M. Schelbert	Participated in discussion concerning Chicago issues with counsel.	0.90
10/26/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call; review 2nd lien term sheets.	4.50
10/27/04	M. Schelbert	Search for recent research; review Moody's release.	1.00
10/28/04	M. Schelbert	Review cash variance.	0.50
10/29/04	M. Schelbert	Review operational issues update.	0.50
		Total	11.90

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

October 1, 2004 through October 31, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
10/11/2004	M. Sullivan	Create convertibele model with warrant and Black-Scholes analysis.	4.00
		Total	4.00

Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
In re RCN Corporation, *et al.*
Summary of Time Records
November 1, 2004 through November 30, 2004

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Russell Belinsky	Senior Managing Director	10.50
Sanjay Jindal	Director	11.50
John Garcia	Vice President	3.00
Brian Cullen	Vice President	22.70
Anurag Kapur	Vice President	48.20
Bill Pearson	Senior Advisor	3.00
Mark Schelbert	Associate	31.80
Total		<u><u>130.70</u></u>

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

November 1, 2004 through November 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
11/01/04	R. Belinsky	Review plan; review emails; internal meeting.	1.00
11/08/04	R. Belinsky	Review financing; t/c with client; internal meeting.	2.00
11/09/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for ucc call; ucc call.	2.50
11/12/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; review financing commitments.	2.00
11/16/04	R. Belinsky	Prepare for call with ucc; ucc call; t/c with ucc (2x).	2.00
11/17/04	R. Belinsky	T/C with client; review 2d lien commitments; review plan.	1.00
		Total	10.50

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

November 1, 2004 through November 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
11/02/04	S. Jindal	Committee call.	1.50
11/09/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; review Chicago settlement.	2.50
11/16/04	S. Jindal	Review second lien commitments.	2.50
11/16/04	S. Jindal	Committee calls on second lien.	2.00
11/18/04	S. Jindal	Committee call; review 10-Q disclosure.	3.00
		Total	11.50

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

November 1, 2004 through November 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
11/09/04	J. Garcia	Committee conf call.	0.50
11/16/04	J. Garcia	Committee conf call.	0.50
11/23/04	J. Garcia	Committee conf call.	0.50
11/23/04	J. Garcia	Review Chicago settlement.	0.50
11/09/04	J. Garcia	Review interim fee apps.	0.50
11/19/04	J. Garcia	Review of supplemental term sheet.	0.50
		Total	3.00

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

November 1, 2004 through November 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
11/02/04	B. Cullen	Committee call.	1.70
11/03/04	B. Cullen	Took call with creditor; review recent motions and interim fee apps.	2.00
11/09/04	B. Cullen	Committee call; review Chicago settlement.	3.00
11/11/04	B. Cullen	Review proposed settlements and related litigation.	4.00
11/15/04	B. Cullen	Review and summarize alternative second lien commitment; liaise with AlixPartners; review connections report.	4.00
11/16/04	B. Cullen	Committee calls on second lien.	3.00
11/18/04	B. Cullen	Committee call; review and summarize 10-Q disclosure.	3.00
11/22/04	B. Cullen	Took call with bondholder; review recent research.	2.00
		Total	22.70

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

November 1, 2004 through November 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
11/01/04	A. Kapur	Review proposed settlement with Chicago.	2.70
11/02/04	A. Kapur	Committee call.	1.70
11/03/04	A. Kapur	Took call with creditor; review recent motions and interim fee apps.	3.80
11/05/04	A. Kapur	Took call with unsecured creditor; review cash forecast; review and summarize convertible second lien motion; call with Blackstone.	5.60
11/08/04	A. Kapur	Took call with unsecured creditor; review draft bank book materials; review cash collateral issues.	4.30
11/09/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; review Chicago settlement.	3.30
11/11/04	A. Kapur	Review proposed settlements and related litigation.	4.60
11/15/04	A. Kapur	Review and summarize alternative second lien commitment; liaise with AlixPartners; review connections report.	4.60
11/16/04	A. Kapur	Committee calls on second lien; took calls with bondholders.	4.40
11/17/04	A. Kapur	Review recent developments, proposed fee orders.	2.10
11/18/04	A. Kapur	Committee call; review and summarize 10-Q disclosure.	3.80
11/22/04	A. Kapur	Took call with unsecured creditors; review plan supplement, Chicago settlement and fee orders.	4.40
11/23/04	A. Kapur	Took call with bondholder; review recent research.	2.90
		Total	48.20

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

November 1, 2004 through November 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
11/09/04	B. Pearson	Committee conf call.	0.50
11/16/04	B. Pearson	Committee conf call.	0.50
11/23/04	B. Pearson	Committee conf call.	0.50
11/23/04	B. Pearson	Review Chicago settlement.	0.50
11/09/04	B. Pearson	Review interim fee apps.	0.50
11/19/04	B. Pearson	Review of supplemental term sheet.	0.50
		Total	3.00

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

November 1, 2004 through November 30, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
11/02/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call.	1.60
11/03/04	M. Schelbert	Review recent motions and interim fee apps.	1.30
11/05/04	M. Schelbert	Review cash forecast; review convertible second lien motion; call with Blackstone.	3.10
11/08/04	M. Schelbert	Review draft bank book materials; review cash collateral issues.	2.70
11/09/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call; review Chicago settlement.	3.40
11/11/04	M. Schelbert	Review proposed settlements and related litigation.	2.70
11/15/04	M. Schelbert	Review alternative second lien commitment; review connections report.	2.20
11/16/04	M. Schelbert	Committee calls on second lien.	2.10
11/17/04	M. Schelbert	Review recent developments, proposed fee orders.	1.30
11/18/04	M. Schelbert	Committee call; review and draft 10-Q disclosure.	5.10
11/22/04	M. Schelbert	Review plan supplement, Chicago settlement and fee orders.	3.50
11/23/04	M. Schelbert	Review recent research.	2.80
		Total	31.80

Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
In re RCN Corporation, *et al.*
Summary of Time Records
December 1, 2004 through December 21, 2004

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Russell Belinsky	Senior Managing Director	2.00
Sanjay Jindal	Director	10.50
John Garcia	Vice President	10.00
Brian Cullen	Vice President	12.30
Anurag Kapur	Vice President	17.80
Mark Schelbert	Associate	29.10
Total		<u><u>81.70</u></u>

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

December 1, 2004 through December 21, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
12/20/2004	R. Belinsky	T/C with committee; review ds; T/C with company.	2.00
		Total	2.00

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

December 1, 2004 through December 21, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
12/01/04	S. Jindal	Review plan objections and voting deadline issues.	2.00
12/06/04	S. Jindal	Committee call with company.	2.00
12/08/04	S. Jindal	Attend confirmation hearing in New York City. Review distributions to holders.	2.50
12/08/04	S. Jindal	Review analysis of equity holders post-restructuring.	2.00
12/09/04	S. Jindal	Speak with bondholders and provide updates on confirmation proceedings and deal closing.	2.00
		Total	10.50

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

December 1, 2004 through December 21, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
12/01/04	J. Garcia	Review plan objections and other items including deadlines, second lien, etc.	3.20
12/03/04	J. Garcia	Review allocations to bondholders per plan.	1.80
12/06/04	J. Garcia	Committee conf call.	1.40
12/07/04	J. Garcia	Discussion internally concerning cash issues.	2.10
12/09/04	J. Garcia	Review and update on confirmation proceedings.	1.50
		Total	10.00

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

December 1, 2004 through December 21, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
12/01/04	B. Cullen	Review plan objections, voting deadline issues, draft second lien circular.	2.30
12/02/04	B. Cullen	Took call with unsecured creditor.	1.00
12/03/04	B. Cullen	Review update; review and summarize distributions to bonds.	2.00
12/06/04	B. Cullen	Committee call with company.	1.00
12/08/04	B. Cullen	Equity holder analysis.	3.00
12/08/04	B. Cullen	Took call with unsecured creditor.	1.00
12/09/04	B. Cullen	Took call with bondholder; review confirmation developments.	2.00
		Total	12.30

Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

December 1, 2004 through December 21, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
12/01/04	A. Kapur	Took call with bondholder; review plan objections, voting deadline issues, draft second lien circular.	4.70
12/03/04	A. Kapur	Review update; review and summarize distributions to bonds.	2.40
12/06/04	A. Kapur	Committee call with company; took call with unsecured creditors.	2.30
12/07/04	A. Kapur	Took call with bondholder; review cash issues with AlixPartners.	2.70
12/08/04	A. Kapur	Attend confirmation hearing; took call with unsecured creditor.	2.60
12/09/04	A. Kapur	Took call with bondholder; review confirmation developments.	3.10
		Total	17.80

*Chanin Capital Partners
Financial Advisors to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

In re RCN Corporation, et al.

December 1, 2004 through December 21, 2004

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Time</u>
12/01/04	M. Schelbert	Review plan objections and update of other plan matters.	3.50
12/03/04	M. Schelbert	Discuss impact of registration rights agreement.	2.50
12/04/04	M. Schelbert	Calculate bondholder allocations and distributions.	6.40
12/06/04	M. Schelbert	Conf call with company.	2.50
12/07/04	M. Schelbert	Analyze equity holders post-restructuring.	3.50
12/08/04	M. Schelbert	Analyze equity holders post-restructuring.	5.20
12/09/04	M. Schelbert	Update on confirmation proceedings.	1.40
12/10/04	M. Schelbert	Corresponded with bondholder.	4.10
		Total	29.10

RCN Corporation

Chanin Capital Partners
Summary of Hours for the Period June 14, 2004 through December 21, 2004

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>June</u>	<u>July</u>	<u>Aug</u>	<u>Sept</u>	<u>Oct</u>	<u>Nov</u>	<u>Dec</u>	<u>Total</u>
Russell Belinsky	Sr. Managing Director	12.50	35.50	21.00	17.50	16.00	10.50	2.00	115.00
Sanjay Jindal	Director	16.00	27.20	14.50	7.00	12.80	11.50	10.50	99.50
John Garcia	Vice President	54.10	55.40	74.90	35.30	20.20	3.00	10.00	252.90
Brian Cullen	Vice President	0.00	0.00	0.00	25.00	13.30	22.70	12.30	73.30
Anurag Kapur	Vice President	53.00	64.20	113.20	55.40	42.70	48.20	17.80	394.50
Bill Pearson	Sr. Advisor	3.10	8.60	7.00	7.00	5.50	3.00	0.00	34.20
Mark Schelbert	Associate	58.50	59.00	48.50	0.00	11.90	31.80	29.10	238.80
Peter Kim	Analyst	0.00	0.00	50.70	6.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	56.70
Michael Sullivan	Analyst	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	4.00	0.00	0.00	4.00
		197.20	249.90	329.80	153.20	126.40	130.70	81.70	1268.90