

EXHIBIT C

Task/Attorney Summary

Client: 61441.03 - In Re: RC Sooner Holdings, LLC

Service Period: April 30, 2010

Statement Date: May 27, 2010

Matter Name: Chapter 11 (110461/)

<u>Code/Description</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B110 - Case Administration	DT May	\$270	2.3	\$621.00
	KG Iffland	\$205	4.2	\$861.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.3	\$102.00
	MG Summers	\$450	0.8	\$360.00
	SJ Bellew	\$565	2.8	\$1,582.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	5.9	\$3,540.00
	CS Chow	\$525	2.6	\$1,365.00
			18.9	\$8,431.00
B120 - Asset Analysis and Recovery	LC Heilman	\$340	10.5	\$3,570.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	1.5	\$900.00
	MG Summers	\$450	0.1	\$45.00
	KG Iffland	\$205	0.2	\$41.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	0.5	\$150.00
	CS Chow	\$525	5.9	\$3,097.50
	SJ Bellew	\$565	3.1	\$1,751.50
			21.8	\$9,555.00
B140 - Relief fr. Stay Proceedings	CS Chow	\$525	27.0	\$14,175.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	34.8	\$10,440.00
	MG Summers	\$450	7.1	\$3,195.00
	SJ Bellew	\$565	4.6	\$2,599.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	26.4	\$15,840.00
			99.9	\$46,249.00
B160 - Fee/Employment Applications	TM Daluz	\$600	0.2	\$120.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	0.6	\$180.00
	KG Iffland	\$205	1.0	\$205.00
			1.8	\$505.00
B190 - Other Contested Matters	DA Felice	\$420	12.4	\$5,208.00
	DT May	\$270	8.5	\$2,295.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	4.7	\$1,410.00
	KG Iffland	\$205	2.5	\$512.50
	MG Summers	\$450	0.1	\$45.00
	SJ Bellew	\$565	17.0	\$9,605.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	8.6	\$5,160.00
	CS Chow	\$525	15.5	\$8,137.50
			69.3	\$32,373.00
B210 - Business Operations	CS Chow	\$525	1.4	\$735.00
61441.03 - In Re: RC Sooner Holdings, LLC				2010056641
SJ Bellew				May 27, 2010

Task/Attorney Summary

Client: 61441.03 - In Re: RC Sooner Holdings, LLC

Service Period: April 30, 2010

Statement Date: May 27, 2010

Matter Name: Chapter 11 (110461/)

<u>Code/Description</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B210 - Business Operations	J Zugerman	\$300	0.4	\$120.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	0.8	\$480.00
			2.6	\$1,335.00
B230 - Financing/Cash Collateral	CS Chow	\$525	4.6	\$2,415.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	1.9	\$1,140.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	2.1	\$630.00
	MG Summers	\$450	17.5	\$7,875.00
		26.1	\$12,060.00	
B430 - Litigation/Hearings	CS Chow	\$525	2.5	\$1,312.50
	SJ Bellew	\$565	1.3	\$734.50
	TM Daluz	\$600	1.5	\$900.00
		5.3	\$2,947.00	
B440 - Schedules and Statements	TM Daluz	\$600	0.9	\$540.00
	CS Chow	\$525	2.4	\$1,260.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	4.2	\$1,260.00
	KG Iffland	\$205	4.7	\$963.50
	MG Summers	\$450	2.6	\$1,170.00
	SJ Bellew	\$565	0.2	\$113.00
		15.0	\$5,306.50	
	Matter Total		260.7	\$118,761.50

Activity/Attorney Summary

Client: 61441.03 - In Re: RC Sooner Holdings, LLC

Matter: Chapter 11 (110461/)

Service Period: April 30, 2010

Statement Date: May 27, 2010

<u>Code/Description</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B110 - Case Administration				
	DT May	\$270	2.3	\$621.00
	KG Iffland	\$205	4.2	\$861.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.3	\$102.00
	MG Summers	\$450	0.8	\$360.00
	SJ Bellew	\$565	2.8	\$1,582.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	5.9	\$3,540.00
	CS Chow	\$525	2.6	\$1,365.00
			<u>18.9</u>	<u>\$8,431.00</u>
	B110 - Total		<u>18.9</u>	<u>\$8,431.00</u>
B120 - Asset Analysis and Recovery				
	LC Heilman	\$340	10.5	\$3,570.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	1.5	\$900.00
	MG Summers	\$450	0.1	\$45.00
	KG Iffland	\$205	0.2	\$41.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	0.5	\$150.00
	CS Chow	\$525	5.9	\$3,097.50
	SJ Bellew	\$565	3.1	\$1,751.50
			<u>21.8</u>	<u>\$9,555.00</u>
	B120 - Total		<u>21.8</u>	<u>\$9,555.00</u>
B140 - Relief fr. Stay Proceedings				
	CS Chow	\$525	27.0	\$14,175.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	34.8	\$10,440.00
	MG Summers	\$450	7.1	\$3,195.00
	SJ Bellew	\$565	4.6	\$2,599.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	26.4	\$15,840.00
			<u>99.9</u>	<u>\$46,249.00</u>
	B140 - Total		<u>99.9</u>	<u>\$46,249.00</u>
B160 - Fee/Employment Applications				
	TM Daluz	\$600	0.2	\$120.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	0.6	\$180.00
	KG Iffland	\$205	1.0	\$205.00
			<u>1.8</u>	<u>\$505.00</u>
	B160 - Total		<u>1.8</u>	<u>\$505.00</u>

61441.03 - In Re: RC Sooner Holdings, LLC
SJ Bellew

2010056641
May 27, 2010

Activity/Attorney Summary

Client: 61441.03 - In Re: RC Sooner Holdings, LLC

Matter: Chapter 11 (110461/)

Service Period: April 30, 2010

Statement Date: May 27, 2010

Code/Description	Name	Rate	Hours	Amount
B190 - Other Contested Matters				
	DA Felice	\$420	12.4	\$5,208.00
	DT May	\$270	8.5	\$2,295.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	4.7	\$1,410.00
	KG Iffland	\$205	2.5	\$512.50
	MG Summers	\$450	0.1	\$45.00
	SJ Bellew	\$565	17.0	\$9,605.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	8.6	\$5,160.00
	CS Chow	\$525	15.5	\$8,137.50
			69.3	\$32,373.00
	B190 - Total		69.3	\$32,373.00
B210 - Business Operations				
	CS Chow	\$525	1.4	\$735.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	0.4	\$120.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	0.8	\$480.00
			2.6	\$1,335.00
	B210 - Total		2.6	\$1,335.00
B230 - Financing/Cash Collateral				
	CS Chow	\$525	4.6	\$2,415.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	1.9	\$1,140.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	2.1	\$630.00
	MG Summers	\$450	17.5	\$7,875.00
			26.1	\$12,060.00
	B230 - Total		26.1	\$12,060.00
B430 - Litigation/Hearings				
	CS Chow	\$525	2.5	\$1,312.50
	SJ Bellew	\$565	1.3	\$734.50
	TM Daluz	\$600	1.5	\$900.00
			5.3	\$2,947.00
	B430 - Total		5.3	\$2,947.00
B440 - Schedules and Statements				
	TM Daluz	\$600	0.9	\$540.00
	CS Chow	\$525	2.4	\$1,260.00
	J Zugerman	\$300	4.2	\$1,260.00

61441.03 - In Re: RC Sooner Holdings, LLC

SJ Bellew

2010056641

May 27, 2010

Activity/Attorney Summary

Client: 61441.03 - In Re: RC Sooner Holdings, LLC

Matter: Chapter 11 (110461/)

Service Period: April 30, 2010

Statement Date: May 27, 2010

<u>Code/Description</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	KG Iffland	\$205	4.7	\$963.50
	MG Summers	\$450	2.6	\$1,170.00
	SJ Bellew	\$565	0.2	\$113.00
			<u>15.0</u>	<u>\$5,306.50</u>
		B440 - Total	<u>15.0</u>	<u>\$5,306.50</u>
		Matter Total	<u>260.7</u>	<u>\$118,761.50</u>

Detail of Time and Disbursements

Client: 61441.03 - In Re: RC Sooner Holdings, LLC

Matter: Chapter 11 (110461/)

B110 - Case Administration

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
SJ Bellew	04/05/10	0.1	\$565	\$56.50	Email to R. Mersky re: status
SJ Bellew	04/05/10	0.1	\$565	\$56.50	Email to/from D. Gordon re: status
TM Daluz	04/06/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Call with D. Gordon and S. Bellew re: Fannie Mae and Remy matters (.5)
KG Iffland	04/13/10	0.7	\$205	\$143.50	Prepare draft agenda (.7)
SJ Bellew	04/13/10	0.4	\$565	\$226.00	Telephone conference with client re: status and strategy
KG Iffland	04/14/10	0.9	\$205	\$184.50	Prepare hearing binder (.9)
KG Iffland	04/14/10	0.5	\$205	\$102.50	Edits to agenda letter (.5)
TM Daluz	04/14/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Revise agenda letter (.4)
SJ Bellew	04/14/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Telephone conference with client re: status
TM Daluz	04/14/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Call with M. Summers re: hearing (.1)
KG Iffland	04/15/10	2.1	\$205	\$430.50	Edits to agenda letter (.6); Prepare and perfect filing and service of same (.5); Revise hearing notebook and service on Chambers (1.0)
TM Daluz	04/18/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Correspond with counsel for Fannie Mae re: orders (.1)
TM Daluz	04/18/10	1.0	\$600	\$600.00	Participate in conference call with client re: hearing (1.0)
CS Chow	04/19/10	0.8	\$525	\$420.00	Conference call w/ D. Gordon re: hearing (.8)
TM Daluz	04/19/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Conference call with client re: hearing (.5)
TM Daluz	04/19/10	1.0	\$600	\$600.00	Prepare for hearing (1.0)
SJ Bellew	04/19/10	0.5	\$565	\$282.50	Telephone conference with client re: outcome of hearing and strategy going forward
SJ Bellew	04/19/10	1.2	\$565	\$678.00	Prepare for omnibus hearing
SJ Bellew	04/20/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Telephone conference with client re: status
TM Daluz	04/20/10	1.0	\$600	\$600.00	Review and revise two certifications of counsel (1.0)

Detail of Time and Disbursements

TM Daluz	04/21/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Conference call with client, S. Bellew and C. Chow re: status (.5)
TM Daluz	04/21/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Call to Bankruptcy court re: need for telephonic conference (.1)
LC Heilman	04/23/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	Perfect filing and service Certification of Counsel re: order rescheduling omnibus hearing
DT May	04/26/10	1.3	\$270	\$351.00	Draft and Prepare Notice of Rescheduling of Omnibus Hearing
CS Chow	04/26/10	0.4	\$525	\$210.00	Review and analysis re: draft notice of rescheduled omnibus hearing (.2); e-mail messages with M. John and A. Whitfield re: upcoming service issues (.2)
TM Daluz	04/27/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Analyze issues re: non-debtor sub (.5)
MG Summers	04/28/10	0.8	\$450	\$360.00	Telephone conference with D. Gordon, S. Bellew, C. Chow, and T. Daluz re Remy litigation, lift stay order, and dip financing
CS Chow	04/28/10	1.2	\$525	\$630.00	Conf. call w/ D. Gordon re: lift stay, DIP financing and other case status issues (.8); analysis and planning re: same (.4)
CS Chow	04/29/10	0.2	\$525	\$105.00	E-mail messages with M. John and A. Whitfield re: service issues (.2)
TM Daluz	04/29/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond re: Citigroup (.2)
DT May	04/30/10	0.1	\$270	\$27.00	Email Notice of Rescheduling to BMC for service
DT May	04/30/10	0.9	\$270	\$243.00	Prepare notice of Rescheduling of Omnibus Hearing, enter on docket and email to BMC for service
		18.9		\$8,431.00	B110 - Total

B120 - Asset Analysis and Recovery

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
SJ Bellew	04/09/10	0.5	\$565	\$282.50	Emails to N. Birnham re: availability of Rule 2004 witness
SJ Bellew	04/09/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Emails to/from N. Birnham re: Rule 2004 requests
MG Summers	04/09/10	0.1	\$450	\$45.00	E-mail correspondence re deposition of Remys and document production issues

Detail of Time and Disbursements

SJ Bellew	04/09/10	0.6	\$565	\$339.00	Review responses to document requests under Rule 2004
SJ Bellew	04/09/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Review notice of service of 2004 documents
TM Daluz	04/09/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Review correspondence with Remy counsel re: 2004 (.1)
SJ Bellew	04/12/10	0.4	\$565	\$226.00	Emails re: Rule 2004 discovery
LC Heilman	04/13/10	5.2	\$340	\$1,768.00	Analyze disputed 2004 issues and prepare chronology for contested hearing on 2004 motion
SJ Bellew	04/13/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Review Rule 2004 motion in connection with instructions on pursuing same
TM Daluz	04/13/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond re: 2004 motion(.2)
TM Daluz	04/13/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Revise response to motion motion for relief from stay (.5)
SJ Bellew	04/13/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Detailed email to N. Birnham re: Rule 2004 examination
SJ Bellew	04/13/10	0.1	\$565	\$56.50	Email to D. Herrold re: Rule 2004 examination
SJ Bellew	04/13/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Emails to C. Chow re: Rule 2004 motion
J Zugeran	04/13/10	0.5	\$300	\$150.00	Telephone conference with L. Heilman re: Rule 2004 hearing
KG Iffland	04/13/10	0.2	\$205	\$41.00	Print 2004 documents for LCH review (.2)
TM Daluz	04/14/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Address issues concerning 2004 hearing (.2)
LC Heilman	04/14/10	1.1	\$340	\$374.00	E-mail correspondence re: hearing on 2004 motion (.1); review and analyze docket and related 2004 pleadings in preparation for hearing on same (1.0)
SJ Bellew	04/14/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Emails to/from C. Chow re: Rule 2004 issues
TM Daluz	04/16/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Review and revise chronology of 2004 motion (.5)
LC Heilman	04/16/10	0.5	\$340	\$170.00	Revise chronology for 2004 motion (.3); follow-up e-mail correspondence re: comments to same (.2)
LC Heilman	04/17/10	3.7	\$340	\$1,258.00	Conduct additional research re: pending proceeding rule (2.3); review and revise 2004 hearing outline/chronology re: legal analysis on pending proceeding rule(1.2); e-mail correspondence to/from C. Chow re: same (.2)
CS Chow	04/18/10	5.9	\$525	\$3,097.50	Review and analysis re: 2004 discovery correspondence and pleadings (2.9);

Detail of Time and Disbursements

research and analysis re: same (.5);
prepare for oral argument re: same (2.5)

21.8 \$9,555.00 B120 - Total

B140 - Relief fr. Stay Proceedings

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
TM Daluz	04/05/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Review Fannie Mae correspondence (.2)
J Zugergerman	04/05/10	2.1	\$300	\$630.00	Review and analyze Fannie Mae's Motion for Relief from Stay and cited cases
J Zugergerman	04/05/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	Telephone conference with T. Daluz re: Fannie Mae's Motion for Relief from Stay
TM Daluz	04/05/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with Fannie Mae re: consensual discovery (.2)
J Zugergerman	04/05/10	1.2	\$300	\$360.00	Research case law re: 11 U.S.C. section 362(d)(1), (2) and relief from stay re: objection to Fannie Mae's motion for relief from stay
TM Daluz	04/06/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Conference call with counsel for Remy's re relief from stay (.3)
TM Daluz	04/06/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with client re: discovery (.2)
J Zugergerman	04/07/10	2.0	\$300	\$600.00	Research case law re: objection to Fannie Mae's motion for relief from stay
TM Daluz	04/08/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Attend to objection to relief from stay (.3)
J Zugergerman	04/08/10	1.8	\$300	\$540.00	Research case law re: objection to Fannie Mae's motion for relief from stay
J Zugergerman	04/08/10	4.6	\$300	\$1,380.00	Draft objection to Fannie Mae's motion for relief from stay
J Zugergerman	04/09/10	4.1	\$300	\$1,230.00	Review and revise objection to Fannie Mae's motion to lift stay
J Zugergerman	04/09/10	1.8	\$300	\$540.00	Research case law re: objection to Fannie Mae's motion for relief from stay
TM Daluz	04/09/10	1.5	\$600	\$900.00	Revise objection to motion for relief (1.5)
TM Daluz	04/11/10	4.0	\$600	\$2,400.00	Review Fannie Mae motion for relief from stay (.5); Draft outline for response (1.5); Revise draft objection to motion for relief from stay (1.5); Meet with J. Zugergerman re: same (.5)

Detail of Time and Disbursements

J Zugerman	04/11/10	1.0	\$300	\$300.00	Conference with T. Daluz re: objection to Fannie Mae's motion for relief from stay (.5); revise objection re: same (.5)
TM Daluz	04/12/10	2.0	\$600	\$1,200.00	Review further revised objection to relief from stay (2.0)
MG Summers	04/12/10	0.2	\$450	\$90.00	Analyze Fannie Mae's proposal re relief from stay and e-mail correspondence re same
MG Summers	04/12/10	0.7	\$450	\$315.00	Telephone conference with D. Gordon and T. Daluz re lift stay and cash collateral strategy and possible resolution
J Zugerman	04/12/10	3.7	\$300	\$1,110.00	Research appraisal evidentiary issues
J Zugerman	04/12/10	1.0	\$300	\$300.00	Draft affidavit in support of objection to Fannie Mae's motion to lift stay
J Zugerman	04/12/10	6.7	\$300	\$2,010.00	Review and revise objection to Fannie Mae's motion to lift stay
TM Daluz	04/12/10	2.0	\$600	\$1,200.00	Calls with R. Mersky re: discovery, etc. (.6); Correspond with D. Gordon re: Fannie Mae issues (.2); Conference call with D. Gordon re: Fannie Mae Issues (1.0); Correspond with R. Mersky re: possible resolution of same (.2)
J Zugerman	04/13/10	2.0	\$300	\$600.00	Prepare document request re: Fannie Mae's motion to lift stay
J Zugerman	04/13/10	0.9	\$300	\$270.00	Continue research type re: appraisal evidentiary issues
MG Summers	04/13/10	0.3	\$450	\$135.00	Analyze issues re settlement and hearing on lift stay motion and cash collateral motion
TM Daluz	04/13/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Multiple communications with D. Gordon re: possible resolution of lift stay issues (.3)
TM Daluz	04/13/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Call with R. Mersky re: possible resolution of lift stay issues (.4)
TM Daluz	04/14/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Correspond with client re: settlement terms (.4)
TM Daluz	04/14/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with R. Mersky re: settlement terms (.2)
MG Summers	04/15/10	0.2	\$450	\$90.00	Analyze issues re negotiations with lender for relief from stay, releases, and use of cash collateral
TM Daluz	04/15/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Correspond with client re: receiver transition issues (.2); Correspond with Fannie Mae re: settlement language (.2)
TM Daluz	04/16/10	1.5	\$600	\$900.00	Calls with client re: settlement (.5);

Detail of Time and Disbursements

Multiple calls with R. Mersky re:
settlement (.5); Revise settlement terms
(.5)

MG Summers	04/16/10	2.1	\$450	\$945.00	Draft stipulation and consent order re motion for relief from stay
SJ Bellew	04/16/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Review emails re: settlement structure
MG Summers	04/17/10	0.2	\$450	\$90.00	Analyze issues re transition from operation of apartment complexes by debtors to receiver
MG Summers	04/18/10	0.9	\$450	\$405.00	Revise stipulation and consent order granting relief from stay
SJ Bellew	04/18/10	0.9	\$565	\$508.50	Prepare for and conduct telephone conference with client re: status of resolution
MG Summers	04/18/10	0.2	\$450	\$90.00	E-mail correspondence with D. Gordon and T. Daluz re consent order granting relief from stay
CS Chow	04/18/10	2.1	\$525	\$1,102.50	Review and analysis re: proposed lift stay stipulation and final cash collateral order (1.2); telephone conversation w/ D. Gordon, others re: same (.9)
TM Daluz	04/18/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Review and revise stipulated order for relief from stay (.5)
TM Daluz	04/18/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Review revised order for relief from stay (.2)
MG Summers	04/18/10	0.8	\$450	\$360.00	Telephone conference with D. Gordon, T. Daluz, S. Bellew, C. Chow, and D. Felice re lift stay motion, pre-trial conference in adversary proceedings, cash collateral, and dip financing
MG Summers	04/19/10	0.2	\$450	\$90.00	E-mail correspondence re Remys and Bank of the West's objections to lift stay order and additional modifications requested by Fannie Mae
TM Daluz	04/19/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Calls with M. Summers re; revision to Fannie Mae order (.5)
MG Summers	04/19/10	0.4	\$450	\$180.00	Analyze issues re stipulation and consent order granting relief from stay
MG Summers	04/19/10	0.3	\$450	\$135.00	Revise consent order and stipulation granting relief from stay
SJ Bellew	04/19/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Review and analyze draft stipulation and consent order re: Fannie Mae settlement
TM Daluz	04/19/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Call with Remy counsel re: comments to relief from stay order (.4)

Detail of Time and Disbursements

J Zugergerman	04/19/10	0.2	\$300	\$60.00	Conference with C. Chow re: relief from stay motion and cash collateral
CS Chow	04/19/10	2.2	\$525	\$1,155.00	Review and analysis re: revisions to lift stay stipulation (.7); review and analysis re: R. Mersky comments to same (.5); analysis and planning re: Remy objections and comments to same (1.0)
TM Daluz	04/20/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Call with M. Summers re: revisions (.2); Call with R. Mersky re: Remy's comments (.2)
J Zugergerman	04/20/10	0.9	\$300	\$270.00	Prepare certification of counsel regarding Fannie Mae's motion for relief from stay
SJ Bellew	04/20/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Review email of client re: Receiver mechanics
MG Summers	04/20/10	0.2	\$450	\$90.00	Analyze Remys' comments and objections to lift stay consent order
MG Summers	04/20/10	0.4	\$450	\$180.00	Revise draft order granting relief from stay
TM Daluz	04/20/10	0.6	\$600	\$360.00	Conference call with R. Mersky, C. Lewis and N. Ramsey re: comments to stay relief (.6)
CS Chow	04/20/10	2.4	\$525	\$1,260.00	Review and analysis re: revised lift stay stipulation (.5); review and analysis of Remy objections to same (1.4); planning and analysis re: telephonic conference issues (1.5)
TM Daluz	04/20/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Multiple correspondence with counsel for Remys re: relief from stay order (.2)
TM Daluz	04/20/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Call with R. Mersky re: proposed lift stay consent orders
TM Daluz	04/20/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Review revised relief from stay and cash collateral orders (.5)
TM Daluz	04/20/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with OK counsel re: receiver (.2)
TM Daluz	04/20/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Review revised proposed form of relief from stay order (.3)
CS Chow	04/20/10	1.6	\$525	\$840.00	Research and analysis re: dismissal issues
TM Daluz	04/21/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Call with R. Mersky re: changes to relief from stay order (.3)
CS Chow	04/21/10	4.5	\$525	\$2,362.50	Analysis and planning re: lift stay stipulation issues (2.4); continue review and analysis of Remy objection and proposed revisions re: same (.5); e-mail messages with D. Gordon re: same (.4); e-mail messages and telephone conversations

Detail of Time and Disbursements

w/ R. Mersky re: same (.4); analysis re: receivership issues (.6); e-mail messages with D. Herrold re: same (.2)

TM Daluz	04/21/10	1.9	\$600	\$1,140.00	Call with Remy counsel re: relief from stay order status (.2); Correspondence from Remy counsel re: change requested to relief from stay order (.2); Call and correspond with R. Mersky re: transition issues and further change to relief from stay order (.4); Draft additional provision for order (.3); Oversee filing of certifications of counsel re: relief from stay and cash collateral orders (.5); Conference call with M. Summers re: changes needed to relief from stay order (.3)
SJ Bellew	04/21/10	0.7	\$565	\$395.50	Telephone conferences with client and T. Daluz and C. Chow re: status of settlement re: lift stay issues
TM Daluz	04/21/10	0.7	\$600	\$420.00	Email correspondence with client re: status of orders (.1); Participate in strategy sessions with C. Chow re: open issues (.4); Review revised orders (.2)
J Zugergerman	04/21/10	0.7	\$300	\$210.00	Review, revise, file and serve certification of counsel regarding Fannie Mae's motion for relief from stay
TM Daluz	04/22/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Call with R. Mersky re: lift stay consent order status (.2)
CS Chow	04/22/10	0.9	\$525	\$472.50	Review and analysis re: D. Herrold emails concerning receivership issues (.6); planning re: same (.3)
CS Chow	04/22/10	0.5	\$525	\$262.50	Further analysis and planning re: lift stay stipulation issues
CS Chow	04/23/10	2.4	\$525	\$1,260.00	Telephone conversation w/ R. Mersky re: lift stay stipulation (.2); e-mail messages with D. Gordon re: receivership and lift stay issues (.8); analysis and planning of teleconference presentation re: same (1.4)
TM Daluz	04/23/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Review correspondence from client and response from C. Chow re: management of companies (.3)
TM Daluz	04/23/10	0.7	\$600	\$420.00	Call with C. Chow re: status of relief from stay order (.5); Email correspondence with R. Mersky re: status of relief from stay order (.2)
TM Daluz	04/25/10	1.0	\$600	\$600.00	Participate in conference call with client, S. Bellew and C. Chow (1.0)
SJ Bellew	04/25/10	1.1	\$565	\$621.50	Prepare for and conduct call with client

Detail of Time and Disbursements

re: lift stay strategy

CS Chow	04/25/10	1.6	\$525	\$840.00	Telephone conversation w/ D. Gordon re: lift stay stipulation and adversary proceeding issues, DIP financing and case status (1.0); planning and analysis re: same (.6)
CS Chow	04/26/10	2.0	\$525	\$1,050.00	Analysis and planning re: proposed lift stay teleconference issues (1.4); telephone conversation and E-mail messages with R. Bello re: same (.4); e-mail messages with R. Mersky re: same (.2)
TM Daluz	04/26/10	0.7	\$600	\$420.00	Call with R. Mersky and L. Carter re: visit from property manager (.3); Correspondence from L. Carter re: visit from managers (.2); Correspond with client re: same (.2)
TM Daluz	04/26/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Correspondence from R. Bello re: relief from stay order (.1)
SJ Bellew	04/26/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Emails to/from client re: FM resolution of lift stay issues
TM Daluz	04/26/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Meet with C. Chow re: hearing on relief from stay order (.3); Calls with R. Mersky re: relief from stay order (.2)
SJ Bellew	04/27/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Review emails re: FM settlement
TM Daluz	04/27/10	1.0	\$600	\$600.00	Multiple correspondence with R. Mersky re: order on relief from stay (.5); Multiple correspondence with counsel for Remy's re: same (.5)
TM Daluz	04/27/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Review order entered by court (.1)
TM Daluz	04/27/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Multiple correspondence with court re: relief from stay order (.4)
SJ Bellew	04/27/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Review Court's Order re: FM settlement
CS Chow	04/27/10	3.0	\$525	\$1,575.00	Review e-mail messages from R. Mersky, J. Walker, N. Ramsey re: lift stay stipulation telephonic conference (.5); analysis and planning re: same (.5); e-mail and telephone conversation w/ R. Mersky re: same (.3); review entered lift stay stipulation and final cash collateral order (.1); e-mail messages with D. Gordon re: same (.1); analysis and planning re: same (.9); analysis re: receivership issues (.5); e-mail messages with E. Jones re: same (.1)
CS Chow	04/28/10	0.2	\$525	\$105.00	Review and analysis of E. Jones and L. Carter correspondence re: receivership proceeding

Detail of Time and Disbursements

SJ Bellew	04/28/10	0.4	\$565	\$226.00	Review FM stipulation in connection with determining discovery obligations of FM
TM Daluz	04/28/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Multiple correspondence with E. Jones re: OK receivership (.3)
CS Chow	04/29/10	0.7	\$525	\$367.50	Review and analysis of D. Gordon e-mail messages re: receivership proceeding and non-debtor issues
CS Chow	04/30/10	2.9	\$525	\$1,522.50	Further research and analysis re: dismissal issues
		99.9		\$46,249.00	B140 - Total

B160 - Fee/Employment Applications

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
TM Daluz	04/05/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Attend to issues re: fee application (.2)
KG Iffland	04/08/10	1.0	\$205	\$205.00	Prepare draft of fee application (1.0)
J Zugerman	04/16/10	0.6	\$300	\$180.00	Review Sneed Lang Herrold Affidavit of Disinterestedness and prepare for filing
		1.8		\$505.00	B160 - Total

B190 - Other Contested Matters

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
TM Daluz	04/05/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with Remy counsel re: adversary (.2)
DT May	04/05/10	1.1	\$270	\$297.00	Compile research regarding rescission claims
KG Iffland	04/06/10	0.3	\$205	\$61.50	Attend to issues regarding complaint (.3)
SJ Bellew	04/06/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Telephone conference with T. Daluz and N. Ramsey re: status of Remy litigation
DA Felice	04/06/10	0.2	\$420	\$84.00	Review docket for response deadline (.1); comment on service of amended complaint (.1)
SJ Bellew	04/06/10	0.5	\$565	\$282.50	Telephone conference with T. Daluz and D. Gordon re: status of adversary proceedings
J Zugerman	04/07/10	0.2	\$300	\$60.00	Review summons for adversary proceeding (.1); e-mail S. Bellew re: same (.1)

Detail of Time and Disbursements

SJ Bellew	04/08/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Telephone conference with K. Ibach re: response date to complaint
TM Daluz	04/08/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Review notice of default in adversary (.1); Correspond with S. Bellew, D. Felice and M. Summers re: same (.2)
MG Summers	04/08/10	0.1	\$450	\$45.00	Analyze order of court re failure of defendants to plead and time within which plaintiff must move for default
SJ Bellew	04/09/10	0.5	\$565	\$282.50	Detailed email to N. Ramsey re: notice of default and pre-trial issues
J Zugerman	04/09/10	1.3	\$300	\$390.00	Draft motion for default judgment and supporting documents for adversary action against Bank of the West
TM Daluz	04/09/10	0.6	\$600	\$360.00	Review correspondence with Remy counsel re: adversary (.1); Review correspondence re: extension of time to answer complaint (.2); Review Remy response to document production (.3)
SJ Bellew	04/09/10	0.1	\$565	\$56.50	Review orders re: default
KG Iffland	04/09/10	0.8	\$205	\$164.00	Prepare certification of counsel and stipulation to extend time to answer Remy complaint (.8)
KG Iffland	04/12/10	0.7	\$205	\$143.50	Preparation of stipulation to extend time to answer complaint (.7)
SJ Bellew	04/13/10	0.4	\$565	\$226.00	Telephone call to T. Lefco (Strange) re: status
J Zugerman	04/13/10	1.7	\$300	\$510.00	Draft motion for default judgment and supporting documents for adversary action against Bank of the West
KG Iffland	04/13/10	0.7	\$205	\$143.50	Prepare and perfect filing and service of stipulation to extend time (.7)
SJ Bellew	04/13/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Emails to/from M. Sheppard re: stipulation
SJ Bellew	04/13/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Review and revise stipulation re: Remys response
SJ Bellew	04/14/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Email to A. Moore re: stipulation
DA Felice	04/14/10	0.5	\$420	\$210.00	Draft proposed scheduling order (.4); circulate to S. Bellew (.1)
SJ Bellew	04/14/10	0.1	\$565	\$56.50	Review stipulation re: extension for Strange
SJ Bellew	04/15/10	0.4	\$565	\$226.00	Review and revise proposed stipulation re: Strange
SJ Bellew	04/15/10	0.9	\$565	\$508.50	Review and revise motion for default re: Bank of the West

Detail of Time and Disbursements

Attorney	Date	Hours	Rate	Amount	Description
SJ Bellew	04/15/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Emails to G. Kaplan re: stipulation
TM Daluz	04/15/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Review motions for default in adversaries (.3); Correspond with J. Zugergerman re: motion for default (.1)
J Zugergerman	04/15/10	1.5	\$300	\$450.00	Review, revise, and prepare for filing motion for default judgment against Bank of the West
TM Daluz	04/16/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Call with counsel for BOW (.2)
SJ Bellew	04/16/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Email to/from D. Astin re: extension
SJ Bellew	04/16/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Telephone conference with D. Astin re: representation of BOW
SJ Bellew	04/17/10	0.7	\$565	\$395.50	Review and analyze Remy motion to dismiss
DA Felice	04/18/10	1.5	\$420	\$630.00	Review Remy's motion to dismiss (.6); participate in conference call with team re: pre-trial conference and Remy's motion to dismiss (.9)
TM Daluz	04/19/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Draft correspondence to client re: Remy discussion (.2); Call with S. Bellew re: adversaries (.2)
DA Felice	04/19/10	0.3	\$420	\$126.00	Review emails re: status of lift stay and assignments for discovery in adversary proceedings
SJ Bellew	04/19/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Email to counsel for Remys re: Bank of the West complaint
SJ Bellew	04/19/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Telephone conference with T. Daluz re: Remy proposal
TM Daluz	04/19/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with counsel for BOW re: orders (.2)
SJ Bellew	04/19/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Detailed email re: discovery tasks
CS Chow	04/19/10	1.7	\$525	\$892.50	Planning and analysis re: adversary strategy
SJ Bellew	04/20/10	1.5	\$565	\$847.50	Telephone conferences with T. Daluz, C. Chow and D. Gordon re: settlement
CS Chow	04/20/10	5.7	\$525	\$2,992.50	Analysis and planning re: adversary proceeding recovery issues (4.7); telephone conversations w/ M. Sheppard, N. Ramsey re: same (.5); telephone conversation w/ D. Gordon re: same (.5)
TM Daluz	04/20/10	2.2	\$600	\$1,320.00	Call with N. Ramsey and M. Sheppard re: adversaries (.5); lengthy call with client re: status of Fannie Mae motion and adversaries (1.0); Several calls with counsel for Remy's re: adversaries (.5); Follow up call with client (.2)

Detail of Time and Disbursements

SJ Bellew	04/20/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Telephone conference with G. Kaplan re: status
SJ Bellew	04/20/10	2.3	\$565	\$1,299.50	Telephone conferences with N. Ramsey and M. Sheppard re: settlement discussions
TM Daluz	04/21/10	1.2	\$600	\$720.00	Several calls with N. Ramsey re: adversary (.5); Several calls with client re: adversary (.5); Call with C. Chow re: broker's position in adversary (.2)
SJ Bellew	04/21/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Emails to/from client re: settlement status
SJ Bellew	04/21/10	0.5	\$565	\$282.50	Telephone conferences with T. Lefco re: settlement discussions
DT May	04/21/10	2.4	\$270	\$648.00	Review and analyze Motion to Dismiss
TM Daluz	04/21/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Analyze ability to settle adversary (.5)
SJ Bellew	04/21/10	0.5	\$565	\$282.50	Telephone conferences with M. Sheppard re: settlement issues
CS Chow	04/21/10	1.8	\$525	\$945.00	Analysis and planning re: adversary proceeding discovery issues (1.0); review and analysis of D. Gordon e-mail messages re: same (.8)
DT May	04/21/10	0.1	\$270	\$27.00	Meet with D. Felice re: tasks to complete by next week reply brief
TM Daluz	04/22/10	0.7	\$600	\$420.00	Email correspondence from client re: Remy issues (.1); Call with D. Gordon and C. Chow re: adversaries (.3); Call with M. Sheppard and C. Chow re: adversaries (.3)
SJ Bellew	04/22/10	0.4	\$565	\$226.00	Review emails from client re: strategy issues on Remy settlement
CS Chow	04/22/10	1.6	\$525	\$840.00	Telephone conversation w/ M. Sheppard re: adversary proceeding issues (.3); analysis and planning re: same (.7); telephone conversation and e-mail messages with D. Gordon re: same (.6)
TM Daluz	04/22/10	1.0	\$600	\$600.00	Calls with D. Gordon re: adversaries and Fannie Mae relief from stay (.5); Call with D. Gordon re: broker (.2); Calls with N. Ramsey re: broker (.3)
DA Felice	04/23/10	1.5	\$420	\$630.00	Draft revised 2004 requests and discovery requests to Remy defendants
CS Chow	04/23/10	0.1	\$525	\$52.50	Planning re: adversary proceeding discovery
DT May	04/23/10	1.2	\$270	\$324.00	Review Motion to dismiss brief
SJ Bellew	04/23/10	0.7	\$565	\$395.50	Emails among client and counsel re: settlement strategy

Detail of Time and Disbursements

CS Chow	04/24/10	2.2	\$525	\$1,155.00	Analysis re: adversary proceeding issues (1.4); draft summary re: same (.8)
SJ Bellew	04/26/10	0.7	\$565	\$395.50	Review and revise draft discovery requests and instructions in connection with same
SJ Bellew	04/26/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Telephone conference with D. Gordon re: status of discussions
TM Daluz	04/26/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Analysis re: adversary discovery status
SJ Bellew	04/26/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Telephone conference with M. Sheppard re: settlement discussions
CS Chow	04/26/10	1.4	\$525	\$735.00	Review and analysis re: draft RemyCo adversary discovery document request and related issues
DA Felice	04/26/10	1.7	\$420	\$714.00	Continue to revise and draft first set of requests for production to the Remy entities (1.2); prepare same for service and service requests (.5)
SJ Bellew	04/27/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Telephone conference with J. McLaughlin re: cause issues
SJ Bellew	04/27/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Email to/from client re: discussion with Bank of West
DT May	04/27/10	1.4	\$270	\$378.00	Prepare and Draft Brief in Opposition to Defendant Remys Motion to Dismiss
DA Felice	04/27/10	1.1	\$420	\$462.00	Draft and revise first set of interrogatories to Remy Entities
TM Daluz	04/28/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Review correspondence to defendants re: discovery (.1); Review correspondence with Fannie Mae re: discovery (.2)
CS Chow	04/28/10	0.6	\$525	\$315.00	Review and analysis re: adversary proceeding correspondence
DA Felice	04/28/10	1.3	\$420	\$546.00	Draft and revise discovery requests for Bank of West
SJ Bellew	04/28/10	0.4	\$565	\$226.00	Email to counsel re: discovery scheduling conference
SJ Bellew	04/28/10	0.5	\$565	\$282.50	Review and analyze BOW complaint in connection with determining discovery strategy
SJ Bellew	04/28/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Email to D. Astin re: depositions
SJ Bellew	04/28/10	0.7	\$565	\$395.50	Review and analyze Strange's motion to dismiss in connection with responding to same
DA Felice	04/28/10	0.9	\$420	\$378.00	Draft and revise first set of interrogatories to Remy defendants

Detail of Time and Disbursements

DT May	04/28/10	2.3	\$270	\$621.00	Prepare and Draft Brief in Opposition to Defendant Remys Motion to Dismiss Adversary
DA Felice	04/28/10	1.5	\$420	\$630.00	Draft and revise discovery requests for SVN
SJ Bellew	04/29/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Telephone conference with client re: discovery strategy
DA Felice	04/29/10	1.9	\$420	\$798.00	Draft subpoena and document requests to Fannie Mae (1.0); draft and circulate stipulation of extension for briefing on Remy Entities' motion to dismiss (.6); Telephone conversation with D. Gordon and S. Bellew re: deposition discovery (.3)
SJ Bellew	04/29/10	0.4	\$565	\$226.00	Telephone conference with T. Lefco re: discovery issues
CS Chow	04/29/10	0.4	\$525	\$210.00	Analysis re: adversary proceeding discovery and procedural issues
TM Daluz	04/29/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond re: motion to dismiss response (.2)
SJ Bellew	04/29/10	0.3	\$565	\$169.50	Review and analyze memo of law re: rescission issues
		69.3		\$32,373.00	B190 - Total

B210 - Business Operations

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
J Zugerman	04/14/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	E-mail C. Chow re: e-mail from B. Bickle (ONG counsel) re: sale agreements
J Zugerman	04/14/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	Review e-mail from B. Bickle (ONG counsel) re: sale agreements
TM Daluz	04/15/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Address issues re: utility (.2)
CS Chow	04/20/10	0.3	\$525	\$157.50	Review and analysis re: March operations issues
J Zugerman	04/20/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	Review interim bill from OKES
CS Chow	04/26/10	1.1	\$525	\$577.50	Analysis and planning re: Pomeroy Park fire (.7); e-mail messages with and telephone conversation w/ D. Gordon re: same (.4)
J Zugerman	04/26/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	E-mail D. Gordon and T. Short re: interim OKES bill
TM Daluz	04/26/10	0.6	\$600	\$360.00	Multiple calls with client and research

Detail of Time and Disbursements

re: fire at Pomeroy Park (.6)

2.6
\$1,335.00
B210 - Total

B230 - Financing/Cash Collateral

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
TM Daluz	04/12/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with M. Summers re: cash collateral (.2)
MG Summers	04/13/10	0.5	\$450	\$225.00	Draft affidavit in support of cash collateral motion
MG Summers	04/13/10	0.1	\$450	\$45.00	E-mail D. Gordon re report on use of cash collateral due April 20
MG Summers	04/14/10	0.6	\$450	\$270.00	Revise affidavit in support of motion to use cash collateral
TM Daluz	04/16/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Review final cash collateral order (.3)
MG Summers	04/16/10	1.4	\$450	\$630.00	Draft final cash collateral order
TM Daluz	04/18/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Review and revise final cash collateral order (.5)
TM Daluz	04/18/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Call with M. Summers re: changes to cash collateral order (.2)
MG Summers	04/18/10	0.3	\$450	\$135.00	Revise final cash collateral order
MG Summers	04/19/10	0.2	\$450	\$90.00	Analyze DIP financing issues
TM Daluz	04/20/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Correspond with BOW re: cash collateral order (.3)
J Zugergerman	04/20/10	0.7	\$300	\$210.00	Prepare certification of counsel for the use of cash collateral
TM Daluz	04/20/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Review revised final cash collateral order (.2)
MG Summers	04/20/10	0.1	\$450	\$45.00	Revise cash collateral order
MG Summers	04/20/10	4.8	\$450	\$2,160.00	Draft DIP financing order
J Zugergerman	04/21/10	0.7	\$300	\$210.00	Review, revise, file and serve certification of counsel regarding use of cash collateral
MG Summers	04/22/10	5.3	\$450	\$2,385.00	Draft motion to approve DIP financing and note
CS Chow	04/22/10	1.9	\$525	\$997.50	Review and analysis re: draft DIP financing pleadings
CS Chow	04/23/10	0.6	\$525	\$315.00	Further review and comment re: DIP

Detail of Time and Disbursements

financing pleadings

MG Summers	04/23/10	2.5	\$450	\$1,125.00	Revise financing motion, note and security agreement, and proposed order
J Zugerman	04/23/10	0.2	\$300	\$60.00	Telephone conference with C. Chow re: Postpetition financing motion
CS Chow	04/25/10	0.3	\$525	\$157.50	E-mail messages with D. Gordon re: DIP financing issues
CS Chow	04/26/10	1.0	\$525	\$525.00	Analysis and planning re: DIP financing issues (.8); e-mail messages with w/ D. Gordon re: same (.2)
CS Chow	04/27/10	0.4	\$525	\$210.00	Review and analysis re: revised DIP financing pleadings (.3); e-mail message to D. Gordon re: same (.1)
MG Summers	04/27/10	1.1	\$450	\$495.00	Revise financing motion, interim financing order, and promissory note
TM Daluz	04/30/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Analysis re: DIP financing issues (.2)
J Zugerman	04/30/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	Review e-mail from C. Chow re: DIP motion
J Zugerman	04/30/10	0.4	\$300	\$120.00	Review, prepare for filing, and file Post-Petition Financing Motion and exhibits
MG Summers	04/30/10	0.6	\$450	\$270.00	Revise DIP financing motion and proposed interim order
CS Chow	04/30/10	0.4	\$525	\$210.00	Further review of DIP pleadings (.2); e-mail messages with D. Gordon, M. John re: same (.2)

	26.1		\$12,060.00		B230 - Total
--	------	--	-------------	--	--------------

B430 - Litigation/Hearings

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
TM Daluz	04/19/10	1.5	\$600	\$900.00	Participate in omnibus hearing (1.5)
CS Chow	04/19/10	2.5	\$525	\$1,312.50	Continue preparing for hearing re: 2004 discovery, adversaries and lift stay stipulation (1.2); Attend hearing re: same (1.3)
SJ Bellew	04/19/10	1.3	\$565	\$734.50	Attend and participate in omnibus hearing

	5.3		\$2,947.00		B430 - Total
--	-----	--	------------	--	--------------

B440 - Schedules and Statements

Detail of Time and Disbursements

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
TM Daluz	04/05/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Attend to issues re: schedules (.2)
MG Summers	04/06/10	0.3	\$450	\$135.00	Analyze issues re schedules and statements re security deposits
J Zugerman	04/06/10	0.3	\$300	\$90.00	Telephone conference with M. Summers re: schedules and statements
J Zugerman	04/06/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	Review e-mail from D. Gordon re: schedules and statements
TM Daluz	04/06/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with M. Summers re: schedules (.2)
J Zugerman	04/06/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	E-mail K. Iffland re: schedules and statements
J Zugerman	04/07/10	3.0	\$300	\$900.00	Review and revise schedules and statements of financial affairs and prepare for filing
J Zugerman	04/07/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	E-mail D. Gordon re: schedules and statements
TM Daluz	04/07/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Analysis re: filling of schedules (.3)
SJ Bellew	04/07/10	0.2	\$565	\$113.00	Review draft schedules
KG Iffland	04/07/10	4.5	\$205	\$922.50	Prepare schedules and SOFA for filing (2.5); Prepare and perfect filing and service of same (2.0)
MG Summers	04/07/10	2.3	\$450	\$1,035.00	Prepare of schedules and statements of financial affairs
J Zugerman	04/08/10	0.1	\$300	\$30.00	Review local rules of procedure re: service of schedules and SOFAs
KG Iffland	04/08/10	0.2	\$205	\$41.00	Perfect service of schedules (.2)
TM Daluz	04/08/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond re: service of schedules (.2)
CS Chow	04/23/10	0.1	\$525	\$52.50	E-mail messages with M. John re: schedules and statements preparation
CS Chow	04/26/10	0.9	\$525	\$472.50	Review and analysis re: monthly operating reports (.6); planning re: same (.3)
CS Chow	04/27/10	1.1	\$525	\$577.50	Review and analysis re: draft monthly operating reports (.7); draft supplemental filing re: same (.3); e-mail messages with D. Gordon re: same (.1)
J Zugerman	04/28/10	0.5	\$300	\$150.00	Review and file monthly operating reports for Debtors
CS Chow	04/28/10	0.3	\$525	\$157.50	Review and analysis re: revised March monthly operating reports

Detail of Time and Disbursements

<u>15.0</u>	<u>\$5,306.50</u>	B440 - Total
-------------	-------------------	--------------

Detail of Time and Disbursements

Time Keeper Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
CS Chow	61.9	\$32,497.50	
DA Felice	12.4	\$5,208.00	
DT May	10.8	\$2,916.00	
J Zugerman	47.3	\$14,190.00	
KG Iffland	12.6	\$2,583.00	
LC Heilman	10.8	\$3,672.00	
MG Summers	28.2	\$12,690.00	
SJ Bellew	29.0	\$16,385.00	
TM Daluz	47.7	\$28,620.00	
	<u>260.7</u>	<u>\$118,761.50</u>	Total Fees