

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
MIDDLE DISTRICT OF FLORIDA  
JACKSONVILLE DIVISION**

**PROOF OF CLAIM**

In re:  
**TAYLOR, BEAN & WHITAKER MORTGAGE CORP.**

Case Number:  
**3:09-bk-07047-JAF**

NOTE: This form should not be used to make a claim for an administrative expense arising after the commencement of the case. A "request" for payment of an administrative expense may be filed pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 503.

Check box if you are aware that anyone else has filed a proof of claim relating to your claim. Attach copy of statement giving particulars.

Name of Creditor and Address: the person or other entity to whom the debtor owes money or property. If necessary, please cross out pre-printed address and write in change of address.

**CLAIM FILED**  
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA

21836931023898  
ELLIS, PAINTER, RATTATEREE & ADAMS, LLC  
(RE: KAI FLUKER (PRO SE))  
DAVID ADAMS  
2 EAST BRYAN STREET  
10TH FLOOR  
SAVANNAH, GA 30401

**JUN 14 2010**

CLERK, U. S. BANKRUPTCY COURT  
MIDDLE DISTRICT OF FLORIDA

If you have already filed a proof of claim with the Bankruptcy Court or BMC, you do not need to file again.

Creditor Telephone Number **(912) 233-9700**  Check box if address is where Notice is to be sent.

**THIS SPACE IS FOR COURT USE ONLY**

Name and address where payment should be sent (if different from above):

Check this box if you are the debtor or trustee in this case.

Check this box to indicate that this claim amends a previously filed claim.

Claim Number (if known):

Filed on: \_\_\_\_\_

Payment Telephone Number ( )

**1. AMOUNT OF CLAIM AS OF DATE CASE FILED \$ 14,979.50**

If all or part of your claim is secured, complete item 4 below; however, if all of your claim is unsecured, do not complete item 4.  
If all or part of your claim is entitled to priority, complete item 5.

Check this box if claim includes interest or other charges in addition to the principal amount of claim. Attach itemized statement of interest or charges.

**2. BASIS FOR CLAIM:**

Legal Services

(See instructions #2 and #3a on reverse side.)

**3. LAST FOUR DIGITS OF ANY NUMBER BY WHICH CREDITOR IDENTIFIES DEBTOR:**

3a. Debtor may have scheduled account as:

**4. SECURED CLAIM** (See instruction #4 on reverse side.)

Secured Claim Amount: \$ \_\_\_\_\_ **DO NOT** include the priority portion of your claim here.

Check the appropriate box if your claim is secured by a lien on property or a right of set off and provide the requested information

**Nature of property or right of setoff:**

Describe:

Real Estate  Motor Vehicle  Other \_\_\_\_\_

Value of Property: \$ \_\_\_\_\_ Annual Interest Rate: \_\_\_\_\_ % if any: \$ \_\_\_\_\_ Basis for Perfection: \_\_\_\_\_

Amount of arrearage and other charges as of time case filed included in secured claim,

**5. PRIORITY CLAIM**

Amount of Claim Entitled to Priority under 11 U.S.C. §507(a). If any portion of your claim falls in one of the following categories, check the box and state the amount.

Unsecured Priority Claim Amount: \$ \_\_\_\_\_ Include **ONLY** the priority portion of your unsecured claim here.

**You MUST specify the priority of the claim:**

- Domestic support obligations under 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(1)(A) or (a)(1)(B).
- Wages, salaries, or commissions (up to \$10,950\*), earned within 180 days before filing of the bankruptcy petition or cessation of the debtor's business, whichever is earlier - 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(4).
- Contributions to an employee benefit plan - 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(5).

- Up to \$2,425\* of deposits toward purchase, lease, or rental of property or services for personal, family, or household use - 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(7).
- Taxes or penalties owed to governmental units - 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(8).
- Other - Specify applicable paragraph of 11 U.S.C. § 507(a) ( \_\_\_\_\_ ).

\* Amounts are subject to adjustment on 4/1/10 and every 3 years thereafter with respect to cases commenced on or after the date of adjustment.

**6. CREDITS:** The amount of all payments on this claim has been credited for the purpose of making this proof of claim.

**7. SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS:** Attach redacted copies of supporting documents, such as promissory notes, purchase orders, invoices, itemized statements of running accounts, contracts, court judgments, mortgages, and security agreements. You may also attach a summary. Attach redacted copies of evidence of perfection of a security interest. (See definition of "redacted" on reverse side.) If the documents are not available, please explain.

**DATE-STAMPED COPY** To receive an acknowledgment of the filing of your claim, enclose a stamped, self-addressed envelope and copy of this proof of claim.

**DO NOT SEND ORIGINAL DOCUMENTS. ATTACHED DOCUMENTS MAY BE DESTROYED AFTER SCANNING.**

The original of this completed proof of claim form must be sent by mail, hand, courier or overnight delivery (facsimile, telecopy or other electronic means NOT accepted), so that it is actually received on or before 5:00 p.m. prevailing Eastern Time on June 15, 2010, the Bar Date (as defined in the Bar Date Notice).

**THIS SPACE FOR COURT USE ONLY**

**By Regular Mail to:**

BMC Group, Inc.  
Attn: Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. Claim Processing  
PO Box 3020  
Chanhassen, MN 55317-3020

**By Hand, Courier, or Overnight Delivery to:**

BMC Group, Inc.  
Attn: Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. Claim Proces  
18750 Lake Drive East  
Chanhassen, MN 55317

T, B & W Mortgage Corp.



02619

Scanned: 6/14/2010-12:26:39 PM

DATE

6/11/10

SIGNATURE

The person filing this claim must sign it. Sign and print name and title. If any of the creditor or other person authorized to file this claim and state address and telephone number if different from the notice address above. Attach copy of power of attorney, if any.

DAVID W. ADAMS MANAGING PARTNER

## INSTRUCTIONS FOR PROOF OF CLAIM FORM

*The instructions and definitions below are general explanations of the law. In certain circumstances, such as bankruptcy cases not filed voluntarily by the debtor, there may be exceptions to these general rules.*

### ITEMS TO BE COMPLETED IN PROOF OF CLAIM FORM (IF NOT ALREADY PROPERLY FILLED IN)

<p><b>Court, Name of Debtor, and Case Number:</b> Use this proof of claim form only if you are asserting a claim against the Debtor, Taylor, Bean &amp; Whitaker Mortgage Corp. If you received a notice of the case from the Claims Agent, BMC Group, some or all of this information may have been already completed.</p> <table border="1" style="width: 100%; border-collapse: collapse; margin-bottom: 5px;"> <tr> <th style="text-align: left;">DEBTOR</th> <th style="text-align: left;">CASE NO</th> <th style="text-align: left;">PETITION DATE</th> </tr> <tr> <td>Taylor, Bean &amp; Whitaker Mortgage Corp.</td> <td>3:09-bk-07047-JAF</td> <td>8/24/2009</td> </tr> </table> <p><b>Creditor's Name and Address:</b> Fill in the name of the person or entity asserting a claim and the name and address of the person who should receive notices issued during the bankruptcy case. A separate space is provided for the payment address if it differs from the notice address. The creditor has a continuing obligation to keep the court informed of its current address. See Federal Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure (FRBP) 2002(g).</p> <p><b>1. Amount of Claim as of Date Case Filed:</b> State the total amount (in lawful US currency) owed to the creditor on the date of the Bankruptcy filing. Follow the instructions concerning whether to complete item 4. Check the box if interest or other charges are included in the claim.</p> <p><b>2. Basis for Claim:</b> State the type of debt or how it was incurred. Examples include goods sold, money loaned, services performed, personal injury/wrongful death, car loan, mortgage note, and credit card.</p> <p><b>3. Last Four Digits of Any Number by Which Creditor Identifies Debtor:</b> State only the last four digits of the debtor's account or other number used by the creditor to identify the debtor.</p> <p><b>3a. Debtor May Have Scheduled Account As:</b> Use this space to report a change in the creditor's name, a transferred claim, or any other information that clarifies a difference between this proof of claim and the claim as scheduled by the debtor.</p> <p><b>4. Secured Claim:</b> Check the appropriate box and provide the requested information if the claim is fully or partially secured. Skip this section if the claim is entirely unsecured. (See DEFINITIONS, below.)</p>	DEBTOR	CASE NO	PETITION DATE	Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp.	3:09-bk-07047-JAF	8/24/2009	<p>State the type and the value of property that secures the claim, attach copies of lien documentation, and state annual interest rate and the amount past due on the claim as of the date of the bankruptcy filing.</p> <p><b>5. Amount of Claim Entitled to Priority Under 11 U.S.C. §507(a).</b> If any portion of your claim falls in one or more of the listed categories, check the appropriate box(es) and state the amount entitled to priority. (See DEFINITIONS, below.) A claim may be partly priority and partly non-priority. For example, in some of the categories, the law limits the amount entitled to priority.</p> <p><b>6. Credits:</b> An authorized signature on this proof of claim serves as an acknowledgment that when calculating the amount of the claim, the creditor gave the debtor credit for any payments received toward the debt.</p> <p><b>7. Supporting Documents:</b> Attach to this proof of claim form redacted copies documenting the existence of the debt and of any lien securing the debt. You may also attach a summary if documentation is voluminous or an explanation if documentation is not available. You must also attach copies of documents that evidence perfection of any security interest. You may also attach a summary. FRBP 3001(c) and (d). Do not send original documents, as attachments may be destroyed after scanning.</p> <p><b>Date and Signature:</b> The person filing this proof of claim <u>must</u> sign and date it. FRBP 9011. Print the name and title, if any, of the creditor or other person authorized to file this claim. State the filer's address and telephone number if it differs from the address given on the top of the form for purposes of receiving notices. Attach a complete copy of any power of attorney. Criminal penalties apply for making a false statement on a proof of claim.</p> <p><b>Date-Stamped Copy:</b> <b>Return claim form and attachments.</b> If you wish to receive an acknowledgement of your claim, please enclose a self-addressed stamped envelope and a second copy of the proof of claim form with any attachments to the Claims Agent, BMC Group, at the address on the front of this form.</p> <p><i>Please read – important information: upon completion of this claim form, you are certifying that the statements herein are true.</i></p> <p>Be sure all items are answered on the claim form. If not applicable, insert "Not Applicable."</p>
DEBTOR	CASE NO	PETITION DATE					
Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp.	3:09-bk-07047-JAF	8/24/2009					

### DEFINITIONS

### INFORMATION

<p><b>DEBTOR</b> A debtor is the person, corporation, or other entity that has filed a bankruptcy case.</p> <p><b>CREDITOR</b> A creditor is any person, corporation, or other entity to whom the debtor owed a debt on the date that the bankruptcy case was filed.</p> <p><b>CLAIM</b> A claim is the creditor's right to receive payment on a debt that was owed by the debtor on the date of the bankruptcy filing. See 11 U.S.C. §101 (5). A claim may be secured or unsecured.</p> <p><b>PROOF OF CLAIM</b> A form telling the bankruptcy court how much the debtor owed a creditor at the time the bankruptcy case was filed (the amount of the creditor's claim). This form must be filed with the court-appointed Claims Agent, BMC Group, at the address listed on the reverse side of this page</p> <p><b>SECURED CLAIM Under 11 U.S.C. §506(a)</b> A secured claim is one backed by a lien on property of the debtor. The claim is secured so long as the creditor has the right to be paid from the property prior to other creditors.</p>	<p>The amount of the secured claim cannot exceed the value of the property. Any amount owed to the creditor in excess of the value of the property is an unsecured claim. Examples of liens on property include a mortgage on real estate or a security interest in a car.</p> <p>A lien may be voluntarily granted by a debtor or may be obtained through a court proceeding. In some states, a court judgment is a lien. A claim also may be secured if the creditor owes the debtor money (has a right to setoff).</p> <p><b>UNSECURED NONPRIORITY CLAIM</b> If a claim is not a secured claim it is an unsecured claim. A claim may be partly secured and partly unsecured if the property on which a creditor has a lien is not worth enough to pay the creditor in full.</p> <p><b>UNSECURED PRIORITY CLAIM Under 11 U.S.C. §507(a)</b> Priority claims are certain categories of unsecured claims that are paid from the available money or property in a bankruptcy case before other unsecured claims.</p> <p><b>Evidence of Perfection</b> Evidence of perfection may include a mortgage, lien, certificate of title, financing statement, or other document showing that the lien has been filed or recorded.</p>	<p><b>Redacted</b> A document has been redacted when the person filing it has masked, edited out, or otherwise deleted, certain information. A creditor should redact and use only the last four digits of any social-security, individual's tax-identification, or financial-account number, all but the initials of a minor's name and only the year of any person's date of birth.</p> <p><b>Offers to Purchase a Claim</b> Certain entities are in the business of purchasing claims for an amount less than the face value of the claims. One or more of these entities may contact the creditor and offer to purchase the claim. Some of the written communications from these entities may easily be confused with official court documentation or communications from the debtor. These entities do not represent the bankruptcy court or the debtor. The creditor has no obligation to sell its claim. However, if the creditor decides to sell its claim, any transfer of such claim is subject to FRBP 3001(e), any applicable provisions of the Bankruptcy Code (11 U.S.C. § 101 et seq.), and any applicable orders of</p>
---	--	---

ONCE YOUR CLAIM IS FILED YOU CAN OBTAIN OR VERIFY YOUR CLAIM NUMBER BY VISITING [www.bmcgroup.com/tbw mortgage](http://www.bmcgroup.com/tbw mortgage)

Scanned on 01/4/2010 12:26:39 PM

ELLIS, PAINTER, RATTERREE ADAMS LLP  
TAYLOR, BEAN WHITAKER  
OUTSTANDING INVOICES  
KAI FLUKER

INVOICE #	DATE	MATTER	FEES	COSTS	TOTAL			
97682	8/10/2009	7013-1678	\$6,625.00	\$286.46	\$6,911.46			
100919	10/14/2009	7013-1678	4,925.00	272.25	5,197.25			
105454	4/21/2010	7013-1678	2,262.00	608.79	2,870.79			
TOTAL			\$13,812.00	\$1,167.50	\$14,979.50			

Scanned: 6/14/2010-12:26:40 PM

# ELLIS, PAINTER, RATTERREE & ADAMS LLP

ATTORNEYS AT LAW  
POST OFFICE BOX 9946  
SAVANNAH, GEORGIA 31412

TELEPHONE: (912) 233-9700  
FAX: (912) 233-2281  
FED ID 58-1788955

Taylor Bean & Whitaker Mortgage  
Attention: Karen Barnard via Serengeti  
1417 North Magnolia Avenue  
Ocala, FL 34475

August 10, 2009  
Page: 1  
Client: 007013  
Matter: 001678  
Invoice #: 97682

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

## For Professional Services Rendered :

Date	Itemized Services	Atty	Hours
04/02/2009	Receipt and review of email from John Lippincott along with documents on service of the Adversarial Complaint in Bankruptcy Court.	SBA	0.3
04/02/2009	Reveiw of all documents filed in Bankruptcy case of Ms. Fluker.	SBA	1.4
04/08/2009	Emails to and from John Lippincott requesting any additional documents he may have in this case.	SBA	0.1
04/10/2009	Call to Christine Mast to discuss whether to attempt to remove all pending cases to Bankruptcy Court.	SBA	0.1
04/10/2009	Research on whether all Fluker matters may be removed to Bankruptcy Court and timing for same.	SBA	2.7
04/14/2009	Letter to Plaintiffs with Order setting status conference.	SBA	0.2
04/24/2009	Receipt and review of email from Melissa Pierson requesting an update on this case.	SBA	0.1
04/27/2009	Receipt and review of Amended Notice of Status Conference.	SBA	0.2
04/28/2009	Lengthy email to Melissa Pierson with status of case and recommendations for future handling.	SBA	0.4
05/01/2009	Call to Judge's law clerk in Superior Court action to determine whether status conference could be continued from the docket on Monday due to bankruptcy of Ms. Fluker.	SBA	0.1
05/01/2009	Email to Clerk requesting case be continued due to Plaintiff's bankruptcy issues, review of response to same.	SBA	0.3
05/01/2009	Review of Motion to Dismiss Chapter 11 Bankruptcy filed by U.S. Trustee, call to U.S. Trustee regarding same.	SBA	1.3

Scanned: 6/14/2010 12:26:41 PM

August 10, 2009  
Page: 2  
Client: 007013  
Matter: 001678  
Invoice # : 97682

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

Date	Itemized Services	Atty	Hours
05/02/2009	Prepare for status conference.	SBA	1.8
05/02/2009	Review of electronic docket on Fluker's Bankruptcy case.	SBA	0.4
05/03/2009	Travel to Atlanta to attend status conference as ordered by the Judge.	SBA	4.2
05/04/2009	Attend status conference as ordered by the judge and travel back from Atlanta.	SBA	6.9
05/04/2009	Calls to John Lippincott and David Adams regarding status conference.	SBA	0.4
05/08/2009	Receipt and review of Order Staying Case due to Plaintiff's bankruptcy action.	SBA	0.2
05/15/2009	Review of Docket on Fluker's Objection to Trustee's Motion to Dismiss, call the U.S. Trustee to determine status on motion and other issues in the Chapter 11 Bankruptcy and the Aversary Proceeding.	SBA	0.3
05/15/2009	Called by U. S. Bankruptcy Trustee to advise on the status of Ms. Fluker's case.	SBA	0.2
05/26/2009	Email from John Lippincott regarding origination file on loan.	SBA	0.1
05/26/2009	Email from John Lippincott with attached documentation regarding service of bankruptcy documents on Taylor, Bean.	SBA	0.5
06/08/2009	Analyze Motion to Dismiss filed by First Franklin.	SBA	0.8
06/09/2009	Emails to and from Karen Barnard at Taylor, Bean regarding status of case and likely outcome.	SBA	0.5
06/15/2009	Call from Bankruptcy Trustee to advise me that his Motion to Dismiss Fluker's Bankruptcy was granted, memo to file with details of our conversation.	SBA	0.7
06/15/2009	Pull order dismissing Bankruptcy action from Pacer and review of same.	SBA	0.5
06/16/2009	Email to Christine Mast with Order dismissing the Fluker case and that the US Trustee was kind enough to call and let me know the Motion to Dismiss was granted.	SBA	0.1

Scanned: 6/14/2010-12:26:42 PM

August 10, 2009

Page: 3

Client: 007013

Matter: 001678

Invoice # : 97682

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

Date	Itemized Services	Atty	Hours
06/19/2009	Lengthy email to Barbara Ponder and John Lippincott with Order dismissing Ms. Fluker's Adversary Proceeding and that the Chapter 11 Proceeding has been dismissed also. We now must deal with the appeal of our eviction and my plan to get a hearing on the State Court case and if we are successful the Superior Court case will go away.	SBA	0.2
07/07/2009	Review of docket on Chapter 11 Bankruptcy filing by Fluker.	SBA	0.5
07/20/2009	Lengthy status update posted on Sergenti Tracker.	SBA	0.7
07/31/2009	Review electronic docket for updates on Chapter 11 action and adversary action.	SBA	0.3
Total Hours			26.5

Fees Summary :

			Hours	Rate	Amount
SBA	Sarah B. Akins	PARTNER	26.5	\$250.00	<u>\$6,625.00</u>
Total Fees					\$6,625.00

	Disbursements	Amount
03/24/2009	Sarah B. Akins - Mileage to/from Status Conference 3/20/09 495 miles @.55/mile	\$272.25
03/26/2009	United Parcel Service - Overnight to Fulton County Superior Court	\$14.21
Total Expenses		<u>\$286.46</u>

August 10, 2009  
Page: 4  
Client: 007013  
Matter: 001678  
Invoice # : 97682

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

Current Charges	\$6,911.46
Previous Balance	\$0.00
Less Payments Received	\$0.00
<b>Total Amount Now Due</b>	<b>\$6,911.46</b>

*Please Pay by Invoice Number*

# ELLIS, PAINTER, RATTERREE & ADAMS LLP

ATTORNEYS AT LAW  
POST OFFICE BOX 9946  
SAVANNAH, GEORGIA 31412

TELEPHONE: (912) 233-9700  
FAX: (912) 233-2281  
FED ID 58-1788955

Taylor Bean & Whitaker Mortgage  
Attention: Karen Barnard via Serengeti  
1417 North Magnolia Avenue  
Ocala, FL 34475

October 14, 2009  
Page: 1  
Client: 007013  
Matter: 001678  
Invoice #: 100919

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

For Professional Services Rendered :

Date	Itemized Services	Atty	Hours
01/02/2009	Call with Christine Mast regarding the facts of case and defense to Complaint.	SBA	0.3
01/02/2009	Review of all file materials.	SBA	1.2
01/03/2009	Email to John Lippincott regarding filing and serving of Complaint, call to him regarding same.	SBA	0.3
01/05/2009	Emails to and from John Lippincott regarding service of Complaint on Taylor, Bean & Whitaker, review answer of EPRA, exchange emails with Christine Mast, attorney for EPRA to determine whether TBW would cooperate and give affidavit to support EPRA motion for summary judgment, review of research on prior pending suit defense to this matter.	SBA	1.0
01/05/2009	Research on prior pending suit, real party in interest and standing defenses to determine whether to file a Motion to Dismiss on those grounds.	SBA	2.5
01/05/2009	Email to John Lippincott asking if he would like me to go ahead and file an Answer prior to service being perfected.	SBA	0.1
01/06/2009	Emails to and from Christine Mast regarding the Motion to Dismiss being filed.	SBA	0.1
01/06/2009	Emails to and from Christine Mast regarding the dispossessory file.	SBA	0.1
01/06/2009	Emails to and from John Lippincott regarding defenses to suit and how to proceed with litigation.	SBA	0.3
01/20/2009	Emails to and from Karen Barnard regarding use of Sargnet Tracker for updates on case.	SBA	0.2

Sargnet: 6/14/2010 12:26:44 PM



October 14, 2009

Page: 2

Client: 007013

Matter: 001678

Invoice # : 100919

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

Date	Itemized Services	Atty	Hours
03/18/2009	Receipt and review of Notice of Status Conference.	SBA	0.2
03/20/2009	Prepare Answer (1.4) and letter to Clerk filing same (.2).	SBA	1.6
03/20/2009	Email to John with draft answer on behalf of TBW.	SBA	0.2
03/23/2009	Travel to and from Atlanta to attend status conference in Fulton County Superior Court.	SBA	10.3
03/23/2009	Emails to and from my partner David Adams regarding Mr. Fluker's bankruptcy.	SBA	0.2
03/25/2009	Email to Marla Campbell requesting copy of Motion to Stay.	SBA	0.1
03/25/2009	Post update on litigation on Sergenti Tracker.	SBA	0.4
03/26/2009	Receipt and review of co-defendant's Motion and Stay Discovery and Brief in Support.	SBA	0.4
03/31/2009	Receipt and review of Notice of Status Conference.	SBA	0.2
		Total Hours	19.7

Fees Summary :

			Hours	Rate	Amount
SBA	Sarah B. Akins	PARTNER	19.7	\$250.00	<u>\$4,925.00</u>
				Total Fees	\$4,925.00

	Disbursements	Amount
08/10/2009	Sarah B. Akins - Mileage to/from Atlanta for status conference 495 miles @ .55/mile	\$272.25
		<u>Total Expenses</u> \$272.25

October 14, 2009

Page: 3

Client: 007013

Matter: 001678

Invoice # : 100919

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

Current Charges	\$5,197.25
Previous Balance	\$6,911.46
Less Payments Received	\$0.00
<b>Total Amount Now Due</b>	<b>\$12,108.71</b>

*Please Pay by Invoice Number*

# ELLIS, PAINTER, RATTERREE & ADAMS LLP

ATTORNEYS AT LAW  
POST OFFICE BOX 9946  
SAVANNAH, GEORGIA 31412

TELEPHONE: (912) 233-9700  
FAX: (912) 233-2281  
FED ID 58-1788955

Taylor Bean & Whitaker Mortgage  
Attention: Karen Barnard via Serengeti  
1417 North Magnolia Avenue  
Ocala, FL 34475

April 21, 2010  
Page: 1  
Client: 007013  
Matter: 001678  
Invoice #: 105454

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

For Professional Services Rendered :

Date	Itemized Services	Atty	Hours
02/11/2010	Began reviewing file in preparation for attending status conference next Monday.	PC	0.4
02/12/2010	Review of Taylor, Bean and Whitaker's bankruptcy filing and file for instant case in preparation for attending mandatory case status conference on Monday.	PC	0.8
02/14/2010	Travel to Atlanta to attend mandatory case status conference.	PC	4.2
02/14/2010	Finished reviewing file in advance of attending mandatory case status conference.	PC	0.3
02/15/2010	Return trip to Savannah from mandatory case status conference.	PC	4.1
02/15/2010	Attended mandatory case status conference.	PC	2.1
02/15/2010	Researched and drafted Motion to Dismiss.	PC	0.9
02/16/2010	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding motion to dismiss.	PC	0.4
02/16/2010	Correspondence with clerk's office and review of online filing information to verify Plaintiffs did not file a notice of change of address.	PC	0.4
02/16/2010	Drafted and revised motion to dismiss.	PC	2.1
02/24/2010	Receipt and review of correspondence regarding filing of Motion to Dismiss.	PC	0.1
03/25/2010	Receipt and review of Final Order of Dismissal for Want of Prosecution.	SBA	0.2

Scanned: 6/14/2010-12:26:46 PM  
Total Hours 16.0

April 21, 2010  
Page: 2  
Client: 007013  
Matter: 001678  
Invoice # : 105454

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

Fees Summary :				Hours	Rate	Amount
SBA	Sarah B. Akins	PARTNER	0.2	\$250.00	\$50.00	
PC	Patrick Connell	ASSOCIATE	15.8	\$140.00	<u>\$2,212.00</u>	
Total Fees					\$2,262.00	

Disbursements			Amount
02/17/2010	Patrick Connell - Lodging	Omni Hotel Atlanta 2/14-2/15 for status conference	\$316.35
02/17/2010	Patrick Connell - Parking	for status conference 2/15/10 City of Atlanta	\$6.00
02/17/2010	Patrick Connell - Mileage to/from Atlanta Ga	for status conference 2/14 to 2/15 - 502 miles @.50/mile	\$251.00
03/01/2010	Photocopies (60 @ \$0.06)		\$3.60
03/15/2010	United Parcel Service - Overnight	to Fulton County Superior Court	\$15.92
03/15/2010	United Parcel Service - Overnight	to Fulton County Superior Court - The Honorable Ural D. Glanville	\$15.92
Total Expenses			<u>\$608.79</u>

April 21, 2010

Page: 3

Client: 007013

Matter: 001678

Invoice # : 105454

RE: Kai Fluker & Hussain Kareem v. Taylor Bean & EPRA

---

Current Charges	\$2,870.79
Previous Balance	\$12,108.71
Less Payments Received	\$0.00
<b>Total Amount Now Due</b>	<b>\$14,979.50</b>

*Please Pay by Invoice Number*