

Exhibit A

Matter ID 056561.000032 - Fees
 Matter Name: Taylor Bean & Whitaker Bankruptcy
 Client: Fidelity National Information Services, Inc.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26265930	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/23/2009	0.50	650.00	325.00	Review information on Taylor Bean case (.3); update client regarding same (.2).
12/29/2009	26265931	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/24/2009	0.50	650.00	325.00	Communicate with client on Taylor Bean case filing (.2); review strategy regarding same (.3).
12/29/2009	25989005	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/01/2009	0.70	650.00	455.00	Review status of case and review first filings concerning creditors (.3); receive and review update on U.S. Trustee action (.2); prepare email to U.S. Trustee and review response (.2).
12/29/2009	25997101	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/03/2009	1.00	650.00	650.00	Telephone conference with Chief Restructuring Officer regarding case and LPS claims (.3); prepare email to Mr. Luria regarding same (.2); receive and review email from client and respond (.2); prepare form for client and provide to Ms. Newman (.3).
12/29/2009	25989032	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/04/2009	0.20	650.00	130.00	Prepare email to Chair on case update and review response.
12/29/2009	25989044	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/05/2009	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive update on case.
12/29/2009	25997109	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/08/2009	0.70	650.00	455.00	Review current status of case and filings (.2); emails to and from client on claims and action to take (.2); telephone conference with Debtor's counsel on LPS claim and case status (.3).
12/29/2009	26019292	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	09/09/2009	0.20	180.00	36.00	Analyze case filings.
12/29/2009	26017977	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/09/2009	1.70	650.00	1,105.00	Prepare email to U.S. Trustee regarding Committee (.2); finalize form, provide to client, review returned form and provide to U.S. Trustee with cover letter explaining nature of claim (.4); telephone conferences with Debtors' counsel throughout day concerning Committee, LPS claims and action needed in case (.3); receive and review emails from Debtor's counsel regarding same and respond (.3); receive and review information on stakeholder meeting (.2); discuss with Mr. Blain importance of meeting and protecting claims of unsecured creditors (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26017987	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/10/2009	2.20	650.00	1,430.00	Receive and review inquiry from Debtors' attorney on status of Committee and upcoming stakeholder meeting and respond (.2); review materials on potential resolution on temporary basis with FDIC in light of impact on unsecured creditors, discuss with various constituencies, prepare for and attend stakeholder meeting in Jacksonville (8.0).
12/29/2009	26128164	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/10/2009	3.00	650.00	1,950.00	Prepare for and attend stakeholder meeting in Jacksonville.
12/29/2009	26018681	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/11/2009	6.80	650.00	4,420.00	Prepare email to U.S. Trustee on Committee formation status and review response (.2); review case activity regarding same (.2); receive and review Notice of Appointment of Official Committee (.2); prepare for and participate on hearing regarding various matters including FDIC stipulation and present Committee position because no counsel had been selected by Committee prior to the hearing, which hearing was delayed by court (3.0); follow up emails with client concerning Committee appointment (.3); review strategy regarding appointment and selecting counsel (.3); advise client on action to take and follow up regarding same (.2); prepare emails to Committee members to foster quicker action by Committee and to further demonstrate the importance of LPS being chair (.4); receive and review email from Committee members and update client (.3); prepare for and participate on initial Committee meeting to begin counsel formation process (1.2); receive and review emails and letters from U.S. Trustee on Committee (.2); receive and review emails from Chief Restructuring Officer and respond (.3).
12/29/2009	26012647	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/12/2009	0.50	650.00	325.00	Review latest developments in case, communicate with counsel regarding same and work on strategy for recovery.
12/29/2009	26012652	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/13/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review Motion to Assume Certain Contracts (.2); prepare email to Chair on meeting (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26031557	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/14/2009	4.20	650.00	2,730.00	Receive and review email from U.S. Trustee regarding participating on call and respond (.2); telephone conference with Chair on chairing Committee and other case matters (.2); numerous communications with various prospective counsel on formation interviews, and provide information to Committee members (.6); prepare for and participate on conference call with U.S. Trustee on Committee and participate on Committee call following to select Chair and determine procedure for counsel (1.0); prepare for and participate on Committee call for interviews of counsel (2.0); follow up call with Chair regarding same (.2).
12/29/2009	26031098	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/15/2009	5.60	650.00	3,640.00	Receive and review inquiry from creditor on case (.2); receive and review emails from Committee counsel and respond (.2); telephone conference with Committee counsel on action to take and Committee call (.2); emails to Chair on case, conference call, and action to take (.2); analyze proposed order and stipulation with FDIC, and provide analysis to Chair (.8); receive and review email from Debtor's counsel on case (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Blain regarding Committee action and LPS claim (.3); communicate with Committee counsel on meeting and agenda (.2); receive and review agenda and discussion points from Committee counsel (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Luria on meeting and respond (.2); receive and review email from Committee counsel on by-laws and respond (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (2.3); prepare email to U.S. Trustee on Committee (.2); respond to Committee counsel inquiries (.2).
12/29/2009	26037354	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/16/2009	1.10	650.00	715.00	Receive and review email from CRO on flow of confidential information and respond to same (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same and review response (.2); prepare agreement for CRO regarding release of information (.2); begin review of confidential information (.4); receive and review email from U.S. Trustee on case (.1).
12/29/2009	26051271	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	09/17/2009	0.20	180.00	36.00	Analyze case matters.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26031111	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/17/2009	4.10	650.00	2,665.00	Receive and review email from Committee counsel on Bylaws and respond (.2); receive and review inquiry from Committee counsel on meeting and respond (.2); analyze and comment on proposed Stipulation with FDIC, and provide to Committee counsel (.5); prepare email to Chair regarding same and review response (.2); begin review of confidential documents on company (.3); receive and review revised Limited Objection draft (.2); emails to and from CRO on case (.2); receive and review inquiry from U.S. Trustee on certain case matters (.2); prepare email to Mr. Singerman regarding same and review responses (.2); prepare email to Chair on Committee meeting and review response (.2); receive and review agenda for Committee call (.2); prepare for and attend Committee meeting conference call on various matters (1.3); follow up email with Committee counsel regarding Committee request and review response (.2).
12/29/2009	26037363	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/18/2009	2.30	650.00	1,495.00	Receive and review update from Committee counsel on status of FDIC stipulation and respond (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on hearing matters and respond (.2); prepare emails to Chair on hearing (.2); receive and review Interim Order on Cash Collateral and other filings (.3); prepare email to Chair regarding original cash collateral motion (.1); review summary of case activity (.2); receive and review information on By-laws (.9); prepare email to counsel regarding nondisclosure (.2).
12/29/2009	26037368	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/20/2009	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review notices of continued hearings on critical motions (.2); review case status and action needed for hearing (.4).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26060851	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/21/2009	4.20	650.00	2,730.00	Review report from Navigant (.4); prepare for and participate on Committee call prior to hearing (.5); telephone conference with Chair regarding same (.2); analyze and comment on Berger Singerman Application to Employ (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel on hearing and review response (.2); review matters set for hearing (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same and review response (.2); analyze and comment on Paul Singerman Declaration (.3); telephone conference with Kris Augnst regarding same (.2); prepare for and participate on hearing by Court Call (1.0); emails to and from Committee counsel on application, declaration and related matters (.3); receive and review Stipulation of Settlement By and Between Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corp. and Debtor Regarding Stay Relief and Transfer of Loan Servicing (.2); update Chair regarding same (.1);
								receive and review Bank of America's Amended Motion for Reconsideration of Agreed Order Approving Procedure for Transfer of Residential Consumer Loan Mortgage Portfolios to U.S. Bank National Association, as Trustee, Manufacturers and Traders Trust Co., and Bayview Loan Servicing (.2).
12/29/2009	26060866	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/22/2009	2.40	650.00	1,560.00	Prepare email to Chair on obtaining confidential report and review response (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman on By-laws and review response (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Singerman on application and respond (.2); receive and review Notices of Hearing on matters (.2); receive and review email from potential purchaser of REO and respond (.2); update Chair regarding same and review response (.2); receive and review Motion to Compel Debtor to Assume or Reject Nationwide Agreement (.2); receive and review Limited Joinder in Support of Wells Fargo (.2); receive and review Debtor's Response to Motion of Sovereign (.2); receive and review Debtor's Response to Natxis (.2); analyze and comment on protocol procedures for creditors (.4).
12/29/2009	26060873	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/23/2009	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review email from Committee counsel on case and respond (.2); receive and review update on By-laws (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26060881	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/24/2009	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review email from Committee counsel on case matters and respond.
12/29/2009	26060892	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/25/2009	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review Stipulation between Debtor and FHLMC resolving certain issues (.2); receive and review Assured Guaranty's Objection to Use of Cash Collateral (.2); receive and review Assured Guaranty's Objection to FDIC/TBW Stipulation (.3); receive and review email from Committee counsel on case (.1).
12/29/2009	26086335	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/26/2009	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review weekend filings in TBW in advance of meeting.
12/29/2009	26086338	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/27/2009	0.80	650.00	520.00	Review recent case activity and background information from Committee counsel (.2); receive and review email from Committee counsel regarding upcoming matters and respond (.2); receive and review email from CRO on case and respond (.2); receive and review email from Chair on case, meeting and other issues and respond (.2).
12/29/2009	26088251	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/28/2009	1.70	650.00	1,105.00	Telephone conference with Chair regarding Section 341 meeting, upcoming matters and meeting with Mr. Luria (.2); review case status and information needed for Meeting of Creditors (.4); telephone conference with Chair on Navigant materials and other case matters (.1); follow up call with Chair regarding Navigant report on various case matters (.5); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on overall status and strategy, and Navigant retention (.5).
12/29/2009	26080881	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/29/2009	5.70	650.00	3,705.00	Prepare email to Chair on update from CRO and meeting (.2); meet with Chair on case status and strategy (1.0); prepare for and attend meeting with Mr. Luria on case, action to taken and Navigant fees (1.0); prepare for and attend Meeting of Creditors with Chair (1.5); telephone conference with Mr. Luria regarding follow-up on Navigant fees (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (1.7).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26087153	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/30/2009	1.80	650.00	1,170.00	Prepare email to CRO on case information and review response (.2); receive and review Debtor's Response to Wells Fargo's Motion for Relief from Stay and to Prohibit Use of Funds (.2); receive and review Debtor's Response to Bank of America's Emergency Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2); receive and review Debtor's Response to FHLMC's Emergency Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on case matters (.5); receive and review update from Committee counsel on various matters (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel and Chair regarding same (.3).
12/29/2009	26109404	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/01/2009	1.40	650.00	910.00	Review information requested by Committee counsel and respond (.2); prepare language for Chair regarding Navigant (.3); telephone conference with Committee counsel on various matters (.2); receive and review email from Committee counsel regarding same and respond (.2); receive and review email from Committee member and respond (.2); receive and review follow up email from Mr. Singerman and respond (.2); prepare follow up email to Chair regarding Navigant (.1).
12/29/2009	26108553	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/02/2009	2.20	650.00	1,430.00	Receive and review Limited Objection of Sovereign Bank to Certain Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay (.2); receive and review Deutsche Bank Motion for 2004 Examination of Virtually all Debtors parties and personnel (.3); receive and review Response of U.S. Bank to various Stay Relief Motions (.2); receive and review Debtor's email on cash collateral order (.2); telephone conference with Chair on Committee update, Navigant and other matters (.3); receive and review emails from and to Committee counsel, and respond (.2); prepare mail to Mr. Chikowski on case and review response (.2); receive and review Order Scheduling Hearing on Objection to FDIC Stipulation (.2); receive and review Order Granting RBC's Motion on Stay (.2); receive and review Order Granting Extension to File Schedules (.2).
12/29/2009	26108557	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/03/2009	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review email from Committee counsel on update and respond to same (.2); review recent filings (.2).
12/29/2009	26108559	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/04/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review email from Committee counsel updating Navigant situation (.2); prepare email to Mr. Singerman regarding action to take (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26112927	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/05/2009	1.50	650.00	975.00	Receive and review Order Approving Stipulation with FDIC (.2); receive and review Order Granting Amended and Restated Emergency Motion on Wages and review Emergency Motion regarding same (.3); receive and review Orders Continuing Hearings on Stay Motions (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman on Committee protocol and review response (.2); analyze Navigant September fees and provide report to Committee counsel (.6).
12/29/2009	26128179	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/06/2009	2.70	650.00	1,755.00	Receive and review Wells Fargo Stay Relief Motion (.2); receive and review docket, agenda and materials from Berger Singerman on case for meeting (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.8); telephone conferences with Chair on potential buyer of REO, related matters and other case matters (.3); emails to and from Mr. Singerman on case matters (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on case update (.7); receive and review emails from Mr. Luria regarding same (.2).
12/29/2009	26131344	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/07/2009	1.10	650.00	715.00	Receive and review Response of Bank of America's Amended Motion for Reconsideration (.2); receive and review emails from committee counsel on various matters and respond (.3); prepare email to Chair on hearing and review response (.2); receive and review update on hearing matters (.2); review Wells Fargo stipulation (.2).
12/29/2009	26131345	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/07/2009	2.20	650.00	1,430.00	Telephone conference with Chair on update from Navigant on case matters (.2); review materials on sale initiatives (.4); receive and review email from Committee counsel on certain filings (.2); comment on objection to DB discovery and provide to Committee counsel (.4); participate on conference call with Committee counsel, Navigant and Chair regarding sale process (.5); follow up telephone conference with Chair regarding same (.1); receive and review Second Order on Cash collateral (.2); receive and review Order continuing hearing on various stay relief motions (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26131360	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/08/2009	4.10	650.00	2,665.00	Receive and review Debtor's Motion for Protective Order regarding Wells Fargo (.2); receive and review Objection of Freddie Mac on abandonment (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1); prepare for and attend hearing on various matters (3.0); receive and review Sovereign Objection to Cash Collateral (.2); analyze Navigant fee statement for week ending 9/17/09 (.3); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1).
12/29/2009	26131373	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/09/2009	1.20	650.00	780.00	Telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on case update (.2); receive and review Freddie Mac's Renewed Objection to Cash Collateral (.2); receive and review Wells Fargo's Objection to Use of Cash Collateral (.2); receive and review Bank of America's Objection to Use of Cash Collateral (.2); receive and review Sovereign's Objection to Use of Cash Collateral (.2); receive and review Debtor's Motion to Sell Non-Residential Property (.2).
12/29/2009	26146982	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/11/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review recent electronic filings in advance of Committee meeting.
12/29/2009	26169009	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	10/14/2009	0.20	180.00	36.00	Analyze case pleadings.
12/29/2009	26159211	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/14/2009	0.90	650.00	585.00	Telephone conference with creditor regarding TBW status (.1); receive and review emails from Committee counsel on hearing and respond (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on case matters (.3); prepare email to Berger Singerman on hearing agenda and review response (.2).
12/29/2009	26149122	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/15/2009	5.50	650.00	3,575.00	Receive and review agenda matters for hearing (.2); review background on various matters and information on case (.2); prepare update report for Chair on Committee meeting and conversations with Committee counsel (.3); receive and review Dell's Objection to Abandonment (.2); receive and review Tennessee's Objection to Abandonment (.2); email to and from Committee counsel on various pending matters (.3); receive and review Debtor's Motion to Establish Interim Compensation Procedures (.2); receive and review Debtor's Motion to Abandon Property (.2); receive and review Supplement to Abandonment (.2); receive and review Notices of Appeal of FDIC Stipulation by Bank of America (.2); prepare for and participate in hearing on various matters including filings by certain parties negatively impacting case (3.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26159223	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/16/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review email from Chair on Navigant expenses and respond to same (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel on Navigant (.1).
12/29/2009	26196814	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/17/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review task list from Committee counsel, and comment on same.
12/29/2009	26218174	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/17/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Analyze subsequent revisions to action items for Committee counsel and comment on same.
12/29/2009	26170134	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/19/2009	1.00	650.00	650.00	Receive and review Supplemental Affidavit of Neil Luria (.2); analyze and comment on five sets of Committee minutes (.7); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.1).
12/29/2009	26180080	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/20/2009	1.90	650.00	1,235.00	Receive and review agenda for Committee meeting (.2); review background materials for meeting (.4); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (1.0); review follow up action regarding same (.3).
12/29/2009	26187907	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/21/2009	0.90	650.00	585.00	Review memorandum on pending matters from Committee counsel (.2); receive and review Notices of Hearings on DIP and Sale Motions (.2); receive and review Orders Granting Appeal Extension on Bank of America (.2); review information on Navigant expenses and provide to Chair (.3).
12/29/2009	26192567	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	10/22/2009	0.20	180.00	36.00	Analyze case pleadings impacting LPS.
12/29/2009	26187919	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/23/2009	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review Debtor's Amended Monthly Report (.2); receive and review update from Committee counsel on case (.3).
12/29/2009	26196821	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/26/2009	2.30	650.00	1,495.00	Review latest information on Meeting of Creditors and update Chair (.2); receive and review email from Chair regarding same (.1); analyze and summarize key points from sale motion and provide to Chair (.7); analyze and summarize key points from DIP motion and provide to Chair (.7); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on case developments (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman regarding action needed by Committee, upcoming meeting and hearing matters (.3).
12/29/2009	26196829	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/27/2009	2.00	650.00	1,300.00	Review background material from prior meetings (.3); receive and review agenda for Committee meeting and discuss with counsel (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (1.2); receive and review email update from Committee counsel regarding same (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/29/2009	26202962	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/28/2009	1.30	650.00	845.00	Review recent electronic filing case activity (.2); telephone conference with Chair on case update (.2); analyze case management summary from Debtor and develop action item list for monitoring of case (.9).
12/29/2009	26218190	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/30/2009	1.10	650.00	715.00	Receive and review Debtor's Motion to Compromise with Ocala (.2); receive and review multiple notices for matters (.2); receive and review Motion to Enter into Servicing Agreement with Selene (.2); receive and review Motion to Reject Centurion Agreement (.2); review document and prepare email to Chair on Reconciliation Report (.3).
01/21/2010	26236046	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/01/2009	0.40	650.00	260.00	Prepare email to Committee counsel on pending matters and review response (.2); review recent filings (.2).
01/21/2010	26236054	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/02/2009	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review emails from Committee counsel on case and respond (.3); review filings regarding hearing (.2).
01/21/2010	26265936	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/03/2009	2.00	650.00	1,300.00	Receive and review emails from Committee counsel on case matters and respond (.3); review updated task list (.2); review summaries of pending matters (.2); receive and review Agenda and comment on same (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.9); receive and review Limited Objections by Sovereign on DIP (.2).
01/21/2010	26236060	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/04/2009	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Analyze Debtor Motion for Turnover of Certain Assets regarding FDIC (.3); analyze Debtor's Motion regarding Use of Cash Collateral (.3); review court's calendar for matters scheduled for hearing (.2); analyze Motion of FHLMC for Relief from Stay (.3); review preparation for hearing (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman regarding same (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
01/21/2010	26236066	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/05/2009	7.90	650.00	5,135.00	Analyze Reconciliation Report (.9); prepare email to Chair on meeting with CRO and Committee counsel on case and hearing matters, and review response (.2); meet with CRO, Committee counsel, and other professionals regarding potential arguments and strategy (.8); review updated court calendar regarding hearing on various matters (.2); analyze FDIC's Limited Objection on Post Petition Financing (.3); receive and review Debtor's Emergency Motion for Turnover (.2); analyze Debtor's Latest Cash Collateral Budget (.2); prepare for and attend hearing on bidding procedures, post petition financing, and numerous other matters (4.6); meet with various counsel concerning orders regarding approval (.5).
01/21/2010	26246396	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/06/2009	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Notices on sale matters.
01/21/2010	26277742	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/10/2009	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Receive and review pleadings summary from Committee counsel in preparation for November 13 hearing (.2); receive and review summary memorandum on November 5 hearing matters (.2); receive and review agenda for Committee meeting (.2); review recent electronic filings in case (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.8).
01/21/2010	26278303	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/11/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review background information and revise summary for Chair.
01/21/2010	26302406	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	11/12/2009	0.20	180.00	36.00	Analyze pleadings impacting case.
01/21/2010	26279526	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/12/2009	0.70	650.00	455.00	Telephone conference with Mr. Luria (CRO) on case matters and action to take (.2); review status of case and update Chair (.1); receive and review Order Rejecting Centurion Agreement (.2); receive and review Order Approving Interim Servicing (.2).
01/21/2010	26284377	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/13/2009	1.20	650.00	780.00	Receive and review Final Order Authorizing Use of Cash Collateral (.2); receive and review Order on Nationwide Title Motion for Relief from Stay (.2); receive and review Final Order on Navigant (.2); receive and review Debtor's Response and Objection to First American Title Motion for Relief from Stay (.2); receive and review Interim Compensation Order (.2); receive and review Order Approving Bidding Procedures and Setting Auction (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
01/21/2010	26284383	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/14/2009	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review action needed on DIP order (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same (.2).
01/21/2010	26354774	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/15/2009	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review status of financing order (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same and review response (.2).
01/21/2010	26310212	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/16/2009	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Order on Post Petition Financing (.2); receive and review Notice of Hearing on FDIC and Freddie lien issue (.2).
01/21/2010	26310221	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/17/2009	1.80	650.00	1,170.00	Receive and review email from Mr. Luria on status and respond (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel on case (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on Colonial Bank, FDIC, Freddie and action needed in case (.2); review Navigant fee expense information and prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same, and review response (.3); receive and review Agenda for Committee call (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding meeting (.1); prepare for and participate on Committee conference call (.7).
01/21/2010	26310224	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/18/2009	1.10	650.00	715.00	Update Chair on Mr. Luria conversation (.1); receive and review email from Committee counsel on FDIC and Freddie action and respond to same (.2); prepare email to CRO regarding same and review response (.2); receive and review Stipulation Regarding Inspection Period Under REO Bulk Sale (.2); receive and review Modification of Stipulation of TBW and FDIC on Reconciliation (.2); receive and review Notice of Bulk Sale Bidding Procedures and related materials (.2).
01/21/2010	26338778	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	11/19/2009	0.20	180.00	36.00	Analyze pleadings impacting case.
01/21/2010	26318186	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/19/2009	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review updates on FDIC and Freddie (.2); prepare email to CRO and Committee counsel regarding same and review responses (.2); receive and review Notice of Canceled Hearing (.2).
01/21/2010	26318198	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/20/2009	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review memo on hearing from Committee counsel.
01/21/2010	26341070	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/23/2009	0.10	650.00	65.00	Review status of matter and action needed, and update Chair regarding same.
01/21/2010	26341071	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/23/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review inquiry from Committee counsel on matters and respond (.2); review information from Chair regarding same (.1).
01/21/2010	26341082	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/24/2009	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review Debtor's Monthly Financial Report (.3); receive and review Navigant Report on fees (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
01/21/2010	26345630	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/25/2009	0.10	650.00	65.00	Prepare email to Committee counsel regarding Navigant.
01/21/2010	26354785	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/30/2009	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review update from Committee counsel on Navigant and respond.
01/22/2010	26367203	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/01/2009	1.90	650.00	1,235.00	Review and comment on prior meeting minutes (.2); review report from prior hearings (.2); review agenda and materials for meeting (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (1.2).
01/22/2010	26389266	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	12/02/2009	0.30	180.00	54.00	Analyze pleadings impacting case.
01/22/2010	26374648	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/03/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review Agenda for hearing matters, and review strategy regarding same.
01/22/2010	26374657	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/04/2009	1.20	650.00	780.00	Receive and review two Bank of America Designation of Records and Issues on appeals, and Orders regarding same (.2); receive and review Order Approving Compromise on City of Ocala (.2); receive and review Stipulation on Servicing with BB&T and Motion to Approve regarding same (.2); analyze 11/16 Navigant statements for TBW (.5); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same (.1).
01/22/2010	26374664	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/05/2009	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Navigant expense detail for November 20, and comment on same.
01/22/2010	26374667	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/06/2009	0.60	650.00	390.00	Analyze Navigant fee statements for Committee (.5); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same (.1).
01/22/2010	26391421	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/07/2009	0.50	650.00	325.00	Telephone conference with Mr. Luria on status of auction, bidding and related topics (.3); receive and review Debtor's Emergency Motion for Joint Administration (.2).
01/22/2010	26406376	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/08/2009	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Analyze report from Committee counsel on pending matters (.4); emails to and from Committee counsel regarding case matters (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); receive and review request from Chair, respond to same, and provide to Committee counsel (.3).
01/22/2010	26394590	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/10/2009	0.90	650.00	585.00	Telephone conference with Chair on auction and related matters (.2); emails from and to Committee counsel, CRO and Chair regarding auction (.2); provide update to Chair (.1); receive and review email from CRO on auction and respond (.2); review update on bidders (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
01/22/2010	26403720	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/11/2009	1.50	650.00	975.00	Receive and review update on bidding and provide to Chair (.2); analyze 12/1 meeting minutes and supporting documents (.4); analyze 12/8 meeting minutes and supporting documents (.4); receive and review Compulink request for administrative expense (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same (.1); receive and review information from U.S. Trustee on new Committee member and respond (.2).
01/22/2010	26405186	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/12/2009	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review email from Mr. Luria on status of action and outcome (.2); prepare email in response to same (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1).
01/22/2010	26448940	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/14/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review email from counsel on auction and respond (.2); update Chair on latest developments in case (.1).
01/22/2010	26420790	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/15/2009	2.60	650.00	1,690.00	Review agenda for Committee meeting (.2); receive and review email from Chair on case and respond (.2); receive and review memorandum on auction report (.2); receive and review Agenda for hearing (.2); receive and review Debtor's Report on REO Asset Sales (.2); receive and review U.S. Trustee's Notice of Appointment (.2); telephone conference with Dave Petro on Committee matters (.3); receive and review email from Mr. Petro regarding same and respond (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); review information from Committee counsel on case and new member bylaws (.2).
01/22/2010	26420802	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/16/2009	1.30	650.00	845.00	Analyze Navigant expense detail for 11/22 (.2); analyze Navigant fees through 12/6 (.4); analyze Navigant fees through 11/29 (.4); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same (.1); emails to and from Committee member on pending matters (.2).
01/22/2010	26448949	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/17/2009	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review email from Chair on case and respond (.2); receive and review email from CRO on auction recoveries and respond (.2); update Chair on recoveries (.1); review information on estate expense and prepare email to Committee regarding same (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
01/22/2010	26448960	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/18/2009	1.90	650.00	1,235.00	Review information from Committee counsel on mini-REO bulk sales and respond (.3); review information from other Committee members (.1); meet with Mr. Petro concerning Committee matters (1.5).
01/22/2010	26476683	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	12/22/2009	0.30	180.00	54.00	Analyze pleadings impacting case.
01/22/2010	26459784	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/22/2009	1.20	650.00	780.00	Receive and review Bank of America Motion to Join DB's 2004 Examination Request, and review hearing notice regarding same (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same (.2); receive and review Navigant fee report and expense detail (.5); receive and review Notice of Supplemental hearing on the Debtor's Sale (.2); review information from Committee counsel on DB action (.1).
01/22/2010	26463964	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/23/2009	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review case status and action needed by Committee (.1); prepare email to Committee counsel on Bank of America matter and review response (.2).
01/22/2010	26461635	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/27/2009	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review Navigant expense detail.
01/22/2010	26478084	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/28/2009	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Order Clarifying Rule 2004 Authorization and Deferring Ruling (.2); receive and review Debtor's Motion for Extension of Time to Assume or Reject Leases of Nonresidential Real Property (.2).
01/22/2010	26483376	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/29/2009	0.80	650.00	520.00	Analyze Navigant fee and expense statement (.4); review responses to inquiries on certain Navigant expenses (.3); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1).
01/22/2010	26476704	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	12/30/2009	0.30	180.00	54.00	Analyze case matters.
02/25/2010	26495352	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/05/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Receive and review agenda and summary materials for meeting (.3); prepare for and participate on conference call with Committee counsel (1.1); prepare email to Committee counsel on case and review response (.2).
02/25/2010	26518115	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/06/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on plan matters (.2); review action needed regarding same (.2); receive and review email from Chair on case and respond (.2).
02/25/2010	26535925	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	01/07/2010	0.20	180.00	36.00	Analyze pleadings impacting case.
02/25/2010	26540331	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/09/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Debtor's Notice of Proposed Agenda for Matters Scheduled for Hearing on January 8, 2010.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
02/25/2010	26518421	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/10/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review case status and information from Committee counsel (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1).
02/25/2010	26536902	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/11/2010	1.30	650.00	845.00	Analyze documents from FDIC regarding Colonial claims, and action needed regarding same (.4); receive and review email from Chair on meeting and respond (.2); telephone conference with Chair on case status, Miami meeting and other case matters (.4); emails to Committee counsel on case and Miami meeting (.3).
02/25/2010	26536910	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/12/2010	3.10	650.00	2,015.00	Receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on case and upcoming meetings, and respond (.3); receive and review agenda and amended agenda for Committee meetings (.2); receive and review litigation update memorandum and chart regarding same (.4); receive and review summary of recent filings and hearing outcome (.3); receive and review proposed motion on claims bar date and order regarding same (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (1.2); provide comments to Committee counsel on Claims Bar Date Motion (.2); receive and review update from Berger Singerman on claim motion filing and respond (.2).
02/25/2010	26540130	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/13/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review email from Chair on meeting and update Committee counsel regarding same.
02/25/2010	26547468	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/14/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review email from Committee counsel on meetings (.1); review electronic filings in case (.2).
02/25/2010	26547478	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/15/2010	1.90	650.00	1,235.00	Receive and review Debtors' Motion on Exclusivity and proposed Order regarding same (.3); receive and review Freddie Mac Motion to Join DB on 2004 Exam (.2); receive and review email from Committee counsel on meeting and respond (.2); analyze Navigant fee statement and expense report (.4); receive and review Notices of Hearing on various matters (.2); receive and review Order Denying Stay Relief (.2); receive and review information on Cash Collateral (.2); review comments regarding same (.2).
02/25/2010	26547486	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/17/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review email update from Berger Singerman (.2); review potential agenda for litigation meetings (.3); review strategy regarding same in preparation for call with Mr. Singerman (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
02/25/2010	26547491	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/18/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review McGuire Motion for Relief from Stay to pursue litigation (.2); review and comment on Debtors' Notice regarding cash collateral (.3); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on meeting (.1).
02/25/2010	26554733	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/19/2010	2.40	650.00	1,560.00	Receive and review Supplemental Order Approving Debtor's Sale of Certain REO (.2); receive and review subpoenae and related notices and requests regarding Bank of America/Deloitte (.3); receive and review Agenda for Committee meeting (.2); receive and review Objection to Bar Date Motion (.2); receive and review Amendment to Schedules E & F (.2); receive and review FDIC's Motion to Join Rule 2004 Exam (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); receive and review summary of litigation matters (.2); receive and review Debtor's Omnibus Notice to Reject Contracts (.2).
02/25/2010	26602691	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/20/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review email from Mr. Petro on case and respond (.2); receive and review Freddie Mac's Objection to Motion to Extend Exclusivity (.3).
02/25/2010	26609175	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/21/2010	1.10	650.00	715.00	Analysis of Freddie's Supplement to obligation to Debtor's Motion to Extend Exclusivity in light of prior filing (.4); prepare summary for Chair and provide recommendation (.2); analyze Navigant fees and expenses through 12/31 (.3); receive and review draft motion for approval of historical (.2).
02/25/2010	26609184	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/22/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Prepare email to Mr. Luria on case and review response (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Luria regarding case activity, recent filings, upcoming hearing and next week's meetings (.5); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.2); review outcome from hearing (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel on case and review response (.2); receive and review agenda for hearing and review Committee position on certain matters (.3).
02/25/2010	26644900	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/24/2010	0.90	650.00	585.00	Review materials in preparation for meeting (.7); prepare emails to Committee counsel and CRO regarding same (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
02/25/2010	26644909	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/25/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Receive and review notices of hearings on various matters (.2); emails to and from Committee counsel on case matters (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman regarding strategy (.5); prepare email to Chair on discussing matters and review response (.2); telephone conference with Chair regarding strategy meeting and action to take (.5).
02/25/2010	26644917	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/26/2010	9.00	650.00	5,850.00	Review materials for meeting (3); meet with Chair on pre-meeting preparations (1.0); prepare for and attend TBW litigation strategy meeting (5.0).
02/25/2010	26644927	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/27/2010	6.30	650.00	4,095.00	Meet with Chair prior to all hands meeting to discuss strategy and latest developments (.8); prepare for and attend second day of TBW strategy meetings with various constituencies (7.5)
02/25/2010	26644944	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/30/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Receive and review emails from Debtor on case (.2); receive and review REO Monthly financial report (.3); receive and review Home America Mortgage Financial Report (.3); receive and review Riorden Motion to Extend time (.2); analyze Navigant fees and expenses through January 17 (.4).
02/25/2010	26644949	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/31/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review information from Committee counsel on case.
03/31/2010	26683040	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/01/2010	1.10	650.00	715.00	Telephone conferences with Chair regarding case, committee work and related matters (.3); telephone conference with committee counsel regarding same and followup conference call on committee work (.3); review reports from Navigant on financial matters for updating Chair (.3); provide update to Chair on certain matters (.2).
03/31/2010	26683053	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/02/2010	2.00	650.00	1,300.00	Telephone conference with Mr. Luria on case matters (.1); receive and review agenda for meeting (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman on meeting matters and review response (.2); analyze report on filings, outcome of last hearing, and schedule for 2/5 hearing (.3); prepare for and participate on committee meeting conference call (1.0); emails to and from committee counsel regarding case matters (.2).
03/31/2010	26689586	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/03/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Objection to Protocol.
03/31/2010	26689622	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/05/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Review status and update Chair regarding same.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/31/2010	26689623	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/05/2010	2.10	650.00	1,365.00	Receive and review agenda for hearing (.2); prepare email to Committee Counsel on bar date motion in light of agenda (.1); review information from Berger Singerman on bar date (.1); review task lists and prepare email to Ms. Waller regarding same and review response (.3); receive and review Debtor's Motion for Protocol on Borrower matters (.3); analyze minutes from Committee meetings on 1/5, 1/12, 1/19 and 1/22/10 and provide comments (.6); review Debtor's lengthy amendment to Schedule F (.3); receive and review Order on exclusivity (.2).
03/31/2010	26689625	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/06/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman on various matters (.2); review recent filings (.2); review information on protocol motion and email Berger Singerman regarding same (.4); receive and review update from Berger Singerman on bar date motion (.2).
03/31/2010	26689631	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/07/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman on bar date.
03/31/2010	26689646	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/09/2010	2.80	650.00	1,820.00	Review background material from prior meeting and review agenda for 2/9 meeting (.4); review pleadings summary for meeting (.2); prepare for and participate on committee meeting conference call (.6); prepare report for Chair on meeting (.2); prepare summary for Chair regarding same (.2); receive and review Motion to Approve settlement and stipulation with Cantor (.2); review any additional information on Cantor settlement and prepare email to Berger Singerman (.4); receive and review responses from Berger Singerman on Cantor settlement (.2); receive and review email from Ms. Waller on meeting (.1); receive and review Motion for Committee Derivative Standing to bring actions (.3); prepare summary for Chair regarding same (.2)
03/31/2010	26689652	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/10/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Analyze additional filings' impact for Chair, and provide report regarding same (.2); receive and review email updates from Berger Singerman on Cantor and respond to same (.2); receive and review email from Chair on action to take in case and respond to same (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on case status and action needed (.2).
03/31/2010	26689659	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/11/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review electronic filings in case.
03/31/2010	26689670	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/12/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review recent filings in case (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on case (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/31/2010	26692966	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/14/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review, analyze and comment on 2/9 minutes (.2); review filings in case (.2).
03/31/2010	26721102	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/15/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on case matters and respond.
03/31/2010	26707705	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/16/2010	2.00	650.00	1,300.00	Review status of derivative standing Motion (.2); receive and review agenda for Committee meeting (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel on litigation and review response (.2); review upcoming hearing matters (.2); review information on certain filings from Committee (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee conference call with Committee counsel (.8); review filings (.2).
03/31/2010	26721112	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/17/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Analyze January Navigant fees and expenses, and Navigant monthly consultant fee report (.5); review status of matters for meeting (.3).
03/31/2010	26721119	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/18/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review update from Committee counsel on matters.
03/31/2010	26744358	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/18/2010	1.20	650.00	780.00	Receive and review Debtor's Notice of Proposed Agenda items for hearing (.2); receive and review Objection of FHLMC to Committee Derivative Standing (.2); receive and review Bank of America's Objection to Debtor's Protocol Motion (.2); receive and review Freddie's Objection to Debtor's Protocol Motion (.2); receive and review US Bank's Objection to Debtor's Protocol Motion (.2); receive and review Wells Fargo's Objection to Debtor's Protocol Motion (.2).
03/31/2010	26721131	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/20/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review outcome from hearing on derivative standing and update Chair regarding same.
03/31/2010	26757160	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/22/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review status of committee action (.2); communicate with committee counsel and review response (.2).
03/31/2010	26747680	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/23/2010	4.40	650.00	2,860.00	Review and comment on meeting minutes (.2); analyze litigation memo and recommendations (1.9); prepare email to Berger Singerman on litigation memo and information that would be helpful for the committee, and review response (.2); review spreadsheet on claims and potential recoveries (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (1.7); review action needed in light of Committee decision (.2).
03/31/2010	26746816	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/24/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Analyze Navigant 2/7 fees and detail of expenses (.4); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/31/2010	26757168	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/25/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review email from Berger Singerman on Navigant information and respond (.2); update Chair regarding same and on Committee action (.1); receive and review Navigant message on certain matters (.2).
04/29/2010	26779460	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/01/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Receive and review REO specialists Monthly report (.2); receive and review HAM Monthly Operating Report (.2); analyze TBW monthly operating report, and prepare inquiries to Committee counsel regarding same (.6); receive and review Order on Claims (.2); receive and review Motion for 2004 Exam of Freddie Mac (.2).
04/29/2010	26772610	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/02/2010	1.50	650.00	975.00	Receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on Committee business (.2); update Chair on case (.1); review agenda and pleading information (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); prepare email to Chair on meeting and follow up action (.2).
04/29/2010	26779475	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/03/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review Order Establishing Protocol (.2); receive and review Notice and documents regarding claims bar date (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.2).
04/29/2010	26801403	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/05/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Analyze and comment on Complaint against Bank of America, N.A. (.3); receive and review First Request For Production of Documents Directed To Defendant Banc of America Securities, LLC (.2); analyze and comment on Complaint for Turnover against Banc of America Securities, LLC (.3); receive and review First Request For Productions Directed To Defendant Bank of America, N.A. (.2); discuss with Mr. Singerman (.2); emails to and from Berger Singerman regarding same (.2).
04/29/2010	26801406	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/06/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Prepare emails to Berger Singerman on various matters and review responses (.3); discuss lawsuits and other matters with Mr. Singerman (.3).
04/29/2010	26803668	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/08/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Analyze and comment on Navigant fees and expenses through 2/14 (.4); review and comment on 2/23 meeting minutes and prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.3); review and comment on 2/16 meeting minutes and prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
04/29/2010	26813158	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/09/2010	1.20	650.00	780.00	Receive and review emails from Berger Singerman and review pleadings summary for meeting (.4); receive and review agenda for meeting (.1); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7).
04/29/2010	26813172	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/11/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Review activity in case.
04/29/2010	26813180	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/12/2010	2.20	650.00	1,430.00	Analyze and comment on complaint against Farkas and associates (.8); analyze and comment on document production requests against Farkas, Cody and entities (.4); receive and review Motion of Committee to Join Debtor's Motion for Examination (.2); analyze and comment on Due From Affiliates Complaints and initial Request for Production of documents for each (.6); review recent electronic filings (.2).
04/29/2010	26831118	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/13/2010	0.90	650.00	585.00	Receive and review email from J. Gassenheimer (Berger Singerman) on Affiliates Complaints and Initial Request for Production of Documents and respond (.9).
04/29/2010	26831127	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/15/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review email from Committee Counsel regarding Navigant meeting and respond (.2); receive and review email from Chair and other committee members regarding same (.2); review recent electronic filings (.2); review information on lawsuits and revisions to same (.2).
04/29/2010	26831136	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/16/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Review filing regarding claim filed in case (.2); review and comment on minutes from 3/9 meeting (.3).
04/29/2010	26831137	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/16/2010	1.30	650.00	845.00	Receive and review agenda for meeting and review pleadings and hearing summaries re same (.4); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on case and respond (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
04/29/2010	26831141	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/17/2010	2.10	650.00	1,365.00	Review background on 2004 exam and consider alternatives (.3); review updates from other parties on hearing and case matters (.2); review recent filings (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman on case (.1); analyze Navigant fee statement and expenses through 2/21 (.3); analyze Navigant fee statement and expenses through 3/12 (.3); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding questions arising from Navigant review of expenses (.2); prepare email to Ms. Waller on certain assets (.2); analyze Freddie's Objection to Rule 2004 Examination motion (.3).
04/29/2010	26831148	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/18/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review report on hearing and examination information (.3); prepare email to Mr. Singerman on case (.1); prepare email to Chair on status of 2004 examinations (.1); receive and review email from Ms. Waller on status (.1).
04/29/2010	26839367	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/19/2010	3.20	650.00	2,080.00	Receive and review filings and Committee materials regarding ATT administrative claim, and consider action needed regarding same (.3); receive and review response to inquiry regarding certain assets listed in Navigant fee statements (.2); provide update to Chair regarding same (.1); analyze Navigant report on case, summarize, and provide report to Chair (.9); emails to and from Berger Singerman regarding case matters (.2); telephone conference with Mr Singerman on case matters (.3); prepare for and participate on conference call with Committee and Navigant on various matters (1.0); prepare emails to Navigant and Mr. Singerman on meeting and review response (.2).
04/29/2010	26845341	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/21/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review and comment on 3/2 Committee meeting minutes.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
04/29/2010	26854454	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/23/2010	3.10	650.00	2,015.00	Analyze and comment on Navigant statements and expenses through 3/7/10 (.3); review memorandum from Committee counsel on update for creditors' website (.2); prepare inquiry to Committee counsel regarding same (.2); review Committee website and related materials (.3); receive and review Motion for further extension to Assume/Reject (.2); receive and review Debtor's Motion to Approve Addendum to Lease and review addendum (.3); receive and review agenda and pleadings summary for Committee meeting (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting (.7); analyze and comment on 2/28 Navigant fees and expenses (.3); telephone conference with Chair regarding case matters (.3).
04/29/2010	26867358	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/24/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Receive and review letter from Nationwide on withdrawal from Committee (.2); analyze and comment on Navigant statements and expenses through 3/14 (.3); prepare email to Ms. Galler regarding same (.1); receive and review TBW Monthly Report for February, summarize and update Chair (.3); receive and review Monthly Reports for February in REO and HAM (.3); prepare analysis for Chair on reports and on need to review for claims (.2).
04/29/2010	26867373	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/26/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Consider strategy on REO and HAM bankruptcies in light of claim deadline (.3); receive and review email from Committee counsel on case status (.1); review recent electronic filings (.1).
04/29/2010	26867380	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/27/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Notice of Committee Appointment by U.S. Trustee (.2); review recent electronic filings (.2).
04/29/2010	26867388	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/28/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Review information on REO and HAM bankruptcies and related matters and advise Chair.
04/29/2010	26884429	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/29/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Prepare email to Ms. Mackey on case and review response (.2); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on meeting (.2); receive and review email from Chair regarding same (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
04/29/2010	26884442	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/30/2010	1.80	650.00	1,170.00	Receive and review Plaintiff's Notice regarding Motion for Class Cert (.2); receive and review letter of disaffirmance from Colonial Bank receiver (.2); receive and review Agenda and pleadings summary for meeting (.2); review matters pending for action at Committee meeting (.2); review and comment on 3/23 minutes and communicate with Berger Singerman regarding same (.3); receive and review Order on TBW Examination of Freddie Mac (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.2); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on meeting and cancellation (.2); receive and review email from Ms. Galler on comments provided (.1);
04/29/2010	26888771	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/31/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review update from Berger Singerman on 2004 examination (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.2); update Chair on activity in case (.1).
05/20/2010	26902614	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/01/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review matters pending and information from Debtor regarding filings.
05/20/2010	26907398	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/05/2010	1.20	650.00	780.00	Receive and review email from Berger Singerman on 2004 exam problems, and review/comment on proposed filing (.4); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on additions to actions to be taken against certain entities, and review/comment on proposed filings (.3); analyze and comment on Navigant fees and expenses through 3/21 (.3); prepare follow up email to Chair on REO and HAM claims and review response (.2).
05/20/2010	26911838	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/06/2010	2.10	650.00	1,365.00	Receive and review email and agenda from Berger Singerman (.2); review pending matters and current pleadings (.2); analyze Class Plaintiff's Motion and memorandum of law(1.0); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7).
05/20/2010	26921173	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/07/2010	0.90	650.00	585.00	Receive and review email from Debtor's counsel on whole loan matters (.2); prepare email to Committee counsel regarding same and review response (.2); review background and prepare email to Chair on Committee meeting (.3); review information on action brought against Debtor, and provide to Committee counsel (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
05/20/2010	26921190	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/08/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on Committee work and other case matters (.3); review and comment on meeting minutes (.2); receive and review Notice on Bidding procedures (.2).
05/20/2010	26924512	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/09/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Notice of Hearing on pending matters.
05/20/2010	26924517	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/11/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review request and update from Berger Singerman and respond.
05/20/2010	26952461	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/12/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Emails from and to Mr. Singerman on case matters (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on FDIC matters and other recoveries (.3).
05/20/2010	26952469	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/13/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Receive and review agenda and pleadings summary from Berger Singerman (.3); review background from prior meetings (.2); prepare for and participate in Committee meeting conference call (.7); receive and review emails from Mr. Luria on case and respond (.2).
05/20/2010	26952475	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/14/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Review status of various matters (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on FDIC, current matters, auction, and other topics (.4); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on lease and respond (.2); review updates (.2).
05/20/2010	26952492	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/16/2010	0.90	650.00	585.00	Receive and review Agenda for hearing (.2); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on landlease claims (.2); analyze terms (.3); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.2).
05/20/2010	27005400	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/18/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review status of lease negotiations with landlord.
05/20/2010	27005418	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/20/2010	2.00	650.00	1,300.00	Receive and review agenda for meeting (.1); receive and review Motion Seal to USA and memorandum regarding same (.3); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Seal (.2); analyze Navigant statements and expenses through 3/28 (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee Meeting conference call (.9); receive and review Notice on ATT administrative expense and other upcoming matters (.2).
05/20/2010	27005428	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/21/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review inquiry from Committee counsel and respond.
05/20/2010	27007281	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/25/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review information on filings in light of upcoming meeting.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
05/20/2010	27028269	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/27/2010	2.70	650.00	1,755.00	Review email from Berger Singerman on various case matters and respond (.2); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on FDIC meeting and respond (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1); receive and review Notice on Committee Motion, and review numerous filings in case (.4); receive and review summary of FDIC issues and review term sheet (.3); telephone conference with Messrs. Singerman and Berger on FDIC revised term sheet and related matters (.5); prepare for and attend Committee meeting conference call (1.0).
05/20/2010	27035947	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/28/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review information from Berger Singerman on case.
05/20/2010	27035953	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/29/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Analyze Navigant 4/11 statements and expenses (.3); receive and review Order on Sale of MSRs (.2).
05/20/2010	27035954	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/29/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review update from Berger Singerman on FDIC.
05/20/2010	27035965	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/30/2010	1.90	650.00	1,235.00	Review minutes from 4/20 committee meeting (.2); receive and review Order Granting Approval to Lease Modification of HQ (.2); review information on Committee 2004 examination matters (.2); review March Financial reports and provide comment to Chair (.3); review and comment on 4/27 minutes, and prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.3); receive and review Luria Affidavit (.2); analyze FDIC term sheet (.3); review information on MBS sale (.2).
06/30/2010	27057948	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/01/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Review current status and update Chair.
06/30/2010	27058165	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/02/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Analyze Navigant statement and expenses thru 4/18 (.3); review pending matters regarding FDIC (.2).
06/30/2010	27058173	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/03/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Debtor's Motion to Reject ATT Contracts (.2); receive and review update from Berger Singerman on FDIC (.2).
06/30/2010	27058178	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/04/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review Objection to Motion for Entry of Order Approving Sale of Mortgage Backed Securities by John Cain (.2); receive and review Joinder in Bank of America's Motion for Order Authorizing 2004 Examination of Federal Home Loan Corporation by BNP Paribas (.2); receive and review Motion to Continue/Reschedule Hearing on May 7, 2010 filed by Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/30/2010	27058179	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/04/2010	3.60	650.00	2,340.00	Receive and review Agenda and pleadings summary from Berger Singerman (.4); review recent election case activity (.1); analyze latest revised term sheet and supporting documentation (1.5); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (1.0); receive and review Bank of America's Response to Freddie Mac's Motion for Continuance of Hearings Scheduled for May 7, 2010 (.2); receive and review Notice of Third Modification of Stipulation Between Debtor and Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation, as Receiver for Colonial Bank (.2); receive and review Creditor's Reply to Freddie Mac's Motion for Continuance of Hearings Scheduled for May 7, 2010 (.2).
06/30/2010	27065269	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/06/2010	0.90	650.00	585.00	Receive and review Agenda for hearing and review related matters (.2); further review of FDIC term sheets, and provide comments to Berger Singerman (.5); review additional information regarding same (.2).
06/30/2010	27065276	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/07/2010	2.20	650.00	1,430.00	Receive and review update from Berger Singerman on case (.2); review latest FDIC outline for settlement, analyze and provide comments regarding same (2.0).
06/30/2010	27073591	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/07/2010	2.00	650.00	1,300.00	Receive and review Complaint by Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., on behalf of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. against South Towne Capital Holdings (.4); receive and review Complaint by Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., on behalf of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. against Uplead Technology, LLC (.4); receive and review Complaint by Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., on behalf of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. against Coda Roberson III (.4); receive and review Complaint by Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., on behalf of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. against Lee Farkas, 3201 Partnership and Coda Roberson III (.4); receive and review Complaint by Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., on behalf of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. against Dine Design Group, Inc. (.4).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/30/2010	27073607	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/10/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review Debtor's Motion to Approve Addendum to Lease (.2); receive and review update from Berger Singerman on FDIC (.2); emails to and from Mr. Singerman regarding same (.2).
06/30/2010	27116910	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/11/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Prepare email to Mr. Singerman on case matters (.2); analyze latest revised FDIC papers (.5).
06/30/2010	27098296	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/11/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Committee's Response to Freddie Mac's Motion for Continuance of Hearings Scheduled for May 7, 2010 (.2); receive and review Objection to Freddie Mac's Motion for Continuance of Hearing Scheduled for May 7, 2010 filed by Creditor BNP Paribas (.2).
06/30/2010	27098297	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/11/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review email and agenda from Berger Singerman (.2); receive and review Order on Extension of Time to Assume or Reject (.2).
06/30/2010	27098298	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/11/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Review materials from Berger Singerman on update (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.8); review additional filings regarding Committee matters (.3).
06/30/2010	27098299	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/11/2010	2.50	650.00	1,625.00	Review pleadings summary and summary from recent hearing (.3); analyze revised term sheet with FDIC (1.0); review summary of various motions (.2); review and comments on revised term sheet with FDIC (.4); prepare for and participate on Committee conference call (.6).
06/30/2010	27115551	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/17/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review status of FDIC matter (.2); review email from Berger Singerman on action needed (.2).
06/30/2010	27115556	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/18/2010	4.20	650.00	2,730.00	Receive and review request from Chair on FDIC matter and settlement (.1); analyze latest proposed settlement term sheet regarding FDIC and provide report to Chair (2.0); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same and review response (.2); telephone conference with James Berger regarding latest developments and provide update to Chair (.3); review materials for Committee conference call (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.9); receive and review updates from Berger Singerman on Committee action on FDIC and analyze for impact on creditors (.4).
06/30/2010	27116920	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/19/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review email from Berger Singerman on case matters and FDIC (.2); review responses to same (.2); receive and review updates on ATT administrative claim (.2); review status of FDIC matters (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/30/2010	27121406	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/20/2010	1.20	650.00	780.00	Review information on Lloyd's action and insurance coverage (.2); receive and review Response of Debtor to Objection to Sale of Mortgage-Backed Securities (.2); receive and review Motions to Continue/Reschedule Hearing On Objection to the Sale of Mortgage-Backed Securities (.2); receive and review Response to Objection to Motion for Relief filed by Aurora Loan Services, LLC (.2); receive and review Notice of Filing Second Amendment to the Colorable Actions List on behalf of Creditor Committee Creditors Committee (.2); review action needed by Committee regarding FDIC (.2).
06/30/2010	27124431	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/21/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Review current status and update Chair.
06/30/2010	27124664	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/21/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Review information on amounts owed and what was presented to Trustee at Chair's request (.6); emails to Chair regarding same (.2); receive and review Order Denying Freddie Mac's Motion for Continuance of Hearings Scheduled for May 7, 2010 (.2); receive and review Order Scheduling Final Evidentiary Hearing on (1) Bank of America's Motion to Join Motion of Creditors Committee for Clarification of Order Authorizing Rule 2004 Examination of Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation, (2) Bank of America's Motion for an Order Authorizing and Directing Examination of Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation Pursuant to Rule 2004, (3) Joinder by BNP Paribas in Bank of America's Motion for Order Authorizing Rule 2004 Examination of Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation, and (4) Joinder by Deutsche Bank AG in Bank of America's Motion for Order Authorizing Rule 2004 Examination of Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation (.2);
								receive and review Order Granting Motion of Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Clarification of Court's Ruling on Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp.'s Motion Authorizing and Directing Examination of Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation and Related Joinders Thereto (.2); receive and review Order Granting Agreed Motion to Continue Hearing Scheduled on May 19, 2010 on Aurora Claim (.2).
06/30/2010	27124436	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/22/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review information on hearing and various matters.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/30/2010	27214644	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	05/24/2010	0.40	180.00	72.00	Analyze case pleadings impacting case.
06/30/2010	27177663	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/25/2010	3.60	650.00	2,340.00	Receive and review Orders regarding Aurora claims (.2); review and comment on 5/18 Committee meeting minutes, and email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.3); review agenda, pleading summary, reverse mortgage information, and pending litigation (.3); analyze Navigant statements and expenses (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); analyze Lloyd's complaint for impact on recoveries (.3); analyze Motion filed by Bank of America, N.A. to withdraw the reference of adversary proceeding and incorporated memorandum of law in support of the same for impact on estate and creditors (.6); analyze Motion filed by Banc of America Securities, LLC to withdraw the reference of adversary proceeding and incorporated memorandum of law in support of the same for impact on estate and creditors (.6); receive and review email from Chair on case and respond (.2); receive and review Notice and information on request for Mortgage Electronic Registration Systems, Inc. (.2).
06/30/2010	27200753	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/26/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review Motion to Compel MERS to produce (.2); review monthly financial statements regarding case and other assets issues, and provide to Chair (.3).
06/30/2010	27200763	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/27/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review Response of Debtor to Objection to Sale of Mortgage-Backed Securities (.2); receive and review Response to Objection to Motion for Relief filed by Aurora Loan Services, LLC (.2); receive and review Notice of Filing Second Amendment to the Colorable Actions by Creditors Committee (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Reject Executory Contracts with AT&T Corp. (.2).
06/30/2010	27200770	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/28/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Receive and review Navigant statements and expenses through 5/2, 5/9 and 5/16.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
07/20/2010	27255730	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/01/2010	1.30	650.00	845.00	Receive and review agenda for meeting and review pleading status report (.3); review background from prior meetings (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.4); receive and review Joinder of Committee in Debtor's Response to Plaintiff's Motion for Enlargement in WARN Act (.2); receive and review Freddie's Notice to Opt in to Protocol (.2).
07/20/2010	27266487	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/03/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Analyze Debtor's Motion for an Order Authorizing Sale of Debtor's Reverse Mortgages Free and Clear of all Liens, Claims, and Interests, and review related notice of hearing.
07/20/2010	27266499	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/04/2010	1.10	650.00	715.00	Receive and review agenda for hearing (.1); review LPS information on Spartan and other claim supporting information, analyze same, and prepare summary recommendation to Chair (.6); receive and review Application for Administrative expense by Braintree (.2); receive and review Emergency Motion on WARN Act (.2).
07/20/2010	27301674	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	06/07/2010	3.30	180.00	594.00	Research claim information, review Chair documents, and begin claim preparation.
07/20/2010	27295614	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/07/2010	0.90	650.00	585.00	Work on documentation and analysis of amounts owed to justify claims against various entities (.5); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on pending matters (.2); review filings by insurance company (.2).
07/20/2010	27287695	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/08/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Receive and review agenda and materials for committee meeting (.3); prepare for and participate on abbreviated committee meeting (.2); emails to and from Berger Singerman regarding action needed (.2).
07/20/2010	27287705	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/11/2010	1.20	650.00	780.00	Review status of exclusivity (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.1); receive and review objection and amended objection of Freddie to Second Amendment to Colorable Actions List (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.1); call from Berger Singerman regarding same (.1); receive and review Freddie's response to BOA Motion on Examination (.2); receive and review email from Chair regarding claims and respond (.2); review information from Chair on claims and entities (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
07/20/2010	27311522	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/15/2010	2.50	650.00	1,625.00	Review and comment on 5/11 minutes and provide to Berger Singerman (.3); receive and review minutes from 5/25 meeting (.2); receive and review Order Granting Bank of America MERS relief (.2); receive and review National Union's motion for relief from stay on D&O (.2); review and comment on Committee response to objection by Freddie to second amendment on colorable action notice (.3); review pending pleadings (.2); review and comment on response to WARN Act emergency motion (.2); receive and review agenda and related papers for meeting (.3) prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6).
07/20/2010	27333246	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	06/16/2010	0.30	180.00	54.00	Analyze case pleadings impacting case.
07/20/2010	27311534	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/16/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Receive and review fourth modification of FDIC/TBW stipulation (.2); receive and review Committee response to WARN emergency motion (.2) receive and review TBW's response to WARN emergency motion (.2); analyze Navigant's June 6 statements and expenses (.3); receive and review order denying motion to extend time to file WARN Act proofs of claim (.2); receive and review order granting in part and denying in part application for administrative expenses and compelling immediate payment regarding AT&T (.2); receive and review motion for extension of time by Naufel (.2). review information on Farkas and assets (.1).
07/20/2010	27315040	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/18/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review update from Berger Singerman on Committee action (.1); receive and review agenda for hearing (.2); review claim information and prepare email to Chair regarding same (.3)
07/20/2010	27315046	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/19/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review outcome from hearing and report from court.
07/20/2010	27315309	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/20/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review Farkas indictment and consider impact of property forfeiture.
07/20/2010	27334701	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/21/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review 6/15 minutes for Committee meeting (.2); receive and review motion to extend exclusivity (.2).
07/20/2010	27349086	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/22/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Receive and review agenda, review pending matters, and review related materials for meeting (.3); prepare for and participate in Committee call on various matters (1.0); review action needed in light of information from meeting (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
07/20/2010	27349087	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/22/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review Answer to Freddie Mac's Objection to (1) Bank of America's Motion for Order Authorizing and Direction 2004 Exam of Freddie and to Joinder by BNP Paribas in Bank of America's Motion for Order Authorizing 2004 Exam of Freddie Mac and Joinder by Deutsche Bank in Bank of America's Motion for Order Authorizing 2004 Exam of Freddie Mac and (2) to Bank of America's Motion to Join Motion of Creditors Committee for Clarification of Order Authorizing Rule 2004 Exam of Freddie Mac.
07/20/2010	27349095	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/24/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Analyze HAM and REO financial reports (.2); analyze TBW financial report for UST and prepare summary for Chair (.3).
07/20/2010	27375557	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/29/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review materials from Berger Singerman on case, and review agenda for meeting.
07/20/2010	27375565	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/30/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding case activity (.1); review Farkas pre-trial detention motion (.3).
08/24/2010	27387146	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/01/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review information on matters and prepare email to BS regarding same (.1); receive and review Order Granting Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors' motion for extension of time to respond to Amended Objection of Freddie Mac to Notice of Second Amendment to Colorable Actions list (.2).
08/24/2010	27387160	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/02/2010	1.50	650.00	975.00	Update Chair on case developments (.1); receive and review letter from BS on claims (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Galler on latest action (.1); receive and review Committee's Unopposed Motion for Extension of Time regarding Colorable Action List (.2); analyze Navigant Statement and Expenses for period ending 6/20 (.3); receive and review Order Approving Debtor's Sale of Reverse Mortgages (.2); receive and review Bank of America's Motion to Compel Draft Confidentiality Agreement (.2); receive and review Supplement to National Union's Motion (.2).
08/24/2010	27387166	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/03/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Review status of various matters, information from BS, meeting updates and prepare summary to assist Chair (.3); receive and review MBIA statement regarding Exclusivity Extension (.2); receive and review Debtor's Motion to Schedule Status Conference (.2); review order granting same (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
08/24/2010	27387169	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/05/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Analyze Committee's Response to National Union's Motion for Relief from Stay for D&O Coverage (.3); analyze Post Trial Brief of Freddie Mac (.3).
08/24/2010	27387170	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/05/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Analyze portions of Reconciliation Report: Overview and Next Steps.
08/24/2010	27417765	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	07/06/2010	1.40	180.00	252.00	Analyze case docket for pleadings impacting Chair and retrieve relevant documents for attorney review.
08/24/2010	27392986	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/06/2010	5.80	650.00	3,770.00	Telephone conference with Dave Petro regarding case and latest developments (.2); update report to Chair in light of new information (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on meeting and respond (.2); review agenda and pending matters (.2); receive and review additional email from Berger Singerman regarding case (.1); finalize analysis of Reconciliation Report (2.0); prepare email to CRO and review response (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Singerman on meeting (.1); prepare email to Berger Singerman on plan expediting and review (.2); prepare email to Chair on case recovery (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on case matters (.3); review legal authority regarding D&O insurance (.2); prepare for and participate on TBW Committee Meeting call (.6); receive and review Notice of Filing Supplemental Authority to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors' Response to the Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay, to the Extent Applicable, to Permit Insured to Advance Defense Costs of Certain of the Debtor's Former Directors and Officers (.2);
								receive and review Statement of the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation, as Receiver of Colonial Bank, Montgomery, Alabama, N.A., in Support of Debtor's Final Reconciliation Report (.2); receive and review Motion to Deem Late Filed Proof of Claim as Timely Filed and Affidavit in Support (.2); receive and review Response to National Union Fire Insurance Company's Motion for Relief from the Automatic Stay and the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors' Response to Same by Raymond Bowman and Paul Allen (.2); analyze additional information provided by Bowman and Allen (.2); prepare email to Ms. Galler regarding same and review response (.2).
08/24/2010	27417770	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	07/07/2010	0.30	180.00	54.00	Analyze case pleadings impacting case.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
08/24/2010	27395527	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/07/2010	3.60	650.00	2,340.00	Review materials for reconciliation report hearing and review info from BS regarding same (1.0); prepare for and participate on Court's status conference for presentation of reconciliation report (2.2); receive and review Order Granting Committee extension regarding Freddie Mac (.2); receive and review Bank of America's Reply to Freddie's Post-hearing Brief (.2).
08/24/2010	27422150	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/12/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Order Granting Bank of America's Motion to Join Motion of Creditors Committee for Clarification of Order Authorizing Rule 2044 Examination of Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation.
08/24/2010	27422151	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/12/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Debtor's Motion for Order Approving Abandonment of Certain Real Estate Owned Property.
08/24/2010	27422152	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/12/2010	3.60	650.00	2,340.00	Review information on Freddie and provide to BS and Chair, and review response (.2); receive and review emails from BS on Lloyd's matter and Freddie objection (.2); respond to same (.1); review information on Freddie proposal (.2); review update regarding same (.1); work on plan and confirmation matters for Committee counsel (2.0); analyze and comment on 7/6 minutes (.2); analyze Navigant statement and expenses through 6/27 (.3); review matters to raise at Committee meeting (.3).
08/24/2010	27431595	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/13/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review notice of withdrawal of amended objection by Freddie Mac to notice by Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of second amendment to colorable actions list.
08/24/2010	27431596	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/13/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Debtor's amended and restated motion for order approving abandonment of certain real estate owned property (.2); receive and review order on objection by J. Crain to Debtor's motion for order authorizing sale of certain mortgage-backed securities (.2).
08/24/2010	27431597	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/13/2010	4.70	650.00	3,055.00	Receive and review agenda and pleadings summary (.2); review other background material (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); receive and review email from BS on case matters and respond (.2); prepare update on plan and confirmation (.3); analyze Plan provisions for post confirmation committee and draft language for committee counsel (3.0).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
08/24/2010	27423906	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/14/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Receive and review email from BS on case and plan.
08/24/2010	27431607	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/15/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Agenda for hearing.
08/24/2010	27431608	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/15/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review motion to approve compromise between Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. and Garrett Daw (.2); receive and review Debtor's motion to reject unexpired leases with Ark Mini Storage (.2); receive and review notice of filing of supplement to list of Ordinary Course Professionals (.2); receive and review notice of withdrawal of motion to extend time to file claim (.2).
08/24/2010	27431615	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/16/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Agenda for hearing (.2); review status of pursuing certain litigation by Committee (.2).
08/24/2010	27431616	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/16/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Farkas' joinder in motion for relief from automatic stay filed by National Union Fire Insurance company and response (.2); receive and review Debtor's amended and restated motion for order approving abandonment (.2).
08/24/2010	27431617	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/16/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review National Union's response to Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors' response to motion for relief from automatic stay, to the extent applicable, to permit insurer to advance defense costs of certain of Debtors' former directors and officers.
08/24/2010	27431624	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/18/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Committee's response to Bowman and Allen on D&O coverage.
08/24/2010	27461404	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/19/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Receive and review email from BS on case (.1); analyze additional plan language requested by BS, and draft submission (.6).
08/24/2010	27461405	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/19/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review Statement of Federal Deposit Insurance Corp, as Receiver of Colonial Bank, in Support of Debtors' Motion for Second Extension of Exclusivity Period (.2); receive and review Order Granting Second Amended Motion of the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Derivative Standing to Litigate in Name of Debtor (.2); receive and review Motion of US Bank National Association as Trustee for Relief from Stay to Permit Setoff (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
08/24/2010	27452366	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/20/2010	2.00	650.00	1,300.00	Receive and review agenda and pleadings summary (.2); review report on hearings (.1); review background from prior meeting and information from Berger Singerman (.2); review action needed on plan (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee Meeting conference call (.6); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on case matters and plan (.6).
08/24/2010	27496701	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	07/21/2010	0.80	180.00	144.00	Analyze case docket for pleadings impacting Chair and retrieve relevant documents for attorney review.
08/24/2010	27452374	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/21/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Review presentation materials from Debtor on Final Reconciliation and provide summary to Chair (.5); review claim register from Committee for pertinent information (.3).
08/24/2010	27496709	07276	Crowley, Robert L.	07/22/2010	0.20	180.00	36.00	Analyze case matters.
08/24/2010	27461418	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/22/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Prepare email to BS on plan matters (.2); update Chair on overall situation with case (.1); review REO, HAM and TBW financial reports for June and provide to Chair (.3).
08/24/2010	27461426	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/23/2010	3.40	650.00	2,210.00	Receive and review email from BS regarding plan matters and meeting with CRO, and respond (.2); consider alternative language for plan and committee responsibilities at BS request, and provide summary regarding same (3.0) ; receive and review follow-up email from BS regarding same and respond (.2).
08/24/2010	27502589	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/25/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review email from BS on Committee matters and respond.
08/24/2010	27522853	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/27/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Review status and update Chair regarding same.
08/24/2010	27502607	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/27/2010	1.50	650.00	975.00	Receive and review agenda for meeting and summary of pleadings (.2); review background from prior meetings and filings (.2) prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.5); receive and review Debtor's Motion for Order Authorizing and Directing 2004 Examination of DeLoitte & Touche LLP and DeLoitte LLP (.2); analyze Navigant reports for period through 7/11/10 (.2); analyze Navigant reports for period through 7/4/10 (.2).
08/24/2010	27508193	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/28/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review update on claims from Committee counsel (.2); receive and review email from BS on Wells status and respond (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
08/24/2010	27508194	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/28/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review order Granting Bank of America's Motion to Compel Draft Confidentiality Agreement.
08/24/2010	27522862	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/29/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review email from BS on Plan and respond to same.
08/24/2010	27522873	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/30/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Motion to Request Inspection of Documentation Verifying Loan Origination.
09/27/2010	27522882	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/01/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Emails to Chair regarding TBW meeting with CRO and review response.
09/27/2010	27532902	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/02/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Review and comment on July 27 minutes, and email to BS (.3); prepare email to CRO on plan matters and action needed regarding same (.2); receive and review emails from CRO and Mr. Singerman regarding same, and respond (.3); update chair regarding same and review response (.2).
09/27/2010	27532911	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/03/2010	2.00	650.00	1,300.00	Receive and review Notice of Reservation of Rights Relating to Asset Reconciliation Report by Bank of America (.2); prepare email to CRO on various matters (.1); receive and review agenda and summaries for meeting (.2); receive and review emails from BS and Neil Luria on plan matters and respond (.3); receive and review email from chair on plan and Committee matters and respond (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); emails from and to Mr. Gassenheimer on case (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding update on plan (.1).
09/27/2010	27535707	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/04/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review update from BS on Wells and respond (.2); update Chair regarding same (.1).
09/27/2010	27542156	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/05/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review update on Lloyd's litigation and respond to BS.
09/27/2010	27542167	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/06/2010	3.80	650.00	2,470.00	Receive and review email from BS on latest developments on FDIC (.2); respond to same (.1); receive and review update from BS on Lloyd's and analyze opinion defeating Lloyd's in adversary appeal (.5); analyze lengthy FDIC agreement and provide comment to BS (3.0).
09/27/2010	27542175	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/08/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Prepare email to BS on Lloyd's adversary and action needed (.2) receive and review email in response to same (.1); prepare email to Mr. Berger on FDIC settlement (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
09/27/2010	27575794	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/09/2010	1.90	650.00	1,235.00	Receive and review Order Extending Exclusivity (.2); follow-up email with Mr. Luria on pending matters and action to take on plan (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Luria regarding same (.1); receive and review email from BS on recent filings and action needed, and respond to same (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Berger on FDIC settlement and respond (.2); review and comment on revised FDIC settlement and prepare for approval process (.8); update Chair on action needed regarding plan (.2).
09/27/2010	27575802	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/10/2010	3.20	650.00	2,080.00	Receive and review Joinder by Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors to Debtors Motion for Order Authorizing and Directing Examination of Deloitte & Touche and Deloitte LLP (.2); analyze Navigant statements and expenses for period ending 7/25 (.3); analyze latest revision of FDIC settlement (.8); telephone conference with James Berger on Plan matters and FDIC settlement (.4); prepare for and participate on TBW Committee meeting conference call (.6); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1) analyze late claim response and prepare email to BS regarding same (.3); receive and review email from Mr. Spector regarding same (.1); prepare analysis for Chair on FDIC settlement (.4).
09/27/2010	27565991	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/11/2010	1.10	650.00	715.00	Receive and review Notice of Proposed Agenda for Matters Scheduled for Hearing on 8/11/2010 (.2); emails to and from Mr. Berger on plan matters and FDIC settlement comments (.2); prepare emails to Chair on plan matters (.2); prepare email to Mr. Luria on plan status and related matters (.2); follow up on FDIC resolution and review action needed regarding same (.2); review information from BS on FDIC matter (.1).
09/27/2010	27570643	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/12/2010	2.50	650.00	1,625.00	Review court activity (.2); emails to and from Mr. Luria and BS team regarding plan matters (.8); prepare for and participate on conference call with BS and CRO on plan activities and meeting (.5); communicate with Chair regarding same (.2); follow up with BS team regarding plan matters (.2); review strategy on hearing for approval of FDIC settlement (2); emails to and from BS regarding same (.2); provide summary to Chair regarding Committee action (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
09/27/2010	27570644	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/12/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Receive and review Order Denying Motion for Relief From Automatic Stay filed by US Bank, Successor Trustee to Bank of America (.2); receive and review Order Approving Emergency Application for Authorization to Employ and Compensate Hilco Fixed Asset Recovery as Auctioneer to Sell Certain Assets of Debtor (.2); receive and review Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement By and Between TBW, Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation, as Receiver of Colonial Bank, and Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (.3).
09/27/2010	27570656	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/13/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review Stipulation with Bayview and US Bank (.2); review recent electronic filings (.2); receive and review email from chair on plan meeting and respond (.2); receive and review email from BS on D&O matters and respond (.2).
09/27/2010	27570657	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/13/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Objection to Notice of Proposed Sale Pursuant to order Granting Debtor's Motion to Sell Non-Essential Property Free and Clear of Liens, Claims and Encumbrances (.2); receive and review Objection to Sale of TBW Assets to Colonial Bank/USAmeribank, Bank of New York Mellon as Investor and to Compel Inspection filed by Creditor John Crain (.2).
09/27/2010	27573911	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/14/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review email from BS regarding National Union filing and respond.
09/27/2010	27573915	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/15/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review email from BS on D&O issues (.1); review action needed regarding same (.2).
09/27/2010	27650980	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/16/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Review action needed on plan and negotiation session regarding same (.3); prepare email to BS and Navigant regarding same and review response (.2).
09/27/2010	27650994	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/17/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Analyze Navigant fees and expenses through July 18.
09/27/2010	27650995	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/17/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Receive and review Order on Debtor's Motion for Order Authorizing and Directing Examination of Deloitte & Touche LLP and Deloitte LLP (.2); receive and review Order Denying Motion to Compel Freddie Mac to Produce Documents (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Reject Unexpired Leases (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Approve Compromise of Controversy Between Taylor Bean & Whitaker and Garrett Daw (.2); receive and review order Granting Motion of Western Union Financial Services, Inc.'s Motion to Deem Late Filed Proofs of Claim as Timely Filed (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
09/27/2010	27650996	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/17/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review and comment on proposed order on certain property.
09/27/2010	27650997	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/17/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Receive and review agenda, information on case, and pleadings summary (.3); receive and review emails from BS on follow up regarding pending matters (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); review and comment on proposed stay order (.2).
09/27/2010	27636442	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/18/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Bank of America letter brief on Freddie Mac (.2); review status of plan from BS (.2).
09/27/2010	27651017	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/20/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review amended notice of hearing on motion to approve settlement agreement among TBW, FDIC, and Committee.
09/27/2010	27669282	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/24/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Receive and review agenda and pleadings summary (.2); receive and review email from BS on related matters and respond (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6).
09/27/2010	27669283	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/24/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Review Financial Reports for Period July 1, to July 31, 2010 of Debtor Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. (.2); review Financial Reports for period July 1 to July 31, 2010 of Interested party Home America Mortgage, Inc. (.2); review Financial Reports for Period July 1 to July 31, 2010 of Interested Party REO Specialists (.2) prepare letter to Chair regarding same (.2).
09/27/2010	27669292	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/25/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Motion for Order Authorizing and Directing Examination of National Union Fire Insurance Company of Pittsburgh.
09/27/2010	27669293	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/25/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Notice of Fourth Amendment to Colorable Actions List Filed Pursuant to Order Granting Motion of Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Derivative Standing to Prosecute Certain Actions in Name of Debtor, Adding Claims Against Certain Farkas Entities and Individuals.
09/27/2010	27695817	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/25/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Review status and provide update to Chair.
09/27/2010	27678072	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/27/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review email from BS on case and analyze Navigant statement (.3); analyze Statement of Claim provided to insurer on D&O coverage and claims (.3).
09/27/2010	27695829	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/29/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Review pending matters and court's setting of adversary proceeding (.2); review and comment on additional revisions to FDIC document (.2); review strategy on hearing regarding same (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
09/27/2010	27695845	06831	Workman, Donald A	08/31/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Receive and review email from BS and review agenda for meeting (.2); review background materials (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); receive and review email from BS on FDIC and review revised First Amendment to agreement (.4).
10/29/2010	27714649	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/01/2010	0.90	650.00	585.00	Review status of upcoming hearing and related matters (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same and review response (.2); review revised amendment (.2); review and comment on Committee meeting minutes for 8/17 and 8/24 (.3).
10/29/2010	27714650	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/01/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Cumberland Valley Request for MRS.
10/29/2010	27710409	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/02/2010	3.20	650.00	2,080.00	Analyze Navigant fees and expenses through 8/8 and comment on same (.3); analyze claims demand on D&O coverage, and provide summary to Chair (.5); prepare for and participate on FDIC settlement hearing (1.6); emails to and from BS team on hearing matters and review responses (.3); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1); review strategy on proposed order and communicate with BS regarding same (.3); receive and review update from BS on matters (.1).
10/29/2010	27710410	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/02/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review Response to Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay, to Extent Applicable, to Permit Insurer to Advance Defense Costs of Lee Farkas Filed by Creditor Committee (.3); review and comment on 8/17 and 8/24 minutes (.3).
10/29/2010	27710411	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/02/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review Response to and Request for Clarification of Debtor's Motion to Approve Settlement Agreement With FDIC by US Bank National Association as Trustee (.2); receive and review Objection to Motion to Approve Settlement Agreement By and Between Debtor, FDIC and Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors by Sovereign Bank (.2); receive and review Limited Objection to Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement By and Between TBW Mortgage Corp., FDIC, as Receiver of Colonial Bank, and Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors by Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation (.2); receive and review Notice of Filing of First Amendment to Settlement with FDIC (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
10/29/2010	27710429	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/03/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review email from Committee member and review response (.2); review pending matters (.2).
10/29/2010	27874086	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/04/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review information from hearing.
10/29/2010	27762554	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/07/2010	2.80	650.00	1,820.00	Receive and review email from BS on confirmation and respond (.2); receive and review email from BS on plan and respond (.2); review plan provisions (2.0); review materials and agenda for meeting (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6).
10/29/2010	27762567	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/09/2010	3.50	650.00	2,275.00	Analyze latest version of plan and provide comment (3.0); review additional information for plan analysis (.5).
10/29/2010	27762579	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/10/2010	5.10	650.00	3,315.00	Review information on meeting and work on preparations for plan review (.7); finish review of latest draft plan and provide comments to BS (2.0); receive and review email from BS and respond (.2); prepare email to Chair and review response (.2); prepare email to Mr. Luria regarding same and review response (.2); emails to and from BS team on plan matters (.3); prepare for and participate on planning conference call regarding plan meeting (.8); review materials from BS on presentation (.4); follow-up emails with Mr. Luria and Mr. Berger on plan matters (.3).
10/29/2010	27762580	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/10/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review agenda for hearing (.2); receive and review Joinder in Motion for Additional Relief from Automatic Stay Filed by K. Israel on behalf of Creditor Lee Farkas (.2); receive and review Notice of Filing Demonstrative Presentation (.2); receive and review Defendant's Petition and Motion to Present Evidence by Smith and Crain (.2).
10/29/2010	27762584	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/11/2010	3.30	650.00	2,145.00	Emails to and from Mr. Luria on plan matters (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on plan matters and action needed on proceeding to confirmation (1.6); prepare email to Mr. Berger regarding plan and review response (.2); prepare for and participate on conference call with Mr. J. Berger concerning plan comments and action needed on related matters (1.1); receive and review emails from BS on plan issues and respond (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
10/29/2010	27762588	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/12/2010	1.50	650.00	975.00	Receive and review email from BS on case and respond (.2); review update on plan and related action from BS (.2); prepare email to Mr. Singerman regarding same (.1); review information from BS and Navigant, analyze for Chair meeting, and summarize same (1.0).
10/29/2010	27792312	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/13/2010	9.50	650.00	6,175.00	Analyze materials from Navigant on current status, projections, and related matters (1.0); review and comment on latest plan draft (2.6); communicate with BS team on action to take (.3); meet with Neil Luria and Navigant team on presentation and current status (3.0); meet with BS team on plan terms and strategize on plan trust agreement (2.0); discuss Plan revisions and plan trust agreement with Chair (.3); follow-up discussions with BS team on plan matters (.3).
10/29/2010	27775744	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/14/2010	10.60	650.00	6,890.00	Review and comment on definition of trade claims and classes (.4); meet with Chair on plan matters and action needed (.5); review Ocala Funding UCC filing (.2); prepare email to Mr. Singerman on case and review response (.2); receive and review agenda and related materials for Committee meeting (.2); discuss with BS team (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Berger on plan matters (.2); review draft inserts to plan and discuss same (.4); review additional response to National Union on Farkas (.3); prepare for and attend Debtor and Navigant briefing and working session on plan matters, litigation and related topics (8.0).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
10/29/2010	27789819	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/15/2010	2.60	650.00	1,690.00	Receive and review Order Directing Response to Motion to Request Inspection of Documentation Verifying Loan Origination and Any Sale of Said Loan (.2); receive and review Objection to Motion for Relief on Behalf of USAAmeribank filed by Joni Cox-Tanner (.2); receive and review Motion to Continue/Reschedule Hearing on Objection to Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement by and Between Taylor Bean & Whitaker Asserts to Colonial Bank/Ameribank (.2); receive and review Crain's Objection to Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement by and Between Debtor, Federal Deposit Insurance Corp, as Receiver of Colonial Bank and Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (.2); receive and review Amended Application for Payment of Administrative Expenses for Related Loss to Real Estate Sale (.2); receive and review Order Directing Response Regarding Motions to Set Amount of Redemption by Duran (.2);
								receive and review Order Directing Response Regarding Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Wesley (.2); receive and review Order Directing Response Regarding Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Smith (.2); receive and review Order Directing Response Regarding Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Oylar (.2); receive and review Order Directing Response regarding Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Creditor Elliott (.2); receive and review Order Directing Response Regarding Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Haggard (.2); receive and review Order Directing Response Regarding Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Haggard (.2).
10/29/2010	27789820	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/15/2010	5.00	650.00	3,250.00	Prepare email to Chair on plan matters and review response (.2); communicate with BS team on plan matters throughout day (.4); review and comment on latest draft of plan trust agreement (2.4); review and comment on latest version of plan, and communicate with BS regarding same (2.0).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
10/29/2010	27781380	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/16/2010	3.00	650.00	1,950.00	Telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on case and plan strategy (.3); prepare email to BS on plan trust agreement (.2); review action needed regarding same (.2); receive and review agenda for Committee meeting (.1); review information and participate on conference call with BS team on plan trust (1.0); receive and review emails from BS on Lloyd's litigation and respond (.2); analyze and comment on proposed motion to dismiss carrier litigation (1.0).
10/29/2010	27785134	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/17/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review Third Application for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Special Counsel for Debtor TBW Mortgage Corp. for period May 1, 2010 through August 31, 2010 (.2); receive and review Third Application for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Berger Singerman as Counsel to official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (.2); receive and review Defendants' Objection to Sale (.2).
10/29/2010	27785135	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/17/2010	3.50	650.00	2,275.00	Receive and review emails from BS on plan matters and respond (.3); review, revise and comment on plan trust agreement, and provide to BS team (1.5); prepare summary of latest developments at Chair's requests (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call regarding plan approval (1.1); emails to and telephone conference with Mr. Gassenheimer on motion to dismiss Lloyd's complaint (.3).
10/29/2010	27781383	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/18/2010	5.30	650.00	3,445.00	Review and revise latest draft of disclosure statement, and provide comments regarding same (3.0); email from and to BS team on plan matters (.3); review and comment on revised plan and related matters (2.0).
10/29/2010	27785847	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/19/2010	8.50	650.00	5,525.00	Review and comment on remaining portions of Disclosure Statement draft, emails to and from BS team, and discuss same with Mr. Berger (6.0); review and comment on revised definition annex, and emails to and from BS regarding same and related plan matters (2.0); receive and review emails from Mr. Singerman regarding plan, disclosure statement and related matters, and respond (.3); emails to Chair on status and action needed on finalizing plan, etc. (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
10/29/2010	27823739	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/20/2010	4.80	650.00	3,120.00	Emails to and from BS on plan and disclosure statement (.3); review and comment on latest revision of plan (1.4); review and comment on latest revision of disclosure statement (1.8); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1); review and comment on plan trust agreement (1.0); review final actions needed on plan (.2).
10/29/2010	27823751	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/21/2010	8.30	650.00	5,395.00	Receive and review Debtor's Second Motion for Abandonment (.2); analyze Navigant statement through 8/15 and comment (.3); prepare email to BS regarding same (.1); receive and review Order Granting Freddie Mac's Request for Clarification of Restrictions (.2); review and comment on minutes for committee meeting on 9/7 and 8/31 (.3); receive and review Order Approving Settlement Agreement with FDIC (.2); prepare email to Ms. Galler regarding case (.5); review and comment on Definitions Annex to Plan (.6); review and comment on latest version of plan (1.0); review and comment on latest version of Disclosure Statement (1.0); emails to and from Mr. Berger regarding same (.2); telephone conference with James Berger regarding same (.3); additional review of revised Disclosure Statement and provide comments to BS (1.6); conference call with BS regarding same (.3); analyze August reports for debtors (.2); prepare letter to Chair regarding same (.2); review agenda for meeting (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting and update on plan process (.6); review and comment on motion to compel against Freddie (.3).
10/29/2010	27823752	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/21/2010	0.90	650.00	585.00	Receive and review Order Denying Motion for Rule 2004 Examination by Creditor's Committee (.2); review Response in Opposition to Motion for Rule 2004 Examination of National Union Fire Insurance Company (.3); review Financial Reports for Period August 1 to 31, 2010 for Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., REO Specialists, LLC, and Home America Mortgage, Inc., and summarize highlights on cash for Chair (.4).
10/29/2010	27823760	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/22/2010	1.80	650.00	1,170.00	Receive and review email from BS on plan and update Chair regarding same (.2); review and revise plan support agreement (.4); communicate with BS regarding same (.1); analyze and comment on BS application (.8); prepare email to BS regarding same and review response (.2); receive and review email from BS on PSA (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
10/29/2010	27823761	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/22/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Order Granting Motion for Relief From Stay by National Union regarding D&O.
10/29/2010	27823772	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/23/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Analyze Navigant statements and expenses, and comment on same (.3); receive update from BS on Wells and respond (.2); receive and review notice on hearing (.1); receive and review Order Setting Disclosure Statement hearing (.2); prepare email to BS on applications and review response (.2).
10/29/2010	27823781	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/24/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review email from BS on Disclosure Statement hearing and respond to same (.2); receive and review response on Navigant expenses that we questioned, and respond (.2).
10/29/2010	27927108	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/24/2010	2.20	650.00	1,430.00	Receive and review TBW's Response to Motion to Request Inspection of Documentation Verifying Loan Origination and Any Sale of Said Loan (.2); receive and review TBW's Omnibus Response in Opposition to Motions by Hefty (.2); receive and review Debtor's Application for Order Authorizing Retention and Employment of Crowe Horwath as Tax Advisor, and Notice of Hearing regarding same (.2); receive and review Order Denying Cumberland Valley National Bank and Trust's Motion for Relief From Automatic Stay (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Oyler (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Smiths (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption By Elliotts (.2); TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Haggards (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Stouts (.2);
								receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption By Tanners (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Duran (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
10/29/2010	27823782	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/24/2010	2.20	650.00	1,430.00	Receive and review TBW's Response to Motion to Request Inspection of Documentation Verifying Loan Origination and Any Sale of Said Loan (.2); receive and review TBW's Omnibus Response in Opposition to Motions by Hefty (.2); receive and review Debtor's Application for Order Authorizing Retention and Employment of Crowe Horwath as Tax Advisor, and Notice of Hearing regarding same (.2); receive and review Order Denying Cumberland Valley National Bank and Trust's Motion for Relief From Automatic Stay (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Oyler (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Smiths (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption By Elliotts (.2); TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Haggards (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Stouts (.2);
								receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption By Tanners (.2); receive and review TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Duran (.2).
10/29/2010	27864775	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/25/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review email from BS on disclosure statement filing matters and respond (.2); review action needed for plan matters (.3).
10/29/2010	27874098	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/26/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review email from BS on Disclosure Statement hearing and respond.
10/29/2010	27874107	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/27/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review and comment on proposed motion to compel and related relief aimed at Freddie (.3); prepare update to Chair on Freddie (.1).
10/29/2010	27863903	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/28/2010	1.80	650.00	1,170.00	Review pending matters and email BS regarding items to include on agenda (.3); receive and review emails from BS regarding same (.2); receive and review materials for meeting (.2); comment to BS regarding same (.1); receive and review Order on WARN Act class certification and dismissal (.2); emails to and from BS on Committee meeting (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
10/29/2010	27863908	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/29/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review Motion to Approve Contract With Interim Services Agent and Notice of Hearing regarding same.
10/29/2010	27863909	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/29/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review notice regarding plan matters.
10/29/2010	27874117	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/30/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review status and background on certain matters, and provide update to Chair.
10/29/2010	27874118	06831	Workman, Donald A	09/30/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Receive and review Agreed order Granting Motion for Relief From Automatic Stay Filed by Wells Fargo Bank (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Reject Executory Contract with Iron Mountain Information Management (.2); receive and review order Overruling Defendant's Objection to Motion for Relief on Behalf of USAmeribank (.2); receive and review Order Overruling Defendant's Objection to Court Document No. 1585 (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Continue/Reschedule Hearing on Objection to Sale by John Crain (.2).
11/19/2010	27907515	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/04/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Review current status and provide update to Chair.
11/19/2010	27907516	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/04/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Telephone conference with Seaside Bank counsel on status of case and plan provisions.
11/19/2010	27907517	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/04/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Receive and review order Denying Without Prejudice Bank of America's Motion for Rule 2004 Examination (.2); receive and review Objection to Debtor's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Smiths (.2); receive and review Objection to Debtor's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Stouts (.2); receive and review Objection to Debtor's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Tanners (.2); receive and review Declaration Filed by Paul Singerman on behalf of Creditor's Committee (.2).
11/19/2010	27907524	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/05/2010	0.90	650.00	585.00	Review background from prior meeting, agenda and related materials (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6).
11/19/2010	27907537	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/07/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review Objection to Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption by Oyler (.2); analyze Navigant fee statements and expense summaries for 9/5, 9/12, and 9/19 (.6).
11/19/2010	27907545	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/08/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review agenda for hearing.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
11/19/2010	27932174	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/12/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Review agenda for Committee meeting and related documents (.2); receive and review email from BS on demands by pro se litigants, consider alternatives and email Chair regarding same (.4); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); receive and review email from BS on plan and respond (.2).
11/19/2010	27932194	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/13/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Review information from Berger Singerman on status regarding pending matters, and respond to same (.2); emails to and from Chair regarding same (.2); emails to and from Mr. Singerman regarding follow up on same (.2); discuss matters with Mr. Singerman (.2).
11/19/2010	27932202	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/14/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Review and comment on latest draft of Plan Trust Agreement and communicate comments to Berger Singerman.
11/19/2010	27932203	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/14/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review information from pro se litigant concerning pending matters.
11/19/2010	27932204	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/14/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review emails from Chair on Plan and respond (.2); telephone conference with Chair concerning recent developments (.3).
11/19/2010	27932220	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/15/2010	1.20	650.00	780.00	Review outcome from hearing and action needed regarding same (.2); prepare email to BS on plan matters and review response (.2); telephone conference with James Berger on Plan Trust Agreement and action needed regarding same (.4); receive and review Order Granting plaintiffs' request on class action, and review notice regarding same (.2); review recent filings (.2).
11/19/2010	27961831	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/18/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Order Granting Motion for Approval of Contract With Interim Servicing Agent (.2); receive and review Response to Filing by Berger Singerman as Counsel for Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors Filed by Smiths (.2).
11/19/2010	27961832	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/18/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Analyze Navigant statement and expenses through August 29, and comment on same (.3); receive and review Order Granting Motion for Entry of Order That Seeks Unsealing of Proofs of Claim and Related Filings Previously Filed Under Seal (.2); receive and review Objection to TBW's Response in Opposition to Motion to Set Amount of Redemption (.2).
11/19/2010	27961833	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/18/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Objection by Elliotts to Debtor's filing.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
11/19/2010	27966024	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/19/2010	1.80	650.00	1,170.00	Receive and review agenda and related materials from Berger Singerman concerning Committee meeting (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman concerning solicitation procedures and respond to same (.2); receive and review follow-up emails from Mr. Singerman and other BS attorneys regarding solicitation and respond (.2); provide comment on Notice of Non-Voting Procedures (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee conference call (.7); follow-up emails to and from BS regarding confirmation (.2).
11/19/2010	27966025	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/19/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review and comment on proposed solicitation letter from Official Committee.
11/19/2010	27964779	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/20/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Receive and review Order Granting Debtor's Second Motion for Order Approving Abandonment of Certain Real Estate Owned property (.2); receive and review Orders Approving Third Interim Application and Allowing Compensation and Expenses to Stichter, Riedel and to Berger Singerman, As Counsel to Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (.2).
11/19/2010	27966044	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/21/2010	2.70	650.00	1,755.00	Analyze and comment on solicitation motion, ballots, form publication notice, confirmation hearing notice and proposed order (2.0); review email from Berger Singerman regarding solicitation matters and respond (.2); receive and review update from Berger Singerman regarding solicitation matters (.2); review emails from Mr. Spector and Ms. Galler regarding solicitation matters and respond (.3).
11/19/2010	27966045	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/21/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review email from Berger Singerman regarding solicitation package and respond to same.
11/19/2010	27964787	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/22/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Emails from BS on solicitation motion and related matters, and respond to same (.3); telephone conferences with Mr. Spector regarding same (.3); conference call with Debtors' counsel and BS regarding action needed on solicitation and confirmation hearing (.4); update Chair regarding same (.1); follow-up conference call with BS regarding action needed on confirmation hearing and solicitation procedures (.4); update Chair on latest developments (.1).
11/19/2010	27964788	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/22/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Receive and review Motion of Debtor TBW for an Order Authorizing Sale of Debtor's Jumbolair Mortgage Note Free and Clear of All Liens, Claims, and Interests.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
11/19/2010	27964789	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/22/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Order Granting Debtor's Second Motion for Order Approving Abandonment of Certain Real Estate Owned Property.
11/19/2010	27983955	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/25/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review information from Berger Singerman on solicitation procedures and review action needed regarding same.
11/19/2010	27983956	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/25/2010	2.00	650.00	1,300.00	Work on Plan and confirmation matters including review of revised procedures motion, proposed order regarding solicitation procedures, notice of non-voting, form of ballots, form of confirmation hearing notice, form of publication notice, and provide comments regarding all to Berger Singerman (2.0).
11/19/2010	27983957	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/25/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Reject Unexpired Lease with U.S. Bancorp Business Equipment Finance Group (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Reject Unexpired Lease with US Bancorp Manifest Funding Services (.2); receive and review notice on sale matters (.1).
11/19/2010	27983958	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/25/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Analyze Financial Reports for period 9/1/10 to 9/30/10 for Debtors TBW, REO, and Home America Mortgage, and prepare letter to Chair regarding same.
11/19/2010	27983983	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/26/2010	1.30	650.00	845.00	Receive and review Findings of Facts and Conclusions of Law regarding WARN Act (.2); review agenda and related materials (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); follow-up emails with BS team regarding confirmation (.2).
11/19/2010	27983990	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/27/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review information from BS on confirmation matters and respond to same.
11/19/2010	27983991	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/27/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review materials and prepare report to Chair on Committee action.
11/19/2010	27989800	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/28/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Prepare email to Chair on pending matters, and consider action needed regarding hearing.
11/19/2010	27989808	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/29/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review Order Overruling Defendant's Objection to Court Document No. 1585 (.2); receive and review Motion for Approval of Office Lease with MIL Owner and Related Sublease with Boyken International (.2); receive and review email from BS on solicitation and plan matters and respond to same (.2).
11/19/2010	27989809	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/29/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review and comment on 10/19 minutes.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
11/19/2010	27989818	06831	Workman, Donald A	10/31/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review and comment on minutes from 10/5 and 10/12.
12/20/2010	28024722	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/01/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review email from BS on case matters.
12/20/2010	28024735	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/02/2010	0.10	650.00	65.00	Review status of matter and update Chair.
12/20/2010	28024736	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/02/2010	3.30	650.00	2,145.00	Prepare email to BS on case matters and review response (.2); receive and review agenda and related materials for Committee meeting (.2); prepare email to BS team regarding same and review responses (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Waller regarding employee and claim issues (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on plan and disclosure statement developments, and update on Wells (.3); prepare email to CRO and review response (.2); receive and review email on TBW By-laws (.2); receive and review update on trade claims (.2); receive and review email on plan liquidation analysis and comment on same (.2); receive and review email on status of Freddie and discuss with Mr. Berger (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on plan and disclosure statement matters (.4).
12/20/2010	28024744	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/03/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Receive and review Objection to Disclosure Statement by Sovereign Bank (.2); review and comment on 10/26 minutes (.2); receive and review Motion for In Camera Inspection and to Compel Production of Documents Pertaining to TBW (.2); receive and review update from BS on Wells settlement (.2); review term sheet on Wells deal (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/20/2010	28063032	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/04/2010	6.70	650.00	4,355.00	Receive and review complaint email from Cox to various parties and government entities (.2); analyze Sovereign Objection to Disclosure Statement (.3); discuss case matters with Chair (.2); receive and review emails from BS on Wells and respond (.2); receive and review emails from Committee members regarding Wells and review responses (.3); prepare email to Mr. Berger on Wells (.1); analyze Freddie objection to Disclosure Statement (.3); telephone conference with Ms. Waller on Wells deal (.2); receive and review email from Ms. Waller regarding same (.1); review and comment on Wells Fargo trust agreements on settlements (1.0); meet with CRO, Navigant, BS Team, Debtor on Wells deal, Disclosure Statement, and plan matters (3.0); analyze Tanner and Smith objection to BS regarding LPS representation, and consider impact on LPS as Chair (.5); analyze Oyler objection to BS regarding LPS representation, and consider impact on LPS as Chair (.3).
12/20/2010	28058624	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/05/2010	5.90	650.00	3,835.00	Prepare email to Chair on Wells settlement (.1); analyze FDIC Response to FHLMC (.2); review revised Chapter 11 and Chapter 7 liquidation analyses (.3); review and comment on additional exhibits to Disclosure Statement (.3); receive and review email from Chair on Wells and review BS information regarding same (.2); meet with TBW team to prepare for hearing on Disclosure Statement (2.5); prepare for and attend hearing on disclosure statement and other matters (1.5); discuss next steps with TBW team after hearing (.5); meet with BS team regarding same (.3).
12/20/2010	28133672	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/07/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review status of Wells and communicate with Mr. Berger regarding same.
12/20/2010	28079456	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/08/2010	0.60	650.00	390.00	Receive and review Motion for Production of Documents (.2); prepare email to BS on certain matters (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on Wells and related matters (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/20/2010	28080077	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/09/2010	2.80	650.00	1,820.00	Review information on proposed orders regarding disclosure statement and solicitation motions, and email BS team regarding same (.3); receive and review agenda and pleadings summary from BS for committee meeting (.2); analyze proposed NL Ventures agreement and comment (.3); analyze and comment on Debtor's legal memorandum on Gomez May adversary proceeding and review strategy regarding same (.8); emails to and from Mr. Berger on pending matters (.2); prepare for and participate on committee meeting conference call (.8); prepare email to Mr. Berger on Wells and review response (.2).
12/20/2010	28087203	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/10/2010	1.20	650.00	780.00	Receive and review Supplemental Affidavit of Neil Luria on behalf of TBW (.2); consider impact and email BS regarding same (.2); review Original Signed Common Interest Agreement (.2); receive and review Executed Confidentiality Agreement and Non-Disclosure Certificates (.2); receive and review Motion for Production of Documents Filed by Creditor J. Crain (.2); review TBW Bylaws (.2).
12/20/2010	28133696	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/12/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Receive and review Notice of Appearance on bank matter (.2); receive and review documents on Wells transactions and settlement (.3); receive and review update on plan matters (.2).
12/20/2010	28133698	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/13/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Review and comment on November 2 meeting minutes (.2); receive and review Order Approving First Amended and Restated Disclosure Statement (.2); analyze Order Approving (1) Procedures for Solicitation and Tabulation of Votes to Accept or Reject Plan and Limited Waiver of Local Rule 3018-1, (2) Related Notice and Objection Procedures, (3) Procedures to Determine Holders of claims in TBW Class 9, and (4) Waiver of Local Rule 3071-1(b) (.3).
12/20/2010	28167319	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/14/2010	1.80	650.00	1,170.00	Prepare email to Mr. Berger on plan matters and Wells deal (.2); review and comment on draft Wells agreement, proposed order and motion (.5); provide comments on same to BS (.2); review and comment on latest plan changes (.4); review corresponding disclosure statement and changes (.5).
12/20/2010	28167327	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/15/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Review information on Wells deal and action needed regarding same (.3); review updated documents regarding same (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/20/2010	28155319	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/16/2010	2.60	650.00	1,690.00	Review Notice of Filing of Revisions to Proposed Joint Plan of Liquidation of Debtors and Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors with attachments (.5); review Notice of Filing of Second Amended and Restated Disclosure Statement with attachments (.7); prepare email to Ms. Waller on meeting matters and review response (.2); review agenda and related materials for Committee meeting conference call (.2); receive and review update from BS (.2); receive and review additional meeting information (.1); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7).
12/20/2010	28157085	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/17/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review and comment on 11/9 minutes (.2); review follow-up information on pending matters for hearing (.2).
12/20/2010	28167340	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/18/2010	2.40	650.00	1,560.00	Receive and review Motion for Approval of Compromise and Settlement on certain assets (.2); receive and review Motion to Approve Compromise Between TBW and NL Ventures VII Magnolia (.2); review strategy regarding same (.2); prepare email to Mr. Singerman regarding same (.1); prepare email to Chair and review response (.2); receive and review emails from BS regarding same and respond (.3); receive and review Saxon Mortgage filing (.2); receive and review Objection to Motion Regarding Docket Number 1979 and Motion in Docket Number 2093 regarding Voting on Claim filed by K. Duran (.2); receive and review Order Striking Objection to Motion Regarding Docket Number 1979 and Motion in Docket Number 2093 Regarding Voting on claim (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Reject (Omnibus) Unexpired Executory Contracts (.2); receive and review Debtor's Motion to Fix Objection Deadline, Set Hearing, and Approve Form of Notice, together with Notice of hearing Scheduled on Procedural Motion for Omnibus Hearing Time, and review underlying motion (.4).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/20/2010	28167354	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/19/2010	2.50	650.00	1,625.00	Receive update from Mr. Luria on pending matters (.1); prepare email to Mr. Berger on case matters and review response (.2); receive and review inquiry from BS on case and action needed on claims (.2); receive and review Debtor's Omnibus Objection to Motions for In Camera Inspection and to Compel Production of Documents of S. Smith and J. Cox-Tanner (.2); receive and review Notice of proposed Agenda for Omnibus Hearing on 11/19/10 (.2); receive and review Debtors' Motion for Extension of Exclusive Period to Obtain Acceptance of plan (.2); receive and review Notice of filing of Signed Loan Sale Agreement with Respect to Sale of Jumbolair, Inc. Mortgage Note (.2); prepare for and participate on hearing on Disclosure Statement and other matters (.8); prepare email to Chair on hearing and review response (.2); prepare email to BS regarding Disclosure Statement and action needed (.2).
12/20/2010	28167357	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/20/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review Notice of preliminary hearing on certain pro se litigants papers (.2); review strategy regarding same and communicate with Chair (.4); prepare email to BS regarding same and review response (.2).
12/20/2010	28167364	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/21/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Review email from BS on claims, analyze, and respond to same.
12/20/2010	28190567	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/22/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Prepare email to Ms. Galler regarding her inquiry on claims and review responses (.2); Receive and review Notice of Preliminary Hearing on Motion and Petition to Present Pertinent Evidence to Court (.2).
12/20/2010	28190577	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/23/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Review and comment on minutes for 11/16 committee meeting (.2); receive and review agenda and related materials for Committee Meeting (.3); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding case matters and review response (.2); prepare for and participate on committee meeting conference call (.7); prepare email to James Berger on plan trust agreement and review response (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
12/20/2010	28190588	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/24/2010	2.60	650.00	1,690.00	Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Set Hearing and to Fix Deadline for Filing Objections and to Approve Form of Notice on Motion to Approve Settlement Agreements related to mortgage pools (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Sell Debtor's Jumbolair, Inc. Mortgage Note and Granting Related Relief (.2); receive and review Order Directing Response Regarding Debtor's Motion for Extension of Exclusive Period to Obtain Acceptance of Plan (.2); receive and review Order Approving Second Amended and Restated Disclosure Statement, Scheduling Confirmation Hearing, and Fixing Time for Filing Acceptances or Rejection of Second Amended and Restated Joint Plan of Liquidation (.2); receive and review Notice of Hearing regarding Wells settlement (.2); receive and review Amended Motion for in Camera - to Correct Affidavit only - no new hearing required filed by Creditor Sue Ann and Sandy Smith (.2); analyze Financial Reports for the period October 1, 2010 to October 31, 2010 for Taylor, Bean & Whitaker, Home America Mortgage, Inc. and REO Specialists, LLC., and report to Chair (.4); analyze and comment on latest revisions to Plan Trust Agreement (1.0).
12/20/2010	28190595	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/28/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Prepare email to Mr. Berger regarding plan trust agreement (.2); review status of confirmation matters (.3).
12/20/2010	28197734	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/29/2010	1.10	650.00	715.00	Receive and review email from BS on meeting and review related materials (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Berger on plan trust agreement and respond (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on comments regarding plan trust agreement (.4); update Chair on case status and recent activity (.1); review recent electronic filings (.2).
12/20/2010	28212657	06831	Workman, Donald A	11/30/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Receive and review update from BS on case matters (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); review proposed Plan Support Agreement (.4); review information from BS regarding same and respond (.2).
02/16/2011	28283687	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	11/24/2010	0.50	180.00	90.00	Work on obtaining case status and filings.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
02/16/2011	28229449	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/01/2010	1.40	650.00	910.00	Review Navigant CRO invoice for December (.2); receive and review email from BS on Plan matters and respond (.2); receive and review Motion to Approve Settlement with BB&T (.2); receive and review Motion for Approval of Debtor's Allocation of Disputed loans and Related Assets and for Approval of Summary Process for Resolution of Disputed Loan Issues (.3); review notice regarding same (.1); prepare email to BS regarding same (.1); review information on Navigant retention and communicate with BS regarding same (.3).
02/16/2011	28230457	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/02/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Receive and review emails from BS on plan matters and respond (.3); perform preliminary review of Navigant retention contract for post-confirmation (.2); review emails and updated revisions to Plan Trust Agreement (1.0); receive and review email from Chair on Plan matters (.1).
02/16/2011	28229461	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/03/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review Order Overruling Defendant's Objection to Sale of TBW Assets to Colonial Bank/USAmeribank, Bank of New York Mellon as Investor and to Compel Inspection of Original Court Document.
02/16/2011	28229462	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/03/2010	0.80	650.00	520.00	Receive and review agenda for hearing (.2); review status of disputed loan procedures and motion and follow up with BS team regarding same (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Berger on status of same and respond (.2); review and comment on 11/30 minutes for Committee meeting (.2).
02/16/2011	28295610	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/06/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review Notice of Rescheduled Hearing on Loan Dispute Procedure (.2); review plan matters (.3).
02/16/2011	28301922	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/07/2010	1.50	650.00	975.00	Receive and review agenda and related materials for Committee meeting (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on Wells, whole loans and related case matters (.5); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.8).
02/16/2011	28315964	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	12/08/2010	1.20	180.00	216.00	Obtain case filings and proofs of claims, and status.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
02/16/2011	28293910	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/08/2010	1.30	650.00	845.00	Receive and review emails from BS on claims objections and respond (.2); review and comment on Navigant fee statement and expenses for periods ending November 7, 14 and 21 (.5); review information on DOJ action on restitution (.2); prepare email to BS regarding same and review response (.2); receive and review Notice of filing Plan Proponents' Determination of Which Holders of General Unsecured Claims Are Entitled to Treatment as a Holder of Claims in TBW Class (.2).
02/16/2011	28383039	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/09/2010	0.30	650.00	195.00	Review information on plan classification, and action needed regarding same.
02/16/2011	28326753	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/10/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review filings on plan matters.
02/16/2011	28301938	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/11/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Review plan matters from Berger Singerman.
02/16/2011	28327469	07975	Giaimo, Christopher J.	12/14/2010	0.50	575.00	287.50	Prepare for and participate in Committee meeting conference call regarding Freddie Mac settlement and related case issues.
02/16/2011	28326761	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/14/2010	1.70	650.00	1,105.00	Review information on whole loans and Freddie (.3); review and comment on December 7 minutes and email Berger Singerman regarding same (.3); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on meeting and respond (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger regarding Freddie and status of various matters (.3); review and comment on Navigant statements for 10/20 (.3); emails from and to Berger Singerman on various plan matters and action needed in case (.3).
02/16/2011	28527018	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	12/15/2010	0.50	180.00	90.00	Work on obtaining case filings and status.
02/16/2011	28339863	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	12/15/2010	0.30	180.00	54.00	Work on obtaining case filings and status.
02/16/2011	28326772	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/15/2010	0.70	650.00	455.00	Receive update on Freddie and confirmation issues (.2); update Chair regarding same (.1); receive and review Amended Motion for Approval of Debtor's Allocation of Disputed Loans and Related Assets (.2); receive and review Joint Motion of Debtor and Deloitte for Confidentiality Order Governing the Joinder Parties' Access to Confidential Material Produced by DeLoitte (.2).
02/16/2011	28339867	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	12/16/2010	0.20	180.00	36.00	Work on obtaining case status and filings.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
02/16/2011	28326784	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/16/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Receive and review Motion to Approve Settlement and review Settlement (.2); review and comment on 12/7 minutes and prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.3).
02/16/2011	28339883	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	12/17/2010	1.00	180.00	180.00	Work on obtaining case status and filings (1.0).
02/16/2011	28326794	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/17/2010	2.40	650.00	1,560.00	Review agenda for hearing (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Singerman on plan matters and consider impact on confirmation (.2); prepare email to Mr. Singerman regarding same and review response (.2); follow up with Mr. Berger on plan matters and Freddie (.2); receive and review Sovereign's Objection to Settlement with BBT concerning certain loans (.2); receive and review Sovereign's Objection to Wells Settlement (.2); receive and review BOA's Objection and Motion for Reconsideration of sale of REO (.2); review information from Berger Singerman on confirmation matters (.3); receive and review Motion to Sell Certain Real Property (.2); receive and review Limited Objection of ACE to Wells Settlement (.2); analyze Motion to Sell Whole Loans and corresponding auction procedures, etc. (.3).
02/16/2011	28326797	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/18/2010	0.50	650.00	325.00	Review recent case activity (.2); follow up with Mr. Berger on Freddie activity and review emails from Mr. Berger regarding same (.3).
02/16/2011	28326800	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/19/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Telephone conference with Mr. Berger on plan update.
02/16/2011	28358547	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/20/2010	0.20	650.00	130.00	Receive and review email from Berger Singerman on plan matters.
02/16/2011	28358548	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/20/2010	1.20	650.00	780.00	Receive and review Debtor's Motion for Order Approving Abandonment of Interest in Certain Loans (.2); receive and review Objection to Motion for Approval of Compromise and Settlement by and Among United Funding Mortgage Corp, Taylor Bean & Whitaker Mortgage and REO Specialist (.2); receive and review Motion to Allow Claim for Purposes of Voting on the Joint Plan of Liquidation (.2); receive and review Objection to Debtor's Motion to Approve Settlement Agreements related to Mortgage Pools Held by 12 Separate Mortgage Backed Securities Trusts (.2); analyze Financial Reports for the Period November 1, 2010 to November 30, 2010 for TBW, REO & HAM and update Chair regarding same (.4).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
02/16/2011	28345440	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/21/2010	1.70	650.00	1,105.00	Review current status and update Chair (.1); receive and review proposed agenda and review related materials (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.9); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding Plan matters and receive response (.2); receive and review email from Chair on ballots and respond to same (.2).
02/16/2011	28359100	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/22/2010	0.40	650.00	260.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman on case matters (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Singerman on plan and respond (.2).
02/16/2011	28359111	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/23/2010	1.60	650.00	1,040.00	Receive and review Omnibus Objection #4: Claims Improperly Filed as Secured And/Or Priority (.2); receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #9: Claims For Which Debtors Are Not Liable (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion for Approval of Stipulation and Compromise Between Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. and NL Ventures VII Magnolia (.2); receive and review Response to Debtors' Omnibus Objection #1: Claims Improperly Filed as Secured (.2); receive and review Motion for Final Determination of Trade Creditor Classification Filed by Yekaterina Mesic on Behalf of Creditor AK Contracting General Contractors Property Management, LLC (.2); receive and review Motion for Order Temporarily Allowing the Uncontested, Unsecured Portion of Claim for Purposes of Voting on the Joint Plan of Liquidation (.2); receive and review Objection to Motion to Approve Settlement Agreements Related to Mortgage Pools Held by 12 Separate Mortgage Backed Securities Trusts (.2); receive and review Freddie's Provisional Motion to Allow Claim to Vote (.2).
02/16/2011	28373127	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/28/2010	1.90	650.00	1,235.00	Review materials from Berger Singerman (.2); review pending matters and pleadings (.3); call from Berger Singerman on meeting matters (.1); prepare for and participate on committee meeting conference call (.7); follow up emails with Berger Singerman regarding confirmation matters (.6).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
02/16/2011	28383048	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/29/2010	2.20	650.00	1,430.00	Review update from Berger Singerman on various confirmation matters and respond (.2); receive and review email from chair on Plan issues and respond (.2); review information on additional trade creditors (.2); receive and review update from Mr. Singerman on confirmation and provide feedback (.2); analyze Navigant documents on case through 10/17/10 (.3); receive and review IFS Motion on Trade Creditor status (.2); receive and review Order on Auction of Whole Loans (.2); receive and review Order approving Debtors' Allocation of Disputed Loans and Related Assets (.2); receive and review Confidentiality Order on Certain Materials (.2); analyze Debtor's Objection to Freddie Priority Claim (.3).
02/16/2011	28383057	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/30/2010	2.20	650.00	1,430.00	Receive and review Notice of Sale on Whole Loan Mortgages and corresponding Notice of Hearing (.2); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on confirmation matters, and respond to same (.4); review demands from BOA and action needed regarding same, and consider alternatives (.4); receive and review email from Chair regarding same (.1); review information on discovery and consider alternatives (.4); review and comment on 12/21 and 12/28 Committee meeting minutes (.3); review and comment on 10/24 and 12/12 Navigant statements and expenses (.4).
02/16/2011	28383062	06831	Workman, Donald A	12/31/2010	1.00	650.00	650.00	Review updates on confirmation matters, and consider action needed in light of recent developments (.5); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on case matters and respond (.2); review filings (.3).
03/25/2011	28393365	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/03/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Receive and review email from Chair on ballots and respond (.2); receive and review email from creditor on plan and respond (.2).
03/25/2011	28386814	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	01/04/2011	1.00	180.00	180.00	Work on obtaining case status and filings.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/25/2011	28393375	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/04/2011	3.30	695.00	2,293.50	Receive and review proposed amendment to FDIC agreement, and provide comment to Chair for execution (.3); receive and review emails from Chair and Berger Singerman regarding same (.1); analyze memorandum on B of A claim issue and potential resolution (.3); review information from Berger Singerman on B of A, and review discovery propounded by BofA (.4); discuss plan matters with Chair and action needed regarding proceeding with confirmation (.3); review agenda and summary of pleadings (.2); telephone conference with creditor on supporting plan (.3); review updated information from Berger Singerman on plan matters (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (1.0); review action needed for 1/7 hearing (.2).
03/25/2011	28454198	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/04/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Receive and review completed ballots from Chair (.2); prepare letter for balloting agent regarding same (.2).
03/25/2011	28393384	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/05/2011	1.60	695.00	1,112.00	Receive and review Notice on Extension of Exclusivity (.2); review update from Berger Singerman on action by Committee regarding upcoming hearing (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman on clarifying plan status and action needed, and review response (.2); receive update on Freddie activity and estimation, and respond to same (.2); analyze and comment on Navigant statements for periods ending 10/31 and 11/28 (.4); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.1); receive and review email analysis from Mr. Spector and provide comment (.3).
03/25/2011	28464018	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	01/06/2011	1.50	180.00	270.00	Work on obtaining case status and filings.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/25/2011	28393390	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/06/2011	1.80	695.00	1,251.00	Receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #1: Claims Improperly Filed As Secured; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #2: Claims Improperly Filed As Priority; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #3: Claims Improperly Filed As Secured And/Or Priority; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #4: Claims Improperly Filed As Secured And/Or Priority; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #5: Claims Improperly Filed As Secured And/Or Priority; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #6: Claims Improperly Filed As Secured And/Or Priority; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #7: Claims For Which Debtors Are Not Liable; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #8: Claims For Which Debtors Are Not Liable; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #9: Claims For Which Debtors Are Not Liable; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #10: Certain Claims Improperly Filed; receive and review Debtors' Omnibus Objection #11: Claims Improperly Filed Twice (1.8).
03/25/2011	28393391	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/06/2011	0.50	695.00	347.50	Receive and review Notice on Request for Administrative claim (.2); review and revise Committee minutes from January 4, and provide comments to Berger Singerman (.3)
03/25/2011	28454206	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/07/2011	5.00	695.00	3,475.00	Receive and review agenda for hearing; prepare email to Mr. Spector regarding same and review response; receive and review Notice of Deposition and request for documents for Freddie; receive and review Notice of Deposition and exhibit of topics for FNFA; review and comment on Navigant statements through 12/19; review background for hearing and review petition by borrower; prepare for and participate in hearing on various matters (5.0).
03/25/2011	28471286	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/08/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman on plan and confirmation issues.
03/25/2011	28471290	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/09/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Receive and review email from Mr. Berger on confirmation and respond (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on GNMA and respond (.2); review information for Committee regarding same and respond (.2); follow up on release language (.2).
03/25/2011	28477353	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/09/2011	0.30	695.00	208.50	Telephone conference with Mr. Berger on Freddie, recent hearing matters and action needed.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/25/2011	28464024	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	01/10/2011	0.20	180.00	36.00	Work on obtaining case filings and status.
03/25/2011	28484699	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/10/2011	8.00	695.00	5,560.00	Receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on GNMA matters and respond (.2); review and comment on proposed language (.3); update chair regarding same and review response (.2); review information on Freddie negotiations and action needed regarding same (.6); review status of ballots and balloting for confirmation (.2); emails to and from Berger Singerman on B of A, GNMA and Freddie (.3); prepare for and participate on conference call regarding planning for confirmation and various settlements (1.5); review and comment on revised GNMA release and waiver language (.4); review B of A settlement draft (.3); prepare for and participate in meeting on planning regarding negotiation session with Freddie (4.0).
03/25/2011	28464032	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	01/11/2011	0.20	180.00	36.00	Work on obtaining case status and filings.
03/25/2011	28484710	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/11/2011	4.70	695.00	3,266.50	Receive and review Debtor's First Amended Notice of Deposition of Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation with documents (.2); receive and review Debtor's First Amended Notice of Deposition of Federal Home Finance Agency with documents (.2); review and comment on Navigant's CRO invoice for January 2011 (.2); review information and rulings from hearing (.2); prepare email to Mr. Casas on Freddie meeting and review response (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Spector on GNMA (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman on plan matters and review response (.2); receive and review Woodlands response on claim (.1); review Smith Objection on sale and comments on committee member (.2); review Committee meeting agenda and pleadings (.2); review background, prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (1.0); work on B of A settlement (1.0); prepare email to chair on Freddie deal points (.2); follow up emails from and to Mr. Casas on Freddie deal points (.2); review update on acceptance by GNMA (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on Freddie and plan matters (.3).
03/25/2011	28473346	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/12/2011	0.30	695.00	208.50	Review status of confirmation and action needed regarding same.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/25/2011	28484721	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/13/2011	3.40	695.00	2,363.00	<p>Receive and review Objection to Confirmation of Plan by First American Title Insurance Company (.2); receive and review Objection to Confirmation of Joint Plain of Liquidation Filed by Bowie CAD et al (.2); receive and review Objection to Confirmation of Second Amended and Restated Joint Plan of Liquidation of the Debtors and Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors by Texas Taxing Authorities (.2); receive and review Order Striking The Woodlands Metro Center MUD and the Woodlands RUD Response to Debtors' Eighth Omnibus Objection to Claims (.2); receive and review Objection to the Second Amended and Restated Joint Plan of Liquidation Filed by Creditor LPP Mortgage, Ltd. and LNV Corporation (.2); receive and review Limited Objection to the Second Amended and Restated Joint Plan of Liquidation of the Debtor, Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Co. and the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors Filed by American Insurance company (.2); receive and review Bank of America's Objection to Wells (.2); receive and review Notices of Withdrawal of Depositions for Freddie and FNFA (.2);</p> <hr/> <p>prepare email to Berger Singerman on confirmation and settlement matters (.2); receive and review update from Mr. Singerman on confirmation and respond (.2); review and comment on proposed settlement with Freddie, and email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.5); follow up email with Berger Singerman regarding same (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding confirmation and Freddie (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Spector on FDIC need to sell COLB loans on emergency basis (.2); update chair regarding same (.1); review Berger Singerman demand to FNFA counsel on settlement (.2).</p> <hr/>

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/25/2011	28484732	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/14/2011	3.10	695.00	2,154.50	Analyze and comment on revised settlement agreement with FDIC, and email Chair regarding same (.4); receive and review email from Chair regarding same and respond (.2); receive and review Joint Motion of Debtor and the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation, as Receiver of Colonial Bank, for Order Authorizing Debtor to (I) Execute Mortgage Loan Assignment and Servicing Agreement to Effectuate the Transfer of COLB Loans and (II) to Amend Settlement Agreement (.3); receive and review Notice of Hearing giving notice of the scheduling of the hearing on the Joint Motion for January 19, 2011, at 10:00 a.m. (.1) emails to and from Berger Singerman team on confirmation and plan matters (.3); receive and review Notice of Change of time and location of the January 19 hearing (.1); receive and review Debtors' Motion to Adjourn/continue/reschedule Confirmation (.2); receive and review Notice of Hearing on the Motion to Adjourn (.1); prepare email to Mr. Singerman regarding plan matters (.1); update chair regarding latest developments (.1); receive and review Order Denying OneWe
<hr/>								
Motion For Relief From Stay (.2); receive and review Order Granting Debtor's Motion For Order Approving Abandonment Of Interest In Certain Loans (.2); receive and review Order Granting In Part and Denying In Part NL Ventures VII Magnolia, L.L.C.'S Motion For Order Temporarily Allowing The Uncontested, Unsecured Portion of Claim For Purposes of Voting on the Joint Plan of Liquidation (.2); receive and review Agreed Order Granting Relief To Permit Lloyds of London To Advance Defense Costs and Payment of Settlement (.2); review Order Granting Debtor's Motion to Reject Unexpired Lease of Non-Residential Real Property With Deerwood II, LLC (.2); receive and review Order Overruling Objection To Order Granting Stalking horse Protections and Auction For the Sale of Certain Mortgage Loans Free and Clear of All Liens, Claims and Interest (.2).								
03/25/2011	28506021	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/17/2011	0.30	695.00	208.50	Review draft settlement agreement with B of A and review status.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/25/2011	28506030	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/18/2011	1.70	695.00	1,181.50	Review status of B of A and prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.2); receive and review Agenda for confirmation hearing (.2); receive and review Berger Singerman agenda and material pleadings for Committee meeting (.2); emails to and from Berger Singerman on confirmation (.2); telephone conference with James Berger regarding confirmation and pending settlements (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6).
03/25/2011	28515582	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/19/2011	1.80	695.00	1,251.00	Receive and review Order on Production of Documents (.2); receive and review Order Approving Settlement Agreement (.2); conference call with Berger Singerman and CRO regarding confirmation matters (.3); review and comment on Navigant through 12/26 (.3); emails from and to Berger Singerman on confirmation matters (.2); review information on hearing (.2); conference call with Mr. Singerman and Mr. Luria on confirmation matters (.4).
03/25/2011	28506040	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/20/2011	1.10	695.00	764.50	Review Order on Sandy Smith matters, and review information from Berger Singerman regarding same (.3); respond to Chair's inquiry regarding same (.1); discuss current status of negotiations with Mr. Singerman (.2); review and comment on latest version of Freddie settlement, and discuss with Mr. Singerman (.5).
03/25/2011	28515593	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/21/2011	0.70	695.00	486.50	Review and comment on 1/18 Minutes for Committee meeting (.2); review and comment on January 11, 2011 Minutes of Committee meeting (.2); receive and review First American Complaint against TBW and consider impact (.3).
03/25/2011	28548654	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/23/2011	0.30	695.00	208.50	Prepare email to Committee member regarding meeting (.1); review update from Berger Singerman and Navigant, and provide status to chair (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/25/2011	28548666	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/24/2011	1.80	695.00	1,251.00	Receive and review Notice of Continued Confirmation Hearing (.2); receive and review Renewed Objection to Order Granting Stalking Horse Protections and Auction for the Sale of Certain Mortgage Loans Free and Clear of All Liens, Claims and Interest by Defendant Victim (.2); receive and review Order on Motion To Approve Stipulation of Zurich American Insurance Company, and Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., et al. Deeming A Proof of Claim Timely (.2); analyze Financial Reports for the Period December 1, 2010 to December 31, 2010 for Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., REO Specialists, LLC, Home America Mortgage, Inc., and prepare summary to Chair (.4); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion for Approval by Home America Mortgage for an Order Authorizing the Sale of Real Property Free and Clear of All Liens, Claims and Interests (.2); receive and review Objection to Order Granting Stalking Horse Protections and Auction for the Sale of Certain Mortgage Loans by Defendant Victim Filed by Creditor Joni Cox-Tanner (.2);
								receive and review Order on Defendant's Petition and Motion to Present Pertinent Evidence to the Court Regarding Lender Processing Services and Their Alleged Activities of Fraud on Behalf of Unsecured Creditors (.2).
03/25/2011	28548677	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/25/2011	1.20	695.00	834.00	Review update from Berger Singerman on pending matters (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on agenda and significant matters (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.5); discuss confirmation and related matters with Mr. Luria (.3).
03/25/2011	28548694	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/27/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Receive and review report from Berger Singerman on potential settlement with NL Ventures, and respond to same (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Spector regarding same (.1); review matters from court update (.1).
03/25/2011	28548703	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/28/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Receive and review email from Berger Singerman on NL Ventures and respond.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/25/2011	28548720	06831	Workman, Donald A	01/31/2011	0.90	695.00	625.50	Receive and review Order Approving Third Amendment to Settlement Agreement By And Among TBW, FDIC, as Receiver of Colonial Bank, and Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (.2); receive and review Order Further Extending Debtors' Exclusivity Period To Obtain Acceptance of Plan (.2); receive and review Order Overruling Stouts' Objection To Order Granting Stalking Horse Protections and Auction For The Sale of Certain Mortgage Loans Free and Clear Of All Liens, Claims and Interest (.2); receive and review Crain's Notice of Appeal Order on Disclosure (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on case matters (.1).
03/31/2011	28596395	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/01/2011	2.20	695.00	1,529.00	Receive and review Notice to Appellant (Crain) of Responsibilities and Notice of Deficient Filing (.2); receive and review Motion to Approve Compromise of Controversy with U.S. Racing, LLC, Michael Peters (.2); receive and review Cox-Tanner Objection to (i) Granting Stalking Horse Protections, (ii) Appeal to any and all Transactions to sell Certificates or "Bad" Loans which may contain fraud, (iii) Response to the Financial Statements Put into Court (.2); receive and review Smith Objection to (i) Granting Stalking Horse Protections, (ii) Appeal to any and all Transactions which may contain fraud to this Court, (iii) Response to the Financial Statements Put into Court for The Month Ending 12/31/10 (.2); receive and review Amended Order Granting Debtor's Motion for Order Approving Abandonment (.2); review agenda and background materials for meeting (.2); review recent activity in case (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee conference call (.8).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/31/2011	28603445	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/03/2011	1.00	695.00	695.00	Receive and review Debtor's Objection to Cox-Tanner claim and related hearing notice (.2); consider inappropriateness of timing of objection with confirmation, and email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.2); receive and review Supplemental Affidavit of Jeffrey W. Kelley Pursuant to Rule 2014 (.2); receive and review Motion to Approve Compromise Between Taylor, Bean & Whitaker and U.S. Racing LLC, Angelia Clifton and Michael Peters (.2); receive and review Amended Order Granting Debtor's Motion For Order Approving Abandonment of Interest In Certain Loans (.2).
03/31/2011	28597717	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/04/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Review and comment on 1/25 Minutes (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on action from 1/4 meeting (.2); receive and review Agenda for hearing (.2).
03/31/2011	28657835	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/07/2011	0.50	695.00	347.50	Receive and review emails and update on confirmation matters (.3); prepare email to Berger Singerman on settlements and confirmation (.2).
03/31/2011	28657851	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/08/2011	2.30	695.00	1,598.50	Review agenda and important pleadings (.1); prepare for and participate on Committee Meeting Conference call (.7); receive and review email from Ms. Galler on inquiry regarding report and respond (.2); receive and review email update from Berger Singerman on confirmation and respond (.2); review and comment on revised Freddie term sheet (.6); receive and review Order Approving Debtor Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp.'s Sale of Certain Mortgage Loans To Selene Finance LP (.2); receive and review Second Amended Order Granting Debtor's Motion For Order Approving Abandonment of Interest in Certain Loans (.2); review court report on 2/4 hearing (.1).
03/31/2011	28657863	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/09/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Receive and review Motion to Sell Property Free and Clear of Liens (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Extend Time to filed Designated Items (.2); receive and review Motion to Continue/Reschedule Hearing on Objection to Claim 2621 of Joni Cox-Tanner (.2); review and comment on Committee Meeting Minutes for 2/1 (.2).
03/31/2011	28625594	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/13/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Compose email to Paul Singerman on Freddie, FNFA and BA meeting (.2); review status of confirmation matters (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/31/2011	28676450	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/15/2011	1.30	695.00	903.50	Receive and review information on case, pleadings and agenda (.2); prepare for and participate Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Committee meeting conference call (.8); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on Freddie (.3).
03/31/2011	28682289	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/16/2011	0.70	695.00	486.50	Discuss case with Mr. Haynie (.3); receive and review Statement Of Issues On Appeal Filed by Crain (.2); receive and review Appellant Designation of Contents for Inclusion in Record on Appeal (.2).
03/31/2011	28682301	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/17/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Review status and update Chair on Freddie deal.
03/31/2011	28696759	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	02/18/2011	0.30	180.00	54.00	Work on obtaining case filings and status.
03/31/2011	28682315	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/18/2011	1.00	695.00	695.00	Emails to and from Berger Singerman on case and confirmation matters (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on confirmation, Freddie and other resolutions and their status (.5); update Chair on status (.1); receive and review Notice of Fifth Amendment to the Colorable Actions List Filed Pursuant to the Order Granting Motion of the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Derivative Standing to Prosecute Certain Actions in the Name of the Debtor, Adding Claims Against Certain Entities and Individuals (.2).
03/31/2011	28713055	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/20/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Receive and review email from Committee member and respond (.2); discuss situation on confirmation with Mr. Berger (.2).
03/31/2011	28732836	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/21/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman on pending matters and review response.
03/31/2011	28732844	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/22/2011	0.90	695.00	625.50	Receive and review agenda and materials from Berger Singerman (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.5); review update from Berger Singerman on confirmation (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
03/31/2011	28732860	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/23/2011	1.70	695.00	1,181.50	Receive and review Notice of Request to Compel Evidence and Documentation to Said Court By and On Behalf of Creditor/Defendant Sandy Smith (.2); analyze Financial Reports for the Period January 1, 2011 to January 31, 2011, for Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., Home America Mortgage, Inc, REO Specialists, LLC, and prepare summary for Chair (.4); prepare email to chair on developments from Committee meeting (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on pending matters (.3); update committee chair regarding same and review response (.2); follow up telephone conference with Mr. Berger on Freddie developments and committee action (.2); review and comment on 2/28 minutes and prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.2).
03/31/2011	28732873	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/24/2011	0.70	695.00	486.50	Review and comment on Navigant fees ending 1/23/11 (.3); telephone conferences with James Berger on confirmation matters and settlement (.4).
03/31/2011	28732886	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/25/2011	2.30	695.00	1,598.50	Review information from Committee members on Freddie resolution and respond (.2); receive and review regional emails from Berger Singerman regarding same and respond (.2); review update from Mr. Singerman and respond (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on confirmation matters (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting emergency conference call (.7); receive and review email from Chair on resolution and respond (.2); prepare proposal for Trustees' counsel (.3); review and comment on minutes of February 22 committee meeting (.2).
03/31/2011	28732899	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/27/2011	1.10	695.00	764.50	Review and comment on Navigant statements and expenses for periods ending 1/23/11, 1/16/11, 1/2/11, 1/9/11 (.9); review update from Berger Singerman on confirmation (.2).
03/31/2011	28732907	06831	Workman, Donald A	02/28/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Receive and review email from Berger Singerman on agreement in principal with Freddie (.2); receive and review emails from committee members on case (.2); review response from Berger Singerman to committee member's inquiry (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
04/28/2011	28775593	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/01/2011	1.40	695.00	973.00	Receive and review Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Motion for an Order Authorizing the Sale of Certain of the Debtor's Mortgage Loans Free and Clear of All Liens, Claims, and Interests (.2); review agenda and related materials (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Singerman and other Committee members on case and respond (.2); prepare for and participate in Committee meeting conference call (.6); receive and review adjournment notice of confirmation from Debtor (.2).
04/28/2011	28775620	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/03/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Review and comment on 2/25 minutes (.2); receive and review Motion to Adjourn and Continue Confirmation (.2); receive and review Agenda for hearing (.2).
04/28/2011	28775628	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/04/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Receive and review update on confirmation.
04/28/2011	28835796	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/08/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Receive and review agenda and supporting documents (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6).
04/28/2011	28825009	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/09/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Receive and review Notice of Filing Sixth Supplement to List of Ordinary Course Professionals.
04/28/2011	28835805	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/11/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Receive and review Debtor's Third Motion for Order Approving Abandonment of Certain Real Estate Owned property.
04/28/2011	28927937	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/12/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Receive and review Motion to Compel certain documents from TBW by pro se litigant.
04/28/2011	28871057	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/14/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Receive and review Order Rescheduling Confirmation.
04/28/2011	28925734	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	03/15/2011	0.30	180.00	54.00	Work on obtaining case filings and status.
04/28/2011	28871067	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/15/2011	1.50	695.00	1,042.50	Review background, agenda and materials from Berger Singerman on case matters (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on latest developments with Freddie (.3); consider alternatives in light of same (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); receive update from Berger Singerman on Freddie agreement (.2).
04/28/2011	28871080	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/16/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Receive and review information from Berger Singerman on case (.2); review former president's plea agreement (.4).
04/28/2011	28871097	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/17/2011	0.70	695.00	486.50	Review Order on Berger Singerman fees (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on update regarding Freddie and other matters (.3); update Chair on latest action by Freddie (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
04/28/2011	28871111	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/18/2011	0.70	695.00	486.50	Receive and review agenda for hearing (.2); analyze and comment on Navigant statement through January 30 (.3); prepare email to Mr. Berger on status and review response (.2).
04/28/2011	28871117	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/20/2011	1.20	695.00	834.00	Receive and review Request for Review by Cox-Tanner, consider implications, and email Berger Singerman regarding same (.2); review and comment on Kissick plea agreements, facts and criminal information to determine useful information for Committee (.4); receive and review Order Granting Motion To Approve Compromise of Controversy between Debtor and U.S. Racing, Angelia Clifton and Michael Peters (.2); receive and review Order Granting Application For Interim Compensation for Debtors' counsel (.2); receive and review Request for Amendment and Modification of Claim Number 219 (.2).
04/28/2011	28890430	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/21/2011	1.90	695.00	1,320.50	Review status of action by Freddie (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same and review response (.2); follow up emails to and from Berger Singerman on latest developments on confirmation and action needed regarding same (.3); update Chair regarding same (.1); receive and review update on certain claimants and respond (.2); receive email from Paul Singerman regarding TBW-Settlement Agreement with Freddie and FHFA (.2); compose email to Chair regarding TBW progress (.2); review and comment on draft agreement (.3); receive and review email from Mr. Berger on Freddie and confirmation, and respond (.2).
04/28/2011	28880570	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/22/2011	1.90	695.00	1,320.50	Receive and review agenda and related materials for Committee meeting (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on Freddie update (.4); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.7); receive and review information from Berger Singerman on Mr. Farkas (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Berger with an update on Freddie (.1); analyze and comment on Navigant statements through 2/6/11 (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
04/28/2011	28884584	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/23/2011	3.60	695.00	2,502.00	Receive and review email on Bayview from Berger Singerman and respond (.2); emails to and from Chair on execution of Bayview agreement, and respond (.2); review and comment on proposed Bayview agreement, and email Berger Singerman regarding same (2.0); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on Freddie, confirmation and Bayview settlement (.8); compose email to Berger Singerman regarding TBW-Bayview settlement (.2); receive and review updates on Committee approval (.2).
04/28/2011	28890444	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/24/2011	1.00	695.00	695.00	Telephone conferences with James Berger on Freddie status, confirmation issues, and action needed (1.0).
04/28/2011	28890461	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/25/2011	3.20	695.00	2,224.00	Receive and review Notice on Bank of America hearing (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on latest update from Freddie and action needed regarding same (.4); prepare update on confirmation for Chair (.2); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on case matters and respond (.2); telephone conference with Berger Singerman team on emergency meeting (.1); prepare for and participate on emergency Committee meeting conference call (.8); telephone conference with Mr. Berger regarding follow up on Freddie (.3); analyze Financial Reports for the Period February 1, 2011 to February 28, 2011 for TBW, HAM & REO and prepare summary for Chair (.4); review and comment on March 8 and March 15 minutes, and prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.3); receive and review Status Report on United States' Motion to Lift Automatic Stay and review related documents (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman on Freddie (.1).
04/28/2011	28927949	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/26/2011	0.10	695.00	69.50	Review status and update Chair regarding same.
04/28/2011	28911215	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/27/2011	0.30	695.00	208.50	Review and comment on Navigant statements through February 13.
04/28/2011	28927956	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/28/2011	0.70	695.00	486.50	Telephone conferences with James Berger on confirmation matters and Freddie settlement (.3); discuss current status and action to take with Chair (.1); follow up with Mr. Berger on update (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
04/28/2011	28916715	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/29/2011	1.50	695.00	1,042.50	Emails to and from Mr. Berger on current status (.2); receive and review email from Committee member regarding same and respond (.2); review agenda and meeting materials (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); follow up call with Mr. Berger after meeting on strategy (.3).
04/28/2011	28927963	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/30/2011	0.30	695.00	208.50	Review information from BS on case and consider alternatives.
04/28/2011	28925757	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	03/31/2011	0.30	180.00	54.00	Work on obtaining case filings and status.
04/28/2011	28927972	06831	Workman, Donald A	03/31/2011	1.00	695.00	695.00	Receive and review Response to Debtors' Omnibus Objection #1-Claims improperly filed as Secured filed by LPP Mortgage (.2); review Desiree Brown's plea agreement (.2); receive and review letter from BS to Freddie counsel and moving settlement (.2); prepare email to BS re same and review responses (.2); review information on Court's ruling on Lloyd's action and respond (.2).
05/31/2011	28994672	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/03/2011	0.70	695.00	486.50	Review status of Freddie and review documents regarding same.
05/31/2011	28980708	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/04/2011	1.70	695.00	1,181.50	Receive and review Addendum Clarification to Motion for Relief as to a Portion of the Sale Order and in Alternative, Application for Allowance and Payment of an Administrative Expense Claim Filed by Creditor Bank of America (.2); receive and review Order on Motion of United States of America to Modify Automatic stay in Federal Tax Lien Enforcement Action (.2); receive and review Order on Bank of America's Motion for Relief as to Portion of Sale Order and Alternative Application for Allowance and Payment of Administrative Expense (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion for Approval of Consent Order in Connection with The Sale of Certain of the Debtor's Mortgage Loans (.2); analyze Order Granting in Part and Denying in Part Motion to Dismiss Lloyd's Adversary Proceeding (.2); receive and review Request for Review and Inspection and Proof of Fraud by Sandy Smith (.2); receive and review Motion to Approve Consent agreement in Connection with certain of Debtor's Mortgage Loans (.2); emails to and from Berger Singerman team on Freddie and confirmation matters (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
05/31/2011	28994684	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/05/2011	1.70	695.00	1,181.50	Receive and review information on actions pending and Freddie status (.2); review letters from Freddie counsel (.2); receive and review agenda and meeting matters (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman team on Freddie and review responses (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.8); review status and update Chair regarding same (.1).
05/31/2011	28985844	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/06/2011	1.30	695.00	903.50	Receive and review update from Berger Singerman on Freddie, and review information from Navigant regarding same (.2); prepare email to Chair regarding same (.1); emails to and from Berger Singerman regarding latest developments on Confirmation (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman regarding breakthrough on Freddie (.2); receive and review Notice of Filing of Second Amendment To Mortgage Loan Purchase and Sale Agreement (.2); receive and review Motion To Approve Stipulation and Consent Agreement in Connection with the Sale of Certain of the Debtor's Mortgage Loans (.2); review status of confirmation (.2).
05/31/2011	28989195	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/07/2011	1.20	695.00	834.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman team on status of Freddie, and review responses (.2); receive and review update from Berger Singerman on resolution and review Committee member responses (.3); receive and review email regarding draft settlement and respond (.2); review pleadings summary from Berger Singerman (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Berger regarding same (.2); follow up emails regarding same and confirmation (.2).
05/31/2011	28994698	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/08/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Receive and review Order Directing Response to Request for Review of Documentation Pertaining to Claim Number 2621, Inspection of Documentation Thereof Verifying Servicing Fraud, and Wiring Fraud and Proof Demonstrating the Actual Fraud (.2); receive and review Order Directing Response to Request for Review of Documentation Pertaining to Claim, Inspection of Documentation thereof Verifying Servicing Fraud, and Wiring Fraud and Proof Demonstrating the Actual Fraud (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Sell Certain of the Debtor's Mortgage Loans Free and Clear of All Liens, Claims, and Interest (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
05/31/2011	28994699	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/08/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Receive and review report from Berger Singerman on Farkas trial (.2); receive and review Agenda for Hearing (.2).
05/31/2011	28994706	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/09/2011	0.90	695.00	625.50	Receive and review Amended Order Granting Motion to Sell Certain of the Debtor's Mortgage Loans Free and Clear of All Liens, Claims, and Interests (.2); receive and review Motion to Compel Payment of Debtor's Obligations under Section 365(d) filed by Creditor 443 Building Corporation (.2); receive and review Debtors' Motion for Third Adjournment, Continuance, and Rescheduling of Hearing on Plan Confirmation and Related Matters (.2); prepare email to Debtor's counsel regarding same (.1); receive and review email from Mr. Blaine and respond (.2).
05/31/2011	29014592	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/11/2011	2.30	695.00	1,598.50	Call with Berger Singerman Team on Freddie Settlement Agreement (.1); revise same and email to Mr. Berger (.6); telephone conferences with Mr. Berger on various settlement issues (.3); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman regarding same and respond (.2); review and comment on Wells agreements and Bayview settlement (.8); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on pending matters and confirmation (.2); prepare update for Chair (.1).
05/31/2011	29016331	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/12/2011	2.20	695.00	1,529.00	Receive and review Agenda and materials on Committee meeting (.2); review outcome of hearing (.1); review and comment on March 22, 25, 29 and April 5 minutes of Committee meetings (.4); prepare for and participate on TBW Committee meeting conference call (.5); receive and review emails from Chair on documents for confirmation settlements and respond (.2); receive and review Request to Compel Evidence and Documentation to Said Court by and on Behalf of Creditor/Defendant Elliott (.2); receive and review Amended Request for Review of Documentation by the Said Court Pertaining to Claim Number 2621, Inspection of Documentation thereof Verifying Servicing Fraud, and Wiring Fraud and Proof Demonstrating the Actual Fraud filed by Smith (.2); receive and review Objection to Confirmation of Plan Filed by Creditor Sandy Smith (.2);

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
								receive and review Request for Review of Documentation by the Said Court Pertaining to Claim Number 220, Inspection of Documentation thereof Verifying Servicing Fraud, and Wiring Fraud and Proof Demonstrating the Actual Fraud Filed by Creditor Joni Cox-Tanner (.2).
05/31/2011	29016855	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/13/2011	3.50	695.00	2,432.50	Receive and review Emergency Motion by Faskas on Proceeds and review related Notice (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding same (.1); analyze and comment on draft 9019 settlement Motion with Freddie (1); analyze and comment on draft Third Amended Plan in respect of Freddie, Natixis and Sovereign changes (2.0); receive and review update from Berger Singerman on Freddie and respond (.2).
05/31/2011	29032208	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/14/2011	0.50	695.00	347.50	Receive and review emails from Berger Singerman and Committee member on case, and respond (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Berger regarding same (.2).
05/31/2011	29032220	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/15/2011	0.90	695.00	625.50	Review information on Farkas (.2); review status of confirmation (.2); receive and review response to inquiry on insurance (.2); review and comment on Navigant statement for period through February 27 (.3).
05/31/2011	29105430	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	04/18/2011	0.30	180.00	54.00	Work on obtaining case status and filings.
05/31/2011	29052804	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/18/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Review Farkas trial testimony summaries (.4); review status of action by Freddie (.2); receive and review updates from Berger Singerman team regarding same (.2).
05/31/2011	29068350	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/19/2011	2.00	695.00	1,390.00	Receive and review agenda and background on case (.2); receive and review emails and updates on confirmation matters from Berger Singerman (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on confirmation strategy (.4); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.8); receive and review Notice of Filing in Support of Farkas' Emergency Motion for Relief from the Automatic Stay Filed by Farkas (.2); review information on Farkas trial (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
05/31/2011	29068363	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/20/2011	0.90	695.00	625.50	Receive and review Motion to Approve Settlement Agreement By and Between Debtor Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., U.S. Bank National Association as Trustee, Magnolia Street funding, Inc. Magnolia Street Funding II, Inc., TBW Funding Company II, LLC, Bayview Financial L.P., Bayview Loan Servicing, LLC, Trusts, Manufacturers and Traders Trust Co., and The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of the Debtor Regarding Certain Mortgage-Backed Securities Transactions and review related notices/documents (.3); receive and review Response to Lee Farkas' Emergency Motion for Relief from Automatic Stay, to the Extent Applicable to Permit Payment of Defense Costs Filed by National Union (.2); receive and review Limited Objection to Motion to Approve Settlement Agreement Filed by Creditor Sovereign Bank (.2); review Farkas trial and related information (.2).
05/31/2011	29055091	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/21/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Receive and review Notice of Adjourned, Continued, Rescheduled Hearing on Confirmation (.2); prepare emails to Mr. Berger on updates regarding Freddie and review responses (.3); receive and review revisions to FDIC agreement, comment, and email Berger Singerman and Chair regarding same (.3).
05/31/2011	29059209	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/22/2011	2.10	695.00	1,459.50	Prepare email to Mr. Berger on Freddie action and review response (.2); review update on Freddie (.2); analyze and comment on Freddie proposed objection to confirmation (.8); update Committee Chair on confirmation (.1); analyze 9019 motion on Freddie and provide comments to Berger Singerman (.8).
05/31/2011	29059210	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/22/2011	1.20	695.00	834.00	Analyze Financial Reports for the Period March 1, 2011 to March 31, 2011 for Taylor, Bean & Whitaker, Home America Mortgage, Inc., and Reo Specialists, LLC, and summarize for Chair (.4); review and comment on Navigant Statements and expenses for periods through February 20 and March 6 (.5); review summary on Farkas testimony (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
05/31/2011	29059217	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/23/2011	1.60	695.00	1,112.00	Update analysis for Berger Singerman team and email Messrs. Singerman and Berger regarding same (.4); prepare email to Berger Singerman team on confirmation matters (.2); analyze and comment on Freddie's revisions to plan, review comments from CRO, and provide additional comments regarding same (1.0).
05/31/2011	29059223	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/24/2011	1.10	695.00	764.50	Analyze statements and expenses for Navigant through 3/13/11, 3/20/11, and April CRO (.9); receive and review Notice of Filing Guilty Verdict in Lee Farkas Criminal Action Filed by National Union Fire Insurance Company (.2)
05/31/2011	29079999	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/25/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Telephone conference with Mr. Berger on latest developments and action needed.
05/31/2011	29084743	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/26/2011	1.50	695.00	1,042.50	Receive and review agenda and related matters (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); receive and review Motion to Approve Consent Agreement in Connection with the Sale of Certain of the Debtor's Mortgage Loans (.2); analyze and comment on Navigant statements and expenses through 3/27/11 (.3); receive and review emails on meeting with Liquidating Trustee regarding post confirmation and respond (.2).
05/31/2011	29099312	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/27/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Emails to and from Mr. Berger on confirmation matters and action needed on Freddie (.3); receive and review email from Chair on FDIC extension (.1); receive and review Order Sustaining Objection to Claim(s) #2621 of Joni Cox-Tanner and Charles Tanner (.2).
05/31/2011	29099319	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/28/2011	1.40	695.00	973.00	Receive and review email from Mr. Berger on planning and respond (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on latest from FHFA and consider alternatives in light of impact on confirmation (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman regarding same (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman regarding same and respond (.2); plan for post-confirmation matters (.4).
05/31/2011	29099325	06831	Workman, Donald A	04/29/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Review status of matters and update Chair on confirmation (.2); receive and review email from Chair regarding same (.1); receive and review email from Berger Singerman Team on Freddie and confirmation (.2); review Committee members information regarding same (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/20/2011	29118655	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/02/2011	1.70	695.00	1,181.50	Emails to and from Mr. Berger on post confirmation matters (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger regarding same (.2); work on post confirmation planning (.8); plan for hearing (.2); numerous follow up emails to and from Mr. Berger on confirmation and Freddie issues (.3).
06/20/2011	29138169	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/03/2011	4.20	695.00	2,919.00	Receive and review Debtors' Motion for Fourth Adjournment, Continuance, and Rescheduling of Hearing on Plan Confirmation and Related Matters (.2); emails to and from Mr. Berger on confirmation matters (.2); review strategy regarding same and meet with Berger Singerman team on preliminary confirmation matters (3.0); receive and review agenda and related materials for committee meeting (.2); prepare for and participate on committee meeting conference call (.6).
06/20/2011	29138182	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/04/2011	7.00	695.00	4,865.00	Review materials from Navigant on post confirmation matters, meet with Berger Singerman team on confirmation issues, and attend all-day meeting with CRO and professionals on post-confirmation litigation preparations (7.0).
06/20/2011	29147508	08367	Kessler, Dena S.	05/05/2011	1.00	300.00	300.00	Obtain language to use in revised plan on fee reimbursement.
06/20/2011	29138200	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/05/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Review information on substantial contribution provisions in plan, and email Berger Singerman regarding same (.3); receive and review email from CRO on confirmation matters (.1).
06/20/2011	29138201	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/05/2011	0.10	695.00	69.50	Review current status and provide status and provide update to Chair.
06/20/2011	29138215	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/06/2011	1.30	695.00	903.50	Receive and review agenda for hearing (.2); prepare for and attend confirmation hearing and related matters (.8); receive and review email update from Debtor regarding court action and respond (.2); prepare update to Chair regarding same (.1).
06/20/2011	29154580	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/07/2011	0.70	695.00	486.50	Work on post-confirmation preparations (.5); prepare email to Chair on confirmation and review response (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/20/2011	29138223	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/08/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Receive and review Notice of Hearing and Amended Notice of Hearing on confirmation (.2); receive and review Motion to Object to Transfer of Defendant's Loan without Defenses against Debtors Filed by Creditor Joni Cox-Tanner (.2); receive and review Debtor's response to Cox-Tanner Request For Review Of Documentation By The Said Court Pertaining To Claim Number 2621, Inspection Of Documentation Thereof Verifying Servicing Fraud, and Wiring Fraud and Proof Demonstrating The Actual Fraud (.2); receive and review Debtors' Response to Smith Request for Review of Documentation By The Said Court Pertaining To Claim Number 2621, Inspection of Documentation Thereof Verifying Servicing Fraud, and Wiring Fraud and Proof Demonstrating The Actual Fraud (.2).
06/20/2011	29201068	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	05/09/2011	0.30	180.00	54.00	Work on obtaining case filings and status.
06/20/2011	29150338	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/09/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman on post-confirmation fees.
06/20/2011	29154592	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/10/2011	3.90	695.00	2,710.50	Receive and review agenda and related materials (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.4); emails to and from Berger Singerman and CRO regarding confirmation planning (.3); prepare for and participate on conference call regarding confirmation, post confirmation and post confirmation litigation matters (2.2); compose email to Chair regarding Taylor, Bean & Whitaker confirmation update (.2); receive and review Notice of Continued Status Conference Hearing on Confirmation, Objection to the Purported Priority Classification and Amount of Claim No. 2629 Filed by The Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation, Motion to Allow Claim for Purposes of Voting on the Joint Plan of Liquidation and Third Motion for Order Approving Abandonment of Certain Real Estate Owned Property (.2); receive and review Notice of Continued Hearing on Motion to Compel Payment of Debtor's Obligations Under Section 365 (d) filed by 443 Building Corporation (.2); receive and review Order Granting Emergency Motion for Relief From Stay to the Extent Applicable to permit Payment of Defense Costs of Lee Farkas by National Union Fire Insurance Company (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/20/2011	29154606	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/11/2011	1.60	695.00	1,112.00	Receive and review Objection to the Confirmation of the Discharge Plan due to the Need for Review of Debtor Fraud Upon the Securities Exchange Commission (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on confirmation and post confirmation matters (.4); receive and review Notice on various continued hearings and on status conference for confirmation (.2); receive and review Order Denying Request For Review Of Documentation By The Said Court Pertaining To Claim Number 2621, Inspection Of Documentation Thereof Verifying Servicing Fraud, And Wiring Fraud And Proof Demonstrating The Actual Fraud (Re: Sandy S. Smith) (.2); receive and review Order Denying Request For Review Of Documentation By The Said Court Pertaining To Claim Number 2621, Inspection of Documentation Thereof Verifying Servicing Fraud, and Wiring Fraud And Proof Demonstrating The Actual Fraud (Re: Cox-Tanner and Tanner) (.2); receive and review Order Denying Motion To Object To Transferal Of Defendant's Loan Without Defenses Against Debtors (.2);
								receive and review Motion To Object To Transferal of Defendant's Loan Without Defenses Against Debtors (.2).
06/20/2011	29171762	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/12/2011	1.20	695.00	834.00	Prepare email to Mr. Luria on confirmation matters and review response (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Luria regarding same (.4); call Mr. Singerman regarding same (.1); review and comment on Committee meeting minutes for April 12, 19, 26 and May 3 (.5).
06/20/2011	29171771	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/13/2011	1.00	695.00	695.00	Receive and review inquiry from Chair on case and respond (.2); review and comment on 5/10 Committee minutes (.2); analyze Navigant statements and expenses thru 4/10 (.3); prepare email to Berger Singerman on meetings (.1); receive and review emails from Mr. Singerman on case and respond (.2).
06/20/2011	29207864	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/14/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Receive and review email from Mr. Singerman on confirmation matters and respond (.2); receive and review follow up from Mr. Singerman and respond (.2).
06/20/2011	29208875	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/16/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Emails from and to Mr. Singerman on case matters (.2); review status of FHFA (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/20/2011	29186961	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/17/2011	1.30	695.00	903.50	Prepare email to Mr. Singerman on case matters and review response (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman on confirmation and post-confirmation matters (.4); receive and review agenda and related documents (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.5).
06/20/2011	29208891	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/18/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Receive and review Motion to Approve Compromise Between Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. and NL Ventures VII Magnolia (.2); receive and review Order Denying Motion To Object To Transferral Of Defendant's Loan Without Defenses Against Debtors (.2); receive and review Order on Berger Singerman fee request (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Luria on various matters (.2).
06/20/2011	29200462	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/19/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Emails to and from Berger Singerman team on current status of FHFA.
06/20/2011	29208895	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/19/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Telephone conference with James Gassenheimer regarding WARN Act mediation and potential resolution.
06/20/2011	29200471	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/20/2011	2.90	695.00	2,015.50	Receive and review Agenda for hearing (.2); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on status of FHFA and respond (.2); analyze FHFA proposed changes to settlement agreement and motion to approve (1.0); analyze FHFA's proposed changes to plan (1.5).
06/20/2011	29274945	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/21/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Prepare email to Mr. Berger on status of Freddie and review response (.2); review status of responses from Freddie (.2); prepare email to Mr. Singerman regarding same and review response (2).
06/20/2011	29274953	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/23/2011	2.10	695.00	1,459.50	Analyze ruling and related materials on ability of creditor to recover fees for achieving results in chapter 11 for confirmation (2.0); receive and review email from Berger Singerman on case matters (.1).
06/20/2011	29274959	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/24/2011	0.50	695.00	347.50	Receive and review emails from CRO on confirmation matters and respond (.2); receive and review email from Chair on case matters (.1); receive update from Berger Singerman on pending matters and respond (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/20/2011	29267173	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/24/2011	8.20	695.00	5,699.00	Receive and review email from Berger Singerman on post-confirmation matters and respond (.2); receive and review agenda and related materials (.2); review information on Natixis (.1); review post-confirmation strategy and litigation materials (1.0); participate on post confirmation litigation and confirmation planning conference call with CRO, Navigant, Berger Singerman, Troutman (5.0); prepare for and participate on committee meeting conference call (.5); follow up emails with Mr. Singerman on matters (.2); receive and review Debtor's Motion To Approve Contract with City of Ocala, Florida For Demolition of Building (.2); receive and review Order Approving Sale (.2); receive and review Motion to Object to Transferal of Defendant's Loan Without Defenses Against Debtors Filed by Creditor Michael & Dianna L. Elliott (.2); analyze Financial Reports for the Period April 1, 2011 to April 30, 2011 for Home America Mortgage, Inc., and REO Specialists, LLC, and update Chair regarding same (.4).
06/20/2011	29267183	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/25/2011	4.40	695.00	3,058.00	Review and comment on Navigant for statements through 4/17 and 5/1 (.5); prepare language for plan to allow recovery of fees (2.0); receive and review email from Mr. Singerman on post confirmation litigation and respond (.2); review follow up regarding same (.1); prepare email to Chair on WARN Act matters (.2); emails from and to Berger Singerman team on confirmation matters (.2); receive and review email from Navigant on post confirmation litigation and respond (.2); work on post confirmation matters with Berger Singerman and Navigant (1.0).
06/20/2011	29279280	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/26/2011	1.60	695.00	1,112.00	Telephone conference with Mr. Berger on Wells Fargo extension and requirements (.2); prepare email to Mr. Singerman on alternatives for confirmation scheduling and review responses (.2); receive and review emails from CRO on post confirmation litigation matters and respond (.2); prepare for and participate on conference call with Berger Singerman, Navigant and CRO regarding retention of Mr. Thomas for Deloitte litigation (1.0).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
06/20/2011	29279289	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/27/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Prepare email to Mr. Singerman on confirmation matters and review response (.2); receive and review Motion for a Comfort Order to permit payment of Policy Proceeds (.2).
06/20/2011	29274978	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/30/2011	0.10	695.00	69.50	Receive and review email from Berger Singerman on case matters.
06/20/2011	29285957	06831	Workman, Donald A	05/31/2011	1.50	695.00	1,042.50	Receive and review agenda and related materials prior to committee meeting (.2); receive and review emails from Berger Singerman updating on status of FHFA (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); prepare email to Mr. Berger on plan matters and review response (.2); receive and review Notice of Rescheduled hearing (.2); follow up email to Mr. Singerman on FHFA update (.1).
	29293475	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	06/01/2011	0.30	180.00	54.00	Work on obtaining case status and filings.
	29304630	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/01/2011	1.20	695.00	834.00	Receive and review email from Mr. Singerman on FHFA and respond (.2); compose email to Neil Luria on confirmation and review response (.2); call from Neil Luria regarding same (.3); follow up emails with CRO and Berger Singerman team regarding confirmation (.2); review update on FHFA at end of day, and emails with Berger Singerman team regarding same (.3).
	29306594	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/02/2011	2.40	695.00	1,668.00	Review status of action by Freddie and FHFA (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger regarding update on developments and action needed regarding confirmation (.5); prepare update for Chair regarding confirmation matters (.2); receive and review agenda for 6/3 hearing (.2); receive and review Notice of Rescheduled Hearing on status conference and confirmation (.2); receive and review Notice of Establishment of Special Bar Date for certain additional Parties (.2); telephone conferences with Mr. Berger on FHFA update (.2); provide update to Chair (.1); emails from and to Berger Singerman on FHFA approval and action needed on confirmation (.3); work on forfeiture issue and discuss with Mr. Gassenheimer (.3).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29306607	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/03/2011	1.40	695.00	973.00	Receive and review email from Mr. Singerman on FHFA and action on confirmation (.2); prepare for and participate on status conference and confirmation matters (.6); emails to and from Berger Singerman team regarding same (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger regarding hearing, confirmation, and action needed (.3); update Chair on status (.1).
	29323424	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/04/2011	0.20	695.00	139.00	Review update from Mr. Singerman.
	29325697	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/07/2011	1.60	695.00	1,112.00	Receive and review report from Court on hearing (.1); receive and review agenda and related materials for Committee (.2); emails to and from Berger Singerman team on confirmation status (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on update on plan amendment and confirmation (.3); update Chair on latest confirmation developments (.1).
	29390950	04941	Rivkin Jr, David B	06/09/2011	1.50	975.00	1,462.50	Conference call with counsel regarding "substitute assets" and DOJ options regarding same; attention to the same.
	29382150	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/09/2011	2.10	695.00	1,459.50	Review strategy on forfeiture and action to take on Farkas (.3); prepare email to Mr. Gassenheimer regarding same and review response (.2); prepare for and participate on conference call with Berger Singerman Team on Farkas and ability to recover (.7); prepare email to Mr. Berger on confirmation status and review response (.2); receive and review update from Berger Singerman on fee recovery and respond (.2); review and comment on Navigant fees and expenses thru 5/15 and 5/22 (.5).
	29382161	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/10/2011	1.10	695.00	764.50	Review and comment on Navigant statement and expenses through 5/19/11 (.3); review status of FHFA, confirmation and related matters (.2); receive and review Notice of Rescheduled Confirmation Hearing (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman team and review response (.2); receive update from Berger Singerman on documents for settlement (.2).
	29386813	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/12/2011	0.30	695.00	208.50	Receive and review update on confirmation from Berger Singerman and respond (.2); receive and review follow up from Mr. Singerman regarding same (.1).
	29420178	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/13/2011	0.30	695.00	208.50	Prepare email to Berger Singerman on confirmation (.1); review strategy on restitution issue (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29408199	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/14/2011	2.90	695.00	2,015.50	Receive and review information from Berger Singerman on criminal action (.2); review and comment on Committee meeting agenda and related materials (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on plan information and fee provision (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Berger regarding same and review alternative provisions (.3); receive and review email from Mr. Sagerman regarding same (.1); emails to and from Chair regarding case (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.5); review strategy on confirmation and fee issues (1.2).
	29434293	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	06/15/2011	0.30	180.00	54.00	Work on obtaining case filings and status.
	29420190	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/15/2011	0.50	695.00	347.50	Review and comment on Navigant Statements through 6/5 (.3); receive and review email from Ms. Galler on case matters and respond (.2).
	29420202	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/16/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Receive and review emails from Berger Singerman on TAF and respond (.2); review and comment on proposed retention letter for TAF (.3); follow up regarding same with Berger Singerman (.1); receive and review Agenda for hearing (.2).
	29414832	04941	Rivkin Jr, David B	06/17/2011	1.30	975.00	1,267.50	Attention to talking points for DOJ meeting.
	29424181	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/17/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Receive and review Notice of Continued and Rescheduled Confirmation Hearing (.2); receive and review claim objection information from Berger Singerman (.2); receive and review Order Directing Response to Motion For Comfort Order to Permit Payment of Policy Proceeds (.2).
	29464152	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/20/2011	2.20	695.00	1,529.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman on status and review response (.2); compose email to Chair regarding confirmation and document finalization (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Berger on language and respond (.2); review additional Plan language and comment (1.0); review status of Farka forfeiture (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on revised plan language (.2); follow up email from Mr. Berger on revised language, review and respond (.3); review information on FDIC extension (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29475067	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/20/2011	2.40	695.00	1,668.00	Prepare email to Berger Singerman on status and review response (.2); compose email to Chair regarding confirmation and document finalization (.2); receive and review email from Mr. Berger on language and respond (.2); review additional Plan language and comment (1.0); review status of Farkas forfeiture (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on revised plan language (.2); follow up email from Mr. Berger on revised language, review and respond (.3); review information on FDIC extension (.1).
	29478031	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/21/2011	0.40	695.00	278.00	Receive and review Rescheduled Confirmation Hearing Order(.2); receive and review Continued Rescheduled Hearing on Compromise and Related matters (.2).
	29464160	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/21/2011	1.30	695.00	903.50	Receive and review Agenda and related materials for Committee meeting (.2); analyze and comment on Navigant fees and expenses through 6/12/11 (.3); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.6); review update on settlements (.2).
	29464168	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/22/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Review status of Freddie and email Mr. Singerman regarding same (.2) receive and review update from Mr. Singerman and respond (.2); emails to and from Mr. Berger regarding action needed in case and on plan revisions (.3) follow-up with BS regarding confirmation (.1).
	29453396	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/23/2011	0.80	695.00	556.00	Receive and review email from Mr. Berger on confirmation and respond (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on current status and action needed re plan confirmation, and finalizing Navigant issues (.4); discuss confirmation with Debtor's counsel (.2).
	29488163	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/27/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Compose emails to Paul Singerman regarding cases (.2); follow up with Berger Singerman regarding same (.2); prepare email to Mr. Berger on confirmation deadlines (.2).
	29478041	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/28/2011	1.20	695.00	834.00	Receive and review Notice on Settlements, Hearings and Amended Plan (.2); review Agenda and related materials for Committee meeting (.2); review action needed for Confirmation (.1); prepare for and participate on TBW Committee conference call (.7).
	29488176	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/29/2011	0.10	695.00	69.50	Review status of matter and update Chair regarding same.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29488177	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/29/2011	1.00	695.00	695.00	Analyze and comment on Navigant Invoice through June 19 (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Berger on current confirmation issues (.3); prepare email to Chair on confirmation hearing and review response (.2); receive and review Notice of Sixth Amendment to the Colorable Actions List Filed Pursuant to the Order Granting Motion of the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Derivative Standing to Prosecute Certain Actions (.2).
	29488190	06831	Workman, Donald A	06/30/2011	1.10	695.00	764.50	Receive and review Response to Pro Se Motion for Comfort Order Filed by National Union Fire Insurance Company (.2); review status of Farkas assets and sentencing (.2); review strategy in light of same (.2); review action taken on Deloitte and current status (.3); emails to and from Berger Singerman regarding same (.2).
	29502835	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/01/2011	0.60	695.00	417.00	Receive and review email from Berger Singerman on claim objections, and consider impact on LPS (.3); receive and review Debtor's Application For An Order Approving The Retention And Employment Of Thomas Alexander & Forrester, LLP As Special Litigation Counsel, Thomas Declaration and Notice of Hearing (.3).
	29569038	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/03/2011	0.30	695.00	208.50	Receive and review declaration on Application to employ TAF, and review related documents on background.
	29572819	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/05/2011	3.10	695.00	2,154.50	Review background material (.2); receive and review agenda and supporting material (.2); review and comment on proposed B/A settlement, and provide to Berger Singerman (1.0); prepare for and participate on TBW Committee conference call (.7); review and comment on confirmation order (1.0).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29572825	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/06/2011	3.00	695.00	2,085.00	<p>Receive and review Objection to Approve Settlement Agreement by and Among Taylor Bean & Whitaker Mortgage, Federal Home Loan Mortgage and the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors and Objection to the Confirmation of the Second Amended and Restated Joint Plan Filed by Creditor Mark A. Armour (.2); receive and review Motion to Approve Settlement Agreement By and Among Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, and Bank of America, N.A. (.2); receive and review Motion to Shorten Time for Hearing on the Motion to Approve Settlement Agreement By and Among Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, and Bank of America, N.A. (.2); review status of various filings (.2); review and comment on proposed Navigant retention letter and indemnification (1.0); receive and review email from Mr. Berger regarding same and respond (.2); follow up emails and calls with Mr. Berger regarding same (.2); receive and review email from</p> <hr/> <p>Berger Singerman on Plan Advisory Committee post-confirmation and review responses (.3); prepare email to Mr. Singerman regarding same and review response (.2); review request by Berger Singerman on BOA Agreement, and review responses and summary (.3).</p> <hr/>

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29572833	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/07/2011	3.40	695.00	2,363.00	Analyze Financial Reports for the Period May 1, 2011 to May 31, 2011 for Debtor Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp., REO Specialists, LLC, and Home America Mortgage, Inc., and prepare letter to Chair regarding same (.4); receive and review Application to Employ Thomas, Alexander & Forrester, LLP as Special Litigation Counsel and review Declaration and Notice regarding same (.3); receive and review Notice of Establishment of Special Bar Date for Parties Listed on Exhibit A (.2); receive and review Order Granting Motion to Approve Compromise Between Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. and NL Ventures VII Magnolia, LLC (.2); receive and review Objection to Approve Settlement Agreement and Objection to the Confirmation of the Second Amended and Restated Joint Plan Filed by Creditor Michael & Dianna L. Elliott (.2); receive and review National Union Response to Motion (.2); receive and review information from Berger Singerman on Navigant agreement (.2); review and comment on revised Navigant agreement (1.0); compose email to Berger Singerman regarding problems with Navigant agreement (.3); receive and review email from Berger Singerman regarding same and respond (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman on confirmation order (.2).
	29572843	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/08/2011	2.30	695.00	1,598.50	Review and comment on revised letter to Navigant and retention agreement (.3); emails to and from Mr. Singerman on Navigant (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Singerman regarding same (.3); receive and review email from CRO regarding same and respond (.2); update Chair and other members regarding same, and review responses (.3); final review on resolution of Navigant (.2); receive and review Objection to Approve Settlement Agreement by and Among Taylor Bean & Whitaker Mortgage, Federal Home Loan Mortgage (.2); receive and review Limited Objection to Third Amended Joint Plan of Liquidation and Settlement Agreement among Debtor, the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors and Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation Filed by Bank of America, National Association (.2); review information from Berger Singerman on confirmation order and respond (.2); receive and review update from Mr. Spector regarding same (.1).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29572851	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/10/2011	0.70	695.00	486.50	Receive and review Joinder of Deutsche Bank AG to Bank of America's Limited Objection to Third Amended Joint Plan of Liquidation and Settlement Agreement Among Debtor, the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors and Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation (.2); prepare email to Berger Singerman regarding confirmation issues and review response (.2); follow up emails from and to Berger Singerman regarding updates through day (.3).
	29692843	6831	Workman, Donald A	7/10/2011	1.50	695.00	1,042.50	Analyze Declaration of Voting Agent (0.3); analyze Plan Proponent's Memorandum of Law (A) in Support of Confirmation of Third Amended and Restated Joint Plan of Liquidation of the Debtors and the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors; and (B) in Response to Objections Thereto (1.2).
	29657226	6831	Workman, Donald A	7/11/2011	3.30	695.00	2,293.50	Receive and review Order Granting Motion to Shorten Time for hearing on the Motion to approve settlement agreement by and among Taylor, Bean & Whitaker Mortgage Corp. the official committee of unsecured creditors and Bank of America, and review related notice (.2); receive and review Joinder to Bank of America's Limited Objection to Third Amended and Restated Joint Plan of Liquidation and Settlement Agreement Among Debtor, the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors and Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation Filed by FDIC (.2); review update and information on forfeiture (.3); prepare email to Berger Singerman on PAC matters (.2); review latest activity by Court (.2); review update and documents on Wells matters (.3); confirmation planning (.5); numerous services and edits of confirmation order (1.3).
	29583536	08247	Ravick, Jacob H.	07/11/2011	1.50	180.00	270.00	Work on obtaining case filings and status; prepare table of contents for upcoming Chair meeting.
	29702534	8367	Kessler, Dena S.	7/12/2011	5.60	300.00	1,680.00	Review background, review filings, prepare for Taylor, Bean & Whitaker confirmation hearing (5.0); participate in meeting to discuss recent developments and planned strategy in Taylor, Bean & Whitaker confirmation (.6).
	29669398	8247	Ravick, Jacob H.	7/12/2011	0.50	180.00	90.00	Work on obtaining case files.
	29588644	4941	Rivkin Jr, David B	7/12/2011	0.50	975.00	487.50	Review action needed regarding status of DOJ discussion.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29593148	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/12/2011	8.60	695.00	5,977.00	Attend Confirmation planning session, review proposed testimony,, meet with witnesses, meet with professionals, review proposed orders, consult with committee counsel, and meet with CRO on post confirmation matters (7.8); emails to and from Mr. Luria on case matters (.2); receive and review agenda and materials for meeting (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.4).
	29676038	6831	Workman, Donald A	7/12/2011	1.20	695.00	834.00	Analyze and comment on latest version of confirmation order.
	29676039	6831	Workman, Donald A	7/12/2011	9.10	695.00	6,324.50	Emails to and from Mr. Singerman on hearing (.3); attend Confirmation planning session, review proposed testimony, meet with witnesses, meet with professionals, review proposed orders, consult with committee counsel, and meet with CRO on post confirmation matters (7.8); emails to and from Mr. Luria on case matters (.2); receive and review agenda and materials for meeting (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.4); receive and review agenda for hearing (.2).
	29702535	8367	Kessler, Dena S.	7/13/2011	10.00	300.00	3,000.00	Attend Taylor, Bean & Whitaker confirmation hearing; participate in strategy session concerning Freddie Mac's objection to key settlement agreement; meetings and follow up work after completion of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker confirmation hearing.
	29655635	8367	Kessler, Dena S.	7/13/2011	0.30	300.00	90.00	Locate provision in confirmed plan on which to submit application for payment of fees and expenses and analyze the same to determine whether must meet "reasonable" or "substantial contribution" standard.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29593154	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/13/2011	9.20	695.00	6,394.00	Review and comment on confirmation order (.8); review update on Freddie and consider alternatives (.8); update Chair on status (.2); prepare for and participate in confirmation hearing and related matters heard by court, review information from Berger Singerman on outcome, meet with team during breaks, and review strategy in light of outcome (5.5); review and comment on Order regarding continuance (.2); review and comment on Order regarding B of A settlement (.2); review and comment on Order regarding Confirmation (.5); meet with CRO on post-confirmation matters, review chart of post-confirmation action items, and discuss with professionals (1.0).
	29702534	8367	Kessler, Dena S.	7/12/2011	5.60	300.00	1,680.00	Review background, review filings, prepare for Taylor, Bean & Whitaker confirmation hearing (5.0); participate in meeting to discuss recent developments and planned strategy in Taylor, Bean & Whitaker confirmation (.6).
	29669398	8247	Ravick, Jacob H.	7/12/2011	0.50	180.00	90.00	Work on obtaining case files.
	29588644	4941	Rivkin Jr, David B	7/12/2011	0.50	975.00	487.50	Review action needed regarding status of DOJ discussion.
	29593148	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/12/2011	8.60	695.00	5,977.00	Attend Confirmation planning session, review proposed testimony,, meet with witnesses, meet with professionals, review proposed orders, consult with committee counsel, and meet with CRO on post confirmation matters (7.8); emails to and from Mr. Luria on case matters (.2); receive and review agenda and materials for meeting (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.4).
	29676038	6831	Workman, Donald A	7/12/2011	1.20	695.00	834.00	Analyze and comment on latest version of confirmation order.
	29676039	6831	Workman, Donald A	7/12/2011	9.10	695.00	6,324.50	Emails to and from Mr. Singerman on hearing (.3); attend Confirmation planning session, review proposed testimony, meet with witnesses, meet with professionals, review proposed orders, consult with committee counsel, and meet with CRO on post confirmation matters (7.8); emails to and from Mr. Luria on case matters (.2); receive and review agenda and materials for meeting (.2); prepare for and participate on Committee meeting conference call (.4); receive and review agenda for hearing (.2).

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Hrs	Bill Rate	Bill Dol	Narrative
	29702535	8367	Kessler, Dena S.	7/13/2011	10.00	300.00	3,000.00	Attend Taylor, Bean & Whitaker confirmation hearing; participate in strategy session concerning Freddie Mac's objection to key settlement agreement; meetings and follow up work after completion of Taylor, Bean & Whitaker confirmation hearing.
	29655635	8367	Kessler, Dena S.	7/13/2011	0.30	300.00	90.00	Locate provision in confirmed plan on which to submit application for payment of fees and expenses and analyze the same to determine whether must meet "reasonable" or "substantial contribution" standard.
	29593154	06831	Workman, Donald A	07/13/2011	9.20	695.00	6,394.00	Review and comment on confirmation order (.8); review update on Freddie and consider alternatives (.8); update Chair on status (.2); prepare for and participate in confirmation hearing and related matters heard by court, review information from Berger Singerman on outcome, meet with team during breaks, and review strategy in light of outcome (5.5); review and comment on Order regarding continuance (.2); review and comment on Order regarding B of A settlement (.2); review and comment on Order regarding Confirmation (.5); meet with CRO on post-confirmation matters, review chart of post-confirmation action items, and discuss with professionals (1.0).
					863.10		553,451.50	Total
							641.24	Blended rate

Matter ID 056561.000032 - Costs
Matter Name: Taylor Bean & Whitaker Bankruptcy
Client: Fidelity National Information Services, Inc.

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
12/29/2009	20094005	06831	Workman	10/14/2009	36.00	3.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	36 Copies
12/29/2009	20095219	06831	Workman	10/15/2009	26.00	2.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	26 Copies
12/29/2009	20096743	06831	Workman	10/16/2009	1.00	0.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
12/29/2009	20096744	06831	Workman	10/16/2009	2.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
12/29/2009	20098723	06831	Workman	10/19/2009	1.00	0.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
12/29/2009	20098724	06831	Workman	10/19/2009	11.00	1.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	11 Copies
12/29/2009	20107515	06831	Workman	10/26/2009	1.00	2.58	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE OCT 09 POSTAGE
01/21/2010	20125979	06831	Workman	11/09/2009	1.00	0.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
01/21/2010	20142135	06831	Workman	11/19/2009	16.00	1.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	16 Copies
01/21/2010	20147719	06831	Workman	11/25/2009	1.00	0.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
01/21/2010	20147720	06831	Workman	11/25/2009	100.00	10.00	Copier / Duplication (E101)	100 Copies
01/21/2010	20138537	06831	Workman	11/03/2009	1.00	12.97	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx Donald Workman c o Omni Hotel 245 Water St JACK SONVILLE FL 798120123990
01/21/2010	20120612	06831	Workman	11/04/2009	40.00	80.00	Fax (E104)	40 Pages faxed to 904-791-4812
01/21/2010	20122001	06831	Workman	11/05/2009	4.00	8.00	Fax (E104)	4 Pages faxed to 904-791-4812

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
01/21/2010	20139861	06831	Workman	11/16/2009	1.00	1.22	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE NOV 09 POSTAGE
01/21/2010	20153077	06831	Workman	11/25/2009	1.00	7.02	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE NOV 09 POSTAGE
01/21/2010	20137194	06831	Workman	11/11/2009	1.00	9.95	Telephone Charges (E105)	Telephone Charges (E105) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend hearing on various matters and represent Committee Chair at hearing, in Jacksonville, Fl 11/4 & 11/5/09
02/25/2010	20047618	06831	Workman	09/09/2009	12.00	2.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	12 Copies
02/25/2010	20107516	06831	Workman	09/11/2009	1.00	9.15	Teleconference (E105)	199 minute conference call by Donald Workman at 02:53 PM
	20060181	06831	Workman	09/14/2009	1.00	675.20	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare/Trainfare (E110) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attendance at stakeholder meeting in Jacksonville, Fl 9/10/09
	20060182	06831	Workman	09/14/2009	1.00	100.00	Ground Transportation Local (E109)	Ground Transportation Local (E109) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attendance at stakeholder meeting in Jacksonville, Fl 9/10/09
	20060183	06831	Workman	09/14/2009	1.00	15.57	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Meals while Traveling (E111) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attendance at stakeholder meeting in Jacksonville, Fl 9/10/09
02/25/2010	20065222	06831	Workman	09/24/2009	1.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
02/25/2010	20065223	06831	Workman	09/24/2009	20.00	40.00	Fax (E104)	20 Pages faxed to 213-488-1425
02/25/2010	20066462	06831	Workman	09/25/2009	4.00	0.80	Copier / Duplication (E101)	4 Copies
02/25/2010	20068805	06831	Workman	09/28/2009	3.00	0.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	3 Copies
02/25/2010	20068806	06831	Workman	09/28/2009	3.00	0.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	3 Copies
02/25/2010	20070079	06831	Workman	09/29/2009	2.00	0.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
02/25/2010	20071920	06831	Workman	09/30/2009	6.00	1.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	6 Copies
02/25/2010	20071921	06831	Workman	09/30/2009	1.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
02/25/2010	20086871	06831	Workman	09/30/2009	1.00	3.36	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	PACER CHARGES 07/01/09 - 09/30/09
02/25/2010	20085881	07250	Koblenz	09/30/2009	1.00	2.16	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	PACER CHARGES 07/01/09 - 09/30/09
	20083226	06831	Workman	10/02/2009	1.00	855.05	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare/Trainfare (E110) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend meeting of creditors in Jacksonville Bankruptcy Court and participate in related meetings 9/29/09

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20083227	06831	Workman	10/02/2009	1.00	58.00	Business Meals, etc. (E111)	Business Meals, etc. (E111) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend meeting of creditors in Jacksonville Bankruptcy Court and participate in related meetings 9/29/09
	20083228	06831	Workman	10/02/2009	1.00	100.00	Ground Transportation Local (E109)	Ground Transportation Local (E109) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend meeting of creditors in Jacksonville Bankruptcy Court and participate in related meetings 9/29/09
	20083229	06831	Workman	10/02/2009	1.00	7.50	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Meals while Traveling (E111) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend meeting of creditors in Jacksonville Bankruptcy Court and participate in related meetings 9/29/09
	20107640	06831	Workman	10/19/2009	1.00	75.50	Ground Transportation Local (E109)	Ground Transportation Local (E109) - - VENDOR: SUNNY'S EXECUTIVE SEDAN SERVICE INC. Pick-up Workman, Donald from RESIDENCE, 6904 GEORGETOWN PIKE, MCLEAN, VA to DCA, US AIR, 3261 on 9/29/09

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20107648	06831	Workman	10/19/2009	1.00	67.50	Ground Transportation Local (E109)	Ground Transportation Local (E109) - - VENDOR: SUNNY'S EXECUTIVE SEDAN SERVICE INC. Pick-up Workman, Donald from DCA, AIR TRAN, 187 to RESIDENCE, 6904 GEORGETOWN PIKE, MCLEAN, VA 22101 on 9/29/09
	20137190	06831	Workman	11/11/2009	1.00	718.50	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare/Trainfare (E110) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend hearing on various matters and represent Committee Chair at hearing, in Jacksonville, Fl 11/4 & 11/5/09
	20137191	06831	Workman	11/11/2009	1.00	90.00	Ground Transportation Local (E109)	Ground Transportation Local (E109) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend hearing on various matters and represent Committee Chair at hearing, in Jacksonville, Fl 11/4 & 11/5/09
	20137192	06831	Workman	11/11/2009	1.00	213.57	Lodging (E110)	Lodging (E110) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend hearing on various matters and represent Committee Chair at hearing, in Jacksonville, Fl 11/4 & 11/5/09

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20137193	06831	Workman	40128	1.00	25.20	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Meals while Traveling (E110) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend hearing on various matters and represent Committee Chair at hearing, in Jacksonville, FL 11/4 & 11/5/09
	20137195	06831	Workman	11/11/2009	1.00	20.00	Miscellaneous (E124)	Miscellaneous (E124) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Attend hearing on various matters and represent Committee Chair at hearing, in Jacksonville, FL 11/4 & 11/5/09
	20184766	06831	Workman	12/18/2009	1.00	40.00	Business Meals, etc. (E111)	Business Meals, etc. (E111) - - VENDOR: DONALD A WORKMAN Meeting to discuss TBW case 12/18/09
02/25/2010	20206116	06831	Workman	12/31/2009	1.00	17.68	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	PACER CHARGES 10/01/09 - 12/31/09
03/31/2010	20233970	06831	Workman	01/25/2010	1.00	26.13	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx Debi Galler c o Donald Workman Berger Singerman 200 S Biscayne Blvd Ste 1000 MIAMI FL 7906935125 79
	20237387	06831	Workman	01/26/2010	1.00	567.70	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel;4Ticket

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20237384	06831	Workman	01/26/2010	1.00	1.25	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Tolls; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Jan 26, 2010
	20237390	06831	Workman	01/26/2010	1.00	36.38	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Parking; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Jan 26, 2010
	20237393	06831	Workman	01/26/2010	1.00	667.14	Lodging (E110)	Lodging; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel (1 Room for D. Workman and 1 Room for Client); Jan 26, 2010
	20237385	06831	Workman	01/26/2010	1.00	8.75	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Lunch; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Jan 26, 2010
	20237389	06831	Workman	01/26/2010	1.00	2.87	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Breakfast; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Jan 26, 2010

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20237383	06831	Workman	01/27/2010	1.00	67.14	Business Meals, etc. (E111)	Lunch; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Sheryl Newman; Jan 27, 2010
	20237392	06831	Workman	01/27/2010	1.00	50.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Taxi/Car Service; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Jan 27, 2010
	20237391	06831	Workman	01/27/2010	1.00	4.40	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Breakfast; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Jan 27, 2010
	20237388	06831	Workman	01/27/2010	1.00	9.20	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Dinner; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Jan 27, 2010
	20237386	06831	Workman	01/27/2010	1.00	15.00	Miscellaneous (E124)	Tips; Donald A Workman; Meeting as Committee Representatives with Debtor, Navigant, and respective Counsel; Jan 27, 2010
03/31/2010	20238268	06831	Workman	02/04/2010	1.00	2.75	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE FEB 2010 POSTAGE

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20252992	06831	Workman	02/15/2010	1.00	67.50	Ground Transportation Local (E109)	Ground Transportation Local (E109) - - VENDOR: SUNNY'S EXECUTIVE SEDAN SERVICE INC. Pick-up Workman, Donald from RESIDENCE 6904 GEORGETOWN PIKE, MCLEAN, VA to DCA AMERICAN DOMESTIC on 1/26/10
03/31/2010	20249638	06831	Workman	02/17/2010	2.00	0.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
03/31/2010	20250955	06831	Workman	02/18/2010	1.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
03/31/2010	20250956	06831	Workman	02/18/2010	50.00	10.00	Copier / Duplication (E101)	50 Copies
04/29/2010	20267348	06831	Workman	03/03/2010	20.00	4.00	Copier / Duplication (E101)	20 Copies
04/29/2010	20271370	07234	Jackson	03/04/2010	1.00	1.22	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE MAR 2010 POSTAGE
05/20/2010	20314066	06831	Workman	03/31/2010	1.00	6.88	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	PACER CHARGES 01/01/10 - 03/31/10
07/20/2010	20402855	07276	Crowley	06/11/2010	3.00	0.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	3 Copies
07/20/2010	20402856	07276	Crowley	06/11/2010	1.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
07/20/2010	20420494	07276	Crowley	06/11/2010	1.00	21.44	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx TAYLOR,BEAM & WHITAKER BMC GROUP INC 18750 Lake Dr E CHANHASSEN MN 791530199605 ROBERT CROWLEY
08/24/2010	20441069	06831	Workman	06/30/2010	1.00	38.24	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	PACER CHARGES 04/01/10 - 06/30/10

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
08/24/2010	20470705	07276	Crowley	07/06/2010	1.00	4.52	Automated Research (E106)	Westlaw Research - 07/06/10 by CROWLEY ROBERT
08/24/2010	20470706	07276	Crowley	07/07/2010	1.00	1.76	Automated Research (E106)	Westlaw Research - 07/07/10 by CROWLEY ROBERT
08/24/2010	20433528	06831	Workman	07/07/2010	278.00	27.80	Copier / Duplication (E101)	278 Copies
09/27/2010	20483458	06831	Workman	07/07/2010	1.00	72.00	Miscellaneous (E124)	Other; Donald A Workman; TBW court call on 7/7/10; Court Call; Jul 07, 2010
08/24/2010	20450581	06831	Workman	07/22/2010	74.00	7.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	74 Copies
10/29/2010	20511111	07250	Koblenz	08/13/2010	1.00	1.56	Automated Research (E106)	Westlaw Research - 08/13/10 by KOBLENZ ESTHER E
10/29/2010	20502312	08068	Garcia	08/25/2010	92.00	9.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	92 Copies
	20503705	06831	Workman	08/25/2010	1.00	5.05	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE AUG 2010 POSTAGE
10/29/2010	20508618	08068	Garcia	08/31/2010	10.00	1.00	Copier / Duplication (E101)	10 Copies
10/29/2010	20515043	08068	Garcia	09/02/2010	2.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
10/29/2010	20515044	08068	Garcia	09/02/2010	4.00	0.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	4 Copies
	20671438	06831	Workman	09/02/2010	1.00	58.00	Court Costs (E112)	Court costs; Donald A Workman; Court call charges from call on 9/2/10 for TBW; Sep 02, 2010;
10/29/2010	20518057	08068	Garcia	09/07/2010	2.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
	20519954	06831	Workman	09/07/2010	1.00	1.22	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE SEPT 2010 POSTAGE
10/29/2010	20519953	08068	Garcia	09/08/2010	1.00	0.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20713686	06831	Workman	09/09/2010	1.00	100.00	Court Costs (E112)	Court costs; Donald A Workman; Court conference call fees; Sep 09, 2010;
10/29/2010	20523481	06831	Workman	09/10/2010	2.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
	20536762	06831	Workman	09/10/2010	1.00	32.16	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx DONALD WORKMAN (GUEST) EPIC HOTEL 270 Biscayne Boulevard Way MIAMI FL 790725143006
	20531950	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	75.00	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Travel Change Fees; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL;
	20531952	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	268.40	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL;
	20671437	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	27.25	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Travel Service Fees; Donald A Workman; Agency fee for travel from Washington to Miami for Committee meeting on September 13 for reservation code OZZFVY (not previously submitted);
	20671436	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	327.40	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare; Donald A Workman; Travel from Washington to Miami for Committee meeting on September 13 (not previously submitted);

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20531954	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	47.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Taxi/Car Service; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Sep 13, 2010;
	20531957	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	232.89	Lodging (E110)	Lodging; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Sep 13, 2010
	20531948	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	18.97	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Dinner; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Sep 13, 2010;
	20542280	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	49.00	Messenger Service (E107)	Messenger Service (E107) - - VENDOR: ASAP COURIER SERVICE, INC. 9/10/2010- Pri Res
	20531951	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	15.00	Miscellaneous (E124)	Tips; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Sep 13, 2010;
	20531949	06831	Workman	09/13/2010	1.00	10.70	Telephone Charges (E105)	Internet; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Sep 13, 2010;

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
10/29/2010	20548079	08068	Garcia	09/14/2010	6.00	0.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	6 Copies
	20531955	06831	Workman	09/14/2010	1.00	40.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Parking; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Sep 14, 2010;
	20531956	06831	Workman	09/14/2010	1.00	45.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Taxi/Car Service; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Sep 14, 2010;
	20531953	06831	Workman	09/14/2010	1.00	57.00	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Lunch; Donald A Workman; Taylor, Bean, Whitaker Committee Meetings in Miami, FL; Sep 14, 2010;
10/29/2010	20534177	08068	Garcia	09/17/2010	30.00	3.00	Copier / Duplication (E101)	30 Copies
10/29/2010	20540216	08068	Garcia	09/23/2010	1.00	0.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
	20555902	06831	Workman	09/29/2010	1.00	6.82	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail sept 2010
	20567984	06831	Workman	09/30/2010	1.00	13.60	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	PACER CHARGES 07/01/10 - 09/30/10
	20597086	06831	Workman	10/29/2010	1.00	6.82	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail Oct 2010
	20625538	06831	Workman	11/03/2010	1.00	176.70	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing;

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20643395	06831	Workman	11/03/2010	1.00	28.20	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx Donald Workman c o Omni Hotel 245 Water St JACKS ONVILLE FL 794077170790
	20628895	08068	Garcia	11/03/2010	5.00	10.00	Fax (E104)	5 Pages faxed to 813-204-6342
	20628896	08068	Garcia	11/03/2010	23.00	46.00	Fax (E104)	23 Pages faxed to 813-204-6342
	20625529	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	153.70	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing;
	20625524	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	65.00	Business Meals, etc. (E111)	Dinner; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; Nov 04, 2010;
	20606343	08068	Garcia	11/04/2010	2.00	4.00	Fax (E104)	2 Pages faxed to 904-791-4812
	20625531	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	6.00	Faxes (E104)	Fax; Donald A Workman; fax; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; fax; Nov 04, 2010;

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20625532	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	15.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Taxi/Car Service; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; taxi from client's office to restaurant; Nov 04, 2010;
	20625537	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	40.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Taxi/Car Service; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; airport to client's office; Nov 04, 2010;
	20625539	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	15.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Taxi/Car Service; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; taxi from restaurant to client's office; Nov 04, 2010;
	20625534	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	8.00	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Breakfast; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; Nov 04, 2010;

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20625535	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	12.00	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Lunch; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; Nov 04, 2010;
	20625533	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	10.00	Miscellaneous (E124)	Tips; Donald A Workman; tips (2 at \$5/each); Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; tips (2 at \$5/each); Nov 04, 2010;
	20625527	06831	Workman	11/04/2010	1.00	5.00	Miscellaneous (E124)	Other; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; shipping; Nov 04, 2010;
02/16/2011	20629586	08068	Garcia	11/05/2010	3.00	0.30	Copier / Duplication (E101)	3 Copies
	20625525	06831	Workman	11/05/2010	1.00	475.70	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing;
	20643393	06831	Workman	11/05/2010	1.00	24.31	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx J GARCIA BAKER HOSTETLER 1050 CONN AVE STE 1100 WASHINGTON DC 868518308985

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20643394	06831	Workman	11/05/2010	1.00	25.89	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx J GARCIA BAKER HOSTETLER 1050 CONN AVE NW STE 11 00 WASHINGTON DC 868518308996
	20625530	06831	Workman	11/05/2010	1.00	45.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Taxi/Car Service; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; taxi to airport; Nov 05, 2010;
	20625540	06831	Workman	11/05/2010	1.00	168.37	Lodging (E110)	Lodging; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; Nov 05, 2010
	20625528	06831	Workman	11/05/2010	1.00	15.00	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Lunch; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; Nov 05, 2010;
	20625526	06831	Workman	11/05/2010	1.00	9.00	Meals while Traveling (E110)	Breakfast; Donald A Workman; Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; Nov 05, 2010;

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20625536	06831	Workman	11/05/2010	1.00	10.00	Miscellaneous (E124)	Tips; Donald A Workman; tips (2 at \$5/each); Meetings on TBW regarding case, disclosure statement, confirmation and hearings; and to attend TBW hearing; tips (2 at \$5/each); Nov 05, 2010;
02/16/2011	20631308	08068	Garcia	11/09/2010	4.00	0.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	4 Copies
	20673271	06831	Workman	11/19/2010	1.00	37.00	Court Costs (E112)	Court costs; Donald A Workman; Court conference call on 11/19/2010; Nov 19, 2010;
	20668313	06831	Workman	12/02/2010	1.00	6.82	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail Nov 2010
02/16/2011	20676197	06831	Workman	12/17/2010	19.00	1.90	Copier / Duplication (E101)	19 Copies
02/16/2011	20676198	06831	Workman	12/17/2010	1.00	0.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
02/16/2011	20676199	06831	Workman	12/17/2010	1.00	0.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
	20683764	06831	Workman	12/17/2010	1.00	15.51	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx Sheryl Newman Lender Processing Services, In 601 Riverside Avenue JACKSONVILLE FL 794235032590
02/16/2011	20677489	06831	Workman	12/20/2010	4.00	0.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	4 Copies
02/16/2011	20677490	06831	Workman	12/20/2010	16.00	1.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	16 Copies

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
02/16/2011	20679356	06831	Workman	12/21/2010	88.00	8.80	Copier / Duplication (E101)	88 Copies
	20681103	06831	Workman	12/21/2010	1.00	5.05	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail Dec 2010
02/16/2011	20681102	06831	Workman	12/22/2010	101.00	10.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	101 Copies
02/16/2011	20689975	06831	Workman	12/30/2010	6.00	0.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	6 Copies
	20711264	06831	Workman	12/31/2010	1.00	23.36	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	PACER CHARGES 10/01/10 - 12/31/10
	20711441	00000	General Attorney	12/31/2010	1.00	23.60	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	PACER CHARGES 10/01/10 - 12/31/10
03/25/2011	20698229	06831	Workman	01/06/2011	22.00	2.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	22 Copies
03/25/2011	20705706	06831	Workman	01/07/2011	7.00	0.70	Copier / Duplication (E101)	7 Copies
03/25/2011	20767245	06831	Workman	01/07/2011	1.00	30.00	Court Costs (E112)	Court costs; Donald A Workman; Reimbursement for Court Conference Call on 1/7/11; Jan 07, 2011;
	20706534	06831	Workman	01/07/2011	1.00	0.44	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail Jan 2011
03/25/2011	20706533	06831	Workman	01/10/2011	12.00	1.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	12 Copies
03/25/2011	20717608	06831	Workman	01/19/2011	6.00	0.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	6 Copies
03/31/2011	20730061	06831	Workman	02/01/2011	14.00	1.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	14 Copies
	20756040	06831	Workman	02/10/2011	1.00	7.15	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail Feb 2011

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20759038	06831	Workman	02/16/2011	1.00	62.00	Business Meals, etc. (E111)	Breakfast; Donald A Workman; Breakfast meeting with Ron Haynie, ICBA President on 2/16/2011 to discuss case.; Feb 16, 2011;
03/31/2011	20768368	06831	Workman	02/25/2011	120.00	12.00	Copier / Duplication (E101)	120 Copies
03/31/2011	20768369	06831	Workman	02/25/2011	92.00	9.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	92 Copies
	20770379	06831	Workman	02/25/2011	1.00	7.15	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail Feb 2011
04/28/2011	20796907	06831	Workman	03/10/2011	2.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
04/28/2011	20813337	06831	Workman	03/25/2011	89.00	8.90	Copier / Duplication (E101)	89 Copies
04/28/2011	20813338	06831	Workman	03/25/2011	4.00	0.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	4 Copies
04/28/2011	20814606	06831	Workman	03/28/2011	2.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
04/28/2011	20814607	06831	Workman	03/28/2011	2.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
04/28/2011	20819360	06831	Workman	03/30/2011	19.00	1.90	Copier / Duplication (E101)	19 Copies
04/28/2011	20819361	06831	Workman	03/30/2011	66.00	6.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	66 Copies
	20820664	06831	Workman	03/30/2011	1.00	5.19	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail Mar 2011
	20853196	05853	Mehrtens	03/31/2011	1.00	14.75	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx CATHY MOHETENS BALCH HODILLER 1050 CONN AVE STE 1100 WASHINGTON DC 868518308919

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20862083	06831	Workman	03/31/2011	1.00	3.60	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	Electronic Court Fees (E112) - - VENDOR: PACER SERVICE CENTER PACER CHARGES 01/01/11 - 03/31/11
	20854476	08247	Ravick	03/31/2011	1.00	26.08	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	PACER CHARGES 01/01/11 - 03/31/11
05/31/2011	20858748	06831	Workman	04/25/2011	88.00	8.80	Copier / Duplication (E101)	88 Copies
05/31/2011	20858749	06831	Workman	04/25/2011	14.00	1.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	14 Copies
	20864907	06831	Workman	04/25/2011	1.00	5.19	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail Apr 2011
05/31/2011	20860112	06831	Workman	04/26/2011	6.00	0.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	6 Copies
	20908199	06831	Workman	05/03/2011	1.00	1,556.40	Airfare/Trainfare (E110)	Airfare; Donald A Workman; To attend meeting on Confirmation and Post Confirmation preparation in Miami, FL (5/3/11 - 5/5/11);
	20908200	06831	Workman	05/03/2011	1.00	40.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Taxi/Car Service; Donald A Workman; To attend meeting on Confirmation and Post Confirmation preparation in Miami, FL (5/3/11 - 5/5/11); May 03, 2011;
	20908203	06831	Workman	05/03/2011	1.00	766.14	Lodging (E110)	Lodging; Donald A Workman; To attend meeting on Confirmation and Post Confirmation preparation in Miami, FL (5/3/11); May 03, 2011

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20908201	06831	Workman	05/04/2011	1.00	45.00	Ground Transportation Out of Town (E110)	Taxi/Car Service; Donald A Workman; To attend meeting on Confirmation and Post Confirmation preparation in Miami, FL (5/3/11 - 5/5/11); May 04, 2011;
	20908202	06831	Workman	05/04/2011	1.00	15.00	Miscellaneous (E124)	Tips; Donald A Workman; To attend meeting on Confirmation and Post Confirmation preparation in Miami, FL (5/3/11 - 5/5/11); To attend meeting on Confirmation and Post Confirmation preparation in Miami, FL (5/4/11); To attend meeting on Confirmation and Post Confirmation preparation in Miami, FL (5/3/11 - 5/5/11); May 04, 2011;
	20886529	06831	Workman	05/06/2011	1.00	30.00	Court Costs (E112)	Court costs; Donald A Workman; Reimbursement for May 6, 2011 Court Call (ID #4198437); May 06, 2011;
	20885124	06831	Workman	40674	8.00	0.80	Copier / Duplication (E101)	8 Copies
	20885125	06831	Workman	05/12/2011	5.00	0.50	Copier / Duplication (E101)	5 Copies
	20885126	06831	Workman	05/12/2011	3.00	0.30	Copier / Duplication (E101)	3 Copies
	20906772	06831	Workman	05/25/2011	86.00	8.60	Copier / Duplication (E101)	86 Copies

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20909133	06831	Workman	05/25/2011	1.00	5.19	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail May 2011
	20912151	06831	Workman	05/27/2011	10.00	1.00	Copier / Duplication (E101)	10 Copies
	20956102	06831	Workman	06/09/2011	1.00	6.54	Teleconference (E105)	135 minute conference call by Donald Workman at 04:28 PM
	20941291	06831	Workman	06/14/2011	1.00	110.00	Business Meals, etc. (E111)	Lunch; Donald A Workman; Lunch meeting to discuss case matters with Mike Powell on 6/14/ 2011.; Jun 14, 2011;
	20939334	06831	Workman	06/14/2011	43.00	4.30	Copier / Duplication (E101)	43 Copies
	20940868	06831	Workman	06/15/2011	1.00	0.10	Copier / Duplication (E101)	1 Copy
	20942006	06831	Workman	06/16/2011	4.00	0.40	Copier / Duplication (E101)	4 Copies
	20944168	06831	Workman	06/18/2011	22.00	2.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	22 Copies
	20956100	06831	Workman	06/29/2011	8.00	0.80	Copier / Duplication (E101)	8 Copies
	20956101	06831	Workman	06/29/2011	2.00	0.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	2 Copies
	20975854	06831	Workman	06/30/2011	1.00	21.04	Electronic Court Fees (E112)	Electronic Court Fees (E112)
	20978171	06831	Workman	07/11/2011	292.00	29.20	Copier / Duplication (E101)	292 Copies
	20993127	06831	Workman	07/11/2011	1.00	42.27	Delivery Services (E107)	FedEx Donald Workman (GUEST) Omni Jacksonville Hotel 2 45 Water Street JACKSONVILLE FL 797289892520

Bill Date	Seq No	Atty No	Atty Name	Work Date	Bill Qty	Bill Dol	Cost Type	Narrative
	20980807	06831	Workman	07/11/2011	1.00	7.15	Postage (E108)	POSTAGE 1st class mail July 2011
						10,872.98	Total	