TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 1 Client: 8775 Matter: 001 Invoice # 15106

Matter: General Administration

Date	Professional Services Rendered	Atty	Hours
11/01/01 11/05/01	Review notice of electronic filing review correspondence from District Court re; letters received from retirees	BEK PT	0.10 0.30
11/07/01 11/08/01	Review notice of agenda for 11/9 hearings Review Amended Notice of Agenda on 11/9 hearings	BEK BEK	0.20 0.20
11/08/01	maintain document control	ZH	1.60
11/13/01	Interoffice conference with Fred Levy re: current proceedings	BEK	0.20
11/14/01	Discussion with Brian E. Kriger and review newly filed pleadings in main case.	FL	0.50
11/15/01	Reviewed mail & calendared court dates & deadlines.	AC	0.40
11/19/01	Review various pleadings (solicitation procedures, American Airlines objection to Creditors Committee fees, fee application by various union/employment counsels.)	FL	0.50
11/19/01	maintain document control	ZH	1.50
11/20/01	Review memos between Fred Levy and K. Gwynne re: docket review	BEK	0.10
11/28/01	maintain document control	ZH	1.80
11/29/01	Review mail; calendar court dates.	AC	0.40
11/29/01	Review McMillian materials from docket provided by local counsel; email to local counsel regarding same.	FL	0.40

Total Hous	s 8.20 Tot	al Services	3	1,336.00
Attorney Recap	Hours	Rate	Amount	
BEK Brian E. Kriger	0.80	365.00	292.00	

November 30, 2001 TWA Retiree Committee

Page 2 Client: 8775 Matter: 001 Invoice # 15106

Matter: General Administration

(Cont.)

Attorney Recap		Hours	Rate	Amount
РΤ	Paul Traub	0.30	600.00	180.00
ZH	Zeinab Hassoun	4.90	50.00	245.00
FL	Fredrick J. Levy	1.40	365.00	511.00
AC	Andrea Chouprouta	0.80	135.00	108.00

November 30, 2001 TWA Retiree Committee

Page 1 Client: 8775 Matter: 002 Invoice # 15107

Matter: Asset Analysis and Disposition

Date	Professional Services Rendered	Atty	Hours
11/08/01	Memos to Fred Levy re: email and calls on pilots optional life insurance	BEK	0.10
11/12/01	Interoffice conference with Fred Levy re: pilots optional life insurance	BEK	0.20
11/13/01	Review pleadings filed in TWA cases: motion for IAM for fees; amended objection of AA to Blank Rome fee application; motion of Wells Fargo for confidential information; and motion to schedule hearing on disclosure statement and plan	BEK	0.60
11/16/01	Receive and distibute Pingree letter regarding pilot's life insurance.	FL	0.40
11/16/01	Review correspondence from B. Pingree to Fred Levy re: pilots optional life insurance	BEK	0.30
11/16/01	Review copied memo from Fred Levy to Committee re: AA's position on pilots optional life insurance	BEK	0.10
11/19/01	Review pleadings filed in TWA cases: motion to dismiss 3rd party complaint of Sabre	BEK	0.20
11/26/01	Read letter from and phone call with M. Gray on 2004 timing; discussion with Brian E. Kriger regarding same.	FL	0.30
11/26/01	Review pleadings in TWA cases: joint motion of Debtors and ALPA for payment of fees; motion authorizing Debtors to sell aircraft to Flight Star; application to employ BMC; supplemental notice of 3rd quarterly fee application of Blank Rome	BEK	0.60
11/27/01	Phone calls with M. Gray regarding	FL	0.20

TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 2 Client: 8775 Matter: 002 Invoice # 15107

Matter: Asset Analysis and Disposition

(Cont.)

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Professional Services Rendered Atty Hours

discovery.

Total Hours	3.00 To	otal Services	1,095.00
Attorney Recap	Hours	s Rate	Amount
BEK Brian E. Kriger FL Fredrick J. Levy	2.10		766.50 328.50

November 30, 2001 TWA Retiree Committee

Page 3 Client: 8775 Matter: 002 Invoice # 15107

Matter: Asset Analysis and Disposition

(Cont.)

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Balance due 1,095.00

November 30, 2001 TWA Retiree Committee

Page 1 Client: 8775 Matter: 003 Invoice # 15108

Matter: Retirees Committee Communications

Date	Professional Services Rendered	Atty	Hours
11/01/01	Review memos from J. Gratz re: new retiree booklets and call from J. Gratz re: same	BEK	0.40
11/01/01	Fax article to Retirees' Committee re: option to retirees for health benefits	BEK	0.10
11/05/01	Phone calls with Committee members re:	FL	0.40
11/05/01	Review memo from F. Arenas to Fred Levy re: pilots optional life insurance	BEK	0.10
11/05/01	Review copied memo from J. Gratz to Fred Levy re: over 65's	BEK	0.10
11/06/01	Phone calls with Committee members regarding status; phone call with retiree.	FL	0.40
11/06/01	Review memos between Fred Levy and K. Gordon re: transcript of hearing	BEK	0.10
11/07/01	Calls and memos with K. Gywnne and D. Sheppard re: conflicts clerk	BEK	0.60
11/08/01	Review memo from J. Gratz re: pilots optional life	BEK	0.10
11/08/01	Call from F. Arenas re: claim issues	BEK	0.10
11/09/01	Phone calls with creditor committee members.	FL	0.20
11/13/01	Exchange emails with committee members regarding pilot's optional life.	FL	0.30
11/14/01	Phone call with Committee chair regarding status.	FL	0.20
11/16/01	Review correspondence from M. Gray to Fred Levy re: B. Pingree to act as contact person for AA	BEK	0.10
11/20/01	Phone calls with Committee members regarding status.	FL	0.60

TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 2 Client: 8775 Matter: 003 Invoice # 15108

Matter: Retirees Committee Communications

(Cont.)

Date	Professional Services Rendered	Atty	Hours
11/26/01	Phone call with Committee Chair regarding pilots life & emails from Fred Arenas regarding same.	FL	0.40
11/26/01	Review memo from R. Keuler re: proceeding by H. McMillian and review pleadings re: same	BEK	0.60
11/27/01	Long phone calls with Fred Arenas regarding pilot life and review documents regarding same.	FL	1.10
11/29/01	Phone calls with committee members regarding status.	FL	0.50
11/29/01	Review memo from Fred Levy to R. Keuler re:	BEK	0.10
11/30/01	Review Tarpa materials; phone call with Gratz regarding same.	FL	0.30

Total Hours	6.80	Total Services	2,482.00

Attorney Recap	Hours	Rate	Amount
BEK Brian E. Kriger	2.40	365.00	876.00
FL Fredrick J. Levy	4.40	365.00	1,606.00

November 30, 2001 TWA Retiree Committee

Page 3 Client: 8775 Matter: 003 Invoice # 15108

Matter: Retirees Committee Communications

(Cont.)

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Balance due 2,482.00

TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 1 Client: 8775 Matter: 005

Invoice # 15109

Matter: Claims Administration and Objections

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Date Professional Services Rendered Atty Hours

11/08/01 Call from M. Couth re: health insurance BEK 0.10

issues

Total Hours 0.10 Total Services 36.50

Attorney Recap Hours Rate Amount BEK Brian E. Kriger 0.10 365.00 36.50

November 30, 2001 TWA Retiree Committee

Page 2 Client: 8775 Matter: 005 Invoice # 15109

Matter: Claims Administration and Objections

(Cont.)

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

-----Balance due 36.50

November 30, 2001 TWA Retiree Committee

Page 1 Client: 8775 Matter: 007 Invoice # 15110

Matter: Litigation

Date of occ	u1. 03/20/01		
Date	Professional Services Rendered	Atty	Hours
11/02/01	discussion discovery schedule with Fred Levy	PT	0.30
11/09/01	Read 2004 hearing transcript & discussion with Brian E. Kriger regarding same.	FL	0.50
11/16/01	Read M. Gray regarding proposed order and contacting Pigree; receive & review signed 2004 order; phone call & email Gray regarding same; exchange email with local counsel regarding Order	FL	0.80
11/16/01	Review order granting motion of Retirees' Committee to take examinations	BEK	0.20
11/16/01	Review copied fax from Fred Levy to M. Gray re: order entered on examinations	BEK	0.10
11/16/01	Review memo from Fred Levy to J. Harris re: examination order	BEK	0.10
11/16/01	Review copied memo from K. Gwynne to Fred Levy re: 2004 examination order	BEK	0.10
11/16/01	Review copied memo from Fred Levy to M. Gray re: 2004 examination order	BEK	0.10
11/19/01	Phone call with M. Gray regarding 2004 order and dates for discovery & discussion with Brian E. Kriger regarding same.	FL	0.40
11/19/01	Interoffice conference with Fred Levy re: dates on examination and position of AA's counsel	BEK	0.20
11/19/01	Review memos between Fred Levy and M. Gray re: order on examination	BEK	0.20
11/20/01	Phone call with Robert Abzug regarding discovery plans.	FL	0.30
11/20/01	Letter to M. Gray regarding discovery.	FL	0.40

TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 2 Client: 8775 Matter: 007 Invoice # 15110

Matter: Litigation

(Cont.)

Date	Professional Services Rendered	Atty	Hours
11/20/01	Review copied correspondence from Fred Levy to M. Gray re: scheduling 2004 examinination	BEK	0.10
11/21/01	Memo to Fred Levy re: deposition dates	BEK	0.10
11/21/01	Review correspondence from M. Gray to Fred Levy re: document production and L. Cleveland examination	BEK	0.10
11/26/01	Interoffice conference with Fred Levy re: taking examination of L. Cleveland	BEK	0.30
11/27/01	Email to professionals regarding Cleveland 2004 scheduling.	FL	0.10
11/27/01	Memo from and interoffice conference with Fred Levy re: documents from AA and Cleveland examination	BEK	0.30
11/30/01		FL	0.20

Total Hours	4.90 Tot	al Services	1,859.00
Attorney Recap	Hours	Rate	Amount
PT Paul Traub FL Fredrick J. Levy BEK Brian E. Kriger	0.30 2.70 1.90	600.00 365.00 365.00	180.00 985.50 693.50

TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 3 Client: 8775 Matter: 007 Invoice # 15110

Matter: Litigation

(Cont.)

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Balance due 1,859.00

November 30, 2001 TWA Retiree Committee

Page 1 Client: 8775 Matter: 008 Invoice # 15111

Matter: Fee/Employment/Applications/Objections

Date	Professional Services Rendered	Atty	Hours
11/01/01	Prepared documents in pdf; electronically filed September Fee Application. Prepared letter to Judge.	AC	0.80
11/01/01	Review TB&F 7th interim application	BEK	0.40
11/02/01	Review copied memo from Fred Levy to M. Gray re: withdrawal of fee objection	BEK	0.10
11/04/01	Started preparation of 2nd Interim fee application.	AC	4.00
11/06/01	Assisted in preparation of TBF's September fee application.	ZH	0.30
11/08/01	Review and finalize supplemental fee application	BEK	0.40
11/09/01	Review amended objection of AA to interim applications of Blank Rome	BEK	0.30
11/13/01	Finalized 2nd quartely fee application.	AC	1.20
11/13/01	Discussion with Andrea Chouprouta regarding 2nd Interim Fee Application due.	FL	0.20
11/14/01	review fee app	PT	0.20
11/14/01	Electronically filed Second Quartely Fee Application.	AC	0.80
11/14/01	Review, revise & edit fee application; discussion with Andrea Chouprouta regarding same.	FL	0.90
11/14/01	Call from D. Sheppard re: Committee chairman executing affidavit.	BEK	0.20
11/14/01	Review notice of TB&F second quarterly application for allowances	BEK	0.10
11/15/01	Phone call with local counsel regarding retention; email to committee chair regarding same.	FL	0.20

TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 2 Client: 8775 Matter: 008 Invoice # 15111

Matter: Fee/Employment/Applications/Objections

(Cont.)

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Date	Professional Services Rendered	Atty	Hours
11/15/01	Review copied memo from Fred Levy to J. Gratz re: retention of Reed Smith	BEK	0.10
11/16/01	Phone call with Committee Chair regarding new local counsel.	FL	0.10
11/16/01	Review application for the retention of Reed Smith	BEK	0.40
11/20/01	Discussion with Andrea Chouprouta regarding Interim Fee Application and problems with JH Cohn; phone calls with JH COhn	FL	0.30
11/26/01	Prepared & electronically filed & served 7th Certificate Of No Objection to September Fee Application.	AC	0.80
11/26/01	Review TB&F 7th Certificate of No Objection	BEK	0.10
11/27/01	Begin review of October time; review filed Certificate Of No Objection.	FL	0.20
11/28/01	Review & edit October time.	FL	0.50
11/28/01	Exchange emails with & discussions with Andrea Chouprouta regarding payment of fees.	FL	0.20
11/28/01	Review notice of 10th interim application of Blank Rome	BEK	0.10
11/29/01	Email fee payment request to debtor.	FL	0.10

Attorney Recap	Hours	Rate	Amount
AC Andrea Chouprouta	7.60	135.00	1,026.00
BEK Brian E. Kriger	2.20	365.00	803.00
ZH Zeinab Hassoun	0.30	50.00	15.00
FL Fredrick J. Levy	2.70	365.00	985.50

Total Hours 13.00 Total Services 2,949.50

TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 3 Client: 8775 Matter: 008 Invoice # 15111

Matter: Fee/Employment/Applications/Objections

(Cont.)

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Attorney Recap Hours Rate Amount
PT Paul Traub 0.20 600.00 120.00

TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 4 Client: 8775 Matter: 008 Invoice # 15111

Matter: Fee/Employment/Applications/Objections

(Cont.)

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Balance due 2,949.50

TWA Retiree Committee November 30, 2001

Page 1 Client: 8775 Matter: 009 Invoice # 15112

Matter: Communications with Debtor

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Date	Professional Services Rendered	Atty	Hours
11/05/01	Review correspondence from Judge Walsh to D. Carickhoff re: additional retiree	BEK	0.40
11/12/01	letters Phone calls & exchange emails with creditors committee members regarding	FL	0.40

Cleveland and pilots life.

Total Hours 0.80 Total Services 292.00

Attorney Recap	Hours	Rate	Amount
BEK Brian E. Kriger	0.40	365.00	146.00
FL Fredrick J. Levy	0.40	365.00	146.00

November 30, 2001 TWA Retiree Committee

Page 2 Client: 8775 Matter: 009 Invoice # 15112

Matter: Communications with Debtor

(Cont.)

Date of Occur: 03/28/01

Balance due 292.00