

EXHIBIT A

EXHIBIT A

Professional Services rendered by Lowenstein Sandler LLP, through August 31, 2019

In re: Chapter 11

I. SUMMARY OF TIME CHARGES AND HOURLY RATES

Name of Professional	Year Admitted	Title/Department	Hours Spent	Hourly Rate	Charge
Citron, Lowell A.	1994	Partner/Corporate / Tax	6.50	\$1,070.00	\$6,955.00
Cohen, Jeffrey	2000	Partner/Bankruptcy	35.50	\$955.00	\$33,902.50
Chafetz, Eric S.	2004	Counsel/Bankruptcy	60.00	\$720.00	\$43,200.00
*Chafetz, Eric S. - Travel Time	2004	Counsel/Bankruptcy	11.80	\$360.00	\$4,248.00
Kaplan, Michael A.	2011	Counsel/Litigation	61.00	\$620.00	\$37,820.00
*Kaplan, Michael A. - Travel Time	2011	Counsel/Litigation	5.80	\$310.00	\$1,798.00
Chahil, Rasmeet K.	2017	Associate/Litigation	38.60	\$460.00	\$17,756.00
*Chahil, Rasmeet K. - Travel Time	2017	Associate/Litigation	5.00	\$230.00	\$1,150.00
MacDonald, Myles R.	2015	Associate/Bankruptcy	87.30	\$490.00	\$42,777.00
Olivera, Gabriel L.	2012	Associate/Bankruptcy	81.30	\$550.00	\$44,715.00
Schneider, John P.	2011	Associate/Bankruptcy	12.40	\$525.00	\$6,510.00
Thomas, C. Patrick	2018	Associate/Litigation	20.50	\$420.00	\$8,610.00
Claussen, Diane	N/A	Paralegal/Bankruptcy Paralegal/Practice	6.80	\$270.00	\$1,836.00
Jara, Gabriel	N/A	Support	1.50	\$270.00	\$405.00
Lawler, Elizabeth B.	N/A	Paralegal/Bankruptcy Paralegal/Practice	5.20	\$250.00	\$1,300.00
Pagano, Jamie J.	N/A	Support	0.60	\$300.00	\$180.00
Power, Megan	N/A	Paralegal/Corporate / Tax	1.50	\$310.00	\$465.00
					\$253,627.50
					<u>-25,362.75</u>
TOTAL FEES (minus discount)			441.30		\$228,264.75
Attorney Blended Rate					\$585.96

* Reflects 50% rate reduction due to non-working travel time

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 2
October 2, 2019

TIME DETAIL:

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>B100 - Administration</u>					
<u>B110 Case Administration</u>					
B110	08/05/19	MAK	Calls with J. Cohen re: case status	0.40	\$248.00
B110	08/12/19	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.50	\$135.00
B110	08/13/19	ESC	Confer with debtors' counsel re: call to discuss next steps	0.20	\$144.00
B110	08/16/19	DC	Update critical dates memo and attorney calendar with objection deadlines	0.20	\$54.00
B110	08/22/19	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.50	\$135.00
B110	08/26/19	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$81.00
B110	08/28/19	DC	Review docket, retrieve filed pleadings, update electronic files, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.40	\$108.00
Total B110 - Case Administration				2.50	\$905.00
<u>B120 Asset Analysis and Recovery</u>					
B120	08/01/19	CPT	Prepare document requests for auditors	2.10	\$882.00
B120	08/05/19	MRM	Review and propose comments to draft voluntary RFPs directed at Elliot Davis LLC, revise draft RFPs and circulate redline to R. Chahil and P. Thomas for review	0.70	\$343.00
B120	08/06/19	CPT	Send search terms to Wellspring Capital	0.30	\$126.00
B120	08/06/19	MAK	Call with counsel for Wellspring (.3); review Wellspring motion to lift stay (.4); research and analysis re: intervention in SC action (1.2)	1.90	\$1,178.00
B120	08/06/19	MRM	Prepare priority-ranked document requests to Wellspring and send to R. Chahil and P. Thomas for review, revise per comments from R. Chahil and send to M. Kaplan as outlook chart for use in response e-mail to Paul Weiss	1.30	\$637.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 3
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	08/06/19	RKC	Research re: UCC intervention in adversary proceeding and ability to conduct Rule 2004 discovery after potential removal of South Carolina action	5.40	\$2,484.00
B120	08/07/19	CPT	Research intervention case law; develop search terms for Wellspring defendants	2.40	\$1,008.00
B120	08/07/19	ESC	Confer with J. Cohen re: litigation strategy	0.20	\$144.00
B120	08/07/19	MAK	Conference call with counsel for Prospect (.5); e-mails with Wellspring counsel (.1); continue document review (2.0); research and analysis re: intervenor status (1.)	3.60	\$2,232.00
B120	08/07/19	MRM	Continue document review re: insider transfers in prior two years, add potential causes of action re: Johnson employment agreement amendments, 2L equitable subordination and insider transfers to F. Hewitt Grant	1.30	\$637.00
B120	08/07/19	MRM	Review Debtors' audited financial statements (2012-2017) and construct summary chart for use in analyzing potential litigation	1.10	\$539.00
B120	08/07/19	MRM	Draft status update e-mail and summary for M. Kaplan, R. Chahil and P. Thomas re: (1) financial statement review chart and (2) central review file and provide analysis re: financial statement review	0.60	\$294.00
B120	08/07/19	MRM	Review documents and construct chart re: 2012 and 2013 special transaction bonuses paid to D&Os and draft and send summary e-mail re: same to M. Kaplan	1.90	\$931.00
B120	08/07/19	MRM	Continue document review and construct excel chart re: potential causes of action	0.90	\$441.00
B120	08/07/19	MRM	Construct timeline of key dates sheet in potential causes of action chart	0.60	\$294.00
B120	08/07/19	RKC	Research and draft memorandum re: UCC intervention in adversary proceeding and ability to conduct Rule 2004 discovery after potential removal of South Carolina action; conference with M. Kaplan re: same; conference with P. Thomas re: further research on case law re: rights of intervening party	2.70	\$1,242.00
B120	08/08/19	JJP	Review search terms and provide comments on same to P. Thomas as requested	0.60	\$180.00
B120	08/08/19	MRM	Review pre-petition demand letter sent by Prospect and draft e-mail to M. Kaplan summarizing same for analysis re: potential causes of action	0.40	\$196.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 4
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	08/08/19	MRM	Review Ddbtors' limited objection and reservation of rights to Committee's Rule 2004 Motion, e-mails with M. Kaplan, R. Chahil and P. Thomas re: planned response to same	0.30	\$147.00
B120	08/08/19	MRM	Review documents and prepare excel file of key documents re: potential D&O/fiduciary claims based on prepetition conduct of D&Os/Wellspring, draft and send update e-mail re: same to M. Kaplan, R. Chahil and P. Thomas	1.30	\$637.00
B120	08/09/19	GLO	Review and analyze the Debtors' limited objection to the committee's 2004 motion	0.40	\$220.00
B120	08/09/19	JC	Review objections to 2004 motions and discuss same	1.60	\$1,528.00
B120	08/09/19	MAK	E-mails with counsel for Wellspring re: meet and confer (.4); review and analyze Wellspring's objection to 2004 motion (1.6); begin drafting reply to the same (1.3)	3.30	\$2,046.00
B120	08/09/19	MRM	Research procedure for Rule 2004 objections and law re: ability of post-confirmation trustee to utilize Rule 2004 and law re: preservation of claims and causes of action in a chapter 11 plan and begin drafting reply to debtors' Rule 2004 Motion and draft preliminary statement for same	2.80	\$1,372.00
B120	08/09/19	MRM	Review objection to rule 2004 motion filed by Wellspring and incorporate citations to same into draft reply to debtors' response to rule 2004 motion	0.60	\$294.00
B120	08/09/19	MRM	Teleconference with M. Kaplan re: strategy for reply to Debtors' limited objection to rule 2004 motion	0.10	\$49.00
B120	08/09/19	MRM	Draft short outline based on guidance from M. Kaplan re: reply to debtors' limited objection to rule 2004 motion and send to R. Chahill and P. Thomas	0.40	\$196.00
B120	08/09/19	RKC	Research re: case law re: claims belonging to debtor's estate	1.70	\$782.00
B120	08/09/19	RKC	Review and analyze Wellspring objection to rule 2004 motion	0.90	\$414.00
B120	08/10/19	ESC	Review various objections to Committee's 2004 motion	0.40	\$288.00
B120	08/10/19	MAK	Continue drafting reply to rule 2004 motions	1.10	\$682.00
B120	08/10/19	RKC	Draft reply to Wellspring objection to rule 2004 motion	4.80	\$2,208.00
B120	08/11/19	MAK	Continue drafting reply to rule 2004 motions	1.60	\$992.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 5
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	08/11/19	MRM	Finish draft reply to debtors' limited response to Rule 2004 Motion and circulate to M. Kaplan, R. Chahill and P. Thomas	2.40	\$1,176.00
B120	08/11/19	RKC	Draft reply to Wellspring objection to rule 2004 motion	1.00	\$460.00
B120	08/12/19	DC	Retrieve responses to committee motion for direct examinations and forward same to attorney team	0.10	\$27.00
B120	08/12/19	ESC	Confer with G. Olivera re: D&O claims	0.20	\$144.00
B120	08/12/19	ESC	Confer with debtors' counsel re: meeting with Wellspring to discuss litigation	0.10	\$72.00
B120	08/12/19	ESC	Review committee's reply to debtors' objection to 2004 motion	0.30	\$216.00
B120	08/12/19	GLO	Review and edit reply to the Wellspring defendants' objection to the committee's 2004 motion	0.90	\$495.00
B120	08/12/19	GLO	Review and edit reply to the Debtors' objection to the committee's 2004 motion	0.70	\$385.00
B120	08/12/19	JC	Review and revise draft reply to debtors' 2004 objection	0.90	\$859.50
B120	08/12/19	JC	Review and revise draft reply to wellspring 2004 objection	1.10	\$1,050.50
B120	08/12/19	MAK	Finalize rule 2004 motions	2.90	\$1,798.00
B120	08/12/19	MAK	Call with counsel for Wellspring re: meet and confer	0.80	\$496.00
B120	08/12/19	MRM	Incorporate additional comments from E. Chafetz, J. Cohen and M. Kaplan into draft reply to debtors' limited objection to rule 2004 motion and circulate to M. Kaplan for review	0.90	\$441.00
B120	08/12/19	MRM	Revise draft reply to Wellspring objection to rule 2004 motion per J. Cohen comments and circulate track-changes version to M. Kaplan for review and signoff	0.20	\$98.00
B120	08/12/19	MRM	Proofread, edit and finalize draft replies to debtors and Wellspring and e-mail to E. Monzo, B. Keilson and J. Dawson (Morris James) for final edits and pre-filing preparation	0.70	\$343.00
B120	08/12/19	MRM	Revise and make additions per M. Kaplan's comments to draft reply to debtors' limited objection to Rule 2004 and make proofreading edits and circulate to M. Kaplan for review	1.10	\$539.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 6
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	08/12/19	MRM	Revise and edit per M. Kaplan comments to draft reply to Wellspring's objection to rule 2004 motion and circulate draft to M. Kaplan for review	0.70	\$343.00
B120	08/12/19	MRM	Finalize of draft reply to debtors' limited Oobjection to rule 2004 per M. Kaplan comments and circulate to entire LS team for review and comment	0.10	\$49.00
B120	08/12/19	MRM	Proofread and finalize draft reply to Wellspring's objection to Rule 2004 motion per M. Kaplan comments and circulate to LS team for review and comments prior to filing	0.10	\$49.00
B120	08/13/19	ESC	Review Wellspring's reply in support of the motion of Wellspring defendants for limited relief from the automatic stay	0.20	\$144.00
B120	08/13/19	GLO	Review and analyze the Wellspring defendants' objection to the committee's rule 2004 motion	0.80	\$440.00
B120	08/13/19	MRM	Review e-mail from G. Olivera re: D&O analysis and review Eclipse/Box/Imanage for full policies (excess D&O insurance) and confirm that policies have not yet been produced, e-mail M. Kaplan with analysis re: facts to raise during oral arguments on Rule 2004 Motions	0.40	\$196.00
B120	08/13/19	MRM	Respond to e-mail from M. Kaplan re: inquiry on identity of counsel purporting to represent Debtors' former CFO and provide copies of voluntary RFPs sent to M. Mosier	0.10	\$49.00
B120	08/14/19	CPT	Draft protective order; circulate draft protective order to opposing counsel	1.70	\$714.00
B120	08/14/19	ESC	Confer with LS team and Debtors' counsel re: litigation claim investigation	0.20	\$144.00
B120	08/14/19	ESC	Address various issues with status of 2004 motions	0.20	\$144.00
B120	08/14/19	GLO	Review and analyze Prospect's South Carolina complaint	1.00	\$550.00
B120	08/14/19	MAK	Review and analyze Wellspring's proposed search terms (1.3); analysis re: date ranges for searches in light of applicable SOL (1.1); inter-office e-mails re: the same (.5)	2.90	\$1,798.00
B120	08/14/19	MRM	Review draft of stipulated protective order and e-mail P. Thomas with suggested technical edits	0.60	\$294.00
B120	08/14/19	MRM	Review amended statements and schedules filed on 8/15/19 and e-mail summary re: same to LS team and e-mail R. Orloff (Debtor's counsel) with questions/request for blacklines	0.40	\$196.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 7
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	08/14/19	MRM	Review and response to strategy e-mails from M. Kaplan re: proposed search terms for Wellspring, Wellspring's proposed date range for communication searches, responding to same and basis for expanded date ranges	0.40	\$196.00
B120	08/15/19	CPT	Draft explanations for search terms	2.80	\$1,176.00
B120	08/15/19	ESC	Confer with M. Kaplan re: preparation for hearing on 2004 and lift stay motions	0.20	\$144.00
B120	08/15/19	JC	Review and revise proposed 2004 orders and discuss with M. Kaplan	1.40	\$1,337.00
B120	08/15/19	MAK	E-mails and call with Debtors counsel re: Rule 2004 motion (.8); inter-office conferences re: revised search terms and date ranges (.7); call with counsel for Wellspring (.4); prepare for Rule 2004 and stay hearing (2.6); revise proposed Rule 2004 order (.3); conference call with counsel for Prospect (.4); review and revise proposed term sheet (.4)	5.60	\$3,472.00
B120	08/15/19	MRM	Revise table of proposed search terms and date range for searches per instructions from M. Kaplan	0.80	\$392.00
B120	08/15/19	MRM	Prepare response to Wellspring's proposed date range for communication searches and expand on chart of search terms to provide reasoning applicable to proposed date range for each search	1.60	\$784.00
B120	08/15/19	MRM	Teleconference with P. Thomas re: additional details to be added to search terms table by P. Thomas prior to finalization	0.10	\$49.00
B120	08/15/19	MRM	Review, proofread and edit chart of search terms, date ranges for searches and bases for date ranges and convert chart to Outlook and send to M. Kaplan for use in negotiation with Wellspring's counsel	0.30	\$147.00
B120	08/15/19	RKC	Review and revise consent order re: rule 2004 examination of debtors (.4); conference with M. Kaplan re: same (.1)	0.50	\$230.00
B120	08/16/19	GLO	Review agreed-to order granting the Committee's 2004 motion	0.20	\$110.00
B120	08/16/19	JC	Telephone call with M. Kaplan re: 2004 orders and related discussions	1.20	\$1,146.00
B120	08/19/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for the Debtors re: Wellspring meeting	0.10	\$72.00
B120	08/20/19	ESC	Review memo on limited immunity for acts of an official committee	0.10	\$72.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 8
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	08/20/19	ESC	Review letter from counsel for Wellspring re: claim issues; confer with LS team re: same	0.30	\$216.00
B120	08/20/19	GLO	Review letter from counsel for Wellspring re: the Committee's investigation and the South Carolina action	0.30	\$165.00
B120	08/20/19	JC	Review Wellspring demand letter and discuss same with M. Kaplan	1.10	\$1,050.50
B120	08/20/19	MRM	Research re: privileges and immunities applicable to Committee members and committee deliberations and draft summary re: Committee's limited fiduciary duties and limited immunity for acts taken in official capacity	1.80	\$882.00
B120	08/20/19	MRM	Conference with M. Kaplan and J. Cohen re: Wellspring letter demanding documents from Committee and research assignment re: anticipated response to Wellspring letter	0.20	\$98.00
B120	08/20/19	MRM	Teleconference with M. Kaplan re: guidance on research issues for response to Wellspring letter	0.10	\$49.00
B120	08/21/19	ESC	Review updates on meeting with Wellspring and data preservation	0.10	\$72.00
B120	08/21/19	ESC	Review memo on scope of committee disclosure requirements	0.20	\$144.00
B120	08/21/19	JC	Review summary of research on committee immunity from document demand from Wellspring	0.50	\$477.50
B120	08/21/19	MRM	Continue research re: Committee disclosure duties under section 1102 of the Code and application to information requests from committee constituents	1.70	\$833.00
B120	08/21/19	MRM	Finalize draft research summary/memorandum section on Committee's duty of disclosure under section 1102 and application to Wellspring letter and application of Garner doctrine to Wellspring letter and send to J. Cohen, M. Kaplan and E. Chafetz for review	1.20	\$588.00
B120	08/21/19	RKC	Draft consent order for Rule 2004 examination of Wellspring	1.20	\$552.00
B120	08/22/19	CPT	Research whether attorney client privilege still applies with respect to a liquidated company	2.10	\$882.00
B120	08/22/19	ESC	Address various document preservation issues	0.10	\$72.00
B120	08/22/19	JC	Review draft letter and comment re: same (deposition request directed at Wellspring)	0.60	\$573.00
B120	08/23/19	MRM	Follow up teleconference with R. Chahil re: additional research for objection to Wellspring motion and division of labor for same	0.10	\$49.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 9
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	08/23/19	MRM	Research re: right of equity-holder to bring derivative actions on behalf of debtors' estates and e-mail R. Chahil short research summary re: same	1.40	\$686.00
B120	08/24/19	ESC	Review objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline (.6); review letter concerning difficulty scheduling depositions (.1)	0.70	\$504.00
B120	08/25/19	MRM	Oversee upload of additional production of documents from Debtors into Eclipse	0.10	\$49.00
B120	08/26/19	GJ	Download production received and import it into database for attorney review	0.70	\$189.00
B120	08/26/19	MRM	Continue review and tagging of Debtors' 8/23/19 production from SportCo_0000311 to 0000436	0.70	\$343.00
B120	08/26/19	MRM	Begin review and tagging of Debtors' 8/23/19 document production, review from SportCo_000001 to 0000310	3.20	\$1,568.00
B120	08/27/19	CPT	Review Debtors first production; draft document review protocol; call with M. McDonald to discuss document review	1.80	\$756.00
B120	08/27/19	GJ	Download production and import it into database for attorney review; prepare review batches requested by P. Thomas	0.80	\$216.00
B120	08/27/19	MRM	Continue review of Debtors' 8/23/19 Production, begin review of Debtors' 8/27/19 Production and continue adding to central review file	2.60	\$1,274.00
B120	08/27/19	MRM	Continue review of Debtors' 8.27.19 production	1.80	\$882.00
B120	08/27/19	MRM	Draft and send broad factual narrative discerned from document review to M. Kaplan for review	0.90	\$441.00
B120	08/28/19	GLO	Review certain documents produced by the Debtors	1.10	\$605.00
B120	08/28/19	MRM	E-mails with R. Chahil and P. Thomas re: hot docs index, priority of various assignments and doc review moving forward	0.30	\$147.00
B120	08/28/19	MRM	Update and add to central review file following document review	0.70	\$343.00
B120	08/28/19	MRM	Review Millennium Health fraudulent transfer adversary and Court's decision on motion to dismiss and draft memorandum summarizing same and analyzing comparability to Carolina Complaint/SportCo and circulate memo to SportCo team for review	3.10	\$1,519.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 10
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	08/28/19	MRM	Review fraudulent transfer complaint brought by Millennium Health post-confirmation trust and lenders' motion to dismiss and court's decision re: same and begin analyzing comparability to SportCo	0.90	\$441.00
B120	08/28/19	MRM	Teleconference with SportCo team re: ongoing document review and guidance, research re: good faith plan standard and Millenium Health 548 action	0.30	\$147.00
B120	08/28/19	MRM	Continue document review of batch of 100 documents chronologically ordered decision from 2/5/18 to 5/25/18	1.70	\$833.00
B120	08/28/19	RKC	Review hot documents in debtors' document production (1.8); conference with M. Kaplan re: potential causes of action (.2)	2.00	\$920.00
B120	08/28/19	RKC	Conference with M. Kaplan, E. Chafetz, M. MacDonald, and P. Thomas re: necessary research and focus of investigation	0.30	\$138.00
B120	08/29/19	GLO	Confer with M. Kaplan re: preserving the 2004 investigation for the liquidating trustee	0.30	\$165.00
B120	08/29/19	MRM	Review Third Circuit holding in USA v. Tabor Court Realty and analyze re: applicability to SportCo and draft and send e-mail memorandum to SportCo team re: same	1.40	\$686.00
B120	08/29/19	MRM	Begin document review re: central review file updates and fleshing out potential causes of action and review re: corporate waste and update review file re: same	1.10	\$539.00
B120	08/29/19	MRM	Continue review of documents and add to central review file re: master timeline and Acusport transaction	1.60	\$784.00
B120	08/29/19	RKC	Review hot documents (2.0); conference with M. MacDonald and P. Thomas re: same (.5); draft summary regarding documents and potential causes of action and send same to M. Kaplan (.5)	3.00	\$1,380.00
B120	08/30/19	CPT	Review Wellspring Capital's requests for the production of documents directed to the committee	0.60	\$252.00
B120	08/30/19	MRM	Continue document review and additions to master timeline and Acusport transaction key document list	1.90	\$931.00
B120	08/31/19	MAK	Continue review of debtors' document production (1.6); review research and analysis re: potential causes of action (1.1)	2.70	\$1,674.00
Total B120 - Asset Analysis and Recovery				137.60	\$73,795.00

B120A Investigation of Prepetition Lenders

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 11
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120A	08/01/19	ESC	Address various issues with lien review memorandum including whether the lenders' lien on the Bellafontaine facility is properly perfected	0.20	\$144.00
B120A	08/01/19	GLO	Review e-mails from L. Citron re: lien review of Debtors' pre-petition lenders	0.20	\$110.00
B120A	08/01/19	GLO	Review e-mail from L. Citron re: Debtors' intercreditor agreement	0.20	\$110.00
B120A	08/01/19	JC	Review lien memo and comment re: same	0.80	\$764.00
B120A	08/01/19	JC	Review lien issues and discuss with L. Citron	1.10	\$1,050.50
B120A	08/01/19	LAC	Work on lien review memo	1.90	\$2,033.00
B120A	08/01/19	MP	Draft prepetition lien analysis memorandum	1.30	\$403.00
B120A	08/01/19	MP	Correspondence re: lien review	0.20	\$62.00
B120A	08/01/19	MRM	Review e-mails from L. Citron re: three items of missing documentation re: liens of Prospect, review investigation database on Eclipse and pull documentation responsive to L. Citron's open items and send to M. Power, L. Citron and C. Ferrette	0.60	\$294.00
B120A	08/01/19	MRM	E-mail M. Power & C. Ferrette re: issues regarding gaps in documentation sent to lien review team, e-mail G. Jara to set up procedures to minimize potential gaps moving forward	0.20	\$98.00
B120A	08/02/19	LAC	Work on lien review memo	2.90	\$3,103.00
B120A	08/05/19	GLO	Review and analyze memorandum re: extent, validity, and perfection of liens under the Debtors' pre-petition secured loans	0.80	\$440.00
B120A	08/05/19	GLO	E-mail J. Cohen re: lien review memorandum	0.10	\$55.00
B120A	08/05/19	JC	Telephone call with M. Kaplan re: Wellspring motion to lift stay	0.50	\$477.50
B120A	08/19/19	ESC	Review scope of term loan lender challenge rights	0.20	\$144.00
B120A	08/20/19	ESC	Review motion of Wellspring for entry of an order extending the challenge deadline for the prepetition term lien and claim matters and granting related relief	0.30	\$216.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 918453

Page 12
 October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120A	08/21/19	GLO	Review and analyze Wellspring's motion to extend its time to file an adversary proceeding or contested matter challenging the validity, enforceability, priority, or extent of the pre-petition term loan liens	0.70	\$385.00
B120A	08/21/19	GLO	Review Wellspring's motion to shorten time to consider their motion to extend the lien challenge deadline	0.20	\$110.00
B120A	08/21/19	RKC	Review letter from Wellspring (.3); review Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline (.4); conference with M. Kaplan regarding Committee's objection to Wellspring's motion to extend (.4); review M. MacDonald's research for objection to motion to extend (.3); draft Committee's objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline (.3)	1.70	\$782.00
B120A	08/22/19	JC	Review draft objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline and comment re: same	0.80	\$764.00
B120A	08/22/19	MRM	Review and provide comments to draft limited objection to Wellspring's motion to extend the challenge period	1.20	\$588.00
B120A	08/22/19	RKC	Draft committee's objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline	3.80	\$1,748.00
B120A	08/23/19	JC	Review revised objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline and comment re: same	0.60	\$573.00
B120A	08/23/19	MRM	Review Wellspring's motion to extend challenge periods re: substantive basis for request and applicable legal standards	0.20	\$98.00
B120A	08/23/19	MRM	Teleconference with R. Chahil re: additions to limited objection to Wellspring motion to extend challenge period	0.10	\$49.00
B120A	08/23/19	RKC	Research re: case law on standard for cause to extend challenge deadline (1); revise objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline (2.4)	3.40	\$1,564.00
B120A	08/24/19	MAK	Revise draft objection to challenge deadline motion and letter re: Rule 2004 motion	2.30	\$1,426.00
B120A	08/24/19	RKC	Revise objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline (.6); draft letter to Court re: 2004 examination of Wellspring (1)	1.60	\$736.00
B120A	08/25/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: issues with Wellspring motion to extend challenge deadline	0.20	\$144.00
B120A	08/26/19	ESC	Review Prospect's objection to the motion of Wellspring for entry of an order extending the challenge deadline for the prepetition term lien and claim matters and granting related relief	0.20	\$144.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 13
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120A	08/26/19	ESC	Review response of debtors to the motion of Wellspring for entry of an order extending the challenge deadline for the prepetition term lien and claim matters and granting related relief	0.20	\$144.00
B120A	08/26/19	ESC	Confer with LS team and local counsel re: objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline and letter to court concerning non-compliance with aspect of 2004 motion directed at Wellspring related to depositions (.1); confer with counsel for Prospect re: same (.1)	0.20	\$144.00
B120A	08/26/19	GLO	Review and analyze Prospect's objection to Wellspring's motion to extend the lien challenge period	0.50	\$275.00
B120A	08/26/19	MRM	Prepare case index and short case summaries for 8/27/19 hearing on Wellspring's Motion to extend challenge period	1.60	\$784.00
B120A	08/27/19	RKC	Review Prospect's objection (.2) and Debtors' objection (.2) to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline	0.40	\$184.00
Total B120A - Investigation of Prepetition Lenders				31.40	\$20,146.00

B130 Asset Disposition

B130	08/13/19	ESC	Review amendment to Evans APA	0.10	\$72.00
B130	08/14/19	ESC	Review notice of filing of amendment to asset purchase agreement	0.10	\$72.00
B130	08/15/19	ESC	Review certification of counsel regarding order, pursuant to section 105, 363, and 365 of the bankruptcy code, (I) approving the asset purchase agreement for the sale of certain assets of Evans Sports, Inc. and authorizing the sale contemplated therein; and (II) granting related relief	0.10	\$72.00
B130	08/16/19	GLO	Review and analyze proposed amendments to the Evans Sports' asset purchase agreement	0.30	\$165.00
B130	08/20/19	ESC	Review notice of closing of sale of property free and clear of liens - 363(f) (Evans Sports)	0.10	\$72.00
B130	08/20/19	GLO	Review notice of closing of sale of Evans Sports business	0.10	\$55.00
B130	08/28/19	ESC	Confer with debtors' counsel sale of assets outside the OCB(.1); review motion (.3)	0.40	\$288.00
B130	08/30/19	ESC	Review offer for Bellefontaine property from Thomas & Maker Company	0.10	\$72.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 14
October 2, 2019

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Total B130 - Asset Disposition				1.30	\$868.00
<u>B140 Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings</u>					
B140	08/02/19	ESC	Review Wellspring defendants' stay relief motion	0.50	\$360.00
B140	08/05/19	GLO	Review and analyze the Wellspring defendants' motion for limited relief from the automatic stay	0.70	\$385.00
B140	08/08/19	RKC	Research re: cases cited in Wellspring's objection to lift stay motion re: claims belonging to debtor's estate	0.80	\$368.00
B140	08/09/19	JC	Review Wellspring relief from stay response and discuss same with M. Kaplan	0.80	\$764.00
B140	08/13/19	GLO	Review and analyze Wellspring's reply in support of the motion of Wellspring defendants for limited relief from the automatic stay	0.50	\$275.00
B140	08/15/19	GLO	Review and analyze response of debtors to the objection of Prospect Capital Corporation to the Wellspring defendants' motion for limited relief from the automatic stay	1.10	\$605.00
B140	08/23/19	ESC	Review certification of counsel regarding order granting, in part, and denying in Part, the Wellspring defendants' motion for limited relief from the automatic stay	0.10	\$72.00
B140	08/26/19	GLO	Review court's order with respect to Wellspring's stay relief motion	0.10	\$55.00
Total B140 - Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings				4.60	\$2,884.00
<u>B150 Meetings of and Communication with Creditors</u>					
B150	08/01/19	ESC	Review update to the committee re: 2004 motions	0.10	\$72.00
B150	08/01/19	ESC	Address various issues with committee call (.1); review Emerald materials (.2)	0.30	\$216.00
B150	08/01/19	GLO	E-mail the Emerald Capital team re: weekly committee professionals' call	0.10	\$55.00
B150	08/01/19	GLO	Confer with M. MacDonald re: pending motions by the Debtors (summaries for the committee)	0.30	\$165.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 15
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	08/01/19	GLO	Prepare for and participate in weekly conference call with the unsecured creditors' committee	0.50	\$275.00
B150	08/01/19	GLO	Review Emerald Capital's presentation for the unsecured creditors' committee	0.20	\$110.00
B150	08/01/19	JC	Office call with G. Olivera re: committee call and strategy	0.40	\$382.00
B150	08/01/19	MRM	Committee status & update call with Morris James, Emerald and LS teams, present summaries to committee re: debtors' retention of CBRE, motions to sell Evans Sports and Bellefontaine facility	0.60	\$294.00
B150	08/01/19	MRM	Prepare presentation script for Committee call re: Debtors' motions to retain CBRE, sell Evans Sports and sell Bellefontaine Facility, review underlying motions and written summaries sent to committee on 7/31, conference with G. Olivera re: presentation to Committee, e-mail C. Saitta re: questions for Emerald during Committee presentation, conference with J. Cohen re: additional information to include in Committee presentation, finalize script	1.60	\$784.00
B150	08/02/19	GLO	Review and edit motion for reimbursement of committee expenses	0.40	\$220.00
B150	08/07/19	GLO	E-mail Emerald Capital team re: financial update from the committee	0.10	\$55.00
B150	08/07/19	GLO	Draft agenda for weekly committee conference call	0.40	\$220.00
B150	08/07/19	GLO	Review presentation prepared by the Emerald Capital team for the weekly committee conference call	0.20	\$110.00
B150	08/07/19	GLO	E-mail to the unsecured creditors' committee an update on DIP hearing and the committee call agenda	0.40	\$220.00
B150	08/08/19	ESC	Participate in committee call	0.40	\$288.00
B150	08/08/19	ESC	Prepare for weekly committee call including review of Emerald materials	0.20	\$144.00
B150	08/08/19	GLO	Prepare for and participate in weekly conference call with the unsecured creditors' committee	0.40	\$220.00
B150	08/08/19	JC	Participate on committee conference call	0.40	\$382.00
B150	08/08/19	MRM	Attend weekly call with committee members, Emerald, Morris James and LS Team	0.50	\$245.00
B150	08/13/19	GLO	E-mail committee member American Outdoor Brands re: committee expense reimbursements	0.20	\$110.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 16
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	08/14/19	ESC	Address various issues in preparation for committee call	0.20	\$144.00
B150	08/14/19	GLO	E-mail the unsecured creditors' committee re: August 15 committee call	0.20	\$110.00
B150	08/14/19	GLO	Draft agenda for August 15 committee conference call	0.30	\$165.00
B150	08/15/19	ESC	Draft e-mail to LS team re: recap of committee call	0.30	\$216.00
B150	08/15/19	ESC	Prepare for (.2) and lead weekly committee call (.4)	0.60	\$432.00
B150	08/15/19	GLO	Prepare for and participate in weekly conference call with the unsecured creditors' committee	0.40	\$220.00
B150	08/15/19	GLO	Draft summary of the August 15 committee conference call	0.60	\$330.00
B150	08/15/19	GLO	E-mail the unsecured creditors' committee re: plan of reorganization negotiations	0.30	\$165.00
B150	08/15/19	JPS	Teleconference with Committee members regarding updated financials of the Debtors	0.30	\$157.50
B150	08/16/19	CPT	Draft e-mail to the committee re: events at the August 16, 2019 hearing	1.00	\$420.00
B150	08/21/19	ESC	Review and comment on e-mail to the committee re: updates	0.20	\$144.00
B150	08/21/19	GLO	E-mail the unsecured creditors' committee re: pending matters	0.30	\$165.00
B150	08/21/19	GLO	Draft committee call agenda for 8/22	0.20	\$110.00
B150	08/21/19	GLO	Confer with M. MacDonald and M. Kaplan re: update on pending matters for the committee	0.40	\$220.00
B150	08/21/19	GLO	Draft and edit substantive summary of all pending matters, settlement negotiations, and financial updates for the unsecured creditors' committee	1.70	\$935.00
B150	08/21/19	MRM	Teleconference with G. Olivera re: draft summary of Wellspring letter for inclusion in weekly update to Committee members and review proofread and provide comments to G. Olivera	0.30	\$147.00
B150	08/23/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: plan comments	0.10	\$72.00
B150	08/23/19	ESC	Confer with the committee re: various case updates including plan term sheet	0.20	\$144.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 918453

Page 17
 October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	08/23/19	GLO	Review e-mail to the unsecured creditors' committee re: revised plan term sheet	0.20	\$110.00
B150	08/27/19	ESC	Revise e-mail to the committee re: recap of hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline	0.20	\$144.00
B150	08/28/19	ESC	Review and comment on motion summaries for committee	0.40	\$288.00
B150	08/28/19	ESC	Revise e-mail to the committee re: call cancellation and motion summaries	0.20	\$144.00
B150	08/28/19	GLO	Draft and summarize of recently filed pleadings for the unsecured creditors' committee	3.90	\$2,145.00
B150	08/29/19	ESC	Revise motion summaries for the committee	0.40	\$288.00
Total B150 - Meetings of and Communication with Creditors				20.60	\$11,982.50

B160 Fee/Employment Applications

B160	08/01/19	EBL	Review entered LS retention order; revise first monthly fee statement accordingly; e-mail to J. Cohen re: same	0.20	\$50.00
B160	08/01/19	EBL	Revisions to Exhibit A to first monthly fee statement	0.40	\$100.00
B160	08/01/19	GLO	Review and edit Lowenstein's June 2019 fee application	1.60	\$880.00
B160	08/01/19	GLO	E-mail J. Cohen re: Lowenstein's June 2019 fee application	0.10	\$55.00
B160	08/01/19	GLO	E-mail D. Claussen re: Lowenstein's June 2019 fee application	0.10	\$55.00
B160	08/02/19	EBL	Revisions to LS' first monthly fee statement	0.70	\$175.00
B160	08/02/19	EBL	Further revisions to LS' first monthly fee statement; finalize and coordinate filing and service of same	0.50	\$125.00
B160	08/02/19	ESC	Address various issues with LS' first monthly fee application	0.10	\$72.00
B160	08/05/19	EBL	Begin working on LS' July fee statement	0.30	\$75.00
B160	08/08/19	GLO	Review and edit July 2019 pre-bill for Lowenstein Sandler (to ensure compliance with the UST requirement)	2.30	\$1,265.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 918453

Page 18
 October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B160	08/09/19	GLO	E-mail J. Cohen and E. Chafetz re: July 2019 pre-bill	0.10	\$55.00
B160	08/12/19	ESC	Review and comment on LS' July 2019 invoice to ensure compliance with UST guidelines	0.70	\$504.00
B160	08/13/19	ESC	Continue reviewing and commenting on LS' July 2019 invoice to ensure compliance with UST requirements	0.80	\$576.00
B160	08/15/19	ESC	Continue reviewing and commenting on LS' July 2019 invoice to ensure compliance with UST requirements	0.70	\$504.00
B160	08/15/19	GLO	E-mail E. Chafetz and L. Pami re: LS' July 2019 pre-bill edits	0.10	\$55.00
B160	08/26/19	GLO	Review changes to the LS/ July 2019 pre-bill	0.60	\$330.00
B160	08/27/19	EBL	Prepare Lowenstein Sandler's second monthly fee statement and related documents	2.60	\$650.00
B160	08/29/19	ESC	Review and comment on LS' first monthly fee application (to ensure compliance with the UST guidelines)	0.30	\$216.00
Total B160 - Fee/Employment Applications				12.20	\$5,742.00
<u>B165 Employment and Retention Applications - Others</u>					
B165	08/02/19	DC	Review expense report received by Remington and follow up with Vista re: expense reimbursement form	0.30	\$81.00
B165	08/15/19	ESC	Review supplemental declaration (second) of Christopher A. Ward, Esq. in support of the application of debtors to authorize the retention and employment of Polsinelli PC as co-counsel to the debtors nunc pro tunc to the petition date	0.10	\$72.00
B165	08/21/19	ESC	Review application to retain Wilson Kibler as real estate broker nunc pro tunc to August 1, 2019	0.10	\$72.00
B165	08/21/19	GLO	Review the Debtors' application to employ Wilson Kibler as real estate broker	0.30	\$165.00
Total B165 - Employment and Retention Applications - Others				0.80	\$390.00

B175 Fee Applications and Invoices - Others

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 918453

Page 19
 October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	08/01/19	DC	Follow up with G. Olivera re: submission of expense reports by the remainder of the committee members, prepare blank form of expense report and draft e-mail to the Vista and Remington re: same	0.50	\$135.00
B175	08/01/19	ESC	Review monthly staffing report for filing period June 10, 2019 to June 30, 2019 of Winter Harbor LLC	0.10	\$72.00
B175	08/02/19	DC	Revise, update and finalize committee expense reimbursement application and prepare exhibits thereto	1.10	\$297.00
B175	08/02/19	EBL	Revisions to committee reimbursement application; finalize and coordinate filing and service of same	0.50	\$125.00
B175	08/20/19	ESC	Review second monthly fee application of Polsinelli PC for compensation and reimbursement of expenses as co-counsel to the debtors for the period from July 1, 2019 to July 31, 2019	0.10	\$72.00
B175	08/20/19	ESC	Review second monthly application of McDermott Will & Emery LLP for allowance of compensation and reimbursement of expenses as debtors' counsel for the period from July 1, 2019 to July 31, 2019	0.10	\$72.00
B175	08/21/19	GLO	Review Winter Harbor's monthly staffing report for July 2019	0.20	\$110.00
Total B175 - Fee Applications and Invoices - Others				2.60	\$883.00
<u>B185 Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts</u>					
B185	08/01/19	ESC	Review consent motion for an agreed order authorizing the rejection of an unexpired lease nunc pro tunc to June 30, 2019 and transferring property of inconsequential value	0.20	\$144.00
B185	08/05/19	GLO	Review the Debtors' consent motion for an order rejecting a certain unexpired lease	0.50	\$275.00
B185	08/23/19	GLO	Review and analyze the Debtors' consent motion for an agreed order authorizing the rejection of an unexpired lease nunc pro tunc to the petition date	0.40	\$220.00
B185	08/23/19	GLO	Review and analyze Debtors' notice of potential assumption and assignment of contracts and related cure amounts	0.30	\$165.00
Total B185 - Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts				1.40	\$804.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 20
October 2, 2019

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)</u>					
B190	08/12/19	CPT	Revise search terms	0.20	\$84.00
B190	08/21/19	CPT	Evaluate debtors' search term hit list (.2); confer with M. Kaplan re debtors' search term hit list (.1); confer with M. Kaplan re: research assignment into whether liquidating company maintains attorney client privilege (.1); draft correspondence to opposing counsel re: search terms (.2); correspond with opposing counsel re: search terms (.2); devise new search terms to send to opposing counsel (.2)	1.00	\$420.00
B190	08/21/19	GLO	Confer with the Emerald Capital team re: financial update for week ending August 16 (Committee call)	0.20	\$110.00
B190	08/26/19	MAK	Reference the objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge period	4.10	\$2,542.00
B190	08/27/19	RKC	Draft and send e-mail update to Committee re: today's hearing	0.90	\$414.00
Total B190 - Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)				6.40	\$3,570.00
<u>B195 Non-Working Travel</u>					
B195	08/06/19	ESC	Travel to final DIP hearing (1.8); travel back to office (1.4)	3.20	\$1,152.00
B195	08/16/19	ESC	Travel to hearing on 2004 motions and Wellspring lift stay motion (2.2); travel home (2.0)	4.20	\$1,512.00
B195	08/16/19	MAK	Travel to and from Wilmington, DE	3.70	\$1,147.00
B195	08/27/19	ESC	Travel to hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge period (2.1); travel home from hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge period (2.3)	4.40	\$1,584.00
B195	08/27/19	MAK	Travel to and from Wilmington, DE	2.10	\$651.00
B195	08/27/19	RKC	Travel from Roseland, NJ to Wilmington, DE for hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline	2.20	\$506.00
B195	08/27/19	RKC	Return travel from Wilmington, DE to Roseland, NJ	2.80	\$644.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 21
October 2, 2019

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
			Total B195 - Non-Working Travel	22.60	\$7,196.00
<u>B200 - Operations</u>					
<u>B210 Business Operations</u>					
B210	08/08/19	GLO	Review summary analysis of the Debtors' financial statements re: investigation	0.30	\$165.00
B210	08/16/19	ESC	Review amended debtor-in-possession monthly operating report for filing period June 10, 2019 to June 30, 2019	0.10	\$72.00
B210	08/16/19	GLO	Review the debtors' June 2019 operating report	0.30	\$165.00
B210	08/20/19	ESC	Review July 2019 monthly operating report	0.10	\$72.00
B210	08/22/19	GLO	Review the Debtors' estimated assets on hand as of August 2019	0.70	\$385.00
			Total B210 - Business Operations	1.50	\$859.00
<u>B230 Financing/Cash Collateral</u>					
B230	07/24/19	GLO	Review and analyze the Debtors' revised wind down budget	0.30	\$165.00
B230	08/01/19	ESC	Review and create issues list related to notice of filing of revised proposed clean and blacklined final DIP order	1.20	\$864.00
B230	08/01/19	ESC	Review updated recovery analysis, budget, and professional fee schedule	0.20	\$144.00
B230	08/01/19	GLO	Review e-mails from J. Cohen, E. Chafetz, and M. MacDonald re: debtors' final DIP and cash collateral order	0.40	\$220.00
B230	08/01/19	MRM	Begin reviewing prior DIP objection & supplemental DIP objection re: drafting of second supplemental DIP objection to revised DIP Order filed by Debtors on 8/1/19 (1.1), teleconference with J. Cohen re: strategy guidance for same (0.1)	1.20	\$588.00
B230	08/02/19	ESC	Confer with debtors' professionals re: status of final DIP negotiations	0.20	\$144.00
B230	08/02/19	ESC	Address DIP objection issues	0.20	\$144.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 22
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	08/02/19	ESC	Review final DIP objection	0.60	\$432.00
B230	08/02/19	GLO	E-mail R. Feulner re: cash collateral issues	0.30	\$165.00
B230	08/02/19	JC	Telephone call with M. MacDonald re: supplemental DIP objection	0.70	\$668.50
B230	08/02/19	JC	Review preliminary draft of supplemental DIP objection	0.40	\$382.00
B230	08/02/19	JC	Telephone call with T. Walsh and A. Friedman re: attempted resolution of DIP issues	1.20	\$1,146.00
B230	08/02/19	MRM	Draft second supplemental objection to DIP financing/cash collateral motion and circulate for review and comment	5.20	\$2,548.00
B230	08/02/19	MRM	Review e-mail from E. Chafetz re: stipulations in second bridge order, review same and e-mail E. Chafetz and J. Cohen regarding guidance on revisions to second supplemental DIP objection	0.70	\$343.00
B230	08/02/19	MRM	Teleconference with E. Chafetz re: guidance on revisions to second supplemental objection to use cash collateral order	0.20	\$98.00
B230	08/02/19	MRM	Review and respond to e-mails with E. Chafetz and J. Cohen re: revisions and points of emphasis for draft second supplemental objection	0.30	\$147.00
B230	08/03/19	ESC	Review further revised DIP objection	0.60	\$432.00
B230	08/03/19	MRM	Revise and add to draft second supplemental objection, review prior motions and draft paragraphs re: investigation of claims and resistance to discovery from various entities, review DIP motion and original objections, BOA filing re: Committee sale motion and draft paragraphs and citations regarding coordination among debtor and prepetition lenders	5.70	\$2,793.00
B230	08/04/19	ESC	Further revisions to DIP objection	1.40	\$1,008.00
B230	08/04/19	GLO	Review and edit the committee's second supplemental objection to the Debtors' motion for the use of cash collateral	0.60	\$330.00
B230	08/04/19	GLO	Review e-mails from J. Cohen, E. Chafetz, and M. MacDonald re: second supplemental objection to the Debtors' motion for the use of cash collateral	0.30	\$165.00
B230	08/04/19	JC	Review and revise draft DIP objection	1.40	\$1,337.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 23
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	08/04/19	LAC	Review DIP objection	0.80	\$856.00
B230	08/04/19	MRM	Begin making edits and drafting second supplemental objection to incorporate additional comments, edits and guidance from J. Cohen	1.90	\$931.00
B230	08/04/19	MRM	Revise and add additional detail and arguments to second supplemental DIP objection per E. Chafetz comments and circulate for review	3.40	\$1,666.00
B230	08/04/19	MRM	Make additional revisions and additions, and add additional citations re: Prospect's representations at first day hearing, per E. Chafetz comments and circulate draft V5 for review, circulate proposed language in L. Citron for review and signoff	1.20	\$588.00
B230	08/05/19	ESC	Further revisions to DIP objection	1.30	\$936.00
B230	08/05/19	ESC	Review updates on DIP discussions with Prospect	0.20	\$144.00
B230	08/05/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: DIP financing strategy	0.20	\$144.00
B230	08/05/19	ESC	Confer with the committee re: DIP objection	0.10	\$72.00
B230	08/05/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for Prospect re: DIP objection	0.10	\$72.00
B230	08/05/19	ESC	Review updated DIP budget	0.10	\$72.00
B230	08/05/19	ESC	Review revised final DIP order (.3); confer with counsel for Prospect Capital re: same (.2)	0.50	\$360.00
B230	08/05/19	GLO	Review and edit final version of the committee's second supplemental objection to the Debtors' DIP motion prior to filing	0.50	\$275.00
B230	08/05/19	GLO	Review and analyze the debtors' revised proposed blackline final DIP order	0.90	\$495.00
B230	08/05/19	GLO	Review e-mails from E. Chafetz and M. MacDonald re: committee's second supplemental DIP objection	0.20	\$110.00
B230	08/05/19	GLO	Review e-mails from J. Cohen and J. Madden re: cash collateral issues and settlement discussions with Prospect Capital	0.20	\$110.00
B230	08/05/19	GLO	Review e-mails from J. Cohen re: negotiations with Prospect on use of cash collateral	0.20	\$110.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 24
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	08/05/19	GLO	Review and edit the committee's second supplemental objection to the debtors' motion for the use of cash collateral	0.70	\$385.00
B230	08/05/19	JC	Further review and revision of draft DIP objection	1.40	\$1,337.00
B230	08/05/19	JC	Telephone call with A. Friedman re: negotiated financing resolution	0.70	\$668.50
B230	08/05/19	JC	Multiple correspondence with Emerald and Morris James re: negotiated resolution with Prospect (financing)	1.10	\$1,050.50
B230	08/05/19	LAC	Revise DIP Objection	0.90	\$963.00
B230	08/05/19	MRM	Continue revisions to draft second supplemental objection per comments and revisions provided by J. Cohen, finalize and circulate for review	2.40	\$1,176.00
B230	08/05/19	MRM	Made additional edits and revisions to second supplemental DIP objection per comments from E. Chafetz and J. Cohen and circulate draft for review	0.90	\$441.00
B230	08/05/19	MRM	Proofread and cite-check second supplemental objections and make edits and circulate for review to E. Chafetz	0.60	\$294.00
B230	08/05/19	MRM	Final edits and revisions to draft second supplemental objection, per comments from E. Chafetz	0.20	\$98.00
B230	08/06/19	GLO	Review blackline changes to the proposed final order for the Debtors' use of cash collateral	0.70	\$385.00
B230	08/06/19	JC	Discussions with E. Chafetz re: final cash collateral order	1.10	\$1,050.50
B230	08/07/19	GLO	Review final DIP order entered by the Court	0.30	\$165.00
Total B230 - Financing/Cash Collateral				46.10	\$29,218.00

B300 - Claims and PlanB310 Claims Administration and Objections

B310	08/20/19	ESC	Address issues with reclamation claim settlement	0.10	\$72.00
------	----------	-----	--	------	---------

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 25
October 2, 2019

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B310	08/20/19	MRM	Investigate Wellspring's assertion of status as unsecured creditor and review Debtors' statements and schedules re: same and e-mail investigation results to J. Cohen, M. Kaplan and E. Chafetz and exchange e-mails with same and answer follow up questions	0.70	\$343.00
B310	08/21/19	ESC	Review debtors' motion for entry of an order (I) establishing deadlines for filing proofs of claim; (II) approving procedures for filing proofs of claim; and (III) approving the form, manner, and sufficiency of providing notice thereof	0.40	\$288.00
B310	08/29/19	ESC	Confer with G. Olivera re: issues with claims bar date order (.2); review revised pleadings (.2)	0.40	\$288.00
B310	08/29/19	GLO	Confer with M. MacDonald re: discovery and the bar date motion	0.30	\$165.00
B310	08/29/19	GLO	Conference call with debtors' counsel re: debtors' bar date motion	0.30	\$165.00
B310	08/29/19	GLO	Research issues re: 503(b)(9) claims assertion procedures	0.90	\$495.00
B310	08/29/19	MRM	Conference with G. Olivera re: meaning and effect of certain provisions in bar date motion/proposed order	0.30	\$147.00
B310	08/29/19	MRM	Teleconference with G. Olivera and R. Orloff (Debtors' counsel) re: UCC issues with bar date motion and potential resolution and extension of deadline to object	0.20	\$98.00
Total B310 - Claims Administration and Objections				3.60	\$2,061.00

B320 Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)

B320	08/06/19	JC	Discuss next steps with M. Kaplan re: liquidation trust negotiations	0.60	\$573.00
B320	08/06/19	JC	Correspondence with A. Friedman re: plan, trust discussions	0.40	\$382.00
B320	08/07/19	ESC	Review entered final order (I) approving the debtors' postpetition financing, (II) authorizing the debtors continued use of cash collateral, (III) granting liens and providing superpriority administrative expense status, (IV) granting adequate protection to the prepetition lenders, (V) modifying automatic Stay, and (VI) granting related relief	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/07/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for Prospect re: plan and trust issues (.7); follow up call with LS team re: same (.3)	1.00	\$720.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 918453

Page 26
 October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	08/07/19	JC	Discuss plan structures with E. Chafetz	0.80	\$764.00
B320	08/07/19	JC	Conference call with counsel to Prospect re: plan structure	1.10	\$1,050.50
B320	08/07/19	MRM	Draft proposed language for plan term sheet with Prospect Capital/2nd Liens re: retention/carve out of certain claims to be pursued by Prospect Capital	0.60	\$294.00
B320	08/08/19	ESC	Draft plan term sheet sheet (1.9); confer with LS team re: same (.1)	2.00	\$1,440.00
B320	08/08/19	ESC	Further revisions to plan term sheet (.3); confer with counsel for Prospect re: same (.1)	0.40	\$288.00
B320	08/08/19	ESC	Address scope of general unsecured claims pool for plan term sheet negotiations	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/08/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for the debtors re: plan support agreement and plan	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/08/19	GLO	Review and edit draft plan term sheet	0.50	\$275.00
B320	08/08/19	GLO	Review edits to plan term sheet by the litigation team	0.40	\$220.00
B320	08/08/19	JC	Review and comment on draft plan term sheet	0.60	\$573.00
B320	08/08/19	MAK	Draft litigation elements for plan term sheet	1.40	\$868.00
B320	08/08/19	MRM	Review provisions of draft term sheet with Prospect Capital re: plan of liquidation	0.20	\$98.00
B320	08/09/19	ESC	Phone call with counsel for Prospect re: term sheet; provide recap to LS team	0.40	\$288.00
B320	08/09/19	ESC	Review plan support agreement	0.70	\$504.00
B320	08/12/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: plan term sheet	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/12/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for Prospect re: plan term sheet	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/13/19	ESC	Review and revise Prospect's term sheet (multiple versions) mark up	1.30	\$936.00
B320	08/13/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: plan term sheet and discovery	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/13/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: plan term sheet	0.40	\$288.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 918453

Page 27
 October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	08/13/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for Prospect re: revised plan term sheet	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/13/19	GLO	Review and analyze the draft plan term sheet with Prospect Capital	0.60	\$330.00
B320	08/13/19	JC	Conference call with M. Kaplan and E. Chafetz re: marked up plan term sheet	0.50	\$477.50
B320	08/13/19	MAK	Office conference re: Prospect negotiations (.4); review and revise plan draft term sheet (.7); e-mails with debtors' counsel (.3); e-mails with counsel for Wellspring (.2); continue document review (2.4)	4.00	\$2,480.00
B320	08/13/19	MRM	Review Prospect's redline of term sheet and plan support agreement and participate in teleconference with M. Kaplan re: same	0.20	\$98.00
B320	08/14/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for Prospect re: plan term sheet issues (.5); confer with M. Kaplan re: same (.2)	0.70	\$504.00
B320	08/14/19	MAK	Call with counsel for Prospect re: plan term sheet	0.40	\$248.00
B320	08/15/19	ESC	Call with Prospect re: term sheet (.4); confer with M. Kaplan re: same (.2)	0.60	\$432.00
B320	08/15/19	ESC	Further revisions to plan term sheet	0.40	\$288.00
B320	08/15/19	ESC	Review update on plan and term sheet issues	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/15/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: preparation for committee call	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/15/19	ESC	Confer with LS team and debtors' counsel re: revised plan term sheet (.1); review revised plan term sheet from the debtors (.5)	0.60	\$432.00
B320	08/15/19	ESC	Review Prospect's further mark up of plan term sheet	0.30	\$216.00
B320	08/15/19	GLO	Review and analyze revised plan term sheet sent by counsel for Prospect	0.40	\$220.00
B320	08/15/19	JC	Review and discuss revisions to plan term sheet with E. Chafetz and M. Kaplan	1.30	\$1,241.50
B320	08/16/19	ESC	Further revisions to plan term sheet; confer with counsel for Prospect re: same	0.30	\$216.00
B320	08/16/19	GLO	Review and analyze edits to the proposed plan term sheet	0.40	\$220.00
B320	08/16/19	JC	Telephone call with E. Chafetz re: plan term sheet issues	0.70	\$668.50

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 28
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	08/17/19	ESC	Address status of plan term sheet	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/19/19	ESC	Confer with J. Cohen re: investigation and plan term sheet	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/19/19	ESC	Review revised plan term sheet	0.30	\$216.00
B320	08/19/19	GLO	Review and analyze proposed revision to the plan term sheet by Prospect Capital	0.80	\$440.00
B320	08/19/19	JC	Review revised plan term sheet and discuss with M. Kaplan	0.80	\$764.00
B320	08/19/19	MAK	E-mails re: meeting with Wellspring and Debtors (.2); review and analyze revised plan term sheet (.6); review and analyze proposed protective order and search term protocol from Wellspring (.9)	1.70	\$1,054.00
B320	08/20/19	ESC	E-mails with LS team re: plan term sheet (.1); phone call re: same (.4); revise plan term sheet and e-mails with counsel for Prospect re: same (.2)	0.70	\$504.00
B320	08/20/19	JC	Office conference with M. Kaplan and E. Chafetz re: revisions to plan term sheet	0.60	\$573.00
B320	08/20/19	MAK	Continue revising plan term sheet (.5); inter-office conference re: the same (.4); telephonic status conference (.2); call with counsel for Prospect (.2); call with counsel for Wellspring (.2); e-mails re: Rule 2004 motion to Prospect (.3); begin research and analysis re: Wellspring's litigation notice (1.6)	3.40	\$2,108.00
B320	08/21/19	ESC	Phone call with A. Friedman re: plan term sheet issues (.2); confer with LS team re: recap of same (.1)	0.30	\$216.00
B320	08/21/19	ESC	Begin reviewing combined plan and disclosure statement	0.90	\$648.00
B320	08/21/19	ESC	Review revised plan term sheet	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/21/19	GLO	Begin review and analysis of the Debtors' draft combined plan and disclosure statement	1.50	\$825.00
B320	08/21/19	GLO	E-mail communications with J. Cohen, M. Kaplan, E. Chafetz, and M. MacDonald re: plan term sheet negotiations	0.50	\$275.00
B320	08/21/19	GLO	Review and analyze Prospect Capital's changes to the draft plan term sheet	0.20	\$110.00
B320	08/21/19	JC	Discuss plan term sheet with M. Kaplan	0.80	\$764.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 918453

Page 29
 October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	08/21/19	JC	Review and comment on draft combined plan and disclosure statement	2.40	\$2,292.00
B320	08/21/19	JPS	Review of debtors' proposed combined plan and disclosure statement	2.10	\$1,102.50
B320	08/22/19	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: term sheet status (.6); confer with LS team re: same (.2)	0.80	\$576.00
B320	08/22/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: plan term sheet	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/22/19	ESC	Further review and comment on combined plan and disclosure statement	1.80	\$1,296.00
B320	08/22/19	ESC	Call with A. Friedman and M. Kaplan re: open plan term sheet issues	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/22/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: plan term sheet issues	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/22/19	GLO	Review and analyze the Debtors' draft combined plan and disclosure statement	4.30	\$2,365.00
B320	08/22/19	JC	Correspondence with M. Kaplan re: plan term sheet	0.50	\$477.50
B320	08/22/19	JC	Telephone calls with B. Reid and R. Friedman re: plan trustee	1.40	\$1,337.00
B320	08/22/19	JPS	Further review of combined plan and disclosure statement	1.80	\$945.00
B320	08/22/19	JPS	Prepare summary e-mail of relevant plan provisions to Gabe Olivera	1.50	\$787.50
B320	08/22/19	MAK	Inter-office conferences re: Prospect plan term sheet (.4); review and revise draft objection to challenge period motion (1.7); call with J. Li re: plan term sheet (.3); call with A. Friedman re: plan term sheet (.2); e-mails with counsel for Wellspring re: 2004 motion (.3); review research and analysis re: privilege post-confirmation (.9)	3.70	\$2,294.00
B320	08/23/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for Prospect re: liquidating trustee and finalizing plan term sheet	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/23/19	ESC	Review debtors' motion for entry of an order (A) conditionally approving the combined disclosure statement and joint chapter 11 plan of liquidation for solicitation purposes only on limited notice (B) establishing procedures for solicitation and tabulation of votes to accept or reject plan of liquidation; (C) approving the form of ballot and solicitation materials, (D) establishing voting record date, (E) fixing the date, time and place for the confirmation hearing and the deadline for filing objections thereto, and (F) approving related notice procedures	0.90	\$648.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 30
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	08/23/19	ESC	Further review and comment on combined plan nad disclosure statement	2.70	\$1,944.00
B320	08/23/19	GLO	Review and analyze changes to the revised plan term sheet	0.40	\$220.00
B320	08/23/19	GLO	Review and analyze the Debtors' motion to approve the combined disclosure statement and plan	2.80	\$1,540.00
B320	08/23/19	GLO	E-mails with J. Cohen, E. Chafetz, and M. MacDonald re: debtors' combined plan and disclosure statement	0.30	\$165.00
B320	08/23/19	GLO	Confer with J. Schneider re: notes on the Debtors' combined plan and disclosure statement	0.60	\$330.00
B320	08/23/19	GLO	Draft analysis and edits to the Debtors' combined disclosure statement and plan of reorganization	2.30	\$1,265.00
B320	08/23/19	GLO	Review and analyze the Debtors' filed plan of liquidation	1.30	\$715.00
B320	08/23/19	JC	Follow up telephone call with R. Friedman re: plan trustee	1.20	\$1,146.00
B320	08/24/19	ESC	Address various plan issues	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/24/19	ESC	Confer with G. Olivera re: plan term sheet	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/24/19	ESC	Confer with G. Olivera re: plan comments	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/24/19	GLO	Edit the plan term sheet between the Committee and Prospect Capital	0.80	\$440.00
B320	08/25/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for Prospect re: revised version of plan term sheet	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/26/19	ESC	Confer with the general counsel for Prospect re: sign off on plan term sheet	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/26/19	ESC	Confer with G. Olivera re: plan comments	0.40	\$288.00
B320	08/26/19	GLO	Confer E. Chafetz re: debtors' plan and disclosure statement	0.50	\$275.00
B320	08/26/19	GLO	Confer J. Schneider re: Debtors' plan and disclosure statement	0.30	\$165.00
B320	08/26/19	GLO	Edit the Debtors' disclosure statement and plan	3.90	\$2,145.00
B320	08/26/19	GLO	Confer with M. MacDonald re: Delaware local rules on liquidating plans	0.40	\$220.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 31
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	08/26/19	MRM	Conference with G. Olivera re: local rules applicable to combined DS/confirmation hearing for liquidating plan	0.10	\$49.00
B320	08/27/19	ESC	Address various plan issues including e-mails with G. Olivera	0.30	\$216.00
B320	08/27/19	GLO	Edit the Debtors' liquidating plan pursuant to the final settlement term sheet	1.70	\$935.00
B320	08/27/19	GLO	E-mail R. Friedman re: litigation trust	0.10	\$55.00
B320	08/28/19	ESC	Participate in call with the proposed trustee (R. Friedman) and G. Olivera re: plan issues	0.30	\$216.00
B320	08/28/19	ESC	Confer with G. Olivera re: plan comments	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/28/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: good faith research for confirmation hearing	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/28/19	ESC	Confer with LS team re: confirmation research strategy (.4); follow up conference with M. McDonald re: same (.1)	0.50	\$360.00
B320	08/28/19	ESC	Confer with counsel for the trustee re: plan issues	0.10	\$72.00
B320	08/28/19	ESC	Review memorandum on good faith element of plan confirmation process	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/28/19	ESC	Review memorandum on Millenium Health case re: confirmation issues	0.20	\$144.00
B320	08/28/19	GLO	Edit the Debtors' combined disclosure statement and plan	3.40	\$1,870.00
B320	08/28/19	GLO	Conference call with R. Friedman re: plan term sheet	0.40	\$220.00
B320	08/28/19	JPS	Research and analysis of good faith requirements for plan proposal in context of debtor release and/or settlement of claims	4.30	\$2,257.50
B320	08/28/19	MAK	Office conference call re: confirmation research and investigation (.4); continue review of debtors document production (2.5)	2.90	\$1,798.00
B320	08/28/19	MRM	Review and provide comments on J. Schneider memo re: good faith under 1129	0.20	\$98.00
B320	08/29/19	ESC	Address issues with confirmation research	0.90	\$648.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 32
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	08/29/19	ESC	Review revised version of the combined plan and disclosure statement (.9); confer with G. Olivera re: same (.3); confer with M. Kaplan re: same (.2)	1.40	\$1,008.00
B320	08/29/19	GLO	Edit the debtors' combined disclosure statement and plan of liquidation	4.10	\$2,255.00
B320	08/29/19	GLO	Confer with E. Chafetz re: debtors' combined plan and disclosure statement	0.40	\$220.00
B320	08/29/19	JPS	Additional research of good faith plan proposal in context of Prospect release	2.40	\$1,260.00
B320	08/29/19	MAK	Review document demand from Wellspring (.3); continue review of debtors document production (1.6); review and revise plan language (.3)	2.20	\$1,364.00
B320	08/30/19	ESC	Review Prospects' comments to first amended combined plan / disclosure statement	0.90	\$648.00
B320	08/31/19	ESC	Address various issues with Prospect combined plan/disclosure statement comments including further review of same and confer with various case parties re: same	0.90	\$648.00
Total B320 - Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)				107.10	\$70,042.00

B400 - Bankruptcy-Related AdviceB430A Court Hearings

B430A	08/02/19	ESC	Review notice of agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on 8/6/2019	0.10	\$72.00
B430A	08/06/19	ESC	Prepare for final DIP hearing	1.20	\$864.00
B430A	08/06/19	ESC	Participate in final DIP hearing	1.00	\$720.00
B430A	08/06/19	GLO	Participate telephonically in hearing re: the debtors' use of cash collateral	0.60	\$330.00
B430A	08/14/19	ESC	Review notice of agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on 8/16/2019	0.10	\$72.00
B430A	08/14/19	GLO	Review notice of agenda for matters set for August 16, 2019	0.10	\$55.00
B430A	08/15/19	DC	Review agenda for 8/16/19 hearing, prepare index and hearing binder for E. Chafetz	1.50	\$405.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 33
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430A	08/15/19	ESC	Confer with D. Claussen re: preparation for 8/16/19 omnibus hearing	0.20	\$144.00
B430A	08/15/19	ESC	Review amended notice of agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on 8/16/2019	0.10	\$72.00
B430A	08/15/19	GLO	Confer with E. Chafetz re: August 16 hearing	0.40	\$220.00
B430A	08/16/19	DC	Coordinate courtcall appearance at telephonic status conference for J. Cohen, E. Chafetz and M. Kaplan	0.30	\$81.00
B430A	08/16/19	ESC	Attend hearing on 2004 motions and Wellspring lift stay motion	1.70	\$1,224.00
B430A	08/16/19	ESC	Prepare for hearing on stay enforcement motion and 2004 motions including review of pleadings and emails with various case parties	1.60	\$1,152.00
B430A	08/16/19	GLO	Participate telephonically in hearing on August 16	1.10	\$605.00
B430A	08/16/19	MAK	Hearing on Rule 2004 motion and motion to lift stay (1.1); confer with counsel for Wellspring (.4); draft e-mail to UCC re: hearing outcome (.4)	1.90	\$1,178.00
B430A	08/20/19	GLO	Participate in telephonic status conference on August 20	0.20	\$110.00
B430A	08/22/19	GLO	E-mail D. Claussen re: upcoming hearings	0.10	\$55.00
B430A	08/26/19	DC	Prepare index and documents for 8/27/19 hearing binder	1.10	\$297.00
B430A	08/26/19	ESC	Confer with M. Kaplan re: preparation for hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge period	0.30	\$216.00
B430A	08/26/19	ESC	Confer with D. Claussen re: binder for hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline	0.20	\$144.00
B430A	08/26/19	GLO	Review agenda for hearing on August 27, 2019	0.10	\$55.00
B430A	08/26/19	RKC	Send objection to Wellspring's motion to extend challenge period	1.00	\$460.00
B430A	08/27/19	ESC	Prepare for (.9) and attend hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge period (2.0)	2.90	\$2,088.00
B430A	08/27/19	ESC	Working Lunch with M. Kaplan and R. Chahil in preparation for hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline	1.30	\$936.00
B430A	08/27/19	GLO	Participate telephonically in hearing on August 27	1.50	\$825.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453Page 34
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430A	08/27/19	MAK	Prepare for hearing (2.7); hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline (1.5); revise e-mail to UCC (.3); begin review of supplemental document production (1.7)	6.20	\$3,844.00
B430A	08/27/19	RKC	Attend hearing on Wellspring's motion to extend challenge deadline	1.50	\$690.00
B430A	08/28/19	CPT	Meet with M. Kaplan and R. Chahill to discuss hearing on lien challenge deadline (.5); conference call with M. Kaplan, R. Chahill, M. MacDonald, R. Chafetz re investigation and document review	4.50	\$1,890.00
B430A	08/28/19	GLO	Review e-mails from R. Chalil re: hearing on August 27, 2019	0.20	\$110.00
Total B430A - Court Hearings				33.00	\$18,914.00
<u>B440 Schedules and Statements</u>					
B440	08/14/19	ESC	Address various issues with amended schedules	0.30	\$216.00
B440	08/14/19	GLO	Review and analyze changes to the Evans Sports, Ellett Brothers and Jerry's Sports schedules and statements of financial affairs	2.40	\$1,320.00
Total B440 - Schedules and Statements				2.70	\$1,536.00
<u>B460 Other - Insurance Matters</u>					
B460	08/08/19	GLO	Review Prospect demand letter on Debtors' insurance policies	0.40	\$220.00
B460	08/13/19	GLO	Review and analyze insurance policies and write-up by the insurance team	1.60	\$880.00
B460	08/13/19	GLO	Confer with M. MacDonald and E. Chafetz re: Debtors' insurance policies	0.60	\$330.00
B460	08/13/19	GLO	E-mail J. Cohen, M. MacDonald, and E. Chafetz re: Debtors' insurance policies	0.20	\$110.00
B460	08/14/19	ESC	Address various issues with D&O coverage	0.10	\$72.00
B460	08/15/19	GLO	Draft and send e-mail to counsel for the Debtors re: D&O policies	0.40	\$220.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 918453

Page 35
October 2, 2019

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
			Total B460 - Other - Insurance Matters	3.30	\$1,832.00

SportCo Holdings, Inc. Unsecured Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 918453

Page 36
 October 2, 2019

Timekeeper Summary (by Task):

Task	Task Description	Hours	Fees
B110	Case Administration	2.50	\$905.00
B120	Asset Analysis and Recovery	137.60	\$73,795.00
B120A	Investigation of Prepetition Lenders	31.40	\$20,146.00
B130	Asset Disposition	1.30	\$868.00
B140	Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	4.60	\$2,884.00
B150	Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	20.60	\$11,982.50
B160	Fee/Employment Applications	12.20	\$5,742.00
B165	Employment and Retention Applications - Others	0.80	\$390.00
B175	Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	2.60	\$883.00
B185	Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts	1.40	\$804.00
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	6.40	\$3,570.00
B195	Non-Working Travel	22.60	\$7,196.00
B210	Business Operations	1.50	\$859.00
B230	Financing/Cash Collateral	46.10	\$29,218.00
B310	Claims Administration and Objections	3.60	\$2,061.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	107.10	\$70,042.00
B430A	Court Hearings	33.00	\$18,914.00
B440	Schedules and Statements	2.70	\$1,536.00
B460	Other - Insurance Matters	3.30	\$1,832.00
			\$253,627.50
			<u>-25,362.75</u>
	Total (minus discount)	441.30	\$228,264.75