

Exhibit B

McGUIREWOODS

Mark E. Freedlander
412.667.7928

Dominion Tower, 23rd Floor
625 Liberty Avenue
Pittsburgh PA 15222

October 17, 2006

INVOICE NO. 90875176

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
c/o Bruce Tobiansky
DuPont Corporation
DuPont Legal, D-4026
1007 Market Street
Wilmington, DE 19898

TAX ID NO. 54-0505857

JOINT GROUP #2048970

Current Invoice:

Current Fees:	\$32,435.50	
Current Disbursements:	<u>\$1,148.55</u>	
Current Invoice Total:		<u>\$33,584.05</u>

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO THE FOLLOWING ADDRESS:

McGuireWoods LLP
Attn: Accounts Receivable
901 E. Cary Street
Richmond, VA 23286-0645

PAYMENT IN FULL IS DUE WITHIN 30 DAYS OF DATE OF INVOICE

McGUIRE WOODS

For professional services rendered and expenses incurred from
September 6, 2006 through September 30, 2006 regarding File
Number 2048970 :

<u>Matter</u>	<u>Fees</u>	<u>Disb.</u>	<u>Total</u>
General Administration 2048970-0001	\$7,641.50	\$1,148.55	\$8,790.05
Debtor-in-Possession Financing 2048970-0004	\$6,631.50	\$.00	\$6,631.50
Creditors' Committee 2048970-0017	\$1,850.50	\$.00	\$1,850.50
Miscellaneous Motions and Advesary Proceedings 2048970-0019	\$16,312.00	\$.00	\$16,312.00
	<hr/>	<hr/>	<hr/>
	\$32,435.50	\$1,148.55	\$33,584.05

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

Re: General Administration

Our File No. 2048970-0001

For Services Rendered Through Sep 30, 2006

09/20/06	Review DIP motion and DIP order; prepare portion of objection Michael J. Roesenthaler	4.50
09/20/06	Review first days; meetings with M. Freedlander and Sally Edison regarding same; research issues relating to first days Michael J. Roesenthaler	2.40
09/20/06	Revise motion to dismiss Michael J. Roesenthaler	1.60
09/20/06	Review CEP bankruptcy filing (0.6); obtain all first day pleadings from docket and prepare binder containing same for S. Edison (3.4) Heather R. Hickman	4.00
09/21/06	Review correspondence from L. Marcero, J. Serda regarding liquidation analysis Sally E. Edison	.50
09/21/06	Telephone call from L. Marcero, J. Serda regarding same Sally E. Edison	.50
09/21/06	Meeting with M. Freedlander, M. Roesenthaler regarding first day hearing strategy Sally E. Edison	.90
09/21/06	Review updated liquidation analysis; conference with S. Edison regarding same Michael J. Roesenthaler	.30
09/21/06	Research trade committee contact information Heather R. Hickman	.80
09/21/06	Revise and e-file pro hac Motions on behalf of M. Freedlander, S. Edison and M. Roesenthaler Heather R. Hickman	1.10

09/21/06	Create service lists (0.8); telephone conferences with Judge's chambers regarding service of pleadings filed in response to first day Motions (0.2) Heather R. Hickman	1.00
09/21/06	E-file Objection to DIP Motion, Motion to Convert Case and Omnibus Response to Debtors' First Day Motions (0.9); coordinate service of all pleadings via e-mail to Trade Committee and service list (0.5) Heather R. Hickman	1.40
09/21/06	Prepare Certificate of Service of Objection to DIP Motion, Motion to Convert Case, and Omnibus Response to Debtors' First Day Motions (0.4); e-file (0.2) Heather R. Hickman	.60
09/21/06	Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/21/06	Review of top 20 creditor lists (0.3); prepare consolidated creditor list as per S. Edison request (1.3) Heather R. Hickman	1.60
09/21/06	Telephone conference with U.S. Trustee's office regarding contact information Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/22/06	Attend to issues related to 2019 statement Sally E. Edison	.30
09/22/06	Coordinate conflicts search Heather R. Hickman	.40
09/22/06	Telephone conference with Clerk's office regarding status of transferred cases Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/22/06	Internet research regarding creditor contact information as per M. Roeschenthaler request Heather R. Hickman	.70
09/22/06	Research Rule 2019 Statements (0.6); e-file Statement on behalf of McGuireWoods (0.3); coordinate service (0.2); revise Certificate of Service, e-file (0.2) Heather R. Hickman	1.30

09/22/06	Multiple telephone conferences with Court regarding status of Motion to Convert Case Heather R. Hickman	.30
09/22/06	Review and analysis of case files Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/22/06	Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.10
09/25/06	Research Rhodia claim amount Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/25/06	Multiple telephone conferences with Court regarding recent filings Heather R. Hickman	.40
09/25/06	Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/25/06	Review, organize and analysis of case files Heather R. Hickman	1.00
09/26/06	Discussions with S. Edison regarding results of DIP hearing; telephone conference with J. Downs regarding case issues and strategy; telephone conference with B. Tobiansky regarding status update Mark E. Freedlander	1.60
09/26/06	Telephone conference with U.S. Trustee regarding case status Sally E. Edison	.10
09/26/06	Review and analysis of documents received Heather R. Hickman	1.30
09/26/06	Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/27/06	Status and strategy discussion with J. DiDonato Mark E. Freedlander	.60
09/27/06	Review various correspondence from B. Mann Sally E. Edison	.20
09/27/06	Research issues related to Mexican assets Sally E. Edison	.40
09/27/06	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.70

09/27/06	Research law review articles as per S. Edison request Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/27/06	Revisions to case players list Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/27/06	Revisions to service list Heather R. Hickman	.40
09/27/06	Prepare checklist of attendees re trade committee conference call Heather R. Hickman	.60
09/27/06	Research bankruptcy docket Heather R. Hickman	.40
09/28/06	Review docket re Notice of Appointment of Creditors Committee; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.40
09/28/06	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.20
09/29/06	Review correspondence from J. Stephenson regarding document requests Sally E. Edison	.20
09/29/06	Telephone call from counsel for Honda regarding status Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.20
09/29/06	Research DuPont contact information (0.2); e-mails to S. Edison regarding same (0.1) Heather R. Hickman	.30
09/29/06	Research prior bankruptcy proceeding re Order entered authorizing continuation of vendor rescue program and payment of prepetition claims of financially distressed sole source suppliers and vendors without contacts as per S. Edison request Heather R. Hickman	.70
09/29/06	Obtain and review case management Order entered Heather R. Hickman	.20
09/30/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander regarding committee composition Sally E. Edison	.10

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	2.2	\$935.00
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	3.2	\$1,120.00
Michael J. Roeschenthaler	\$255.00	9.0	\$2,295.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	22.7	\$3,291.50
	TOTAL FEES	37.1	\$7,641.50

Disbursements and Other Expenses:

	Copy Charges	\$348.40
	Rate=.10 Quantity=3484	
	Computer Research - Lexis	\$274.00
	Long Distance Telephone Charges	\$34.00
	Westlaw Research	\$4.00
08/18/06	Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Edison Sally on 08/18/2006	\$39.27
08/22/06	Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Edison Sally on 08/22/2006	\$18.25
08/22/06	Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Edison Sally on 08/22/2006	\$16.82
08/24/06	Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Edison Sally on 08/24/2006	\$75.76
08/24/06	Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 08/24/2006	\$80.23
08/29/06	Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Edison Sally on 08/29/2006	\$23.11
09/18/06	American Express - Lunch ordered for 8/22/06 meeting with client	\$229.71
09/18/06	American Express - Tip for lunch delivered on 8/22/06	\$5.00
	TOTAL EXPENSES	\$1,148.55

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0001

\$8,790.05

Re: Debtor-in-Possession Financing
Our File No. 2048970-0004
For Services Rendered Through Sep 30, 2006

09/20/06	Draft objection to debtor in possession financing order Mark E. Freedlander	3.00
09/20/06	Obtain and review DIP Motion with all attachments; distribute to attorneys Heather R. Hickman	.50
09/21/06	Draft revisions to DIP objections; status and strategy meeting with S. Edison and M. Roeschenthaler regarding first day pleadings and hearings; communications with J. Hutchison, J. Downs and J. DiDonato regarding issues with interim DIP order Mark E. Freedlander	3.20
09/21/06	Review and revise DIP objection Sally E. Edison	2.70
09/21/06	Drafting DIP objection incorporate section drafted by M. Freedlander Michael J. Roeschenthaler	2.90
09/24/06	Review and analyze revised DIP order Sally E. Edison	.90
09/25/06	Meeting with case professionals regarding interim DIP order and review various correspondence related to same Sally E. Edison	3.50
09/25/06	Telephone conference with M. Freedlander regarding DIP order status Sally E. Edison	.40
09/25/06	Review proposed DIP order; correspondence with S. Edison regarding comments to same Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.40
09/26/06	Telephone conference with L. Marcero regarding strategy for global settlement with Wachovia and customers Mark E. Freedlander	.50

09/26/06 Review various correspondence from debtors' .50
 counsel regarding interim DIP order and review
 order
 Sally E. Edison

09/26/06 Review correspondence from T. Wearsch regarding .20
 DIP financing order
 Sally E. Edison

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	6.7	\$2,847.50
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	8.2	\$2,870.00
Michael J. Roeschenthaler	\$255.00	3.3	\$841.50
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	0.5	\$72.50
		18.7	\$6,631.50
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0004

\$6,631.50

Re: Creditors' Committee
Our File No. 2048970-0017
For Services Rendered Through Sep 30, 2006

09/21/06	Draft correspondence to informal committee regarding first day hearing Sally E. Edison	.40
09/24/06	Draft correspondence to committee regarding first day hearings Sally E. Edison	1.10
09/25/06	Draft correspondence to committee regarding first day status Sally E. Edison	.70
09/25/06	Review various correspondence from informal committee members regarding case status and reply Sally E. Edison	.40
09/25/06	Review proposed e-mail to committee on status Michael J. Roesenthaler	.10
09/27/06	Prepare for and participate in status/strategy conference call with committee Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
09/27/06	Prepare for and attend conference call with informal committee regarding case strategy and first day hearings Sally E. Edison	1.00
09/27/06	Draft correspondence to informal committee Sally E. Edison	.20
09/29/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander regarding committee composition; review correspondence from B. Tobiansky regarding same Sally E. Edison	.20

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	1.0	\$425.00
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	4.0	\$1,400.00
Michael J. Roesenthaler	\$255.00	0.1	\$25.50
		<u>5.1</u>	<u>\$1,850.50</u>

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0017

\$1,850.50

Re: Miscellaneous Motions and Adversary Proceedings
Our File No. 2048970-0019
For Services Rendered Through Sep 30, 2006

09/20/06	Review first day pleadings; status and strategy meeting with S. Edison and M. Roeschenthaler regarding objections to first day pleadings Mark E. Freedlander	2.20
09/20/06	Review and analyze first day motions Sally E. Edison	2.40
09/20/06	Meeting with M. Freedlander, M. Roeschenthaler re review and analysis of DIP order and related strategy Sally E. Edison	2.20
09/21/06	Review and revise omnibus objection to first day motions Sally E. Edison	2.80
09/21/06	Prepare for first day hearings Sally E. Edison	2.80
09/21/06	Research wage priority issues and communications with S. Edison regarding same (.4) James E. Van Horn	.40
09/21/06	Revise Motion to Convert Michael J. Roeschenthaler	2.50
09/21/06	Review omnibus objection to various first days; meeting with S. Edison regarding same; assist on revision Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
09/22/06	Travel to and from Akron for first day hearings; participate in first day hearings Mark E. Freedlander	11.50
09/22/06	Travel to and attend first day hearings Sally E. Edison	10.10
09/22/06	Prepare binder containing first day pleadings for M. Roeschenthaler Heather R. Hickman	.80

09/24/06 Prepare for continued first day and DIP hearings
Sally E. Edison 1.20

09/25/06 Travel to and attend continued first day hearings
Sally E. Edison 5.80

09/27/06 Research Washington Penn v. CEP district court action for M. Freedlander (0.1); obtain requested pleadings (0.2)
Heather R. Hickman .30

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	13.7	\$5,822.50
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	27.3	\$9,555.00
James E. Van Horn	\$280.00	0.4	\$112.00
Michael J. Roeschenthaler	\$255.00	2.6	\$663.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	1.1	\$159.50
		45.1	\$16,312.00
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0019

\$16,312.00

Summary of Fees and Expenses:

Total Fees for all Matters:	\$32,435.50
Total Expenses for all Matters:	<u>\$1,148.55</u>
Total for this Invoice:	<u><u>\$33,584.05</u></u>