

McGUIREWOODS

Mark E. Freedlander
412.667.7928

Dominion Tower, 23rd Floor
625 Liberty Avenue
Pittsburgh PA 15222

November 14, 2006

INVOICE NO. 90883659

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (CEP)
c/o Bruce Tobiansky
DuPont Corporation
DuPont Legal, D-4026
1007 Market Street
Wilmington, DE 19898

TAX ID NO. 54-0505857

JOINT GROUP #2048970

Current Invoice:

Current Fees:	\$83,026.00	
Current Disbursements:	<u>\$2,334.87</u>	
Current Invoice Total:		<u>\$85,360.87</u>

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO THE FOLLOWING ADDRESS:

McGuireWoods LLP
Attn: Accounts Receivable
901 E. Cary Street
Richmond, VA 23286-0645

PAYMENT IN FULL IS DUE WITHIN 30 DAYS OF DATE OF INVOICE

McGUIREWOODS

For professional services rendered and expenses incurred from
October 2, 2006 through October 31, 2006 regarding File
Number 2048970 :

<u>Matter</u>	<u>Fees</u>	<u>Disb.</u>	<u>Total</u>
General Administration			
2048970-0001	\$17,777.00	\$2,334.87	\$20,111.87
Petition, Schedules and Financial Information			
2048970-0002	\$759.50	\$.00	\$759.50
Debtor-in-Possession Financing			
2048970-0004	\$31,785.50	\$.00	\$31,785.50
Docket Review			
2048970-0008	\$650.00	\$.00	\$650.00
Employee Matters			
2048970-0009	\$1,050.00	\$.00	\$1,050.00
Creditors' Committee			
2048970-0017	\$2,920.00	\$.00	\$2,920.00
Miscellaneous Motions and Advesary Proceedings			
2048970-0019	\$9,387.50	\$.00	\$9,387.50
Sales			
2048970-0020	\$15,687.00	\$.00	\$15,687.00
Motions for Relief for Stay			
2048970-0021	\$43.50	\$.00	\$43.50
Retention of Professionals and Fee Application			
2048970-0022	\$2,966.00	\$.00	\$2,966.00
	<hr/>	<hr/>	<hr/>
	\$83,026.00	\$2,334.87	\$85,360.87

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

Re: General Administration
Our File No. 2048970-0001
For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006

10/02/06 Telephone conference with M. Roeschenthaler regarding committee bylaws Sally E. Edison	.20
10/02/06 Research issues relating to Mexican insolvency laws Michael J. Roeschenthaler	2.30
10/02/06 Review articles regarding cross-border bankruptcy Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.30
10/02/06 Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.60
10/02/06 E-mail to U.S. Trustee's Office regarding DuPont contact information Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/03/06 Communications with B. Tobiansky regarding committee strategy Mark E. Freedlander	.40
10/03/06 Review correspondence from B. Tobiansky regarding committee formation and retention of professionals Sally E. Edison	.20
10/03/06 Telephone conference with S. Edison regarding Bylaws Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
10/03/06 Review and analysis of documents received Heather R. Hickman	1.70
10/04/06 Conference call with CEP professionals regarding case status and strategy Mark E. Freedlander	1.30

10/04/06	Discussion with D. Lampl and R. Cromer regarding committee theories for creditor recoveries Mark E. Freedlander	.40
10/04/06	Prepare for and attend conference call with debtors' counsel regarding case status Sally E. Edison	1.20
10/04/06	Review correspondence from T. Wearsch regarding lien searches Sally E. Edison	.40
10/04/06	Meeting with M. Freedlander and S. Edison regarding conference call and strategy Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.40
10/04/06	Participate in conference call with counsel for debtors, M. Freedlander and S. Edison Michael J. Roeschenthaler	1.30
10/04/06	Review designations Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.20
10/04/06	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.80
10/04/06	Review consolidated creditor list; e-mail to M. Roeschenthaler regarding same Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/05/06	Review various correspondence from M. Freedlander regarding issues related to Delphi reservation Sally E. Edison	.30
10/05/06	Research issues relating to proposed bonus plan Michael J. Roeschenthaler	2.50
10/05/06	Review correspondence regarding recently filed pleadings Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
10/05/06	Discuss collecting information relating to motion to discuss hearing with paralegal Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.20
10/05/06	Conference with staff regarding calendar Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10

10/05/06	Review of recently filed pleadings Heather R. Hickman	1.10
10/06/06	Telephone conference with J. Hutchison regarding case status and strategy Mark E. Freedlander	.60
10/06/06	Meeting with M. Freedlander regarding objections to motions set for hearing on 10/10/06 Sally E. Edison	.40
10/06/06	Telephone conference with T. Wearsch regarding case status Sally E. Edison	.40
10/06/06	Conference with M. Freedlander regarding miscellaneous motions Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
10/06/06	Conference call with committee Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.50
10/06/06	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.30
10/09/06	Communications with J. Hutchison regarding case status and open case items Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
10/09/06	Review and analyze DIP settlement proposal and motion to dismiss Sally E. Edison	.50
10/10/06	Telephone conference with B. Sidman regarding Honda equipment and facility issues Mark E. Freedlander	.50
10/10/06	Telephone conference with T. Radom regarding Delphi specific equipment and DIP order issue Mark E. Freedlander	.70
10/10/06	Follow up regarding miscellaneous pleadings; conference with M. Freedlander regarding same Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.30
10/10/06	Conference with debtor Michael J. Roeschenthaler	1.40

10/10/06 Meeting with M. Freedlander and S. Edison regarding open issues and conference call Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.30
10/10/06 Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.60
10/11/06 Telephone conference with J. Downs regarding sale issues and negotiation of consensual final DIP order with committee Mark E. Freedlander	.70
10/11/06 Review litigation calendar for objection deadlines Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
10/11/06 Review of recently filed pleadings Heather R. Hickman	.90
10/12/06 Case strategy meeting with S. Edison Mark E. Freedlander	.90
10/12/06 Review and analysis of case documents Heather R. Hickman	1.30
10/13/06 Communications with J. Hutchinson regarding case administration and information sharing issues Mark E. Freedlander	.50
10/13/06 Address various customer tooling issues Mark E. Freedlander	.90
10/13/06 Review and analysis of case documents Heather R. Hickman	1.30
10/16/06 Communications (multiple) with counsel to CEP regarding case status, liquidation analysis issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.40
10/16/06 Review stipulated order regarding customers tooling and related correspondence among professionals Sally E. Edison	.40
10/16/06 Review transcript of first days Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.70
10/16/06 Review and analysis of case documents Heather R. Hickman	1.70

10/16/06	Research local bankruptcy rules as per attorney request Heather R. Hickman	.30
10/17/06	Status and strategy discussions with L. Marcero; strategy discussions with S. Edison Mark E. Freedlander	1.40
10/17/06	Draft correspondence to T. Wearsch regarding customer tooling Sally E. Edison	.10
10/17/06	Research local rule 2016 as per attorney request Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/17/06	Review and analysis of case documents Heather R. Hickman	1.30
10/18/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander regarding Honda and Bishopville Sally E. Edison	.20
10/18/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander regarding Ford emergency motion for relief Sally E. Edison	.20
10/18/06	Review and analysis of case documents Heather R. Hickman	1.40
10/19/06	Discussions with J. Downs regarding Ford issues Mark E. Freedlander	.30
10/19/06	Meeting with M. Freedlander regarding objection to miscellaneous motions Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.20
10/19/06	Revise and update service list Heather R. Hickman	.50
10/19/06	Review general Order re case administration procedures Heather R. Hickman	.40
10/20/06	Review liquidation analysis from Grant Thornton Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
10/20/06	Review and analysis of case documents Heather R. Hickman	1.50

10/23/06 Meeting with M. Freedlander regarding case status Sally E. Edison	.40
10/23/06 Research case on Lexis as per M. Freedlander request Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/23/06 Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.50
10/24/06 Draft correspondence to M. Giannirakis regarding committee attendance at continued 341 meeting Sally E. Edison	.40
10/24/06 Correspondence with S. Edison regarding potential issues relating to security interests in Mexico Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
10/24/06 Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	2.30
10/25/06 Review Mexican securitization articles Michael J. Roeschenthaler	1.50
10/25/06 Research securing collateral in Mexico; meeting with S. Edison regarding same Michael J. Roeschenthaler	3.50
10/25/06 Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	2.40
10/25/06 Register and perform on-line UCC searches in the District of Columbia; discussions with S. Edison regarding same Janice W. Shapiro	1.20
10/25/06 Locate article regarding Mexican security interests Cynthia L. Smith	.40
10/26/06 Respond to creditor inquiries regarding status/strategy Mark E. Freedlander	.90

10/27/06	Conference call with J. Hutchinson and Mexican counsel regarding ownership of assets in Mexico, lien perfection in Mexico and asset disposition in Mexico Mark E. Freedlander	1.80
10/27/06	Prepare for conference call with debtor Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.50
10/27/06	Conference call with debtor regarding Mexico; meeting with M. Freedlander and S. Edison regarding same Michael J. Roeschenthaler	2.00
10/27/06	Conference with S. Edison regarding conference call Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.20
10/27/06	Review documentation regarding Mexican assets Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.40
10/27/06	Review Chihua lease Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.30
10/27/06	Review updated offer by plant Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
10/30/06	Review and analysis of case documents Heather R. Hickman	1.70
10/31/06	Review statements of financial affairs regarding potential value of avoidance actions Mark E. Freedlander	1.30
10/31/06	Communications with S. Edison regarding Mexican asset protection issues Mark E. Freedlander	.50
10/31/06	Research filings for entry of appearance by State of Ohio and DEP as per attorney request Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/31/06	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	2.30

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	15.5	\$6,587.50
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	5.3	\$1,855.00
Michael J. Roeschenthaler	\$255.00	19.8	\$5,049.00
Janice W. Shapiro	\$160.00	1.2	\$192.00

Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	27.9	\$4,045.50
Cynthia L. Smith	\$120.00	0.4	\$48.00
		70.1	\$17,777.00
TOTAL FEES			

Disbursements and Other Expenses:

Copy Charges		\$285.20
Rate=.10 Quantity=2852		
Computer Research - Lexis		\$264.00
Postal Service Charges		\$24.30
Long Distance Telephone Charges		\$100.20
Westlaw Research		\$550.00
09/27/06 Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Edison Sally on 09/27/2006		\$24.25
10/04/06 Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 10/04/2006		\$21.78
10/05/06 Sally E Edison - First Day of Hearing 10/02/06; mileage, cab fare		\$95.78
10/06/06 Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 10/06/2006		\$20.16
10/06/06 FedEx Priority Overnight/Int'l Priority to AKRON OH US Tracking #: 718936289474		\$9.59
10/06/06 Transcripts Plus- CM 2048970-0001 pre-payment for transcript of first day hearings held in CEP bankruptcy proceeding		\$809.60
10/10/06 FedEx Priority Overnight/Int'l Priority to NEW HOPE PA US Tracking #: 851136229023		\$18.38
10/12/06 Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 10/12/2006		\$30.22
10/13/06 Genesys Conferencing - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 10/13/2006		\$16.82
10/16/06 GENESYS CONFERENCING - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 10/16/2006		\$8.56
10/17/06 FedEx Priority Overnight/Int'l Priority to PITTSBURGH PA US Tracking #: 858583683710		\$14.39
10/19/06 GENESYS CONFERENCING - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 10/19/2006		\$20.92
10/20/06 GENESYS CONFERENCING - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 10/20/2006		\$5.72
10/24/06 Mark E. Freedlander- Filing fee 10/17/06		\$15.00
TOTAL EXPENSES		\$2,334.87

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0001

\$20,111.87

Re: Petition, Schedules and Financial Information

Our File No. 2048970-0002

For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006

10/30/06 Brief review of schedules and statement of financial affairs Sally E. Edison	.70
10/30/06 Review Debtors' schedules and statements filed (0.8); distribute to S. Edison and Grant Thornton (0.3) Heather R. Hickman	1.10
10/31/06 Review and analyze schedules and SOFAs Sally E. Edison	.60
10/31/06 Prepare binders containing Debtors' schedules Heather R. Hickman	1.00

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	1.3	\$455.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	2.1	\$304.50
TOTAL FEES		3.4	\$759.50

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0002

\$759.50

Re: Debtor-in-Possession Financing**Our File No. 2048970-0004****For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006**

10/03/06	Research Objection by Honda to Debtors' Financing Motion for M. Freedlander Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/04/06	Discussions with M. Hammer regarding potential resolution of committee DIP objection and motion to convert Mark E. Freedlander	.30
10/07/06	Draft settlement proposal to participating customers and Wachovia Mark E. Freedlander	3.20
10/09/06	Discuss settlement proposal with L. Marcero, draft revisions to settlement letter Mark E. Freedlander	1.40
10/11/06	Telephone conference with T. Radom regarding Delphi designated equipment purchases and potential DIP order resolution with Committee Mark E. Freedlander	.80
10/11/06	Communications with D. Baty regarding potential resolution of DIP order issues with participating customers Mark E. Freedlander	.50
10/12/06	Conference call with participating customers regarding potential resolution of DIP/cash collateral issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
10/12/06	Prepare for and participate in call with customers regarding DIP terms Sally E. Edison	1.20
10/12/06	Review various correspondence from customer counsel regarding equipment designations Sally E. Edison	.40
10/12/06	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding issues related to DIP negotiation Sally E. Edison	.60

10/12/06	Various office meetings with M. Freedlander, M. Roeschenthaler regarding DIP Sally E. Edison	.80
10/13/06	Conference call with Wachovia regarding committee settlement proposal relating to DIP issues; communications with participating customers regarding results of Wachovia negotiations and next steps Mark E. Freedlander	2.30
10/13/06	Review correspondence from J. Hutchison regarding BBK payment issues and related e-mails from other case professionals Sally E. Edison	.40
10/13/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander to committee regarding status of discussions with Wachovia Sally E. Edison	.30
10/16/06	Status and strategy conference call with participating customers Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
10/16/06	Multiple communications with counsel to Wachovia regarding potential resolution of DIP objection and case strategy issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.40
10/17/06	Case status, strategy and DIP resolution/litigation communications with J. Hutchison Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
10/17/06	Review Wachovia borrowing base certificate; discuss same with J. Downs Mark E. Freedlander	.80
10/17/06	Review various correspondence from M. Freedlander regarding borrowing base certificate Sally E. Edison	.30
10/18/06	Drafting of revised settlement term sheets relating to DIP/cash collateral order Mark E. Freedlander	2.20

10/18/06	Numerous communications with L. Marcero regarding status and strategy relating to customer and Wachovia negotiations Mark E. Freedlander	1.30
10/18/06	Communications (multiple) with counsel to CEP regarding liquidation analysis issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.40
10/18/06	Communications with customers regarding DIP order resolution and/or asset disposition issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.10
10/18/06	Discovery concerning final DIP Hearing Sally E. Edison	.40
10/18/06	Research DIP Motion and related documents for customer subordination agreement information Heather R. Hickman	.50
10/19/06	Conference call with J. Hutchison and J. Downs regarding status/strategy for DIP order negotiations Mark E. Freedlander	.70
10/19/06	Telephone conference with M. Hammer regarding negotiation of resolution of DIP order issues with participating customers Mark E. Freedlander	.80
10/19/06	Draft revisions to Wachovia and participating customer settlement proposals; discuss same with L. Marcero Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
10/19/06	Review and draft comments to proposed DIP order and customer agreement Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
10/19/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander to committee regarding DIP term sheet proposal Sally E. Edison	.40
10/19/06	Review correspondence from J. Hutchison regarding cancelled meeting with professionals and related correspondence Sally E. Edison	.30
10/19/06	Review term sheets Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10

10/19/06	Review proposed final DIP order Michael J. Roeschenthaler	1.30
10/20/06	Settlement conference calls and discussions with counsel to participating customers and counsel to Wachovia; multiple communications with L. Marcero regarding status and strategy relating to same Mark E. Freedlander	4.50
10/21/06	Correspondence with M. Freedlander regarding status of settlement with Wachovia and customers Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
10/23/06	Participate in communications with customers, Wachovia, debtors and committee co-chairs regarding negotiation of consensual DIP order Mark E. Freedlander	7.20
10/23/06	Review proposed winddown budget Sally E. Edison	.40
10/23/06	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding status of DIP order Sally E. Edison	.40
10/24/06	Attend and participate in hearing/negotiations relating to debtor in possession financing order (travel to/from Akron relating to same) Mark E. Freedlander	9.10
10/24/06	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding DIP order status Sally E. Edison	.80
10/24/06	Review Visteon's proposed findings of fact Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.30
10/24/06	Review status e-mail from M. Freedlander regarding DIP; respond to same Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.10
10/24/06	Review consolidated reply to objections to DIP motion Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.30
10/24/06	Review limited objection of NL Ventures Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.20

10/25/06	Review and comment on multiple drafts of DIP financing order and related documents; communications with J. Downs, S. Isenberg, K. Katsma, S. Edison, et al. regarding issues and comments to DIP order and related documents Mark E. Freedlander	4.20
10/25/06	Telephone conference with M. Freedlander regarding status of final DIP hearing Sally E. Edison	.20
10/25/06	Review various correspondence from debtors' counsel re interim DIP order and review order Sally E. Edison	.80
10/26/06	Multiple communications with S. Edison regarding DIP order issues and potential resolution thereof; communications with J. Downs regarding same; review of documents Mark E. Freedlander	2.50
10/26/06	Travel to and from Akron final DIP hearing Sally E. Edison	3.80
10/26/06	Attend final DIP hearing and various meeting with counsel regarding same Sally E. Edison	7.80
10/26/06	Various telephone conferences with M. Freedlander regarding status of DIP hearing Sally E. Edison	.40
10/26/06	Review updated liquidation analysis Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.20
10/27/06	Address outstanding DIP order language issues Mark E. Freedlander	.70
10/27/06	Status and strategy discussion with J. Hutchinson and J. Downs regarding DIP financing issues and strategy Mark E. Freedlander	.80
10/27/06	Participate in telephonic hearing regarding DIP Order issues Mark E. Freedlander	.80
10/27/06	Office meeting with M. Freedlander regarding status of DIP hearing Sally E. Edison	.40

10/27/06 Review various correspondence from case .50
 professionals regarding same
 Sally E. Edison

10/30/06 Review various correspondence from case .50
 professionals regarding status of entry of DIP
 order and related documents and exhibits
 Sally E. Edison

10/31/06 Draft correspondence to committee chairs .60
 regarding committee signatures required on
 selected DIP documents
 Sally E. Edison

10/31/06 Review amendment to post petition agreement .20
 Michael J. Roesenthaler

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	55.0	\$23,375.00
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	21.7	\$7,595.00
Michael J. Roesenthaler	\$255.00	2.8	\$714.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	0.7	\$101.50
TOTAL FEES		80.2	\$31,785.50

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0004

\$31,785.50

Re: Docket Review

Our File No. 2048970-0008

For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006

10/03/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/04/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/05/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/06/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/10/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/11/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/12/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/13/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/16/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/17/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/18/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/19/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/20/06 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/23/06 Telephone call from M. Giannirakis regarding status of motion to approve incentive program and 341 meeting Sally E. Edison	.20

10/23/06 Review docket; distribute .20
Heather R. Hickman

10/24/06 Review docket; distribute .20
Heather R. Hickman

10/25/06 Review docket; distribute .20
Heather R. Hickman

10/26/06 Review docket; distribute .20
Heather R. Hickman

10/27/06 Review docket; distribute .20
Heather R. Hickman

10/30/06 Review docket; distribute .20
Heather R. Hickman

10/31/06 Review docket; distribute .20
Heather R. Hickman

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	0.2	\$70.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	4.0	\$580.00
		<hr/>	<hr/>
	TOTAL FEES	4.2	\$650.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0008

\$650.00

Re: Employee Matters

Our File No. 2048970-0009

For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006

10/06/06	Conference call with W. Wilson regarding issues relating to proposed incentive/retention program Mark E. Freedlander	.50
10/06/06	Review bonus plan summary from GT Sally E. Edison	.30
10/11/06	Communications with D. Fusco regarding issues with stay bonus program Mark E. Freedlander	.40
10/12/06	Office meeting with M. Freedlander regarding incentive program Sally E. Edison	.20
10/12/06	Telephone conference with R. Willis regarding call from J. Reichman regarding UNITE HERE union and request for information regarding employee sale options; review correspondence from M. Freedlander regarding same Sally E. Edison	.40
10/18/06	Meeting with M. Roeschenthaler regarding issues and strategy relating to employee incentive program Mark E. Freedlander	.50
10/27/06	Office meeting M. Freedlander regarding status of employee incentive program Sally E. Edison	.40

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	1.4	\$595.00
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	1.3	\$455.00
		2.7	\$1,050.00
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0009

\$1,050.00

Re: Creditors' Committee**Our File No. 2048970-0017****For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006**

10/02/06	Office meeting with M. Freedlander, M. Roeschenthaler regarding committee and case status Sally E. Edison	.50
10/04/06	Review and revise committee by-laws Mark E. Freedlander	.70
10/04/06	Draft committee by-laws Sally E. Edison	.60
10/04/06	Office meeting with M. Freedlander, M. Roeschenthaler regarding case status and strategy Sally E. Edison	.40
10/06/06	Creditor committee status and strategy conference call Mark E. Freedlander	1.20
10/12/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander to committee chair/co-chair regarding same Sally E. Edison	.10
10/12/06	Review correspondence from M. Giannirakis regarding revised committee composition; office meeting with M. Freedlander regarding same Sally E. Edison	.40
10/13/06	Review various correspondence from M. Freedlander, B. Tobiansky, D. Wilson-Bailey regarding scheduling of committee conference call Sally E. Edison	.30
10/18/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander, B. Tobiansky, D. Wilson-Bailey regarding scheduling of committee call Sally E. Edison	.20
10/19/06	Prepare for and participate in status and strategy conference call with committee co-chairs regarding revised settlement offer Mark E. Freedlander	1.20

10/19/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander, B. Tobiansky, D. Wilson-Bailey regarding scheduling of conference call Sally E. Edison	.20
10/19/06	Conference with committee Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.50
10/23/06	Participate in status call with committee co-chairs Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
10/30/06	Review correspondence from J. Serda regarding information request to Debtors Sally E. Edison	.30

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	4.1	\$1,742.50
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	3.0	\$1,050.00
Michael J. Roeschenthaler	\$255.00	0.5	\$127.50
		7.6	\$2,920.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0017 \$2,920.00

Re: Miscellaneous Motions and Advesary Proceedings
Our File No. 2048970-0019
For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006

10/03/06	Review motion to approve incentive plan Sally E. Edison	.40
10/04/06	Review Delphi essential supplier order Sally E. Edison	.40
10/04/06	Revise Notice of Appearance, e-file (0.5); create service list (0.7); coordinate service of same (0.3) Heather R. Hickman	1.50
10/05/06	Review bonus compensation motion and draft issues with respect thereto; review articles on revisions to code relating to KERP programs Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
10/05/06	Discuss issues relating to various pleadings with M. Freedlander and S. Edison Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.20
10/05/06	Create critical dates calendar Heather R. Hickman	1.50
10/05/06	Prepare Withdrawal of 2019 Statement Heather R. Hickman	.80
10/05/06	Telephone conferences with Court regarding request for first day hearing transcripts Heather R. Hickman	.30
10/06/06	Prepare files for 10/10/06 hearings Heather R. Hickman	1.10
10/06/06	Telephone conferences with Court regarding request for transcript of first day hearings (0.2); request funds and prepare letter to Court, transmit to same (0.3) Heather R. Hickman	.50
10/06/06	Update critical dates calendar; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.40
10/10/06	Participate in telephonic status conference and miscellaneous motions hearings Mark E. Freedlander	1.20

10/10/06 Telephone conference with Clerk regarding request for transcript of first day hearings Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/10/06 Update critical dates calendar Heather R. Hickman	.40
10/11/06 E-mail to Transcripts Plus regarding first day hearing transcript requested Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/11/06 Update critical dates calendar; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.70
10/13/06 Correspondence with court transcribers regarding first day hearing transcript request Heather R. Hickman	.30
10/16/06 Prepare electronic core service list Heather R. Hickman	.50
10/16/06 Review first day hearing transcripts Heather R. Hickman	.80
10/17/06 Update critical dates calendar; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.80
10/18/06 Review motion for authority to implement bonus plan; meeting with M. Freedlander regarding response to bonus motion Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.80
10/18/06 Analyze bonus plan; draft objection to same Michael J. Roeschenthaler	3.00
10/19/06 Participate in telephonic status conference with court Mark E. Freedlander	.70
10/19/06 Telephone conference with J. Roberton regarding Ford molds dispute and potential resolution thereof Mark E. Freedlander	.40
10/19/06 Review and draft suggested revisions to objection to employee bonus plan Mark E. Freedlander	.90
10/19/06 Draft objection to bonus plan motion Michael J. Roeschenthaler	2.00

10/19/06	Multiple telephone conferences with Court regarding filing and service process Heather R. Hickman	.60
10/20/06	Participate in Ford relief from stay hearings (2); participate in telephonic status conference Mark E. Freedlander	1.60
10/20/06	Draft revisions to objection to employee retention plan motion and reservation to sale procedures motion Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
10/20/06	Conference call with counsel to Ford, counsel to Wachovia and special counsel to CEP regarding Ford relief resolution Mark E. Freedlander	.40
10/20/06	Revise objection to bonus motion Michael J. Roeschenthaler	2.70
10/20/06	Research issues related to retention bonuses and severance bonuses; continue drafting objection to bonus motion; proof same Michael J. Roeschenthaler	2.10
10/20/06	Prepare and e-file Committee Objection to to Performance Bonus Plan and Reservation of Rights to Debtors' Sale Motion (0.7); coordinate service via e-mail and U.S. mail (0.6) Heather R. Hickman	1.30
10/20/06	Research objections and responses to various motions scheduled for 10/24/06 hearings Heather R. Hickman	.80
10/23/06	Prepare binders for 10/24/06 hearings Heather R. Hickman	2.70
10/23/06	Prepare and e-file Certificates of Service re Committee Objection to Sale Motion and Employee Bonus Motion Heather R. Hickman	.60
10/26/06	Review and analysis of recently filed pleadings Heather R. Hickman	.80
10/27/06	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	2.50

10/30/06 Review correspondence from J. Downs regarding .20
 Washington Penn subpoena and review replies
 Sally E. Edison

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	8.2	\$3,485.00
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	1.0	\$350.00
Michael J. Roesenthaler	\$255.00	10.8	\$2,754.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	19.3	\$2,798.50
		39.3	\$9,387.50
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0019 \$9,387.50

Re: Sales

**Our File No. 2048970-0020
For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006**

10/02/06	Review and analyze various appraisals received from debtors Sally E. Edison	.90
10/02/06	Review correspondence from GM regarding designation of sale facilities Sally E. Edison	.10
10/04/06	Review correspondence from T. Bergen regarding plant by plant budget Sally E. Edison	.40
10/06/06	Draft issues list regarding asset liquidation; communications with B. Holland regarding asset liquidation issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
10/06/06	Review various correspondence from M. Freedlander to case professionals regarding case status and strategy Sally E. Edison	.40
10/06/06	Telephone conference with L. Marcero regarding facility sales Sally E. Edison	.20
10/06/06	Review correspondence from L. Marcero regarding same Sally E. Edison	.40
10/09/06	Discussions with B. Holland regarding asset disposition issues and strategy Mark E. Freedlander	.90
10/09/06	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding strategy for asset sales Sally E. Edison	.40
10/09/06	Review correspondence from GM's counsel regarding designated equipment lists Sally E. Edison	.30

10/10/06	Communications with L. Marcero regarding customer equipment designation and AR payment issues Mark E. Freedlander	.80
10/10/06	Telephone conference with J. Downs and S. Isenberg regarding asset disposition strategy and issues Mark E. Freedlander	.70
10/10/06	Conference call with debtor, Glass and Wachovia regarding asset disposition status and issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.70
10/10/06	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding status of customer resourcing Sally E. Edison	.30
10/10/06	Participate in conference call with debtors' and Wachovia's professionals regarding strategy for asset sales and related matters; review various correspondence from debtors' and Wachovia's professionals regarding same; office meeting with M. Freedlander, M. Roeschenthaler regarding same Sally E. Edison	2.70
10/11/06	Communications with L. Woodard regarding issues with letter of intent for Mexican facility Mark E. Freedlander	.80
10/11/06	Research sale Motion Heather R. Hickman	.30
10/13/06	Review correspondence from J. Hutchison regarding V229 equipment sale Sally E. Edison	.10
10/16/06	Communications with T. Watters regarding M&E sale issues Mark E. Freedlander	.80
10/16/06	Review, analyze and draft comments to sale procedures motion; review asset materials provided to auctioneers Mark E. Freedlander	1.40

10/16/06	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander to J. Hutchison regarding sale procedures and related responses Sally E. Edison	.40
10/18/06	Review Bishopville APA Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.30
10/19/06	Discussions with J. Hutchison, J. Downs, R. Sidman regarding emergency sale of Bishopville to Honda supplier Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
10/19/06	Draft reservation of rights to procedures motion Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.60
10/19/06	Review and analysis of case files Heather R. Hickman	.60
10/20/06	Address Bishopville going concern sale issues with Wachovia and Honda Mark E. Freedlander	1.20
10/20/06	Address sale issues relating to Bishopville Sally E. Edison	.20
10/23/06	Review auction/liquidation proposals; discussions with T. Watters regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	.90
10/23/06	Review auction procedures Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.50
10/25/06	Research regarding lien perfection in Mexico Sally E. Edison	2.80
10/25/06	Telephone conference with M. Freedlander regarding Mexican assets Sally E. Edison	.10
10/25/06	Draft correspondence to debtors' counsel regarding information requests concerning Mexican assets Sally E. Edison	.30
10/25/06	Review auctioneer comparison prepared by Glass Sally E. Edison	.40

10/25/06	Meeting with and draft correspondence to J. Shapiro regarding lien search concerning Mexican assets; meeting with M. Roesenthaler regarding same Sally E. Edison	.70
10/26/06	Communications with T. Watters regarding auction issues; communications with J. Hutchison regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	.80
10/26/06	Meeting with J. Hutchinson regarding status of Mexican assets Sally E. Edison	.20
10/26/06	Review correspondence regarding sale and auctioneer Michael J. Roesenthaler	.20
10/26/06	Research sale Motion as per attorney request Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/27/06	Conference call with debtors and Wachovia regarding strategy for auctioneer selection and sale procedures Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
10/27/06	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding status of auctioneer bids; telephone conference with case professionals regarding same Sally E. Edison	1.10
10/27/06	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding status of Mexican assets; prepare for and attend conference call regarding same; office meeting with M. Freedlander and M. Roesenthaler regarding same Sally E. Edison	3.10
10/27/06	Review recent filings and documentation related to proposed sales Michael J. Roesenthaler	1.00
10/30/06	Address liquidation/auction issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.00

10/30/06	Review numerous correspondence from case professionals regarding auctioneer selection process and related sales Sally E. Edison	.80
10/31/06	Various telephone calls and conference calls addressing auctioneer retention and facility liquidations Mark E. Freedlander	3.20
10/31/06	Prepare for and attention conference calls on selection of auctioneer Sally E. Edison	1.60
10/31/06	Review numerous correspondence from case professionals regarding status of selection of auctioneer Sally E. Edison	.60
10/31/06	Conference with M. Freedlander and S. Edison regarding auction procedures; conference call with debtor regarding same Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.30
10/31/06	Review auctioneer proposals and carry cost analysis Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.30
10/31/06	Prepare for and attend conference calls on selection of auctioneer Michael J. Roeschenthaler	1.60
10/31/06	Review transactional documents relating to sale of real property Michael J. Roeschenthaler	1.20

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	17.7	\$7,522.50
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	18.5	\$6,475.00
Michael J. Roeschenthaler	\$255.00	6.0	\$1,530.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	1.1	\$159.50
		43.3	\$15,687.00
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0020

\$15,687.00

Re: Motions for Relief for Stay
Our File No. 2048970-0021
For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006

10/18/06 Review Motion for Relief from Stay filed by .30
Ford Motor Company
Heather R. Hickman

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	0.3	\$43.50
		<hr/>	<hr/>
	TOTAL FEES	0.3	\$43.50

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0021 \$43.50

Re: Retention of Professionals and Fee Application
Our File No. 2048970-0022
For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2006

10/02/06	Research regarding nunc pro tunc relief related to retention of professionals Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.50
10/04/06	Review and revise application to retain McGuireWoods Mark E. Freedlander	1.20
10/04/06	Draft retention application Michael J. Roeschenthaler	1.60
10/04/06	Draft proposed order for retention application Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.40
10/04/06	Draft affidavit in support of retention application; review client relationships Michael J. Roeschenthaler	1.00
10/04/06	Research retention applications of financial advisors filed in various bankruptcy proceedings (0.3); e-mails to Grant Thornton regarding same (0.2) Heather R. Hickman	.50
10/05/06	Conference with M. Freedlander regarding Guliani application; review same Michael J. Roeschenthaler	.20
10/06/06	E-file retention application (0.4); telephone conferences with Court regarding service (0.2); coordinate service via e-mail and U.S. mail (0.5); prepare Certificate of Service, e-file (0.4) Heather R. Hickman	1.50
10/10/06	Telephone conference with Grant Thornton regarding McGuireWoods retention application (0.2); transmit application to same (0.1) Heather R. Hickman	.30
10/11/06	E-mail to Grant Thornton regarding retention application Heather R. Hickman	.20

10/13/06	Review correspondence from J. Hutchison regarding Glass as IB and related e-mails from other case professionals Sally E. Edison	.40
10/13/06	Prepare and e-file Amended Exh. 2 to M. Freedlander Affidavit in Support of McGuireWoods retention Heather R. Hickman	.60
10/16/06	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding Glass as IB Sally E. Edison	.20
10/16/06	Prepare Certificate of Service re Amended Exh. 2 to Affidavit of M. Freedlander in Support of Retention Application, e-file (0.5); coordinate service of same (0.4) Heather R. Hickman	.90
10/17/06	E-mails to Grant Thornton regarding status of retention application Heather R. Hickman	.30
10/17/06	Review Grant Thornton retention application Heather R. Hickman	.40
10/18/06	Telephone conference with Grant Thornton regarding status of retention application Heather R. Hickman	.20
10/19/06	Review correspondence from J. Hutchison regarding Glass as IB Sally E. Edison	.20
10/19/06	Revisions to Grant Thornton retention application (0.7); e-file (0.4); prepare and file amendment to application (0.8); coordinate service via e-mail and U.S. mail (0.3) Heather R. Hickman	2.20
10/19/06	Revise and upload McGuireWoods retention Order Heather R. Hickman	.40
10/20/06	Prepare and e-file Certificate of Service re Grant Thornton retention application Heather R. Hickman	.50
10/25/06	Research retainer held as of filing date as per S. Edison request Heather R. Hickman	.30

10/27/06 Telephone conference with Court regarding .20
status of McGuireWoods retention Order
Heather R. Hickman

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$425.00	1.2	\$510.00
Sally E. Edison	\$350.00	0.8	\$280.00
Michael J. Roesenthaler	\$255.00	3.7	\$943.50
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$145.00	8.5	\$1,232.50
	TOTAL FEES	14.2	\$2,966.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0022

\$2,966.00

Summary of Fees and Expenses:

Total Fees for all Matters:	\$83,026.00
Total Expenses for all Matters:	<u>\$2,334.87</u>
Total for this Invoice:	<u>\$85,360.87</u>