

McGUIREWOODS

Mark E. Freedlander
412.667.7928

Dominion Tower, 23rd Floor
625 Liberty Avenue
Pittsburgh PA 15222

February 7, 2007

INVOICE NO. 90904019

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (CEP)
c/o Bruce Tobiansky
DuPont Corporation
DuPont Legal, D-4026
1007 Market Street
Wilmington, DE 19898

TAX ID NO. 54-0505857

JOINT GROUP #2048970

Current Invoice:

Current Fees:	\$70,084.50	
Current Disbursements:	<u>\$165.18</u>	
Current Invoice Total:		<u>\$70,249.68</u>

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO THE FOLLOWING ADDRESS:

McGuireWoods LLP
Attn: Accounts Receivable
901 E. Cary Street
Richmond, VA 23286-0645

PAYMENT IN FULL IS DUE WITHIN 30 DAYS OF DATE OF INVOICE

McGUIREWOODS

For professional services rendered and expenses incurred from
January 2, 2007 through January 31, 2007 regarding File
Number 2048970 :

<u>Matter</u>	<u>Fees</u>	<u>Disb.</u>	<u>Total</u>
General Administration			
2048970-0001	\$15,667.50	\$160.30	\$15,827.80
Investigation of Prepetition Transactions			
2048970-0003	\$1,472.50	\$.00	\$1,472.50
Debtor-in-Possession Financing			
2048970-0004	\$2,690.00	\$.00	\$2,690.00
Docket Review			
2048970-0008	\$332.50	\$.00	\$332.50
Employee Matters			
2048970-0009	\$580.00	\$.00	\$580.00
Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization			
2048970-0013	\$34,633.00	\$.00	\$34,633.00
Creditors' Committee			
2048970-0017	\$240.00	\$.00	\$240.00
Claims Processing			
2048970-0018	\$3,372.50	\$.00	\$3,372.50
Miscellaneous Motions and Advesary Proceedings			
2048970-0019	\$4,313.00	\$.00	\$4,313.00
Sales			
2048970-0020	\$6,731.00	\$4.88	\$6,735.88
Retention of Professionals and Fee Application			
2048970-0022	\$52.50	\$.00	\$52.50

\$70,084.50

\$165.18

\$70,249.68

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

Re: General Administration

Our File No. 2048970-0001

For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/02/07 Status and strategy discussions with J. Hutchinson Mark E. Freedlander	.60
01/03/07 Draft open issues memo to counsel to CEP Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/03/07 Communications with L. Marcero regarding estate winddown cost issues, liquidating trust issues, account receivable collection issues Mark E. Freedlander	.90
01/03/07 Review M. Freedlander memorandum regarding case status William C. Price	.50
01/04/07 Address liquidation issues with L. Marcero Mark E. Freedlander	.70
01/04/07 Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.70
01/05/07 Communications with J. Hutchinson regarding liquidation status and strategy; communications with L. Marcero regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	.80
01/05/07 Review various emails regarding case status William C. Price	.50
01/08/07 Status and strategy discussions with J. Hutchinson and B. Price Mark E. Freedlander	.90
01/09/07 Review and comment on common interest agreement Ronald W. Crouch	.40
01/09/07 Communications with J. Hutchinson regarding winddown and case administration issues Mark E. Freedlander	.50

01/09/07	Review Crestline letter of intent; review debtor outline of open issues; review updated liquidation analysis materials Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/09/07	Review wind down budget (1.0); participate in conference call regarding wind down and case status (1.0); review open items memorandum (.5) William C. Price	2.50
01/09/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.30
01/10/07	Address issues regarding final winddown budget; Mallak salary proposal; A/R collections; potential litigation claims Mark E. Freedlander	2.20
01/10/07	Draft status update memo to committee Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/10/07	Review various e-mails related to Wachovia funding (.3); review various e-mails related to Anthem notification (.3); review various e-mails regarding collection of accounts receivable (.3); review draft status report to Committee (.5); review Order setting general unsecured claims bar date (.3) William C. Price	1.70
01/11/07	Discussions with J. Hutchinson regarding Mallak compensation issues; communications with L. Marcero regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	.70
01/11/07	Review various correspondence from committee professionals regarding analysis of winddown costs Sally E. Edison	.20
01/11/07	Review various e-mails related to wind down William C. Price	.30
01/11/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.70
01/12/07	Communications with J. Hutchinson regarding case administration issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.20

01/12/07	Communications with L. Marcero regarding accounts receivable collection and reconciliation issues; Mallak retention/payment issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.10
01/12/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.80
01/12/07	Update of service list Heather R. Hickman	.50
01/15/07	Communications with CEP and/or L. Marcero regarding accounts receivable reconciliation issues Mark E. Freedlander	.90
01/15/07	Review memorandum from M. Freedlander regarding case status (.3); review accounts receivable collection status (.5); meeting with M. Freedlander regarding case status (.2) William C. Price	1.00
01/16/07	Communications with L. Marcero, J. Hutchinson regarding accounts receivable collection issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.10
01/16/07	Case status and strategy discussions with J. Hutchinson Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/16/07	Participate in hearing regarding motion to extend exclusivity William C. Price	.50
01/17/07	Review accounts receivable information; communications with L. Marcero regarding accounts receivable collection issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.30
01/17/07	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding status of collection of AR Sally E. Edison	.30
01/17/07	Review and analyze winddown budget Sally E. Edison	.20
01/18/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.90

01/19/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.30
01/22/07	Communications with J. Hutchinson regarding status and strategy relating to accounts receivable collections and communications with Grant Thornton regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/22/07	Review updated liquidation analysis and communications with Grant Thornton regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/23/07	Review draft order terminating DIP facility (.5); review accounts receivable balances update (.1); review various e-mails regarding J. Mallak's employment status (.3) William C. Price	.90
01/24/07	Status update conference call with advisors to CEP Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/24/07	Status and strategy discussions with B. Tobiansky Mark E. Freedlander	.50
01/24/07	Research docket for information as requested by M. Freedlander, pull requested documents Thomas Matthew Collins	.20
01/25/07	Communications with L. Marcero regarding accounts receivable reconciliation and collection issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/25/07	Address Delphi claim issues with B. Tobiansky Mark E. Freedlander	.50
01/25/07	Research docket for information as requested by M. Freedlander, pull requested documents Thomas Matthew Collins	.20
01/30/07	Research docket for M. Freedlander and pull requested documents Thomas Matthew Collins	.10

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	24.4	\$11,590.00

Ronald W. Crouch	\$440.00	0.4	\$176.00
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	0.7	\$280.00
William C. Price	\$310.00	7.9	\$2,449.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	6.2	\$1,085.00
Thomas Matthew Collins	\$175.00	0.5	\$87.50
		40.1	\$15,667.50

Disbursements and Other Expenses:

Copy Charges		\$16.30
Rate=.10 Quantity=163		
Pacer Research		\$10.96
Long Distance Telephone Charges		\$30.40
12/10/06 GENESYS CONFERENCING - Conference call hosted by Edison Sally on 12/10/2006		\$3.90
12/13/06 GENESYS CONFERENCING - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 12/13/2006		\$15.59
12/22/06 GENESYS CONFERENCING - Conference call hosted by Freedlander Mark on 12/22/2006		\$63.11
01/15/07 FedEx Priority Overnight/Int'l Priority to MISSISSAUGA ON CA Tracking #: 841148374959		\$20.04
		\$160.30

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0001 \$15,827.80

Re: Investigation of Prepetition Transactions
Our File No. 2048970-0003
For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/17/07 Communications with M. Merklin regarding .90
 Reserve Group issues and information requests
 Mark E. Freedlander

01/23/07 Review documentation relating to The Reserve 2.20
 Group and communications with M. Merklin
 regarding same
 Mark E. Freedlander

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	3.1	\$1,472.50
TOTAL FEES		3.1	\$1,472.50

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0003 \$1,472.50

Re: Debtor-in-Possession Financing
Our File No. 2048970-0004
For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/04/07	Review of final cash collateral Order as per W. Price request Heather R. Hickman	.20
01/08/07	Review and analyze revised budget and related correspondence from case professionals Sally E. Edison	.40
01/09/07	Participate in case funding call with counsel to CEP, Glass and Grant Thornton Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/12/07	Address case funding issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/17/07	Review loan documents relating to case funding issue Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/23/07	Review correspondence from case professionals regarding revised cash collateral order Sally E. Edison	.30
01/24/07	Review correspondence from various case professionals regarding cash collateral order Sally E. Edison	.20
01/24/07	Review Visteon's comments to order amending final order authorizing use of cash collateral William C. Price	.50
01/25/07	Review correspondence from various case professionals regarding cash collateral order revisions Sally E. Edison	.30
01/26/07	Communications with J. Downs and M. Hammer regarding DIP amendment issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/26/07	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding DIP amendment and termination Sally E. Edison	.30

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	4.0	\$1,900.00
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	1.5	\$600.00
William C. Price	\$310.00	0.5	\$155.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	0.2	\$35.00
		<hr/>	<hr/>
	TOTAL FEES	6.2	\$2,690.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0004

\$2,690.00

Re: Docket Review
Our File No. 2048970-0008
For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/02/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
01/03/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.10
01/04/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.10
01/05/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.10
01/08/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.10
01/09/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.10
01/10/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
01/11/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
01/12/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
01/16/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
01/17/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
01/19/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	1.9	\$332.50
		<u>1.9</u>	<u>\$332.50</u>
TOTAL FEES			

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of CEP
File Number: 2048970
Invoice No. 90904019

Page 12
February 7, 2007

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0008

\$332.50

Re: Employee Matters

Our File No. 2048970-0009

For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/10/07 Research files and database relating to .50
employee documentation as per M. Freedlander
request
Heather R. Hickman

01/16/07 Communications with J. Hutchinson regarding .70
union effects bargaining issues
Mark E. Freedlander

01/23/07 Review correspondence from M. Freedlander .30
regarding Mallak employment agreement and
replies from case professionals
Sally E. Edison

01/24/07 Review correspondence from M. Freedlander .10
regarding workers comp
Sally E. Edison

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	0.7	\$332.50
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	0.4	\$160.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	0.5	\$87.50
		<hr/>	<hr/>
	TOTAL FEES	1.6	\$580.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0009

\$580.00

Re: Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization
Our File No. 2048970-0013
For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/02/07	Draft revisions to plan of liquidation and liquidating trust agreement; communications with B. Price regarding disclosure statement drafting issues; communications with L. Marcero regarding potential appointment as liquidating trustee Mark E. Freedlander	3.60
01/02/07	Draft disclosure statement (6.0); review revised joint plan of liquidation (1.0); revise joint plan of liquidation (.5); review draft trust agreement and Plan (2.0) William C. Price	9.50
01/03/07	Review and comment on plan Sally E. Edison	1.70
01/03/07	Review M. Freedlander memo to J. Hutchinson regarding case status Sally E. Edison	.20
01/03/07	Revise draft trust agreement (2.0); revise joint plan of liquidation (2.0); revise disclosure statement (2.5) William C. Price	6.50
01/04/07	Review and draft revisions to disclosure statement Mark E. Freedlander	3.20
01/04/07	Analysis of Plan and Trust Agreement for tax issues. Douglas W. Charnas	2.10
01/04/07	Review, revise and finalize draft disclosure statement and circulate the same to M. Freedlander and S. Edison for review and comment William C. Price	5.00
01/05/07	Revise draft disclosure statement integrating M. Freedlander's comments (5.0); revise draft plan of liquidation (0.5); revise draft trust agreement (0.5) William C. Price	6.00

01/08/07	Discuss liquidating trust issues with S. Martin Mark E. Freedlander	.50
01/08/07	Review revised liquidating budget Mark E. Freedlander	.70
01/08/07	Review and draft revisions to disclosure statement Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/08/07	Revise draft disclosure statement (2.5); review presentation materials (1.0); review Parker-Hannifin transaction closing binder (1.5); meeting with M. Freedlander regarding status (0.3); William C. Price	6.30
01/09/07	Address potential litigation/discovery strategy issues with R. Crouch Mark E. Freedlander	.70
01/12/07	Review motion to extend exclusivity (.5); draft response to motion to extend exclusivity (1.0); revise response to motion to extend exclusivity (.5); coordinate filing and service of response to motion to extend exclusivity (.2) William C. Price	2.20
01/18/07	Telephone conference with E. Goodman regarding debtor comments to disclosure statement; draft revisions to plan of liquidation Mark E. Freedlander	2.40
01/19/07	Communications with E. Goodman regarding Baker comments to proposed disclosure statement; draft revisions to proposed plan of liquidation Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/19/07	Drafting modifications to plan of liquidation Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/19/07	Review memorandum regarding liquidation procedure for Mexican operations William C. Price	1.00
01/22/07	Drafting of revisions to plan related documents Mark E. Freedlander	2.70

01/22/07	Review e-mail from M. Freedlander regarding administrative claims bar date (.1); review claims bar date order (.3); draft e-mail to M. Freedlander regarding administrative claims bar date (.1) William C. Price	.50
01/23/07	Address plan of liquidation and liquidating trust issues of Huron Mark E. Freedlander	.80
01/23/07	Draft revisions to Wachovia form of debtor-in-possession termination stipulation Mark E. Freedlander	1.70
01/23/07	Address trust administration issues with J. Hutchinson Mark E. Freedlander	.70
01/23/07	Drafting of revisions to plan and related documents Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/23/07	Review revised draft joint plan of liquidation William C. Price	1.00
01/24/07	Communications with M. Hammer regarding DIP termination stipulation Mark E. Freedlander	.70
01/24/07	Drafting revisions to plan and plan related documents Mark E. Freedlander	1.20
01/24/07	Teleconference with claims agent regarding balloting issues (.2); teleconference with project manager at BMC Group regarding balloting issues (.3); review e-mail from project manager at BMC Group regarding balloting issues and forward the same to M. Freedlander (.1); review e-mail from M. Freedlander regarding workers' compensation issues (.2); review case status reports (.5); meeting with M. Freedlander regarding workers' compensation issues (.3) William C. Price	1.60

01/25/07	Communications with J. Downs regarding termination of debtor-in-possession facility; review Wachovia proposed comments to stipulation; communications with M. Hammer regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/25/07	Communications with S. Martin regarding Huron comments to liquidating trust Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/25/07	Drafting of revisions to plan documents Mark E. Freedlander	2.00
01/26/07	Drafting of revisions to plan of liquidation, disclosure statement and liquidating trust agreement Mark E. Freedlander	3.00
01/29/07	Draft revisions to plan and disclosure statement and liquidation trust agreement Mark E. Freedlander	3.00
01/29/07	Review revisions to plan of liquidation (.5); review revisions to disclosure statement (.7); review revisions to trust agreement (.5); review e-mail to committee regarding plan of liquidation, disclosure statement and trust agreement (.3) William C. Price	2.00
01/30/07	Communications with committee co-chairs and communications with S. Martin regarding liquidation trust and plan of liquidation issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/30/07	Revise disclosure statement motion Sally E. Edison	.50
01/30/07	Review e-mail from M. Freedlander to client regarding plan of liquidation, disclosure statement and trust agreement (.1); review e-mail from client regarding plan of liquidation, disclosure statement and trust agreement (.1); review revised plan of liquidation, disclosure statement and trust agreement (.7); meeting with M. Freedlander regarding comments to plan of liquidation, disclosure statement and trust agreement (.1) William C. Price	1.00

01/31/07 Address issues relating to plan and disclosure statement
Mark E. Freedlander 5.00

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Douglas W. Charnas	\$495.00	2.1	\$1,039.50
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	40.9	\$19,427.50
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	2.4	\$960.00
William C. Price	\$310.00	42.6	\$13,206.00
	TOTAL FEES	88.0	\$34,633.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0013

\$34,633.00

Re: Creditors' Committee
Our File No. 2048970-0017
For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/10/07 Review and comment on proposed status memo to .40
committee
Sally E. Edison

01/30/07 Review various correspondence from committee .20
chairs regarding status of plan and committee
conference call
Sally E. Edison

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	0.6	\$240.00
		<u>0.6</u>	<u>\$240.00</u>
	TOTAL FEES		

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0017 \$240.00

Re: Claims Processing
Our File No. 2048970-0018
For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/08/07	Review labor and benefit claim issue memos and discuss same with J. Hutchinson Mark E. Freedlander	1.10
01/11/07	Communications with S. Edison, T. Wearsch, and D. Clay regarding independent contractor claim issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
01/11/07	Discussion with J. Hutchinson regarding claims related issues; review documents Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/12/07	Telephone conference with D. Clay regarding independent contractor claim issues; discussions with S. Edison and M. Hammer regarding independent contractor claim issues; e-mail communications with counsel to CEP and counsel to independent contractors regarding claim issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.10
01/17/07	Review information regarding Carlisle administrative claim for equipment and reclamation claims report Mark E. Freedlander	.90
01/24/07	Discussions with J. Hutchinson regarding workers compensation issues in Ohio Mark E. Freedlander	1.50

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	7.1	\$3,372.50
		<u>7.1</u>	<u>\$3,372.50</u>
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0018

\$3,372.50

Re: Miscellaneous Motions and Adversary Proceedings
Our File No. 2048970-0019
For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/03/07	Research status of independent contractors Motion for S. Edison Heather R. Hickman	.20
01/09/07	Review draft joint defense and prosecution agreement William C. Price	.50
01/09/07	Update critical dates calendar; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.90
01/11/07	Review correspondence from D. Clay regarding proposed order authorizing payment of independent contractors Sally E. Edison	.30
01/11/07	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander regarding same Sally E. Edison	.20
01/11/07	Telephone conference with D. Clay regarding same Sally E. Edison	.30
01/11/07	Telephone conference with T. Wearsch regarding same Sally E. Edison	.20
01/11/07	Review Supplemental Order authorizing Debtors to pay wages and salaries of individual contractors and relating pleadings as per S. Edison request Heather R. Hickman	.50
01/12/07	Participate in pre-hearing status call Mark E. Freedlander	.80
01/12/07	Review correspondence from D. Clay regarding proposed stipulation of facts related to independent contractors Sally E. Edison	.30

01/12/07	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding payments to independent contractors Sally E. Edison	.30
01/12/07	Meeting with M. Freedlander regarding same Sally E. Edison	.20
01/12/07	Draft correspondence to M. Freedlander regarding same Sally E. Edison	.40
01/12/07	E-file Committee Response to Debtors' Motion to extend exclusivity period (0.4); coordinate service via e-mail and U.S. mail (0.5); prepare Certificate of Service, e-file (0.4) Heather R. Hickman	1.30
01/15/07	Address issues relating to claims of independent contractors Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/15/07	Address issues regarding orders for 1-16-07 hearings; communications with J. Hutchinson and T. Wearsch regarding exclusivity extension Mark E. Freedlander	1.30
01/15/07	Review correspondence from D. Clay regarding status of hearing on independent contractors and related correspondence from other counsel Sally E. Edison	.30
01/15/07	Prepare files for 1/16/07 hearings Heather R. Hickman	.80
01/17/07	Review various e-mails regarding potential litigation William C. Price	.50
01/17/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.60
01/17/07	Update critical dates calendar; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.80
01/17/07	Research reclamation report filed by Debtors and miscellaneous Motions as per attorney request Heather R. Hickman	.40

01/24/07 Address Washington Penn information requests 1.00
 with L. Marcero and B. Price
 Mark E. Freedlander

01/24/07 Review M. Freedlander's comments regarding .30
 Washington Penn Plastics litigation (.2);
 meeting with M. Freedlander regarding
 Washington Penn Plastics litigation (.1)
 William C. Price

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	4.1	\$1,947.50
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	2.5	\$1,000.00
William C. Price	\$310.00	1.3	\$403.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	5.5	\$962.50
TOTAL FEES		13.4	\$4,313.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0019

\$4,313.00

Re: Sales

Our File No. 2048970-0020
For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/05/07	Communications with S. Mates regarding timing of BIU emergency from auction facilities; communications with CEP regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/09/07	Communications with S. Mattes regarding asset liquidation and facility exit issues Mark E. Freedlander	.80
01/09/07	Review Crestline letter of intent William C. Price	.30
01/10/07	Review correspondence from various professionals regarding status of outstanding asset sales Sally E. Edison	.20
01/24/07	Communications with Bidityup and other parties in interest regarding surrender dates for sale facilities Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/24/07	Review e-mail from M. Freedlander regarding sales and removal of equipment; review e-mail from J. Hutchinson regarding sales and removal of equipment William C. Price	.30
01/25/07	Communications with Bidityup regarding facility surrender issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/26/07	Communications with Bidityup and counsel to debtors regarding abandonment of facilities following auctions Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
01/31/07	Travel to and from Middlefield, Ohio (5.0); attend auction at Middlefield, Ohio plant (8.5) William C. Price	13.50

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	4.8	\$2,280.00
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	0.2	\$80.00

William C. Price	\$310.00	14.1	\$4,371.00
		<hr/>	<hr/>
TOTAL FEES		19.1	\$6,731.00

Disbursements and Other Expenses:

Pacer Research \$4.88

TOTAL EXPENSES

 \$4.88

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0020 \$6,735.88

Re: Retention of Professionals and Fee Application
Our File No. 2048970-0022
For Services Rendered Through Jan 31, 2007

01/19/07 Coordinate service of Grant Thornton December .30
invoice
Heather R. Hickman

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	0.3	\$52.50
		<u>0.3</u>	<u>\$52.50</u>
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0022 \$52.50

Summary of Fees and Expenses:

Total Fees for all Matters:	\$70,084.50
Total Expenses for all Matters:	<u>\$165.18</u>
Total for this Invoice:	<u>\$70,249.68</u>