Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/24/07	M J Asensio	Meet with Mr. McGowan at Company's headquarters in preparation for negotiation session with Steelworkers Union.	2.00	920.00
01/24/07	J J McGowan Jr	Final preparations for effect bargaining with Steelworkers, labor counsel (1.0); pull together materials including bargaining agreements, pension plans, actuary reports, COBRA and health plan related documents and materials (.2); preliminary meeting with Mr. Asensio (.4); meet with Steelworkers and their counsel to review individuals with retained health plan coverage, rates of payment, scope of coverage, etc. (.8); review, discuss 2005 CBA-dictated benefit plan increased and scope of PBGC insurance (40%), discuss generally plan liabilities, controlled group issues and considerations, agree to collect additional information from actuary (1.5); contact Mr. Hutchinson and discuss status of discussions, push back from union on termination dates, etc. (.2); contact Mr. Merklin(.1).	4.20	1,932.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/24/07	D L Koerwitz	Assist with preparations for meeting between Mr. Asensio and Mr. McGowan and representatives from the unions (.5); research issue regarding circumstances under which an additional premium is assessable for a terminating plan when the plan sponsor is in bankruptcy (1.0); report findings of research to Mr. McGowan (.1); review COBRA data to determine number of employees who have subscribed to COBRA coverage from the Tuscaloosa location and report findings to Mr. Hutchinson (.6).	2.20	605.00
01/24/07	J F Hutchinson,	E-mails and conference with Mr. Bergen regarding workers' compensation issues (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding workers' compensation issues and Mallak contract (.4); review and work on workers' compensation issues (.2); conference with Mr. Goodman regarding workers' compensation research (.2).	1.00	525.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/24/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Bergen regarding Union meeting, receivables and future funding (.3); conference with Mr. Asensio and Mr. McGowan regarding labor negotiations (.3).	0.60	315.00
01/24/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference call with Grant Thornton, Glass & Associates, Mr. Freedlander, Mr. Wearsch regarding remaining issues in case.	0.50	262.50
01/24/07	S L Atkinson	Assist Ms. Koerwitz in providing Mr. McGowan with necessary documents for negotiations with Union.	0.50	75.00
01/24/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Hutchinson regarding workers compensation claims (.4); attend conference call with Messrs. Hutchinson, Bergen, Freedlander and Mallak regarding same (.5).	0.90	225.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/24/07	E R Goodman	Telephone call with Ms. Koerwitz regarding workers' compensation payments (.1); telephone call with Ohio Workers' Compensation Bureau regarding CEP (.3); attend conference with Mr. Hutchinson and Mr. Wearsch regarding workers' compensation issues (.3); review CEP first day Motion and Order regarding workers' compensation plans (.3); attend conference call with Mr. Hutchinson and Mr. Freedlander regarding workers' compensation issues (.3); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding workers'	2.60	637.00
01/25/07	M J Asensio	compensation issues (.2); research and review case law on the treatment of claims for unpaid workers' compensation premiums in Ohio (1.1). Review documents received from Steelworkers Union including prior collective bargaining agreements with regard to potential assumption of pension plan and its liabilities.	1.10	506.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/25/07	M J Asensio	Several telephone conferences with Mr. Fusco, counsel for Steelworkers Union with regard to documentation needed to facilitate further negotiation surrounding the termination of the health and welfare plan and the potential assumption of the pension plan and its liabilities.	1.10	506.00
01/25/07	J J McGowan Jr	Follow-up on Steelworkers bargaining issues; receive, review older bargaining agreements (.5); discuss practical aspects with Mr. Merklin, raising affects bargaining questions, desire to be circumspect over response to PBGC, Steelworkers, separately respond to PBGC inquiries pertaining to compliance statement (.5).	1.00	460.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/25/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Workers' Compensation, accounts receivable collections, Mexican assets, closing of Mexican and future personnel needs (.6); conference with Mr. Goodman regarding workers' compensation issues (.3); work on workers' compensation issue regarding priority of various workers' compensation claims (.5).	1.40	735.00
01/26/07	P A Poole	Attention to workers' compensation non-compliant employer issues (.4); review code sections relating to non complying employers (.6).	1.00	375.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/26/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Ms. Poole and Mr. Goodman regarding workers' compensation issues and potential liability regarding premiums (.5); review workers' compensation issues, including priority issues (.2); e-mails regarding workers' compensation from Mr. Goodman (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding employment agreement (.2); conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding status of workers' compensation issues and Mallak employment agreement (.2); conference with Mr. Hamlin regarding status (.2).	1.50	787.50
01/26/07	E R Goodman	Review DIP budget (.4); meet with Mr. Hutchinson and Ms. Poole regarding treatment of Ohio workers' compensation claims (.8); telephone call to SRS regarding workers' compensation claims (.1); review Carlisle Asset Purchase Agreement and draft e-mail to Mr. Hutchinson and Ms. Poole regarding the same (.6); telephone call to Mr. Mallak regarding workers' compensation documents (.1).	2.00	490.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/28/07	E R Goodman	Review case law dealing with the treatment of workers' compensation premiums under section 507 of the Bankruptcy Code.	0.40	98.00
01/29/07	J J McGowan Jr	Confer with Ms. Koerwitz about effects bargaining (.3); check on status of revised pension funding studies with Mr. Hutchinson (.2).	0.50	230.00
01/29/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Goodman regarding workers' compensation/review case law on workers' compensation/premiums priority (.3); review and revise revisions to Mr. Mallak employment agreement (.3).	0.60	315.00
01/29/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Mallak regarding personnel issues (.5); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.2).	0.70	367.50
01/29/07	E R Goodman	Telephone call with Mr. Hutchinson regarding workers' compensation premiums.	0.30	73.50
01/30/07	J J McGowan Jr	Follow-up with Mr. Hutchinson regarding need for updated pension actuarial figures.	0.50	230.00
01/30/07	R M Loesch	Review amendment to Mr. Mallak's employment agreement.	0.30	117.00

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 48 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/31/07	R M Loesch	Review and comment on draft amendment to Mr. Mallak's employment agreement.	0.80	312.00
01/31/07	E R Goodman	Telephone call with SRS regarding workers' compensation claims.	0.30	73.50

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B17	ENVIRONMENT	PAL MATTERS		
01/30/07	JР	Perdion	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Middlefield property (.3); conference with Mr. Poynter regarding environmental issues at Middlefield property (.2); internet research regarding environmental issues at Middlefield property (.3); review reports regarding environmental issues at Middlefield property (.1);	2.00	580.00
01/30/07	J F	Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Perdion regarding environmental issues at Middlefield.	0.20	105.00
01/31/07	J P	Perdion	Review purchase agreement and lease with respect to retained environmental liabilities and indemnification for Middlefield property (1.0); draft disclosure language (.2); review and respond to e-mail correspondence regarding same from Mr. Hutchinson (.1).	1.30	377.00
01/31/07	J F	Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Perdion regarding environmental language to go in Disclosure Statement and make revisions thereto.	0.50	262.50

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B18	EXECUTORY	CONTRACTS AND LEASES		
10/03/06	т м	Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Hunter regarding leases at various facilities (.3); review lease for Tuscaloosa (.2).	0.50	117.50
10/10/06	т м	Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Parobek regarding JP Morgan/Chase lease (.4); review same (.7).	1.10	258.50
10/11/06	т м	Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding leases at client's facilities (.3); further telephone calls with Mr. Ray regarding equipment (.5).	0.80	188.00
10/12/06	т м	Wearsch	Review JP Morgan Equipment Lease (.5); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding client's lease agreements (.3); review and revise proposed Vandalia Order (.5).	1.30	305.50
10/25/06	JF	Hutchinson,	Receipt and review e-mails regarding revisions to contracts (.4); conference with Mr. Radom regarding Hermasillo (.2).	0.60	270.00
10/30/06	JF	Hutchinson,	Review issues and documents regarding leases at Crestline and Tuscaloosa true equipment leases.	0.70	315.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value	
10/31/06	T M Wearsch	Prepare for meeting (.3); attend meeting with Messrs. Hutchinson, Toole and Parobek regarding JP Morgan Chase lease and Carlisle issues (1.3).	1.60	376.00	

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B18	EXECUTORY	CONTRACTS AND LEASES		
11/01/06	тм	Wearsch	Review and respond to requests from Mr. Parker regarding lease agreements (.5); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding same (.3).	0.80	188.00
11/03/06	E R	Goodman	Review 365(d)(4) Motions filed in other case since the enactment of BAPCPA (1.4); research and review case law applying section 365(d)(4) of the Bankruptcy Code (.5); review case law considering Motions to Extend Time in which to assume or reject leases (.9); draft and edit Motion, lease schedule and proposed Order for a 90-day extension (3.6); review Debtors' Schedule G (.2).	6.60	1,485.00
11/08/06	E R	Goodman	Review e-mail from landlord regarding rental payments (.1); telephone call to Company regarding rental payments (.3); telephone call with counsel for the landlord regarding postpetition rental payments (.1).	0.50	112.50
11/10/06	E R	Goodman	Review time deadlines for plan filing and contract assumption per voice message from Mr. Hutchinson.	0.40	90.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/15/06	E R Goodman	Telephone calls with client regarding postpetition lease payment (.2); draft First Omnibus Lease Rejection Motion, proposed Order and exhibit (3.1).	3.30	742.50
11/16/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit First Omnibus Lease Rejection Motion (.3); draft e-mail to Company regarding lease rejection issues (.2).	0.50	112.50
11/20/06	T M Wearsch	Various telephone calls with Messrs. Hutchinson, Bergen and Stephenson regarding lease payments (.5); legal research regarding payment of administrative rent with security deposit (1.5).	2.00	470.00
11/20/06	E R Goodman	Review research memorandum on lease rejection damages.	0.20	45.00
11/21/06	J F Hutchinson,	Work with Mr. Wearsch regarding landlord deposits and e-mails regarding same (.5); research regarding landlord deposits and recovery of same (.9).	1.40	630.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/21/06	T M Wearsch	Review and respond to correspondence and inquiries from Committee and Wachovia regarding security deposit use post-petition (.4); continued legal research regarding same (1.6).	2.00	470.00
11/21/06	E R Goodman	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding treatment of security deposits with certain lessors of nonresidential real property (.8); locate and begin reviewing case law and lease rejection claims (.2).	1.00	225.00
11/27/06	E R Goodman	Draft Second Omnibus Lease Rejection Motion for personal property and proposed Order.	1.00	225.00
11/30/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Goodman regarding rent deposits and payment of rent.	0.20	90.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B18	EXECUTORY	CONTRACTS AND LEASES		
12/04/06	ТМ	Wearsch	Exchange correspondence with Mr. Parker regarding real property leases, rental payments and rejection (.3); telephone call with Gretchen from Dilouth Capital regarding rejection of equipment lease (.2).	0.50	117.50
12/05/06	т м	Wearsch	Review and comment on lease rejection schedule.	0.40	94.00
12/06/06	Т М	Wearsch	Prepare comments for telephone call (.5); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding rejection cap analysis (.4).	0.90	211.50
12/06/06	E R	Goodman	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding lease rejection and security deposit issues.	0.60	135.00
12/08/06	J F	Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Wyner regarding landlord issue at Tuscaloosa.	0.20	90.00
12/08/06	т м	Wearsch	Review and respond to memorandum from Mr. Parobek regarding leased presses and Carlisle claims (.3); review revised rejection analysis (.2).	0.50	117.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/11/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit Motion for Extension of Time to Assume or Reject Nonresidential Real Property Leases.	1.90	427.50
12/13/06	E R Goodman	Draft e-mail to Glass & Associates regarding lease schedule (.3); draft and edit Motion for Extension of Time to Assume or Reject Nonresidential Real Property Leases (1.3); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding lease schedule (.1).	1.70	382.50
12/13/06	E R Goodman	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding executory contract Motion.	0.20	45.00
12/14/06	E R Goodman	Draft e-mail to Glass & Associates regarding lease schedule (.1); telephone call with Ms. Johnson regarding real property leases (.1); edit Motion for Extension of Time to Assume or Reject Nonresidential Real Property Leases (.1).	0.30	67.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/15/06	E R Goodman	Telephone call with BMC regarding lease schedule (.1); draft e-mails to Glass & Associates regarding lease schedules (.3); telephone call with Glass & Associates regarding lease schedule (.2); draft and edit Motion for Extension of Time to Assumeor Reject Nonresidential Real Property Leases (1.0); review lease rejection report from Glass & Associates (1.2); review and edit first omnibus lease rejection Motion (1.5); begin reviewing expired leases and executory contracts set for rejection (1.5); telephone call to equipment lessor (.2); begin reviewing case law on retroactive lease rejection (.4).	6.40	1,440.00
12/17/06	E R Goodman	Research and review case law on retroactive lease rejection (1.5); edit real property and personal property lease rejection Motions (1.6).	3.10	697.50
12/18/06	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review and make revisions to Motion to Reject Livonia Lease.	0.30	135.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/18/06	E R Goodman	E-mail correspondence with Glass & Associates regarding real property leases (.1); review case law on retroactive lease rejection (1.3); review Livonia lease (1.1); draft and edit Motion to Reject Livonia Leasee (1.5); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding edits to lease rejection Motion (.2); edit same per comments from Mr. Hutchinson (1.0); attend to filing of lease rejection Motion (.2).	5.40	1,215.00
12/19/06	J F Hutchinson,	Work on Motion to Extend Time to Reject Leases (.3); e-mails to Mr. Mallak and Mr. Stephenson regarding timing of lease rejections (.3).	0.60	270.00
12/19/06	T M Wearsch	Review and respond to correspondence regarding lease rejections and timing.	0.40	94.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/19/06	E R Goodman	Edit Motion to Extend Time to Assume or Reject Nonresidential Real Property Leases (3.7); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same (.4); attend to filing of Motion to Extend Time to Assume or Reject Nonresidential Real Property Leases (.3); edit first omnibus personal property lease rejection Motion (.2); review unexpired personal property leases (.9).	5.50	1,237.50
12/20/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit personal property lease rejection Motion (1.7); telephone calls with Glass & Associates regarding personal property schedule (.2); draft e-mails regarding rejection date for personal property leases (.2); review personal property leases (1.3).	3.40	765.00
12/21/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding rejection of lease agreements.	0.20	47.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/21/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit Motion to Reject Personal Property Leases (1.2); e-mail correspondence with Glass & Associates regarding equipment schedule for lease rejection Motion (.1); telephone call to Mr. Mallak regarding computer leases (.1).	1.40	315.00
12/22/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Goodman regarding revisions to Motions (.6); review and revise Motions regarding rejection of personal lease and rejection damages (.9).	1.50	675.00
12/22/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding access to facilities (.2); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.2); review Motions to Reject Leases and Motion to Extend Time to do same (.6); telephone call with Mr. Goodman regarding same (.2).	1.20	282.00
12/22/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit personal property lease rejection Motion and attend to filing of the same.	0.70	157.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/26/06	J F Hutchinson,	Review Motion regarding equipment leases, lease rejection claims and revise same (.4); review Atlas documents (.3).	0.70	315.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B18	EXECUTORY (CONTRACTS AND LEASES		
01/02/07	J F	Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Goodman regarding equipment lien rejections.	0.20	105.00
01/02/07	E R	Goodman	Telephone call to equipment lessor.	0.20	49.00
01/03/07	JF	Hutchinson,	Review equipment lease rejection summary and determine additional rejections and timing.	0.50	262.50
01/03/07	ТМ	Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Mallak Agreement (.2); review Mallak Agreement and draft memorandum regarding potential rejection claim arising under same (2.5).	2.70	675.00
01/05/07	ТМ	Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Parker regarding lease payments and insurance at Belleville and Canton (.4); review and revise analysis of Mallak Agreement (.4).	0.80	200.00
01/05/07	E R	Goodman	Review e-mail from Mr. Hutchinson regarding lease rejection Motion (.1); review real property leases scheduled for rejection (.6); draft real property lease rejection Motion (.7); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding lease rejection Motion (.2).	1.60	392.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/07/07	E R Goodman	Review real property leases scheduled for rejection and draft real property lease rejection Motion.	1.50	367.50
01/08/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Parker regarding Belleville and Canton leases (.4); follow-up with Mr. Bergen regarding same (.2); assess propriety of paying full rent on same (.2); review and respond to correspondence from Mr. Parobek regarding sale of presses in Crestline (.3).	1.10	275.00
01/08/07	E R Goodman	Draft and edit real property lease rejection Motion (1.8); review case law on effective date of lease rejection (.4); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding lease rejection Motion (.4).	2.60	637.00
01/09/07	E R Goodman	Telephone call with personal property lessor (.1); draft e-mails to Glass & Associates regarding rejection of personal property leases (.1).	0.20	49.00
01/11/07	T M Wearsch	Exchange correspondence with Mr. Parker regarding leased facilities.	0.30	75.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/15/07	J F Hutchinson,	Prepare for hearing (1.1); e-mails to and from Mr. Freedlander regarding exclusivity, sale, plan, independent contractors (.3); work on independent contractors' issues to determine whether to withdraw Motion (.2); e-mails to Mr. Stephenson regarding Lapeer and Crestline and surrender leased real estate (.4); conferences with Mr. Bergen regarding same (.4); conferences with Mr. Goodman regarding Orders and work on proposed Orders (.6); conference with Mr. Goodman regarding equipment leases being rejected (.2); review list of equipment leases being rejected (.1).	2.90	1,522.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/15/07	E R Goodman	Draft, edit and upload proposed Orders regarding the rejection of the Livonia lease, certain personal property leases and the section 365(d)(4) motion (2.0); draft e-mails to Glass & Associates, the Committee and Wachovia regarding proposed section 365 Orders (.3); meetings with Mr. Hutchinson regarding lease rejection Motions and Orders (.6); telephone call with client regarding Belleville and Canton facilities (.3); review personal property lease report (.3); review real property lease schedule per meeting with Mr. Hutchinson (.5).	4.00	980.00
01/16/07	J F Hutchinson,	Prepare for hearing (.4); attend hearing (1.0).	1.40	735.00
01/18/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding leased facilities (.2); follow-up regarding same with company (.2).	0.40	100.00
01/19/07	E R Goodman	Edit section 365(d)(4) Order and upload new version per conversation with the Court (.3); draft e-mail to BMC regarding service of lease rejection Order (.1).	0.40	98.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/24/07	T M Wearsch	Various telephone calls with Mr. Parker regarding leases at Canton and Belleville (.4); follow-up regarding same (.2).	0.60	150.00
01/24/07	E R Goodman	Review and file Affidavit of Service for lease rejection Order.	0.20	49.00
01/25/07	E R Goodman	Telephone conversations with Glass & Associates and client regarding status of Belleville and Canton facilities (.1); draft e-mail to Glass & Associates regarding second personal property lease rejection Motion (.3); draft second omnibus lease rejection Motion for personal property (.6).	1.00	245.00
01/26/07	T M Wearsch	Conversations with Mr. Parker regarding turn over of Belleville and Canton and temporary lease (.4); review same and respond to correspondence related to same (.3); work to coordinate turn over of properties (.4).	1.10	275.00
01/26/07	E R Goodman	Edit and revise Motion to Reject Belleville and Canton Leases (.4); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding lease rejection Motions (.2).	0.60	147.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/26/07	E R Goodman	Review and file Affidavit of Service for lease rejection Orders and draft e-mails to BMC regarding the same.	0.30	73.50
01/29/07	J F Hutchinson,	Review and revise Motion to Reject Canton and Belleville.	0.40	210.00
01/29/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding turn over of Canton and Belleville facilities (.2); continue to coordinate same (.3); review and comment on Motion for Relief from Stay (.4).	0.90	225.00
01/29/07	E R Goodman	Draft and edit Motion to Reject Canton and Belleville leases (.5); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding lease rejection Motion (.2); attend to filing Motion to Reject Canton and Belleville leases and related exhibits (.2).	0.90	220.50
01/30/07	T M Wearsch	Obtain Biditup consent to turn over of Canton and Belleville and continue coordination of same (.5); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding same (.2).	0.70	175.00
01/30/07	E R Goodman	Meet with Ms. DeGaetano regarding lease rejection research project.	0.40	98.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/30/07	E R Goodman	Review and file Affidavit of Service for lease rejection Motion.	0.10	24.50
01/30/07	M A DeGaetano	Review documents regarding pending Motion to Reject Lease (.3); meet with Mr. Goodman to discuss same (.4).	0.70	133.00
01/31/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding amendment to employment agreement (.3); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding turn over of Canton and Belleville (.3).	0.60	150.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B19	FEE/EMPLOYM	ENT APPLICATIONS		
10/04/06	J F	Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr. Mallak and Mr. Sacamino regarding possible retention of Guiliani Capital Advisors LLC (.8); telephone conference with Mr. Sidman regarding same (.1).	0.90	405.00
10/05/06	JF	Hutchinson,	Conference with Guiliani Capital Advisors LLC regarding potential retention as investment banker.	0.20	90.00
10/06/06	S A	Maxwell	Prepare draft Notice of Withdrawal of Application to Employ Giuliani Capital Advisors LLC as Investment Bankers and forward to Mr. Goodman for review and comment (.1); prepare same for electronic filing with court and distribution (.1).	0.20	26.00
10/10/06	JF	Hutchinson,	Review issues regarding Application to Employ Glass & Associates with Mr. DiDonato (.4); revise Application (.4).	0.80	360.00
10/12/06	J F	Hutchinson,	Revisions to Application to Employ Glass & Associates.	0.30	135.00
10/12/06	E R	Goodman	Review addendum to Application to Employ Glass & Associates.	0.30	67.50
10/13/06	T M	Wearsch	Attention to Application to Emply Glass & Associates.	0.50	117.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/16/06	S A Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	1.50	195.00
10/16/06	T M Wearsch	Attention to Application to Employ Glass & Associates.	0.40	94.00
10/17/06	S A Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	1.40	182.00
10/18/06	S A Maxwell	Prepare draft of Monthly Fee Statement letter and spreadsheet relating to same (.2); prepare Task Code Summary and forward to Mr. Wearsch for review and comment (.3).	0.50	65.00
10/18/06	J F Hutchinson,	Attention to Baker & Hostetler's Monthly Fee Statement.	0.60	270.00
10/19/06	S A Maxwell	Prepare Baker & Hostetler's Monthly Fee Statement and forward to appropriate parties.	0.60	78.00
10/19/06	S A Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	0.20	26.00
10/19/06	J F Hutchinson,	Attention to Baker & Hostetler's Monthly Fee Statement for September.	1.00	450.00
10/19/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding revised Application to Employ Glass & Associates.	0.40	180.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/19/06	T M Wearsch	Review final Monthly Fee Statement and respond to questions from other professionals regarding same.	0.30	70.50
10/29/06	E R Goodman	Review Addendum to Glass & Associates agreement (.3); draft and edit Amended Application to Employ Glass & Associates as Financial Advisor and Investment Banker (2.4).	2.70	607.50
10/30/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit Amended Application to Employ Glass & Associates as Financial Advisor and Investment Banker.	2.50	562.50
10/31/06	T M Wearsch	Review Monthly Fee Statement (.5); review interim compensation procedure regarding payment on same and holdback (.3).	0.80	188.00
10/31/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit Amended Application to Employ Glass & Associates as Financial Advisor and Investment Banker and proposed Order (.9); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same (.2).	1.10	247.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B19 FEE/E	MPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS		
11/01/06	T M Wearsch	h Review and revise Glass & Associates retention agreement and Application.	0.50	117.50
11/01/06	E R Goodman	Draft, edit and file Amended Application to Employ Glass & Associates and proposed Order per changes to the Employment Agreement.	2.00	450.00
11/06/06	S A Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	1.60	208.00
11/10/06	J F Hutchir	nson, Attention to Baker & Hostetler's Monthly Fee Statement.	2.40	1,080.00
11/17/06	T M Wearsch	n Review and revise Baker & Hostetler's Monthly Fee Statement.	1.20	282.00
11/20/06	S A Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	0.30	39.00
11/20/06	S A Maxwell	Prepare Baker & Hostetler's Monthly Fee Statement and forward to appropriate parties.	0.50	65.00
11/30/06	S A Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	0.70	91.00
11/30/06	J F Hutchin	nson, Attention to Fee Application.	0.30	135.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B19	FEE/EMPLOYM	MENT APPLICATIONS		
12/01/06	E R	Goodman	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Application to Employ real Estate Broker.	0.30	67.50
12/04/06	S A	Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	0.60	78.00
12/04/06	т м	Wearsch	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding December Monthly Fee Statement (.3); draft correspondence regarding same (.2); review and comment on December Monthly Fee Statement (.6).	1.10	258.50
12/04/06	E R	Goodman	Review Atlas employment agreement (.8); draft and edit Application to Employ Atlas and related parties (4.1); draft and edit declarations in support of Atlas Application (1.1).	6.00	1,350.00
12/05/06	S A	Maxwell	Prepare Task Code Summary and forward to Mr. Wearsch for review and comment.	0.30	39.00
12/07/06	S A	Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement at the request of Mr. Hutchinson (.5); prepare Monthly Fee Statement and forward to appropriate parties (.5).	1.00	130.00
12/07/06	J F	Hutchinson,	Work on December Monthly Fee Statement.	1.30	585.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/14/06	E R Goodman	Edit and review Application to Retain Real Estate Broker.	2.80	630.00
12/15/06	E R Goodman	Edit and review Application to Retain Real Estate Broker (.3); e-mail correspondence with Glass & Associates regarding same (.3).	0.60	135.00
12/22/06	E R Goodman	Telephone call with Mr. Hutchinson and Glass & Associates regarding Atlas Application (.2); telephone call with Ms. Johnson regarding Atlas Application (.3); draft and edit Henkaline Application, declaration and proposed Order (1.9).	2.40	540.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B19 FEE/EMPLOY	MENT APPLICATIONS		
01/03/07	J F Hutchinson,	Review Goldburg Kohn Monthly Fee Statement.	0.40	210.00
01/08/07	S A Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	1.30	182.00
01/08/07	E R Goodman	Review and respond to e-mailes regarding Amended Order Employing Glass & Associates.	0.30	73.50
01/12/07	S A Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	0.80	112.00
01/12/07	E R Goodman	Review and upload Amended Order Employing Glass & Associates (.2); telephone call to Mr. Freelander regarding same (.1).	0.30	73.50
01/16/07	J F Hutchinson,	Attention to Baker & Hostetler's Monthly Fee Statement.	0.90	472.50
01/18/07	J F Hutchinson,	E-mail Mr. Bergen regarding Ms. Robertson's bill.	0.10	52.50
01/19/07	S A Maxwell	Prepare Monthly Fee Statement and forward to appropriate parties.	0.50	70.00
01/23/07	E R Goodman	Telephone conference with Court and U.S. Trustee regarding Amended Application to Employ Glass & Associates.	0.10	24.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/25/07	E R Goodman	Draft Application to Employ Gutmann as Aappraiser for Vandalia, related declaration and proposed Order (1.6); draft e-mails to Ms. Johnson regarding same (.1).	1.70	416.50
01/26/07	E R Goodman	Draft and edit Application to Employ Gutmann as Appraiser for Vandalia (.4); draft and edit Application to Employ Watson as Appraiser for Bishopville (1.0).	1.40	343.00
01/28/07	S A Maxwell	Review and correct time entries for Monthly Fee Statement.	1.40	196.00
01/29/07	J F Hutchinson,	Review and revise Applications to Employ Appraisers.	0.30	157.50
01/29/07	E R Goodman	Edit Application to Employ Watson as Appraiser for Bishopville (.9); draft e-mails to Ms. Johnson regarding status of same (.2); prepare and file Applications to Employ Watson and Gutmann as Appraisers (.3).	1.40	343.00
01/30/07	T M Wearsch	Review and respond to inquiries regarding payment of BMC fees and expenses.	0.30	75.00

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 24 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

12/07/06 5890/088286/00001 Invoice Number 388859

Date	Na	ıme	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B20 FE	E/EMPLOYMENT	OBJECTIONS		
11/30/06	E R Goo	Aj	view Fee pplications filed by ther professionals.	0.20	45.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B21 FINANCING	G/CASH COLLATERAL		
09/20/06	T M Wearsch	Review and revise DIP Motion (1.2); review and revise Affidavit regarding same (1.0); telephone call with Mr. Bergen regarding final budget (.1); telephone call with Mr. Knipple regarding budget (.3); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding funding and first day hearing (.3).	2.90	681.50
09/24/06	T M Wearsch	Review, revise and circulate revised version of financing Order.	2.50	587.50
09/25/06	J F Hutchinson	n, Attend DIP hearing.	4.10	1,845.00
09/25/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Bergen regarding entry of cash management and financing Order (.7); prepare for hearing regarding financing Order (.9); attend hearing regarding financing financing Order (4.1).	5.70	1,339.50
09/26/06	J F Hutchinson	n, Conference with Mr. DiDonato and Mr. Bergen regarding DIP and funding (.2); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding funding and customer issues (.4).	0.60	270.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/26/06	T M Wearsch	Attention to entry of DIP Order and circulate same (.5); attention to service of assisting customers and coordinating same (.7); various calls with Mr. Bergen regarding funding questions under DIP Order (.6); review and respond to correspondence regarding Postpetition Agreement and Mexican assets (.3); attention to issues related to same and review conformed version (.9); attend conference call with Glass & Associates regarding availability of funding (.5); review further draft of Postpetition Agreement (.3); obtain signatures on Postpetition Agreement and circulate same (.4); review correspondence regarding assisting customers (.4).	4.80	1,128.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/27/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr. Mallak and Mr. Bergen regarding customer issues (.9); conference with Mr. DiDonato regarding incentive plan, letter to customers, information to customers, information to vendors and funding issues (.3); conference with Mr. Bergen and client regarding lack of funding (.3); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding customers' funding issues and fund sale and trust by BBK (.2); conference with Ms. Seewer regarding revisions to letter to customers (.5); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding letter to customers and revisions thereto (.6); conferences with Ms. Seewer and further revisions to letter to customers (.2) (.2); conference with Mr. Banbery and e-mails regarding distribution of \$9 million in funded trust (.3); conference with Mr. Bergen regarding same (.2).	3.70	1,665.00

10/19/06 5890/088286/00001 Invoice Number 372456

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/27/06	T M Wearsch	Attend conference call with Ms. Seewer and Mr. Hutchinson regarding signing up Assisting Customers (.4); review and revise agreement regarding same (.4); coordinate circulation of same (.7).	1.50	352.50
09/28/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding various issues in respect of availability and reserve set-up by Wachovia (.5); conferences with Mr. Mallak and Mr. Bergen regarding funding block to customers and potential solutions to issues (.6); e-mail Mr. Mallak, Mr. Bergen regarding reserve set-up by Wachovia and regarding GM request regarding seven-day notice and waiver thereof (.4).	1.50	675.00
09/28/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Assisting Customers.	0.30	70.50

10/19/06 5890/088286/00001 Invoice Number 372456

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/29/06	T M Wearsch	Review Assisting Customer Agreements from various potential assisting customers (.5); meeting with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same (.4); telephone call with Mr. Hunter regarding Faurecia customer agreement (.3); various calls to attorneys for other assisting customers regarding same and funding (.4).	1.60	376.00

11/20/06 5890/088286/00001 Invoice Number 382475

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B21 FINANCING/	CASH COLLATERAL		
10/03/06	J F Hutchinson,	Review issues regarding final DIP and work on revisions.	1.70	765.00
10/03/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Bergen regarding entry into Assisting Customer Agreements and funding issues (.5); telephone calls with Messrs. Sgroi and Sable regarding Valeo (.6); various telephone calls with Ms. Bowers and Mr. Sidman regarding Honda (.5); telephone calls with Mr. Hammer regarding ACH (.6); review, revise and coordinate execution of all Assisting Customer Agreements (1.6).	3.80	893.00
10/03/06	E R Goodman	Review DIP Objection filed by Honda.	0.20	45.00
10/04/06	T M Wearsch	Review plant by plant budget, assisting customer payments and liquidation analysis (.4); attend conference call with Glass & Associates regarding same and Committee (.7); attend conference call with same and Mr. Freedlander regarding sale process, DIP and related issues (.8).	1.90	446.50
10/05/06	J F Hutchinson,	Attention to revised DIP for final hearing.	0.60	270.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/06/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Bergen regarding hostage situations (.2); telephone call with Ms. Bowers regarding Honda Objection (.2); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding Chase leasing (.1); review borrowing base (.1); review chart regarding customer exit (.3).	0.90	211.50
10/09/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Van Tiem regarding Wachovia cash collateralization/reser ve issues and use of cash (.6); telephone conferece with Mr. Van Tiem regarding use of cash and proceeds of current assets to reduce term (.3).	0.90	405.00
10/09/06	T M Wearsch	Review and respond to correspondence related to financing and Objections (.4); telephone call with Ms. Edison regarding comments to proposed Orders (.3); telephone call with Ms. Giannirakis regarding same (.1); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg regarding same (.3).	1.10	258.50
10/10/06	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review DIP regarding sale/designation of equipment by General Motors and other participating customers.	0.80	360.00

11/20/06 5890/088286/00001 Invoice Number 382475

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/11/06	J F Hutchinson,	Attention to revising interim DIP/carve out language.	0.70	315.00
10/12/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Wearsch and Mr. Stephenson regarding revisions to interim DIP for final DIP.	0.40	180.00
10/13/06	J F Hutchinson,	Review Mr. Freedlander letter as against DIP language (.3); e-mails to and from customers regarding BBK and control of cash and blocking payments (1.2); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding use of cash and release of cash by BBK (.3).	1.80	810.00
10/15/06	J F Hutchinson,	Work on revision of interim DIP agreement to convert to final DIP financing agreement.	1.10	495.00

11/20/06 5890/088286/00001 Invoice Number 382475

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/16/06	J F Hutchinson,	Review liquidation analysis and DIP with Mr. Downs and Mr. Stephenson (.7); revisions to liquidation analysis suggested with respect to descriptions in notes (1.3); e-mails to Mr. Freedlander regarding liquidation analysis, sale facilities and request for information (.5); receipt and review Mr. Dick's customer exit analysis (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Hammer, counsel for Visteon, regarding DIP (.2); e-mail Mr. Stephenson regarding liquidation analysis (.9); additional conferences with Mr. Stephenson regarding liquidation analysis and chapter 7 liquidation analysis (.4); e-mails to and from Mr. Stephenson regarding preparation for contested DIP hearing (.6).	4.80	2,160.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/16/06	T M Wearsch	Conference with Mr. Downs regarding final DIP order (.8); telephone call with Ms. Fleming regarding customer related accounts issue (.2); telephone call with Mr. Bergen regarding hostage payments (.2); attention to utilizing adequate assurance requests and resolution of same (.4); review liquidation analysis (.5); attention to negotiations of final DIP Order (.6).	2.70	634.50
10/17/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr. Wearsch regarding DIP Order revisions (.2); work on DIP Order revisions (.7); communications with Mr. Freedlander and to Glass regarding hearing on DIP and sale of Valeo equipment (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.2); review cases on funding minimum contribution payment (.9); e-mails to Mr. Goodman regarding same (.1).	2.40	1,080.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/17/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding customer refusal to fund (.4); draft e-mail regarding same (.2); telephone call with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same (.2); draft Final Financing Order (2.0).	2.40	564.00
10/18/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference call with customers' counsel regarding funding issues (.5); conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding DIP and liquidation analysis (.2); conference with Mr. Bergen regarding failure to fund and delays in funding (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding funding (.1); work on revised DIP (.4).	1.40	630.00
10/18/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Bergen regarding funding issues and problems with noticing customers and BBK (.4); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same and potential Motion to Compel (.3).	0.70	315.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/18/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding blocked funding (.2); telephone call with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same (.3); telephone call with Messrs. Bergen and Hutchinson regarding same (.2); attend conference call with Ms. Seewer and Katsma and Messrs. Hutchinson, Bergen, Radom and Bamberry regarding same and liquidation analysis (.5); telephone call with Messrs. Mallak and Hutchinson regarding same and incentive plan (.2); telephone call with Messrs. Hutchinson and Freedlander regarding liquidation analysis and depositions (.1); continue drafting Final Financing Order and ancillary agreements (); meeting with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same and preparation for hearing (.8).	5.00	1,175.00