Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/16/07	E R Goodman	Review Plan and Disclosure Statement and draft memorandum summarizing comments thereto (1.7); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Plan, Disclosure Statement and Trust Agreement and related issues (1.7); telephone conferences with Mr. Hutchinson and Mr. Freedlander regarding changes to the proposed Plan (1.4).	4.80	1,176.00
01/17/07	S A Maxwell	Access and obtain sample Motions to Approve Disclosure Statement and forward to Mr. Goodman per his request.	0.30	42.00
01/17/07	J F Hutchinson,	Review and revise Disclosure Statement.	2.40	1,260.00
01/17/07	E R Goodman	Review form Motions to Approve Disclosure Statement (1.0); draft Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement (2.0).	3.00	735.00
01/18/07	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Goodman regarding Disclosure Statement, Motion to Approve and revisions to Disclosure Statement. (.8); additional revisions to Plan (.2).	1.00	525.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/18/07	E R Goodman	Draft Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement (4.8); telephone call with Mr. Hutchinson regarding changes to the Disclosure Statement (.8); telephone call to Mr. Freedlander regarding Disclosure Statement (.5); review form Disclosure Statement notices and draft Notice of Hearing to Consider the Disclosure Statement (1.8).	7.90	1,935.50
01/19/07	J F Hutchinson,	Work on Disclosure Statement revisions (.4); work on Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement (.5).	0.90	472.50
01/19/07	E R Goodman	Draft Notice of Voting Deadline and Confirmation Hearing (2.1); draft proposed Order Approving Disclosure Statement (2.8); review form voting ballots for Chapter 11 Plans (.4); telephone call with BMC regarding solicitation procedures (.2).	5.50	1,347.50
01/21/07	E R Goodman	Begin drafting form ballot for unsecured creditors.	1.50	367.50
01/22/07	J F Hutchinson,	Draft Order, revise (.2); work on Motion regarding Notice and Disclosure Statement (.4).	0.60	315.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/22/07	E R Goodman	Draft form Ballots for Classes 1 and 4 (1.7); draft and edit Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement (.5).	2.20	539.00
01/23/07	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review revisions to Plan and funding Order (1.0); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding funding Order (.2),	1.20	630.00
01/23/07	E R Goodman	Draft and edit ballot instructions (2.1); edit and review Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement and related exhibits (2.2); draft time line regarding hearings on Disclosure Statement and Plan confirmation (.5); review local bankruptcy rules regarding certification of ballots (.1); draft e-mail to BMC regarding Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement (.2).	5.10	1,249.50
01/24/07	E R Goodman	Review revised Plan of Reorganization from the Committee.	0.80	196.00
01/25/07	J F Hutchinson,	Work on and revise Disclosure Statement.	0.40	210.00
01/25/07	E R Goodman	Review revised Plan of Reorganization from the Committee (.5); review Disclosure Statement and draft summary of missing information per Mr. Hutchinson's request (.8).	1.30	318.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/26/07	E R Goodman	Telephone call and e-mail to Mr. Ptaszek regarding Plan of Reorganization.	0.10	24.50
01/27/07	J F Hutchinson,	Work on and make revisions to Motion regarding Disclosure Statement and approval of Notices.	1.40	735.00
01/29/07	J F Hutchinson,	Work on revisions to Disclosure Statement, Plan and Motion (1.3); conference with Mr. Goodman regarding revisions to Disclosure Statement and Plan (1.0); review rules regarding Disclosure Statement and solicitation packages (.3).	2.60	1,365.00
01/29/07	E R Goodman	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding comments to Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement (1.0); edit same per comments from Mr. Hutchinson (1.5).	2.50	612.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/30/07	J F Hutchinson,	Review and revise second draft of Disclosure Statement (.8); conference with Mr. Goodman regarding revisions to Trust Agreement (.2); work on Disclosure Statement, Plan and revisions to Trust Agreement (.9); work on Motion/revise same for approval of Disclosure Statement and Notice (1.0); additional work on revisions to Disclosure Statement, Plan, Trust Agreement and Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement (1.1); conference with Mr. Goodman regarding Trust Agreement, Disclosure Statement and revisions to Motion (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding moving up hearing in Disclosure Statement	4.50	2,362.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/30/07	E R Goodman	Edit Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement per comments from Mr. Hutchinson (3.3); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same (1.0); telephone calls to the Court regarding Disclosure Statement hearing (.2); draft e-mail to counsel for the Committee regarding Motion to Approve Disclosure Statement (.1); review revised Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.5).	6.10	1,494.50
01/31/07	E G Ptaszek	Review Plan of Liquidation.	2.00	1,190.00
01/31/07	J F Hutchinson,	Work on Plan and Disclosure Statement (.7); telephone conferences with Mr. Freedlander and Mr. Mallak regarding Plan, and Disclosure Statement (1.3).	2.00	1,050.00
01/31/07	E R Goodman	Review Disclosure Statement and Plan (1.3); telephone conference with Mr. Hutchinson and Mr. Freedlander regarding comments to Plan and Trust Agreement (.7); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Plan and Disclosure Statement (.7).	2.70	661.50

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	в30	REAL ESTATE			
11/10/06	JF	Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding real estate offers and potential sale of real estate.	0.20	90.00
11/20/06	JF	Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Bergen regarding Tuscaloosa and real estate issues and deposits held by landlords (.4); review schedules regarding deposits and discuss with Mr. Goodman (.1); revisions to schedules (.4); e-mails regarding listing for Lapeer real estate (.2).	1.10	495.00
11/22/06	JF	Hutchinson,	Review documents regarding real estate brokers for sale and offer on Lapeer real estate.	0.40	180.00
11/30/06	JF	Hutchinson,	E-mails to Mr. Freedlander regarding real estate sales (.1); review Lapeer offer (.3).	0.40	180.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B30 REAL ESTATI			
12/01/06	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review suggested changes to Lapeer real estate contract (.6); review Phase I for Lapeer (.3); additional review of Phase I environmental report for Lapeer (.2); conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding real estate sales (.2); conference with Ms. Johnson and e-mail Ms. Johnson regarding real estate issues (.3).	1.30	585.00
12/04/06	V L Johnson	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding properties and draft memorandum regarding same.	1.50	442.50
12/04/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Ms. Johnson regarding all real estate issues and sales of real estate and appraisals in defense of Motion for Relief from Stay.	1.50	675.00
12/05/06	V L Johnson	Draft memorandum regarding checklist for various closings.	1.50	442.50
12/05/06	V L Johnson	Meet with Messrs. Hutchinson and Wearsch regarding properties.	0.50	147.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/05/06	J F Hutchinson,	Review proposal from Atlas to list Crestline real estate (.3); comments and conference with Ms. Johnson regarding Lapeer and Crestline (.2); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.3).	0.80	360.00
12/07/06	V L Johnson	Attention to Vandalia, Ohio matter.	0.50	147.50
12/07/06	V L Johnson	Attention to Bishopville, South Carolina matter.	0.50	147.50
12/11/06	V L Johnson	Attention to appraisals for Burkeysville and Vandalia, Ohio.	0.50	147.50
12/12/06	V L Johnson	Attention to Lapeer, Michigan transaction.	1.00	295.00
12/13/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Ms. Johnson regarding Lapeer (.1); work on Lapeer and potential DIP extension past December 20, 2006 (.9).	1.00	450.00
12/14/06	V L Johnson	Attention to Lapeer, Michigan transaction.	1.00	295.00
12/14/06	E R Goodman	Review and respond to e-mails regarding sale of real property.	0.40	90.00
12/19/06	V L Johnson	Attention to Lapeer, Michigan purchase contract.	1.00	295.00
12/19/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Ms. Johnson regarding closing of Lapeer.	0.20	90.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/20/06	V L Johnson	Attention to hiring appraiser for Vandalia.	0.50	147.50
12/20/06	V L Johnson	Attention to hiring appraiser for Bishopville.	0.50	147.50
12/27/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Ms. Johnson regarding appraisers for Bishopville and Vandalia (.2); e-mails to Mr. Stephenson regarding Lapeer lease and sale of real estate (.3); review Lapeer documents regarding same (.3); e-mails to Mr. Stephenson regarding Lapeer rental agreement and conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.4); review revisions to Atlas proposal for listing of Crestline (.1).	1.30	585.00
12/28/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Bergen regarding Atlas, appraisers for Bishopville and Vandalia and equipment rental at Lapeer vs. closing sale of real estate early at Lapeer (1.0); telephone conference with Mr. Ruttenburg of Atlas regarding revisions to Atlas proposal (.3).	1.30	585.00

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 27 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B31	RECLAMATION			
09/27/06	E R	Goodman	Review and organize reclamation demand letters.	0.50	112.50
09/28/06	E R	Goodman	Telephone calls to reclamation claimants.	0.40	90.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B31	RECLAMATION			
10/02/06	E R	Goodman	Conference with reclamation claimants.	0.20	45.00
10/05/06	E R	Goodman	Review reclamation Motion and reclamation claims.	1.70	382.50
10/09/06	E R	Goodman	Telephone call with Mr. Hutchinson regarding reclamation Motion.	0.10	22.50
10/10/06	E R	Goodman	Review reclamation demands per conversation with Mr. Hutchinson.	0.60	135.00
10/16/06	E R	Goodman	Review reclamation claims, update reclamation claims chart and send reclamation Order to reclamation claimants.	0.60	135.00
10/24/06	E R	Goodman	Review form reclamation claims report (.4); review possible reclamation defenses (.4); draft form reclamation information request letter (1.0).	1.80	405.00
10/26/06	E R	Goodman	Review and finalize reclamation information letter.	0.30	67.50
10/31/06	E R	Goodman	Draft reclamation information chart for the Company (.7); draft e-mail to Company regarding reclamation chart (.1); telephone call with Mr. Knipple regarding reclamation chart (.2).	1.00	225.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B31	RECLAMATION			
11/01/06	E R	Goodman	Review reclamation claim from Safeway Packaging (.2); telephone call to Safeway Packaging regarding reclamation claim (.1); edit reclamation list and send reclamation order to Safeway Packaging (.3).	0.60	135.00
11/08/06	E R	Goodman	Telephone call to Company regarding reclamation claims chart.	0.10	22.50
11/16/06	ER	Goodman	Review supporting documentation submitted by reclamation claimants (.4); edit reclamation report (.3).	0.70	157.50
11/28/06	E R	Goodman	Review reclamation spreadsheet from the Company and edit reclamation claims chart.	0.40	90.00
11/30/06	E R	Goodman	Review reclamation claim letter and data from ARJ Manufacturing.	0.30	67.50

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B31	RECLAMATION			
12/01/06	ERG	Goodman	Draft reclamation notice and report (3.5); research and review recent case law in the Sixth Circuit and elsewhere on the treatment of reclamation claims (.5).	4.00	900.00
12/04/06	ERG	Goodman	Telephone call with reclamation creditor.	0.10	22.50
12/06/06	ERG	Goodman	Review e-mail from Lanxess regarding reclamation information request.	0.10	22.50
12/08/06	ERG	oodman	Draft and edit reclamation claims report.	1.00	225.00
12/09/06	ERG	oodman	Draft and edit reclamation claims notice.	1.00	225.00
12/10/06	ERG	oodman	Draft and edit reclamation notice.	1.20	270.00
12/11/06	ERG	oodman	Draft and edit reclamation claims report.	0.60	135.00
12/13/06	ERG	oodman	Draft and edit reclamation claims report (.6); review final DIP Order (.3); draft e-mail to client regarding ARJ reclamation claim (.3).	1.20	270.00
12/14/06	E R G	oodman	Draft and edit reclamation claims report.	0.20	45.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B31	RECLAMATION			
01/02/07	ER	Goodman	Draft and edit reclamation claims report (1.6); review case law on cash sellers and reclamation rights (.6); review and respond to e-mail from Glass & Associates regarding disposition of reclamation goods (.3).	2.50	612.50
01/04/07	E R	Goodman	Research reclamation of goods delivered on cash on delivery terms.	1.00	245.00
01/08/07	E R	Goodman	Telephone call with Mr. Knipple regarding ARJ reclamation claim.	0.20	49.00
01/09/07	J F	Hutchinson,	Review 503(b)(9) and bar date issues and resolution of reclamation claims (.4); conference with Mr. Mallak (.2); work on issues and revisions (.4).	1.00	525.00
01/12/07	J F	Hutchinson,	Work on independent contractors' objection and conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding independent contractors (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding independent contractors' Motion and work on Orders regarding hearing (.4).	1.10	577.50

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 81 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/15/07	E R Goodman	Edit and review reclamation claims report.	0.30	73.50
01/16/07	E R Goodman	Edit, review and file reclamation notice and exhibits.	3.50	857.50
01/26/07	E R Goodman	Telephone call with Hubbard Supply regarding reclamation claim.	0.20	49.00
01/29/07	E R Goodman	Respond to telephone message from Mr. Maxon regarding reclamation claim of Nova Chemicals.	0.10	24.50
01/30/07	E R Goodman	Telephone call to Mr. Maxon regarding reclamation claim of Nova Chemicals.	0.10	24.50
01/31/07	E R Goodman	Review Nova Stipulation and draft e-mail to counsel to Nova regarding changes to the Nova Stipulation.	0.30	73.50

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 54 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B32 RELIEF FROM	STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION	PROCEEDINGS	
10/18/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Ms. Robertson regarding Carlisle stay violation.	0.30	70.50

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 34 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B32 RELIEF FROM	STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION	PROCEEDINGS	
11/20/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Gordon, counsel for Parker Hannifin, regarding Parker Hannifin's Motion for Relief from Stay.	0.30	135.00

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 71 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B32	RELIEF FROM	STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION	PROCEEDINGS	
12/04/06	J F	Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Gordon regarding relief from stay.	0.10	45.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B33 RESEARCH			
10/12/06	T J Richards	Research regarding distinction between a true lease and a disguised security interest under Uniform Commercial Code section 1-201.	1.00	190.00
10/16/06	T J Richards	Research regarding distinction between a true lease and a disguised security interest under Uniform Commercial Code section 1-201 (.5); draft memorandum regarding same per Mr. Wearsch (2.0).	2.50	475.00
10/17/06	T J Richards	Research regarding distinction between a true lease of real property and a disguised security interest under federal Economic Reality Test.	2.50	475.00
10/18/06	T J Richards	Research regarding distinction between a true lease of real property and a disguised security interest under federal Economic Reality Test (.2); draft memorandum regarding same per Mr. Wearsch (1.3).	1.50	285.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/19/06	T J Richards	Research regarding debtor-in-possession's duty to maximize value of estate and duty to all creditors (1.7); research regarding ability of Unsecured Creditors' Committee to object to Motion for Post-Petition Financing (.8); draft memorandum regarding same (1.2).	3.70	703.00
10/19/06	E R Goodman	Meet with Mr. Richards regarding research project.	0.60	135.00
10/20/06	T J Richards	Research regarding standard for approving post-petition financing under section 364 (2.2); research regarding number of lenders that need to be contacted under section 364 (.9); draft memorandum regarding same (1.3); complete memorandum regarding distinction between a true lease of real property and a disguised security interest under federal Economic Reality Test (.8).	5.20	988.00
10/25/06	E R Goodman	Telephone calls with Mr. Wearsch regarding Mexican assets.	0.30	67.50

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	в33	RESEARCH			
11/07/06	ΤJ	Richards	Research regarding extraterritorial jurisdiction of Bankruptcy Code (.4); research regarding whether property owned by debtor located in foreign jurisdiction is subject to turnover as property of the estate (1.2); update Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.2).	1.80	342.00
11/08/06	ΤJ	Richards	Follow-up research regarding extraterritorial jurisdiction of Bankruptcy Code and whether property owned by debtor located in foreign jurisdiction is subject to turnover as property of the estate.	1.00	190.00
11/20/06	ТJ	Richards	Receive instruction from Mr. Wearsch (.3); research regarding whether lease cure includes award of attorneys' fees (1.0).	1.30	247.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	в33	RESEARCH			
12/05/06	ΤJ	Richards	Receive instruction from Mr. Hutchinson (.4); conduct research regarding whether premiums paid to PBGC post-petition are entitled to administrative expense treatment (.8).	1.20	228.00
12/06/06	T J	Richards	Conduct research regarding whether premiums paid to PBGC post-petition are entitled to administrative expense treatment (1.3); meet with Mr. Goodman regarding effect of section 1113 on administrative expense treatment of payments under collective bargaining agreements (.3); review Unimet and WCI Steel cases addressing section 1113 (.5); update Mr. Hutchinson regarding same (.2).	2.30	437.00
12/07/06	ΤЈ	Richards	Follow-up research regarding whether premiums paid to PBGC post-petition are entitled to administrative expense treatment.	1.00	190.00

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 73 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/11/06	T J Richards	Draft memorandum regarding whether premiums paid to PBGC post-petition are entitled to administrative expense treatment and effect of section 1113 on administrative expense treatment of payments under collective bargaining agreements.	2.30	437.00
12/13/06	T M Wearsch	Research regarding availability of 1146(c) tax waiver.	2.00	470.00
12/19/06	H E Kimmel	Research case law regarding 11 USC 363 and ordinary course of business transactions as to termination of health care coverage for non-union employees.	0.20	36.00
12/21/06	M A DeGaetano	Research ordinary course of business standards.	2.00	360.00
12/22/06	M A DeGaetano	Research collective bargaining agreements.	3.50	630.00

Date	1	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B36 S	SALE/AUCTION	OF BUSINESS		
09/22/06	R M Lo	oesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Marshall regarding sale of assets.	0.30	112.50
09/25/06	JFH	utchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Loesch regarding sale of Vandalia machinery (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Van Tiem regarding sale process (.3); work on sale procedures and conference with Mr. Baddeley regarding same (.5).	0.90	405.00
09/25/06	E R Go	oodman	Telephone call with Mr. Lawniczak regarding the sale of certain assets.	0.10	22.50
09/26/06	R M Lo	pesch	Office conference with Mr. Wearsch and Mr. Hutchinson regarding sale of Vandalia assets.	1.30	487.50
09/26/06	J F Hu	itchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Sidman regarding claim of Honda (.3); telephone conference with Ms. Seewer regarding Honda and regarding assisting customer issues (.4).	0.70	315.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/26/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sale process (.3); conference with Mr. Van Tiem regarding sale process (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Isenberg regarding machinery sales (.2); work on sale process (.6).	1.30	585.00
09/26/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Mallak regarding customers and loss of customers (.3); telephone conference with Canton water department (.1); additional conference with Mr. Mallak regarding customers and vendor issues (.3).	0.70	315.00
09/26/06	T M Wearsch	Attention to process for hiring liquidators (.4); various calls with Mr. Loesch regarding sale of Vandalia equipment (.3); draft outline of sales procedures (.5).	1.20	282.00
09/26/06	E R Goodman	Telephone call with Ms. Koch regarding prospective auctioneers for liquidation facilities.	0.20	45.00
09/27/06	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with T. Marshall and attention to preparation of Asset Purchase Agreement.	4.80	1,800.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/27/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Wearsch and attention to sale Motion and procedures (.9); attention to obtaining liquidator, including conferences with Ms. Isenberg, Mr. Marshall, and review list of liquidators and e-mail sites regarding same (1.2); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sale proceeding (.2); attention to sale process (.1); e-mails to and from Mr. Marshall regarding Vandalia, Ohio sale of machinery (.2).	2.60	1,170.00
09/27/06	T M Wearsch	Exchange correspondence with Mr. Stephenson regarding retention of liquidator (.3); telephone call with Mr. Sacamino regarding investment banking issues (.3); draft sales procedures Motion (8.9); draft confidentiality agreement (.8); meet with Mr. Loesch regarding sale of Vandalia Equipment (.3); attention to structuring of same (.4); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg regarding same (.3).	11.30	2,655.50
09/28/06	R M Loesch	Continue to prepare Asset Purchase Agreement for Vandalia equipment and ancillary documents.	3.50	1,312.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/28/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sales procedures Motion (.2); review and revise same (1.3); e-mail Glass & Associates regarding both Motions (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding creditor (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Mexico assets (.3); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Mexico assets (.2); additional work on sale Motion (.5).	2.80	1,260.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/28/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conference regarding Canton (.2); telephone call to Mr. Sidman regarding Honda claim (.1); telephone call to Mr. Mallak regarding customers including Honda (.2); e-mails from Ms. Seewer, Ms. Isenberg regarding customers' exit notices (.2); attention to issues relating to claims against third parties, including discussion with Mr. Goldman (.9); telephone conference with Ms. Isenberg regarding customer notice of existing facilities (.3); conference with Mr. Sidman regarding Honda and Bishopville Plant (.2); conference with Mr. Baty and Ms. Seewer regarding waiver of seven-day notice (.2); e-mails Ms. Seewer regarding GM request (.2).	2.50	1,125.00
09/28/06	T M Wearsch	Review and revise sales procedures Motion.	2.50	587.50
09/28/06	E R Goodman	Telephone calls to potential purchasers of assets.	0.20	45.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/29/06	R M Loesch	Prepare Asset Purchase Agreement (.5); prepare form of Escrow Agreement (.4); prepare Bill of Sale (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Bloomestein regarding same (.2).	1.50	562.50
09/29/06	J F Hutchinson,	Attention to revisions to sales procedures Motion (2.1); conferences with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.2); prepare Motion to Sell (1.1); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sales procedures (.1); telephone calls and e-mails to Wachovia regarding sales procedures (.2).	3.70	1,665.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
Date		Conferences with Mr. Mallak regarding incentive plan (.2); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Mexican assets and Delphi demands regarding Mexican assets (.2); receipt and review letters regarding molders' lien; and correspondence from two utilities and conference with counsel (.5); receipt and review letters from counsel for Honda and Valeo regarding revisions as proposed to assisting customer agreement (1.6); telephone conferences with Mr. Mallak regarding customers and bank issues (.3); telephone conference with Mr. VanTiem regarding customers and production in various plants (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding same and regarding same and regarding honda potential designation of Bishopville as sale facility (.4); receipt and review information from Faurecia's counsel (.2); receipt and review information from Valeo's counsel (.2); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Lapeer and designation	4.60	Time Value
		of Tuscaloosa by Visteon (.3); conference with client, Mr. VanTiem and Mr. Mallak		

		regarding customer and production issues (.2); receipt and review revisions to proposal regarding accommodations from potential assisting customers (.2).		
09/29/06	T M Wearsch	Attend meeting with Mr. Hutchinson regarding sale procedures (.5); review sale facility designation from Visteon (.1); review and respond to correspondence from company regarding small sales of equipment (.4); review resourcing completion notice (.1); meeting with Mr. Hutchinson regarding resourcing and timing of sales (.4); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg regarding sale procedures (.3); telephone call with Ms. Seewer regarding sale procedures (.3); telephone call with Mr. Radom regarding sale procedures and sale of Hermosillo (.4); telephone call with Mr. Hammer regarding sale procedures (.2); review and revise sale procedures (.2); review and revise sale procedures (3.0).	5.70	1,339.50
09/29/06	E R Goodman	Telephone call with intellectual property attorneys regarding intellectual property.	0.50	112.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
09/30/06	J F Hutchinson,	Revise sale procedures Motion and Order (1.4); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.5); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding equipment designation and sale of Chihuahua (.3); telephone call with Mr. Mallak (.3); telephone call with Guiliani Capital Advisors regarding sale (.3).	2.80	1,260.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B36	SALE/AUCTIO	ON OF BUSINESS		
10/01/06	т м	Wearsch	Review, revise and circulate sale procedures Motion.	2.20	517.00
10/02/06	R M	Loesch	Attention to Asset Purchase Agreement (3.1); telephone conference with Mr. Marshall regarding same (.5); continued attention to escrow agreement and Bill of Sale (2.4).	6.00	2,250.00
10/02/06	J F	Hutchinson,	Meet with Mr. Van Tiem to discuss sale of assets (.6); attention to Brief and sale procedure Motion and conferences with Mr. Bergen and Mr. Mallak regarding same (.2).	0.80	360.00
10/02/06	J F	Hutchinson,	Telephone conferences with Mr. Mallak regarding Assisting Customers (1.2); meet at company with Mr. Mallak, Mr. Bergen, Mr. Banbery (4.1); conferences with Mr. Hammer, Mr. Sidman regarding Assisting Customers contracts (2.2).	7.50	3,375.00
10/03/06	R M	Loesch	Attention to Asset Purchase Agreement (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.1).	0.30	112.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/03/06	J F Hutchinson,	Attention to sale Motion and conferences with Mr. Mallak and Mr. Van Tiem and Mr. Bergen regarding same.	1.30	585.00
10/03/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr. Bergen regarding Assisting Customers (.6); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.8); conference with Mr. Hammer regarding ACH (.1); conference with Ms. Bowers regarding Honda (.2); conference with Mr. Sidman and Ms. Bowers (.3); conference with Ms. Zurn (.1); receipt and review Objection of Honda and discussion with Mr. Goodman regarding same (.6); telephone conference with Ms. Seewer regarding Assisting Customers contracts (.2).	2.90	1,305.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/03/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Sacamino regarding sale facilities (.2); telephone call with Mr. Loesch regarding Vandalia sale (.3); review Asset Purchase Agreement for Vandalia equipment (.4); review comments to sale procedures from customers and Wachovia (1.0); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg regarding same (.3); review and revise sale procedures Motion, Order and Notice (1.9).	4.10	963.50
10/03/06	E R Goodman	Respond to telephone calls from potential purchasers.	0.50	112.50
10/04/06	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Wearsh regarding Asset Purchase Agreement.	0.30	112.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/04/06	J F Hutchinson,	E-mails to Glass & Associates regarding sales (.3); receipt and review status report from Glass & Associates and conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.4); e-mails to Glass & Associates regarding status report (.2); e-mail to and from Mr. Freedlander (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Sidman regarding sale (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Bergen and conferences with Mr. Mallak and Glass & Associates regarding Committee issues, sale of assets and additional conferences regarding same (2.5); conference with Mr. Freedlander and Glass & Associates regarding sale of assets and regarding other issues, including DIP and financing issues (1.1).	4.70	2,115.00
10/04/06	T M Wearsch	Review further comments to sale procedures from customers and Wachovia counsel (.5); draft cure notice and sale notice (1.5); review and revise sale procedures Motion and Order (3.5).	5.50	1,292.50

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 61 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/05/06	R M Loesch	Attention to preparation of Asset Purchase Agreement (2.4); review and respond to Mr. Bloomenstein's comments (.4).	2.80	1,050.00
10/05/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sales procedures.	0.30	135.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/05/06	J F Hutchinson,	Attention to Asset Purchase Agreement and review of offer on Vandalia equipment (.5); conference with Ms. Seewer regarding sales and tooling issues for GM (.2); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding tooling issues and Hermacio (.3) (.2); conference with Mr. Parobek regarding Carlisle Plastics (.3); conference with Mr. Reffner regarding same (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding various issues, including sale of assets (.4); conference with Mr. Bergen regarding sale of assets (.3); work with Mr. Stephenson on sales and retention of auctioneers and private investor groups (.8); e-mails to Mr. Freedlander regarding same (.1); e-mail Mr. Stephenson regarding liquidation sales and auctioneer (.3) telephone conference with attorney for buyer (.3); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Hermasillo offer to purchase and potential offer to purchase	4.30	1,935.00
	•	Chihuahua assets (.3).		

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/05/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Bergen regarding Assisting Customers deposits.	0.20	90.00
10/05/06	T M Wearsch	Review equipment designations (.2); attention to retention of investment banker (.4); aide GM with tooling removal inquiry (.3); draft and forward confidentiality agreement (.5).	1.40	329.00
10/05/06	E R Goodman	Review section 363 sale Motion and proposed Order (.6); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding sale Motion (.4).	1.00	225.00
10/06/06	R M Loesch	Office conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding bid procedures and draft Asset Purchase Agreement (.3); conference call with Mr. Bloomenstein and Mr. Marshall regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (.3); prepare second draft of Asset Purchase Agreement (1.9); continued attention to preparation of Escrow Agreement (.5).	3.00	1,125.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/06/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference call with Glass & Associates, Mr. Mallak and Mr. Wearsch regarding sale issues, auctioneer, status of Assisting Customer deposits and use of cash (1.3); telephone conference with Mr. Porter regarding potential purchase of assets (.2); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding potential sales of Tuscaloosa, Hermasillo, Bishopville (.5); attention to various Asset Purchase Agreement issues with regard to sale of machinery in Vandalia and regard to other asset sales (.6); conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding sale issues (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding sale issues (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Radom, counsel for Delphi, regarding Hermasillo offer (.2).	3.00	1,350.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/06/06	T M Wearsch	Respond to various inquiries regarding liquidators and sale procedures (.7); attend conference call with Messrs. Hutchinson and Stephenson (.7); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding liquidators, Tuscaloosa, Bishopville and sale procedures (.8); review correspondence regarding TRW de minimus sale (.1); review purchase offer from Century Mold (.3); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.2); revise and forward confidentiality agreement (.4); review and revise Vandalia sale procedures (1.5).	5.30	1,245.50
10/09/06	R M Loesch	Attention to bid procedures (.5); conference call with Mr. Bloomenstein and Mr. Wearsch regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (.4); attention to same (.6).	1.50	562.50
10/09/06	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review Committee note/memo regarding sales (.3); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.1).	0.40	180.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
Date		Review Mexican asset ownership issue (.2); conference with Mr. Folland, counsel for Parker-Hannifin (.3); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding Parker Hannifin finance lease (.2); conference with Mr. Bergen regarding sales (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding sales at Hermasillo and Chihuahua (.3); additional telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding union issues in Mexico and sale of Mexican assets to Delphi (.3); conference with M. Freedlander regarding sales (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Dick regarding sale of assets designated customer assets to customers removing equipment (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding same and regarding encumbrances and sales of assets to designated assets to specific customers (.4); conference call with Mr. DiDonato, Mr. Bergen, Mr. Stevenson, Mr. Mallak and Mr. Wearsch regarding	Hours 3.80	Time Value
		various issues regarding sales, use of cash and term debt (.8); telephone conference with Attorney Riech of Greystone regarding potential purchase and		

bid for assets of
company (.3);
conference with Mr.
Stephenson regarding
same (.2).

10/09/06 J F Hutchinson,

Telephone conference with Mr. Sidman regarding sale and Honda Objection (.2); review carrier sale/e-mail to Mr. Bergen regarding same (.3); work on auctioneers's issues and sale of assets (.3).

0.80 360.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/09/06	T M Wearsch	Review and respond to correspondence regarding sale facilities (.4); conference call with Mr. Hammer regarding same (.3); attention to solution for sale of customer equipment in ordinary course (1.0); participate in conference call with Messrs. Loesh and Bloomenstein regarding final negotiation of Nardalia Purchase Agreement (.4); answer questions related to same (.4); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding asset bids and procedures (.8); review status report (.3); telephone call with Mr.Freedlander regarding sales of equipment in ordinary course (.5); review and respond to correspondence regarding asset bids and buy outs (.5); draft form Asset Purchase Agreement (2.3); meeting with Mr. Hutchinson regarding sales and Mexican assets (.5); conference call with Glass & Associates regarding same (.7).	8.10	1,903.50
10/10/06	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Bloomenstein regarding deal documentation and attention to finalizing same.	3.00	1,125.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/10/06	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review e-mails from Mr. Freedlander, Mr. Downs, Mr. Stephenson regarding sale and scheduling (.9); telephone conference with Mr. Radom regarding HermaSeal sale (.3); work on sale procedures/auctioneers (.5).	1.70	765.00
10/10/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding Visteon offer (.5); telephone call with Mr. Sidman regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (.2); telephone call with Mr. Folland regarding Parker Hannifan leases (.3); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding pending lawsuits (.1); revise Vandalia Sales Procedures Motion and draft Order (2.5); telephone call with Mr. Radom regarding form of Asset Purchase Agreement (.2); forward same to Mr. Freedlander (.1); conference call with Mr. Van Tiem regarding Vandalia sale and other sales (.4); conference call with Ms. Isenberg and Messrs. Downs and Freedlander (1.2).	5.50	1,292.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/10/06	E R Goodman	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding sale of Mexican assets.	0.40	90.00
10/11/06	R M Loesch	Attention to execution of Asset Purchase Agreement (1.5); numerous telephone conferences with Messrs. Wearsch, Bloomenstein and Marshall regarding same (.5); attention to finalizing Schedule of Purchased Assets (1.4); telephone conference with Mr. Marshall and Mr. Bloomenstein regarding same (.4).	3.80	1,425.00
10/11/06	S A Maxwell	Office conference with Mr. Hutchinson and Mr. Wearsch regarding sale of difference locations.	0.30	39.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/11/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conferences with Joe Mallak (.6) regarding sales, Delphi offer for Hermasillo production issues; Telephone conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding liquidation analysis (.2); meeting with Mr. Wearsch and Ms. Maxwell regarding sales/chart to track sales and offers for purchase of equipment (.8); telephone conference with Mr. Merklin regarding Mexican assets/ownership of Mexican assets (.2); review sale documents and other documents regarding ownership of Mexican assets (1.2)	3.30	1,485.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/11/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale diligence (.4); review and respond to multiple e-mails regarding same and adequate assurance (.5); telephone call with Mr. Parobek regarding sale of Tuscaloosa (.6); conference call with Mr. Quizada-Martinez regarding Mexican assets and dispositions (.5); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same (.6); attention to status of independent contractors and payment issues (.5); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg regarding Vandalia Sale Motion (.5); telephone call with Mr. Loesch regarding additional assets (.2); review correspondence related to diligence and offers (.4).	4.10	963.50
10/12/06	S A Maxwell	Prepare draft chart of activities that will affect the pending sale of numerous plants and forward to Mr. Wearsch for review and comment.	0.30	39.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/12/06	J F Hutchinson,	E-mails to Mr. Stephenson regarding sales and e-mail with Mr. Wearsch and Mr. Goodman regarding sales orders (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding Honda/Bishopville (.3); telephone conference and e-mails to and from Mr. Stephenson regarding Bishopville (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding Mexican assets and sale to Century Mold (.2); numerous e-mails and telephone conferences regarding General Motors designation of equipment to purchase (.2); and regarding designation by other customers (.2); e-mails to Mr. Jury and receipt and review letter from Mr. Jury; e-mail client regarding Canton and Crestline facilities (.3); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sale of Bishopville (.2).	2.00	900.00