Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/12/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Ms. Bowers regarding Bishopville lease (.1); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa equipment (.1); telephone call with Mr. Parobek regarding same (.1); conference call with Messrs. Stephenson, Parobek and Gianpapa regarding same (.5); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding sale of Mexico plants (.3); telephone call with Mr. Gold regarding bid (.2); telephone call with Mr. Wrightman regarding sale of Middlefield (.3); telephone call with Mr. Willis regarding same (.3); telephone call with Mr. Fuscone regarding same (.1); respond to various requests from Mr. Stephenson regarding sale process and diligence (.8); review Wachovia comments to Vandalia sale procedures and edit same (1.0); work on sale worksheets (.8); attention to Honda exit and effect on Bishopville (.5); send sale procedures to Mr. Freedlander (.1).	5.20	1,222.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/13/06	J F Hutchinson,	Review liquidation analysis (.3); telephone call to Mr. Mallak regarding various issues including sale of Mexican assets, sale of Bishopville, and sale of Tuscaloosa assets (.4); work on liquidation analysis issues and prepare for discussions with Glass & Associates (1.2); conference with Mr. Dick regarding sale of assets at Crestline (.2); e-mails to Mr. Dick regarding Valeo equipment sale (.2); e-mail Mr. Downs and Mr. Freedlander regarding same (.2); conference with Mr. DiDonato regarding sales and liquidation of Northern facilities (.3); telephone conference with counsel for potential purchaser of Vandalia and e-mail regarding same (.2); telephone conference with attorney Hilbert regarding purchase of Crestline and purchase of Belleville,	3.60	1,620.00
		Michigan facilities (.3); review auctioneer progress and open issues with		

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/13/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Messrs. Parobek and Toole regarding JP Morgan Equipment Lease (.3); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale at Bishopville (.2); draft Vandalia Sale Notice (1.0); telephone call with Mr. Downs and Ms. Isenberg regarding Bishopville sale and related sale issues (.3); telephone call with Messrs. Hutchinson and Hilbart regarding client's perspective bid (.2); review correspondence related to sale activity (.6); respond to questions regarding auctioneers (.3); exchange correspondence with Mr. Freedlander regarding Vandalia Purchase Agreement (.4); begin drafting stipulated order (1.2).	4.50	1,057.50
10/14/06	J F Hutchinson,	Extended conference call with Mr. Mallak, Mr. Wearsch, Mr. Stephenson and Mr. DiDonato regarding various issues.	1.70	765.00
10/14/06	T M Wearsch	Attend conference call with Messrs. Hutchinson, Bergen, DiDonato, Stephenson and Mallak regarding sales, auctions, liquidation and liquidation analysis.	1.90	446.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/15/06	J F Hutchinson,	Review and work on liquidation analysis.	0.40	180.00
10/15/06	E R Goodman	Analyze possible reply arguments to procedures Objection.	1.50	337.50
10/16/06	R M Loesch	Prepare letter distributing final executed agreements to Mr. Marshall and Mr. Bloomenstein, organize same for distribution.	0.80	300.00
10/16/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Radom regarding Hermasillo sale (.6); telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding same and regarding sale of other facilities, including Ohio facilities (.5); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sale order, utilities order, hostage payments and resolution of sale issues (.5); e-mails to Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Bergen regarding sales and utility payments (.6); telephone conference with Mr. Radom, counsel for Delphi, regarding sales and DIP hearing (.1).	2.30	1,035.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/16/06	T M Wearsch	Draft, review and revise stipulation order (1.7); call with Mr. Radom regarding sale in Mexico (.5); telephone call with Messrs. Bergen and Stephenson regarding sale process (.5); attention to de minimus sale requests (.7); review Committee comments on sale process and related correspondence (.3); finalize Vadalia sale Motion and exhibits for filing and insert Wachovia comments(1.2); attention to structuring a potential sale of Bishopville (.7); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg and Mr. Downs regarding comments to sale Order (.3); draft, review and revise Motion to Approve, Stipulated Order and Motion to Expedite and finalize same (2.5).	8.40	1,974.00
10/16/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit Reply to procedures Objection.	0.50	112.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/17/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Bergen regarding sales and regarding Mr. Dick's proposed wind down schedule (.2); review same and suggest revisions to wind down schedule analysis (.4); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding sale of equipment at Hermasillo facility (.3); additional conference with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.1); review e-mails and e-mail Mr. Bergen regarding issues of late delivery at Tuscaloosa (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Chihuahua facility and Asset Purchase Agreement for Hermasillo and sale to Delphi (.2); e-mail Mr. Downs regarding Wind Down schedule and budget (.3); additional e-mails to Mr. Downs regarding post-sale wind down budget and regarding Bishopville sales (.2); e-mail to Mr. Sidman regarding Bishopville sale (.1); communications with Glass regarding customer designated equipment and Hermasillo offer, revised form Asset Purchase Agreement and revisions to same (.4); e-mails to Mr. Downs, Mr. Dick and Mr. Mallak regarding	3.30	1,485.00

timing of auction sale (.1); e-mails regarding sale of Bishopville to prospective purchaser and conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding no contingencies and timing of sale (.4); numerous e-mails and communications with Mr. Wearsch and Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Crestline, Bellville and Bishopville and customer proposals (.3).

10/17/06 T M Wearsch

Telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding sale process (.2); telephone call with Mr. Marshall regarding Vandalia sale bidding (.3); review and respond to various correspondence related to proposed sales (.5); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding Bishopville offers and possible closing (.4); telephone calls with Ms. Bowers regarding same and Honda (.2); telephone call with Mr. Hertlein regarding same and client's purchase of Bishopville (.7); draft correspondence to Mr. Stephenson regarding action items for Bishopville (.3); draft emergency sale motion for Bishopville (1.7).

4.30 1,010.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/18/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone call to Mexican counsel regarding ownership of Mexican assets and sale thereof (.8); review analysis of ownership of Mexican assets and sale thereof (.7); telephone conference with Ms. Giannirakis regarding diminimus sale of equipment (.1); e-mail Mr. Reffer regarding ownership of Mexican assets (.2); e-mails regarding sale of and funding of Bishopville and Honda sale with Mr. Sidman (.3); e-mail Mr. Downs regarding Bishopville sale status (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Fowland of Parker Hannifin regarding sale of Bishopville and assignment of lease (.3).	2.60	1,170.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/18/06	T M Wearsch	Conference call with Messrs. Hutchinson, Bergen, Stephenson, DiDonato and Mallak regarding liquidation analysis (.7); telephone call with Mr. Reich regarding potential bid (.2); telephone call with Mr. Hertlien regarding bid for Bishopville (.2); review correspondence related to liquidation budget (.3); review correspondence from Mr. Hilbert regarding Crestline bid (.1); various telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding bid for Bishopville (.5); attention to resolution of process on same (.7); forward de miminimis Sale Order to Mr. Dick (.1); answer inquiries from Mr. Parobek regarding JP Morgan lease and Tuscaloosa (.3).	3.10	728.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/19/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sale of Bishopville and regarding hearing (.5); status conference call with Mr. Mallak, Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Bergen regarding asset purchase agreement, Mexican assets and other sales (1.1); conferences with Mr. Downs regarding sale of Bishopville (.4); conference with Mr. Sidman regarding same (.1); e-mails regarding meeting (.8); e-mails with Mr. Ubbing of Brouse McDowell regarding Mexican bailment agreement (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Sidman regarding sale of Bishopville and removal of tooling, making sale impossible (.2).	3.30	1,485.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/19/06	T M Wearsch	Review Bishopville Asset Purchase Agreement (.5); conference call regarding same with Messrs. Hutchinson, Bergen, Mallak and Stephenson (.7); telephone call with Mr. Downs regarding same (.2); conference call with Messrs. Freedlander, Downs and Hutchinson regarding sale process and DIP hearing (.5); review and comment on confidentiality agreement (.4); respond to inquiries regarding de minimis sales (.3); attention to Bishopville sale negotiation (1.7); review Crestline offer (.4).	4.70	1,104.50
10/20/06	J A Baddeley	Draft Motion for Sale of Assets.	2.00	880.00

J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sale of Bishopville and issues to be resolved to complete sale (.3); conference with Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Bergen regarding same (.3) (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Honda removal of tools and sale to Ernie Green Company and additional deposit required for sale (.5); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding additional deposit from Ernie Green Company for purchase of Bishopville facility (.1); e-mail Mr. Stephenson regarding same and conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Bishopville (.2); preparation of motion to sell Bishopville (.3); conference with Mr. Van Tiem regarding sale of Bishopville to Ernie Green Company and items that need to be resolved prior to conclusion of same (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Downs regarding sale	6.30	2,835.00
	of Bishopville (.2); e-mails to Mr. Downs regarding Bishopville (.1); e-mail to Mr. Freedlander regarding same (.1); e-mails and telephone conference with Mr. Stephenson		
		Bishopville (.2); preparation of motion to sell Bishopville (.3); conference with Mr. Van Tiem regarding sale of Bishopville to Ernie Green Company and items that need to be resolved prior to conclusion of same (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Downs regarding sale of Bishopville (.2); e-mails to Mr. Downs regarding Bishopville (.1); e-mail to Mr. Freedlander regarding same (.1); e-mails and telephone conference	Bishopville (.2); preparation of motion to sell Bishopville (.3); conference with Mr. Van Tiem regarding sale of Bishopville to Ernie Green Company and items that need to be resolved prior to conclusion of same (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Downs regarding sale of Bishopville (.2); e-mails to Mr. Downs regarding Bishopville (.1); e-mail to Mr. Freedlander regarding same (.1); e-mails and telephone conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Bishopville and

prevent removal of tooling by Honda (.2); receipt and review term sheet, offers and revised DIP Order (.8); conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding Mexican assets (.1); e-mails regarding resourcing by Honda, offer for purchase of Crestline to Wachovia and Mr. Freedlander (.3); review same and conference with Mr. Stephenson of Glass regarding offers (.3); work on and prepare for hearing on sales Motion and DIP (.8); work on and prepare for hearing and review liquidation analysis outline, prepare for testimony (1.2).

10/20/06 T M Wearsch

Review real estate proposals (.3); review various auctioneer offers (.6); review Bishopville term sheet (.3); respond to same (.1); review and respond to correspondence related to same (1.1); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.6); telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.5); negotiate proposals for Bishopville with all parties in interest (1.2).

4.70 1,104.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/22/06	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review Century Mold letter of intent for purchase of Chihuahua (.2); review Thomas Industries auction proposal (.2); receipt and review bailment agreement regarding Mexican assets (.3).	0.70	315.00
10/23/06	J A Baddeley	Prepare for hearing on sale procedures Motion.	1.30	572.00
10/23/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Hammer regarding status of sales (.2); conference with Mr. Baty regarding same (.2); conference with Mr. Mallek regarding sales and regarding Bishopville (.4); conference with Mr. Parobek regarding Chase leases and sales procedures (.3); conference with Mr. Radom regarding Hermasillo sale (.3).	1.40	630.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/23/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding status and negotiations (.2); work on Objections and findings of fact and conclusions of law (1.3); e-mails to Glass & Associates and Mr. Downs regarding status and sales and budget items (.3); conference with GE Capital counsel (.2); conferences with Mr. Mallak regarding chapter 11 issues (.3) (.1); work on Reply Brief (.5); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Crestline and GE issues (.3); work with Mr. Goodman on Reply Brief (.2); revise findings of fact (.2); conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding status (.2); work on Reply Brief (.9); receipt and review GM's findings of fact (.1); review cases cited (.8); status conference with Court (.4); conference with Ms. Giannirakis (.2); conference with Ms. Giannirakis (.2); conference with Ms. Isenberg regarding hearing (.3); telephone conference with Mr. DiDonato regarding hearing and	7.70	3,465.00
		<pre>potential testimony (.3).</pre>		

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/23/06	T M Wearsch	Respond to diligence request regarding Tuscaloosa (.4); attention to de minimis sale requests (.4); attention to Delphi equipment offer (.2); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding Objection (.3); prepare for hearing regarding sale procedures (1.0).	2.30	540.50
10/24/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Hermasio.	0.20	90.00
10/25/06	J F Hutchinson,	Attention to Mexican asset issue with Mr. Goodman.	0.90	405.00
10/25/06	T M Wearsch	Draft proposed Tuscaloosa sale Order (2.0); coordinate Delphi purchase of Middlefield equipment (.3); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding Sale Procedures Order (.3); draft Bill of Sale for Middlefield (.4); collect party comments to Sale Procedures Order (.4); telephone call with Ms. Katsman regarding same (.3); review, revise and submit Sale Procedures Order (.5).	4.20	987.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/25/06	E R Goodman	Review Asset Purchase Agreement between Carlisle and CEPP (1.3); draft summary of Asset Purchase Agreement for Mr. Hutchinson (.4); meetings with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Asset Purchase Agreement (.4).	2.10	472.50
10/26/06	S A Maxwell	Prepare and submit Order (A) Establishing Bidding Procedures for Tuscaloosa, Alabama Sale Facility; (B) Setting Date for Auction and Hearing on Approval of Sale of Such Facility; and (C) Approving Form of Notice to court at the request of Mr. Wearsch.	0.10	13.00
10/26/06	E R Goodman	Review Asset Purchase Agreement (.2); telephone call with counsel in Mexico regarding ownership of Mexican assets (.3); draft and edit Motion to Employ Auctioneer and Sell Assets at an Auction (2.8).	3.30	742.50
10/26/06	E R Goodman	Telephone calls to Mexican counsel regarding bailment agreement (.2); review Asset Purchase Agreement and related documents (.7).	0.90	202.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/27/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mexican counsel and Mr. Freedlander and Mr. Edesa (1.1); conference call with Mr. Freedlander, Mr. Downs, Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Bergen, regarding sale and auctions (.8); work on auction issues and sales (.3); conference with Mr. Bergen and Mr. Stephenson regarding sales (.3); e-mail Mr. Dick regarding equipment sales (.2); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding sales (Mexico) (.1); work on sales procedures and revisions regarding Mexican sales (.6).	3.40	1,530.00
10/27/06	T M Wearsch	Submit de minimis sale proposals (.3); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding Bishopville sale (.4).	0.70	164.50
10/27/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit Motion to Employ Auctioneer and Sell Assets at an Auction, Affidavit and proposed Order.	2.00	450.00
10/27/06	E R Goodman	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Mexican assets (.6); review asset lists from Mexican counsel (.5).	1.10	247.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/30/06	J F Hutchinson,	Meeting with Mr. Merklin regarding Mexican assets and insurance issues (.3); e-mail Mr. Freedlander regarding information, Washington Penn case, subpoenas, conferences with auctioneer and auctioneer engagement (.2); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale status (.3); additional communication with Mr. Freedlander regarding auctioneer engagement (.1) (.2); e-mails and conference with Mr. Downs regarding sales and auctions and status of same (.3); e-mail Mr. Stephenson regarding sales and bids, conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.9); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sales status (.2).	2.50	1,125.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/30/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale procedures (.4); review final auctioneer proposals (.7); telephone call with Mr. Downs regarding same (.3); attention to structuring of sale of Mexican assets (.5); answer inquiries regarding tooling releases and payment of accounts (.2); respond to inquiries regarding lien releases (.2); telephone call with Mr. Bergen regarding same (.2).	2.50	587.50
10/31/06	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Bloomstein regarding Trelleburg.	0.30	112.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/31/06	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review new auctioneer proposals (.7); conference call with Mr. Freedlander, Mr. Downs, Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Bergen regarding auction sales (.4); conferences with Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Bergen regarding auctioneers (.6); conference with Mr. Downs regarding auctioneers (.2); conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding auctioneers (.2); conference with Mr. Bergen regarding carrying costs (.2); conference with Mr. Bergen regarding carrying costs (.2); conference with Mr. Downs regarding auction issues (.3); additional conference with Mr. Downs, Mr. Freedlander and potential auctioneers regarding using auctioneer (.8).	3.40	1,530.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
10/31/06	T M Wearsch	Review correspondence regarding auctioneers (.3) review auctioneer proposals and prepare for call (.4); attend conference call with Ms. Isenberg and Messrs. Hutchinson, Freedlander, Stephenson, Downs, Linderman and representative of HILCO and then Biditup regarding auctioneer offers (1.9); various follow-up calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.6); review additional correspondence regarding same (.3); review and forward two-day sale notices (.2); telephone call with Mr. Ferrel regarding administrative claim (.2).	3.90	916.50

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B36	SALE/AUCT	ION OF BUSINESS		
11/01/06	R M	Loesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Marshall regarding Confidentiality Agreement (.2); review e-mail regarding same(.2); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Sale of Century Mold Mexico LLC's asset (.3); review and comment on draft Asset Purchase Agreement (1.6).	2.30	862.50
11/01/06	T M	Wearsch	Conference call with Wachovia and Committee regarding wind down and auctioneer (.5); telephone call with Mr. Downs regarding auctioneer (.3); conference call with Messrs. Downs and Freedlander regarding same (.4); attention to bidder qualification for Vandalia (.4); attention to various issues related to auctioneer retention (2.8); respond to inquiries regarding Tuscaloosa purchasers (.5); review Century Mold agreement (.7).	5.60	1,316.00
11/02/06	R M	Loesch	Review and comment on draft Asset Purchase Agreement with Century Mold Mexico LLC (2.1); office conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding draft Asset Purchase Agreement (.2).	2.30	862.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
Date	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding Mexican Sale (.1); continued attention to negotiation of letter of credit and auctioneer terms (1.5); review and forward de minimus sale request (.2); respond to request for confidentiality agreement (.2); review Hermosillo purchase agreement (1.0); telephone call with Mr. Winter regarding offer for Tuscaloosa (.4); telephone call with Mr. Loesch regarding Century Mold purchase agreement (.4); telephone call with Mr. Illion regarding ABC bid for Vandalia presses (.4); telephone call with Mr. Marshall regarding Vandalia sale procedures and hearing (.3); respond to request from Mr. Parobek regarding insurance (.1); review real estate proposals (.6); telephone call with Mr. Radom regarding Hermosillo agreement (.4); telephone calls with	Tours 7.10	Time Value
		Wachovia and Committee counsel regarding negotiations with auctioneer (1.5).		

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/03/06	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Illion regarding ABC Bid (.1); review proposed changed to Confidentiality Agreement (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Illion regarding same (.7); telephone conference with Mr. Woodard regarding Asset Purchase Agreement for Mexican assets (.2); attention to same (.2).	1.30	487.50
11/03/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conferences with Mr. Wearsch and Mr. Mallak regarding sales of Vandalia equipment and auction thereof (.1); attention to Motion to Retail Auctioneer to Sell Assets of seven facilities (.1); attention to Asset Purchase Agreements regarding Hermasillo and Chihuahua (.1); work on and review and revise Asset Purchase Agreements for Hermasillo and Chihuahua, Asset Marketing Agreement with regard to retention and engagement of auctioneer and Motion with respect thereto (2.9).	3.20	1,440.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/03/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Hunter regarding customer tooling issue (.2); follow-up regarding same (.1); call with Mr. Illion regarding ABC bid (.3); various telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding bidding procedures and offers (.6); attend various conference calls with Biditup, Committee and Wachovia regarding negotiation of auctioneer agreement and sale order (2.4); draft closing facilities sale order (1.0); draft auctioneer marketing agreement (2.0); draft application to employ Biditup (1.1); review and revise order, agreement and application (.9).	7.60	1,786.00
11/05/06	R M Loesch	Attention to review and comment on draft Asset Purchase Agreement for Mexican assets.	0.50	187.50
11/05/06	T M Wearsch	Review real estate summary (.2); review revisions to Biditup Agreement (.5).	0.70	164.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/06/06	R M Loesch	Attention to negotiation and document preparation for sale of Mexican assets (8.0); numerous conferences with Mr. Wearsch and Ms. Wilkens regarding same (1.5).	9.50	3,562.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/06/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference call/review sales procedures and auction marketing agreement and review and revise same (.9); receipt and review sales procedures redrafts (1.1); additional work on redrafts of sales procedures (.6); conference calls with Biditup regarding engagement agreement (.5); telephone call Mr. Stephenson regarding engagement (.1); conference call with Biditup, Wachovia, Mr. Freedlander and Mr. Downs (1.7); telephone conferences with Mr. Mallak regarding sales of Tuscaloosa facility and Chihuahua facility (.5); work on Asset Purchase Agreements regarding same (.2); additional conference with Mr. Downs regarding engagement agreement and sale of Chihuahua (.3); work on and review Hermasillo and Chihuahua APA's and conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding revisions thereto (1.2).	7.10	3,195.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/06/06	T M Wearsch	Review revisions to Confidentiality Agreement (.2); draft electronic mail regarding same (.1); review various correspondence regarding auctioneer proposal (.5); various telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.4); review and revise retention Motion for Biditup (.8); various telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding Mexican sales (.6); various calls with Mr. Marshall regarding Vandalia hearing (.3); review correspondence regarding Tuscaloosa sale (.3); telephone call with Mr. Winter regarding same (.3); review winddown budget (.3); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding hearing (.2); attend conference call regarding Biditup proposal (.6); call with Mr. Martinez regarding Hermosillo agreement (.5); review and comment on Mexican purchase agreements (2.0); various calls with Mr. Radom regarding same (.4); prepare for sale hearing (1.2); draft sale motion for Mexican assets (2.0).	10.70	2,514.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/07/06	R M Loesch	Attention to preparation of a revised Asset Purchase Agreement (6.0); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak (.3); prepare draft Escrow Agreement (.5); conference call regarding revised Asset Purchase Agreement (.5).	7.30	2,737.50
11/07/06	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review proposed order and engagement agreement with Biditup (.4); make revisions thereto, including revisions of proposed order (.3); prepare for hearing (.9); numerous conferences with Mr. Downs, Mr. Freedlander, Ms. Edison, Ms. Giannirakis prior to hearing (1.5); hearing on asset marketing agreement and proposed Order to Retain Auctioneer and sale of Vandalia equipment and independent contractors Motion and Objection (3.4); additional discussions with Biditup (.8); post-hearing meeting and several extended telephone conferences with Biditup counsel, Mr. Freedlander, Mr. Downs (2.1); additional work on revisions of Biditup engagement agreement and Order (1.0).	10.40	4,680.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/07/06	T M Wearsch	Meet with Mr. Marshall regarding preparation for testimony (2.0); attend hearing on Vandalia equipment sales (3.0); negotiate purchase agreements for Hermosillo and Chihuahua and work to finalize same (2.0); draft sale Motion regarding same (5.8); various telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.3).	13.10	3,078.50
11/08/06	R M Loesch	Attention to final negotiation and preparation of Asset Purchase Agreement and Escrow Agreement (5.0); attention to multiple drafts and e-mail regarding same (2.0); attention to multiple telephone conferences with Mr. Mallak, Ms. Wilkens and Mr. Martinez (1.3).	8.30	3,112.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/08/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conferences with Mr. Downs (1.9); several telephone conferences with Mr. Melman, counsel for Biditup (1.3); work on engagement agreement of auctioneer and make revisions thereto and work on proposed order regarding same (.7); additional conferences with Mr. Mallak and Mr. Downs regarding provisions of engagement agreement (.4); status conference with court (.4); work on revisions to Hermasillo and Chihuahua Asset Purchase Agreements and conferences with Mr. Wearsch and Mr. Mallak regarding terms of Chihuahua and Hermasillo sale (2.1); work on revisions to auctioneer's Order, asset marketing agreement and retention of Biditup (3.8).	10.60	4,770.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/08/06	T M Wearsch	Finalize Mexican purchase agreements (3.2); review and revise Mexican sale Motions and exhibits and additional research related to same (11.2); telephone calls with Mr. Radom regarding same (.4); telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.6); review and comment on auctioneer Motion (.3).	15.70	3,689.50
11/08/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit motion for expedited hearing on auctioneer motion (3.2); draft and edit auctioneer motion, declaration and interim order (3.7); meetings with Mr. Hutchinson regarding auctioneer motion (.8); phone calls with counsel for the auctioneer regarding motion and declaration (.3); prepare for filing of motion for expedited hearing and auctioneer motion (1.6).	9.60	2,160.00
11/09/06	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Mexican Power of Attorney (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Illion regarding ABC bid and prepare correspondence regarding same (.5).	0.80	300.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/09/06	S A Maxwell	Prepare and submit Interim Order to Employ Biditup Auctions Worldwide, Inc. as Auctioneer and Order Approving Expedited Hearing on Application to Employ Biditup Auctions Worldwide, Inc. to court at the request of Mr. Goodman.	0.10	13.00
11/09/06	J F Hutchinson,	Additional work on Order and Motion (.3); conferece with Mr. Downs regarding revisions to asset marketing agreement (.5); work on Motion/Order and draft revisions to auction agreement and Chihuahua and Hermasillo Asset Purchase Agreement (1.1); conference with Tuscaloosa customer (.1); review proposals for sale of real estate at LaPere, Michigan and Canton facilities (.7).	2.70	1,215.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/09/06	T M Wearsch	Review financial information provided by ABC Plastics and respond to bidder qualification inquiries (.6); attend telephonic hearing on auctioneer and sale Order (.5); answer party inquiries regarding same (.3); attend conference call with Messrs. Stephenson and Bergen regarding budget, sales and leases (.6); review and respond to correspondence regarding auctioneer (.4); various telephone calls with Mr. Lawnizak regarding qualifying client as bidder for Vandalia equipment(.5); prepare notice of auction (.5); various calls with Mr. Winter regarding client's interest in Tuscaloosa and bidding process (.6); draft and forward various exhibits and schedules to Mr. Winter (.8); review proposed sale Order for closing facilities (.2); review real estate proposal for Lapeer facility (.3); various telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding same and Tuscaloosa auction process and bidder inquiries (.9); review PBGC draft Objection to Mexican sales (.3); exchange	7.30	1,715.50

		The state of the s		
		Mr. Ginsberg regarding same (.3); review and exchange correspondence regarding real estate sales (.5).		
11/09/06	E R Goodman	Work on Application and Motion for Expedited Hearing (.9); attend court's status conference (.4); edit and upload proposed Orders (.7); edit sale Order and prepare upload version thereof (1.3); draft e-mails regarding auctioneer Application and sale Motion (.8); telephone call with potential equipment purchaser (.1); e-mail correspondence with claims and noticing agent (.1).	4.30	967.50
11/10/06	R M Loesch	Attention to preparation for auction for Vandalia assets (.4); follow-up on Escrow money received from CT vibration (.1).	0.50	187.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/10/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference call regarding sale, real estate, auction issues and list of equipment and funding going forward with Mr. Downs, Ms. Isenberg, Mr. Freedlander (1.4); telephone conference with Mr. Coffee of Tucker Ellis regarding sale of Tuscaloosa and potential purchase by his client (.5); work on sale/Tuscaloosa and funding issues overadvance availability and use of capital assets sale proceeds and additional conferences with Mr. Downs and Mr. Wearsch regarding same	3.00	1,350.00

Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
T M Wearsch	Respond to various requests from potential bidders for Vandalia equipment regarding qualification issues (.6); telephone calls from Mr. Lawnizak regarding Contitech bid (.4); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding disposition of computers (.3); telephone calls with Mr. Loesch regarding Vandalia bids (.4); review letter of credit language (.3); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg regarding same (.3); review proposed asset schedules and attention to auctioneer retention and finalizing asset schedules (.6); attend conference call with Ms. Isenberg and Messrs. Stephenson, Dick, Mallak, Downs, Hutchinson and Freedlander regarding auctioneer equipment lists and response (1.4); review various correspondence related to same (.5); review equipment designations and formulate response (.5); attend further conference call with Mr. Downs regarding letter response to Biditup (1.1); drat, review and revise Biditup letter	7.40	1,739.00
	conference call with Mr. Winter regarding		
		Respond to various requests from potential bidders for Vandalia equipment regarding qualification issues (.6); telephone calls from Mr. Lawnizak regarding Contitech bid (.4); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding disposition of computers (.3); telephone calls with Mr. Loesch regarding Vandalia bids (.4); review letter of credit language (.3); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg regarding same (.3); review proposed asset schedules and attention to auctioneer retention and finalizing asset schedules (.6); attend conference call with Ms. Isenberg and Messrs. Stephenson, Dick, Mallak, Downs, Hutchinson and Freedlander regarding auctioneer equipment lists and response (1.4); review various correspondence related to same (.5); review equipment designations and formulate response (.5); attend further conference call with Mr. Downs regarding letter response to Biditup (1.1); drat, review and revise Biditup letter response (.9); conference call with	T M Wearsch Respond to various requests from potential bidders for Vandalia equipment regarding qualification issues (.6); telephone calls from Mr. Lawnizak regarding Contitech bid (.4); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding disposition of computers (.3); telephone calls with Mr. Loesch regarding Vandalia bids (.4); review letter of credit language (.3); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg regarding same (.3); review proposed asset schedules and attention to auctioneer retention and finalizing asset schedules (.6); attend conference call with Ms. Isenberg and Messrs. Stephenson, Dick, Mallak, Downs, Hutchinson and Freedlander regarding auctioneer equipment lists and response (1.4); review various correspondence related to same (.5); review equipment designations and formulate response (.5); attend further conference call with Mr. Downs regarding letter response to Biditup (1.1); drat, review and revise Biditup letter response (.9); conference call with

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11								
_			Billing	Detail	-	Professional	Services	

		client's Tuscaloosa bid (.4).		
11/11/06	T M Wearsch	Review correspondence regarding letter of credit issue and funding availability.	0.20	47.00
11/13/06	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Lawniczak regarding Contitech overbid (.2); conference call with Mr. Wearsch and Tucker Marshall regarding auction (.3); review Contitech paperwork (1.0).	1.50	562.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/13/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Hohman and potential purchaser of Ossberger (.2); conference with Mr. Haub, potential purchaser of Ossberger Machines (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Duplaga of Veriform regarding patents and review letter from him and e-mail regarding patent issues (.8); telephone conference with Mr. Lawnizak regarding bid for Ossberger Machines (.2); review other bids and Tuscaloosa bid (1.2); work on sales/review offers and conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.7); e-mails regarding LC language and insurance certificates for Biditup (.5); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding sale of Ossberger and Mexico sales offers (.3); e-mail Mr. Stephenson regarding sales/real estate and review proposals for real estate from brokers (.5).	4.70	2,115.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
Date		Respond to various inquiries from potential bidders regarding qualification for auction and submission of final bids (1.0); telephone calls with Mr. Lawnizak regarding same (.4); exchange correspondence with Mr. Ginsberg regarding PBGC objection (.2); respond to Visteon inquiries regarding Tuscaloosa purchase agreement (.3); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa offers and auctioneer (.7); review correspondence regarding Lapeer Michigan sale (.2); obtain comments from Committee and Wachovia to Equipment List Letter, review and revise same and prepare exhibits to same (1.8); review bids submitted for Vandalia auction (1.5); telephone calls with Messrs. Downs and Freedlander regarding auctioneer agreement (.6); telephone call with Mr. Winter regarding Tuscaloosa	Hours 7.60	Time Value 1,786.00
		purchase agreement (.3); respond to diligence requests for Tuscaloosa (.4); telephone call with Mr. Radom regarding hearing and Hermosillo closing (.2).		

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/14/06	R M Loesch	Prepare for Vandalia auction (.6); telephone conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding ACB bid (.2).	0.80	300.00
11/14/06	J F Hutchinson,	Memorandum to Mr. Wearsch and conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding closing of Ossberger sales and closing with Biditup regarding sale of seven facilities (.1); work on language for LC (.1); additional work on closing and Biditup language (.4); review Asset Purchase Agreements in preparation for auction (1.3); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding Asset Purchase Agreement language and revisions thereto and regarding auctioneer reductions to guaranteed amount (.6); review auctioneer e-mails regarding reductions (.3).	2.80	1,260.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
Date		Review and respond to correspondence regarding Vandalia equipment bids (.4); obtain insurance certificates for auctioneer (.2); review proposed letter of credit and comment on same (.6); conference calls with Ms. Isenberg regarding same and Biditup retention (.4) conference call with Messrs. Stephenson and Matters regarding Biditup reduction requests (.5); draft summary of same (.4); investigate background for same and formulate response (.8); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.8); conference call with Ms. Isenberg and Messrs. Stephenson and Freedlander regarding same and response (1.4); telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding same and Mexican sales (.4); telephone call with Mr. Dick regarding response to asset list questions (.3); attention to resolution of GM tooling request (.4);	Tours 7.60	Resident Marie VIII
·		telephone call with Mr. Lawnizak regarding auction (.2); telephone call with Mr. Marshall regarding same (.3); prepare for auction (.5).		

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/15/06	R M Loesch	Attention to Vandalia auction (1.0); attention to preparation of letter to Ms. Wilken at Harris Beach regarding signature pages (.2); follow-up telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Escrow Agreement (1.0); attention to preparation of final APA with ABC (2.6).	4.80	1,800.00
11/15/06	J F Hutchinson,	Prepare and attend auction for Vandalia equipment (3.5); conferences with and e-mails with Mr. Stephenson regarding other sales, leases and equipment sales and language regarding Biditup auctioneer agreement (1.6); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding funding issues and sale of Mexican assets (.3).	5.40	2,430.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/15/06	T M Wearsch	Prepare and attend auction (3.5); telephone call with Ms. Isenberg regarding same (.1); meeting with Messrs. Loesch and Illion after auction regarding closing details (.7); draft correspondence regarding same (.3); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding Accuval appraisal of designated equipment and affect on guarantee (.3); review revised and final Vandalia purchase agreement (.4); review Visteon proposed Stalking Horse bid for Tuscaloosa (.5); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa bids (.2); review and respond to correspondence regarding Biditup equipment designation and asset lists for agreement (.7); review cure spreadsheet from NL ventures (.3); attention to JP Morgan cure issues (.2); draft summary response for Biditup regarding asset lists and valuation (.9).	8.10	1,903.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/16/06	R M Loesch	Attention to finalizing an Asset Purchase Agreement with ABC Plastic, Inc. and prepare email to Mr. Illion regarding same.	1.30	487.50
11/16/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Bergen and Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa sale and Biditup response and reductions (.6); receipt and review Tuscaloosa APA (.8); e-mail Mr. Bergen regarding Tuscaloosa (.1); work on issue regarding Tuscaloosa sale, Mexican asset sale and funding escrow with Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Bergen (.8).	3.30	1,485.00
11/16/06	J F Hutchinson,	Prepare for meeting with Mr. Parobek and Mr. Toole (.4); meeting with Messrs. Parobek, Toole and Wearsch regarding machine located in Crestline and Tuscaloosa (1.5); e-mails to Mr. Freedlander regarding same (.1).	2.80	1,260.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/16/06	T M Wearsch	Prepare for conference call (.3); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same (.2); attend conference call with Messrs. Hutchinson, Stephenson and Bergen regarding sales, auctioneer, lease rejections and all other important issues (1.9); telephone call with Mr. Winter regarding Tuscaloosa bid (.3); meeting with Messrs. Parobek, Toole and Hutchinson regarding resolution of JP Morgan Chase equipment and sale (1.5); various telephone calls related to response to auctioneer proposal on equipment (.6); draft response to auctioneer after discussing same with Committee and Wachovia (.5); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.5); telephone call with Mr. Hammer regarding Visteon bid (.3); review procedures Order (.2); draft correspondence regarding stalking horse (.3); answer inquiries regarding Vandalia transaction closing (.4).	7.00	1,645.00

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 61 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/17/06	R M Loesch	Telephone call with Mr. Illion regarding revised Asset Purchase Agreement (.1); attention to preparation for closing (.7).	0.80	300.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/17/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Adcox, counsel for potential bidder of Tuscaloosa (.3); conference with Mr.	8.30	3,735.00
		on amendments to marketing agreement (.4); conferences with Mr. Goodman regarding same and regarding revisions to amendment of asset marketing agreement (.6);		

		conferences with Mr. Freedlander regarding reductions of guarantee by Biditup and revisions of asset marketing agreement (.3); revisions and amendment to asset list and conferences with Mr. Mellman regarding same (.3).		
11/17/06	T M Wearsch	Conference call with Messrs. Hutchinson, Bergen and Stephenson regarding sales and auctioneer (1.7); respond to requests regarding same (.3).	2.00	470.00
11/17/06	E R Goodman	Draft and edit proposed final Order Approving Retention of Biditup and create exhibits thereto (2.9); telephone calls with Biditup regarding marketing agreement (.5); telephone call with Wachovia regarding marketing agreement (.3); work on Biditup Application (1.0); draft and edit amendment to asset marketing agreement (.4).	5.10	1,147.50