Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/19/06	J F Hutchinson,	Several e-mails with Mr. Downs regarding revisions to reductions of guarantee and LC from auctioneer, Biditup (.5); conferences with Mr. Melman regarding revisions to amendment of asset marketing agreement and Order (1.3); e-mails to Mr. Mellman, counsel for Biditup, regarding reductions and equipment to be sold (.9); additional telephone conferences with Mr. Dick regarding equipment to be sold and revised list (.4); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.2).	3.30	1,485.00
11/19/06	E R Goodman	Telephone calls with Mr. Hutchinson regarding asset marketing agreement (.1); telephone call with client regarding asset marking agreement (.1); review e-mails from auctioneer and Wachovia regarding asset marketing agreement (.5); review and edit addendum to asset marketing agreement and attend to execution thereof (2.6).	3.30	742.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/20/06	R M Loesch	Attention to finalizing Asset Purchase Agreement (3.0); prepare closing certificate (.3); prepare and respond to numerous e-mails regarding same (.5); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak; telephone conference with Mr. Illion; telephone with Mr. Wearsch (.5).	4.30	1,612.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/20/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conferences with Mr. Downs regarding potential reductions of guarantee of LC by Biditup (.3); conferences with Mr. Goodman regarding revisions to Order (.2); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sale of Tuscaloosa and Mexican sales (.1); additional revisions to Order Retaining Biditup and permitting sale of all assets at seven facilities (.5); prepare for hearing on same (.5); attend hearing by phone (.6); work on and additional revisions to sale Order (.9); telephone conference with Mr. Mellman regarding revisions to Biditup agreement and sale Order (.3); e-mails and telephone conferences with Mr. Downs regarding sale and LC language (.3); review Tuscaloosa sale issues and telephone call to Mr. Adcox (.5); telephone call to Mr. Adcox regarding Tuscaloosa bid (.1); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding potential bids on Tuscaloosa facility as going concern (.2).	4.50	2,025.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/20/06	T M Wearsch	Attention to closing of Vandalia transaction (1.1); draft, review and revise report of Vandalia auction (1.2); attend hearing on Biditup retention and sale Order (.8); respond to Committee information requests (.7); telephone calls with Mr. Adcox regarding client's bid for Tuscaloosa (.6); review letter of credit proposal (.1); review proposed sale order (.2); telephone call with Mr. Parobek regarding equipment sales (.2); respond to correspondence related to same (.2); attention to Delphi claim resolution (.3); review Lapeer listing agreement (.3); comment on same (.2); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding same (.2); various telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding bid proposals and inquiries (.6).	6.90	1,621.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/20/06	E R Goodman	Plan and prepare for hearing on Biditup Application (1.2); attend hearing regarding Biditup retention and sale procedures (.8); draft, edit and upload proposed final Order for Biditup retention (1.7); draft, edit and upload proposed Order for authority to sell assets and related exhibits (2.6); attend status conference with Glass & Associates and team regarding rent issues and the incentive plan (.5).	6.80	1,530.00
11/21/06	R M Loesch	Conference call with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.3); begin preparation of Transition Services Agreement (1.0).	1.30	487.50
11/21/06	R M Loesch	Attention to closing of Asset Purchase Agreement involving Vandalia.	3.00	1,125.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/21/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr. Adcox, counsel for potential bidder for Tuscaloosa (.5); conferences with Mr. Stephenson regarding funding and regarding sales of Tuscaloosa and Mexican facilities (.8); conferences with Mr. Bergen regarding incentive bonus, sales and closing of sales (.8); conferences with Mr. Mallak regarding bonuses and sale of Mexican facilities and Tuscaloosa facility (.9); conference with Mr. Loesch regarding closing of sales and issues regarding closing and timing of same (.6); e-mail Mr. Baty (.1); work on closing issues regarding sale of Vandalia equipment (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Melman regarding auctioneer letter of credit (.2); review Order entered regarding Biditup (.1).	4.30	1,935.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/21/06	T M Wearsch	Retrieve and review corporate change of name document for debtor and transmit same to Mr. Parker (.2); various telephone calls with Mr. Parker regarding Tuscaloosa auction bids and cure claim (.5); respond to requests related to Vandalia equipment closing (.5); respond to inquiries from Mr. Parobek regarding sale of Chase presses (.3); review performance bonus calculations (.4); review proposed order on independent contractors (.3); respond to requests from the PBGC (.3); review documents and draft closing agenda and checklist for Hermosillo (.7); respond to requests for information regarding Mexican assets (.4).	3.60	846.00
11/22/06	R M Loesch	Attention to Transfer of Funds out of trust escrow account.	0.30	112.50
11/22/06	R M Loesch	Attention to preparation of Transition Services Agreement (1.0); review and comment on draft Employer Substitution Agreement (.8).	1.80	675.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/22/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Messrs. Bergen, Stephenson, Mallak and Wearsch regarding funding issues, sale of Mexican assets, sale of Tuscaloosa, potential sale of Lapeer facility and certain equipment (1.7); additional conference call with Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Bergen and Mr. Downs, Ms. Isenberg and Wachovia principals regarding sales and 5availability issues, Mexican receivables, PBGC issues and sale of assets at Mexican facilities and Tuscaloosa (1.4).	3.10	1,395.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/22/06	T M Wearsch	Various telephone calls with Mr. Parker regarding sale auction (.4); review correspondence and charts in preparation for conference call (.4); extended conference call with Mr. Bergen and Mr. Stephenson regarding sales, funding, availability and auctioneer (1.7); review and respond to correspondence regarding sales (.4); respond to inquires and requests from potential Tuscaloosa bidders (1.0); attention to closing of Mexican transactions (.4); provide wire information to Mr. Lawnizak (.1); review offer on Lapeer and comment on same (.3); review and respond to bonus plan correspondence (.7); review documentation for Mexican operations (1.5); review and respond to request from PBGC and telephone call with Mr. Ginsberg regarding requested language (.4); telephone call with Mr. Wolfe regarding tax effects of transactions (.2).	7.50	1,762.50
11/22/06	E R Goodman	Telephone call with Mr. Wearsch regarding Mexican assets.	0.20	45.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/27/06	R M Loesch	Review draft Transitional Professional Personnel Services Agreement (1.0); review and comment on next draft transitional Maquila Services Agreement (1.0); attention to Transition Services Agreement for Delphi Deal (.8).	2.80	1,050.00
11/27/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr.  Hammer regarding Tuscaloosa sale (.2); additional conferences and e-mails with bidders for Tuscaloosa (.9); conferences with Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa sale and offer for purchase of real estate at Lapeer, Michigan (.6); work on closing of same (.5); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding sale of Mexican assets, Tuscaloosa assets and business and payment demands for tooling from customers (.3).	2.50	1,125.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/27/06	T M Wearsch	Respond to inquiries from perspective Tuscaloosa purchasers regarding bid qualification (.8); telephone call with Mr. Hammer regarding same (.3); review bids for Tuscaloosa (.6); conference call with Messrs. Hutchinson, Bergen, Hammer, Downs and Radom regarding funding issues and sales (.4); various meetings and telephone calls regarding same and formulation of response and Emergency Motion (1.0); prepare for hearing on sale of Mexican assets including preparation of witnesses and evidence and review case law (4.0); draft proposed sale Orders (2.0); collect comments from various parties and review and revise same (2.5); attend conference call with Ms. Wilkens and Mr. Woodard regarding same for Chihuahua and amendment to purchase	13.70	3,219.50
11/28/06	R M Loesch	agreement (2.1).  Review and comment on amendment to Century Mold Asset Purchase Agreement Amendment (.8); numerous conference calls regarding various deal issues (3.0); attention to document negotiations; prepare for closing (2.0).	5.80	2,175.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/28/06	S A Maxwell	Prepare Affidavit of Service regarding report of auction and sale for electronic filing with court at the request of Mr. Goodman.	0.10	13.00
11/28/06	J F Hutchinson,	Meet at CEP with Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Wearsch and Mr. Bergen in preparation for hearing (2.0); attend hearing on sale of Mexican assets (2.5); meeting with Mr. Mallak regarding funding issues, sale of Tuscaloosa, sale of Mexican assets and means of paying incentive bonus plan (1.1); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding auction of Tuscaloosa (.3); conferences with Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Bergen, Mr. Hammer and Mr. Wyner regarding auction of Tuscaloosa (1.1); review Baxter and Visteon bids (1.1); additional conference with Mr. Hammer regarding Tuscaloosa (.3).	8.40	3,780.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
Date	T M Wearsch	Continued preparation for hearing on sale of Mexican facilities and continued negotiation of purchase agreements and final sale Orders (5.0); attend hearing regarding same and incentive plan funding issue (2.5); meet with Messrs. Dick, Mallak and Hutchinson regarding closing of transactions, funding and closing case (1.0); collect party comments and review and revise final Mexican sale Orders (1.0); review and respond to correspondence regarding same (.7); telephone call with Mr. Radom regarding same (.3); telephone call with Mr. Downs regarding same (.2); telephone call with Judge Shea-Stonum regarding comments to same (.2); review, revise and circulate Order based on same (.4); obtain parties consents to same (.5); coordinate final versions of same (.4); telephone call with Ms. Zurn regarding same (.2); review and revise closing checklist for	13.90	
		Hermosillo (.4); review auction alternatives (.4); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding same (.2); telephone call with Ms. Zurn regarding adjournment		

of auction (.1); draft notice of adjournment (.4); review, revise and file same (.2).

11/29/06 R M Loesch

Conference calls regarding Transition Agreements (1.0); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak (.1); review and comment on multiple drafts of transition agreement (5.); prepare for closing (.7).

6.80 2,550.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/29/06		Conferences with Mr. Weiner, attorney for Baxter, regarding Tuscaloosa auction (.4); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding auction (.2); attend Tuscaloosa auction and continue same (2.0); telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding sale of Tuscaloosa and continued funding of operations (.2); e-mails regarding auction to Mr. Hammer, Mr. Freedlander, Mr. Downs, Mr. Weiner and Mr. Adcox, counsel for ISE (.6); telephone conference with Mr. Downs regarding funding and Tuscaloosa and Mexican sale assets (.2); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.3); telephone conferences with Mr. Bergen, Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Mallak regarding Mexican closing and funding of Mexican facilities going forward and transition services agreement (1.0) (.8); telephone conference with Mr. Hammer regarding Tuscaloosa sale (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Adcox, counsel for ISE, regarding Tuscaloosa sale (.3);	7.60	<del></del>
		conference call with Mr. Downs, customers' counsel, Mr. Bambery of BBK, and Mr. Stephenson and Mr.		

Bergen regarding availability and method of calculating availability (1.2); additional telephone conference with Mr. Downs regarding availability issues and calculation of same (.2).

11/29/06 T M Wearsch

Prepare for auction (.4); attend auction for Tuscaloosa (.8); telephone call with Ms. Zurn regarding additional change to Chihuahua Order (.1); revise and submit same (.3); review and comment on revised Hermosillo purchase agreement (.5); review, revise and circulate closing checklist (.4); draft transition service agreement (1.0); draft employer substitution agreement (1.2); attention to various issues in preparation for closing of Hermosillo transaction (1.2); telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.4); attend conference call with Messrs. Mallak, Woodard, Wilkens and Loesch regarding closing of Chihuahua (.9); various telephone calls with Messrs. Radom, Wilson and Wilkins regarding closing of Hermosillo transaction (.6); review authority of Delphi to close transaction (1.0).

8.80 2,068.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/30/06	R M Loesch	Attention to closing (6.1); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding asset list (.1); telephone conference with Mr. Martinez regarding lease termination (.6); prepare final Bill of Sale (.5); prepare Officer's Certificate (.2).	7.50	2,812.50
11/30/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr.  Mallak regarding closing of Mexico, payment of rent at two facilities and sale of Tuscaloosa (.3); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding closing and work on closing (.3); conference with Mr. Radom regarding tooling and Mexican sale (.1); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Mexican tooling (.2) (.3); conferences with Mr. Bergen regarding tooling and payment by customers of accounts receivable and payment of rent (.2) (.2); work on closing of Mexican sale (1.6); conference with Mr. Loesch regarding closing of Chihuahua facility (.3).	3.50	1,575.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
11/30/06	T M Wearsch	Attend hearing on Emergency Motion regarding funding of incentive plan (.5); continue to draft, review and revise various documents for the closing of the Hermosillo and Chihuahua sales and attend closing of same (7.9); various telephone calls with Mr. Radom regarding same (1.0); various telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.7); work to obtain release statements (.6); various telephone calls with Mr. Loesch regarding closing of Chihuahua (.5); draft letters to perspective Tuscaloosa bidders regarding insufficiencies (.6).	11.80	2,773.00

Date		Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B36	SALE/AUCTIO	ON OF BUSINESS		
12/01/06	R M	Loesch	Attention to closing (3.0); numerous telephone conference with Ms. Wilkens (1.0); telephone conference with Mr. Martinez regarding Mexican lease matters (.3).	4.30	1,612.50
12/01/06	J F	Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Radom regarding Mexico and tooling release (.2); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding Mexican closing issues (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding tooling for Delphi (.3); conference call with Mr. Downs, Wachovia, Principals, Mr. Freedlander, Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Bergen regarding Lapeer (.6); conference with Mr. Stephenson and e-mails regarding Lapeer sale (.3); conferences and e-mails with Mr. Mallak, Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Bergen regarding Lapeer and Tuscaloosa sales and order regarding bonus plan (1.0); work on Tuscaloosa sale order (.3); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.2).	3.20	1,440.00
12/01/06	т м	Wearsch	Attend closing for Hermosillo and Chihuahua transactions.	8.10	1,903.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
Date		Review revisions to agreement by General Motors and Mr. Downs (.1); e-mail regarding revisions to changes made by Mr. Downs (.2); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa and Lapeer sales (.3); receipt and review Lapeer proposal purchase (.5); conference with Mr. Bergen regarding availability and funding issues (.2); review issues of availability as to future funding and review documents from Mr. Bergen regarding same (.3); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding Crestline (.2); conference with Attorney Adcox regarding Tuscaloosa (.3); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding Lapeer sale (.3); call from Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa sale and regarding response to action items from Committee (.4); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Lapeer, action item response and	Hours 3.40	Time Value
		subpoena (.4); telephone conference with Ms. Robertson regarding Carlisle, receivables and settlement with Carlisle (.2).		

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/04/06	T M Wearsch	Review and comment on Atlas listing proposal (.4); telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding sale of Tuscaloosa and Lapeer (.5); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Tuscaloosa and potential bidders (.4); respond to information inquiries from potential Tuscaloosa bidders (.7); respond to requests from Delphi regarding Hermosillo closing documents (.4); telephone call with Mr. Parobek regarding adjournment of auction (.2); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding same (.2); review status of Lapeer offer (.1); review Mexican sale documents regarding asset allocation (.3).	3.00	705.00
12/05/06	R M Loesch	Follow-up with Wachovia regarding lien release letter (.1); telephone conference with Ms. Wilken regarding closing documents (.1).	0.20	75.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/05/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Bergen regarding status and regarding sales and auctions of all properties (.6); review e-mails from Mr. Banbery regarding court order and e-mail Mr. Banbery regarding availability issues (.2); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding sales, status of all sales, future wind down funding and availability issues (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Wyner regarding Tuscaloosa (.2); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa (.1).	1.50	675.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/05/06	T M Wearsch	Attention to retention of appraisers for Parker Hannifan locations (.3); telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding sale of Crestline, closing of Mexican accounts; transition services and sale of Tuscaloosa (.7); follow-up with Mr. Downs regarding Century lien release (.4); telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa offers and options (.4); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding same (.3); review revise Tuscaloosa bid from Visteon (.4); review and respond to correspondence regarding same and Hitech bid (.4); telephone call with Mr. Hammer regarding same (.3).	3.20	752.00
12/06/06	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Martinez regarding lease termination.	0.20	75.00

3.80	
	1,710.00

		regarding Tuscaloosa sale (.2).		
12/06/06	T M Wearsch	Review proposed Lapeer sale agreement (.2); review correspondence related to same (.1); review deposits schedule (.1); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding Tuscaloosa closing (.3); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding same and plant wind down (.5); coordinate auction and prepare for same (.7); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding same and Tuscaloosa sale (.5); attention to structuring Tuscaloosa transaction and plan assuming no bids (1.0); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding Crestline sale (.2); telephone call with Mr. Parker regarding sale of Tuscaloosa (.2).	3.80	893.00
12/07/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Tuscaloosa sale (.2); attend auction of Tuscaloosa (1.2); conference with Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Bergen regarding listing of Crestline and sale of Tuscaloosa and wind down budget (.5); e-mails Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Mallak regarding sale of Tuscaloosa and inventory issues at Tuscaloosa (.5)	2.40	1,080.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/07/06	T M Wearsch	Prepare for and attend Tuscaloosa auction (1.5); follow up telephone call with Mr. Parobek regarding same (.3); various telephone calls with Mr. Parker regarding same and assignment of lease (.5); various telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Tuscaloosa and bidders (.4); telephone call with Mr Mallak regarding same (.3).	3.00	705.00
12/08/06	R M Loesch	Prepare cover letter to Ms. Wilkens and Mr. Martinez (.5); attention to organization of closing files (.5); telephone conference with Ms. Wilkens (.3).	1.30	487.50

12/08/06 J F Hutchinson, Conference with Mr. Mallak regarding sale		
of Tuscaloosa (.3); conference with Mr. Parobek regarding Tuscaloosa sale (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Wyner regarding sale of Tuscaloosa (.2); attend continued auction (1.1); conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding funding and Tuscaloosa sale (.2); conference with Mr. Parobek regarding Tuscaloosa sale and regarding Carlisle defense to claim against Carlisle (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Lapeer and sale of Tuscaloosa (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding sales, Lapeer sale, Tuscaloosa sale and Bishopville sale (.3); conference with Ms. Johnson regarding Lapeer sale and closing (.3); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Lapeer (.3); Motion and Order	4.30	1,935.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/08/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Fusco regarding withdrawal of Objection by Steelworkers (.1); telephone call to Mr. Mallak regarding resolution of Union objection and regarding sale of Tuscaloosa and funding issues (.3).	0.40	180.00
12/08/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Messrs. Hutchinson, Mallak and Stephenson regarding inventory and Tuscaloosa sale (1.0); calls with Mr. Mallak regarding negotiation of final Tuscaloosa purchase agreement (.6); prepare for and attend Tuscaloosa sale auction (.7); telephone calls with Mr. Hammer regarding same and revised purchase agreement for Tuscaloosa (.6); finalize structuring of Tuscaloosa transaction (.8).	3.70	869.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/11/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Asensio regarding effects bargaining (.3); e-mails to Mr. Freedlander regarding effects bargaining and sale (.2); work on Lapeer sale and revise Purchase Agreement (.6); review and revise proposed order regarding sale of Tuscaloosa (.7); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding hearing and sales (.3); work on Tuscaloosa sale and prepare for hearing (.4); conference with Mr. Hammer regarding sale to Visteon of Tuscaloosa facility (.3).	2.80	1,260.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/11/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Parobek regarding Tuscaloosa Presses and rejection (.6); conference call with Messrs. Mallak and Hutchinson regarding inventory values at Tuscaloosa (.4); telephone calls with Mr. Hammer regarding resolution of same (.6); review and comment on asset purchase agreement and proposed sale Order (2.0); conference calls with Messrs. Downs, Hammer, Gosh and Freedlander regarding same (1.0); review revised versions of same (.7); meet with Mr. Parker regarding landlord concerns at Tuscaloosa (.5); prepare for hearing (1.1); attend status call with Court (.5); follow-up regarding finalizing and submitting Tuscaloosa agreement and proposed Order (1.0).	8.40	1,974.00
12/12/06	R M Loesch	Attention to preparation and organization of documentation for sale of Mexican assets.	0.40	150.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/12/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding information to Committee and regarding upcoming sales (.4); work on Transition Services Agreement as to Tuscaloosa (.4).	0.80	360.00
12/12/06	T M Wearsch	Review revised asset purchase agreement and revised sale Order (.5); review comments to same (.4); prepare for hearing (.5); attend hearing on Tuscaloosa sale (1.5); telephone calls with Mr. Hammer regarding transition services (.7); telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.8); review potential list of transition services and draft transition services and draft transition services agreement (3.2); collect comments to the proposed asset purchase agreement and sale Order (.5); telephone calls with Mr. Parker regarding comments of landlord (.4); telephone calls with Mr. Parobek regarding comments of Carslisle and Crestline equipment (.4).	8.90	2,091.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/13/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone conferences with Mr. Stephenson of Glass regarding Vandalia auction (.1); revisions to Tuscaloosa APA (1.4); conference with Mr. Bergen regarding purchase of inventory (.2); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding LC drawdown (.2); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding letter of credit draw down (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding information for court (.2) (.1); conference call with Glass & Associates, Committee counsel, Wachovia counsel (1.3); telephone conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding Lapeer sale	4.30	1,935.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/13/06	T M Wearsch	Attention to employee substitution agreement for Hermosillo (.5); review correspondence regarding equipment auctions and draw of letter of credit (.3); review correspondence regarding MIddlefield closure (.1): telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding transition services (.7); telephone calls regarding same with Mr. Hammer (.8); conference calls with Messrs. Parker, Parobek, Freedlander, Downs, Gosch and Hammer regarding same and proposed order and asset marketing agreement (1.0); review and comment on various rounds of drafts of same and coordinate final versions of same for filing (4.0).	7.40	1,739.00
12/14/06	S A Maxwell	Access and obtain samples of Motions to Sell Real Property and Orders relating to same and forward to Mr. Goodman per his request.	0.30	39.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/14/06	T M Wearsch	Prepare for hearing (1.1); attend hearing regarding sale at Tuscaloosa (.7); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding Chihuahua closing and accounts receivable (.2); draft letter for Mr. Mallak regarding same (.4); review and respond to correspondence from Delphi regarding Middlefield production (.2); review Carlisle security agreement (.2); review and respond to correspondence regarding Middlefield equipment designations (.3); review correspondence and status of Lapeer transaction (.3); review riders to Buy Sell Agreement (.3); review revised asset purchase agreement (.2).	3.90	916.50
12/15/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Stephenson regarding Lapeer transaction (.4): review correspondence related to same (.3); telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding closing of Tuscaloosa (.4); attention to same and preparation for same (1.0); review correspondence regarding letter of credit draw (.2).	2.30	540.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/18/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding robots at Crestline (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding sale and budget and wind down issues (.4); e-mails to and from Mr. Freedlander regarding sales and budget (.3); e-mail regarding sale auction of presses and robots at Crestline (.4); telephone conference with Mr. Dick regarding same (.3).	1.70	765.00
12/18/06	T M Wearsch	Attention to transfer of Mexican proceeds to escrow account (.4); review Biditup letter of credit and prepare draft draw letter (1.5); telephone calls with Ms. Wong of Comerica bank regarding same (.4); telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding pos-auction issues at Crestline (.2); review and respond to correspondence regarding reduction in letter of credit (.4); telephone call with Mr. Downs regarding same (.3); telephone calls with Mr. Radom regarding closing of Tuscaloosa transaction (.6); prepare for Tuscaloosa closing (3.0).	6.80	1,598.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/19/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Lapeer and purchase agreement (.1); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding closing matters (.3).	0.40	180.00
12/19/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding Tuscaloosa closing.	0.10	23.50
12/19/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding Tuscaloosa closing and negotiation regarding inventory (1.4); telephone calls with Mr. Hammer regarding same (1.5); telephone calls with Mr. Parker regarding lease assumption (.4); negotiate and finalize closing documents and finalize all issues regarding Tuscaloosa closing (4.8).	8.10	1,903.50
12/19/06	E R Goodman	Telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding sale proceeds (.3); meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Atlas Application (.2).	0.50	112.50
12/20/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Stephenson and Mr. Wearsch regarding Tuscaloosa sale and draw on letter of credit.	0.40	180.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/20/06	T M Wearsch	Review and respond to correspondence regarding Crestline auction (.3); respond to announcement request from Ms. Shevnock regarding Tuscaloosa transaction (.1); draft, review, revise and file Sale Motion for Lapeer (3.0); review correspondence from Comerica regarding failed draw (.2); various telephone calls with Ms. Wong from Comerica regarding same (.5); draft revise draw request and draft to complete draw on letter of credit (1.5); draft correspondence regarding same (.1); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding Tuscaloosa closing (.2); respond to inquiries and document requests regarding Tuscaloosa closing (.4).	6.30	1,480.50
12/21/06	J F Hutchinson,	E-mails to Mr. Stephenson regarding status of all auctions and sale of robots and conditions at Crestline facility after sale by auctioneers.	0.60	270.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/21/06	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Stephenson regarding Crestline closing (.1); review correspondence related to same (.2); telephone call with Mr. Parobek regarding results of Crestline auction (.3); telephone call with Mr. Risberger regarding same and sale of robots (.3); telephone calls with Ms. Wong of Comerica regarding letter of credit draw (.5); follow up regarding same (.3).	1.70	399.50
12/22/06	T M Wearsch	Follow-up on letter of credit draw and exchange correspondence regarding same (.4); review Atlas engagement agreement (.2); review proposals for appraisers (.2).	0.80	188.00
12/26/06	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding Biditup and removal of assets by purchasers (.3); review Biditup contract regarding requirement for removal of assets (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding same and regarding status of all issues, including collection of receivables and wind down and DIP budget, employment status (.4).	1.00	450.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
12/27/06	T M Wearsch	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding sale results at Lapeer and rental options.	0.30	70.50
12/28/06	J F Hutchinson,	Telephone call from Mr. Mallak regarding personnel issues and sale status.	0.50	225.00
12/28/06	T M Wearsch	Coordinate return of deposit to Hitech (.3); telephone call with Mr. Risberger regarding sale of robots (.4); review and forward offer from Mr. Risberger (.2); respond to inquiry from Mr. Parker regarding Tuscaloosa security deposit (.3).	1.20	282.00
12/29/06	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with Ms. Wilkins regarding termination of Transition Services Agreement.	0.20	75.00
12/29/06	J F Hutchinson,	Review documents and status of sale of all proceedings and potential 502(g) rejection claims.	0.80	360.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
TASK CODE:	B36 SALE/AUCTIO	ON OF BUSINESS		
01/02/07	V L Johnson	Attention to appraisal agreement for Vandalia, Ohio.	0.30	91.50
01/02/07	V L Johnson	Attention to appraisal agreement for Bishopville, South Carolina.	0.30	91.50
01/02/07	J F Hutchinson,	Work on sale of Crestline and conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding same.	0.30	157.50
01/02/07	J F Hutchinson,	E-mails regarding Lapeer with Mr. Stephenson and Ms. Johnson.	0.50	262.50
01/02/07	T M Wearsch	Respond to inquiries regarding Lapeer property sale (.3); review and respond to correspondence regarding a sale of the Crestline property (.2).	0.50	125.00
01/03/07	V L Johnson	E-mail title company regarding transaction.	0.10	30.50
01/03/07	V L Johnson	Order title commitment.	0.10	30.50
01/03/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Ms. Johnson regarding Lapeer sale.	0.20	105.00
01/03/07	T M Wearsch	Conference call with Messrs. Hutchinson, Mallak, Bergen and Stephenson regarding Mexican sale proceeds, real property sales, pension issues and other labor issues.	0.60	150.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/04/07	J F Hutchinson,	E-mail and communication with Ms. Johnson regarding closing of sale of Lapeer.	0.20	105.00
01/04/07	T M Wearsch	Follow-up regarding appraisers (.3); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding CEP Mexico liquidation and sale at Crestline (.3).	0.60	150.00
01/05/07	R M Loesch	Telephone conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Century Mold transfer of employees.	0.30	117.00
01/05/07	V L Johnson	Discussion with Mr. Wearsch regarding appraisals.	0.50	152.50
01/05/07	J F Hutchinson,	E-mails with Mr. Stephenson regarding Biditup removal of equipment and sale reconciliation (.3); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Crestline and offer for same (.2).	0.50	262.50
01/08/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Pointer regarding shutdown and surrender of property (.5); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding same (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Freedlander regarding all issues (.5).	1.20	630.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/08/07	T M Wearsch	Attention to retention of appraisers (.2); telephone call with Mr. Risbridger regarding offer for robots (.3); forward correspondence regarding same (.1); review offer for Crestline property (.3).	0.90	225.00
01/08/07	T M Wearsch	Conference with Mr. Hutchinson regarding shutdown and surrender of property.	0.20	50.00
01/09/07	V L Johnson	Review Crestline letter of intent.	0.70	213.50
01/09/07	V L Johnson	Obtain title work for Lapeer, Michigan location.	0.30	91.50
01/09/07	J F Hutchinson,	E-mails to Mr. Freedlander regarding numerous matters, including Biditup and exit dates.	0.50	262.50
01/09/07	J F Hutchinson,	E-mails to Mr. Stephenson, Mr. Wearsch, Mr. Bergen, Mr. Freedlander regarding distribution, funding, Crestline and Lapeer sales (.9); e-mails regarding Crestline offer to and from Mr. Freedlander and Ms. Johnson (.3).	1.20	630.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/09/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Risbridger regarding offer for robots (.3); telephone call with Messrs. Mallak and Poynter regarding same (.3); draft correspondence regarding same (.1); respond to inquiries regarding same (.2); review and respond to correspondence related to Crestline offer (.3).	1.20	300.00
01/10/07	V L Johnson	Draft Crestline Purchase Agreement.	1.00	305.00
01/10/07	J F Hutchinson,	Work on Crestline sale (.8); e-mail to Glass & Associates regarding Crestline (.2).	1.00	525.00
01/10/07	T M Wearsch	Review and respond to correspondence related to Crestline sale and obtain consent for same (.4); draft, review and revise letter of intent (1.1).	1.50	375.00
01/11/07	V L Johnson	Finalize initial draft of Purchase Agreement for Crestline.	1.00	305.00
01/11/07	V L Johnson	Review Crestline title work.	0.50	152.50
01/11/07	V L Johnson	Telephone call with title company regarding delays in getting title report.	0.50	152.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/11/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conferece with Mr. Parobek regarding machine at Crestline (.3); review Crestline machine issues with Mr. Stephenson (.2); conference with Ms. Johnson regarding sale of Crestline (.3); review Lapeer sale issues (.3); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Crestline sale (1.1); conferences with Ms. Johnson regarding Crestline and Lapeer (.3).	2.50	1,312.50
01/11/07	T M Wearsch	Coordinate execution of Crestline letter of intent and move to definitive agreements (.4); follow-up with Mr. Risbridger regarding robots (.2).	0.60	150.00
01/15/07	T M Wearsch	Draft Lapeer sale Order.	1.20	300.00
01/16/07	V L Johnson	Finalize Purchase Agreement for Crestline and forward to Mr. McKown.	2.50	762.50
01/16/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. McKown regarding Purchase Agreement.	0.20	61.00
01/16/07	T M Wearsch	Review and comment on Crestline sale agreement.	0.50	125.00
01/17/07	T M Wearsch	Follow-up with Mr. Stephenson regarding Lapeer sale Order.	0.30	75.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/18/07	V L Johnson	Attention to Lapeer, Michigan transaction.	0.50	152.50
01/18/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr. Wearsch and e-mails regarding Crestline and Lapeer sale, personnel issues, accounts receivable and future funding.	0.80	420.00
01/18/07	T M Wearsch	Follow-up regarding Lapeer sale Order (.2); review and respond to inquires from company regarding Biditup and clean up of the facilities (.3).	0.50	125.00
01/19/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding sales and regarding Notice and publication in Wall Street Journal.	0.20	105.00
01/19/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Ms. Johnson and Mr. Hutchinson regarding tax waiver in sale Order (.1); review and respond to various correspondence regarding payments due under transition agreements (.2): review transition agreements (.2); telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding same (.3); conference with Mr. Hutchinson regarding notice and publication (.2).	1.00	250.00
01/22/07	V L Johnson	Attention to issues concerning Lapeer, Michigan.	0.80	244.00

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 88 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/22/07	V L Johnson	Telephone call with Mr. Riseman regarding title work.	0.50	152.50
01/22/07	V L Johnson	Review e-mail from Mr. Stephenson.	0.20	61.00
01/22/07	J F Hutchinson,	E-mail Mr. Mallak regarding Lapeer.	0.10	52.50
01/23/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. Riseman regarding Lapeer, Michigan due diligence items.	0.20	61.00
01/23/07	V L Johnson	Attention to closing issues involving Lapeer, Michigan purchase transaction.	0.60	183.00
01/23/07	V L Johnson	Telephone calls to title company regarding completeness of title for Lapeer Michigan.	0.20	61.00
01/24/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. Poynter regarding access to Vandalia facility.	0.20	61.00
01/24/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. Watson regarding access to Vandalia facility.	0.20	61.00
01/24/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. Watson regarding access to Bishipville facility.	0.20	61.00
01/24/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. Middleton regarding access to facilities.	0.30	91.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/24/07	V L Johnson	Finalize Crestline Purchase Agreement and send to buyer.	0.60	183.00
01/24/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with buyer and buyer's counsel regarding Purchase Agreement.	0.30	91.50
01/24/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. Poynter regarding access to Bishopville facility.	0.20	61.00
01/24/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference with Mr. Goodman and e-mail Mr. Stephenson regarding sale of Crestline (.3); telephone call from Mr. Stephenson regarding Lapeer (.1); telephone conference with Ms. Johnson regarding sales of Lapeer and closing of sale of Crestline (.2); conference with Mr. Stephenson regarding closing of same (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Bergen regarding Carlisle and closing of sales (.2)	1.00	525.00
01/24/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding wind down of operations and termination of transition services (.3); review and respond to correspondence regarding real estate sales (.3).	0.60	150.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/24/07	E R Goodman	Telephone call to Ms. Johnson regarding Crestline sale (.1); draft and edit Motion to Sell Property in Crestline under section 363 of the Bankruptcy Code (2.4); draft e-mail to Ms. Johnson regarding same (.1).	2.60	637.00
01/25/07	V L Johnson	Attention to Crestline Purchase Agreement and related issues.	0.50	152.50
01/25/07	V L Johnson	Attention to Vandalia Purchase Agreement and related issues.	0.50	152.50
01/25/07	V L Johnson	Attention to Bishopville Purchase Agreement and related issues.	0.50	152.50
01/25/07	V L Johnson	Attention to Lapeer, Michigan Purchase Agreement and related issues.	0.50	152.50
01/25/07	J F Hutchinson,	Work on Keen/appraisal Orders and e-mails regarding Crestline, Lapeer, Vandalia and Bishopville to various parties involved in sales (.4); conference with Mr. Goodman regarding same (.2).	0.60	315.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/25/07	E R Goodman	Draft and review e-mails regarding sale Order for LaPeer, Michigan (.1); telephone call and e-mail to Ms. Johnson regarding appraisals for Bishopville and Vandalia (.1); draft e-mail to Ms. Johnson regarding Crestline sale (.1).	0.30	73.50
01/26/07	V L Johnson	Compile exhibits for Lapeer, Michigan agreement.	1.10	335.50
01/26/07	V L Johnson	Attention to Bishopville appraisal.	0.40	122.00
01/26/07	V L Johnson	Attention to Vandalia appraisal.	0.40	122.00
01/26/07	V L Johnson	Attention to execution of Crestline purchase agreement.	0.50	152.50
01/26/07	V L Johnson	Review court Order and declaration for Vandalia.	1.00	305.00
01/26/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. Dean regarding status of execution regarding Crestline.	0.40	122.00
01/26/07	V L Johnson	Exchange e-mail with Mr. Stephenson regarding Mr. Riseman.	0.20	61.00
01/26/07	V L Johnson	E-mail correspondence with Mr. McKown regarding status of Crestline execution.	0.20	61.00
01/26/07	V L Johnson	Review court Order and declaration for Bishopville.	1.00	305.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/26/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conferences with Mr. Bergen regarding Belleville, Canton, Workers' Compensation issues, funding order, Bishopville and Vandalia appraisals (.5) (.4); review status of properties from Mr. Stephenson (.2).	1.10	577.50
01/26/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding liquidation of CEP Mexico (.4): conference call with Messrs. Hutchinson and Freedlander regarding same, treatment of Mallak claim and wind down (.3); review CEP Mexico liquidation plan (.3).	1.00	250.00
01/26/07	E R Goodman	Review files and draft e-mail to Ms. Johnson regarding lot descriptions (.1); draft and edit Motion to Sell Crestline (.1); telephone call to counsel for Wachovia regarding sale of Crestline properties (.1); draft and edit LaPeer Order and draft e-mail to the purchaser regarding same (1.0).	1.30	318.50
01/28/07	E R Goodman	Respond to e-mail from Wachovia regarding Crestline sale.	0.30	73.50

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/29/07	V L Johnson	Telephone call with Mr. Watson regarding Bankruptcy Court Declaration and resume.	1.10	335.50
01/29/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. Riseman.	0.50	152.50
01/29/07	V L Johnson	Telephone call with appraiser, Mr. Middleton, regarding Bankruptcy Court Declaration.	1.00	305.00
01/29/07	V L Johnson	Schedule walk through of facility in Vandalia, Ohio.	0.90	274.50
01/29/07	J F Hutchinson,	Review and revise Motion to Sell Crestline (.4); conferences with Mr. Mallak regarding Crestline, sale of Canton, closing of Belleville (.3); attention to Motion to Sell Crestline (.3).	1.00	525.00
01/29/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding Tuscaloosa closing documents (.2); telephone call with Mr. Radom regarding Middlefield auction (.2); telephone call with same and Mr. Mattes regarding same (.2); review and respond to correspondence related to same (.1); telephone call with Mr. Mallak regarding tooling (.3); review and respond to letter regarding same (.2).	1.20	300.00

CEP Holdings, LLC Chapter 11 Page 94 of Billing Detail - Professional Services

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/29/07	E R Goodman	Meet with Mr. Hutchinson regarding Crestline sale Motion (.3); edit Crestline sale Motion per comments from Mr. Hutchinson (1.5); attend to filing Motion to Sell Crestline and related exhibits (.2).	2.00	490.00
01/30/07	V L Johnson	Arrange for walk through of Vandalia location.	0.30	91.50
01/30/07	V L Johnson	Obtain consents.	0.60	183.00
01/30/07	V L Johnson	Telephone discussion with Mr. Riseman regarding due diligence.	1.10	335.50
01/30/07	V L Johnson	Attention to Crestline title work.	0.70	213.50
01/30/07	V L Johnson	Arrange for walk through of Bishopville location.	0.30	91.50
01/30/07	J F Hutchinson,	Conference and e-mails with Ms. Johnson regarding Lapeer and Crestline closings.	0.60	315.00

Date	Name	Description	Hours	Time Value
01/30/07	T M Wearsch	Telephone calls with Mr. Mallak regarding termination of transition services (.4); review various transition services agreements regarding same (.3); draft correspondence to Visteon regarding same (.2); telephone calls with Mr. Riseman regarding consent of purchaser to Lapeer sale Order (.3); review and revise same (.3).	1.50	375.00
01/31/07	J F Hutchinson,	Receipt and review reverse merger proposal (.1); review Carlisle proposal (.2); conference with Mr. Wearsch regarding Carlisle proposal (.1); conference with Mr. Mallak regarding Carlisle proposal and regarding revisions to Mallak contract (.3); conference with Mr. Bergen regarding sale at Middlefield (.2).	0.90	472.50