



Mark E. Freedlander
412.667.7928

Dominion Tower, 23rd Floor
625 Liberty Avenue
Pittsburgh PA 15222

August 14, 2007

INVOICE NO. 90953011

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (CEP)
c/o Bruce Tobiansky
DuPont Corporation
DuPont Legal, D-4026
1007 Market Street
Wilmington, DE 19898

TAX ID NO. 54-0505857

JOINT GROUP #2048970

Current Invoice:

Current Fees:	\$59,480.00	
Current Disbursements:	<u>\$1,944.45</u>	
Current Invoice Total:		<u>\$61,424.45</u>

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO THE FOLLOWING ADDRESS:

McGuireWoods LLP
Attn: Accounts Receivable
901 E. Cary Street
Richmond, VA 23286-0645

PAYMENT IN FULL IS DUE UPON PRESENTATION

McGUIREWOODS

For professional services rendered and expenses incurred from
July 2, 2007 through July 31, 2007 regarding File
Number 2048970 :

<u>Matter</u>	<u>Fees</u>	<u>Disb.</u>	<u>Total</u>
General Administration 2048970-0001	\$9,853.50	\$362.45	\$10,215.95
Debtor-in-Possession Financing 2048970-0004	\$426.00	\$.00	\$426.00
Docket Review 2048970-0008	\$665.00	\$.00	\$665.00
Employee Matters 2048970-0009	\$1,150.00	\$.00	\$1,150.00
Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization 2048970-0013	\$34,952.50	\$1,582.00	\$36,534.50
Taxes 2048970-0015	\$1,187.50	\$.00	\$1,187.50
Claims Processing 2048970-0018	\$6,645.00	\$.00	\$6,645.00
Miscellaneous Motions and Advesary Proceedings 2048970-0019	\$3,827.50	\$.00	\$3,827.50
Retention of Professionals and Fee Application 2048970-0022	\$773.00	\$.00	\$773.00
	<hr/>		
	\$59,480.00	\$1,944.45	\$61,424.45

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND EXPENSES INCURRED:

Re: **General Administration**

Our File No. 2048970-0001

For Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2007

07/02/07	Teleconference with T. Wearsch regarding scheduling issues (.2); review hearing agenda (.1) William C. Price	.30
07/02/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.30
07/05/07	Telephone conference with S. Seewer regarding customer response to committee cash infusion request; communications with J. Hutchinson regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
07/05/07	Communications with R. Cromer regarding status of fraudulent conveyance due diligence Mark E. Freedlander	.50
07/05/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.40
07/06/07	Review Hutchinson communications regarding cash infusion issues; draft reply correspondence to customers regarding cash infusion counter-offer Mark E. Freedlander	1.30
07/06/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.20
07/16/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.10
07/17/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.20
07/18/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	2.10
07/20/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.10

07/23/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	.40
07/24/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.80
07/25/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.40
07/26/07	Address issues relating to transition from debtor-in-possession to liquidating trust Mark E. Freedlander	1.30
07/26/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	2.00
07/27/07	Research regarding tax treatment of and issues relating to liquidation trust for the benefit of creditors Thomas E. Taylor	2.90
07/27/07	Address issues relating to USW settlement Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
07/27/07	Address issues relating to establishment of liquidating trust and transition from debtor-in-possession to liquidating trust Mark E. Freedlander	.90
07/27/07	Address subordinated secured payoff issues Mark E. Freedlander	.60
07/30/07	Research regarding tax treatment of, and issues relating to liquidating trust for the benefit of creditors; note to M. Ackerly Thomas E. Taylor	1.10
07/30/07	Address subordinated secured claim payoff issues and resolution of cash infusion claim issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.70
07/30/07	Review and update case files Heather R. Hickman	1.40
07/31/07	Address post-confirmation issues with counsel to debtors, various creditors, counsel to participating customers Mark E. Freedlander	2.00

07/31/07 Draft email to M. Freedlander regarding same; .80
 research regarding liquidating trust rules
 Arnold E. Grant

07/31/07 Review and update case files .80
 Heather R. Hickman

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Arnold E. Grant	\$510.00	0.8	\$408.00
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	10.3	\$4,892.50
Thomas E. Taylor	\$450.00	4.0	\$1,800.00
William C. Price	\$310.00	0.3	\$93.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	15.2	\$2,660.00
TOTAL FEES		30.6	\$9,853.50

Disbursements and Other Expenses:

Copy Charges	\$70.60
Rate=.10 Quantity=706	
Meal & Mileage Allowance	\$9.00
Pacer Research	\$133.12
Long Distance Telephone Charges	\$20.00
06/20/07 GENESYS CONFERENCING - Conference call hosted by William C. Price on 06/20/2007	\$7.90
07/27/07 William C. Price - Trip to Akron, Ohio for hearing 07/24/07; meal, mileage	\$121.83
TOTAL EXPENSES	\$362.45

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0001

\$10,215.95

Re: Debtor-in-Possession Financing
Our File No. 2048970-0004
For Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2007

07/05/07 Review correspondence from M. Freedlander cash .10
 infusions and resolution of outstanding issues
 Sally E. Edison

07/05/07 Attention to cash infusion issues .30
 William C. Price

07/12/07 Teleconference with S. Seewar regarding cash .30
 infusions (.2); draft e-mail to M. Freedlander
 regarding cash infusions (.1)
 William C. Price

07/16/07 Review correspondence from J. Galyen regarding .30
 draft tabulation report
 Sally E. Edison

07/30/07 Review various correspondence from case .20
 professionals regarding payoff letter
 Sally E. Edison

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	0.6	\$240.00
William C. Price	\$310.00	0.6	\$186.00
		1.2	\$426.00
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0004 \$426.00

Re: Docket Review

Our File No. 2048970-0008

For Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2007

07/02/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/03/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/05/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/06/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/09/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/10/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/11/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/13/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/16/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/17/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/18/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/19/07 Review docket Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/20/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/23/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/25/07 Review docket; distribute Heather R. Hickman	.20

07/26/07 Review docket .20
Heather R. Hickman

07/27/07 Review docket .20
Heather R. Hickman

07/30/07 Review docket .20
Heather R. Hickman

07/31/07 Review docket .20
Heather R. Hickman

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	3.8	\$665.00
		<hr/>	<hr/>
	TOTAL FEES	3.8	\$665.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0008

\$665.00

Re: Employee Matters

Our File No. 2048970-0009

For Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2007

07/03/07 Multiple communications with J. Hutchinson 2.00
and/or D. Fusco regarding effects bargaining
agreement with USW and review documentation
relating to same
Mark E. Freedlander

07/16/07 Draft correspondence to E. Goodman regarding .50
request for Ohio workers' compensation files;
telephone conference with E. Goodman regarding
same
Sally E. Edison

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	2.0	\$950.00
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	0.5	\$200.00
		<u>2.5</u>	<u>\$1,150.00</u>
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0009

\$1,150.00

Re: Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization**Our File No. 2048970-0013****For Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2007**

07/02/07	Review preliminary voting tabulation report (.5); review plan and disclosure statement in preparation for drafting memorandum in support of confirmation and confirmation order (1.5) William C. Price	2.00
07/05/07	Communications with W. Price regarding preparation/documentation relating to plan confirmation hearing Mark E. Freedlander	.80
07/05/07	Draft memorandum in support of confirmation (6.5); meeting with M. Freedlander regarding confirmation issues (.3); revise memorandum in support of confirmation and circulate the same to M. Freedlander (1.0) William C. Price	7.80
07/06/07	Communications with creditors regarding plan of liquidation and estimated return issues Mark E. Freedlander	1.00
07/06/07	Review interim ballot tabulation report Sally E. Edison	.20
07/06/07	Review interim voting tabulation report (.3); draft confirmation order (2.0); draft affidavits in support of confirmation (1.5) William C. Price	3.80
07/10/07	Review tabulation report (.3); draft e-mail to committee regarding voting (.1); draft confirmation order (1.5) William C. Price	1.90
07/11/07	Review correspondence from B. Price regarding ballot deadline; meeting with B. Price regarding same Sally E. Edison	.30
07/11/07	Telephone call to Rhodia regarding same; review correspondence from M. Dahlinger, Rhodia, regarding same; telephone conference with S. Herr, DuPont, regarding submission of ballot Sally E. Edison	.50

07/11/07	Attention to plan solicitation William C. Price	.50
07/12/07	Draft memorandum in support of plan confirmation William C. Price	6.50
07/13/07	Review objections to plan of liquidation (1.5) William C. Price	1.50
07/16/07	Review and draft revisions to memorandum in support of plan confirmation Mark E. Freedlander	1.70
07/16/07	Review NL Ventures objection to plan confirmation; communications with T. Wearsch and/or M. Parker regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	.80
07/16/07	Attention to objection of NL Ventures V Carlisle LP's to plan confirmation (.3); draft affidavit in support of confirmation (1.0) William C. Price	1.30
07/17/07	Review and draft revisions to memorandum in support of confirmation (2.5); telephone conference with M. Parker regarding NL Venture plan objections and potential resolution thereof; draft communications to debtors regarding status/strategy relating to NL Ventures plan objection (2.0) Mark E. Freedlander	4.50
07/17/07	Research Sixth Circuit standards for plan confirmation (4.0); revise memorandum in support of plan confirmation (1.5); research partial consolidation and forward the same to M. Freedlander (.5); review revised memorandum in support of plan confirmation (.5) William C. Price	6.50
07/17/07	Various e-mails and meetings with W. Price regarding revisions to memorandum in support of plan confirmation Nicholas E. Meriwether	.30
07/17/07	Research and make revisions to memorandum in support of plan confirmation Nicholas E. Meriwether	.70

07/17/07	Research and make revisions to memorandum in support of plan confirmation Nicholas E. Meriwether	.60
07/18/07	Plan objection resolution call with J. Hutchinson/T. Wearsch (1.0); drafting of proposed issues settlement communication to M. Parker (1.0); drafting of revisions to confirmation order (2.0); status/strategy discussion with B. Price (.7) Mark E. Freedlander	4.70
07/18/07	Review correspondence from J. Galyen and draft tabulation report Sally E. Edison	.20
07/18/07	Review revised confirmation order (1.0); draft revisions to confirmation order (.3); review, revise and finalize memorandum in support of confirmation and confirmation order and circulate the same (1.5); review, revise and finalize declaration of J. Mallak regarding plan confirmation and forward the same to M. Freedlander for review and comment (1.0) William C. Price	3.80
07/18/07	Attention to final revisions to memorandum in support of plan confirmation Nicholas E. Meriwether	.50
07/19/07	Conference call with T. Wearsch and M. Parker regarding potential resolution of NL Venture plan objections (.6); multiple communications with M. Parker regarding proposed language resolving plan objections (.7); review debtor proffers/evidentiary documents relating to plan confirmation (.7); telephone conference with G. Brickhouse regarding potential resolution of PBGC plan issues; conference call with J. Hutchinson and M. Merklin regarding same (1.0); plan confirmation status/strategy discussion with J. Hutchinson (.8); participate in status conference on plan confirmation with court (.5) Mark E. Freedlander	4.30
07/19/07	Attention to plan confirmation issues (.5); review various e-mails regarding plan confirmation (.5) William C. Price	1.00

07/19/07	Obtain Limited Objection of PBGC to Plan of Liquidation as per M. Freedlander request Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/20/07	Draft revisions to confirmation order (1.7); draft revisions to memo in support of confirmation (1.4); review declarations of Bergen and Mallak and comments thereon (1.0); review orders relating to pension plan assumptions and effects bargaining settlement (.5); address confirmation status/strategy with J. Hutchinson, T. Wearsch (multiple communications) (1.5) Mark E. Freedlander	5.50
07/20/07	Attention to plan confirmation issues (.5); review Washington Penn limited objection to Reserve Group settlement (.5): review memorandum in support of plan confirmation (1.0); review proposed confirmation order (1.0) William C. Price	3.00
07/20/07	E-file Memorandum in Support of Plan of Liquidation (0.4); coordinate service of same (0.3) Heather R. Hickman	.70
07/20/07	Upload Order confirming Joint Plan of Liquidation to Judge's chambers, revise and resubmit as per Court's request (0.6); coordinate service to Debtors' counsel (0.2) Heather R. Hickman	.80
07/23/07	Address plan confirmation issues -- communications with J. Hutchinson and T. Wearsch (multiple), M. Merklin, G. Brickhouse, R. Cromer and/or M. Parker regarding same; strategy discussions with B. Price regarding confirmation hearing Mark E. Freedlander	4.00
07/23/07	Meeting with M. Freedlander regarding plan confirmation hearing status Sally E. Edison	.20
07/23/07	Review proposed docket sheet (.3); revise plan confirmation order (.5); review comments to revised plan confirmation order (.3); prepare for plan confirmation hearing (6.0) William C. Price	7.10

07/24/07	Review various correspondence from case professionals regarding plan confirmation Sally E. Edison	.20
07/24/07	Travel to Akron, OH for plan confirmation hearing (2.0); prepare for plan confirmation hearing (2.0); attend plan confirmation hearing (1.5); revise plan confirmation order (2.0); travel from Akron, OH from plan confirmation hearing (.5); revise plan confirmation order (.5); review, revise and finalize plan confirmation order and circulate the same for review and comment (.5); coordinate filing of revised plan confirmation order (.3) William C. Price	9.30
07/24/07	Prepare and upload proposed confirmation order with Court Thomas Matthew Collins	1.50
07/25/07	Review numerous correspondence from case professionals regarding plan confirmation and transition issues Sally E. Edison	.40
07/25/07	Attention to transition (.5); review order approving pension resolution (.3); review various comments regarding order approving pension resolution (.3); review order confirmation joint plan of liquidation (.5); attention to notice of entry of order confirming joint plan of liquidation William C. Price	2.10
07/26/07	Review Wachovia payoff letter and participating customer AR settlement stipulation; draft memo regarding payoff of subordinated secured participations; communications with Wachovia regarding same Mark E. Freedlander	2.30
07/26/07	Review correspondence from M. Freedlander regarding trust operation issues; review confirmation order notice; meeting with B. Price regarding same Sally E. Edison	.50

07/26/07 Attention to payoff letter issues (.3); review 2.10
 memorandum regarding payoff letter issues (.5);
 review draft notice of entry of order
 confirming joint plan of liquidation (.5);
 review memorandum regarding plan confirmation
 (.5); review notice of entry of order
 confirming joint plan of liquidation (.3)
 William C. Price

07/31/07 Attention to transition issues .30
 William C. Price

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	29.6	\$14,060.00
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	2.5	\$1,000.00
William C. Price	\$310.00	60.5	\$18,755.00
Nicholas E. Meriwether	\$275.00	2.1	\$577.50
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	1.7	\$297.50
Thomas Matthew Collins	\$175.00	1.5	\$262.50
		97.9	\$34,952.50
	TOTAL FEES		

Disbursements and Other Expenses:

Westlaw Research	\$1,582.00
TOTAL EXPENSES	\$1,582.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0013 \$36,534.50

Re: Taxes

Our File No. 2048970-0015

For Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2007

07/25/07 Address plan confirmation/effective date 2.50
liquidating trust transition issues
Mark E. Freedlander

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	2.5	\$1,187.50
		<hr/>	<hr/>
	TOTAL FEES	2.5	\$1,187.50

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0015

\$1,187.50

Re: Claims Processing

Our File No. 2048970-0018

For Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2007

07/02/07 Meeting with B. Price regarding status of claims reconciliation Sally E. Edison	.30
07/02/07 Review claims reconciliation report William C. Price	1.50
07/12/07 Review correspondence from T. Bergen, J. Galyen, B. Price regarding preparation for claims reconciliation meeting Sally E. Edison	.20
07/12/07 Meeting with B. Price regarding same Sally E. Edison	.20
07/13/07 Meeting with T. Bergen, J. Galyen, B. Price regarding resolution of claims and outstanding issues Sally E. Edison	.50
07/13/07 Prepare for claims reconciliation meeting (2.0); meeting with A. Bergen and J. Galyen regarding claims reconciliation project (3.5) William C. Price	5.50
07/17/07 Attention to request for removal from service list William C. Price	.30
07/20/07 Review claims objection exhibits William C. Price	2.00
07/25/07 Draft correspondence to E. Goodman regarding status of claims objections; telephone call from E. Goodman regarding same Sally E. Edison	.40
07/25/07 Review draft exhibits for omnibus claims objection William C. Price	1.00
07/27/07 Begin to review and analyze documents received from E. Goodman regarding Ohio BWC claims Sally E. Edison	2.20

07/27/07 Review draft exhibits for omnibus claims objection
William C. Price 2.50

07/30/07 Begin to review and analyze proposed exhibits to omnibus claims objections and related matters
Sally E. Edison .80

07/30/07 Attention to omnibus claims objection
William C. Price 2.00

07/31/07 Attention to omnibus claims objection
William C. Price .70

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Sally E. Edison	\$400.00	4.6	\$1,840.00
William C. Price	\$310.00	15.5	\$4,805.00
		<hr/>	<hr/>
	TOTAL FEES	20.1	\$6,645.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0018

\$6,645.00

Re: Miscellaneous Motions and Adversary Proceedings**Our File No. 2048970-0019****For Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2007**

07/02/07	Review and analysis of case documentation Heather R. Hickman	.70
07/03/07	Review and analysis of case documentation Heather R. Hickman	.90
07/05/07	Update critical dates calendar; distribute Heather R. Hickman	1.10
07/09/07	Review and analysis of case documentation Heather R. Hickman	2.10
07/11/07	Review and analysis of case documentation Heather R. Hickman	.90
07/13/07	Review and analysis of case documentation Heather R. Hickman	1.60
07/17/07	Review and analysis of case documentation Heather R. Hickman	1.40
07/19/07	Review critical dates calendar regarding 7/19/07 pre-hearing conference scheduled (0.2); conference with M. Freedlander regarding same (0.1) Heather R. Hickman	.30
07/20/07	Review Washington Penn limited objection to pension plan assumption/Reserve Group settlement; discussion with J. Hutchinson/M. Merklin regarding strategy relating to same Mark E. Freedlander	1.50
07/20/07	Review and analysis of case documentation Heather R. Hickman	.60
07/23/07	Participate in status call with court regarding approval of Reserve Group pension assumption and participating customer accounts receivable settlement motions Mark E. Freedlander	.70
07/23/07	Prepare files for 7/24/07 plan confirmation hearing Heather R. Hickman	4.20

07/25/07 Review and analysis of case documentation 1.90
Heather R. Hickman

07/26/07 Research settlement Order and Stipulation with .20
customers as per M. Freedlander request
Heather R. Hickman

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Mark E. Freedlander	\$475.00	2.2	\$1,045.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	15.9	\$2,782.50
		<hr/>	<hr/>
	TOTAL FEES	18.1	\$3,827.50

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0019

\$3,827.50

Re: Retention of Professionals and Fee Application

Our File No. 2048970-0022

For Services Rendered Through Jul 31, 2007

07/03/07	Review second interim fee applications William C. Price	.50
07/03/07	Coordinate service of McGuireWoods and Grant Thornton second interim fee applications via e-mail and U.S. mail (0.4); prepare Certificate of Service, e-file (0.4) Heather R. Hickman	.80
07/03/07	Communications to Grant Thornton regarding submittal of proposed Order accompanying second interim fee application and revisions to same Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/03/07	Upload proposed Order accompanying McGuireWoods' second interim fee application Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/11/07	Communications with K. Ramsey at Grant Thornton regarding submittal of revised proposed Order granting Grant Thornton's second interim fee application Heather R. Hickman	.40
07/19/07	Transmit June fee statement of Grant Thornton for service to case professionals Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/20/07	Multiple communications with Grant Thornton regarding submittal of revised proposed Order to accompany second interim fee application (0.4); review and upload Order to Judge's chambers (0.3) Heather R. Hickman	.70
07/20/07	Conference with M. Freedlander regarding status of payment of March fee statement of Grant Thornton (0.1); forward e-mail communications to Huron Consulting relating to same (0.1) Heather R. Hickman	.20
07/26/07	Attention to final fee application William C. Price	.30

07/26/07 Research confirmation Order for fee application .30
filing deadlines
Heather R. Hickman

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
William C. Price	\$310.00	0.8	\$248.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$175.00	3.0	\$525.00
		<hr/>	<hr/>
	TOTAL FEES	3.8	\$773.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2048970-0022

\$773.00

Summary of Fees and Expenses:

Total Fees for all Matters: \$59,480.00

Total Expenses for all Matters: \$1,944.45

Total for this Invoice: \$61,424.45