EXHIBIT A

LAW OFFICES

NEAL, GERBER & EISENBERG LLP

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO: NEAL, GERBER & EISENBERG LLP 28987 NETWORK PLACE CHICAGO, IL 60673-1289 TWO NORTH LA SALLE STREET CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60602-3801 (312) 269-8000 F.E.I.N. 36-3532950

Corus Bankshares Committee; The Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Corus Bankshares, Inc. c/o Chair of Committee

July 18, 2011 Invoice 188848

For professional services rendered for the period ending June 30, 2011:

Total Due	\$ 14.521.40
Chargeable costs and expenses	\$ 47.40
Fees	\$ 14,474.00

CATEGORY SUMMARY

CATEGORY		HOURS SPEN	<u>NT</u>	<u>FEES</u>
023318.0004	Case Administration	0.20		\$134.00
023318.0007 Applications	Fee/Employment	7.40		\$1,985.00
023318.0011	Meetings of Creditors	4.60		\$2,185.00
023318.0012 Statement	Plan and Disclosure	21.00		\$10,170.00
TOTAL HOUR	RS	33.20		
			TOTAL:	\$14,474.00

NEAL, GERBER & EISENBERGLLP

July 18, 2011 Invoice 188848

EXPENSE SUMMARY

Statement No: 188848

For professional services rendered with regard to:

Re: <u>Case Administration</u>

DISBURSEMENTS

Jun 23, 2011	M. A. Berkoff	Transcript of Proceedings - Jackleen Defini, CSR, RPR transcript of hearing 5/26/11	44.00
Jun 24, 2011	Firm Admin	Reproduction of Documents	3.40
DISBURSEM	ENTS SUMMARY		
	Reproduction of Docume	nts	3.40
	Transcript of Proceedings	3	44.00
	TOTAL DI	SBURSEMENTS	<u>\$47.40</u>
	TOTAL DIS	BURSEMENTS	\$47.40

Case 10-26881 Doc 568-1 Filed 07/28/11 Entered 07/28/11 11:04:40 Desc Exhibit A Page 5 of 12

NEAL, GERBER & EISENBERGLLP July 18, 2011 Invoice 188848

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>		HOURS	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
Mark A. Berkoff	(Partner)	1.20	$\overline{670.00}$	\$804.00
Deborah M. Gutfeld	(Partner)	25.20	475.00	\$11,970.00
Nina Taylor Brody	(Paralegal)	6.80	250.00	\$1,700.00
TOTAL HOURS		33.20		
TOTAL FEES				<u>\$14,474.00</u>
		TOTAL FEES		\$14,474.00

Case 10-26881 Doc 568-1 Filed 07/28/11 Entered 07/28/11 11:04:40 Desc Exhibit A Page 6 of 12

NEAL, GERBER & EISENBERGLLP July 18, 2011 Invoice 188848

Statement No: 188848

r or proteosion					
Re: <u>Case A</u>	dministratio	<u>on</u>			
Jun 8, 2011	MAB		ace with D. Gutfeld status and covering on June 9.	0.10	67.00
Jun 22, 2011	MAB	Review monthly (.10).	y operating report	0.10	67.00
TIMEKEEPI	ER SUMMA	ARY			
	TIMEKEE		HOURS	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
	M. A. Berk	off	0.20	670.00	\$134.00
TOTAL HOU	RS		0.20		
TOTAL FEES					<u>\$134.00</u>
			TOTAL FEES		\$134.00

Statement No: 188848

Re:	Fee/Employment Applications

Jun 1, 2011	DMG	Review correspondence regarding Third Interim Fee Application.	0.20	95.00
Jun 1, 2011	NTB	E-mail regarding filing of Third Interim (.20); review BMC Group service list to determine if any new parties were added (.30); coordinate filing of NGE Interim and certificate of service (.40); coordinate service of NGE, Kilpatrick and FTI interim requests (.30).	1.20	300.00
Jun 14, 2011	NTB	Review docket for possible objections (.20); file and serve certificate of no objection for 10th monthly fee application (.20).	0.40	100.00
Jun 17, 2011	NTB	Begin to prepare 11th monthly fee application.	0.50	125.00
Jun 21, 2011	NTB	Prepare fee application and exhibits.	0.50	125.00
Jun 22, 2011	NTB	Draft monthly application and exhibits thereto.	3.00	750.00
Jun 23, 2011	DMG	Review/revise 11th Monthly Fee Application (.30); correspondence with N. Brody regarding same (.10).	0.40	190.00
Jun 24, 2011	NTB	Revisions to application and exhibits (.60); send electronic copy (.10); prepare and assemble application and exhibits for filing (.30); coordinate filing and service of application (.20).	1.20	300.00

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>FEES</u>
D. M. Gutfeld	0.60	475.00	\$285.00
N. Taylor Brody	6.80	250.00	\$1,700.00

7.40 TOTAL HOURS

TOTAL FEES \$1,985.00

> \$1,985.00 TOTAL FEES

NEAL, GERBER & EISENBERGLLP

July 18, 2011 Invoice 188848

Statement No: 188848

Re:	Meetings	of Creditors

Re: <u>Meetir</u>	igs of Create	<u>ors</u>		
Jun 6, 2011	DMG	Prepare for and participate in teleconference with Committee members and professionals regarding revised Plan of Reorganization and strategy with respect to same.	1.50	712.50
Jun 14, 2011	DMG	Committee Conference call to discuss outstanding issues related to Plan and related strategy (1.00); review Agenda related to Committee conference call (.10).	1.10	522.50
Jun 15, 2011	DMG	Multiple correspondence with committee members and professionals regarding negotiation of Plan and related strategy issues.	0.90	427.50
Jun 27, 2011	DMG	Conference call with Committee and Professionals regarding strategy related to Exclusivity Motion and Plan status (.80); review correspondence from T. Meyers regarding revisions to Plan (.10).	0.90	427.50
Jun 28, 2011	DMG	Review correspondence from T. Meyers to Committee regarding status of Plan and strategy related to same (.20).	0.20	95.00
TIMEKEEPI	ER SUMMA	<u>ARY</u>		
	TIMEKEEI D. M. Gutfo		<u>RATE</u> 475.00	<u>FEES</u> \$2,185.00
TOTAL HOU	RS	4.60		
TOTAL FEES	S			\$2,185.00
		TOTAL FEES		\$2,185.00

Statement No: 188848

Re:	Plan	and	Discl	osure	Statement
IXC.	ı ıaıı	anu	DISCI	USUI C	Statement

				
Jun 1, 2011	DMG	Review correspondence regarding Committee meeting with Debtor/Tricadia and related strategy for meeting with Tricadia to discuss Reorganization Plan.	0.70	332.50
Jun 2, 2011	DMG	Review Debtor's presentation regarding Reorganization Plan (.70); review correspondence related to meeting with Tricadia/Debtors to discuss Reorganization Plan (.40)	1.10	522.50
Jun 3, 2011	DMG	Review correspondence related to meeting with Tricadia to discuss Reorganization Plan and related issues (.50); review transcript from 5/26 hearing (.20) and correspondence with T. Meyers regarding same (.20).	0.90	427.50
Jun 6, 2011	MAB	Review numerous e-mails regarding proposed revisions to Plan and follow-up from NYC meeting.	0.30	201.00
Jun 6, 2011	DMG	Review open items/action list from meeting with Debtor and Tricadia with respect to Plan of Reorganization (.30) and related correspondence from T. Meyers and committee members (.60).	0.90	427.50
Jun 7, 2011	DMG	Review proposed correspondence to Tricadia/Debtors regarding Plan of Reorganization (.70) and related comments from Committee members and professionals (.60).	1.30	617.50

Jun 8, 2011	DMG	Review revised correspondence to Tricadia/Debtors regarding Plan of Reorganization (.60) and related comments from Committee members and professionals (.40).	1.00	475.00
Jun 9, 2011	MAB	Review monthly operating report (.10); fee statements (.10) and emails to the committee regarding plan developments (.10).	0.30	201.00
Jun 10, 2011	DMG	Review debtor's revision to Committee Communication and revised correspondence to Tricadia/Debtors regarding Plan of Reorganization (.60).	0.60	285.00
Jun 14, 2011	MAB	Review redlines to Plan documents and related e-mails.	0.40	268.00
Jun 14, 2011	DMG	Conference call with proposed Validator (Judge Kauffman) (.20); review comments to Plan (redline) circulated by T. Meyers and related correspondence (1.6).	1.80	855.00
Jun 15, 2011	DMG	Review Debtor's comments to revised Plan (Committee redline) and related communications.	1.20	570.00
Jun 16, 2011	DMG	Prepare for and attend Court hearing related to Debtor's Motion to Extend Exclusivity and status on Plan.	1.30	617.50
Jun 22, 2011	DMG	Review current version of Plan with Committee comments (1.0); correspond with T. Meyers regarding same and related strategy (.30).	1.30	617.50
Jun 26, 2011	DMG	Review correspondence from T. Meyers regarding Plan and timeline (.10); review redline Plan reflecting Debtor, Committee and Tricadia revisions (1.7).	1.80	855.00

NEAL, GERBER	&	EISENBERGLLP
--------------	---	--------------

July 18, 2011 Invoice 188848

Jun 27, 2011	DMG	Review additio documents.	nal revisions to Plan	0.70	332.50						
Jun 28, 2011	DMG	Motion to Exte status of Plan/I (20); review co Meyers regardi	0); review redline	2.90	1,377.50						
Jun 29, 2011	DMG	Review Plan/D (as filed).	isclosure Statement	2.50	1,187.50						
TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY											
	TIMEKEE		<u>HOURS</u>	RATE	<u>FEES</u>						
	M. A. Berk	off	1.00	670.00	\$670.00						
	D. M. Gutf	eld	20.00	475.00	\$9,500.00						
TOTAL HOU	RS		21.00								
TOTAL FEES	5				\$10,170.00						
			\$10,170.00								