Case 10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 1 of 26

EXHIBIT 1A

Case 10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 2 of 26 Timekeeper Summary Chart for Services Rendered

Timekeeper Summary Chart for Services Rendered During the Application Period

				AVERAGE	
		YEAR		HOURLY	
NAME	POSITION	LICENSED	HOURS	RATE***	FEE
Alfred S. Lurey	Partner	1967	5.60	\$740.00	\$4,144.00
Jeffrey T. Skinner	Partner	1996	0.60	\$510.00	\$306.00
Lynn E. Fowler	Partner	1986	3.50	\$650.00	\$2,275.00
Stephen A. Edwards	Partner	1978	7.80	\$550.00	\$4,290.00
Todd C. Meyers	Partner	1991	37.40	\$725.00	\$27,115.00
W. Randy Eaddy	Partner	1980	4.30	\$655.00	\$2,816.50
Michael D. Langford	Counsel	1987	2.90	\$475.00	\$1,377.50
Robbin Rahman	Associate	2000	57.70	\$420.00	\$24,234.00
Shane G. Ramsey	Associate	2006	5.00	\$365.00	\$1,825.00
La Asia S. Canty	Paralegal	N/A	16.80	\$220.00	\$3,696.00
TOTAL			<u>141.60</u>		<u>\$72,079.00</u>

BLENDED AVERAGE

HOURLY RATE \$509.03

^{***}Rates reflect increase in rates effective January 2011

Case 10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 3 of 26

EXHIBIT 1B

B120 - Business Operations Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.20	\$725.00	\$145.00
RR	Robbin Rahman	0.40	\$420.00	\$168.00
	Task Subtotal	0.60		\$313.00

B130 - Case Administration and Analysis Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.60	\$725.00	\$435.00
RR	Robbin Rahman	2.20	\$420.00	\$924.00
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	0.60	\$220.00	\$132.00
	Task Subtotal	3.40		\$1,491,00

B140 - Claims Adm. and Analysis Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.30	\$725.00	\$217.50
RR	Robbin Rahman	0.40	\$420.00	\$168.00
	Task Subtotal	0.70		\$385.50

B160 - Fee/Employment Applications Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.90	\$725.00	\$652.50
RR	Robbin Rahman	8.10	\$420.00	\$3,402.00
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	13.00	\$220.00	\$2,860.00
	Task Subtotal	22.00		\$6.914.50

B170 - Fee/Employment Objections Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.20	\$725.00	\$145.00
	Task Subtotal	0.20		\$145.00

B190 - Litigation General Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	·	
ASL	Alfred S. Lurey	5.00	\$740.00	\$3,700.00	
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	11.00	\$725.00	\$7,975.00	
MDL	Michael D. Langford	2.90	\$475.00	\$1,377.50	
SGR	Shane G. Ramsey	2.20	\$365.00	\$803.00	
RR	Robbin Rahman	14.30	\$420.00	\$6,006.00	
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	3.00	\$220.00	\$660.00	
	Task Subtotal	38.40		\$20,521.50	

B200 - Meetings of Creditors Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	2.20	\$725.00	\$1,595.00
RR	Robbin Rahman	0.90	\$420.00	\$378.00
	Task Subtotal	3.10		\$1,973.00

B210 - Plan and Disclosure Statement Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
SAE	Stephen A. Edwards	7.80	\$550.00	\$4,290.00
JTS	Jeffrey T. Skinner	0.60	\$510.00	\$306.00
WRE	W. Randy Eaddy	4.30	\$655.00	\$2,816.50
LEF	Lynn E. Fowler	3.50	\$650.00	\$2,275.00
ASL	Alfred S. Lurey	0.60	\$740.00	\$444.00
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	22.00	\$725.00	\$15,950.00
SGR	Shane G. Ramsey	2.80	\$365.00	\$1,022.00
RR	Robbin Rahman	31.40	\$420.00	\$13,188.00
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	0.20	\$220.00	\$44.00
	Task Subtotal	73.20		\$40,335.50

Case 10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 6 of 26

EXHIBIT 2

Case 10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 7 of 26 Expenses Incurred During the Application Period

DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
Airfare (coach)	\$503.40
Document Reproduction	\$35.00
Hotel	\$360.00
Long Distance Charges	\$621.40
Meals	\$59.77
Taxi/Cabs	\$199.00
Westlaw On-Line Legal Research	\$65.34
TOTAL	\$1,843.91

Case 10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 8 of 26

EXHIBIT 3



Please Remit Payments Only To: P.O. Box 945614 Atlanta, Georgia 30394 Telephone (866) 244-4934 www.kilpatricktownsend.com Fed I.D. 58-0511774

September 21, 2011

CORUS BANKSHARES CREDITORS COMMITTEE Client: 62303 C/O J.C. MATTHEWS, COMMITTE CHAIRMAN Matter: 391796 THE BANK OF NEW YORK MELLON TRUST COMPANY, Invoice #: 11213484

N.A.

601 TRAVIS, 16TH FLOOR **HOUSTON, TEXAS 77002**

RE: CORUS CREDITORS COMMITTEE

REMITTANCE PAGE

	Invoice			Interest/		
Date	Number	Fees	Disbursements	Other	Payments	Balance Due
Current	Invoice:					
9/21/11	11213484	\$72,079.00	\$1,843.91	\$0.00		\$73,922.91

Please return this page with payment Due and Payable upon receipt. 1% interest per month charged on balances after 30 days.

Bank: Wachovia Bank of Georgia Atlanta, Georgia

ABA Routing No.: 061 000 227

Credit: Kilpatrick Townsend & Stockton LLP

Please Remit Payments Only To: P.O. Box 945614 Atlanta, Georgia 30394 Telephone (866) 244-4934 www.kilpatricktownsend.com Fed I.D. 58-0511774

September 21, 2011

CORUS BANKSHARES CREDITORS COMMITTEE Client: 62303 C/O J.C. MATTHEWS, COMMITTE CHAIRMAN Matter: 391796 THE BANK OF NEW YORK MELLON TRUST COMPANY, Invoice #: 11213484

N.A.

601 TRAVIS, 16TH FLOOR HOUSTON, TEXAS 77002

RE: CORUS CREDITORS COMMITTEE

For Professional Services Through August 31, 2011:

B120 - Business Operations

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/20/2011	TCM	Review MOR.	0.20	145.00
08/22/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails of T. Meyers regarding review of securities filings (.1); review and respond to emails of L. Canty regarding same (.1); review SEC filings regarding same (.2).	0.40	168.00
		Task Subtotal	0.60	313.00

B120 - Business Operations Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.20	725.00	145.00
RR	Robbin Rahman	0.40	420.00	168.00
	Task Subtotal	0.60		313.00

Amounts are calculated per entry, rounding discrepancies may occur in summaries or totals as a result of prearranged discounts.

Other Charges include a reasonable allocation of related overhead expenses.

Due and Payable upon receipt. 1% interest per month charged on balances after 30 days.

B130 - Case Administration and Analysis

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/08/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails of T. Meyers regarding upcoming hearing (.1); draft and revise emails to local counsel and debtors' counsel regarding same (.2).	0.30	126.00
08/09/2011	TCM	Review agenda and emails regarding hearing.	0.20	145.00
08/12/2011	TCM	Review orders.	0.10	72.50
08/12/2011	LSC	Update outline of critical dates and deadlines.	0.10	22.00
08/12/2011	RR	Review and revise committee meeting minutes (March 2011 and before) (.4); draft and revise committee meeting minutes (April 2011 and after) (1.0).	1.40	588.00
08/22/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails from T. Meyers regarding upcoming hearings (.1); review agenda and docket regarding same (.2); draft and revise emails to debtor's counsel regarding same (.1); review and respond to emails from local counsel regarding attendance at same (.1).	0.50	210.00
08/22/2011	TCM	Review plan regarding same.	0.20	145.00
08/22/2011	LSC	Research and transmit information with respect to public filings of the Debtor (.4); correspondence with R. Rahman regarding same (.1).	0.50	110.00
08/23/2011	TCM	Review hearing agenda.	0.10	72.50
		Task Subtotal	3.40	1,491.00

B130 - Case Administration and Analysis Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.60	725.00	435.00
RR	Robbin Rahman	2.20	420.00	924.00
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	0.60	220.00	132.00
	Task Subtotal	3.40		1,491.00

B140 - Claims Adm. and Objections

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/05/2011	TCM	Review claim objection response.	0.10	72.50
08/21/2011	TCM	Review debtor reply to claim objection responses.	0.20	145.00
08/23/2011	RR	Review orders approving omnibus claims objections.	0.40	168.00
		Task Subtotal	0.70	385.50

B140 - Claims Adm. and Objections Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.30	725.00	217.50
RR	Robbin Rahman	0.40	420.00	168.00
	Task Subtotal	0.70		385.50

B160 - Fee/Employment Applications

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/03/2011	LSC	Revise monthly fee application of KTS (.5); revise monthly fee application of FTI (.3).	0.80	176.00
08/07/2011	TCM	Review monthly fee application and email to Robbin Rahman regarding same.	0.20	145.00
08/08/2011	LSC	Revise KTS twelfth monthly fee statement and exhibits (.9); correspondence with B. Sheets regarding same (.2); correspondence with R. Rahman regarding same (.1); revise FTI's twelfth monthly fee statement and exhibits (.3).	1.50	330.00
08/08/2011	TCM	Revise and edit monthly fee application.	0.20	145.00
08/09/2011	LSC	Revise KTS' twelfth monthly fee statement (.3); revise FTI's twelfth monthly fee statement (.3); prepare exhibits to same (.1); electronically file twelfth monthly fee statements (.3); correspondence with R. Rahman regarding same (.1).	1.10	242.00
08/09/2011	RR	Review revised applications for compensation per comments of T. Meyers (.2); draft and revise email to committee regarding filing of same (.1).	0.30	126.00
08/16/2011	RR	Review FTI interim fee application.	0.40	168.00
08/19/2011	LSC	Begin drafting thirteenth monthly fee statement.	3.90	858.00
08/22/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails from FTI regarding interim fee applications and montly applications (.3); conferences with L. Canty regarding preparation and filing of same (.2); review and respond to emails of local counsel regarding same (.1); review and respond to emails of T. Meyers regarding same (.2).	0.80	336.00
08/22/2011	LSC	Continue drafting thirteenth monthly fee statement.	1.50	330.00
08/23/2011	LSC	Continue drafting thirteenth monthly fee statement, including narratives and exhibits (1.9); research and correspondence with attorneys regarding fees and expenses (.4); prepare fourth interim fee request (.4); prepare certifications of no objection for KTS and FTI twelfth monthly fee statements and file same (.3).	3.00	660.00

62303/\$64\$6510-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Des $\varphi_{age\ 4}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 13 of 26

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/23/2011	RR	Review and revise interim fee application (1.2); review and analyze interim fee application for FTI (.7); review and revise monthly fee application (1.1); review and analyze monthly fee application for FTI (.4); telephone conferences with L. Canty regarding same (.3); draft and revise emails to T. Meyers regarding same (.1); draft and revise emails to local counsel regarding interim fee applications (.2); review and revise monthly fee applications per comments of T. Meyers (.3).	4.30	1,806.00
08/23/2011	TCM	Email exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding fee application hearing (.1); review fee application and email Robbin Rahman regarding same (.3).	0.40	290.00
08/24/2011	RR	Conferences with L. Canty, local counsel and FTI regarding interim fee applications (.2); draft and revise email to committee regarding same (.1).	0.30	126.00
08/24/2011	LSC	Communicate with R. Rahman, D. Gutfeld, and N. Brody regarding interim fee applications (.1); revise notice of KTS's fourth interim fee request (.1); draft notice of FTI's fourth interim fee request (.2); revise FTI's fourth interim fee request (.2);	0.60	132.00
08/25/2011	RR	Review and revise monthly fee applications (.2); draft and revise email to committee regarding same (.2); conferences with L. Canty regarding same (.2); draft and revise emails to debtors regarding certificates of no objection for monthly fee applications (.2); review and respond to email of local counsel regarding hearing on interim fee applications (.1).	0.90	378.00
08/26/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails from L. Canty regarding filing of monthly fee applications.	0.30	126.00
08/26/2011	LSC	Further revise thirteenth monthly fee statements of KTS and FTI (.2); file same (.2); correspondence with R. Rahman and M. Cordasco regarding same (.1).	0.50	110.00
08/30/2011	LSC	Electronically file supplement to FTI's thirteenth monthly fee statement.	0.10	22.00
08/30/2011	TCM	Email exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding FTI fee application.	0.10	72.50
08/30/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails of L. Canty regarding supplement to FTI fee application (.1); review supplemental filing (.3); review and respond to emails of T. Meyers regarding same (.4).	0.80	336.00
		Task Subtotal	22.00	6,914.50

B160 - Fee/Employment Applications Summary

Summary	Timekeep	er Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. I	Meyers	0.90	725.00	652.50
RR	Robbin R	ahman	8.10	420.00	3,402.00
LSC	La Asia S	S. Canty	13.00	220.00	2,860.00
	Task Sub	total	22.00		6,914.50
		B170 - Fee/Employmo	ent Objections		
Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
08/05/2011	TCM	Review Kinetic application.		0.20	145.00
		Task Subtotal		0.20	145.00
		B170 - Fee/Employment O	bjections Summa	ŗ y	
Summary	Timekeep	er Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. I	Meyers	0.20	725.00	145.00
	Task Sub	total	0.20		145.00
		B190 - Litigation	n General		
Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
07/30/2011	SGR	Exchange emails with T. Meyers regardsharing agreement.	arding rejection of	0.10	36.50
07/31/2011	SGR	Review plan and disclosure statement tax sharing agreement and send email same.	0 0		219.00
08/01/2011	SGR	Research and email exchanges regard issues.	ling tax refund litig	ation 1.10	401.50
08/01/2011	SGR	Exchange emails with T. Meyers regardsharing agreement.	arding rejection of	0.10	36.50
08/03/2011	MDL	E-mail correspondence with Todd Morefund litigation and interrogatories a (.1); review debtor's draft tax refund and discovery documents from other make suggested revisions and addition complaint and answer in the tax refur conference with Robbin Rahman regardences (.1).	and document requed discovery document similar litigation are ons thereto (1.2); re- and litigation (.7);	ests ts nd	997.50

62303/\$64\$6510-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Des $\varphi_{age\ 6}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 15 of 26

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/03/2011	SGR	Research regarding tax refund litigation issues and exchange emails regarding same.	0.30	109.50
08/03/2011	RR	Draft and revise email to counsel for Tricadia regarding class action settlement and related materials (.5); conferences with T. Meyers regarding same (.1).	0.60	252.00
08/03/2011	TCM	Exchange with Gerard Catelanello regarding D&O issues (.1); email David Seligman regarding same (.1); exchange with Martha Tun regarding FDIC discovery requests (.1); conference with Mike Langford regarding reviewing same (.2); review debtor and FDIC discovery requests (.6); telephone conference with Gerard Catellanello regarding D&O issues (.4); conference with Al Lurey regarding same (.1); email exchange with Gerard Catalanello regarding D&O materials (.1).	1.70	1,232.50
08/03/2011	LSC	Research regarding litigation actions and tax matters (1.7); transmit documents and pleadings to M. Langford (.4); correspondence with same regarding same (.2).	2.30	506.00
08/04/2011	MDL	Review draft discovery requests for tax refund litigation and make suggested revisions thereto.	0.70	332.50
08/05/2011	MDL	Review e-mail message from counsel for holding company regarding tax refund litigation discovery requests.	0.10	47.50
08/05/2011	TCM	Email exchanges with Marla Tun regarding discovery (.1); telephone call with counsel from similar case regarding tax agreement issues (.5).	0.60	435.00
08/06/2011	ASL	Review Hindman research memorandum regarding tax sharing policy in preparation for telephone conference with cousel in case with similar issues.	0.30	222.00
08/08/2011	ASL	Conference call with counsel in case, involving similar issues regarding arguments about ownership of tax refunds in cases where there is a tax sharing policy rather than a tax sharing agreement.	0.40	296.00
08/08/2011	TCM	Review research regarding unsigned tax sharing agreements.	0.50	362.50
08/09/2011	TCM	Email exchanges with Triacadia counsel regarding D&O issues.	0.20	145.00
08/09/2011	RR	Draft and revise email to counsel for Tricadia regarding class action settlement issue.	0.20	84.00
08/10/2011	ASL	Review cases regarding whether any NOL exists at subsidiary level when corporate group files consolidated tax returns (2.7); e-mail memorandum to Mr. Fowler and Mr. Meyers regarding UDI and Marvel cases (1.6).	4.30	3,182.00

62303/\$64\$6510-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Des $\varphi_{age\ 7}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 16 of 26

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/10/2011	TCM	Analyze injunction issues (.6); conference with Al Lurey regarding same (.2).	0.80	580.00
08/12/2011	TCM	Continue injunction analysis.	0.50	362.50
08/15/2011	TCM	Email Tricadia counsel regarding D&O issues.	0.10	72.50
08/20/2011	TCM	Exchange with Tricadia counsel regarding litigation status.	0.10	72.50
08/22/2011	TCM	Email Robbin Rahman regarding SEC filings (.1); conference with Al Lurey regarding injunction (.1); review pleadings regarding possible injunction action (.7); review analysis of board minutes (1.2).	2.10	1,522.50
08/23/2011	LSC	Research, retrieve, and transmit documents with respect to the Colonial plan and confirmation for use in Corus.	0.50	110.00
08/23/2011	RR	Draft and revise email to T. Meyers regarding class action.	0.10	42.00
08/23/2011	TCM	Email exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding injunction action (.1); further work on same (.3).	0.40	290.00
08/24/2011	TCM	Conferences with Robbin Rahman regarding injunction action and work on same.	0.60	435.00
08/24/2011	RR	Telephone conference with T. Meyers regarding class action settlement and related matters (.3); review class action settlement regarding mechanics of same (.8);draft and revise email to T. Meyers regarding deadlines and milestones for same (.4); draft and revise draft demand letter regarding enjoining settlement (1.7); telephone conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2); draft and revise motion for derivative standing regarding same (1.1).	4.50	1,890.00
08/25/2011	RR	Review and revise demand letter regarding class action settlement (.9); draft and revise email to T. Meyers regarding same (.1); draft and revise motion for derivative standing (3.4).	4.40	1,848.00
08/26/2011	RR	Draft and revise motion for derivative standing.	1.60	672.00
08/26/2011	TCM	Work on injunction possibility.	0.40	290.00
08/26/2011	LSC	Retrieve, print, and transmit pleadings for T. Meyers for use in Corus.	0.20	44.00

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/29/2011	TCM	Email exchange with Tricadia counsel regarding injunction (.2); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.1); review Marla Tun email regarding discovery responses (.1); review discovery responses and conference with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.4); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding his call with Marla Tun regarding discovery responses (.1); conference with Al Lurey and review NetBank and Colonial regarding contract rejection issue (.8); email exchange with Jeff Gettlemen regarding repudiation by FDIC (.1); further research regarding rejection issues (.8).	2.60	1,885.00
08/29/2011	RR	Review and analyze discovery responses of debtor (1.1); conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2); telephone conference with M. Tun regarding revisions to same (.4); review and analyze revised discovery responses (.5).	2.20	924.00
08/30/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails of T. Meyers regarding debtor's discovery responses (.2); draft and revise emails to M. Tun regarding debtor's discovery responses (.3).	0.50	210.00
08/30/2011	TCM	Review revised discovery response and conference with Robbin Rahman regarding same.	0.20	145.00
08/31/2011	TCM	Conference with Robbin Rahman regarding interrogatory responses (.1); review final versions of same (.1).	0.20	145.00
08/31/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails of T. Meyers regarding Debtors discovery responses .	0.20	84.00
		Task Subtotal	38.40	20,521.50

B190 - Litigation General Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
ASL	Alfred S. Lurey	5.00	740.00	3,700.00
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	11.00	725.00	7,975.00
MDL	Michael D. Langford	2.90	475.00	1,377.50
SGR	Shane G. Ramsey	2.20	365.00	803.00
RR	Robbin Rahman	14.30	420.00	6,006.00

Summary	Timekeep	er Name Hours	Ra	ate/Hour	Amount
LSC	La Asia S	3.00 3.00		220.00	660.00
	Task Sub	total 38.40			20,521.50
		B200 - Meetings of Creditors			
Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
08/03/2011	TCM	Email committee regarding disclosure statement hearing pending issues (.2); exchanges regarding committee m (.1).	_	0.30	217.50
08/08/2011	RR	Telephone conference with committee (.6); follow-up conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.1).		0.70	294.00
08/08/2011	TCM	Prepare for committee call (.6); committee call (.6); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.1).		1.30	942.50
08/29/2011	TCM	Lengthy email memo to committee regarding various	issues.	0.50	362.50
08/29/2011	RR	Review and respond to email of T. Meyers regarding to committee.	update	0.20	84.00
08/31/2011	TCM	Email committee regarding call.		0.10	72.50
		Task Subtotal		3.10	1,973.00
		B200 - Meetings of Creditors Summary	7		
Summary	Timekeep	er Name Hours	Ra	ate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. I	Meyers 2.20		725.00	1,595.00
RR	Robbin R	ahman 0.90		420.00	378.00
	Task Sub	total 3.10			1,973.00
		B210 - Plan and Disclosure Statement			
Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
08/01/2011	SGR	Review plan and disclosure statement regarding reject tax sharing agreement and send email to T. Meyers resame.		0.60	219.00
08/01/2011	SAE	Review offering documents.		1.30	715.00

Prepare for meeting with potential creditor designee and

meeting regarding same.

1.00

725.00

08/02/2011 TCM

$_{62303/}$ ඉඉදු10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc $_{\mathrm{ge}\ 10}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 19 of 26

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/03/2011	TCM	Email exchanges with David Seligman regarding FDIC objections (.2); review preliminary research regarding loan issue revised by FDIC (.5); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding various plan issues (.2); email committee regarding disclosure statement hearing and pending issues (.2); review FDIC loan agreement in Downey case (.3).	1.40	1,015.00
08/03/2011	RR	Review email from T. Meyers regarding disclosure statement hearing and related disclosure statement language (.2); conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.1).	0.30	126.00
08/03/2011	SAE	Correspondence and telephone conversations with Mr. Rahmann regarding CDO documentation (.1); review of same (1.5).	1.60	880.00
08/05/2011	RR	Review solicitation procedures and draft summary of schedule (1.0); draft and revise emails to S. Edwards regarding CDO review (.2).	1.20	504.00
08/05/2011	TCM	Email David Seligman regarding FDIC objections (.1); review plan regarding creditor designee role (.2).	0.30	217.50
08/07/2011	TCM	Review schedule of dates (.1); email to Robbin Rahman regarding certain deadlines (.1).	0.20	145.00
08/08/2011	RR	Draft and revise email to debtors regarding plan and indenture trustee fees issue.	0.20	84.00
08/08/2011	TCM	Telephone conference with FTI regarding status (.3); review emails to David Seligman regarding distributions (.1).	0.40	290.00
08/09/2011	TCM	Email exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding distribution issue.	0.10	72.50
08/10/2011	TCM	Email exchanges regarding distribution issues (.2); email exchanges with David Seligman regarding various issues (.2).	0.40	290.00
08/10/2011	LSC	Calendar additional critical dates and deadlines with respect to the Plan.	0.20	44.00
08/10/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails from committee members regarding indenture trustee fees issue and call regarding same (.5); telephone conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.1); draft and revise email summary of issues for counsel for debtors (.4).	1.00	420.00
08/11/2011	RR	Telephone conference with counsel for debtors regarding plan supplement (.3); conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.1); draft and revise email regarding committee designee and other matters (.4).	0.80	336.00

62303/ඉඉදු10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Descape 11 Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 20 of 26

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/11/2011	SAE	Review documents relating to CDO holders of Corus Trust securities provided by Kirkland & Ellis, including Collateral Management Agreements and Private Placement Memoranda for PreTSL Trusts (4.7); telephone call with Mr. Rahman (.2).	4.90	2,695.00
08/11/2011	TCM	Review Section 1121 motion (.2); exchanges with Gene Davis regarding plan issues (.2); exchanges with David Seligman regarding same (.2); telephone conference with David Seligman regarding same (.3); review disclosure statement regarding issues (.3).	1.20	870.00
08/15/2011	TCM	Email exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding exclusivity motion (.2); review email regarding plan supplement (.1).	0.30	217.50
08/15/2011	RR	Review and analyze motion to extend exclusive period (.5); draft and revise email to T. Meyers summarizing issues regarding same(.4); review and analyze plan supplement (.4).	1.30	546.00
08/15/2011	LEF	E-mail correspondence with Mr. Meyers (.1); review plan documents (1.2).	1.30	845.00
08/16/2011	RR	Telephone conference with debtors and committee members regarding distribution rules for DTC participants (.5); review and analyze Plan Supplement (2.3); telephone conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2); draft and revise summary of comments for T. Meyers (.3); review and respond to emails from working group regarding same (.3).	3.60	1,512.00
08/16/2011	TCM	Call with debtor and trustees regarding distribution issues (.7); prepare for same (.2); exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding plan supplement issues (.2); review same (1.0); conferences with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.2); exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding Section 1121 hearing (.1); exchange with Gene Davis regarding fee issue (.1); email Lynn Fowler regarding plan supplement (.1).	2.60	1,885.00
08/17/2011	WRE	Emails from Todd Meyers regarding review of governance documents relating to stock being issues to unsecured creditors (.2); review `regarding same and portions of Plan Supplement, and email to Todd Meyers regarding preliminary analysis of same (1.3).	1.50	982.50

$_{62303/}$ ඉඉදු10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc $_{\mathrm{ge}\ 12}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 21 of 26

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/17/2011	RR	Review summary of distribution procedures for DTC participants (.4); telephone conference with K. Martin regarding same (.3); review and respond to emails from T. Meyers regarding same (.2); draft and revise email to Committee regarding same (.2); review and respond to emails from working group regarding comments to Plan Supplement (.3); review and analyze Plan Supplement (.8); draft and revise email to counsel for Debtors regarding comments to Plan Supplement (.4); review and respond to emails from working group regarding additional comments to same (.3); review and analyze email from J. Skinner regarding investment guidelines (.3); draft and revise proposed email to debtors regarding investment guidelines (.6)	3.80	1,596.00
08/17/2011	TCM	Exchanges regarding plan distribution issues (.2); review email regarding Charter and conference with Lynn Fowler regarding same (.2); review Robbin Rahman email regarding distribution (.1); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.1); emails to Randy Eaddy and Jeff Skinner regarding supplement review for securities and investment issues (.2); conferences regarding same (.4); telephone conference with Steve Cimalore regarding IT fees issue (.2).	1.40	1,015.00
08/17/2011	JTS	Reviewing proposed investment policy (.4); draft email regarding same (.2).	0.60	306.00
08/17/2011	LEF	Review organizational documents (1.1); e-mail correspondence with Mr. Meyers regarding issues (.2).	1.40	910.00
08/18/2011	TCM	Exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding plan supplement (.2); exchange with Jeff Cohen regarding plan (.1); exchanges with Jim Lewis regarding indenture trustee fee issue (.2); telephone conference with Jeff Cohen regarding plan questions (.4); telephone conference with FTI regarding same (.3); calls with Randy Eaddy and Robbin Rahman regarding corporate securities issues implicated by plan supplement (.7); review indenture trustee emails regarding distribution (.2).	2.10	1,522.50
08/18/2011	RR	Telephone conference with T. Meyers and R. Eaddy regarding Plan Supplement (.4); telephone conference with counsel for debtor regarding same (.3); follow-up conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.1); draft and revise email to counsel for Debtor regarding comments to plan supplement (.4); review revised plan supplement (1.2); conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2).	2.60	1,092.00

62303/ඉඉදු10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc $_{\rm ge}$ $_{13}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 22 of 26

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/18/2011	WRE	Review portions of draft Plan and Plan Supplement, and related draft post-confirmation governance documents, for Reorganized Debtor to analyze rights of Class A and Class B holders (1.6); telephone conference with and emails to Todd Meyers et al regarding same (.7).	2.30	1,506.50
08/19/2011	WRE	Follow up with Robbin Rahman regarding changes to draft Plan and Plan Supplement.	0.50	327.50
08/19/2011	RR	Draft and revise summary of comments to plan supplement (.6); telephone conference with counsel for debtor's regarding same (.5); review and respond to emails from Debtors regarding same (.3); conferences with T. Meyers regarding same (.4); review and analyze revised plan supplement and exhibits regarding comments (1.0).	2.80	1,176.00
08/19/2011	TCM	Conference with Robbin Rahman regarding rejection of tax policy (.2); review BMC email regarding distribution issue (.1); review various email exchanges regarding plan supplement changes and review same (1.8); email Jeff Cohen regarding answers to inquiries (.1).	2.20	1,595.00
08/19/2011	LEF	Review revised Plan of Reorganization (.5); e-mail correspondence with Mr. Rahman (.2).	0.80	520.00
08/21/2011	TCM	Review hearing agenda (.1); exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding Section 1121 motion (.1).	0.20	145.00
08/22/2011	ASL	Review e-mail from Mr. Rahman regarding plan supplement.	0.20	148.00
08/22/2011	TCM	Review email to committee regarding supplement (.1); email David Seligman regarding status (.1).	0.20	145.00
08/22/2011	RR	Draft and revise email to committee regarding plan supplement and remaining issues (.4); review and respond to question from FTI regarding outstanding issues (.2); conference with S. Ramsey regarding assumption/rejection of tax sharing agreement from Colonial (.1); review email and attachments from S. Ramsey regarding same (.4).	1.10	462.00
08/23/2011	TCM	Email exchange with David Seligman regarding FDIC objection status.	0.10	72.50
08/24/2011	TCM	Email exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding distribution issues (.2); further exchanges with committee members regarding distributions (.2); look into post-confirmation issues (.3).	0.70	507.50
08/24/2011	RR	Draft and revise email to committee regarding explanation of DTC issues for cash electors (.1); draft and revise email to BMC regarding additional questions (.1); review and analyze response from BMC regarding same (.3); draft and revise email to M. Pollio regarding same (.1).	0.60	252.00

62303/ඉඉදු10-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 Desc $_{\rm ge}$ $_{14}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 23 of 26

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
08/25/2011	RR	Conference with S. Ramsey regarding similar FDIC objection in Harrington bankruptcy case (.3); review and analyze objection of FDIC regarding same (.8); review debtors response to FDIC objection to disclosure statement (.4); telephone conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2); draft and respond to emails from debtors regarding coordination of response to same (.5).	2.20	924.00
08/25/2011	TCM	Review Section 1121 order (.1); email exchanges with Robbin Rahman and David Seligman regarding FDIC objection in Harrington that implicate same plan issues as Corus and review same (.7).	0.80	580.00
08/26/2011	TCM	Conferences with Al Lurey and Robbin Rahman regarding FDIC objection response (.5); further conferences with Shane Ramsey and Robbin Rahman regarding same (.5).	1.00	725.00
08/26/2011	RR	Review and analyze FDIC objection in Harrington, FDIC objection to disclosure statement (.8); review indenture regarding same (.4); conference with S. Ramsey regarding status of Harrington case (.2); conference with S. Ramsey and T. Meyers regarding strategy with respect to same (.5); review and respond to emails of S. Ramsey regarding same (.1); review and respond to emails of Debtors regarding scheduling of call regarding same (.2).	2.20	924.00
08/26/2011	ASL	Telephone conference with Mr. Meyers regarding FDIC's subordination agreement with respect to tax refund.	0.20	148.00
08/29/2011	RR	Telephone conference with counsel to debtors regarding post- effective date trading of securities (.3); review and respond to emails of T. Meyers regarding same (.2); telephone conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2); draft and respond to emails of M. Pollio regarding same (.4); telephone conference with Debtors regarding arguments in response to FDIC objection to plan (.6); follow-up conference with S. Ramsey and T. Meyers regarding same (.2).	1.90	798.00
08/29/2011	SGR	Teleconference with Tricadia regarding plan issues (.3); teleconference with Kirkland regarding same (.6); address issues regarding same (.6).	1.50	547.50
08/29/2011	TCM	Call with Kirkland & Ellis regarding plan issues (.6); conference with Robbin Rahman and Shane Ramsey regarding same (.2); email exchange with Gene Davis regarding fees (.1); email exchanges regarding claim assignment issues under plan (.2); telephone conferences with Shane Ramsey and Vik Ghei regarding open issues (.3).	1.40	1,015.00

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount		
08/30/2011	TCM	Email exchange with Jeff Gettlemen regarding FDIC objection (.1); review Marie Pollio email regarding distributions (.1); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.2); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding distribution and trading issues (.2); email Robbin Rahman regarding substantial contribution claims (.1); email exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding transfer restrictions (.1); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding various plan issues (.3); call with Kirkland & Ellis regarding FDIC objection (.5); email exchanges with Jeff Gettlemen regarding plan objection responses (.2); research regarding same (.8); email exchanges with Shane Ramsey and Robbin Rahman regarding changing lien issue (.2).	2.80	2,030.00		
08/30/2011	SGR	Exchange emails regarding plan confirmation issues and research issues regarding same.	0.40	146.00		
08/30/2011	ASL	Conference with Mr. Meyers regarding rejection of TSA.	0.20	148.00		
08/30/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails from debtors and T. Meyers regarding trading of claims (.3); draft and revise emails to M. Pollio regarding same (.2); telephone conference with Debtors regarding same (.6); follow-up telephone conference with M. Pollio regarding same (.2); follow-up telephone conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2); review plan supplement regarding trading restrictions and draft and revise emails to T. Meyers regarding same (.7); telephone conference with T. Meyers and debtors regarding FDIC objections to plan (.5); review indenture and related documents regarding priority issues (1.2); review FDIC disclosure statement objection and Harrington objection (.4).	4.30	1,806.00		
08/31/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails of V. Ghei regarding trading restrictions (.2); draft and revise email to T. Meyers regarding same (.1); review Wilmington Indenture regarding priority of charging liens and related issues (1.0); conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2).	1.50	630.00		
08/31/2011	SGR	Research regarding plan confirmation issues and indenture trustee fees payment and exchange emails regarding same.	0.30	109.50		
08/31/2011	TCM	Email exchanges with Vik Ghei and Robbin Rahman regarding assignment of claims (.2); review indentures regarding subordination issues (1.0).	1.20	870.00		
		Task Subtotal	73.20	40,335.50		
	B210 - Plan and Disclosure Statement Summary					

B210 - Plan and Disclosure Statement Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
SAE	Stephen A. Edwards	7.80	550.00	4,290.00

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
JTS	Jeffrey T. Skinner	0.60	510.00	306.00
WRE	W. Randy Eaddy	4.30	655.00	2,816.50
LEF	Lynn E. Fowler	3.50	650.00	2,275.00
ASL	Alfred S. Lurey	0.60	740.00	444.00
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	22.00	725.00	15,950.00
SGR	Shane G. Ramsey	2.80	365.00	1,022.00
RR	Robbin Rahman	31.40	420.00	13,188.00
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	0.20	220.00	44.00
	Task Subtotal	73.20		40,335.50

All Tasks Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name		Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
WRE	W. R. Eaddy		4.30	655.00	2,816.50
SAE	S. A. Edwards		7.80	550.00	4,290.00
LEF	L. E. Fowler		3.50	650.00	2,275.00
ASL	A. S. Lurey		5.60	740.00	4,144.00
TCM	T. C. Meyers		37.40	725.00	27,115.00
JTS	J. T. Skinner		0.60	510.00	306.00
MDL	M. D. Langford		2.90	475.00	1,377.50
RR	Robbin Rahman		57.70	420.00	24,234.00
SGR	Shane G. Ramsey		5.00	365.00	1,825.00
LSC	La Asia S. Canty		16.80	220.00	3,696.00
		Totals	141.60		\$72,079.00

Other Charges:

07/27/2011	Airfare expense of Todd C. Meyers for a trip to Chicago on 27 Jul 2011 - 28 Jul 2011	503.40
07/27/2011	Hotel expense of Todd C. Meyers for a trip to Chicago on 27 Jul 2011	360.00
07/27/2011	Meal expense of Todd C. Meyers on 27 Jul 2011 - 28 Jul 2011	59.77
07/27/2011	Taxi/Cabs expense of Todd C. Meyers on 27 Jul 2011 regarding	199.00
08/03/2011	Westlaw On-Line Legal Research	65.34

62303/\$9459610-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 De\$62303/\$9459610-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 De\$62303/\$9459610-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 De\$62303/\$9459610-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 De\$62303/\$959610-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 De\$62303/\$959610-26881 Doc 690-1 Filed 10/03/11 Entered 10/03/11 14:33:41 De\$62303/\$959610-26881 De\$9610-26881 De\$9610-26881 Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 26 of 26

Other Charges:

08/11/2011 Miscellaneous - Intercall 621.40

Document Reproduction 31.90

Document Reproduction 3.10

Total Other Charges \$1,843.91

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE \$73,922.91