Case 10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 1 of 21

EXHIBIT 1A

Case 10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 2 of 21 Timekeeper Summary Chart for Services Rendered

Timekeeper Summary Chart for Services Rendered During the Application Period

(By Timekeeper)

				AVERAGE	
		YEAR		HOURLY	
NAME	POSITION	LICENSED	HOURS	RATE***	FEE
Alfred S. Lurey	Partner	1967	1.10	\$740.00	\$814.00
Todd C. Meyers	Partner	1991	5.40	\$362.50	\$1,957.50
Todd C. Meyers	Partner	1991	40.90	\$725.00	\$29,652.50
Robbin Rahman	Associate	2000	5.80	\$210.00	\$1,218.00
Robbin Rahman	Associate	2000	54.30	\$420.00	\$22,806.00
Shane G. Ramsey	Associate	2006	12.00	\$365.00	\$4,380.00
La Asia S. Canty	Paralegal	N/A	11.70	\$220.00	\$2,574.00
TOTAL			<u>131.20</u>		<u>\$63,402.00</u>

BLENDED AVERAGE HOURLY RATE

\$483.25

^{***}Rates reflect increase in rates effective January 2011

Case 10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 3 of 21

EXHIBIT 1B

Case 10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 4 of 21 Timekeeper Summary by Task Code

B120 - Business Operations Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.10	725.00	\$72.50
	Task Subtotal	0.10		\$72.50

B130 - Case Administration and Analysis Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.30	725.00	\$217.50
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	0.40	220.00	\$88.00
	Task Subtotal	0.70		\$305.50

B140 - Claims Adm. and Analysis Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.20	725.00	\$145.00
	Task Subtotal	0.20		\$145.00

B160 - Fee/Employment Applications Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.30	725.00	\$217.50
RR	Robbin Rahman	1.50	420.00	\$630.00
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	6.00	220.00	\$1,320.00
	Task Subtotal	7.80		\$2,167.50

B170 - Fee/Employment Objections Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.20	725.00	\$145.00
	Task Subtotal	0.20		\$145.00

B190 - Litigation General Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
ASL	Alfred S. Lurey	0.90	740.00	\$666.00
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	0.10	725.00	\$72.50
	Task Subtotal	1.00		\$738.50

B200 - Meetings of Creditors Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	5.70	725.00	\$4,132.50
RR	Robbin Rahman	0.20	420.00	\$84.00
	Task Subtotal	5.90		\$4.216.50

B210 - Plan and Disclosure Statement Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
ASL	Alfred S. Lurey	0.20	740.00	\$148.00
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	34.00	725.00	\$24,650.00
SGR	Shane G. Ramsey	12.00	365.00	\$4,380.00
RR	Robbin Rahman	52.60	420.00	\$22,092.00
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	5.30	220.00	\$1,166.00
	Task Subtotal	104.10		\$52,436.00

B310 - Travel Time Summary

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. Meyers	5.40	362.50	\$1,957.50
RR	Robbin Rahman	5.80	210.00	\$1,218.00
	Task Subtotal	11.20		\$3,175.50

Case 10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 6 of 21

EXHIBIT 2

Case 10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 7 of 21 Expenses Incurred During the Application Period

DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
Document Reproduction	\$9.70
Lexis On-Line Legal Research	\$4.24
Long Distance Charges	\$572.34
Westlaw On-Line Legal Research	\$630.95
TOTAL	\$1,217.23

Case 10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Desc Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 8 of 21

EXHIBIT 3



Please Remit Payments Only To: P.O. Box 945614 Atlanta, Georgia 30394 Telephone (866) 244-4934 www.kilpatricktownsend.com Fed I.D. 58-0511774

Credit: Kilpatrick Townsend & Stockton LLP

Account No.: 2000131592388

Swift Code: PNBPUS33

October 11, 2011

CORUS BANKSHARES CREDITORS COMMITTEE Client: 62303 C/O J.C. MATTHEWS, COMMITTE CHAIRMAN Matter: 391796 THE BANK OF NEW YORK MELLON TRUST COMPANY, Invoice #: 11218859

N.A.

601 TRAVIS, 16TH FLOOR HOUSTON, TEXAS 77002

RE: CORUS CREDITORS COMMITTEE

REMITTANCE PAGE

	Invoice			Interest/		
Date	Number	Fees	Disbursements	Other	Payments	Balance Due
Current 1	Invoice:					
10/11/11	11218859	\$63,402.00	\$1,217.23	\$0.00		\$64,619.23

Please return this page with payment
Due and Payable upon receipt. 1% interest per month charged on balances after 30 days.

Bank: Wachovia Bank of Georgia Atlanta, Georgia

ABA Routing No.: 061 000 227

Please Remit Payments Only To: P.O. Box 945614 Atlanta, Georgia 30394 Telephone (866) 244-4934 www.kilpatricktownsend.com Fed I.D. 58-0511774

October 11, 2011

CORUS BANKSHARES CREDITORS COMMITTEE

Client: Matter: 62303 391796

C/O J.C. MATTHEWS, COMMITTE CHAIRMAN THE BANK OF NEW YORK MELLON TRUST COMPANY,

Invoice #: 11218859

N.A.

601 TRAVIS, 16TH FLOOR HOUSTON, TEXAS 77002

RE: CORUS CREDITORS COMMITTEE

For Professional Services Through September 30, 2011:

B120 - Business Operations

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
09/22/2011	TCM	Review MOR.	0.10	72.50
		Task Subtotal	0.10	72.50
		B120 - Business Operations Summary		
Summary	Timekeep	er Name Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. 1	Meyers 0.10	725.00	72.50
	Task Sub	total 0.10		72.50
		B130 - Case Administration and Analysis		
Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
09/13/2011	TCM	Email exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding SEC filing	s. 0.10	72.50
09/15/2011	TCM	eview email regarding bondholder inquiry (.1); conference 0.20 ith Robbin Rahman regarding same (.1).		145.00
09/22/2011	LSC	Review master service list, compare, and update service list	t. 0.40	88.00

Amounts are calculated per entry, rounding discrepancies may occur in summaries or totals as a result of prearranged discounts.

Other Charges include a reasonable allocation of related overhead expenses.

Due and Payable upon receipt. 1% interest per month charged on balances after 30 days.

Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
		Task Subtotal		0.70	305.50
		B130 - Case Administration a	nd Analysis Sumn	nary	
Summary	Timekeep	er Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. I	Meyers	0.30	725.00	217.50
LSC	La Asia S	S. Canty	0.40	220.00	88.00
	Task Sub	total	0.70		305.50
		B140 - Claims Adm. a	nd Objections		
Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
09/02/2011	TCM	Review Dumbroski claim.		0.10	72.50
09/27/2011	TCM	Voicemail from creditor and email Rosame.	bbin Rahman rega	arding 0.10	72.50
		Task Subtotal		0.20	145.00
		B140 - Claims Adm. and O	bjections Summai	ry	
Summary	Timekeep	er Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. I	Meyers	0.20	725.00	145.00
	Task Sub	total	0.20		145.00
		B160 - Fee/Employmer	nt Applications		
Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
09/12/2011	RR	Review and revise certificates of no o (.2); draft and revise email to counsel same (.1).		·	126.00
09/12/2011	LSC	Draft CNOs for thirteenth monthly fee	e statements.	0.20	44.00
09/13/2011	LSC	Revise and file CNOs regarding thirte statements.	enth monthly fee	0.10	22.00
09/21/2011	LSC	Begin drafting fourteenth monthly fee	statement.	1.60	352.00
09/22/2011	LSC	Continue drafting fourteenth monthly revise FTI's fourteenth monthly and p service (.3).			264.00
09/23/2011	LSC	Continue drafting fourteenth monthly narrative and exhibits.	fee statement, incl	uding 2.90	638.00

Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
09/30/2011	RR	Review and revise monthly fee applic (1.0); conference with L. Canty regard		1 FTI 1.20	504.00
09/30/2011	TCM	Review fee application.		0.30	217.50
		Task Subtotal		7.80	2,167.50
		B160 - Fee/Employment App	plications Summa	ry	
Summary	Timekeep	er Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. I	Meyers	0.30	725.00	217.50
RR	Robbin R	ahman	1.50	420.00	630.00
LSC	La Asia S	S. Canty	6.00	220.00	1,320.00
	Task Sub	total	7.80		2,167.50
		B170 - Fee/Employme	nt Objections		
Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
09/05/2011	TCM	Review Kinectic application.		0.20	145.00
		Task Subtotal		0.20	145.00
		B170 - Fee/Employment Ob	ojections Summar	·y	
Summary	Timekeep		ojections Summan	r y Rate/Hour	Amount
Summary TCM	Timekeep	per Name			<i>Amount</i> 145.00
•		ver Name Meyers	Hours	Rate/Hour	
•	Todd C. I	ver Name Meyers	Hours 0.20 0.20	Rate/Hour	145.00
•	Todd C. I	ner Name Meyers Intotal	Hours 0.20 0.20	Rate/Hour	145.00
TCM	Todd C. I Task Sub Initials	er Name Meyers Itotal B190 - Litigation	#Ours 0.20 0.20 General	Rate/Hour 725.00 Hours	145.00 145.00
TCM Date	Todd C. I Task Sub Initials TCM	Meyers Mototal B190 - Litigation Description Email exchange with David Seligman	Hours 0.20 0.20 General regarding tax refu	### Rate/Hour 725.00 Hours	145.00 145.00 Amount
TCM Date 09/14/2011	Todd C. I Task Sub Initials TCM	Meyers Intotal B190 - Litigation Description Email exchange with David Seligman arguments in Bankunited. Review debtor's draft response to FDI confirmation (.5); conference with Mr	Hours 0.20 0.20 General regarding tax refu	### Rate/Hour 725.00 Hours	145.00 145.00 Amount 72.50
TCM Date 09/14/2011	Todd C. I Task Sub Initials TCM	Meyers Intotal B190 - Litigation Description Email exchange with David Seligman arguments in Bankunited. Review debtor's draft response to FDI confirmation (.5); conference with Mr suggested revisions to same (.4).	Hours 0.20 0.20 Ceneral regarding tax refu C's objection to place. Meyers regarding	### Rate/Hour 725.00 ### Hours 10	145.00 145.00 Amount 72.50 666.00
TCM Date 09/14/2011	Todd C. I Task Sub Initials TCM	Meyers Intotal B190 - Litigation Description Email exchange with David Seligman arguments in Bankunited. Review debtor's draft response to FDI confirmation (.5); conference with Mr suggested revisions to same (.4). Task Subtotal B190 - Litigation General contents and the supplication of the supplic	Hours 0.20 0.20 Ceneral regarding tax refu C's objection to place. Meyers regarding	### Rate/Hour 725.00 ### Hours 10	145.00 145.00 Amount 72.50 666.00

Summary	Timekeep	er Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. N	Meyers	0.10	725.00	72.50
	Task Sub	total	1.00		738.50
		B200 - Meetings of	Creditors		
Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
09/02/2011	TCM	Committee call (1.0); prepare for same Rahman regarding same (.1); draft emergarding FDIC objection and strategy	ail memo to comm		1,377.50
09/03/2011	TCM	Email exchange with Walter Curchack objection.	regarding FDIC	0.10	72.50
09/05/2011	TCM	Review Doug Spelfogel email regarding	ng IT fee issue.	0.10	72.50
09/06/2011	TCM	Prepare for committee call (.3); commemails to committee regarding status (iew 0.90	652.50
09/07/2011	TCM	Exchanges with Doug Spelfogel regard review Walter Curchack email regardi	_	(.1); 0.20	145.00
09/15/2011	TCM	Draft email to committee regarding va	rious issues.	0.40	290.00
09/21/2011	TCM	Email exchanges regarding committee	meeting.	0.10	72.50
09/22/2011	TCM	Prepare for committee call (.3); comm committee regarding various issues (.3		ail 1.20	870.00
09/26/2011	TCM	Conference with Robbin Rahman regal (.1); conference with committee members (.5).	_		435.00
09/28/2011	TCM	Email committee regarding hearing.		0.20	145.00
09/30/2011	RR	Attention to contacting committee mendiscuss next steps.	mbers regarding c	eall to 0.20	84.00
		Task Subtotal		5.90	4,216.50
		B200 - Meetings of Cred	itors Summary		
Summary	Timekeep	er Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C. I	Meyers	5.70	725.00	4,132.50

420.00

0.20

5.90

84.00

4,216.50

RR

Robbin Rahman

Task Subtotal

B210 - Plan and Disclosure Statement

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
09/01/2011	TCM	Conference with Al Lurey and research regarding subordination issue (1.5); telephone conference with Dan Brown regarding FDIC response (.2); emails regarding plan supplement (.1).	1.80	1,305.00
09/01/2011	ASL	Conference with Mr. Meyers regarding subordination provisions.	0.20	148.00
09/02/2011	RR	Telephone conference with committee regarding FDIC objections and related matters.	1.00	420.00
09/02/2011	TCM	Review revised plan supplement and emails regarding same (.4); exchange with Dan Brown regarding voting report (.1); review FDIC objection (.3); telephone conference with Dan Brown regarding same (.2).	1.00	725.00
09/05/2011	TCM	Research regarding 1129 (a)(4) and email exchanges with Shane Ramsey and Robbin Rahman regarding same (.8); email exchanges with Kirkland & Ellis regarding IT fee issues (.3).	1.10	797.50
09/05/2011	SGR	Exchange emails with T. Meyers and R. Rahman regarding payment of indenture trustee fees in plan (.2); research and draft memorandum regarding same (3.4).	3.60	1,314.00
09/06/2011	SGR	Continue researching various cases regarding payment of indenture trustee fees and draft memorandum regarding same.	7.60	2,774.00
09/06/2011	LSC	Legal research with respect to the plan at the request of S. Ramsey.	1.80	396.00
09/06/2011	RR	Review and analyze emails of T. Meyers regarding discussions with debtor and alternatives with respect to plan provisions (.3); conference with S. Ramsey regarding memo on IT fees in other cases (.3); review WaMu decision and WaMu docket regarding same (1.3); telephone conference with Committee regarding FDIC fee objections and related matters (.4); telephone conference with debtors regarding same (1.2); telephone conference with FTI (Cordasco) regarding same (.3); follow up telephone conference with Cordasco regarding same and review chart prepared by Cordasco regarding various scenarios for distributions (.8); review voting report, plan support agreements and disclosure statement and respond to emails of T. Meyers regarding same (.8); draft and revise emails to committee regarding same (.4).	5.80	2,436.00

62303/\$64\$6510-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Des $\varphi_{age\ 6}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 15 of 21

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
09/06/2011	TCM	Continue analysis of IT fee issues (.5); telephone conference with Walter Curchack regarding same (.3); review emails regarding ballot report (.1); telephone conference with David Seligman regarding FDIC response and plan strategy (1.2); review ballot report and email exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding plan support parties' votes (.3); review email regarding FTI analysis of FDIC reserves under proposed settlement and email Robbin Rahman regarding same (.2); email Robbin Rahman regarding voting issues (.1); review memo regarding Section 1129(a)(4) and email committee regarding same (.3); review FTI analysis of reserves for FDIC (.7).	3.70	2,682.50
09/07/2011	RR	Review pleadings regarding issues relating to plan support parties; review and respond to emails of committee members regarding FDIC objection issues (.4); telephone conference with committee member regarding same (.3); draft and revise emails to debtor and committee regarding strategy (.3); review first amendment to plan supplement (.5); review memo from S. Ramsey regarding indenture trustee fees (.4); conference with S. Ramsey regarding same (.2).	2.20	924.00
09/07/2011	SGR	Review and revise indenture trustee fees memorandum and conduct research regarding same.	0.40	146.00
09/07/2011	TCM	Exchanges with David Seligman and Robbin Rahman regarding various issues.	0.20	145.00
09/08/2011	TCM	Conference with Robbin Rahman and email David Seligman regarding Harrington.	0.20	145.00
09/08/2011	LSC	Research case law regarding application for reimbursement of IT legal fees and other professional expenses.	0.30	66.00
09/08/2011	RR	Telephone conference with Pimco regarding issues related to plan and "cash option" (.5); draft and revise email summary to T. Meyers regarding same (.2); review and analyze Harrington West reply to FDIC objection and send same to counsel for debtors (.4); conference with S. Ramsey regarding same (.2); review and analyze various pleadings regarding significance of plan support parties cash election (.6); draft and revise email to T. Meyers regarding same (.3).	2.20	924.00
09/09/2011	TCM	Review email from holder (.1); review Robbin Rahman email regarding discussion with holder (.1); email exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding plan support party voter and review David Seligman email regarding same (.2); email David Seligman regarding plan issues (.1).	0.50	362.50
09/10/2011	TCM	Email exchange with David Seligman regarding various issues.	0.10	72.50

62303/\$9\$9\$10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Des\$age 7 Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 16 of 21

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
09/12/2011	TCM	Telephone conference with David Seligman regarding status (.3); analyze objection issues (.6); email FTI regarding same (.1).	1.00	725.00
09/13/2011	TCM	Email exchanges with David Seligman regarding FDIC issues (.2); email exchanges with Robbin Rahman and Dan Brown regarding ballot report (.1); review Robbin Rahman email regarding reserve analysis (.1); exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding PBGC plan termination status (.1).	0.50	362.50
09/13/2011	RR	Review and analyze distribution analysis from Kinteic (.4); review and respond to emails from M. Cordasco regarding same (.2); telephone conference with M. Cordasco regarding same (.3); draft and revise email summarizing same to T. Meyers (.2); draft and respond to emails from counsel for debtors regarding status of PBGC resolution (.2).	1.30	546.00
09/14/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails of T. Meyers regarding calculation of IT fees and related materials.	0.30	126.00
09/14/2011	TCM	Conference with Robbin Rahman regarding Kinetic spreadsheet (.1); review Kinetic regarding same analysis (.5); review David Seligman email regarding same (.1); email exchange with Michael Cordasco regarding same (.1); email exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding indenture trustee fees (.2).	1.00	725.00
09/15/2011	TCM	Email David Seligman regarding response status (.1); plan research and exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.7).	0.80	580.00
09/15/2011	RR	Draft and revise emails to committee members regarding Indenture Trustee fees (.3); review and revise fees chart regarding same (.8); draft and revise email to T. Meyers summarizing status of same (.1); telephone conference with Wilmington Trust regarding same (.4); telephone conference with claim holder regarding terms of plan and related issues (1.1); draft and respond to emails to T. Meyers regarding same (.3); review and revise email from T. Meyers regarding summary of conversation (.2); draft and revise email to T. Meyers regarding summary of Kinetic distribution analysis for Committee (.4); review email from T. Meyers to Committee regarding same (.1); telephone conference with M. Cordasco regarding Kinetic distribution analysis (.3).	4.00	1,680.00
09/16/2011	RR	Telephone conference with M. Cordasco regarding open issues for distribution analysis (.3); telephone conference with Cordasco regarding status of plan and related issues (.4); review email from M. Cordasco regarding updated Tricadia fee assumptions (.2); conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2).	1.10	462.00

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
09/16/2011	TCM	Exchange with David Seligman regarding response (.1); review Robbin Rahman email regarding Tricadia fee provision (.1); review email regarding Kinetic analysis (.1); review Vik Ghei email regarding plan provisions (.1); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding various issues (.2); conference with Al Lurey regarding FDIC issues (.1).	0.70	507.50
09/19/2011	TCM	Email exchanges with David Seligman regarding status (.2); email exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding confirmation hearing (.1); review revised plan (.4); email Robbin Rahman regarding ballot report (.1); conferences with Robbin Rahman regarding plan (.2).	1.00	725.00
09/19/2011	RR	Update chart of IT fees per email from BNYM (.2); draft and revise email to BNYM regarding same (.1); review and respond to email from counsel for committee regarding dividend by BankUnited (.3); draft and revise email to committee regarding debtor's response to FDIC objection and related pleadings (.3); review and analyze debtor's response to FDIC objection (1.1); review and analyze revised plan (.8); telephone conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.4); review and respond to emails from T. Meyers regarding same (.2).	3.40	1,428.00
09/20/2011	RR	Review and analyze plan voting report (.3); draft and revise email to T. Meyers summarizing same (.5); telephone conference with T. Meyers regarding same (.2); draft and revise chart identifying TOPrS Trust, CDO and plan voting party (1.5); telephone conference with M. Cordasco regarding status of settlement with FDIC (.3); review and respond to emails from counsel for Debtor and T. Meyers regarding status of settlement with FDIC (.2); draft and revise joinder with respect to Debtors response to FDIC objection to Plan (1.0); telephone conferences with counsel for debtor regarding additional issues for Plan (.4); draft and revise emails following up on same (.2)	4.60	1,932.00
09/20/2011	TCM	Email exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding plan and ballot report (.2); email from creditor regarding plan and with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.1); review ballot report and conference with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.2); review and revise and edit response to FDIC objection (1.0); email exchanges with David Seligman regarding deal with FDIC (.2); review analysis of ballot report and exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding votes by PSA parties (.3); email Robbin Rahman regarding plan changes (.1); various calls with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.4); conference with Al Lurey regarding subordination arguments for response to FDIC objection (.3); further exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding plan and supplement changes (.2).	3.00	2,175.00

62303/\$9\$9 10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Des\$0 age 9 Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 18 of 21

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
09/21/2011	TCM	Revise and edit committee joinder (.3); email Robbin Rahman regarding fee provision (.1); telephone conference with Doug Spelfogel regarding same (.2); telephone conference with David Seligman regarding litigation trustee (.2); numerous conferences with Robbin Rahman and email exchanges regarding plan revisions and FDIC response (1.5); email exchanges with Vik Ghei regarding litigation trustee (.2); telephone conference with Dan Brown regarding FDIC response (.4); review revised plan and email various comments to same (1.5).	4.40	3,190.00
09/21/2011	RR	Review response to FDIC objection and Plan and revised related documents (3.5); review and respond to emails from T. Meyers regarding same (.6); telephone conference with counsel for Debtors regarding revisions to plan (.5); draft and revise email to T. Meyers summarizing issues from same (.3); telephone conferences with various committee members regarding comments to same (.5); draft and revise emails to T. Meyers regarding same (.4); review revised versions of Plan (1.0).	6.80	2,856.00
09/21/2011	SGR	Emails regarding plan issues.	0.10	36.50
09/22/2011	RR	Telephone conference with committee regarding revised plan and related pleadings (.6); telephone conferences with debtor regarding same (.8); conferences with T. Meyers regarding same (.4); review and revise plan and confirmation brief per comments of Committee and T. Meyers (4.4); telephone conferences with Debtors regarding same (1.2); draft and revise email summaries of various related issues to T. Meyers and Committee (.8); review updated voting report (.6); draft and revise email to T. Meyers regarding same (.4).	9.20	3,864.00
09/22/2011	TCM	Various exchanges with Robbin Rahman and Jeff Gettlemen regarding status (.2); review ballot report and email Robbin Rahman regarding same (.2); telephone conference with David Seligman regarding plan issues (1.0); review revised joinder (.1); revise and edit same (.3); review revised FDIC response and draft comments (.8); review revised plan and telephone conference with David Seligman and others regarding various issues with same (1.0); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding ballots and other issues (.3); review further revised plan and with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.4); exchanges with David Seligman and Robbin Rahman regarding plan and brief changes (.3).	4.60	3,335.00
09/22/2011	LSC	Research regarding plans with pari passu treatment of FDIC and TOPrS and transmit same.	0.40	88.00
09/23/2011	LSC	Prepare materials for confirmation hearing (2.7); discuss same with R. Rahman (.1).	2.80	616.00

$_{62303/}$ ඉදුරු 10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Desc $_{\mathrm{ge}\ 10}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 19 of 21

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
09/23/2011	RR	Review and analyze confirmation brief, declaration and proposed order (1.6); draft and revise email to Committee regarding same (.1); draft and revise email to debtor regarding status of settlement with FDIC (.1); telephone conferences with counsel for Debtor regarding additional confirmation issues (.4); draft and revise email to Committee summarizing status of various issues (.3).	2.50	1,050.00
09/23/2011	TCM	Work on various plan issues.	1.00	725.00
09/25/2011	TCM	Review FDIC stipulation (.1); review hearing agenda (.1); review Robbin Rahman email regarding ballots (.1).	0.30	217.50
09/26/2011	TCM	Review plan revisions (.2); conferences with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.2); review revised supplement (.1); review motion (.1); email exchanges and telephone conference with Gene Davis regarding status (.3); additional conferences with Robbin Rahman regarding open issues (.2); email exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding effective date and review plan regarding same (.2); conference with Robbin Rahman regarding order and review comments to same (.2); review confirmation order (.3); email exchanges with David Seligman regarding litigation trustee (.1); review and analyze final ballot report and conference with Robbin Rahman regarding same (.3); additional exchanges with Robbin Rahman regarding voting issues (.2); email exchange with Robbin Rahman regarding amended plan (.1); review additional plan changes (.2).	2.70	1,957.50
09/26/2011	RR	Review and revise plan and related exhibits in advance of confirmation hearing (3.8); telephone conferences with counsel for debtor regarding same (.5); telephone conferences with T. Meyers regarding same (.3).	4.60	1,932.00
09/27/2011	TCM	Review hearing agenda (.1); analyze ballots (.3); review confirmation brief (.5); prepare for hearing (1.0); travel to and from court and attend hearing (2.0).	3.90	2,827.50
09/27/2011	RR	Review and respond to emails of T. Meyers in preparation for confirmation hearing (.6); conference with M. Cordasco regarding same (.4); attend and participate in preconfirmation hearing conferences with counsel for Debtors and other interested parties (1.0); attend and participate in plan confirmation hearing (.6); travel to and from court (1.0).	3.60	1,512.00
09/30/2011	TCM	Review Jeff Gettlemen email regarding pension plan termination (.1); telephone conference with Vik Ghei regarding status (.3); email Robbin Rahman regarding communication to creditor designee (.1).	0.50	362.50
09/30/2011	SGR	Teleconference with Holdco regarding status.	0.30	109.50

Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
	•	Task Subtotal		104.10	52,436.00
		B210 - Plan and Disclosure	e Statement Summary	y	
Summary	Timekeep			Rate/Hour	Amount
ASL	Alfred S.	Lurey	0.20	740.00	148.00
TCM	Todd C.	Meyers	34.00	725.00	24,650.00
SGR	Shane G.	Ramsey	12.00	365.00	4,380.00
RR	Robbin R	Rahman	52.60	420.00	22,092.00
LSC	La Asia S	S. Canty	5.30	220.00	1,166.00
	Task Sub	btotal	104.10		52,436.00
		B310 - Trav	el Time		
Date	Initials	Description		Hours	Amount
09/26/2011		Travel to Chicago for confirmation	hearing (bill at half rate	e). 2.80	588.00
09/26/2011	1 TCM	Travel to Chicago for hearing and p half rate).	repare for same (bill at	2.60	942.50
09/27/2011	l RR	Travel from Chicago to Atlanta.		3.00	630.00
09/27/2011	1 TCM	Travel home (bill at half rate).		2.80	1,015.00
		Task Subtotal		11.20	3,175.50
		B310 - Travel Tir	ne Summary		
Summary	Timekeep	per Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
TCM	Todd C.	Meyers	5.40	362.50	1,957.50
RR	Robbin R	Rahman	5.80	210.00	1,218.00
	Task Sub	btotal	11.20		3,175.50
		All Tasks S	ummary		
Summary	Timekeep	per Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
ASL	A. S. Lur	rey	1.10	740.00	814.00
TCM	T. C. Me	yers	40.90	725.00	29,652.50
TCM	T. C. Me	yers	5.40	362.50	1,957.50
RR	Robbin R	Rahman	54.30	420.00	22,806.00

$_{62303/}$ ඉඉදු10-26881 Doc 720-1 Filed 10/25/11 Entered 10/25/11 16:00:29 Desc $_{\mathrm{ge}\ 12}$ Exhibits 1A - 3 Page 21 of 21

Summary	Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount	
RR	Robbin Rahman	5.80	210.00	1,218.00	
SGR	Shane G. Ramsey	12.00	365.00	4,380.00	
LSC	La Asia S. Canty	11.70	220.00	2,574.00	
	Totals	131.20		\$63,402.00	
Other Cha	rges:				
09/06/2011	Westlaw On-Line Legal Research			397.78	
09/06/2011	Westlaw On-Line Legal Research			73.91	
09/07/201	Westlaw On-Line Legal Research			14.06	
09/07/201	Westlaw On-Line Legal Research			145.20	
09/14/201	Reed Elsevier dba LexisNexis Courtlink P. 5/31/11	roduct Usage for p	period 5/1/11-	2.80	
	Document Reproduction			6.30	
	Long Distance Charges			572.34	
	Document Reproduction			3.40	
	1.44				
Total Other Charges					
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE				\$64,619.23	