

EXHIBIT C

(Invoices of U.S. Bank National Association)



Corporate Trust Services
One Federal Street, 3rd Floor
Boston, MA 02110

Fee Invoice

Invoice Date: November 1, 2011

Corus Bancshares, Inc.
10 S. Riverside Plaza
Suite 1800
Chicago, IL 60606
Attn: Chief Financail Officer

Customer Relationship Information

Corus Bancshares, Inc Trust Preferred

Direct Inquires To:
James H. Byrnes
617.603.6442

Accounts Included In This Relationship

743039002

Activity Detail

<u>Service</u>	<u>Volume</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total Fees</u>
Default Administration thru 06/15/2010	12.9	\$450	5,805.00
Subtotal: Default Administration			\$ 5,805.00

TOTAL SERVICE CHARGES	\$	5,805.00
-----------------------	----	----------

Default Administration of Corus Bankshares Through 6/15/10

Hourly rate: \$450
 Hours Billed 12.90
 Total Expenses: \$0.00
 Total Fees: \$5,805.00
 Total Balance: \$5,805.00

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>Expenses</u>
4/8/2010	CORUS - Call with Counsel re: Notice of deferral	1	
	CORUS - Call with Trustee's re: restructuring	2.00	
4/13/2010	CORUS- review materials for proposed restructuring	1	
4/27/2010	CORUS - review materials for Trustee's call -	1.25	
6/1/2010	CORUS - prepare for TTES call - review materials	1.1	
	CORUS - Conf. Call with Trustee's	1.75	
6/5/2010	CORUS - Account Review III	1.8	
6/7/2010	CORUS - call/email counsel	0.75	
6/15/2010	CORUS - Review filing materials, email, calls with S&G	2.25	
	Total =	12.9	\$0.00



Corporate Trust Services
One Federal Street, 3rd Floor
Boston, MA 02110

Fee Invoice

Invoice Date: November 1, 2011

Corus Bancshares, Inc.
Corus Bancshares, Inc.
10 S. Riverside Plaza
Suite 1800
Chicago, IL 60606
Attn: Chief Financail Officer

Customer Relationship Information

Corus Bancshares, Inc Trust Preferred

Direct Inquires To:
James H. Byrnes
617.603.6442

Accounts Included In This Relationship

743039002

Activity Detail

<u>Service</u>	<u>Volume</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total Fees</u>
Default Administration 06/16/2010- 12/31/2010	108.5	\$450	48,825.00
Default Administration Expenses 06/16/2010- 12/31/2010			1,354.32
Default Administration 01/01/2011- 03/21/2011	22.25	\$475	10,568.75
			\$ 60,748.07

TOTAL SERVICE CHARGES	\$ 60,748.07
-----------------------	--------------

Default Administration of Corus Bankshares 6/15/10 Through 3/21/11

6/16/10 - 12/31/10 Total: \$50,179.32
 1/1/11 - 3/21/11 Total: \$10,568.75
 Total Balance: \$60,748.07

6/16/10 - 12/31/10

Hourly rate: \$450
 Hours Billed 108.50
 Total Expenses: \$1,354.32
 Total Fees: \$48,825.00
 Total Balance: \$50,179.32

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>Expenses</u>
6/16/2010	CORUS - Investment review- all 3 Trusts	1.5	
	CORUS - A/R review - sign-off	1.75	
	CORUS - Account Review I	2.25	
6/17/2010	CORUS - Trustee's Call	1	
6/18/2010	CORUS - review emails, calls with S&G re: filing	0.75	
6/22/2010	CORUS - Trustee's Call	1	
6/24/10	CORUS - review filings, emails etc re: formation meeting	0.75	
6/25/10	CORUS - call with S&G	0.5	
6/26/10	CORUS - prep for formation meeting - Internal calls, calls with professionals, S&G	1.75	
6/27/10	CORUS - prep for formation meeting, Internal calls, calls with professionals, S&G	2.5	
6/28/10	CORUS - Attend Committee Formation Meeting - Chicago, IL	18.5	\$652.81
6/29/10	CORUS - Follow-up from Committee formation meeting, internal, S&G	1.75	
	CORUS - Account Review III	2	
7/1/10	CORUS - prep for committee meeting	0.5	
	CORUS - UCC Meeting	1.5	
7/6/10	CORUS - Call w/ S&G	0.5	
7/7/10	CORUS - Call w/ S&G	0.25	
7/8/10	CORUS - prep for committee meeting	0.5	
	CORUS - UCC Meeting/Call	1	
	CORUS - Account Review II		
7/12/10	CORUS - review emails, calls re: UCC	0.25	
7/13/10	CORUS - review emails, calls re: UCC	0.75	
7/14/10	CORUS - Call with FA, S&G	0.5	
7/15/10	CORUS - prep for UCC Call	1.25	
	CORUS - UCC Meeting	1.5	
	CORUS - Review, finalize Notices of Default, prepare 2026D, I, III, V	1.75	
7/17/10	CORUS - Account Review- V	2	
7/18/10	CORUS - Internal coordination POC rates	0.5	
	CORUS - Review internal POC model. - P. Allen	1.75	
7/19/10	CORUS - call with S&G	0.25	
7/21/10	CORUS - Internal coordination POC rates	0.5	
7/22/10	CORUS - calculate POC amounts I,III,V	1.75	
	CORUS - Review Trust documents I, III, V	0.75	
	CORUS - review, respond emails, inquiries	0.25	
7/23/10	CORUS - prep for UCC MEETING	1.5	
	CORUS - UCC Meeting	2.25	

7/26/10 CORUS - Fianilze POC Calculations, I, III, V - SIGNOFF	2.25	
8/3/2010 CORUS - call with S&G	0.25	
CORUS - review/respond to emails	0.25	
8/4/2010 CORUS - review/respond to emails	0.5	
CORUS - call with S&G re: POC, internal follow-up	1.25	
CORUS - review revised calculations	0.5	
8/5/2010 CORUS - prepare for UCC Meeting	1.5	
CORUS - UCC Meeting	1	
CORUS - follow-up calls with UCC, S&G	1.75	
8/6/2010 CORUS - review/respond to emails,calls	0.25	
8/10/2010 CORUS - review, execute final POC'S	0.5	
8/12/2010 CORUS - prepare for UCC Meeting	0.75	
CORUS - call w/ S&G	0.25	
CORUS - prepare for UCC Meeting	0.75	
8/16/2010 CORUS - Attend UCC Meeting - NYC	10.25	\$701.51
8/17/2010 CORUS - call with S&G, follow-up to UCC MEETING	1	
8/18/2010 CORUS - review/respond emails	0.25	
8/20/2010 CORUS - prepare for UCC Meeting	0.75	
CORUS - UCC Meeting	1	
8/25/2010 CORUS - review/respond emails	0.25	
8/30/2010 CORUS - review/respond emails	0.5	
9/1/2010 CORUS - review UCC emails	0.5	
9/2/2010 CORUS - Call with S&G	0.25	
9/7/2010 CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting	0.75	
CORUS - UCC Meeting/ follow-up call with S&G	1.25	
9/8/2010 CORUS - Call with S&G	0.5	
9/10/2010 CORUS - REVIEW UCC emails	0.5	
9/15/2010 CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting	0.5	
9/16/2010 CORUS - UCC Meeting/ follow-up call with S&G	1	
9/21/2010 CORUS - review UCC emails	0.5	
9/24/2010 CORUS - Call with S&G	0.5	
CORUS - review UCC emails	0.5	
10/3/2010 CORUS - pre for UCC Meeting	0.5	
10/4/2010 CORUS - UCC Meeting	1	
10/10/2010 CORUS - Review UCC Materials, Plan	1.25	
10/12/2010 CORUS - call with S&G	0.25	
10/18/2010 CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting	0.5	
CORUS - UCC Meeting , follow-up with S&G	1.25	
10/25/2010 CORUS - review/responnd to emails	0.25	
10/29/2010 CORUS - review UCC Materials, D/S	0.75	
11/3/2010 CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting	0.5	
11/4/2010 CORUS - UCC Meeting, follow-up S&G	1	
11/12/2010 CORUS - review UCC materials - revised Plan/ D/S	1.5	
11/15/2010 CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting	0.75	
CORUS - UCC Meeting, follow-up S&G	1	

11/17/2010	CORUS - call with S&G	0.25	
11/18/2010	CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting	0.75	
	CORUS - UCC Meeting, follow-up S&G	1.25	
11/21/2010	CORUS - review UCC materials - revised Plan/ D/S	0.75	
12/4/2010	CORUS - review/respond emails	0.25	
12/7/2010	CORUS - meeting with counsel re: update of case	1	
12/14/2010	CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting	0.5	
12/15/2010	CORUS - UCC Meeting, Follow-up S&G	1	
12/21/2010	CORUS - call with S&G	0.25	
12/23/2010	CORUS - Finalized Informational Notices, prepare 2026D (I, III, V)	1.25	
12/29/2010	CORUS - review/respond emails	0.5	
	Total =	108.5	\$1,354.32

1/1/11 - 3/21/11

Hourly rate: \$475
 Hours Billed 22.25
 Total Expenses: \$0.00
 Total Fees: \$10,568.75
 Total Balance: \$10,568.75

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>Expenses</u>
1/3/2011	CORUS - review/respond emails	0.25	
1/11/2011	CORUS - review UCC emails, materials	0.5	
1/19/2011	CORUS - call w/S&G - status of default, legal issues	0.75	
1/27/2011	CORUS - call w/S&G - BANA succession	0.75	
2/2/2011	CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting	0.5	
	CORUS - UCC Meeting, follow-up w/ S&G	1.25	
2/3/2011	CORUS - call with S & G	0.25	
2/8/2011	CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting	0.5	
2/9/2011	CORUS - UCC Meeting, follow-up	1	
2/10/2010	CORUS - call with S & G	0.5	
2/11/2011	CORUS - review/respond to emails re: UCC	0.25	
	CORUS - call with S & G	0.75	
2/14/2011	CORUS - call with S & G - BANA	1	
2/18/2011	CORUS - review/respond to emails re: UCC	0.75	
2/19/2011	CORUS - call with USB-Chicago- BANA intergration	1.25	
2/20/2011	CORUS - prep for DRCM - Corus Update	0.75	
2/27/2028	CORUS - review/respond to emails re: UCC	0.25	
	CORUS - prep for DRCM - Corus Update	0.75	
2/28/2011	CORUS - DRCM - update	0.5	
3/1/2011	CORUS - UCC Meeting, follow-up	0.75	
3/4/2011	CORUS - USB/BANA intergration call	0.5	
3/9/2011	CORUS - review UCC emails	0.5	
	CORUS - call with S&G	0.5	
3/14/2011	CORUS - review UCC emails	0.75	
	CORUS - prep for UCC Call	0.5	
	CORUS - UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.75	

3/15/2011	CORUS - review UCC emails, etc re: Tricadia	1	
3/20/11	CORUS - prep for UCC Call	0.5	
3/21/11	CORUS - UCC Meeting, follow-up	2.25	
	CORUS - review UCC emails, materials :Tricadia	0.75	
	Total =	22.25	0



Corporate Trust Services
 One Federal Street, 3rd Floor
 Boston, MA 02110

Fee Invoice

Invoice Date: November 1, 2011

Corus Bancshares, Inc.
 C/O Kaye Scholer LLP
 Three First National Plaza
 70 West Madison Street - Suite 4100
 Chicago, IL 60602

Customer Relationship Information

Corus Bancshares, Inc Trust Preferred

Direct Inquires To:
 James H. Byrnes
 617.603.6442

Accounts Included In This Relationship

743039002

Activity Detail

<u>Service</u>	<u>Volume</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total Fees</u>
Default Administration 03/22/2011- 10/27/2011	76.75	\$475	36,456.25
			-
			-
			\$ 36,456.25

TOTAL SERVICE CHARGES	\$	36,456.25
-----------------------	----	-----------

Default Administration of Corus Bankshares 3/21/11 Through 10/27/11

Hourly rate: \$475
 Hours Billed 76.75
 Total Expenses: \$0.00
 Total Fees: \$36,456.25
 Total Balance: \$36,456.25

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>Expenses</u>
3/23/11	CORUS - call with S&G ; update on Tricadia issues	1	
3/25/11	CORUS - call w/S&G - UCC, Tricadia	1.25	
	CORUS - follow-up call w/S&G	0.75	
3/28/11	CORUS - Review Tricadia plan, call(s)with S&G	2.25	
3/29/11	CORUS - Review comments to Tricadia Plan, call(s) W/ S&G	2.25	
	CORUS - review/respond UCC emails	0.5	
3/31/11	CORUS - Reviewcommittee materials, discussions w/S&G,	1.75	
	CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting, UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.5	
4/1/2011	CORUS - review/respond UCC emails	0.5	
4/5/2011	CORUS - review/respond emails - plan admin	1	
4/7/2011	CORUS - review plan admin material	0.75	
	CORUS - call w/S&G	0.5	
4/15/2011	CORUS - review UCC mails	0.75	
	CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting, UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.75	
4/22/2011	CORUS - review UCC mails	0.75	
4/27/2011	CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting, UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.25	
5/3/2011	CORUS -review/ respond UCC emails	0.75	
5/5/2011	CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting, UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.75	
5/11/2011	CORUS - review/respond UCC emails, materials	0.75	
	CORUS - Review emails, draft response letter to Tricadia	1	
5/17/2011	CORUS - prep for UCC Meeting, UCC Meeting, follow-up	2.25	
5/19/2011	CORUS - review/respond UCC emails, materials	0.5	
	CORUS - call with S&G re:exclusivtiy	0.75	
5/20/2011	CORUS - call with S&G	0.5	
5/23/2011	CORUS - review materials, call w/ S&G - exclusivity	1.5	
5/24/2011	CORUS - Review materials, call w/ S&G - exclusivity	0.75	
5/25/2011	CORUS -prep for, attend, UCC Meeting, follow-up	2.25	
5/26/2011	CORUS - Calls w/ S&G RE: status, strategey	0.5	
5/27/2011	CORUS -Calls w/ S&G RE: status, strategey	1	
	CORUS - review draft	1.25	
5/31/2011	CORUS- -prep for, attend, UCC Meeting, follow-up	2	
6/1/2011	CORUS - review materials for Debtor Meeting	1	
6/3/2011	CORUS - Call w/ S&G - Update on 6/2 Debtor's meeting	1	
6/6/2011	CORUS - prep for, attend UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.75	
6/7/2011	CORUS - Call w/ S&G - re: Debtor's plan, comments , review emails	1.25	
6/14/2011	CORUS - review emails, drafts, re: Debtor's Plan	1	
	CORUS - UCC Call	1.5	
6/21/2011	CORUS - review emails, drafts, re: Debtor's Plan	1	

7/6/2011	CORUS - review drafts , emails from w/o 6/28	1.25
7/8/2011	CORUS - review drafts D/S procedurers	1
7/11/2011	CORUS - review drafts, emails	0.75
7/13/2011	CORUS - call w/ S&G - support letter	0.5
7/18/2011	CORUS - review emails, claim calc's	1.25
07/21/201	CORUS - review drafts, emails, re: cliams amts, support letter	0.75
7/25/2011	CORUS - review revised Plan , D/S	1.25
7/26/2011	CORUS - call w/ S&G -update on FDIC objection	0.5
7/27/2011	CORUS - prep for, attend UCC Meeting, follow-up	2.75
7/28/2011	CORUS - review committee emails, objections	0.75
8/1/2011	CORUS - call w/ S&G - update confirm issues , plan, D/S	0.5
8/3/2011	CORUS - call w/ S&G - update/discussion on Notices to Holders	0.5
8/4/2011	CORUS - call with S&G - Finalize Notices	0.25
	CORUS - prepare 2026 D, Notices, mailing	1
8/8/2011	CORUS - prep for, attend UCC Meeting, follow-up	1
8/10/2011	CORUS - call w/ S&G re: distribution	0.5
8/11/2011	CORUS - review/respond committee emails	0.25
8/30/2011	CORUS - review litigation, plan oblection, confirmation issues email	1
8/31/2011	CORUS - call with S&G - securities trading	0.5
09/02/201	CORUS - prepfor, attend, UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.25
	CORUS - call withn S&G - trading	0.5
9/5/2011	CORUS - review/respond committee emails	0.5
9/6/2011	CORUS - prepfor, attend, UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.75
9/7/2011	CORUS - call(s) withn S&G - confirmation issues	1
9/8/2011	CORUS - call with S&G - Confirmation issues	0.5
9/12/2011	CORUS - review/respond committee emails	0.25
9/19/2011	CORUS - call with S&G - Confirmation issues	0.25
9/22/2011	CORUS - prepfor, attend, UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.75
09/28/201	CORUS - review/respond committee emails	0.75
10/3/2011	CORUS - prep for , attend, UCC Meeting, follow-up	1.25
10/10/2011	CORUS - review/respond committee emails	0.25
10/18/2011	CORUS - Call with S&G -	0.5
	CORUS - call with Trusttes/BMC Group	0.75
10/20/2011	CORUS - call w/S&G	0.5
10/26/2011	CORUS - follow-up call Trustee's/BMC Group	1
	CORUS - FEE APP Preparation	1.75
10/27/2011	CORUS -Fee App Preparation	1.25
	CORUS - Call with S&G -	0.25

Total = 76.75 \$0.00