

EXHIBIT B

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
Page 3

Time Detail by Task Code

TASK CODE: B110 Case Administration

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Services</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
09/02/08	D. Smith	Review and print documents from online docketing system and assemble agenda binder for hearing per J. H. Cook.	1.20	50.00	60.00
09/05/08	D. Smith	Review and organize pleadings file.	0.30	50.00	15.00
09/12/08	D. Smith	Review and organize pleadings file.	0.30	50.00	15.00
09/17/08	D. Smith	Review and pull documents from pleadings file and print documents from online docketing system; assemble agenda binders for court processing per J. H. Cook.	3.00	50.00	150.00
09/18/08	J.H. Cook	Forward response to C. Davis for execution.	0.10	205.00	20.50
09/18/08	D. Smith	Review and print documents from online docketing system per D. Stratton.	0.30	50.00	15.00
09/24/08	D. Smith	Review docket and organize pleadings file.	2.00	50.00	100.00
09/24/08	D. Smith	Review and pull documents from pleadings file and print documents from online docketing system per J. H. Cook.	0.30	50.00	15.00
09/25/08	D. Smith	Review docket and organize pleadings file.	0.50	50.00	25.00
09/29/08	J.H. Cook	E-mails to A. Sorkin and L. Hartley 6th Quarterly Order.	0.20	205.00	41.00

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
Page 4

Total B110 Case Administration

8.20

456.50

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
Page 5

TASK CODE: B150 Creditors' Committee

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Services</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
09/02/08	D. Stratton	Committee conference call to review status of negotiations over plan and other matters.	1.50	615.00	922.50
09/16/08	D. Stratton	Committee conference call to discuss open issues.	1.10	615.00	676.50
09/23/08	D. Stratton	Committee conference call to discuss status of plan negotiations, etc.	1.40	615.00	861.00
Total B150 Creditors' Committee			4.00		2,460.00

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
Page 6

TASK CODE: B155 Court Hearings

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Services</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
09/04/08	D. Stratton	Prepare for and attend omnibus hearing.	1.20	615.00	738.00
09/17/08	J.H. Cook	Coordinate telephonic appearances of Willkie Attorneys at Disclosure Statement Hearing.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/19/08	D. Stratton	Prepare for and attend disclosure statement hearings.	2.00	615.00	1,230.00
09/24/08	J.H. Cook	Coordinate telephonic appearances for 10/2/08 fee hearing.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/26/08	J.H. Cook	Review docket and case calendar and preparation of telephonic appearance forms.	0.30	205.00	61.50
09/29/08	J.H. Cook	Forward telephonic appearance registrations to various parties.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/30/08	J.H. Cook	Review agenda for 10/2/08 hearing.	0.20	205.00	41.00
Total B155 Court Hearings			4.30		2,193.50

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
 Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
 October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
 Page 7

TASK CODE: B160 Fees

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Services</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
08/22/08	J.H. Cook	E-mails to/from A. Sorkin re outstanding fees and expenses.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/02/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation of Notice and COS for Willkie 19th Fee Application.	0.30	205.00	61.50
09/05/08	J.H. Cook	Review 8/08 time in preparation of fee application.	0.30	205.00	61.50
09/16/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation of PH Fee Application.	1.00	205.00	205.00
09/17/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation of PH Fee Application.	0.80	205.00	164.00
09/24/08	J.H. Cook	Revisions to PH Fee Application.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/24/08	J.H. Cook	Review docket re Fee Examiner Reports.	0.30	205.00	61.50
09/25/08	J. Carignan	Review and revise 19th PH Monthly Fee Application.	0.30	345.00	103.50
09/25/08	J.H. Cook	Review Sixth Interim Fee Application and Chart from Debtors re same (0.5); telephone call with A. Joseck re same (0.2); telephone call with K. Fitzgerald re same (0.1).	0.80	205.00	164.00
09/25/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation of order re Sixth Quarterly Application.	0.80	205.00	164.00
09/26/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation of Notices and Certificates of Service re same.	0.50	205.00	102.50
09/26/08	J.H. Cook	Telephone call with A.	0.20	205.00	41.00

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
Page 8

		Ambeault (Willkie) re fees.		
09/26/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation re filing of PH Fee Application.	0.40 205.00	82.00
Total B160 Fees			<u>6.10</u>	<u>1,292.50</u>

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
Page 9

TASK CODE: B161 Fees/Objections

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Services</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
09/02/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation of CONO re Kroll 19th Fee Application.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/05/08	J.H. Cook	Revisions to Kroll CONO.	0.30	205.00	61.50
09/19/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation of CONO re PH Fee Application.	0.40	205.00	82.00
09/19/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation re filing of CONO re PH Fee Application.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/19/08	J.H. Cook	Coordinate telephonic appearances for 9/22/08 hearing.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/25/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation of CONO re Willkie Fee Application and e-mails to A. Sorkin re same.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/25/08	J.H. Cook	Preparation re filing of CONO re Willkie Fee Application.	0.30	205.00	61.50
Total B161 Fees/Objections			1.80		369.00

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
Page 10

TASK CODE: B191 General Litigation

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Services</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
09/22/08	D. Stratton	Review decision approving settlement.	0.30	615.00	184.50
Total B191 General Litigation			0.30		184.50

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
 Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
 October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
 Page 11

TASK CODE: B320 Plan and Disclosure Statement

<u>Date</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Services</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Fees</u>
09/15/08	D. Stratton	Review disclosure statement objection.	0.50	615.00	307.50
09/16/08	D. Stratton	Review disclosure statement objection and revision (.4); confer with A. Weiner, E. Meltzer and J.H. Cook re service and filing (.3).	0.70	615.00	430.50
09/16/08	E. Meltzer	Confer with H. Cook re objection to disclosure statement (.1); review same (.3).	0.40	345.00	138.00
09/16/08	J.H. Cook	Review docket re noticing information for motion to approve disclosure statement.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/17/08	J.H. Cook	Review agenda for 9/19/08 disclosure statement hearing and discussion with D. Smith re preparation of hearing binder.	0.20	205.00	41.00
09/18/08	D. Stratton	Telephone calls and e-mails re objection to disclosure statement (.6); review objection and follow up with service and filing (.6); review motion to approve DS and objections, prepare for hearing.	2.40	615.00	1,476.00
09/18/08	J.H. Cook	Review documents for Disclosure Statement Hearing and preparation re same.	0.60	205.00	123.00
09/22/08	D. Stratton	Conference call with Court re approval of disclosure	0.40	615.00	246.00

Sea Containers Services Ltd. Official Committee of
Client/Matter Number: 132986.00002
October 14, 2008

Invoice: 10516973
Page 12

statement.		
Total B320 Plan and Disclosure Statement	5.40	2,803.00