

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)

Exhibit A - Part 1

PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services

Summary by Project Category

For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Project Category and Task Code	Hours
<i>Monthly Fee</i>	
United Kingdom	
Malmo (a) Interface with Professionals	10.25
Malmo (g) Raising Capital	25.00
Malmo (h) Plan of Reorganisation	11.25
Malmo (k) Fee Application	1.25
Total Hours and Compensation for United Kingdom	47.75
United States	
Malmo (a) Interface with Professionals	7.00
Malmo (g) Raising Capital	60.50
Malmo (h) Plan of Reorganisation	52.75
Malmo (k) Fee Application	5.50
Total Hours and Compensation for United States	125.75
Total Hours and Compensation for Monthly Fee	173.50
Grand Total Hours for August 2008	173.50

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)

Exhibit A - Part 2

PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services

Summary of Professionals

For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Professional	Position; Prior Relevant Experience; Year License to Practice Obtained; Area of Expertise.	Hours
United Kingdom		
<i>Partner</i>		
Michael Berkowitch	Partner, 3 years at PwC; Specialist in restructuring and finance.	43.50
Steven Pearson	Partner, 10 years at PwC; Assoc of Business Recovery Professionals for 12 years; Licensed Insolvency Practitioner (UK); Institute of Chartered Accountants in England & Wales, 1989; 16 years experience in restructuring, insolvency and corporate finance.	3.00
<i>Executive</i>		
David Ives	Executive, 5 years with PwC, qualified with Associations of Accounting Technicians, 5 years retail banking experience, 5 years finance experience.	1.25
United States		
<i>Director</i>		
Keith Kaiser	Director, 11 years at PwC; 15 years total relevant experience in Restructuring Corporate Finance and Corporate Lending.	125.75
Grand Total Hours for August 2008		173.50

Exhibit A - Part 3

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Professional Services by Date
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
Monthly Fee				
Malmo (a) Interface with Professionals				
<i>United Kingdom</i>				
8/5/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0001: Prepared for and attended meeting with L. Barlow, C. Cavin (AP), M. Martinez (HLHZ) and M. Skelton (Kroll) to discuss major terms of Fortis term sheet and financing process.	2.50
8/7/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0002: Call with M. Martinez (HLHZ) regarding Fortis term sheet.	0.50
8/8/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0004: Call with D. Eaton (KE) regarding Newco corporate governance.	0.25
8/8/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0003: Call with M. Martinez (HLHZ), M. Skelton (Kroll), M. Kelly (WFG), L. Barlow (AP) and J. Schorer (KE) to present SCL's thoughts on Fortis term sheet and key open items.	1.50
8/15/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0005: Pre-call with L. Barlow, C. Cavin (AP) and J. Schorer (KE) to plan for call with Fortis on the financing term sheet.	1.00
8/26/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0006: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC), C. Cavin (AP) and J. Schorer (KE) to discuss latest comments to Fortis term sheet.	3.50
8/27/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0007: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC), M. Martinez (HLHZ) and M. Skelton (Kroll) to discuss business issues arising from financing negotiations.	1.00
<i>United States</i>				
7/3/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0008: Call with L. Barlow (AP), M. Wilson (SCL), M. Berkowitch (PwC), J. Schorer (KE) to review comments to potential lender term sheet.	3.00
7/7/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0009: Call with D. Eaton (KE) and M. Berkowitch (PwC) regarding liquidation valuation.	1.00
7/7/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0011: Attended call with J. Webb, S. Tao and M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss liquidation and plan valuations.	1.50
7/7/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0010: Attended call with M. Berkowitch (PwC), L. Barlow (AP), M. Wilson (SCL), J. Schorer (KE) to review comments to potential lender term sheet.	1.50
Total Hours and Compensation for Malmo (a) Interface with Professionals				17.25
Malmo (g) Raising Capital				
<i>United Kingdom</i>				

Exhibit A - Part 3

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Professional Services by Date
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
8/1/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0012: Call with L. Barlow (AP) to review J. Schorer (KE) comments on open points and preparation for the call.	0.75
8/1/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0013: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC) and J. Schorer (KE) to discuss J. Schorer's comments on Fortis open issues.	1.50
8/1/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0014: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC) and Fortis to discuss open business issues.	1.50
8/2/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0015: Reviewed and commented on proposed email to Fortis summarising status of open issues and proposal on each issue as well as read and responded to emails from D. Eaton (KE) regarding sharing of Fortis term sheet with SCSL committee.	1.25
8/4/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0017: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC) to discuss Fortis open issues and valuation presentation in respect of owned container fleet.	1.00
8/4/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0016: Meeting with L. Barlow (AP) and M. Wilson (SCL) regarding open issues on Fortis term sheet.	1.00
8/4/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0018: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC) and Fortis to discuss term sheet open items.	1.50
8/5/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0021: Call with L. Barlow (AP) to discuss various covenant issues in financing and responded to emails from K. Kaiser (PwC) regarding his call with HLHZ and Kroll.	1.00
8/5/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0020: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC) to plan for Fortis call and prepared analysis of potential dilution related to Fortis debt equity conversion.	1.50
8/5/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0019: Call with Fortis and K. Kaiser (PwC) to discuss open issues on term sheet and give feedback from meetings with HLHZ and Kroll; prepared email to SCL summarising key points from the call and next steps.	1.50
8/6/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0023: Call with M. Wilson (SCL) regarding Newco balance sheet and discussions with GE.	0.25
8/6/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0025: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC) and Fortis to review Fortis' latest position on open issues.	0.25
8/6/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0022: Sent emails to SCL and K. Kaiser (PwC) about a call this afternoon to discuss Fortis amortisation profile and sent email to D. Eaton (KE) regarding required shareholder/board approvals in connection with exit financing.	0.75
8/6/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0024: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC), L. Barlow and C. Cavin (AP) regarding covenant levels in Fortis financing, including prior conversation with K. Kaiser to prepare for the call with Alix Partners.	1.00
8/7/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0026: Call with L. Barlow, C. Cavin (AP), K. Kaiser (PwC), J. Schorer and P. Wierbicki (KE) to review latest Fortis term sheet.	4.00
8/8/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0028: Call with M. Wilson (SCL), L. Barlow (AP) and K. Kaiser (PwC) to discuss levels of financial covenants in financing.	0.50

Exhibit A - Part 3

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Professional Services by Date
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
8/8/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0027: Call with L. Barlow (AP), M. Wilson (SCL), K. Kaiser (PwC) and J. Schorer (KE) to prepare for call with committees this evening on Fortis term sheet.	1.00
8/9/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0029: Reviewed and commented on K&E proposed markup to Fortis term sheet.	1.25
8/15/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0030: Call with J. Schorer (KE), L. Barlow, C. Cavin (AP), Fortis and Thatcher Profit to discuss financing term sheet.	2.00
8/26/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0031: Reviewed K&E proposed comments to latest Fortis term sheet.	1.00
8/27/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0032: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC) to catch up on financing issues and plan call later today with FLHZ & Kroll.	0.50
<i>United States</i>				
7/1/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0034: Provided Response to potential exit lenders diligence questions.	0.25
7/1/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0035: Email to SCL group regarding open diligence items.	0.75
7/1/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0033: Call with potential exit lender regarding locating a partner.	0.75
7/2/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0036: Review of potential exit lenders term sheet.	2.00
7/6/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0037: Attended call with M Berkowitch (PwC), L. Barlow (AP), M. Wilson (SCL), J. Schorer (KE) to review comments to potential lender term sheet.	1.25
7/6/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0038: Analyzed covenants for potential term sheet and related email.	2.50
7/7/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0039: Provided language for term sheet.	1.25
7/8/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0047: Sent CA's to potential exit lender.	0.50
7/8/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0045: Stressed model for reduction in disposal values.	1.00
7/8/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0040: Attended call with L. Barlow (AP), M. Wilson (SCL), J. Schorer (KE), M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss comments to potential lender term sheet.	1.00
7/8/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0046: Created and distributed hypothetical borrowing base schedule.	1.25
7/8/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0044: Designed borrowing base worksheet.	1.50
7/8/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0041: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) regarding agenda of meetings tomorrow.	1.50

Exhibit A - Part 3

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Professional Services by Date
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
7/8/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0043: Reviewed M. Berkowitch valuation model and prepared email to R. Radia (PwC) regarding cost of equity.	2.00
7/8/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0042: Reviewed M. Berkowitch valuation model and prepared email to R. Radia (PwC) regarding cost of equity.	2.00
7/9/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0049: Amended potential lender TS regarding payment mechanism and definitions; discussed same with M. Berkowitch (PwC).	0.75
7/9/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0048: Reviewed revised version of potential lender term sheet and discussed same with L. Barlow, C. Cavin (AP) and M. Berkowitch (PwC).	1.00
7/9/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0050: Reviewed revised liquidation analysis and discussed same with J. Webb and M. Berkowitch (PwC).	2.50
7/10/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0054: Emailed hold harmless letter to potential exit lenders.	0.50
7/10/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0052: Discussed disclosure statement with M. Berkowitch (PwC).	0.75
7/10/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0051: Reviewed changes to potential lender term sheet and discussed the same with M. Berkowitch (PwC).	1.00
7/10/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0053: Discussed container valuation assumptions with M. Berkowitch (PwC).	1.25
7/11/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0055: Held discussion with M. (No Suggestions) (PwC) regarding changes to potential lender term sheet and container valuation.	0.50
7/11/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0056: Discussion with M. Berkowitch (PwC) regarding Disclosure Statement language on liquidation and plan valuations.	2.25
7/14/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0057: Provided diligence information to potential exit lenders.	0.50
7/14/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0058: Negotiated confidential agreement with potential exit lender.	1.00
7/15/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0060: Pre-call with L. Barlow (AP), M. Wilson (SCL), M. Berkowitch (PwC) to prepare for potential lender call.	0.25
7/15/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0061: 2 calls with M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss container valuation language and conversations with potential lender.	0.50
7/15/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0059: Call with L. Barlow (AP), M. Wilson (SCL), M. Berkowitch (PwC) and potential lender and Thatcher Profit to discuss SCL comments to potential lender term sheet.	0.75
7/15/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0062: Call with J Schorer (K&E regarding exit financing).	0.75

Exhibit A - Part 3

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Professional Services by Date
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
7/16/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0064: Provided requested diligence to potential exit lender.	0.50
7/16/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0063: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss changes to valuation section of the Disclosure Statement and follow-up on potential lender financing issues.	1.50
7/17/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0066: Call with potential exit lender regarding confidential agreement.	0.75
7/17/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0065: Call with potential exit lender regarding diligence information.	1.00
7/17/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0067: Developed draft term sheet for repatriation note.	1.00
7/17/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0069: Call with L. Barlow (AP), M. Wilson (SCL), M. Berkowitch (PwC) regarding expected cash repatriations and associated Note.	1.25
7/17/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0068: Updated cash flow forecast for project repatriation proceeds.	2.00
7/18/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0072: Read emails from M. Berkowitch (PwC) regarding latest call with potential lender and responded by email.	1.50
7/18/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0070: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC), M. Martinez (HLHZ), M. Skelton (Kroll) regarding status of potential lender financing.	1.50
7/18/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0073: Call with potential exit lender regarding new facility terms and related email to Laura Barlow (SCL), Mark Wilson (SCL), and Michael Berkowitch (PwC).	2.00
7/18/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0071: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) to review open issues and actions on potential lender financing.	2.50
7/20/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0074: Reviewed and commented on draft valuation presentation for owned container fleet; sent email regarding same to M. Berkowitch (PwC).	0.50
7/21/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0076: Discussion with potential exit lender regarding repatriations.	1.25
7/21/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0075: Updated container cash flow model for revised term sheet terms.	2.00
7/22/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0078: Prepared analysis regarding disposal values.	1.00
7/22/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0077: Discussion with potential exit lender regarding confidential agreements.	1.25
7/25/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0080: Follow-up call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss exit term sheet.	0.50
7/25/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0079: Call with J. Schorer regarding principal paydown schedule.	1.50

Exhibit A - Part 3

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Professional Services by Date
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
7/26/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F081: Review of payment schedule language in term sheet.	0.75
7/30/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F082: Call with potential exit lender regarding confidential agreement.	0.50
7/31/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F083: Provided potential exit lender diligence information.	2.00
Total Hours and Compensation for Malmo (g) Raising Capital				85.50
Malmo (h) Plan of Reorganisation				
<i>United Kingdom</i>				
8/1/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0085: Read emails from Debt wire on plan filing prior to distributing to SCL and PwC team.	0.25
8/1/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0084: Read and responded to emails from J. Schorer (KE) regarding financing.	0.25
8/4/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0087: Reviewed and commented on valuation presentation in respect of SCL's owned container fleet.	0.50
8/4/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0086: Attended daily call of SCL restructuring steering group.	0.50
8/6/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0090: Attended daily call of SCL restructuring steering group.	0.50
8/6/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0089: Conversation with S. Pearson (PwC) regarding advising SCL on liquidation plan and costs.	0.50
8/6/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0088: Sent email to D. Agay (KE) regarding legal issues involved with Newco raising equity and responded to email from L. Ashe (AP) regarding pre-petition loan facility.	0.50
8/8/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0092: Daily call of restructuring steering group.	0.50
8/8/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0091: Reviewed and amended latest version of container valuation presentation and had two calls with K. Kaiser (PwC) regarding same.	3.00
8/9/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0093: Reviewed and commented on K&E comments to liquidation analysis.	0.25
8/11/2008	Steven Pearson	Partner	0808F0096: Review of options for liquidations in UK and in group - analysis.	2.00
8/14/2008	Steven Pearson	Partner	0808F0097: Review of liquidation of UK companies with Jeremy Webb and Simon Hawkins (PwC).	1.00
8/27/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0094: Responded to emails from C.Cavin, L. Barlow (AP), J. Schorer (KE) and K. Kaiser (PwC) related to exit financing.	0.50

Exhibit A - Part 3

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Professional Services by Date
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
8/28/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Partner	0808F0095: Call with K. Kaiser (PwC) to discuss comments to container valuation discussion and steps to finalise.	1.00
<i>United States</i>				
7/3/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0098: Sent various emails to M. Berkowitch and J. Webb (PwC) regarding valuation.	0.25
7/8/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0099: Prepared draft schedule for container valuation WACC.	2.00
7/9/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0100: Analysis related to B class dividend value differential.	0.50
7/10/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0101: Preparation of container valuation for disclosure statement.	3.00
7/11/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0102: Edit on disclosure statement language regarding container fleet valuation and liquidation analysis.	4.00
7/16/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0103: Updated owned container valuation and liquidation analysis.	1.75
7/19/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0104: Drafted Draft Container Valuation Presentation.	5.00
7/20/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0106: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss my comments on valuation presentation.	0.50
7/20/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0105: Revised draft container valuation presentation.	3.00
7/20/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0107: Call with L. Barlow (AP), M. Wilson, L. Clement (SCL), M. Berkowitch, S. Tao, J. Webb (PwC) regarding valuation and liquidation analysis, including preparation for call.	3.25
7/21/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0109: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss revised potential lender term sheet and container valuation.	0.25
7/21/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0108: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC), M. Wilson (SCL), J. Schorer (KE) to discuss comments to revised potential lender term sheet.	1.00
7/22/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0112: Followup call with M. Wilson (SCL), M. Berkowitch (PwC), J. Schorer (KE) to discuss action points from potential lender call.	1.00
7/22/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0113: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC), J. Schorer (KE), M. Wilson (SCL), potential lender and Thatcher Profit (TOP) regarding comments to 2nd version of potential lender term sheet.	1.00
7/22/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0111: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) regarding container valuation and potential lender term sheet open points.	1.50
7/22/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0110: Call with J. Schorer, N. Labovitz (KE), M. Berkowitch (PwC), C. Cavin (AP) to prepare for the potential lender call on the term sheet.	1.50

Exhibit A - Part 3

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Professional Services by Date
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
7/23/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0114: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC), M. Martinez, T. Hanson (HLHZ) to discuss valuation assumptions and update them on potential lender negotiations.	0.50
7/23/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0115: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss his call with potential lender and my call with HLHZ.	0.50
7/23/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0116: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) and M. Wilson (SCL) regarding liquidation valuation assumptions.	1.50
7/24/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0118: Call with L. Barlow (AP) and L. Clement (SCL) regarding GESG valuation in Chapter 7 scenario, call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) and L. Barlow regarding same.	1.50
7/24/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0117: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC), L. Barlow (AP), J. Schorer (KE) regarding various open issues on potential lender financing.	2.00
7/25/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0120: Call with L. Barlow, C. Cavin (AP), M. Berkowitch (PwC) and potential lender to discuss open issues on financing structure.	0.75
7/25/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0119: Pre-call with L. Barlow, C. Cavin (AP), M. Berkowitch (PwC) and J. Schorer (KE) to plan for potential lender call.	1.50
7/26/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0122: Revised estimates of enterprise and equity value of Newco for disclosure statement and sent email to M. Berkowitch (PwC) regarding same.	1.50
7/26/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0121: Edits to container valuation presentation.	2.00
7/27/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0123: Discussed collective comments to potential lender term sheet with L. Barlow (AP), J. Schorer (KE), M. Berkowitch (PwC).	3.00
7/28/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0128: Read and responded to numerous emails from L. Barlow (AP), L. Clement (SCL), M. Berkowitch (PwC), S. Tao (PwC).	0.50
7/28/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0126: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) regarding Newco enterprise value and equity value calculations.	1.00
7/28/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0125: Call with L. Barlow (AP), L. Clement (SCL) and M. Berkowitch (PwC) regarding assumptions underlying liquidation analysis, including preparation thereof.	1.00
7/28/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0124: Call with B. Heferich (PwC) to discuss NewCo proforma financial statement.	1.00
7/28/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0129: Updated equity schedule and sent to M. Berkowitch.	1.50
7/28/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0127: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss enterprise and equity value calculations and potential lender term sheet.	1.50

Exhibit A - Part 3

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Professional Services by Date
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Date	Name	Position	Description	Hours
7/30/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0130: Call with M. Berkowitch (PwC), L. Barlow, C. Cavin (AP), J. Schorer (KE), potential lender and Thatcher Profit to discuss SCI comments to potential lender term sheet.	1.00
7/30/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0131: Call to M. Berkowitch (PwC) to discuss action points from potential lender call and prepared email to L. Barlow (AP) regarding same.	1.00
Total Hours and Compensation for Malmö (h) Plan of Reorganisation				64.00
Malmö (k) Fee Application				
<i>United Kingdom</i>				
8/5/2008	David Ives	Senior Associate	0808F0132: Preparation July time analysis.	1.00
8/7/2008	David Ives	Senior Associate	0808F0133: Raise May bill.	0.25
<i>United States</i>				
7/2/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F00134: Recording time detail.	2.00
7/16/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F00135: Recording time detail.	1.00
7/27/2008	Keith Kaiser	Director	0808F0136: Recording time detail.	2.50
Total Hours and Compensation for Malmö (k) Fee Application				6.75
Total Hours and Compensation for Monthly Fee				173.50
Grand Total Hours and Compensation for August 2008				173.50

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)

Exhibit A - Part 4

PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services

Summary of Expenditures

For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

<u>Transaction Type</u>	<u>Local Currency GBP / USD</u>	<u>Total USD</u>
United Kingdom		
Lodging	399.84	\$646.06
Meals	39.77	\$64.26
Public/ground transportation	38.48	\$62.17
Total Expenditures for United Kingdom	478.09	\$772.49
Total Expenditures for August 2008	478.09	\$772.49

Exhibit A - Part 5

Sea Containers Ltd., et al (Case 06-11156)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Monthly Fixed Fee for Restructuring Services
 Detail of Expenditures by Professional
 For the Period August 1, 2008 through August 31, 2008

Expense Date	Personnel	Transaction Type	Description	Local Currency GBP / USD	Total USD
<i>United Kingdom</i>					
7/10/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Public/ground transportation	0808E001: Taxi from Plumtree Court to St Mary Axe to attend meeting at K&E's offices.	6.00	\$9.69
7/10/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Lodging	0808E002: Sofitel, Paris for 1 night (12 June) attending SCL Board meeting.	399.84	\$646.06
7/10/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Meals	0808E003: Sofitel, Paris cost of 1 breakfast (13 June) attending SCL Board meeting.	22.14	\$35.77
7/10/2008	Michael Berkowitch	Public/ground transportation	0808E004: Taxi fare from Sofitel, Paris to Gare du Nord, Paris (13 June) attending SCL Board meeting.	32.48	\$52.48
8/20/2008	Steven Pearson	Meals	0808E005: Breakfast meeting at Plumtree Court with Jeremy Webb, Mike Berkowitch (PwC) as well as Laura Barlow and Lisa Clement (SCL).	17.63	\$28.49
Total Expenditures for August 2008				\$478.09	\$772.49

Exchange rate 1.6158 published in the London edition of the Financial Times on October 31, 2008.

PwC's standard practice is to treat certain expenses as having been incurred when such obligations are recorded and reflected as payable in PwC's accounting system. Accordingly, reimbursement for certain disbursements sought in connection with this statement may be on account of expenses incurred during the prior statement period.