Exhibit A

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 2 of 29 YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

(302) 571-6600 (800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY) THE BRANDYWINE BUILDING 1000 WEST STREET, 17TH FLOOR WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

(302) 571-1253 FAX www.ycst.com

28,410.07

P.O. Box 391 Wilmington, Delaware 19899-0391

TAX I.D. No. 51-0082644

Total

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 3 of 29

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

AGGREGATE TIME SUMMARY BY MATTER

MATTER		TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL AMOUNT
065635.1001	Case Administration	3.60	\$ 368.50
065635.1002	Court Hearings	3.40	562.00
065635.1004	Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports	1.40	395.00
065635.1007	Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions	14.10	4,695.50
065635.1012	Plan and Disclosure Statement	21.30	8,486.00
065635.1013	Creditor Inquiries	0.60	145.00
065635.1017	Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues	24.50	5,774.00
065635.1018	Fee Application Preparation	3.60	1,122.00
	Total:	72.50	\$ 21,548.00

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

ATTORNEY TIME SUMMARY BY MATTER

MATTER 065635.1001 Case Administration		TOTAL HOURS	HOURLY <u>RATE</u>	TOTAL
Anastasia Joseck	Paralegal	2.30 x\$	115.00 = \$	264.50
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	1.30 x\$	80.00 =	104.00
Tota	1:	3.60	\$	368.50
MATTER 065635.1002 Court Hearings		TOTAL HOURS	HOURLY RATE	TOTAL
Sean T. Greecher	Associate	0.90 x\$	305.00 =	274.50
Anastasia Joseck	Paralegal	2.50 x\$	115.00 =	287.50
Tota	11:	3.40	\$	562.00
MATTER 065635.1004 Schedules & Statements Reports	, U.S. Trustee	TOTAL HOURS	HOURLY <u>RATE</u>	TOTAL
Sean T. Greecher	Associate	1.20 x\$	305.00 =	366.00
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	0.20 x\$	145.00 =	29.00
Tota	al:	1.40	\$	395.00

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 5 of 29

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

MATTER 065635.1007 Claims Analysis, Object Resolutions	tions and	TOTAL <u>HOURS</u>	HOURLY <u>RATE</u>	<u>TOTAL</u>
Robert S. Brady	Partner	0.40 x\$	560.00 =	224.00
Edmon L. Morton	Partner	5.20 x\$	430.00 =	2,236.00
Sean T. Greecher	Associate	6.40 x\$	305.00 =	1,952.00
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	1.40 x\$	145.00 =	203.00
Anastasia Joseck	Paralegal	0.70 x\$	115.00 =	80.50
Tot	al:	14.10	\$	4,695.50
MATTER 065635.1012 Plan and Disclosure Sta	tement	TOTAL <u>HOURS</u>	HOURLY <u>RATE</u>	TOTAL
Robert S. Brady	Partner	3.20 x\$	560.00 =	1,792.00
Edmon L. Morton	Partner	11.50 x\$	120.00	4.045.00
	i ai tiilei	11.30 X\$	430.00 =	4,945.00
Sean T. Greecher	Associate	5.10 x\$	430.00 = 305.00 =	4,945.00 1,555.50
Sean T. Greecher Casey Cathcart				ŕ
	Associate	5.10 x\$	305.00 =	1,555.50

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 6 of 29

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

MATTER 065635.1013 Creditor Inquiries		TOTAL HOURS		HOURLY <u>RATE</u>		TOTAL
Sean T. Greecher	Associate	0.40	x \$	305.00 =	=	122.00
Anastasia Joseck	Paralegal	0.20	x \$	115.00 =	:	23.00
Total:		0.60			\$	145.00
MATTER 065635.1017 Retention of Professionals	/Fee Issues	TOTAL HOURS		HOURLY <u>RATE</u>		TOTAL
Edmon L. Morton	Partner	1.80	x\$	430.00 =	=	774.00
Sean T. Greecher	Associate	12.20	x\$	305.00 =	=	3,721.00
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	3.20	x\$	145.00 =	=	464.00
Anastasia Joseck	Paralegal	6.60	x\$	115.00 =	=	759.00
Troy Bollman	Paralegal	0.70	x \$	80.00 =	=	56.00
Total:		24.50			\$	5,774.00
MATTER 065635.1018 Fee Application Preparati	ion	TOTAL HOURS		HOURLY <u>RATE</u>		TOTAL
Edmon L. Morton	Partner	0.80	x\$	430.00 =	=	344.00
Sean T. Greecher	Associate	2.40	x \$	305.00 =	=	732.00
Anastasia Joseck	Paralegal	0.40	x\$	115.00 =	=	46.00
Total	:	3.60			\$	1,122.00
Aggregate T	'otal:	72.50			\$	21,548.00

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 7 of 29

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

AGGREGATE TIME SUMMARY PAGE BY INDIVIDUAL

	TOTAL HOURS	В	OURLY <u>RATE</u>	TOTAL
Robert S. Brady, Partner	3.60	\$	560.00	\$ 2,016.00
Edmon L. Morton, Partner	19.30	\$	430.00	8,299.00
Sean T. Greecher, Associate	28.60	\$	305.00	8,723.00
Casey Cathcart, Paralegal	5.50	\$	145.00	797.50
Anastasia Joseck, Paralegal	13.50	\$	115.00	1,552.50
Troy Bollman, Paralegal	2.00	\$	80.00	160.00
Total:	72.50			\$ 21,548.00

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1001 - Case Administration

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/6/08	Prepare daily docket for working group and download related pleadings	TBOLL	0.20
8/11/08	Prepare daily docket for working group and download related pleadings	TBOLL	0.30
8/13/08	Prepare daily docket for working group and download related pleadings	TBOLL	0.20
8/14/08	Prepare daily docket for working group and download related pleadings	TBOLL	0.20
8/15/08	Prepare daily docket for working group	TBOLL	0.10
8/19/08	Prepare daily docket for working group	TBOLL	0.10
8/20/08	Prepare daily docket for working group	TBOLL	0.10
8/21/08	Prepare daily docket for working group and download related pleadings	TBOLL	0.10
8/25/08	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel and client	AJOSE	0.20
8/25/08	Draft and finalize for filing and coordinate service of notice of hearing re: sixth quarterly fee request	AJOSE	0.50
8/28/08	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel and client	AJOSE	0.10
8/28/08	Match pleadings with Court docket	AJOSE	0.80
8/28/08	Update critical dates	AJOSE	0.60
8/29/08	Review and evaluate incoming pleadings and correspondence for distribution to co-counsel and client	AJOSE	0.10

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1001 - Case Administration

Attorney	
Hours/Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Anastasia Joseck, Paralegal	
2.30 hours at \$115.00/per hour =	264.50
Troy Bollman, Paralegal	
1.30 hours at \$80.00/per hour =	104.00
Total Hours: 3.60	\$368.50

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1002 - Court Hearings

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/18/08	Calls/emails re: agenda for 8/20 hearing (.30); Review/execute agenda (.10); Work with A. Joseck re: filing/service (.10)	SGREE	0.50
8/18/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of agenda	AJOSE	0.70
8/25/08	Review/execute certification re: omnibus hearing dates	SGREE	0.10
8/25/08	Draft and finalize for filing and coordinate service of certification of counsel re: hearing dates	AJOSE	0.50
8/28/08	Email A. Joseck re: 9/3 agenda	SGREE	0.10
8/28/08	Draft agendas for attorney review	AJOSE	0.50
8/29/08	Work with A. Joseck re: agenda for 9/3 hearing	SGREE	0.20
8/29/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on 9/3/08	AJOSE	0.80

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1002 - Court Hearings

Attorney	
Hours/Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Sean T. Greecher, Associate	
0.90 hours at \$305.00/per hour =	274.50
Anastasia Joseck, Paralegal	
2.50 hours at \$115.00/per hour =	287.50
	Miles
Total Hours: 3.40	\$562.00

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 12 of 29

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1004 - Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/4/08	Review documents/email G. Rogers re: US Trustee quarterly fee payment	SGREE	0.20
8/5/08	Review/coordinate filing of June monthly operating report	SGREE	0.30
8/6/08	Serve monthly operating report for June 2008; prepare and file affidavit of service	CCATH	0.20
8/14/08	Review/coordinate submission of quarterly US Trustee disbursement fees	SGREE	0.70

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 13 of 29

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1004 - Schedules & Statements, U.S. Trustee Reports

Attorney	
Hours/Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Sean T. Greecher, Associate	
1.20 hours at $$305.00/\text{per hour} =$	366.00
Casey Cathcart, Paralegal	
0.20 hours at 145.00/per hour =	29.00
	\$395.00
Total Hours: 1.40	\$393.00

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1007 - Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/1/08	Correspondence to/from David Eaton re: status of opinion on pension settlement; teleconference with Bankruptcy court re: same	RBRAD	0.40
8/1/08	Correspondence from and correspondence to D. Eaton and R. Brady re: pension settlement status; conference with R. Brady re: same	EMORT	0.40
8/8/08	Review objection to Caiafa claim (1.0); Work with E. Morton re: same (.20)	SGREE	1.20
8/9/08	Correspondence from and correspondence to S. Greecher and J. Bjork re: securities claim objection	EMORT	0.50
8/9/08	Work with E. Morton re: Caiafa objection (.20); Review/comment on same (.30); Email to Sidley/Kirkland re: same (.30)	SGREE	0.80
8/11/08	Telephone to D. Buchbinder re: claims objections	EMORT	0.10
8/12/08	Correspondence from and correspondence to S. Singer re: GE settlement/claims issues	EMORT	0.30
8/12/08	Telephone conference with D. Buchbinder re: Sidley/claims issues; conference with S. Greecher re: same	EMORT	0.40
8/14/08	Coordinate preparation of claims binders with claims agent	AJOSE	0.20
8/15/08	Prepare and finalize motion to approve tolling stipulation with GE (review pleadings; numerous correspondence with cocounsel; work with C. Cathcart and S. Greecher re: same)	EMORT	1.30
8/15/08	Conference with R. Brady re: status of pension settlement consideration by Court (.3); correspondence from/to R. Brady and co-counsel re: same (.4); teleconference with co-counsel and R. Brady re: same (.2)	EMORT	0.90
8/15/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of motion to approve entry into tolling agreement	CCATH	0.80
8/20/08	Work with E. Morton and C. Cathcart re: claims objection hearing	SGREE	0.20

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/20/08	Draft and file notice of submission of claims re: third omnibus objection (.4); draft and coordinate service of corrected cover sheet to claim binder to Chambers (.2)	CCATH	0.60
8/22/08	Correspondence from and to S. Greecher re: Caiafa objection	EMORT	0.20
8/22/08	Review Caiafa claim objection (.40); Draft notice and order (.40); Review/compile exhibits (.20)	SGREE	1.00
8/22/08	Calls with court/emails with co-counsel/fee auditor re: omnibus/fee hearings	SGREE	0.40
8/24/08	Review and comment on Dacey Trust objection; conference with S. Greecher re: same	EMORT	1.10
8/24/08	Work with E. Morton re: Dacey and Caiafa claims	SGREE	0.30
8/25/08	Review Caiafa claim objection (.1); work with A. Joseck re: filing/service (.1)	SGREE	0.30
8/25/08	Review responses to 4th omnibus objection (.2); email Kirkland re: same (.2)	SGREE	0.40
8/25/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of claim objection re: proof of claim	AJOSE	0.50
8/26/08	Emails re: Stracey claim	SGREE	0.30
8/26/08	Review/revise/edit objection to Dacey claim	SGREE	1.00
8/27/08	Call with S. Seewer re: claim objections (.2); call counsel to claimant re: same (.1)	SGREE	0.30
8/28/08	Call from counsel to claimant re: 4th omnibus objection	SGREE	0.20

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1007 - Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions

Attorney	
<u>Hours/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Robert S. Brady, Partner	
0.40 hours at \$560.00/per hour =	224.00
Edmon L. Morton, Partner	
5.20 hours at \$430.00/per hour =	2,236.00
Sean T. Greecher, Associate	
6.40 hours at \$305.00/per hour =	1,952.00
Casey Cathcart, Paralegal	
1.40 hours at 145.00/per hour =	203.00
Anastasia Joseck, Paralegal	
0.70 hours at 115.00/per hour =	80.50
Total Hours: 14.10	\$4,695.50

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1012 - Plan and Disclosure Statement

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/1/08	Correspondence from and correspondence to D. Buchbinder re: plan and disclosure statement	EMORT	0.20
8/4/08	Work with E. Morton re: confirmation/plan filing issues	SGREE	0.20
8/4/08	Review documents/motions/precedent re: filing of revised plan/confirmation memo (.40); Emails to/from S. Seewer re: same (.30)	SGREE	0.70
8/5/08	Review documents/schedule for plan process (.20); Emails to/from S. Seewer re: solicitation and plan confirmation issues (.20)	SGREE	0.40
8/5/08	File affidavit of service of BMC Group re: plan and disclosure statement	CCATH	0.10
8/5/08	Prepare and coordinate service of bound copies of disclosure statement and solicitation procedures motion to D. Buchbinder	CCATH	0.60
8/13/08	Review US Trustee issues with disclosure statement and plan	RBRAD	0.40
8/13/08	Correspondence from R. Brady and D. Agay re: disclosure statement/pension claims issues	EMORT	0.20
8/13/08	Correspondence from D. Buchbinder re: plan and disclosure statement issues (includes review); correspondence to D. Agay re: same	EMORT	0.50
8/14/08	Review US Trustee comments to plan/disclosure statement	SGREE	0.20
8/15/08	Teleconference with Bankruptcy court re: status of opinion on pension claim settlement and impact on disclosure statement and confirmation timetable (.3); review disclosure statement for discussion of pension settlement (.2); teleconference and emails with David Agay and David Eaton re: same (.4)	RBRAD	0.90
8/18/08	Correspondence to/from Dave Agay re: status of Court's decision on pension claim settlement and impact confirmation schedule (.2); teleconference with Dave Agay and E. Morton re: same	RBRAD	0.50

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 18 of 29

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/18/08	Correspondence from and correspondence to D. Agay and R. Brady re: disclosure statement and pension settlement issues; teleconference with D. Agay re: same	EMORT	0.60
8/19/08	Teleconference with Nancy Hunt re: status of disclosure statement hearing (2x)	RBRAD	0.30
8/19/08	Correspondence to/from Dave Agay re: status of disclosure statement hearing and court's opinion on pension settlement	RBRAD	0.30
8/19/08	Correspondence from and correspondence to D. Eaton, D. Agay and R. Brady re: Disclosure Statement hearing issues (.8); Correspondence from and correspondence to D. Stratton, D. Eaton and M. Abrams re: same (includes brief call with D. Eaton)(.5)	EMORT	1.30
8/24/08	Correspondence from and to P. Wierbicki and D. Agay re: UST Disclosure Statement issues; conference with S. Greecher re: same	EMORT	0.70
8/24/08	Work with E. Morton re: plan process issues	SGREE	0.20
8/25/08	Review UST plan and disclosure statement issues and discuss same with E. Morton and S. Greecher	RBRAD	0.80
8/25/08	Review plan/disclosure statement and numerous US Trustee comments to same (1.7); conference with S. Greecher (.5); telephone conference with S. Greecher and Kirkland and Ellis resame (1.3); correspondence from and correspondence to D. Buchbinder (.2)	EMORT	3.70
8/25/08	Work with E. Morton re: US Trustees issues concerning plan disclosure statement	SGREE	0.50
8/25/08	Call with E. Morton and Kirkland re: review and discussion of US Trustee comments on plan (portion of call)	SGREE	1.00
8/26/08	Correspondence from and to S. Simon re: UST Disclosure statement issues; Teleconference re: same	EMORT	0.80
8/26/08	Correspondence from and to S. Seewer and S. Greecher re: plan/scheme issues; Conference with S. Greecher re: same	EMORT	0.50

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 19 of 29

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/26/08	Review draft liquidation analysis for disclosure statement (.2); Teleconference with P. Nelson re: same (.3); Draft notice of same (.3); Correspondence from and to P. Nelson and D. Agay (.2)	EMORT	1.00
8/26/08	Review docket and emails to/from S. Singer re: precedent for SCL plan	SGREE	0.70
8/26/08	Emails to/from SCSL committee and client re: professional fee payments	SGREE	0.20
8/26/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of Appendix to Notice of Disclosure Statement	AJOSE	0.80
8/27/08	Correspondence from and to D. Agay re: Disclosure statement issues (3); Correspondence to and from K&E re: same (.2); Teleconference with D. Buchbinder (1.2); Conference with S. Greecher (.3)	EMORT	2.00
8/27/08	Work with E. Morton re: solicitation issues (.3); calls/emails to/from S. Seewer re: same (.3)	SGREE	0.60
8/27/08	Call from Papenberger claimant re: disclosure statement issue (.1); emails re: same (.2)	SGREE	0.30
8/28/08	Call with counsel to Silverpoint re: disclosure statement objection	SGREE	0.10

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1012 - Plan and Disclosure Statement

Attorney	
Hours/Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Robert S. Brady, Partner	
3.20 hours at \$560.00/per hour =	1,792.00
Edmon L. Morton, Partner	
11.50 hours at \$430.00/per hour =	4,945.00
Sean T. Greecher, Associate	
5.10 hours at \$305.00/per hour =	1,555.50
Casey Cathcart, Paralegal	
0.70 hours at \$145.00/per hour =	101.50
Anastasia Joseck, Paralegal	
0.80 hours at \$115.00/per hour =	92.00
Total Hours: 21.30	\$8,486.00

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1013 - Creditor Inquiries

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
7/25/08	Telephone from creditor re: case information; forwarded message to attorney	AJOSE	0.20
8/7/08	Call from interested party re: notice received	SGREE	0.10
8/11/08	Emails to/from Ellison Tillyard re: bankruptcy notice; Email BMC re: same	SGREE	0.20
8/18/08	Call from UK interested party re: disclosure statement notice inquiry	SGREE	0.10

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1013 - Creditor Inquiries

Attorney	
Hours/Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Sean T. Greecher, Associate	
0.40 hours at \$305.00/per hour =	122.00
Anastasia Joseck, Paralegal	
0.20 hours at 115.00/per hour =	23.00
	Market Market Control of the Control
Total Hours: 0.60	\$145.00

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1017 - Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/4/08	Review/coordinate filing of AP Services monthly staffing report	SGREE	0.20
8/4/08	File staffing report by AP Services for June 2008	CCATH	0.20
8/5/08	Review docket/email H. Potts re: Dundas Wilson OCP affidavit	SGREE	0.20
8/5/08	Work with C. Cathcart re: CLM 21st monthly fee application (.10); Review/execute notice re: same (.20)	SGREE	0.30
8/5/08	Review docket; Email with E. Morton and Kirkland re: disclosure statement/solicitation motion service	SGREE	0.20
8/5/08	Review N. Hetherington July fee invoice (.10); Email notice parties re: same (.10)	SGREE	0.20
8/5/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of twenty-first monthly fee application of Carter, Ledyard & Milburn for June 2008	CCATH	0.70
8/6/08	Review document; Email G. Rogers re: Ajilon invoice; Emails to/from G. Rogers re: payment of invoices	SGREE	0.40
8/7/08	Emails with G. Rogers re: Ajilon fees	SGREE	0.20
8/7/08	Review PwC Legal retention order/application (.10); Emails to/from PwC Legal re: same (.10)	SGREE	0.20
8/8/08	Review/execute notices re: PwC Legal fee applications (.40); Work with PwC Legal re: same (.20)	SGREE	0.60
8/8/08	Review/execute notices re: PwC 21st monthly fee application (.20); Coordinate filing/service of same (.10)	SGREE	0.30
8/8/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of monthly fee application of PwC for June 2008	CCATH	0.50
8/8/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of monthly fee application of PwC Legal for April 2008	CCATH	0.30
8/8/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of monthly fee application of PwC Legal for May 2008	CCATH	0.20
8/8/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of monthly fee application of PwC Legal for June 2008	CCATH	0.30

Case 06-11156-KJC Doc 2312-2 Filed 11/04/08 Entered 11/04/08 16:49:20 Desc Exhibit A Page 24 of 29

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/8/08	Coordinate service re: 15th fee application of PwC Legal, 16th fee application of PwC Legal, 17th fee application of PwC Legal, and 21st fee application of PwC Legal	TBOLL	0.10
8/11/08	Emails to/from G. Rogers and Kirkland re: Taylor Root fees	SGREE	0.30
8/11/08	File affidavit of service re: monthly fee application of PwC for June 2008, monthly fee application of PwC Legal for April 2008, monthly fee application of PwC Legal for May 2008, and monthly fee application of PwC Legal for June 2008	ССАТН	0.10
8/12/08	Conference with S. Greecher (multiple) re: OCP issues (includes research re: same)	EMORT	0.50
8/12/08	Conference with S. Greecher re: quarterly fee notice and YCST application	EMORT	0.30
8/12/08	Emails with M. McCarthy re: Taylor Root (.60); Work with G. Rogers and H. Potts (.20); Work with E. Morton (.20); Review documents re: same (.40)	SGREE	1.40
8/12/08	Emails with M. McCarthy re: Fenner Moeran OCP affidavit	SGREE	0.20
8/12/08	Work with A. Joseck re: PwC Legal fees/quarterly fee notice	SGREE	0.20
8/12/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 16th fee request of PwC Legal	AJOSE	0.60
8/12/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 15th fee request of PwC Legal	AJOSE	0.60
8/12/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of 17th fee request of PwC Legal	AJOSE	0.60
8/12/08	Finalize seventh interim fee request of debtors' professionals for attorney review	AJOSE	1.10
8/13/08	Emails to/from R. Cavaliere re: Vollman fee application	SGREE	0.30
8/13/08	Email re: payments to contract attorneys	SGREE	0.10
8/13/08	Coordinate service re: 21st fee application of Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor for June 2008	TBOLL	0.10
8/14/08	Conference with S. Greecher re: Vollman fee issues; research re: same	EMORT	0.50

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/14/08	Review documents/invoices re: Taylor Root payments (.50); Calls/emails with Kirkland re: same (.30); Review motion/order re: same (.20)	SGREE	1.00
8/14/08	Review/execute notices re: Vollman 2nd/3rd fee applications (.60); Work with E. Morton re: same (.20); Emails to/from counsel to Vollman (.20)	SGREE	1.00
8/14/08	Review/execute notice re: 7th interim fees	SGREE	0.30
8/14/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of interim fee request	AJOSE	1.20
8/14/08	Finalize draft and circulate interim fee request to professionals for final review	AJOSE	0.50
8/14/08	Coordinate service re: second interim fee application of Vollman Brothers, third interim fee application of Vollman Brothers and notice of service and filing of seventh quarterly fee requests of Debtors' professionals	TBOLL	0.20
8/15/08	Email/call with counsel to Vollman re: fee applications	SGREE	0.20
8/15/08	Email Kirkland re: quarterly fee hearing	SGREE	0.20
8/15/08	Review/coordinate filing of AP Services quarterly fee application	SGREE	0.40
8/15/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of AP Services' report of compensation and expenses incurred for April through June 2008	CCATH	0.50
8/15/08	Coordinate service re: AP Services fee application for April 2008 to June 2008	TBOLL	0.10
8/18/08	Calls/emails with M. Mccarthy re: OCP retention issues (.20); Draft supplemental notice (.20); Coordinate filing/service (.10)	SGREE	0.50
8/18/08	Coordinate service re: notice of supplemental list of ordinary course professionals	TBOLL	0.10
8/20/08	Email C. Cathcart re: Reed Smith Richards Butler CNO filing	SGREE	0.10
8/20/08	Review documents; Email Dundas Wilson re: invoices	SGREE	0.30
8/20/08	Emails to/from G. Rogers re: Punter Southall fees	SGREE	0.20
8/20/08	Emails to/from Kirkland and fee auditor re: 7th quarterly fee hearing	SGREE	0.40

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/20/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of certificate of no objection re: Reed Smith Richards Butler's monthly fee application for June 2008	ССАТН	0.40
8/20/08	Coordinate service re: certificate of no objection to Reed Smith Richards Butler fee application for June 2008	TBOLL	0.10
8/25/08	Review email correspondence (.1); email G. Rogers re: SCS Committee professional payments	SGREE	0.20
8/25/08	Review/execute notice re: 6th quarterly hearing	SGREE	0.10
8/25/08	Review SC Services committee correspondence re: professional fees (.2); email G. Rogers re: same (.1)	SGREE	0.30
8/25/08	Emails re: Kirkland July fee application (.2); review/execute notice re: same (.2); work with A. Joseck re: filing/service of same (.1)	SGREE	0.50
8/25/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of cno re: K&E's 20th fee application	AJOSE	0.40
8/25/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of Kirkland's 21st monthly fee application	AJOSE	0.80
8/26/08	Correspondence from and to C. Cavin re: Vollman fee issues	EMORT	0.50
8/26/08	Review AP Services monthly staffing report	SGREE	0.10
8/26/08	Emails re: PwC Legal fee applications	SGREE	0.10
8/26/08	Finalize for filing and coordinate service of staffing report of AP Services	AJOSE	0.30
8/27/08	Review/execute notice re: Reed Smith Richards Butler fee application	SGREE	0.20
8/27/08	Draft notice and finalize for filing and coordinate service of RSRB 20th fee application	AJOSE	0.50
8/28/08	Review fee auditor reports for debtor professionals (.3); emails to professionals re: same (.3)	SGREE	0.60
8/28/08	Review/execute CNO re: Carter Ledyard 21st monthly fee application	SGREE	0.10
8/29/08	Email G. Rogers re: Taylor Root invoices	SGREE	0.10

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1017 - Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues

Attorney	
Hours/Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Edmon L. Morton, Partner	
1.80 hours at \$430.00/per hour =	774.00
Sean T. Greecher, Associate	
12.20 hours at \$305.00/per hour =	3,721.00
Casey Cathcart, Paralegal	
3.20 hours at \$145.00/per hour =	464.00
Anastasia Joseck, Paralegal	
6.60 hours at \$115.00/per hour =	759.00
Troy Bollman, Paralegal	
0.70 hours at \$80.00/per hour =	56.00
Total Hours: 24.50	\$5,774.00

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1018 - Fee Application Preparation

Date	Description	Attorney	Time
8/7/08	Review Young Conaway June fee application for privilege/accuracy/compliance with local rules	SGREE	1.10
8/10/08	Work on June YCST fee application	EMORT	0.80
8/13/08	Review/execute notice re: Young Conaway June fee application (.20); Coordinate filing/service of same (.20)	SGREE	0.40
8/14/08	Draft certificates of no objection re: YCST's 19th and 20th fee applications	AJOSE	0.40
8/15/08	Review/execute CNO re: Young Conaway April-May fee applications	SGREE	0.10
8/18/08	Review/revise Young Conaway July invoice for privilege/accuracy/compliance with local rules	SGREE	0.80

Sea Container Ltd. Billing Period Through August 31, 2008

MATTER 065635.1018 - Fee Application Preparation

Attorney	
Hours/Rate	<u>Amount</u>
Edmon L. Morton, Partner	
0.80 hours at \$430.00/per hour =	344.00
Sean T. Greecher, Associate	
2.40 hours at \$305.00/per hour =	732.00
Anastasia Joseck, Paralegal	
0.40 hours at 115.00/per hour =	46.00

Total Hours: 3.60	\$1,122.00