

# Attachment A

Urban Brands, Inc.  
TIME RECORDS BY SERVICES RENDERED  
Period from: 4/1/11 to 4/30/11

Date	Employee	Task Code	Description	Hours	Fees
Friday, April 01, 2011	DO	3	Reviewed Section 503(b)(9) claims status file and Ken Simon's update communication to Committee Counsel	0.50	\$ 275.00
Friday, April 01, 2011	DO	8	Reviewed latest version of Recovery Analysis Report updated by Annie Wang	0.30	165.00
Friday, April 01, 2011	KS	8	Review and revisions to recovery analysis	1.70	1181.50
Friday, April 01, 2011	KS	20	Review and revisions to 503(b)(9) claims analysis	1.40	973.00
Monday, April 04, 2011	DO	18	Reviewed Tax Claims by State Scheduled forwarded by Jim Horgan in anticipation of 2.00pm conference call with PwC	0.40	220.00
Monday, April 04, 2011	DO	22	Participated in 2.00pm conference call with Ken Simon and PwC	1.00	550.00
Monday, April 04, 2011	KS	3	Review analysis prepared by PwC of priority tax claims and compare to information included in LM+Co recovery analysis	1.10	764.50
Monday, April 04, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for and participation in conference call with PwC professionals, S. Feldman and D. O'Brien to discuss tax claims filed and steps to minimize certain filed claims	0.90	625.50
Monday, April 04, 2011	KS	22	Review comments from S. Feldman re: 503(b)(9) claims analysis forwarded to him on 4/1/2011.	0.60	417.00
Tuesday, April 05, 2011	KS	22	Discussions with S. Feldman re: various emails and revisions to 503(b)(9) claims analysis and amount due from CIT Group	2.20	1529.00
Wednesday, April 06, 2011	AW	8	Edits and modifications to recovery analysis	0.50	187.50
Wednesday, April 06, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis to reflect comments received from S. Feldman re: 503(b)(9) claims, amount due from CIT, credit card receivable holdback adjustment, etc.	2.60	1807.00
Monday, April 11, 2011	DO	3	Reviewed blacklined version of updated TSA draft forwarded by Jim Horgan	0.60	330.00
Monday, April 11, 2011	DO	37	Corresponded with local counsel on interim fee app preparation	0.10	55.00
Tuesday, April 12, 2011	DO	1	Provided March Time Descriptions to Jesse Millner for the purpose of preparing a March fee application to Court	0.10	55.00
Tuesday, April 12, 2011	DO	37	Reviewed and Issued 2nd interim fee application to Leslie Heilman for filing and serving	0.40	220.00
Tuesday, April 12, 2011	JM	37	Prepared fee application	0.50	187.50
Thursday, April 14, 2011	DO	1	Reviewed correspondence between Ken Simon and Steve Feldman and Committee Counsel on CC issue	0.20	110.00
Friday, April 15, 2011	DO	1	Reviewed Sixth Fee Application prepared by Jesse Millner and issued to local counsel for filing and serving	1.00	550.00
Tuesday, April 19, 2011	KS	3	Review draft settlement agreement with CIT and compare to information included in LM+Co recovery analysis. Also, prepared email to S. Feldman raising certain questions.	1.10	764.50
Tuesday, April 19, 2011	KS	3	Review numerous documents including proposed settlement agreement and various supporting schedules and exhibits, etc.	2.40	1668.00
Tuesday, April 19, 2011	KS	22	Discussion with J. Horgan re: proposed settlement agreement	0.30	208.50
Tuesday, April 19, 2011	KS	1	Prepare email to counsel re: preliminary list of significant unresolved items and issues	0.90	625.50
Tuesday, April 19, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis	0.40	278.00
Wednesday, April 20, 2011	AW	8	Edits and modifications to recovery analysis	1.50	562.50
Wednesday, April 20, 2011	DO	3	Reviewed Post Closing Date Reconciliation Items with New Ashley Stewart (Exhibit 1) forwarded by Jim Horgan	0.40	220.00
Wednesday, April 20, 2011	DO	3	Reviewed revised Settlement Agreement with Curtis comments dated 4/18/2011 and related correspondence forwarded by Jim Horgan	0.60	330.00
Wednesday, April 20, 2011	KS	3	Read revised proposed settlement agreement and related exhibits and adjust true-up calculation to reflect updated amounts	1.50	1042.50
Wednesday, April 20, 2011	KS	4	Discussion with M. Klein re: revised 503(b)(9) calculations	0.30	208.50
Wednesday, April 20, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis	1.80	1251.00
Wednesday, April 20, 2011	KS	22	Discussion with S. Feldman and revisions to calculation of amount due from CIT Group and revision to recovery analysis	1.60	1112.00
Wednesday, April 20, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for and telephone call with S. Feldman and J. Horgan re: proposed revisions to personal property tax calculation	1.40	973.00
Thursday, April 21, 2011	AW	8	Edits and modifications to recovery analysis	4.00	1500.00
Thursday, April 21, 2011	KS	4	Email to counsel re: status of true-up calculation and need for a pre conference call to prepare for meeting on Tuesday	0.60	417.00
Thursday, April 21, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis to account for and disclose details of positive cash adjustments, personal property tax changes, 503(b)(9) update, etc.	3.10	2154.50
Thursday, April 21, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for and telephone call with S. Feldman and J. Horgan to discuss numerous true-up issues, transition services agreement, open items, etc.	2.90	2015.50
Friday, April 22, 2011	KS	3	Reconcile true-up calculation prepared by Debtor to calculation prepared by LM+Co and email to Debtor re: differences	0.70	486.50
Friday, April 22, 2011	KS	22	Various discussions with J. Horgan and S. Feldman re: various true-up adjustments, etc.	0.70	486.50
Friday, April 22, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to draft recovery analysis	1.90	1320.50
Friday, April 22, 2011	KS	20	Update 503(b)(9) analysis and forward to various professionals with explanatory email	1.40	973.00
Friday, April 22, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for conference call with Committee and Debtor representatives on April 25th to discuss open issues that need to be resolved including review of latest draft settlement documents and related exhibits, etc.	0.80	556.00
Monday, April 25, 2011	KS	3	Obtain additional information about 503 (b)(9) claims and modify analysis to reflect changes	0.90	625.50
Monday, April 25, 2011	KS	3	Review relevant sections of executed APA to clarify treatment of excess, if any, over \$1.4mm of assumed IT and non IT contract costs	0.70	486.50
Monday, April 25, 2011	KS	22	Subsequent discussions with SA Feldman, J. Horgan and P. Mandarino on outstanding additional issues	1.20	834.00
Monday, April 25, 2011	KS	1	Prepare email describing outstanding issues and proposed resolutions	0.60	417.00
Monday, April 25, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis	0.30	208.50

Urban Brands, Inc.  
TIME RECORDS BY SERVICES RENDERED  
Period from: 4/1/11 to 4/30/11

Date	Employee	Task Code	Description	Hours	Fees
Monday, April 25, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for and participation in conference call with L. Gottlieb, M. Klein, P. Mandarino, J. Horgan, S. Feldman, M. Collins and K. Good to discuss unresolved settlement issues	1.60	1112.00
Tuesday, April 26, 2011	KS	3	Review response from GBM re: unresolved purchase price settlement issues and prepare comprehensive email to various professionals addressing comments	1.80	1251.00
Tuesday, April 26, 2011	KS	3	Review relevant sections of APA and Draft Settlement proposal and prepare notes re: the financial issues that should be modified and the justification for such modification	1.70	1181.50
Tuesday, April 26, 2011	KS	22	Discussion with S. Feldman re: changes to the executed APA that are contemplated in the settlement agreement	0.50	347.50
Tuesday, April 26, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis	0.30	208.50
Tuesday, April 26, 2011	KS	17	Update 503(b)(9) analysis to account for claims that were filed by claims traders and others and omitted from the initial analysis	0.70	486.50
Tuesday, April 26, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for and conference call with P. Mandarino, S. Feldman and J. Horgan to discuss GBM response to settlement proposal	0.50	347.50
Wednesday, April 27, 2011	KS	3	Review proposed settlement documents and discussion with M. Klein re: existing concerns	1.30	903.50
Wednesday, April 27, 2011	KS	20	Calculate maximum liability (under various scenarios) for 503(b)(9) claims, prepare summary and discussion with S. Feldman re: outcome and request for additional information	1.90	1320.50
Wednesday, April 27, 2011	KS	21	Review filed priority tax claims and summarize by category	0.90	625.50
Wednesday, April 27, 2011	MB	8	Edits and modifications to recovery analysis	1.10	522.50
Thursday, April 28, 2011	KS	21	Revised detailed analysis of 503(b)(9) claims to reflect updated information	2.10	1459.50
Friday, April 29, 2011	KS	24	Discussion with S. Sasser (GBM) re: need for final settlement meeting, etc.	0.30	208.50
Friday, April 29, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis to reflect additional information	0.80	556.00
Friday, April 29, 2011	KS	21	Review priority claims files	0.70	486.50
Friday, April 29, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for and various calls with S. Feldman, J. Horgan and M. Abate to discuss open issues (cash reconciliations, payable reimbursements, personal property taxes, etc.)	2.90	2015.50
Friday, April 29, 2011	MB	8	Edits and modifications to recovery analysis	1.10	522.50
<b>Total:</b>				<b>70.30</b>	<b>\$ 45,482.50</b>