

# Attachment A

Urban Brands, Inc.  
TIME RECORDS BY SERVICES RENDERED  
Period from: 5/1/11 to 5/31/11

Date	Employee	Task Code	Description	Hours	Fees
Monday, May 02, 2011	DO	11	Sourced and reviewed February and March 2011 Monthly Operating Reports filed by Debtor on the docket	1.20	\$ 660.00
Monday, May 02, 2011	DO	8	Reviewed latest version of Recovery Analysis updated by Ken Simon	0.80	440.00
Tuesday, May 03, 2011	AW	8	Edits and modifications to recovery analysis	0.50	187.50
Tuesday, May 03, 2011	DO	8	Reviewed Recovery Analysis issued by Ken Simon to counsel and related correspondence on amount due from CIT	0.40	220.00
Tuesday, May 03, 2011	KS	4	Various discussions with S. Feldman, J. Horgan and L. Gottlieb re: unresolved issues and need to have an in person meeting with GBM representatives address and resolve	1.40	973.00
Tuesday, May 03, 2011	KS	3	Review schedule of post petition refundable utility deposits and discussion with J. Horgan re: same	0.60	417.00
Tuesday, May 03, 2011	KS	3	Read proposed settlement with CIT re: refundable excess cash and discussion and prepare reconciliation re: final amount due	1.30	903.50
Tuesday, May 03, 2011	KS	3	Review schedule of post petition utility deposits and discussion with J. Horgan re: same	0.40	278.00
Tuesday, May 03, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis	0.40	278.00
Wednesday, May 04, 2011	AW	8	Edits and modifications to recovery analysis	0.50	187.50
Wednesday, May 04, 2011	DO	3	Reviewed post petition security deposits Excel file forwarded by Jim Horgan	0.30	165.00
Wednesday, May 04, 2011	KS	20	Obtain additional information about settled 503(b)(9) claims and update analysis	1.70	1,181.50
Wednesday, May 04, 2011	KS	4	Discussion with S. Feldman re: status of true-up meeting, pre petition priority claims and applicability of interest and penalties, etc.	0.50	347.50
Wednesday, May 04, 2011	KS	4	Discussions with committee member re: 503(b)(9) claims and status of settlements	0.80	556.00
Wednesday, May 04, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis	0.90	625.50
Thursday, May 05, 2011	DO	4	Reviewed correspondence with Committee Counsel on Personal Property Taxes	0.20	110.00
Thursday, May 05, 2011	KS	4	Discussions with S. Feldman re: settlement status conference and personal property tax issue, etc.	0.60	417.00
Thursday, May 05, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis	0.40	278.00
Thursday, May 05, 2011	KS	1	Draft memo and forward to counsel re: personally property taxes, measurement date for allocation purposes, unresolved issue between Buyer and Seller, etc.	1.60	1,112.00
Thursday, May 05, 2011	KS	4	Discussion and email to M. Klein re: personal property and interest and penalty issue	0.20	139.00
Monday, May 09, 2011	DO	4	Provided April Time Descriptions to Jesse Millner	0.10	55.00
Monday, May 09, 2011	JM	37	Prepared fee application	0.50	187.50
Monday, May 09, 2011	KS	11	Review the monthly operating reports for the periods January 30, 2011 to February 26, 2011 and February 23, 2011 to April 2, 2011 and the related emails from M. Klein and S. Feldman	1.40	973.00
Monday, May 09, 2011	KS	3	Review various filed proofs of claim forwarded to me from S. Feldman and other related issues re: differences between book balance and filed proof of claims, etc.	0.60	417.00
Monday, May 09, 2011	KS	3	Review retention application of BDO for tax services and fixed fee quote	0.20	139.00
Monday, May 09, 2011	KS	20	Review email re: revision to Zhejiang Tong-Yuan 503(b)(9) claim, discussion with S. Feldman re: same and update recovery analysis and related schedules to reflect revised amount	1.40	973.00
Tuesday, May 10, 2011	DO	8	Updated recovery analysis for professional fee applications made to date (Note 5, page 8) and estimates through completion of the case	1.50	825.00
Tuesday, May 10, 2011	DO	3	Reviewed professional fees by firm spreadsheet forwarded by Ken Simon	0.30	165.00
Tuesday, May 10, 2011	DO	8	Updated recovery analysis for professional fee applications made by the BMC Group to date to match Steve Feldman's file	0.50	275.00
Tuesday, May 10, 2011	DO	8	Updated latest version of recovery analysis	0.30	165.00
Tuesday, May 10, 2011	DO	3	Checked docket and updated Note 5 of the draft recovery analysis to reflect actual March fee app filed by PwC with the Court and forwarded to Ken Simon	0.30	165.00
Tuesday, May 10, 2011	KS	4	Various discussions with S. Feldman re: status of settlement meeting, state and local tax payments made with filing of extension requests, updated analysis of professional fees, etc.	0.80	556.00
Tuesday, May 10, 2011	KS	4	Preparation of emails to counsel re: settlement discussions, etc.	0.40	278.00
Tuesday, May 10, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis to account for updated information re: professional fees, income tax obligations, 503(b)(9) settled claims, etc.	2.10	1,459.50
Wednesday, May 11, 2011	DO	1	Met with Ken Simon on required revisions to recovery analysis and updated same throughout the morning	3.80	2,090.00
Wednesday, May 11, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis	1.90	1,320.50
Wednesday, May 11, 2011	KS	4	Various discussions with S. Feldman re: status of settlement discussions and identify potential solutions	0.90	625.50
Wednesday, May 11, 2011	KS	21	Review electronic listing of filed claims	0.70	486.50
Wednesday, May 11, 2011	KS	4	Email to counsel re: status of settlement discussion	0.20	139.00
Wednesday, May 11, 2011	KS	4	Read and respond to various emails	0.40	278.00
Thursday, May 12, 2011	DO	1	Reviewed April 2011 Fee Application and provided edits to Jesse Millner and issued revised version to local counsel for filing and serving	1.00	550.00
Thursday, May 12, 2011	JM	37	Updated fee application	0.50	187.50
Thursday, May 12, 2011	KS	4	Review and respond to various emails from counsel and S. Feldman and discussions with S. Feldman re: settlement meeting with S. Strasser, M. Abate, K. Simon and S. Feldman	2.10	1,459.50
Friday, May 13, 2011	KS	4	Preparation for and discussion strategy discussion with S. Feldman re: strategy for the settlement meeting scheduled for Tuesday (May 17th)	0.80	556.00
Friday, May 13, 2011	KS	21	Review various electronic claims files	0.90	625.50
Friday, May 13, 2011	KS	3	Review proposed settlement agreement in preparation for settlement meeting on May 17th	0.40	278.00
Monday, May 16, 2011	KS	4	Discussions and emails to S. Feldman re: preparing for settlement meeting on May, 17th	0.80	556.00
Monday, May 16, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for settlement meeting on May 17th including review of APA, draft settlement agreement, true-up calculation variances, etc.	1.90	1,320.50
Monday, May 16, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis	0.90	625.50
Monday, May 16, 2011	KS	21	Review filed personal property/ad valorem claims	0.50	347.50
Tuesday, May 17, 2011	DO	8	Updated recovery analysis to amend estimated provision for professional fees through completion of the case and forwarded to Ken Simon	0.30	165.00
Tuesday, May 17, 2011	DO	22	Prepared for and attended meeting with Steve Feldman, Mike Abate, S. Strasser and Ken Simon on unresolved true-up adjustments	2.50	1,375.00
Tuesday, May 17, 2011	DO	8	Updated Notes 5 and 8 to recovery analysis to reflect Ken Simon's suggested amendments	0.30	165.00
Tuesday, May 17, 2011	DO	22	Met with Ken Simon and Steve Feldman on required changes to base case and basis for scenario analysis on discussions with GBM	1.20	660.00
Tuesday, May 17, 2011	DO	8	Updated base case in recovery analysis	2.00	1,100.00
Tuesday, May 17, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for and meeting with S. Strasser, M. Abate, S. Feldman and D. O'Brien re: resolution of disputed true-up adjustments	4.10	2,849.50
Tuesday, May 17, 2011	KS	22	Subsequent meetings with S. Feldman and D. O'Brien re: outcome of previous meeting and analysis that needed to be performed	1.20	834.00

Urban Brands, Inc.  
TIME RECORDS BY SERVICES RENDERED  
Period from: 5/11/11 to 5/31/11

Date	Employee	Task Code	Description	Hours	Fees
Wednesday, May 18, 2011	DO	1	Met with Ken Simon on required adjustments to recovery analysis base case following prior day meetings	1.50	825.00
Wednesday, May 18, 2011	DO	22	Participated in conference call with Steve Feldman on additional questions regarding correct cash number	0.50	275.00
Wednesday, May 18, 2011	DO	8	Revised recovery analysis, notes and exhibits throughout the morning for submission to Committee Counsel	2.40	1,320.00
Wednesday, May 18, 2011	DO	8	Prepared Document on Proposed True-Up Adjustments and Impact on Recovery Analysis after consultation with Ken Simon on formatting	2.00	1,100.00
Wednesday, May 18, 2011	KS	4	Various discussions with S. Feldman re: unresolved settlement issues	0.80	556.00
Wednesday, May 18, 2011	KS	23	Update true-up calculation to account for details of additional cash adjustments	1.10	764.50
Wednesday, May 18, 2011	KS	8	Update recovery analysis to account for additional adjustments and disclosures	1.40	973.00
Wednesday, May 18, 2011	KS	4	Emails to counsel re: status of true-up discussions, etc.	0.60	417.00
Wednesday, May 18, 2011	KS	23	Preparation of analysis of base case, committee settlement proposal and buyers counter proposal and notes thereto	1.20	834.00
Thursday, May 19, 2011	DO	23	Participated in conference call with Committee Counsel, Steve Feldman and Ken Simon on status of true-up	0.80	440.00
Thursday, May 19, 2011	KS	23	Preparation for and participation in 12:30pm conference call with L. Gottlieb, C. Hershkopf, M. Klein, S. Feldman and D. O'Brien re: status of true-up settlement discussions and "next steps"	2.20	1,529.00
Thursday, May 19, 2011	KS	21	Review electronic claims files and compare with amounts used in recovery analysis	1.90	1,320.50
Thursday, May 19, 2011	KS	21	Email to counsel re: interest and penalties included in filed tax proofs of claim	0.30	208.50
Thursday, May 19, 2011	KS	4	Email to counsel re: 90 day extension for payment of assumed 503(b)(9) claims	0.10	69.50
Friday, May 20, 2011	KS	21	Review detailed electronic claims files provided by debtor in order to assess total of whole dollar claims (after eliminating claims that ultimately will not have priority status) and unsecured claims and compare to amounts used in draft recovery analysis	2.60	1,807.00
Friday, May 20, 2011	KS	21	Discussions with S. Feldman re: disputed settlement true-up items, cash on hand and claims data, etc.	0.50	347.50
Monday, May 23, 2011	KS	22	Review previously proposed lower of cost or market disallowed adjustments and send analysis to S. Feldman in anticipation that the question will be raised at the next settlement meeting	0.80	556.00
Monday, May 23, 2011	KS	4	Review and respond to various emails from S. Feldman, P. Mandarino, J. Horgan and L. Gottlieb re: possible settlement meeting with S. Strasser re: final true-up adjustments	1.80	1,251.00
Monday, May 23, 2011	KS	3	Review true-up calculations prepared by J. Horgan and S. Feldman and discussed additional adjustments that needed to be made with S. Feldman	1.40	973.00
Monday, May 23, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to LM+Co recovery analysis and true-up calculation included therein	1.20	834.00
Tuesday, May 24, 2011	DO	3	Reviewed updated Reconciliation Items - Proposed resolution spreadsheet and related correspondence pending Thursday's meeting	0.50	275.00
Tuesday, May 24, 2011	DO	1	Reviewed updated recovery reports issued to PwC	0.30	165.00
Tuesday, May 24, 2011	KS	4	Various discussions and emails to S. Feldman and others re: New Jersey Corporation Business tax disputed assessment	1.20	834.00
Tuesday, May 24, 2011	KS	22	Various emails and discussions with S. Feldman and L. Gottlieb re: strategy for the Thursday settlement meeting with financial advisors	1.90	1,320.50
Tuesday, May 24, 2011	KS	22	Preparation of latest true-up status reconciliation along with cover letter to counsel and S. Feldman	2.20	1,529.00
Wednesday, May 25, 2011	KS	21	Review and respond to emails regarding \$547,000 New Jersey Corporation Business tax assessment and go forward strategy	0.80	556.00
Wednesday, May 25, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for 5/26/2011 settlement meeting with S. Strasser, S. Feldman, P. Mandarino, J. Horgan, M. Abate and D. O'Brien including revisions to latest true-up calculation, etc.	1.30	903.50
Thursday, May 26, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for and pre meeting with P. Mandarino, S. Feldman and J. Horgan to discuss strategy for resolving disputed true-up issues	2.70	1,876.50
Thursday, May 26, 2011	KS	22	Meeting with P. Mandarino, J. Horgan, S. Feldman, M. Kahn and S. Strasser to discuss and resolve disputed true-up adjustments	1.50	1,042.50
Thursday, May 26, 2011	KS	22	Post meeting conference with S. Feldman, J. Horgan and L. Gottlieb to discuss final negotiated resolution of true-up adjustments	0.50	347.50
Tuesday, May 31, 2011	KS	3	Review and revisions to draft business term sheet prepared by S. Strasser, including various discussions with S. Feldman to coordinate response	1.60	1,112.00
Tuesday, May 31, 2011	KS	4	Emails to counsel re: draft to business term sheet	0.70	486.50
Tuesday, May 31, 2011	KS	22	Preparation for and conference call with S. Feldman and PwC tax professionals re: status of state and local corporation and sales and use tax assessments	0.70	486.50
Tuesday, May 31, 2011	KS	3	Review true-up calculation included in draft business term sheet.	0.10	69.50
<b>Total:</b>				<u>95.50</u>	<u>\$ 62,107.50</u>