

EXHIBIT A

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B110 - Case Administration					
Heilman,L.C.	06/15/11	Review recent bankruptcy filings	380.00	0.10	38.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/24/11	Receive and review agenda for omnibus/fee hearing	380.00	0.10	38.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/24/11	E-mail from M. Klein re: omnibus hearing	380.00	0.10	38.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/27/11	Review agenda for omnibus hearing	380.00	0.10	38.00
Total B110				0.40	\$152.00
B160 - Fee/Employment Applications					
Kittinger,J.E.	06/02/11	Draft certificate of no objection regarding sixth monthly fee application of Ballard Spahr LLP	180.00	0.20	36.00
Daluz,T.M.	06/03/11	Review/revise CNO (.1); Oversee filing (.2)	650.00	0.30	195.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/03/11	Finalize for filing, coordinate service and e-file certificate of no objection regarding sixth monthly fee application of Ballard Spahr LLP	180.00	0.40	72.00
Daluz,T.M.	06/08/11	Review fee application (.5)	650.00	0.50	325.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/08/11	Prepare for filing seventh monthly fee application of Cooley LLP	180.00	0.40	72.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/09/11	Prepare for filing seventh monthly fee application of Cooley LLP	180.00	0.60	108.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/10/11	Finalize for filing, coordinate service and e-file seventh monthly fee application of Cooley LLP	180.00	1.30	234.00
Daluz,T.M.	06/10/11	Review Cooley's fee application for filing (.2)	650.00	0.20	130.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/13/11	Preparation for filing of eighth monthly fee application of Loughlin Meghji + Company Inc.	180.00	0.20	36.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kittinger,J.E.	06/13/11	Finalize for filing, coordinate service and e-file seventh monthly fee application of Ballard Spahr LLP	180.00	1.10	198.00
Daluz,T.M.	06/13/11	Fee application review and revise (.3); Oversee filing (.2)	650.00	0.50	325.00
Daluz,T.M.	06/14/11	Review bill for fee application (.3)	650.00	0.30	195.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/17/11	Review omnibus fee order for committee fees	180.00	0.30	54.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/20/11	Draft certificate of no objection to Loughlin Meghji + Company Inc.'s seventh monthly fee application	180.00	0.20	36.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/20/11	E-mail correspondence to/from J. Finocchiaro re: comments to proposed second interim fee order	380.00	0.20	76.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/20/11	Review and revise proposed second interim fee order	380.00	0.20	76.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/20/11	Review CNO to LM+Co's seventh monthly fee application (.1); coordinate filing and service of same (.1)	380.00	0.20	76.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/20/11	Telephone call with D. O'Brien re: changes to proposed second interim fee order	380.00	0.10	38.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/23/11	Receive and review certification of counsel re: omnibus order for second interim fee applications	380.00	0.10	38.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/24/11	E-mail correspondence from/to K. Good re: status of hearing on Committee fee applications (.2); e-mail correspondence to M. Klein and D. O'Brien re: same (.1)	380.00	0.30	114.00
Daluz,T.M.	06/27/11	Review billing re: fee application (.5)	650.00	0.50	325.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/29/11	Revise eighth monthly fee application of Loughlin Mehjji + Company Inc.	180.00	0.50	90.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Heilman,L.C.	06/29/11	E-mail correspondence from/to R. Winning, M. Klein re: Cooley's May fee application (.3); e-mail correspondence to/from M. Klein re: Cooley's interim fee application (.2); coordinate preparation of interim fee applications for LM+CO and Ballard Spahr (.1) ; e-mail to J. Kittinger re: Cooley's May fee application (.1)	380.00	0.70	266.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/30/11	Review and revise May fee application for Cooley for filing	380.00	0.20	76.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/30/11	Coordinate preparation of Cooley's third interim fee application for filing	380.00	0.10	38.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/30/11	Review and revise May fee application for LM+CO for filing	380.00	0.20	76.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/30/11	E-mail correspondence from M. Klein re: Cooley's third interim fee application	380.00	0.10	38.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/30/11	Draft third quarterly fee application of Loughlin Meghji + Company, Inc.	180.00	0.90	162.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/30/11	Finalize for filing, coordinate service and e-file eighth monthly fee application of Cooley LLP	180.00	0.60	108.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/30/11	Revise third quarterly fee application of Cooley LLP	180.00	0.40	72.00
Kittinger,J.E.	06/30/11	Finalize for filing, coordinate service and e-file eighth monthly fee application of Loughlin Meghji + Company, Inc.	180.00	0.50	90.00
Total B160				12.30	\$3,775.00
B320 - Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)					
Heilman,L.C.	06/15/11	Telephone call with counsel for landlord re: status of Plan	380.00	0.10	38.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/15/11	E-mail correspondence to M. Klein re: status of Plan filing	380.00	0.10	38.00
Daluz,T.M.	06/20/11	Review exclusivity motion (.2)	650.00	0.20	130.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Heilman,L.C.	06/20/11	Review motion to extend exclusivity periods (.1), schedule deadlines for same (.1)	380.00	0.20	76.00
Heilman,L.C.	06/21/11	E-mail correspondence to landlord creditor re: plan status	380.00	0.10	38.00
Total B320				<u>0.70</u>	<u>\$320.00</u>
Total Fees				<u>13.40</u>	<u>4,247.00</u>

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SUMMARY

<u>Name</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Task: B110 - Case Administration			
Heilman,L.C.	380.00	0.40	152.00
Total Task: B110		0.40	\$152.00
Task: B160 - Fee/Employment Applications			
Kittinger,J.E.	180.00	7.60	1,368.00
Heilman,L.C.	380.00	2.40	912.00
Daluz,T.M.	650.00	2.30	1,495.00
Total Task: B160		12.30	\$3,775.00
Task: B320 - Plan and Disclosure Statement (including			
Heilman,L.C.	380.00	0.50	190.00
Daluz,T.M.	650.00	0.20	130.00
Total Task: B320		0.70	\$320.00
Total Fees		<u>13.40</u>	<u>\$4,247.00</u>

Professional Services Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Partner			
Daluz, T.M.	2.50	650.00	1,625.00
Partner Total	2.50		\$1,625.00
Associate			
Heilman, L.C.	3.30	380.00	1,254.00
Associate Total	3.30		\$1,254.00
Paralegal			
Kittinger, J.E.	7.60	180.00	1,368.00
Paralegal Total	7.60		\$1,368.00
Total Fees	13.40		\$4,247.00

DISBURSEMENT DETAILS

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Code</u>	<u>Type</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Kittinger, J.E.	05/09/11	35	Delivery Service	Courier service	15.00
Kittinger, J.E.	05/09/11	35	Delivery Service	Courier service	24.00
Kittinger, J.E.	05/19/11	35	Delivery Service	Courier service	15.00
Kittinger, J.E.	05/26/11	35	Delivery Service	Courier service	15.00
Kittinger, J.E.	05/27/11	1	Duplicating	88 Copies	8.80
Kittinger, J.E.	05/28/11	35	Delivery Service	Courier service	7.50
Kittinger, J.E.	05/28/11	35	Delivery Service		7.50
Kittinger, J.E.	06/03/11	35	Delivery Service	Courier service	15.00
Kittinger, J.E.	06/03/11	1	Duplicating	20 Copies	2.00
Kittinger, J.E.	06/10/11	1	Duplicating	128 Copies	12.80
Kittinger, J.E.	06/11/11	35	Delivery Service	Courier service	15.00
Kittinger, J.E.	06/13/11	35	Delivery Service	Courier service	24.00
Kittinger, J.E.	06/13/11	1	Duplicating	132 Copies	13.20
Kittinger, J.E.	06/20/11	1	Duplicating	26 Copies	2.60
Total Disbursements					\$177.40

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY

<u>Code</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
-------------	--------------------	---------------

062571.00 - 00117568
Tobey M. Daluz

<u>Code</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
35	Delivery Service	138.00
1	Duplicating	39.40
Total Disbursements		<hr/> \$177.40
Total Current Charges:		<hr/> \$4,424.40 <hr/>