

Attachment A

Urban Brands, Inc.
TIME RECORDS BY SERVICES RENDERED
Period from: 8/1/11 to 8/31/11

Date	Employee	Task Code	Description	Hours	Fees
Monday, August 01, 2011	DO	18	Worked with Ken Simon to identify outliers from open and settled lists of 503(b)(9) claims	0.60	\$ 330.00
Monday, August 01, 2011	KS	3	Review most recent settlement documents received from counsel	1.10	764.50
Monday, August 01, 2011	KS	3	Trace each item included in updated analysis of settled and not settled 503(b)(9) claims to analysis included in LM+Co recovery report and identify additional claims settled by NAS	0.90	625.50
Monday, August 01, 2011	KS	4	Discussions and emails with S. Feldman and M. Klein prior to conference call with various professionals re: finalizing settlement	0.50	347.50
Monday, August 01, 2011	KS	23	Participation in conference call with various professionals re: finalizing settlement discussions	0.60	417.00
Tuesday, August 02, 2011	DO	8	Updated Recovery Analysis in Pages 36 through 38 to reflect Ken Simon's edits on 503(b)(9) claim status in Exhibit 12	0.60	330.00
Tuesday, August 02, 2011	KS	3	Read various emails re: final settlement agreement	0.40	278.00
Tuesday, August 02, 2011	KS	8	Revisions to recovery analysis to reflect updated 503(b)(9) claims	1.10	764.50
Wednesday, August 03, 2011	KS	3	Review various revisions to settlement agreement and exhibits thereto	0.80	556.00
Wednesday, August 03, 2011	KS	4	Various discussions with S. Feldman and M. Klein re: settlement agreement	0.80	556.00
Thursday, August 04, 2011	KS	3	Review various emails and discussions with S. Feldman re: final settlement agreement	1.20	834.00
Friday, August 05, 2011	DO	4	Spoke with and corresponded with Committee Counsel and Local Counsel on Third Interim Fee Hearing Scheduled for August 9, 2011	0.30	165.00
Monday, August 15, 2011	DO	37	Reviewed July fee application and issued to local counsel for filing and serving	0.50	275.00
Monday, August 15, 2011	JM	37	Prepared July fee application	0.50	187.50
Tuesday, August 16, 2011	KS	4	Read email from counsel and scan attached settlement agreement and transition services agreement	0.30	208.50
Thursday, August 25, 2011	KS	3	Review documents re: objections to filed 503(b)(9) claims and update recovery analysis	1.60	1,112.00
Tuesday, August 30, 2011	KS	8	Review second omnibus objection to 503(b)(9) claims and update recovery analysis to include additional information	1.90	1,320.50
Wednesday, August 31, 2011	KS	4	Review various emails re: 503(b)(9) claims and discussion with M. Klein re: same	0.40	278.00
Total:				14.10	\$ 9,349.50