

EXHIBIT A

Task/Attorney Summary

Client: 62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

Service Period: October 31, 2010

Statement Date: November 12, 2010

Matter Name: Urban Brands, Inc. (117568/)

<u>Code/Description</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B110 - Case Administration	DT May	\$270	0.4	\$108.00
	JE Kittinger	\$170	7.9	\$1,343.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	8.8	\$2,992.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	2.0	\$1,200.00
	DL Pollack	\$660	0.9	\$594.00
				20.0
B130 - Asset Disposition	TM Daluz	\$600	1.1	\$660.00
	DL Pollack	\$660	1.0	\$660.00
	JE Kittinger	\$170	1.8	\$306.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	30.4	\$10,336.00
			34.3	\$11,962.00
B140 - Relief fr. Stay Proceedings	TM Daluz	\$600	0.1	\$60.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.1	\$34.00
			0.2	\$94.00
B150 - Mtgs. of/and Comm. w/creditors	DT May	\$270	1.2	\$324.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	11.1	\$3,774.00
			12.3	\$4,098.00
B160 - Fee/Employment Applications	JE Kittinger	\$170	6.2	\$1,054.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	13.3	\$4,522.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	2.3	\$1,380.00
			21.8	\$6,956.00
B185 - Assumpt/Reject. Leases/Contr.	LC Heilman	\$340	0.4	\$136.00
			0.4	\$136.00
B195 - Non-Working Travel	LC Heilman	\$170	5.8	\$986.00
			5.8	\$986.00
B230 - Financing/Cash Collateral	LC Heilman	\$340	0.7	\$238.00
			0.7	\$238.00
B430 - Litigation/Hearings	LC Heilman	\$340	3.9	\$1,326.00
			3.9	\$1,326.00

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,
TM Daluz

2010114500
November 12, 2010

Activity/Attorney Summary

Client: 62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

Matter: Urban Brands, Inc. (117568/)

Service Period: October 31, 2010

Statement Date: November 12, 2010

Code/Description	Name	Rate	Hours	Amount
B110 - Case Administration				
	DT May	\$270	0.4	\$108.00
	JE Kittinger	\$170	7.9	\$1,343.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	8.8	\$2,992.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	2.0	\$1,200.00
	DL Pollack	\$660	0.9	\$594.00
			20.0	\$6,237.00
	B110 - Total		20.0	\$6,237.00
B130 - Asset Disposition				
	TM Daluz	\$600	1.1	\$660.00
	DL Pollack	\$660	1.0	\$660.00
	JE Kittinger	\$170	1.8	\$306.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	30.4	\$10,336.00
			34.3	\$11,962.00
	B130 - Total		34.3	\$11,962.00
B140 - Relief fr. Stay Proceedings				
	TM Daluz	\$600	0.1	\$60.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.1	\$34.00
			0.2	\$94.00
	B140 - Total		0.2	\$94.00
B150 - Mtgs. of/and Comm. w/creditors				
	DT May	\$270	1.2	\$324.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	11.1	\$3,774.00
			12.3	\$4,098.00
	B150 - Total		12.3	\$4,098.00
B160 - Fee/Employment Applications				
	JE Kittinger	\$170	6.2	\$1,054.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	13.3	\$4,522.00
	TM Daluz	\$600	2.3	\$1,380.00
			21.8	\$6,956.00
	B160 - Total		21.8	\$6,956.00
B185 - Assumpt/Reject. Leases/Contr.				

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,
 TM Daluz

2010114500
 November 12, 2010

Activity/Attorney Summary

Client: 62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

Matter: Urban Brands, Inc. (117568/)

Service Period: October 31, 2010

Statement Date: November 12, 2010

Code/Description	Name	Rate	Hours	Amount
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.4	\$136.00
			0.4	\$136.00
B195 - Non-Working Travel	B185 - Total		0.4	\$136.00
	LC Heilman	\$170	5.8	\$986.00
			5.8	\$986.00
	B195 - Total		5.8	\$986.00
B230 - Financing/Cash Collateral	LC Heilman	\$340	0.7	\$238.00
			0.7	\$238.00
	B230 - Total		0.7	\$238.00
B430 - Litigation/Hearings	LC Heilman	\$340	3.9	\$1,326.00
			3.9	\$1,326.00
	B430 - Total		3.9	\$1,326.00
	Matter Total		99.4	\$32,033.00

Detail of Time and Disbursements

Client: 62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,
 Matter: Urban Brands, Inc. (117568/)

B110 - Case Administration

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	10/01/10	0.4	\$340	\$136.00	Multiple e-mail correspondence and follow-up conferences re: Delaware counsel retention
LC Heilman	10/01/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence to/from C. Hershcopf re: appearance and pro hac vice motions
TM Daluz	10/01/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with Cooley re: representation of Committee
DL Pollack	10/01/10	0.4	\$660	\$264.00	Emails from and to L. Heilman, T. Daluz and C. Hershcopf (Cooley) re: engagement as local counsel for Creditors Committee
LC Heilman	10/03/10	1.8	\$340	\$612.00	Draft notice of appearance and request for notices (.6); draft pro hac vice motions for C. Hershcopf, M. Klein and L. Gottlieb (.9); coordinate filing and service of notice of appearance (.1); e-mail correspondence re: pro hac vice motions (.2)
LC Heilman	10/04/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Multiple e-mail correspondence re: financial advisor selection
JE Kittinger	10/04/10	0.4	\$170	\$68.00	Finalize for filing and e-file entry of appearance and request for notices
JE Kittinger	10/04/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Finalize for filing and e-file motion for admission pro hac vice of Lawrence C. Gottlieb
JE Kittinger	10/04/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Coordinate service of entry of appearance and request for notices
JE Kittinger	10/04/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Finalize for filing and e-file motion for admission pro hac vice of Michael Klein
JE Kittinger	10/04/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Finalize for filing and e-file motion for admission pro hac vice of Cathy Hershcopf
LC Heilman	10/04/10	0.7	\$340	\$238.00	Follow-up e-mail correspondence and conference with J. Kittinger re: Committee entry of appearance (.2); e-mail correspondence re: 2002 service list (.2); confer with J. Kittinger re: receipt numbers for filing pro hac vice motions (.1); receive and review executed Certifications to pro hac vice motions (.1); coordinate filing and service of

Detail of Time and Disbursements

					same (.1)
JE Kittinger	10/04/10	1.9	\$170	\$323.00	Prepare 2002 service list for filings
LC Heilman	10/04/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Receive and review notice of appointment of creditors' committee
LC Heilman	10/05/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Analyze Committee organizational documents
LC Heilman	10/05/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	Review recent bankruptcy filings
TM Daluz	10/05/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Review emails re: financial advisor
DL Pollack	10/05/10	0.2	\$660	\$132.00	Review emails re: proposed FA's for Creditors Committee
LC Heilman	10/05/10	0.5	\$340	\$170.00	Multiple e-mail correspondence re: financial advisor responses to Committee inquiries
DL Pollack	10/05/10	0.1	\$660	\$66.00	Review re: potential conflicts
LC Heilman	10/06/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review pleadings
TM Daluz	10/06/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Confer with L. Heilman re: participation in action, meeting, etc.
TM Daluz	10/06/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Review status email to committee from co-counsel
LC Heilman	10/07/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Receive and review orders granting pro hac vice admission of M. Klein, C. Hershcopf and L. Gottlieb
LC Heilman	10/07/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review and analyze Committee by-laws and initial contact sheet
LC Heilman	10/07/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review recent bankruptcy filings
LC Heilman	10/08/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Receive and review reclamation demand from International Inspirations, Inc.
LC Heilman	10/08/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Receive and review letter motion to assign creditor to Committee
LC Heilman	10/11/10	0.4	\$340	\$136.00	E-mail correspondence from M. Klein re: non-disclosure agreement (.1); review and analyze debtors' non-disclosure agreement with the Committee (.1); coordinate execution of same (.1); e-mail correspondence to M. Klein enclosing executed non-disclosure agreement (.1)
LC Heilman	10/11/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review recent bankruptcy filings
TM Daluz	10/11/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Review Non Disclosure Agreement (.2); Attend to execution of NDA (.2); Correspond with co-counsel re: NDA (.1)
LC Heilman	10/11/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review agenda for hearing on October 13, 2010
LC Heilman	10/11/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence enclosing orders

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

2010114500

TM Daluz

November 12, 2010

Detail of Time and Disbursements

					granting pro hac vice admission of M. Klein, C. Hershcopf and L. Gottlieb
LC Heilman	10/13/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review recent pleadings
DL Pollack	10/13/10	0.1	\$660	\$66.00	Emails to and from L. Heilman re: outcome of hearing
TM Daluz	10/14/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Review correspondence re: debtor's final analysis
DL Pollack	10/14/10	0.1	\$660	\$66.00	Emails L. Heilman re: Committee call
LC Heilman	10/14/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review e-mail correspondence to Committee from K. Simon re: fiscal year projections for Debtors
LC Heilman	10/14/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review recent bankruptcy filings
LC Heilman	10/15/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review recent bankruptcy filings
LC Heilman	10/18/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence with debtor's counsel re: omnibus hearings
LC Heilman	10/18/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review pleadings
JE Kittinger	10/20/10	1.6	\$170	\$272.00	Review docket and update 2002 service list
LC Heilman	10/20/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Conferences with J. Kittinger re: updates to 2002 service list
LC Heilman	10/21/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review e-mail correspondence to Committee re: auction
DT May	10/25/10	0.4	\$270	\$108.00	Prepare and revise summary of 341 hearing
LC Heilman	10/25/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence re: follow-up on meeting of creditors
TM Daluz	10/25/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Review and revise summary of 341 meeting (.2); Discuss management note with D. May (.2)
LC Heilman	10/26/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence re: meeting of creditors follow-up
JE Kittinger	10/27/10	0.1	\$170	\$17.00	Update calendar to reflect objection deadlines
JE Kittinger	10/27/10	2.5	\$170	\$425.00	Prepare binder for hearing on October 27, 2010 for L. Heilman
JE Kittinger	10/27/10	0.2	\$170	\$34.00	Update 2002 service list addresses
LC Heilman	10/28/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	Review recent bankruptcy filings
TM Daluz	10/28/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Review email to Bank of America re: retention (.2) ✓
LC Heilman	10/28/10	0.9	\$340	\$306.00	Manage and update file

Detail of Time and Disbursements

20.0 \$6,237.00 B110 - Total

B130 - Asset Disposition

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
TM Daluz	10/04/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Review objection to bid procedures (.2); Review correspondence with co-counsel, debtor's counsel re: revised procedures (.2)
JE Kittinger	10/04/10	0.5	\$170	\$85.00	Finalize for filing and e-file limited objection to sale motion
JE Kittinger	10/04/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Coordinate service of limited objection to sale motion
LC Heilman	10/04/10	6.3	\$340	\$2,142.00	Telephone call with M. Klein re: status of objections to sale process and bid procedures (.1); follow-up e-mail correspondence re: same (.1); e-mail correspondence re: Committee call to discuss bid procedures (.1); participate in Committee conference call re: bid procedures hearing (1.1); review and analyze mark-up of changes to bidding procedures and proposed order (.3); e-mail correspondence from M. Merchant re: same (.1); multiple e-mail correspondence from/to M. Klein re: draft objection to bid procedures and changes there to (.4); review and revise objection to bid procedures for filing (.7); prepare materials for bid procedures hearing (.9); coordinate filing and service of Limited Objection to bidding procedures (.2); e-mail correspondence re: service of same (.1); confer with M. Klein and prepare for bid procedures hearing (.5); review and analyzed revised mark-ups of bidding procedures and proposed order (.2); attend bid procedures hearing (1.4); e-mail correspondence re: summary of proceedings from bid procedures hearing (.1)
LC Heilman	10/06/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Receive and review sale notice
TM Daluz	10/12/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Correspond with co-counsel re: status of sales process (.2)
LC Heilman	10/12/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review e-mail correspondence re: Rainbow bid issues
LC Heilman	10/13/10	0.7	\$340	\$238.00	E-mail correspondence with landlord re: sale issues (.2); conference with D. Pacitti and follow-up e-mail correspondence re: Committee meeting with

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

2010114500

TM Daluz

Detail of Time and Disbursements

					prospective bidder Versa Capital (.3); e-mail correspondence re: Committee meeting with prospective bidder J. Sitt (.2)
DL Pollack	10/13/10	0.1	\$660	\$66.00	Email from counsel re: necessary for Committee meeting to discuss potential buyer
TM Daluz	10/13/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Correspondence from L. Gottlieb re: interest in sale (.1)
DL Pollack	10/14/10	0.1	\$660	\$66.00	Review emails re: meeting with potential buyer
LC Heilman	10/14/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	Multiple e-mail correspondence and follow-up telephone call re: Versa Capital meeting (.2); e-mail correspondence re: other potential bidders (.1)
DL Pollack	10/14/10	0.2	\$660	\$132.00	Emails re: additional bidder status
TM Daluz	10/14/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Email from L. Gottlieb re: status of sale (.1); Review correspondence from M. Klein re: additional bidder (.1)
DL Pollack	10/15/10	0.1	\$660	\$66.00	Emails L. Heilman re: 10/19 meeting with potential purchasers
LC Heilman	10/15/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence re: Committee meetings with potential bidders
LC Heilman	10/18/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence re: Committee meeting with Versa
LC Heilman	10/20/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review claims status and sale update from Loughlin Meghji
DL Pollack	10/20/10	0.3	\$660	\$198.00	Review Loughlin Meghi summary in connection with various bids
LC Heilman	10/24/10	0.7	\$340	\$238.00	Review correspondence and recent pleadings re: sale developments in preparation for auction
LC Heilman	10/25/10	14.1	\$340	\$4,794.00	Attend auction for the sale of Debtors' assets
LC Heilman	10/26/10	6.7	\$340	\$2,278.00	Attend auction for the sale of Debtors' assets (6.4); coordinate preparation of binder for sale hearing (.1); e-mail correspondence from/to M. Klein re: negotiations on final APA and sale hearing (.2)
DL Pollack	10/26/10	0.2	\$660	\$132.00	Telephone conference L. Heilman re: outcome of auction and Sale Hearing
LC Heilman	10/27/10	0.5	\$340	\$170.00	Supervise preparation of materials for sale hearing
LC Heilman	10/27/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	Multiple e-mail correspondence with Committee re: sale updates

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

TM Daluz

Detail of Time and Disbursements

JE Kittinger	10/27/10	0.6	\$170	\$102.00	Document retrieval regarding objections to Debtors sale motion
TM Daluz	10/27/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Meet with L. Heilman re: auction
LC Heilman	10/28/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence from K. Good re: auction transcript
JE Kittinger	10/28/10	0.4	\$170	\$68.00	Document retrieval regarding additional objections to Debtors sale motion

34.3	\$11,962.00	B130 - Total
------	-------------	--------------

B140 - Relief fr. Stay Proceedings

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	10/08/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Receive and review motion of G. Butler for relief from stay
TM Daluz	10/11/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Review motion for relief from stay (.1)
		0.2		\$94.00	B140 - Total

B150 - Mtgs. of/and Comm. w/creditors

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	10/05/10	2.5	\$340	\$850.00	Participate in Committee call re: selection of financial advisor
LC Heilman	10/06/10	0.4	\$340	\$136.00	Receive and review 341 meeting notice (.1); schedule same (.1); telephone calls to/from M. Klein re: same (.2)
LC Heilman	10/07/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence re: Committee meeting scheduled with Debtors and Gordon Brothers
LC Heilman	10/11/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Confer with L. Hayes re: Committee meeting with debtors and Gordon Brothers in New York
LC Heilman	10/12/10	4.8	\$340	\$1,632.00	Attend meetings with Committee, Debtors and GB Merchant Partners
LC Heilman	10/14/10	0.9	\$340	\$306.00	Committee conference call re: sale issues and potential bidders (.6); follow-up e-mail correspondence re: same (.3)
LC Heilman	10/19/10	2.2	\$340	\$748.00	Participate telephonically in Committee meeting with potential bidder Versa

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,
TM Daluz

Detail of Time and Disbursements

Capital Management

DT May 10/25/10 1.2 \$270 \$324.00 Attend 341 meeting

12.3
 \$4,098.00 B150 - Total

B160 - Fee/Employment Applications

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	10/05/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence re: Ballard's retention application
JE Kittinger	10/11/10	1.7	\$170	\$289.00	Draft application for entry of an order authorizing the retention and employment of Ballrad Spahr LLP as co-counsel to the Official committee of Unsecured Creditors
TM Daluz	10/11/10	0.6	\$600	\$360.00	Review conflict search re: retention disclosure (.6)
JE Kittinger	10/12/10	0.1	\$170	\$17.00	E-mail to L. Heilman regarding draft application for entry of an order authorizing the retention and employment of Ballrad Spahr LLP as co-counsel to the Official committee of Unsecured Creditors
JE Kittinger	10/12/10	1.9	\$170	\$323.00	Draft application for entry of an order authorizing the retention and employment of Ballard Spahr LLP as co-counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
LC Heilman	10/14/10	2.3	\$340	\$782.00	Telephone call with M. Klein re: retention applications (.1); review and revise draft retention application for Ballard Spahr (2.2)
TM Daluz	10/14/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Review and revise retention application (.2)
LC Heilman	10/15/10	1.7	\$340	\$578.00	E-mail correspondence re: Ballard's retention application (.2); analyze conflicts report and revise retention application and supporting affidavit of T. Daluz (1.5)
TM Daluz	10/18/10	0.6	\$600	\$360.00	Calls and attend to retention issues (.4); Review revised retention application (.2)
LC Heilman	10/18/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence to M. Klein re: Ballard's retention application for review and execution by Committee
LC Heilman	10/18/10	1.1	\$340	\$374.00	Analyze conflict issues in preparation of retention application (.6); e-mail correspondence and telephone calls with

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

2010114500

TM Daluz

November 12, 2010

Detail of Time and Disbursements

T. Daluz re: same (.2); revise retention application (.3)

LC Heilman	10/19/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence from/to M. Klein re: retention applications
TM Daluz	10/20/10	0.3	\$600	\$180.00	Correspond with J. Fanone and L. Heilman re: retention issues (.3)
LC Heilman	10/20/10	4.1	\$340	\$1,394.00	Review and revise Committee retention applications for filing (3.2); e-mail correspondence re: same (.2); multiple e-mail correspondence and telephone calls re: conflict waiver (.5); revise waiver letter for Bank of America (.2)
JE Kittinger	10/21/10	0.6	\$170	\$102.00	Finalize for filing and e-file application to retain and employ Loughlin Meghji + Company as financial advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
JE Kittinger	10/21/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Coordinate service of application to retain and employ Cooley LLP as lead counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
JE Kittinger	10/21/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Coordinate service of application to retain and employ Loughlin Meghji + Company as financial advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
JE Kittinger	10/21/10	0.5	\$170	\$85.00	Finalize for filing and e-file application to retain and employ Cooley LLP as lead counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
TM Daluz	10/21/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Attend to issues re: retention (.2)
LC Heilman	10/21/10	0.7	\$340	\$238.00	Telephone call with M. Klein re: retention applications (.1); finalize retention application of Cooley LLP and Loughlin Meghji + Co. for filing (.4); coordinate filing and service of same (.1); e-mail correspondence re: filed retention applications (.1)
LC Heilman	10/24/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	Analyze additional potential conflicts for retention application (.2); e-mail correspondence re: same (.1)
LC Heilman	10/25/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Address conflict issues for Ballard's retention application
LC Heilman	10/25/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Multiple e-mail correspondence re: UST's comments to retention applications of Cooley LLP and Loughlin Meghji
JE Kittinger	10/27/10	0.5	\$170	\$85.00	Finalize for filing and e-file retention application of Ballard Spahr LLP

Detail of Time and Disbursements

JE Kittinger	10/27/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Coordinate service of retention application of Ballard Spahr LLP
LC Heilman	10/27/10	1.5	\$340	\$510.00	Confer with T. Daluz re: remaining retention application issues (.2); revise affidavit in support of Ballard Spahr's retention application (.2); finalize retention application and coordinate filing and service of same (.6); e-mail correspondence from/to D. O'Brien re: revised proposed retention order for LM+Co to address UST comments (.1); review and revise proposed retention order for LM+Co (.1); e-mail correspondence to UST enclosing revised LM+Co retention order (.1); e-mail correspondence from UST re: additional comments to LM+Co retention (.1); e-mail correspondence to D. O'Brien re: same (.1)
TM Daluz	10/27/10	0.4	\$600	\$240.00	Meet with L. Heilman re: retention issues (.2); Finalize retention order (.2)
LC Heilman	10/28/10	0.5	\$340	\$170.00	Analyze retention issues (.2); follow-up e-mail correspondence re: same (.3)
LC Heilman	10/28/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	E-mail correspondence from K. Simon and telephone call with D. O'Brien re: UST's comments to LM+Co retention (.2); follow-up e-mail correspondence from D. O'Brien re: same (.1)
LC Heilman	10/29/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review e-mail correspondence with D. Buchbinder re: resolution of UST's objection to Cooley's retention application
		21.8		\$6,956.00	B160 - Total

B185 - Assumpt/Reject. Leases/Contr.

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	10/20/10	0.4	\$340	\$136.00	Review and analyze various cure objections
		0.4		\$136.00	B185 - Total

B195 - Non-Working Travel

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	10/12/10	5.8	\$170	\$986.00	Travel to/from NY, NY for Committee

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

TM Daluz

Detail of Time and Disbursements

meeting

	5.8		\$986.00	
--	-----	--	----------	--

B195 - Total

B230 - Financing/Cash Collateral

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	10/06/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence to/from M. Klein re: DIP issues
LC Heilman	10/07/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence re: extension of deadline to object to entry of final DIP order (.1); re-schedule same (.1)
LC Heilman	10/12/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	Analyze Committee's comments to final DIP order

	0.7		\$238.00	
--	-----	--	----------	--

B230 - Total

B430 - Litigation/Hearings

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	10/13/10	1.2	\$340	\$408.00	Prepare for and attend hearing on DIP financing
LC Heilman	10/27/10	2.7	\$340	\$918.00	Attend sale hearing

	3.9		\$1,326.00	
--	-----	--	------------	--

B430 - Total