

# **EXHIBIT A**

## Task/Attorney Summary

Client: 62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

Service Period: November 30, 2010

Statement Date: December 14, 2010

---

Matter Name: Urban Brands, Inc. (117568/)

<u>Code/Description</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B110 - Case Administration	TM Daluz	\$600	0.4	\$240.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.7	\$238.00
	JE Kittinger	\$170	2.0	\$340.00
			3.1	\$818.00
B130 - Asset Disposition	LC Heilman	\$340	0.1	\$34.00
			0.1	\$34.00
B150 - Mtgs. of/and Comm. w/creditors	TM Daluz	\$600	0.1	\$60.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.4	\$136.00
			0.5	\$196.00
B160 - Fee/Employment Applications	TM Daluz	\$600	2.1	\$1,260.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	11.9	\$4,046.00
	JE Kittinger	\$170	9.6	\$1,632.00
			23.6	\$6,938.00
B170 - Fee/Employment Objections	LC Heilman	\$340	1.4	\$476.00
			1.4	\$476.00
B185 - Assumpt/Reject. Leases/Contr.	LC Heilman	\$340	0.4	\$136.00
			0.4	\$136.00
B310 - Claims Admin/Objections	TM Daluz	\$600	0.1	\$60.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.5	\$170.00
			0.6	\$230.00
	<b>Matter Total</b>		29.7	\$8,828.00

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

TM Daluz

2010125653

December 14, 2010

## Activity/Attorney Summary

Client: 62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

Matter: Urban Brands, Inc. (117568/)

Service Period: November 30, 2010

Statement Date: December 14, 2010

<u>Code/Description</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B110 - Case Administration				
	TM Daluz	\$600	0.4	\$240.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.7	\$238.00
	JE Kittinger	\$170	2.0	\$340.00
			3.1	\$818.00
			<b>B110 - Total</b>	3.1 \$818.00
B130 - Asset Disposition				
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.1	\$34.00
			0.1	\$34.00
			<b>B130 - Total</b>	0.1 \$34.00
B150 - Mtgs. of/and Comm. w/creditors				
	TM Daluz	\$600	0.1	\$60.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.4	\$136.00
			0.5	\$196.00
			<b>B150 - Total</b>	0.5 \$196.00
B160 - Fee/Employment Applications				
	TM Daluz	\$600	2.1	\$1,260.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	11.9	\$4,046.00
	JE Kittinger	\$170	9.6	\$1,632.00
			23.6	\$6,938.00
			<b>B160 - Total</b>	23.6 \$6,938.00
B170 - Fee/Employment Objections				
	LC Heilman	\$340	1.4	\$476.00
			1.4	\$476.00
			<b>B170 - Total</b>	1.4 \$476.00
B185 - Assumpt/Reject. Leases/Contr.				
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.4	\$136.00
			0.4	\$136.00
			<b>B185 - Total</b>	0.4 \$136.00
B310 - Claims Admin/Objections				

62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

TM Daluz

2010125653

December 14, 2010

## Activity/Attorney Summary

Client: 62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,

Matter: Urban Brands, Inc. (117568/)

Service Period: November 30, 2010

Statement Date: December 14, 2010

---

<u>Code/Description</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	TM Daluz	\$600	0.1	\$60.00
	LC Heilman	\$340	0.5	\$170.00
			<u>0.6</u>	<u>\$230.00</u>
	<b>B310 - Total</b>		<u>0.6</u>	<u>\$230.00</u>
	<b>Matter Total</b>		<u>29.7</u>	<u>\$8,828.00</u>

## Detail of Time and Disbursements

Client: 62571.00 - Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Urban Brands,  
Matter: Urban Brands, Inc. (117568/)

---

### B110 - Case Administration

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	11/03/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review order modifying corporate names and case caption
LC Heilman	11/05/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review order scheduling omnibus hearing (.1); schedule same (.1)
LC Heilman	11/11/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review recent bankruptcy filings
JE Kittinger	11/11/10	0.9	\$170	\$153.00	Review docket and update 2002 service list
LC Heilman	11/12/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review agenda for hearing
TM Daluz	11/12/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Review omnibus hearing order
TM Daluz	11/12/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Attend to BOA waiver
LC Heilman	11/13/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review amended agenda canceling hearing
JE Kittinger	11/15/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Update case calendar regarding dates and deadlines from order establishing procedures for interim monthly compensation
JE Kittinger	11/22/10	0.1	\$170	\$17.00	Update case calendar regarding objection deadlines
TM Daluz	11/24/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Review docket re: case status
LC Heilman	11/24/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review recent bankruptcy filings
JE Kittinger	11/24/10	0.6	\$170	\$102.00	Update 2002 service list
JE Kittinger	11/24/10	0.1	\$170	\$17.00	Update calendar regarding objection deadlines for fee applications
		<hr/>		<hr/>	
		3.1		\$818.00	B110 - Total

### B130 - Asset Disposition

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	11/02/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence from Debtors' counsel re: sale hearing transcript
		<hr/>		<hr/>	
		0.1		\$34.00	B130 - Total

## Detail of Time and Disbursements

### B150 - Mtgs. of/and Comm. w/creditors

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	11/08/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Review e-mail correspondence to Committee re: summary of motion to establish bar dates
LC Heilman	11/10/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence to Committee re: statements and schedules
TM Daluz	11/24/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Correspondence to Committee re: status of case and schedules
LC Heilman	11/24/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review e-mail correspondence and memorandum to Committee members re: bar date and summary of schedules
		0.5		\$196.00	B150 - Total

### B160 - Fee/Employment Applications

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
TM Daluz	11/09/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Correspond with L. Heilman re: waiver
LC Heilman	11/09/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence re: Bank of America conflict waiver
TM Daluz	11/10/10	0.5	\$600	\$300.00	Prepare bill for fee application (.5)
LC Heilman	11/10/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	Coordinate preparation of CNOs for Committee retention applications (.1); confer with T. Daluz re: same (.1); e-mail correspondence to T. Clarke re: conflict waiver from Bank of America (.1)
JE Kittinger	11/11/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Draft certificate of no objection regarding retention application of Cooley LLP
JE Kittinger	11/11/10	0.2	\$170	\$34.00	Finalize for filing and e-file certificate of counsel regarding retention application of Loughlin Meghji + Company Inc.
JE Kittinger	11/11/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Draft certificate of no objection regarding retention application of Ballard Sapahr LLP
JE Kittinger	11/11/10	0.2	\$170	\$34.00	Finalize for filing and e-file certificate of no objection regarding retention application of Cooley LLP
JE Kittinger	11/11/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Draft certificate of counsel regarding

## Detail of Time and Disbursements

					retention application of Loughlin Meghji + Company Inc.
JE Kittinger	11/11/10	0.2	\$170	\$34.00	Finalize for filing and e-file certificate of no objection regarding retention application of Ballard Spahr LLP
LC Heilman	11/11/10	3.1	\$340	\$1,054.00	Confer with J. Kittinger re: CNOs to retention applications (.1); analyze and revise CNO to Ballard Spahr retention application (.5); revise Ballard Spahr retention order re: case caption changes (.3); analyze and revise CNO to Cooley's retention application (.4); revise Cooley retention order re: corporate names and caption changes (.2); review local rules re: certifications of counsel and submission of revised orders (.2); analyze and revise certification of counsel re: revised LM+Co retention order (.5); further revise LM+Co retention order re: corporate names and caption changes (.2); e-mail correspondence to/from K. Good re: submission of revised retention orders and CNOs to Court (.3); coordinate filing and service of CNOs to retention applications (.1); receive and review copies of filed CNOs to retention applications (.1); e-mail correspondence to debtors' counsel re: same (.2)
LC Heilman	11/11/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence to M. Klein re: Cooley's filed retention application (.1); e-mail correspondence to D. O'Brien re: LM+Co's filed retention application (.1)
TM Daluz	11/12/10	0.2	\$600	\$120.00	Attend to fee application (.2)
LC Heilman	11/12/10	2.3	\$340	\$782.00	Telephone call and follow-up e-mail correspondence with T. Clarke re: Bank of America conflict waiver (.2); follow-up e-mail correspondence re: same (.1); telephone call with K. Simon re: timing for filing monthly fee applications (.2); analyze administrative procedures order for monthly fee applications and local bankruptcy rules re: timing issues (.2); review orders granting Committee professional retentions (.2); follow-up e-mail correspondence re: same (.2); coordinate service of retention orders (.2); confer with T. Daluz re: first monthly fee applications (.2); e-mail correspondence from K. Simon re: LM+Co first monthly fee application (.1); analyze LM+Co first monthly fee application for compliance with local rules (.5); telephone call re: same (.2)

## Detail of Time and Disbursements

JE Kittinger	11/15/10	2.1	\$170	\$357.00	Draft first monthly fee application of Ballard Spahr LLP
JE Kittinger	11/15/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Review order establishing procedures for interim monthly compensation and reimbursement of expenses
JE Kittinger	11/15/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Draft certificate of service regarding retention orders of Loughlin Meghji + Company, Cooley LLP and Ballard Spahr LLP
JE Kittinger	11/17/10	1.3	\$170	\$221.00	Revise first monthly fee application of Ballard Spahr LLP
LC Heilman	11/17/10	2.9	\$340	\$986.00	E-mail correspondence to/from M. Klein re: Cooley's first monthly fee application (.2); review and revise certificate of service regarding service of retention orders (.1); coordinate filing of same (.1); analyze and revise Ballard Spahr's first monthly fee application (1.7); analyze and revise Loughlin Menghji + Company's first monthly fee application for filing (.8)
LC Heilman	11/18/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence with K. Simon re: follow-up on filing of LM+Co's first fee application
JE Kittinger	11/18/10	1.0	\$170	\$170.00	Continue to Revise first monthly fee application of Ballard Spahr LLP
JE Kittinger	11/19/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Revise and update first monthly fee application of Loughlin Meghji + Company Inc.
JE Kittinger	11/19/10	0.3	\$170	\$51.00	Revise and update first monthly fee application of Cooley LLP
TM Daluz	11/19/10	1.3	\$600	\$780.00	Review and revise fee application (1.0); Oversee issues re: filing (.2); confer with L. Heilman re: Cooley application and committee expense reimbursement (.1)
JE Kittinger	11/19/10	0.5	\$170	\$85.00	Revise and prepare first monthly fee application of Ballard Spahr LLP
LC Heilman	11/19/10	1.6	\$340	\$544.00	E-mail correspondence with M. Klein re: Cooley's first monthly fee application (.2); coordination preparation of same for filing (.1); analyze and further revise and finalize Ballard's first monthly fee application for filing (.6); analyze and revise first monthly application of Cooley LLP for filing (.5); review and finalize LM+Co's first monthly fee application for filing (.2)
JE Kittinger	11/20/10	0.2	\$170	\$34.00	E-mail to and from L. Heilman Regarding filling and service of first monthly fee applications of Ballard Spahr LLP, Cooley



## Detail of Time and Disbursements

LLP and Loughlin Meghji + Company, Inc.

JE Kittinger	11/20/10	0.2	\$170	\$34.00	Coordinate service of first monthly fee application of Loughlin Meghji + Company Inc.
JE Kittinger	11/20/10	0.4	\$170	\$68.00	Finalize for filing and e-file first monthly fee application of Cooley LLP
LC Heilman	11/20/10	0.5	\$340	\$170.00	Supervise and coordinate filing and service of first monthly fee applications for committee professionals (.3); e-mail correspondence re: filed copies of fee applications (.2)
JE Kittinger	11/20/10	0.2	\$170	\$34.00	Coordinate service of first monthly fee application of Ballard Spahr LLP
JE Kittinger	11/20/10	0.4	\$170	\$68.00	Finalize for filing and e-file first monthly fee application of Ballard Spahr LLP
JE Kittinger	11/20/10	0.2	\$170	\$34.00	Coordinate service of first monthly fee application of Cooley LLP
JE Kittinger	11/20/10	0.4	\$170	\$68.00	Finalize for filing and e-file first monthly fee application of Loughlin Meghji + Company Inc.
LC Heilman	11/22/10	0.5	\$340	\$170.00	Review and analyze filed fee applications for committee professionals (.2); confer with J. Kittinger re: CNO deadlines for same (.1); e-mail correspondence with K. Simon re: follow-up on objection deadline for LM+Co's first fee application (.2)
LC Heilman	11/29/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	E-mail correspondence from BMC Group re: September/October fees

	23.6		\$6,938.00		B160 - Total
--	------	--	------------	--	--------------

### B170 - Fee/Employment Objections

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	11/01/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	E-mail correspondence from D. Buchbinder re: UST's acceptance of revised proposed LM+Co retention order (.1); follow-up e-mail correspondence to D. O'Brien re: same (.1)
LC Heilman	11/01/10	0.9	\$340	\$306.00	Analyze and revise LM+Co retention order to address the UST's additional comments to same (.5); e-mail correspondence to D. O'Brien re: proposed revisions to retention order (.1); telephone call with D. O'Brien re: further changes to

## Detail of Time and Disbursements

retention order (.1); further revise  
retention order (.1); e-mail  
correspondence to D. Buchbinder enclosing  
revised proposed retention order for  
LM+Co (.1)

LC Heilman	11/02/10	0.3	\$340	\$102.00	E-mail correspondence with D. O'Brien re: follow-up on revised retention order (.2); e-mail correspondence re: BMC Group's fees (.1)
		1.4		\$476.00	B170 - Total

### B185 - Assumpt/Reject. Leases/Contr.

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	11/03/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review and analyze rejection motion re: Marianne leases (.1); schedule deadlines for same (.1)
LC Heilman	11/24/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review and analyze multiple notices of rejection of various leases
		0.4		\$136.00	B185 - Total

### B310 - Claims Admin/Objections

<u>Name</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
LC Heilman	11/03/10	0.1	\$340	\$34.00	Receive and review notices of reclamation demands of certain creditors
LC Heilman	11/05/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Review and analyze bar date motion
TM Daluz	11/24/10	0.1	\$600	\$60.00	Review bar date order
LC Heilman	11/29/10	0.2	\$340	\$68.00	Receive and review bar date order, notice and form proofs of claim
		0.6		\$230.00	B310 - Total